

LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP
JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted *pro hac vice*)
jprol@lowenstein.com
BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted *pro hac vice*)
bweisenberg@lowenstein.com
COLLEEN M. RESTEL (admitted *pro hac vice*)
crestel@lowenstein.com
One Lowenstein Drive
Roseland, New Jersey 07068
Telephone: (973) 597-2500

KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP
TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)
tkeller@kbkllp.com
JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)
jkim@kbkllp.com
GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 190895)
galbert@kbkllp.com
101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950
San Francisco, California 94104
Telephone: (415) 496-6723

Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA
OAKLAND DIVISION**

In re:

THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF
OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,

Debtor.

Case No. 23-40523 WJL

Chapter 11

**THIRTIETH MONTHLY
PROFESSIONAL FEE STATEMENT
FOR LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP
FOR NOVEMBER 1, 2025 THROUGH
NOVEMBER 30, 2025**

TO ALL INTERESTED PARTIES AND TO THEIR COUNSEL OF RECORD:

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Lowenstein Sandler LLP (“**Lowenstein**”), lead counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “**Committee**”) of The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the “**Debtor**”), files its thirtieth Monthly Professional Fee Statement for the period of November 1, 2025 through November 30, 2025 (the “**Monthly Fee Statement**”). Pursuant to the *Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of*



1 *Expenses of Professionals* [Dkt. 170] (the “**Interim Fee Order**”)¹ entered by the Court on June 23,
2 2023², the total legal fees and costs expended by Lowenstein on account of its representation of the
3 Committee for the period of November 1, 2025 through November 30, 2025, is:

4 Period	Fees	Expenses	Total
5 November 1, 2025 through 6 November 30, 2025	\$126,855.00	\$1,933.94	\$128,788.94
7 Net Total Allowed Payments 8 this Statement Period: (80% of Fees and 100% of Costs)	\$101,484.00	\$1,933.94	\$103,417.94

9 The itemized billing statements for the fees billed and expenses incurred are attached
10 hereto as **Exhibits A and B**, respectively. Notice Parties have 10 days from the date of service
11 of this Monthly Fee Statement to file an objection thereto. If no objection is filed, Lowenstein
12 may file a certificate of no objection (or if an Objection was timely served, a certificate of partial
13 objection) with the Court after which the Debtor, without further order of the Court, shall pay
14 Lowenstein an amount equal to the lesser of: (1) 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses
15 requested in the Monthly Fee Statement, and (2) if an Objection was served, 80% of the fees and
16 100% of the expenses to which there was no Objection no later than five business days after the
17 filing of the relevant certificate.

18 Dated: December 30, 2025

LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP

19 By: /s/ Jeffrey D. Prol
20 Jeffrey D. Prol
21 Brent Weisenberg
22 Colleen Restel
23 One Lowenstein Drive
24 Roseland, New Jersey 07068
25 Telephone: (973) 597-2500

*Counsel for the Official Committee
of Unsecured Creditors*

26 ¹ Capitalized terms not otherwise defined have the meaning ascribed to them in the Interim Fee Order.

27 ² On June 27, 2025, the Court entered the *Agreed Order Amending Procedures for Interim Compensation and*
28 *Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [Dkt. 2101] (the “**Modified Interim Fee Order**”). Under the
Modified Interim Fee Order, the 80% monthly holdback amount required by the Interim Fee Order was
increased to 30% through September 2025. The monthly holdback amount is now back to 20% as required
by the Interim Fee Order.

EXHIBIT A

EXHIBIT A

Professional Services rendered by Lowenstein Sandler LLP, through November 30, 2025

In re: Chapter 11 Proceeding

I. SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES AND HOURLY RATES

Name of Professional	Year Admitted	Title/Department	Hours Spent	Hourly Rate	Charge
Prol, Jeffrey D.	1990	Partner/Bankruptcy	45.30	\$1,370.00	\$62,061.00
Weisenberg, Brent I.	2002	Partner/Bankruptcy	49.40	\$1,160.00	\$57,304.00
Schoenkin, Benjamin A.	2023	Associate/Bankruptcy	10.50	\$660.00	\$6,930.00
Claussen, Diane	N/A	Paralegal/Bankruptcy	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
TOTAL FEES			106.60		\$126,855.00
Attorney Blended Rate					\$1,200.52

TIME DETAIL:

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
<u>B100 - Administration</u>					
<u>B110 Case Administration</u>					
B110	11/12/25	DC	Review docket and court calendar (.1); update attorney calendar (.1)	0.20	\$80.00
B110	11/14/25	DC	Review Transcript of 11/12/25 Hearing and update electronic folders	0.10	\$40.00
Total B110 - Case Administration				0.30	\$120.00
<u>B150 Meetings of and Communication with Creditors</u>					
B150	11/03/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Dismissal Hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/04/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on events since prior week's Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: prepare for November 12th Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/04/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: questions on possible dismissal	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/04/25	JDP	Confer with SCC re: mediation strategy and status	0.60	\$822.00
B150	11/06/25	JDP	Confer with SCC re: status of mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B150	11/07/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of case	0.50	\$580.00
B150	11/07/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of case	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/07/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on Status Conference	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/07/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of case	0.50	\$580.00
B150	11/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on recent events in case and path ahead	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/08/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: schedule conference call in advance of Status Conference	0.20	\$232.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	11/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee re: prepare for 11/12/25 Status Conference	0.80	\$928.00
B150	11/10/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: attendance at 11/12/25 Status Conference	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: expectations for upcoming Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/10/25	JDP	Prepare for (.2) and participate in (.8) committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	11/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: expectations for upcoming Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: developing issues just prior to Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with another counsel for Committee member re: developing issues just prior to Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Committee professionals re: developing issues just prior to Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Committee professionals re: debrief on Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Committee re: debrief on Status Conference	0.80	\$928.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Revise email to Committee re: debrief on Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with another counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/12/25	BIW	Re-confer with Committee professionals re: developing issues just prior to Status Conference	0.50	\$580.00
B150	11/12/25	JDP	Draft email update to committee re: mediation and status conference	0.40	\$548.00
B150	11/12/25	JDP	Draft email to SCC re: mediation and status conference update	0.40	\$548.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	11/13/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor inquiry on case status	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/13/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Committee member re: status of mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.70	\$812.00
B150	11/13/25	BIW	Confer with another counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/14/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members	0.80	\$928.00
B150	11/14/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	11/14/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/14/25	JDP	Prepare for (.5) and participate in (.8) SCC update call	1.30	\$1,781.00
B150	11/14/25	JDP	Prepare for (.3) and participate in (.9) Committee update call	1.20	\$1,644.00
B150	11/16/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: update on mediation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	11/17/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: update on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on mediation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	11/17/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: update on mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/17/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on mediation	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/17/25	JDP	Follow-up with SCC re: mediation position	0.60	\$822.00
B150	11/19/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/20/25	BIW	Confer with Survivors re: status of case (1 @.3 and 1 @.4)	0.70	\$812.00
B150	11/21/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: debrief on Status Conference addressing form of Dismissal Order	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Status Conference held earlier in the day	0.60	\$696.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	11/21/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on earlier Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/21/25	JDP	Review and edit draft email update to committee and SCC re: mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B150	11/22/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor re: status of case	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/24/25	BIW	Participate in conference call with Committee	0.50	\$580.00
B150	11/24/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: expected filing of Plan Term Sheet	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/24/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: expected filing of Plan and responses thereto	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/24/25	JDP	Prepare for (.6) and participate in (.5) committee update call	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	11/25/25	BIW	Draft two emails in response to inquiries by counsel for Survivor	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/25/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update in lieu of Committee call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Review Mediator's proposed settlement Term Sheet (.4); draft summary email to Committee re: same (.7)	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: summary of Mediator's Plan Term Sheet	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Mediator's proposal	0.40	\$464.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Mediator's proposal	0.60	\$696.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Mediator's proposal	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Revise email to Committee summarizing Mediator's Term Sheet	0.30	\$348.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on Mediator's proposal	0.50	\$580.00
B150	11/26/25	BIW	Draft email responding to Survivor inquiry on dismissal	0.20	\$232.00
B150	11/26/25	JDP	Review and edit email to committee re: mediators proposal	0.30	\$411.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with Creditors				34.50	\$41,616.00
<u>B155 Mediation</u>					
B155	11/06/25	JDP	E-mail to/from Judge Sontchi re: mediation update	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/06/25	JDP	E-mails to/from co-counsel re: mediation update	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/07/25	JDP	E-mails to/from A. Uetz re: mediation update and status conference attendance	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: status of negotiations	0.70	\$812.00
B155	11/12/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: status of negotiations	0.40	\$464.00
B155	11/12/25	JDP	Calls with B. Weisenberg, co-counsel (1.4), scc (.7) and T. Gallagher (.7) re: possible new proposal and strategy for status conference	2.40	\$3,288.00
B155	11/13/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: mediation strategy	0.30	\$411.00
B155	11/13/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B155	11/13/25	JDP	Call with Judge Newsome re: mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B155	11/13/25	JDP	E-mails to/from T. Gallagher re: scheduling mediation call	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/14/25	JDP	Develop strategy for mediation	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	11/14/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: mediation strategy	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/15/25	BIW	Participate in call with Mediators and M. Lee	1.20	\$1,392.00
B155	11/15/25	JDP	Prepare for (.3) and participate in (1.2) mediation session	1.50	\$2,055.00
B155	11/18/25	JDP	Call to T. Gallagher re: status of mediation	0.10	\$137.00
B155	11/18/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: status of mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/19/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: status of mediation; emails to/from T. Gallagher re: status of mediation	0.60	\$822.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	11/20/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: mediation; emails to/ from T. Gallagher re: same; follow up call with T. Gallagher re: same	0.60	\$822.00
B155	11/21/25	BIW	Confer with T. Schiavoni re: discuss cases insured by insurance	0.30	\$348.00
B155	11/21/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/21/25	JDP	Call with T. Gallaher re: mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B155	11/23/25	BIW	Draft emails to Mediators re: status of Term Sheet	0.20	\$232.00
B155	11/23/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: status of mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B155	11/24/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: timing of delivery for Term Sheet	0.20	\$232.00
B155	11/24/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: status of mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	11/24/25	BIW	Review research on payment of prepetition claims outside of a Plan of Reorganization	0.40	\$464.00
B155	11/24/25	JDP	Call with T. Gallagher re: status of mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B155	11/25/25	BIW	Review Child Protection Protocols at request of Mediator	0.40	\$464.00
B155	11/25/25	BIW	Review research on legality of payments to prepetition claimants being made outside of a Plan	0.60	\$696.00
B155	11/25/25	JDP	Call with T. Gallagher re: mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: requested extension of Dismissal Deadline	0.20	\$232.00
B155	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: explanation of Mediator Term Sheet	0.10	\$116.00
B155	11/26/25	BIW	Draft email to Mediators re: Committee's agreement to extend deadline dismissal deadline	0.20	\$232.00
B155	11/26/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: explanation of Mediator Term Sheet	0.40	\$464.00
B155	11/26/25	BIW	Outline areas of concern raised by Mediator Plan Term Sheet	0.80	\$928.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	11/26/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: mediators' proposal and strategy for addressing dismissal of case (.4); develop strategy for moving forward (.7)	1.10	\$1,507.00
B155	11/26/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: mediators' proposal	0.60	\$822.00
B155	11/26/25	JDP	Review and analyze mediators' proposal; draft issues list	2.50	\$3,425.00
B155	11/28/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: mediators' proposal (.2); emails to/from Judge Sontchi re: same (.2)	0.40	\$548.00
B155	11/28/25	JDP	Develop mediation strategy	0.60	\$822.00
B155	11/29/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: negotiate Plan Term Sheet	0.20	\$232.00
B155	11/30/25	BIW	Review Mediator's revised settlement proposal	0.20	\$232.00
Total B155 - Mediation				21.90	\$28,491.00

B170 Fee/Employment Objections

B170	11/18/25	BIW	Review Fee Examiner's informal response to Seventh Interim Fee Application	0.20	\$232.00
B170	11/18/25	DC	Reconcile amounts owed under the Sixth and Seventh Interim Period	0.30	\$120.00
B170	11/19/25	DC	Convert spreadsheets for review of objection to LS' Seventh Interim Fee Application	0.20	\$80.00
B170	11/19/25	JDP	Review fee examiner's initial report on LS' Seventh Interim Fee Application (.4); review fee application (.4); begin compiling data to respond (.8)	1.60	\$2,192.00
B170	11/20/25	DC	Draft LS' October Monthly Fee Statement and revise same per comments received	0.60	\$240.00
B170	11/20/25	JDP	E-mails to/from D. Klauder re: fee examiner report on LS interim fee application	0.20	\$274.00
B170	11/28/25	JDP	Compile and analyze information to respond to fee examiner interim comments on Lowenstein's seventh interim fee application	3.50	\$4,795.00
B170	11/29/25	JDP	Prepare response to fee examiner interim report on LS seventh interim fee application (1.1); prepare for call with fee examiner (.6); participate in call with fee examiner re: interim comments (.4)	2.10	\$2,877.00

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Total B170 - Fee/Employment Objections				8.70	\$10,810.00
<u>B175 Fee Applications and Invoices - Others</u>					
B175	11/07/25	BIW	Review Foley's September Monthly Fee Statement	0.40	\$464.00
Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others				0.40	\$464.00
<u>B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)</u>					
B190	10/24/25	JDP	Review and revise draft reply re: dismissal of case (2.2); review cases cited in Debtor response and committee reply (1.2)	3.40	\$4,658.00
B190	11/03/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: November 12th Status Conference	0.20	\$232.00
B190	11/05/25	JDP	Review transcript of 10/29 hearing and decision on motion to dismiss to prepare for 11/12 status conference	0.60	\$822.00
B190	11/06/25	JDP	E-mails to/from A. Uetz re: status of motion to dismiss	0.20	\$274.00
B190	11/18/25	BIW	Review Debtor's draft Dismissal Order and draft email re: same	0.40	\$464.00
B190	11/19/25	BIW	Review proposed revisions to Debtor's Dismissal Order (.1) and respond to same (.1)	0.20	\$232.00
B190	11/19/25	JDP	Review debtor's proposed order dismissing case, review transcripts of hearing and status conference; draft alternative form of order	0.90	\$1,233.00
B190	11/19/25	JDP	Review comments received on alternative order dismissing case, revise order, and draft email to debtor's counsel re: revised form of order	0.60	\$822.00
B190	11/19/25	JDP	E-mails from/to debtor's counsel re: form of order dismissing case	0.30	\$411.00
B190	11/20/25	BIW	Revise email to counsel for Debtor re: dispute over form of Dismissal Order	0.40	\$464.00
B190	11/20/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: Debtor's proposed form of Dismissal Order	0.60	\$696.00
B190	11/20/25	BIW	Revise objection to Debtor's proposed Dismissal Order	1.30	\$1,508.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B190	11/20/25	JDP	Draft objection to Debtor's proposed form of order dismissing case	1.70	\$2,329.00
B190	11/20/25	JDP	Review transcripts for 10/29 and 11/12 hearings to prepare for call with A. Uetz re: form of order dismissing case (.7); call with A. Uetz re: same (.2) and send follow-up e-mail (.3)	1.20	\$1,644.00
B190	11/21/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: debrief on Status Conference earlier in the day	0.20	\$232.00
B190	11/21/25	BIW	Revise objection to Debtor's proposed Dismissal Order	1.40	\$1,624.00
B190	11/21/25	BIW	Finalize Objection to proposed Dismissal Order	0.60	\$696.00
B190	11/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: dueling orders on dismissal	0.40	\$464.00
B190	11/21/25	JDP	Review and edit draft brief opposing Debtor's proposed form or order dismissing chapter 11 case	2.00	\$2,740.00
B190	11/21/25	JDP	Review and edit revised draft of brief objecting to Debtor's proposed form of order dismissing case	1.50	\$2,055.00
B190	11/26/25	BIW	Drafted email to Committee re: notice of order extending dismissal deadline	0.20	\$232.00
Total B190 - Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)				18.30	\$23,832.00

B300 - Claims and Plan

B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)

B320	11/18/25	BAS	Meet with B. Weisenberg to discuss potential distribution in advance of plan confirmation	0.20	\$132.00
B320	11/18/25	BAS	Research potential for distribution in advance of plan confirmation	0.50	\$330.00
B320	11/18/25	BIW	Review research re: payment of claims in advance of Plan confirmation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	11/20/25	BAS	Research potential distribution prior to plan confirmation	3.20	\$2,112.00
B320	11/21/25	BAS	Research potential distribution for distribution prior to plan confirmation	3.10	\$2,046.00
B320	11/24/25	BAS	Call with B. Weisenberg about legal research re: pre-plan confirmation distributions	0.10	\$66.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	11/25/25	BAS	Review relevant cases and draft summary as to research re: pre plan confirmation distribution	3.40	\$2,244.00
B320	11/26/25	BIW	Begin drafting Plan Term Sheet	0.80	\$928.00
B320	11/26/25	BIW	Review Debtor's draft of Child Protection Protocols	0.80	\$928.00
B320	11/28/25	BIW	Continue drafting Plan Term Sheet	2.60	\$3,016.00
B320	11/29/25	BIW	Continue drafting Plan Term Sheet	0.90	\$1,044.00
Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)				15.90	\$13,194.00

B400 - Bankruptcy-Related Advice

B430A Court Hearings

B430A	11/03/25	BIW	Review Status Conference Transcript	0.40	\$464.00
B430A	11/10/25	JDP	Review Debtor status conference report; develop strategy for response	0.30	\$411.00
B430A	11/11/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: prepare for following day's Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B430A	11/12/25	BIW	Attend Status Conference via Zoom	1.50	\$1,740.00
B430A	11/12/25	JDP	Participate in status conference before Judge Lafferty	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430A	11/12/25	JDP	Develop strategy and prepare for status conference	0.80	\$1,096.00
B430A	11/21/25	BIW	Prepare for (.7), attend (.5), virtual Status Conference re: form of Dismissal Order dispute	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430A	11/21/25	JDP	Assist with preparation for oral argument on form of order dismissing case	0.60	\$822.00
Total B430A - Court Hearings				6.60	\$8,328.00

Timekeeper Summary (by Task):

Task	Task Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	0.30	\$120.00
B150	Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	34.50	\$41,616.00
B155	Mediation	21.90	\$28,491.00
B170	Fee/Employment Objections	8.70	\$10,810.00
B175	Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	0.40	\$464.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	18.30	\$23,832.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	15.90	\$13,194.00
B430A	Court Hearings	6.60	\$8,328.00
	Total	106.60	\$126,855.00

EXHIBIT B

EXHIBIT B

Actual and necessary disbursements incurred by Lowenstein Sandler LLP

II. Summary of Disbursement Charges

	\$570.24
Computerized legal research	\$1,241.20
Travel	<u>\$122.50</u>
Total Disbursements	<u><u>\$1,933.94</u></u>

The above charges are based upon time and expense records available on or about the date of the attached letter. Such records are believed in good faith to be accurate and substantially up to date, but there may be fees and expenses that have not been processed as of such date which Lowenstein Sandler LLP may submit in the future. Lowenstein Sandler LLP reserves the right to amend this monthly statement at a later date.

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/26/25	eDiscovery Review VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-10-26 105.60 GB eDiscovery Review	\$570.24
10/26/25	eDiscovery Review VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-10-26 105.60 GB eDiscovery Review	\$-570.24
11/26/25	eDiscovery Review VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-11-26 105.60 GB eDiscovery Review	\$570.24
11/10/25	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7798325111110205 Hotel - Lodging; Status Conference in the Oakland Diocese and Franciscan Friars cancellation fee	\$122.50
11/18/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SCHOENKIN,BENJAMIN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 2 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$5.45
11/19/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SCHOENKIN,BENJAMIN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$5.45
11/21/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SCHOENKIN,BENJAMIN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 8 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$643.46
11/25/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SCHOENKIN,BENJAMIN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 18 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$586.84
	Total Disbursements	<hr/> <u>\$1,933.94</u>