#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., 1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

SUMMARY OF FOURTEENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2025

Name of Applicant: Jones Day

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: The above-captioned Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

Date of Order Approving Retention: June 19, 2020 (as of the Petition Date),

and amended on August 18, 2020

Petition Date: June 18, 2020

Period for which compensation and

reimbursement are sought:

October 1, 2024 through January 31, 2025

Amount of Compensation sought as actual,

reasonable, and necessary:

\$1,729,798.75

Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as

actual, reasonable, and necessary:

\$5,956.84

Total Compensation Approved by Interim

Fee Order to Date:

\$41,446,403.45

Total Expenses Approved by Interim

Fee Order to Date:

\$263,028.04

Total Allowed Compensation Paid to Date: \$41,446,403.45

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 134

Total Allowed Expenses Paid to Date: \$263,028.04

Compensation Already Paid Pursuant to a \$978,685.48

Monthly Fee Statement But Not Yet Allowed:

Expenses Already Paid Pursuant to a Monthly \$5,956.84

Fee Statement But Not Yet Allowed:

This is a(n): X interim final application

Prior Monthly Fee Statements Submitted:

<b>Date Submitted</b>	Month Covered	Fees	Expenses
November 26, 2024	October 1, 2024 –	\$732,688.75	\$2,509.87
	October 31, 2024		
December 30, 2024	November 1, 2024 –	\$293,755.00	\$3,446.97
	November 30, 2024		
January 30, 2025	December 1, 2024 –	\$264,192.50	\$0.00
	December 31, 2024		
March 3, 2025	January 1, 2025 –	\$439,162.50	\$0.00
	January 31, 2025		

To date, no objections have been received to any prior monthly fee statements. The objection deadline relating to the *Fifty-Fifth Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period from January 1, 2025 Through January 31, 2025* has not yet passed.

#### SUMMARY OF HOURS AND COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL<sup>2</sup>

Name of Professional	Position - Bar Year	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
C CAHOW	PARTNER – 2014	\$1,275.00	81.10	\$103,402.50
C CAHOW	PARTNER – 2014	*\$637.50	8.00	\$5,100.00
C CAHOW	PARTNER – 2014	\$1,400.00	7.60	\$10,640.00
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	\$1,575.00	273.40	\$430,605.00
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	*\$787.50	5.00	\$3,937.50
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	\$1,700.00	111.30	\$189,210.00
M A CODY	PARTNER – 1996	*\$850.00	5.00	\$4,250.00
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	\$1,625.00	96.20	\$156,325.00
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	*\$812.50	5.50	\$4,468.75
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	\$1,800.00	32.90	\$59,220.00
B B ERENS	PARTNER – 1991	*\$900.00	4.00	\$3,600.00
G M GORDON	PARTNER – 1980	\$2,000.00	0.20	\$400.00
G M GORDON	PARTNER – 1980	\$2,200.00	0.10	\$220.00
M R HIRST	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,375.00	67.60	\$92,950.00
M R HIRST	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,500.00	36.10	\$54,150.00
M R HIRST	PARTNER – 2001	*\$750.00	2.20	\$1,650.00
J M JONES	PARTNER – 1986	\$1,750.00	0.30	\$525.00
T B LEWIS	PARTNER – 1987	\$1,450.00	25.20	\$36,540.00
T B LEWIS	PARTNER – 1987	\$1,550.00	19.10	\$29,605.00
C K MARSHALL	PARTNER – 2001	\$1,450.00	2.00	\$2,900.00
D S TORBORG	PARTNER – 1998	\$1,400.00	5.40	\$7,560.00
D S TORBORG	PARTNER – 1998	\$1,550.00	1.60	\$2,480.00
A ANDERSON	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$825.00	8.10	\$6,682.50
A ANDERSON	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$925.00	4.50	\$4,162.50
E M DOWLING	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$725.00	66.00	\$47,850.00
J GALE	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$725.00	75.60	\$54,810.00
J GALE	ASSOCIATE – 2022	\$825.00	12.80	\$10,560.00
R HART	ASSOCIATE – 2021	\$825.00	13.50	\$11,137.50
R HART	ASSOCIATE – 2021	\$925.00	13.00	\$12,025.00
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE – 2018	\$925.00	158.10	\$146,242.50
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE – 2018	*\$462.50	6.00	\$2,775.00
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE – 2018	\$1,075.00	15.60	\$16,770.00

2

Certain billing rates were increased in the ordinary course of Jones Day's business on January 1, 2025. Where applicable, professionals whose rates increased are listed twice in this chart – once with the applicable billing rate in effect for October through December 2024 and once with the new billing rate effective as of January 1, 2025. In addition, consistent with the Interim Compensation Order (as defined herein), time spent traveling without actively working on matters in these Chapter 11 Cases has been billed at 50% of the professional's normal hourly rate. These non-work travel adjustments are noted in the chart with an asterisk.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 4 of 134

Name of Professional	Position - Bar Year	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
P LOMBARDI	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$850.00	121.10	\$102,935.00
P LOMBARDI	ASSOCIATE – 2020	\$950.00	13.20	\$12,540.00
A PRUITT	ASSOCIATE – 2023	\$700.00	36.40	\$25,480.00
A PRUITT	ASSOCIATE – 2023	\$750.00	30.80	\$23,100.00
L C FISCHER	STAFF ATTORNEY	\$650.00	43.40	\$28,210.00
C L SMITH	PARALEGAL	\$525.00	32.50	\$17,062.50
C L SMITH	PARALEGAL	\$600.00	8.30	\$4,980.00
E PRATT	LEGAL SUPPORT	\$375.00	7.30	\$2,737.50
TOTAL			1456.00	\$1,729,798.75

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 5 of 134

#### BLENDED RATE OF PROFESSIONALS – TOTAL

Professionals	Blended Rate	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Partners	\$1,519.04	789.80	\$1,199,738.75
Associates	\$830.12	574.70	\$477,070.00
Staff Attorney	\$650.00	43.40	\$28,210.00
Paralegals & Legal Support	\$515.18	48.10	\$24,780.00
TOTAL	\$1,188.04	1,456.00	\$1,729,798.75

#### **COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY**

Project Category	Total Hours	<b>Total Fees</b>
Case Administration and Business Operations	75.00	\$99,742.50
Automatic Stay	75.30	\$106,142.50
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	83.30	\$116,030.00
Claims Administration	12.60	\$20,265.00
Court Hearings	254.70	\$307,925.00
General Corporate and Real Estate	61.60	\$96,070.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator	19.00	\$19,460.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	109.10	\$132,640.00
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	249.30	\$223,260.00
Fee Application Preparation	51.80	\$38,585.00
Asbestos Matters	428.60	\$543,897.50
Nonworking Travel	35.70	\$25,781.25
TOTAL	1456.00	\$1,729,798.75

#### **EXPENSE SUMMARY**<sup>3</sup>

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	<b>Total Expenses</b>
Travel – Air Fare	N/A	\$3,501.50
Travel – Food and Beverage Expenses	N/A	\$82.36
Travel – Hotel Charges	N/A	\$1,773.93
Travel – Taxi Charges	N/A	\$599.05
Travel – Other	N/A	0.00
TOTAL		\$5,956.84

The Debtors inadvertently omitted certain information on Page 2 of Exhibit A of the served version of the October Monthly Fee Statement. The omitted information has been included in the October Monthly Fee Statement, attached hereto in Exhibit A.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 134

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., 1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

# FOURTEENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2025

Jones Day, counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors"), makes its fourteenth interim application (the "Application") for allowance of compensation of \$1,729,798.75, and reimbursement of expenses of \$5,956.84 for the period from October 1, 2024 through January 31, 2025 (the "Compensation Period") in accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals, dated July 15, 2020 [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order").

In support of this Application, Jones Day respectfully represents as follows:

#### **Overview**

- 1. Jones Day attorneys and paraprofessionals expended a total of 1,456.00 hours during the Compensation Period for which compensation is requested.
- 2. During the Compensation Period, Jones Day did not receive any payments or promises of payment from any source other than the Debtors for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered by this Application.

NAI-1543210229

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 134

No agreement or understanding exists between Jones Day or any third person for the sharing of compensation, except as allowed by section 504(b) of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code") and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules") with respect to the sharing of compensation between and among partners of Jones Day.

- 3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, included with this
  Application are: (a) a schedule identifying all Jones Day professionals and paraprofessionals
  who have performed services in these chapter 11 cases during the Compensation Period,
  the capacities in which each individual is employed by Jones Day, the hourly billing rate charged
  by Jones Day for the services performed by each such individual, the aggregate number of hours
  expended in these cases during the Compensation Period for each professional and
  paraprofessional, the total fees billed therefor, and the year in which each professional was first
  licensed to practice law; (b) a summary of services by billing category for services rendered by
  Jones Day during the Compensation Period; and (c) a schedule summarizing, by category,
  the actual and necessary disbursements that Jones Day incurred during the Compensation Period
  in connection with the performance of professional services for the Debtors and for which it
  seeks reimbursement.
- 4. Attached hereto collectively as <u>Exhibit A</u> are Jones Day's itemized monthly time records for professionals and paraprofessionals performing services for the Debtors during the Compensation Period and Jones Day's itemized records detailing expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors during the Compensation Period.
- 5. This Application complies with sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Interim Compensation Order, the *Guidelines for Compensation*

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 10 of 134

and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals issued by this Court (the "Compensation Guidelines"), and the Rules of Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Western District of North Carolina (the "Local Rules").

#### **Background**

- 6. On June 18, 2020 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtors commenced their reorganization cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases") by filing voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. These Chapter 11 Cases have been consolidated for procedural purposes only and are being administered jointly. The Debtors are authorized to continue to manage their property and operate their businesses as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 7. On the Petition Date, the Debtors filed the <u>Ex Parte Application of</u> the Debtors for an Order Authorizing Them to Retain and Employ Jones Day as Counsel as of the Petition Date [Dkt. 20] (the "Retention Application"), by which the Debtors sought authority to retain and employ Jones Day as their counsel in the Chapter 11 Cases. On June 19, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 71] (the "Original Retention Order") authorizing the retention of Jones Day as the Debtors' counsel as of the Petition Date.
- 8. On July 7, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 147] appointing the official committee of asbestos personal injury claimants (the "ACC") in these Chapter 11 Cases. On October 14, 2020, the Court entered an order [Dkt. 389] appointing Joseph W. Grier, III as legal representative for future asbestos claimants in these Chapter 11 Cases (the "FCR").
- 9. The Debtors and the ACC agreed to an amendment to the Original Retention Order to reserve certain rights of the ACC. On August 18, 2020, the Court entered the amended retention order agreed upon by the Debtors and the ACC [Dkt. 264] (the "Jones Day Retention Order"), which superseded the Original Retention Order.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 11 of 134

#### Jurisdiction

10. This Court has jurisdiction to consider this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). Venue for this matter is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1409.

#### **Summary of Services**

- appropriate to the administration of the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases, as described in detail below. These services were in the best interests of the Debtors and other parties in interest. The compensation requested is commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues and tasks involved.
- 12. All of the services for which compensation is requested hereunder were rendered at the request of and solely on behalf of the Debtors, and not on behalf of any other entity.

#### **Progress of the Chapter 11 Cases to Date**

- 13. During the Compensation Period, the Debtors, with the assistance of Jones Day, have worked diligently to administer and advance these cases. The Debtors' achievements during the Compensation Period include, among others:
  - drafting and preparing the Case History and Status Report of Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC [Dkt. 2378] (the "Aldrich/Murray Case History");
  - preparing for and appearing at the October 24, 2024 hearing regarding the Aldrich/Murray Case History and status reports submitted by other interested parties in the Chapter 11 Cases;
  - researching and analyzing the Statement of Issues on Appeal of Order Denying Robert Semian's Motion for Relief from the Automatic Stay Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 362(d) [Dkt. 2474] (the "Semian Lift Stay Appeal"), and preparing for the appeal related thereto;

- drafting and preparing the Debtors' Designation of Additional Items to be Included in the Record on Appeal of Order Denying Robert Semian's Motion for Relief from the Automatic Stay Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 362(d) [Dkt. 2494] (the "Debtors' Designation of the Record for the Semian Appeal");
- negotiating, drafting, and preparing the protocol (the "Claims File Protocol") governing the collection and production of particular documents in connection with discovery in the Court ordered estimation process [Dkt. 1127] ("Estimation");
- drafting and preparing the *Consent Order Pursuant to Rule 502(d) of the Federal Rules of Evidence* [Dkt. 2546] (the "502(d) Order") governing the production of documents in connection with Estimation;
- preparing for and arguing at the January 30, 2025 hearing on the 502(d) Order and the Claims File Protocol;
- comprehensive research and analysis regarding plan confirmation issues;
- addressing various issues in two adversary proceedings filed by the ACC, consisting of: (a) a complaint filed on behalf of the bankruptcy estates against the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates alleging that the prepetition corporate restructurings that created the Debtors (the "Corporate Restructuring") was an intentional and constructive fraudulent transfer [Adv. No. 22-03028, Adv. Dkt. 1] (the "Fraudulent Transfer Proceeding") and; (b) a complaint on behalf of the bankruptcy estates alleging that individual officers and directors of the Debtors and officers, directors, and employees of other members of the Debtors' corporate family breached their fiduciary duties in connection with the Corporate Restructuring and the filing of these Chapter 11 Cases [Adv. No. 22-03029, Adv. Dkt. 1] (the "Fiduciary Duty Proceeding" and, together, the "Derivative Proceedings");
- addressing various discovery matters in the Derivative Proceedings;
- conducting various research and analysis and drafting documents and memoranda concerning matters related to claims administration;
- preparing and providing quarterly and monthly reports on the Debtors' operations in compliance with the Debtors' reporting obligations [Aldrich Dkts. 2404, 2405, 2454, 2493, 2525, 2526; Murray Dkts. 150, 151, 156, 158, 160, 161];
- meetings with the FCR and his counsel regarding the Chapter 11 Cases; and

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 13 of 134

• engaging in various other discussions with the ACC, the Debtors' advisors, the FCR, the Debtors' insurers, and other parties in interest regarding various matters relating to the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### **Prior Monthly Fee Statements**

14. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day has submitted the following monthly fee statements (collectively, the "Prior Monthly Fee Statements") to the Debtors for the four months comprising the Compensation Period, each of which is incorporated herein by reference in its entirety:<sup>2</sup>

Date Submitted	Period Covered	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Payment Received	Amount Outstanding <sup>3</sup>
November 26, 2024	October 1, 2024 – October 31, 2024	\$732,688.75	\$2,509.87	\$692,178.37	\$43,020.25
December 30, 2024	November 1, 2024 – November 30, 2024	\$293,755.00	\$3,446.97	\$292,463.95	\$4,738.02
January 30, 2025	December 1, 2024 – December 31, 2024	\$264,192.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$264,192.50
March 3, 2025	January 1, 2025 – January 31, 2025	\$439,162.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$439,162.50

15. In total, Jones Day has submitted the Prior Monthly Fee Statements during the Compensation Period for total fees of \$1,729,798.75 and total expenses of \$5,956.84. As of the date of this Application, no party has objected to any of Jones Day's Prior Monthly Fee Statements.<sup>4</sup>

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Copies of the Prior Monthly Fee Statements are attached hereto collectively as <u>Exhibit A</u>.

During the Compensation Period, the Debtors inadvertently overpaid Jones Day by \$30,248.62 for the Fifty-Second Monthly Fee Statement and by \$24,637.48 for the Fifty-Third Monthly Fee Statement. These overpayments will be applied as a credit against additional amounts outstanding, once such payment is authorized. Therefore, as of the date of and for purposes of this Interim Application, Jones Day has received payment for 90% of fees and 100% of expenses for the Fifty-Second and Fifth-Third Monthly Fee Statements covering October and November 2024.

The objection deadline relating to the Fifty-Fifth Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period from January 1, 2025 Through January 31, 2025 has not yet passed.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 14 of 134

#### **Compensation by Project Category**

The following is a summary of the activities performed by Jones Day professionals and paraprofessionals during the Compensation Period, organized by project billing category.<sup>5</sup>

16. Case Administration and Business Operations — 75.00 hours — \$99,742.50

In light of the size and complexity of the Debtors' bankruptcy cases, daily case administration matters necessarily required attention from Jones Day during the Compensation Period. These services included the following:

- maintaining a detailed work in process report (the "<u>WIP Report</u>") that is
  distributed to the Debtors and other professionals to track the progress of
  motions, applications, and other matters relating to these cases. The WIP
  Report assists the Debtors in assigning tasks and responsibilities,
  coordinating activities, tracking deadlines, reporting progress, and
  avoiding duplication of effort among the Debtors and their professionals;
- participating in regular conference calls and video meetings with the Debtors' management and other professionals to discuss and review key case developments, pending motions and applications, compliance with the requirements of chapter 11, and other work in process as identified in the WIP Report;
- maintaining case management tools, including maintenance of a case calendar and docket to monitor filings and related litigation deadlines;
- reviewing and coordinating administrative filings; and
- communicating with parties in interest regarding the Chapter 11 Cases.

Jones Day believes that it has adopted appropriate procedures for the effective and efficient administration of these cases that have resulted, and will continue to result, in cost savings inuring to the direct benefit of the Debtors and their estates and creditors.

The summary set forth below is qualified in its entirety by reference to the time and service detail attached to each Prior Monthly Fee Statement. Project billing categories for which no time was charged during the Compensation Period are not listed below.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 15 of 134

#### 17. Automatic Stay — 75.30 hours — \$106,142.50

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day assisted the Debtors with researching, drafting, and preparing the Debtors' Designation of the Record for the Semian Appeal. Jones Day also research and advised the Debtors' regarding the arguments proffered in the Semian Lift Stay Appeal.

### 18. Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement — 83.30 hours — \$116,030.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day assisted the Debtors with researching, drafting, and preparing memoranda concerning plan-related precedent in connection with their pursuit of a consensual resolution of these Chapter 11 Cases.

#### 19. Claims Administration — 12.60 hours — \$20,265.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day continued to work with co-counsel with respect to various matters involving claims against the Debtors. In particular, Jones Day devoted time to:

- analyzing issues related to proofs of claim, including analysis of incomplete or incorrect proofs of claim, claim withdrawals, and settled and satisfied claims; and communicating with co-counsel regarding same; and
- analyzing procedures related to objections to proofs of claim.

#### 20. Court Hearings — 254.70 hours — \$307,925.00

Jones Day's activities during the Compensation Period included preparation for and participation in hearings before this Court on a variety of matters described elsewhere in this Application. In particular, Jones Day devoted time to:

• the hearing held on October 24, 2024 regarding the Aldrich/Murray Case History, and status reports submitted by other interested parties in the Chapter 11 Cases; and

• the hearing held on January 30, 2025 regarding the Claims File Protocol and 502(d) Order.

#### 21. General Corporate/Real Estate — 61.60 hours — \$96,070.00

Jones Day professionals assisted the Debtors with various corporate tasks during the Compensation Period, including the following:

- conducting periodic discussions with the Debtors' insurers as to the status of the Chapter 11 Cases and various potential events that may occur during the cases;
- attending board meetings of the Debtors and reviewing related meeting minutes; and
- providing advice and assistance to the Debtors in connection with certain corporate matters, including researching issues related to corporate governance, disclosure requirements, and preparing corporate documents.

#### 22. Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting – 19.00 hours

#### -\$19,460.00

Jones Day professionals prepared monthly status reports and quarterly fee statements for both Aldrich and Murray. These reports keep the Court up to date on the financial affairs of the Debtors and comply with the Debtors' reporting obligations as debtors-in-possession.

#### 23. Litigation and Adversary Proceedings — 109.10 hours — \$132,640.00

Jones Day professionals devoted substantial time during the Compensation Period to various litigation-related tasks. These services included the following:

- reviewing and analyzing the amicus briefs filed by the Aldrich ACC and FCR in the pending <u>Bestwall</u> Fourth Circuit appeal, <u>Bestwall LLC v.</u>
   Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants, No. 24-1493 (4th Cir.) [Dkts. 52, 69];
- addressing discovery matters in the Derivative Proceedings, including: (a) reviewing and analyzing the ACC's discovery requests and related correspondence in the Derivative Proceedings; (b) collecting and reviewing documents potentially to be produced in response to the

discovery requests in the Derivative Proceedings; (c) preparing other discovery materials related to the Derivative Proceedings; and (d) participating in meet and confers with the ACC's regarding discovery issues;

- responding to inquires from the ACC regarding privilege issues in the Fraudulent Transfer Proceeding;
- communicating internally and with the Debtors regarding discovery plans related to the Fraudulent Transfer Proceeding; and
- researching issues in anticipation of potential future litigation activities in the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### 24. Asbestos Matters — 428.60 hours — \$ 543,897.50

Jones Day professionals devoted substantial time during the Compensation Period to addressing various asbestos-related matters, including the following:

- engaging in various discovery matters and developing plans for discovery related to estimation of the Debtors' asbestos liabilities, including issues related to document production and privilege;
- reviewing precedent, drafting, and preparing the Aldrich/Murray Case History;
- communicating internally and with the Debtors, co-counsel, and other advisors concerning the Aldrich Case History and tort system history;
- communicating with the ACC regarding various estimation-related discovery matters, including issues related to claims file sampling and privilege;
- preparing for and communicating with co-counsel and mediators regarding mediation; and
- communicating with Bates White, LLC, the Debtors' asbestos consultant, regarding the status of asbestos matters and various analyses.

#### 25. Professional Retention and Fee Issues — 249.30 hours — \$223,260.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day professionals devoted time to assisting the Debtors with various professional retention and fee issues, including:

- reviewing and analyzing invoices, monthly fee statements, and interim fee applications of all professionals retained in the Chapter 11 Cases;
- drafting and maintaining a comprehensive weekly fee tracker to assist the Debtors with managing the invoices of the various professionals retained in the Chapter 11 Cases;
- reviewing reports and analyzing invoices of ordinary course professionals;
- reviewing disclosures of retained professionals;
- preparing a quarterly ordinary course professional report; and
- communicating with the Debtors' other professionals regarding the interim fee application process and reviewing the interim fee applications of the Debtors' professionals and other professionals retained in the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### 26. Fee Application Preparation — 51.80 hours — \$38,585.00

During the Compensation Period, Jones Day devoted time to (a) reviewing its invoices for September 2024, October 2024, November 2024, and December 2024 for privilege and to ensure compliance with the Local Rules and the Compensation Guidelines; (b) drafting the related Prior Monthly Fee Statements to accompany these monthly invoices; and (c) preparing the *Thirteenth Interim Application of Jones Day for Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors for the Period From June 1, 2024 Through September 30, 2024* [Dkt. 2434], which was approved by the Court on December 10, 2024 [Dkt. 2472].

#### 27. **Bankruptcy Write-Offs** — \$26,197.31

This category reflects all amounts that Jones Day has voluntarily determined not to charge the Debtors as assessed by Jones Day in reviewing invoices, consistent with its own internal policies and to comply with the "reasonableness" requirements of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code. Those amounts include \$416.06 of expenses, as well as \$25,781.25 of non-working travel time in accordance with the terms of the Interim Compensation Order.

#### **Expenses Incurred by Jones Day**

- 28. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code authorizes "reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses" incurred by professionals employed in a chapter 11 case. Accordingly, Jones Day seeks reimbursement for expenses ("Expenses") incurred in rendering services to the Debtors during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$5,956.84. Itemized records detailing the Expenses incurred during the Compensation Period are attached to the Prior Monthly Fee Statements.
  - 29. Jones Day maintains the following policies with respect to Expenses:
  - No amortization of the cost of any investment, equipment, or capital outlay is included in the expenses. In addition, for those items or services that Jones Day purchased from or contracted with a third party (such as outside copy services), Jones Day seeks reimbursement only for the exact amount billed to Jones Day by the third party vendor and paid by Jones Day to the third party vendor.
  - Jones Day generally does not charge for ordinary photocopying performed by lawyers, paraprofessionals, and assistants. With respect to large photocopying jobs necessitating the use of Jones Day's specialized duplication staff and equipment, such photocopying was charged at 10 cents per page. To the extent practicable, Jones Day utilizes less expensive outside copying services.
  - Meals charged to the Debtors either are associated with (a) out-of-town travel; (b) meetings at Jones Day with the Debtors and other professionals; or (c) attorneys working late on urgent matters concerning the Debtors.
  - Charges for airline and train travel include the cost of each coach-class airline or train ticket purchased in connection with the provision of services to the Debtors, plus, for each airline or train ticket issued by the travel service regularly used by Jones Day, a \$40 transaction fee to cover travel service expenses.
  - The time pressures associated with the services rendered by Jones Day at times require Jones Day's professionals and paraprofessionals to devote substantial amounts of time during the evenings and on weekends. Jones Day may charge for secretarial and other staff overtime expense that is directly associated with such after-hours work and is necessary given the circumstances of the case. Jones Day does not consider such expenses to be part of its ongoing overhead expenses because they are special

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 20 of 134

incremental expenses arising from the specific services being provided to the Debtors. Nevertheless, no such charges are included in this Application.

#### **Conclusion**

30. The fees and expenses requested herein by Jones Day are billed in accordance with its existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the Compensation Period. Such fees are reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable nonbankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market. Jones Day's fees and expenses, therefore, should be approved on an interim basis pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Interim Compensation Order, and applicable Bankruptcy Rules and Local Rules.

#### **Notice**

31. This Application has been served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order on the Notice Parties, as defined therein. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, a notice of opportunity for hearing on this Application in accordance with Local Rule 9013-1(e)(7) has been served on the Notice Parties and all parties that have filed a notice of appearance with the Clerk of this Court and requested such notice. Jones Day submits that, in light of the nature of the relief requested, no other or further notice need be provided.

#### No Prior Request

32. No prior request for the relief sought in this Application has been made to this or any other court.

WHEREFORE, Jones Day respectfully requests that, pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Interim Compensation Order, and applicable Bankruptcy Rules and Local Rules, the Court (a) enter an order substantially in the form attached hereto as

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 21 of 134

Exhibit B granting the relief requested herein and (b) grant such other and further relief to Jones

Day as the Court may deem just and proper.

Dated: March 12, 2025 Chicago, Illinois Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Amanda P. Johnson (IL Bar No. 6329873)

JONES DAY 110 North Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585

E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com macody@jonesday.com

amandajohnson@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

-and-

Gregory M. Gordon (TX Bar No. 08435300)
JONES DAY

2727 N. Harwood Street Dallas, Texas 75201

Telephone: (214) 220-3939 Facsimile: (214) 969-5100

E-mail: gmgordon@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 22 of 134

#### **EXHIBIT A**

**Prior Monthly Fee Statements** 

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

### FIFTY-SECOND MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Fifty-Second Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From October 1, 2024 Through October 31, 2024 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period
 October 1, 2024 through October 31, 2024 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$732,688.75
Total Expenses	\$2,509.87
TOTAL	\$735,198.62

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 24 of 134

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$661,929.75 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin,

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 25 of 134

PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than December 10, 2024 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 134

Dated: November 26, 2024 Chicago, Illinois Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

> macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 134

#### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

#### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

October 31, 2024 161866 Invoice: 241307867

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through October 31, 2024:

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	30.40	38,647.50
Automatic Stay	5.40	7,685.00
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	62.80	83,357.50
Claims Administration	3.30	5,217.50
Court Hearings	234.40	275,242.50
General Corporate and Real Estate	13.40	20,052.50
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator		
Reporting	6.40	6,317.50
Nonworking Travel	24.50	16,281.25
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	7.50	10,297.50
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	23.90	18,725.00
Fee Application Preparation	10.80	7,165.00
Asbestos Matters	199.30	243,700.00
Total Fees	622.10 USD	732,688.75
Total Billed Disbursements	USD	2,509.87
TOTAL	USD	735,198.62

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 29 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 2 October 31, 2024

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Disbursement & Charges Summary

Travel - Air Fare	1,007.90
Travel - Food and Beverage Expenses	47.25
Travel - Hotel Charges	1,286.31
Travel - Taxi Charges	168.41

2,509.87 \*\* USD

Invoice: 241307867

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 30 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3
October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241307867

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – October 31, 2024

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	73.00	1,275.00	93,075.00
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	8.00	637.50	5,100.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	154.50	1,575.00	243,337.50
M A Cody	Partner	1996	5.00	787.50	3,937.50
B B Erens	Partner	1991	73.50	1,625.00	119,437.50
B B Erens	Partner	1991	5.50	812.50	4,468.75
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	25.60	1,375.00	35,200.00
J M Jones	Partner	1986	0.30	1,750.00	525.00
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	12.40	1,450.00	17,980.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	1.00	1,450.00	1,450.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	3.00	1,400.00	4,200.00
Total			361.80		528,711.25
E M Dowling	Associate	2022	66.00	725.00	47,850.00
J L Gale	Associate	2022	39.80	725.00	28,855.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	96.70	925.00	89,447.50
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	6.00	462.50	2,775.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	23.50	850.00	19,975.00
Total			232.00		188,902.50
L C Fischer	Staff Attorney	1996	9.30	650.00	6,045.00
Total			9.30		6,045.00
C L Smith	Paralegal		12.70	525.00	6,667.50
Total			12.70		6,667.50
E Pratt	Project Manager		6.30	375.00	2,362.50
Total			6.30		2,362.50
Total			622.10	USD	732,688.75

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 31 of 134 JONES DAY

Invoice: 241307867

161866 Page: 4 October 31, 2024

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Fee Detail

Fee Detail				
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount	
Case Administration	and Business Operations			
10/01/24 Attend work i	C K Cahow in process call with client and advisors.	1.00	1,275.00	
10/01/24 Telephone co	M A Cody nference with advisors regarding work in p	1.00 process matters.	1,575.00	
10/01/24 Prepare for ac	B B Erens dvisor work in process call (.20); attend cal	1.00 Il regarding same (.80).	1,625.00	
10/01/24 Attend work i	M R Hirst in process call with client and advisors.	0.80	1,100.00	
10/01/24 Attend work i	A P Johnson in process call with Erens, Cahow, Cody, I	0.90 Evert.	832.50	
10/01/24 Participate in	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors.	1.00	1,450.00	
10/01/24 Review and di system with sa	C L Smith istribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed name (.10).	0.20 documents and update electronic file	105.00 e management	
10/02/24 Review and di	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
10/03/24 Review and di	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
10/04/24 Revise calenda	J L Gale ar of key dates and deadlines.	0.10	72.50	
	C L Smith istribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ame (.10); update case calendar (.10).	0.30 documents and update electronic file	157.50 e management	
10/07/24 Review and di	C L Smith istribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
10/08/24 Attend work i	C K Cahow in process call with internal team and advis	0.90 sors (.40); prepare for same (.50).	1,147.50	
10/08/24 Telephone co.	M A Cody nference with advisors regarding work in p	0.40 process matters.	630.00	
10/08/24 Attend adviso	B B Erens or work in process call.	0.30	487.50	
10/08/24 Attend portio	M R Hirst ns of work in process call.	0.20	275.00	

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 32 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	11	
161866 Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 5 October 31, 2024 voice: 241307867
Thairen Tamp 222	o and marray boner and		10100. 211301001
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/08/24 Attend wor	A P Johnson k in process call.	0.30	277.50
10/08/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/09/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/10/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/11/24 Organize up	B B Erens pcoming tasks in case.	0.20	325.00
10/11/24 Revise caler	J L Gale ndar of key dates and deadlines (0.6); draft em	0.70 nail to Johnson regarding same (0	507.50
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed on same (.20).	0.30 documents and update electronic	157.50 file management
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed on same (.10).	0.20 documents and update electronic	105.00 file management
10/15/24 Telephone	M A Cody conference with advisors regarding work in p	0.50 rocess matters.	787.50
10/15/24 Prepare for	B B Erens advisor work in process call (.70); attend call	1.20 regarding same (.50).	1,950.00
10/15/24 Attend wor	M R Hirst k in process call with advisors.	0.50	687.50
10/15/24 Attend wor	A P Johnson k in process call with advisors (.5); prepare fo	0.90 or same (.4).	832.50
10/15/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/15/24 Attend wor	D S Torborg k in process call with advisors.	0.50	700.00
10/16/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/17/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/18/24 Attend wor	C K Cahow k in process call with company, internal team	0.40 and advisors.	510.00

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 33 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	<b>1</b>	
161866			Page: 6 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/18/24 Telephone	M A Cody conference with client and advisors regarding	0.50 work in process matters	787.50
10/18/24 Revise caler	J L Gale ndar of key dates and deadlines.	0.10	72.50
10/18/24 Attend wor	A P Johnson k in process call with client and advisors.	0.40	370.00
10/18/24 Attend wor	T B Lewis k in process call with client and advisors.	0.50	725.00
10/18/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/21/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/22/24 Attend wor	C K Cahow k in process call with internal team and adviso	1.00 rs (.50); prepare for sam	1,275.00 ae (.50).
10/22/24 Telephone	M A Cody conference with advisors regarding work in pr	0.50 ocess matters.	787.50
10/22/24 Attend advi	B B Erens isor work in process call.	0.50	812.50
10/22/24 Attend wor	A P Johnson k in process call with advisors (.5); prepare for	0.70 same (.2).	647.50
10/22/24 Participate	T B Lewis in work in process call with advisors (.5); prepare	0.80 are for same (.3).	1,160.00
10/22/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
10/22/24 Attend wor	D S Torborg k in process call with advisors (.5); prepare for	0.70 same (.2).	980.00
	C L Smith distribute docket ( .10); obtain recently filed on same (.10).	0.20 documents and update e	105.00 lectronic file management
10/24/24 Review and	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
	B B Erens dvisors regarding work in process matters (1.30 arding same (.20).	2.00 )); attend call with client	3,250.00 regarding same (.50);
10/25/24 Revise caler	J L Gale ndar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20	145.00

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES D	A 1		
161866				Page: 7 per 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/25/24 Review and d	C L Smith listribute docket.	0.10		52.50
10/28/24 Communicate	C K Cahow e with Erens regarding case administration	0.10 matters.		127.50
10/28/24 Review and d	C L Smith listribute docket.	0.10		52.50
10/29/24 Attend adviso	C K Cahow or work in process call (.60); prepare for sar	1.70 me (.40); address follow t	ap related to sa	2,167.50 me (.70).
10/29/24 Telephone co	M A Cody onference with advisors regarding work in p	0.70 process matters.		1,102.50
10/29/24 Prepare for ac same (.60).	B B Erens dvisor work in process call (.20); emails wit	1.00 h Miller regarding same	(.20); attend cal	1,625.00 l regarding
10/29/24 Attend work	M R Hirst in process call with advisors (.6); prepare for	0.90 or same (.3).		1,237.50
10/29/24 Attend work	A P Johnson in process call with Erens, Miller, Evert, Ca	0.60 ahow.		555.00
10/29/24 Participate in	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors (.6); pre	0.80 pare for same (.2).		1,160.00
10/29/24 Review and d	C L Smith listribute docket.	0.10		52.50
10/29/24 Attend work	D S Torborg in process call with advisors.	0.60		840.00
10/30/24 Revise calend	J L Gale lar of key dates and deadlines.	0.20		145.00
10/30/24 Review and d	C L Smith listribute docket.	0.10		52.50
10/31/24 Review and d system with s	C L Smith listribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed ame (.10).	0.20 documents and update e	lectronic file m	105.00 anagement
	Matter Total	30.40	USD	38,647.50
Automatic Stay				
10/28/24 Review and a relief.	M A Cody nalyze DBMP opinion from District Court	0.80 affirming bankruptcy co	ourt opinion de	1,260.00 nying stay

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 35 of 134 JONES DAY

161866	<b>,</b> 01. <b>2</b> 0 <b>2</b> 1		Page: 8 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/28/24 Review DBMF	B B Erens Popinion from District Court affirming ba	0.50 nkruptcy court opinion c	812.50 lenying lift stay relief.
10/28/24 Review and an	A P Johnson alyze District Court opinion in DBMP affi	1.00 irming bankruptcy court	925.00 opinion denying stay relief.
10/29/24 Review transcr	M A Cody ipts and orders related to appeal of stay re	2.80 lief motions in precedent	4,410.00 case.
10/29/24 Review DBMF	A P Johnson P opinion from District Court affirming ba	0.30 .nkruptcy court opinion c	277.50 lenying lift stay relief.
	Matter Total	5.40	USD 7,685.00
Plan of Reorganization	n and Disclosure Statement		
10/01/24 Research regar	E M Dowling ding plan-related matters and potential nex	1.30 xt steps relating to same.	942.50
	E M Dowling ding plan-related matters and potential new egarding same (.9); research regarding plan		
10/03/24 Draft and revis to same.	E M Dowling se memo regarding research concerning pla	3.40 an-related matters and po	2,465.00 otential next steps relating
10/04/24 Draft and revis relating to sam	E M Dowling se memorandum regarding research concere.	7.30 rning plan-related matters	5,292.50 s and potential next steps
10/11/24 Review and an same and relate	M A Cody alyze precedent related to plan matters (.8) ed issues (.4).	1.20 s; telephone conference w	1,890.00 with internal team regarding
10/14/24 Review and an (2.1).	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and related materials	4.80 (2.7); review memorandu	7,560.00 nm regarding plan issues
	M A Cody alyze memoranda and related documents r mbardi regarding same (.1).	3.60 regarding plan precedent	5,670.00 and related matters (3.5);
10/15/24 Review preced (0.8).	P Lombardi ent regarding plan matters (0.9); draft men	1.70 norandum concerning san	1,445.00 me and forward to Cody
10/16/24 Review plan pr	M A Cody recedent documents and related materials.	1.80	2,835.00
10/17/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze pleadings and precedent related to pl	3.70 lan issues.	5,827.50

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 36 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DAT		
161866	1M D 7 H C		Page: 9 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/18/24 Review preced	M A Cody ent and materials relating to plan matters.	2.30	3,622.50
10/18/24 Draft summary concerning san	P Lombardi y of precedent concerning plan matters (.2); rev ne (.1).	0.70 ise same (.4); draft	595.00 email to Johnson
10/21/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and pleadings (2.3); meeting	2.50 ng with Erens rega	3,937.50 rding same (.2).
10/21/24 Review materia	B B Erens als relating to plan-related matters (.80); meeting	1.00 g with Cody regard	1,625.00 ting same (.20).
10/21/24 Research regar	P Lombardi ding plan-related matters (.7); revise summary o	1.10 of precedent conce	935.00 rning same (.4).
10/22/24 Review and an plan issues (.3)	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and related materials (3.3):	3.60 ; telephone confere	5,670.00 ence with Erens regarding
10/22/24 Telephone call	B B Erens with Cody regarding plan matters.	0.30	487.50
10/23/24 Review plan pr	M A Cody recedent and related materials.	1.60	2,520.00
10/25/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and related materials (3.8)	4.60 ; review case law re	7,245.00 garding plan issues (.8).
	M A Cody alyze case precedent and documents regarding ns in connection with same (1.7); review addition		
10/28/24 Diligence regar	B B Erens rding potential plan-related matters.	0.20	325.00
10/29/24 Review case la	M A Cody w and precedent regarding plan issues and relat	2.80 red matters.	4,410.00
10/30/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze precedent relating to plan matters.	2.60	4,095.00
10/31/24 Review pleadir to plan matters	M A Cody ngs, opinions and precedent regarding plan mat s (.8).	2.60 ters (1.8); review po	4,095.00 otential next steps relating
	Matter Total	62.80	USD 83,357.50
Claims Administration	n		

Review memorandum regarding status of discussions with claimants regarding claim amendments and

10/01/24

M A Cody

0.80

1,260.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 37 of 134 JONES DAY

	J 0 1 1 2 0 2 1			
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 10 er 31, 2024 241307867
1	,			
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
withdrawals.				
10/01/24 Review corresp	B B Erens pondence from Evert regarding claims iss	0.40 sues.		650.00
10/03/24 Review and re (.1).	M A Cody vise draft claim withdrawal and amendme	0.40 ent stipulations (.3); email	to Masiano reg	630.00 arding same
10/17/24 Review corresp	M A Cody pondence related to claims issues.	0.50		787.50
	M A Cody pondence and related materials regarding als regarding same (.7).	1.20 claim withdrawals (.5); re	view memorano	1,890.00 lum and
	Matter Total	3.30	USD	5,217.50
Court Hearings				
10/10/24 Begin preparat	B B Erens tions for October 24 status conference.	0.20		325.00
10/11/24 Call with Eren same (.50).	C K Cahow as, Cody, Lewis, Hirst, Johnson regarding	1.00 October 24, 2024 status h	nearing (.50); pr	1,275.00 epare for
	M A Cody nference with Erens, Cahow, Johnson, Hi nce (.5); meeting with Johnson regarding p			1,260.00 October 24
	B B Erens and attend (.60) call with internal team and ance; communications with Evert regarding			
10/11/24 Attend call wit conference.	J L Gale th Erens, Miller, Cahow, Hirst, Johnson ro	0.50 egarding preparations for	October 24 sta	362.50 tus
10/11/24 Begin preparat	M R Hirst tions for October 24 status conference.	0.60		825.00
	A P Johnson atation for October 24 status conference (or status conference (.5).	0.70 .2); attend call with intern	nal team regardin	647.50 ng
10/12/24 Review outline	C K Cahow e for October 24 status conference.	0.50		637.50
draft outline fo	A P Johnson station for October 24 status conference (or presentation (2.0); review emails from I sterials related to same (3)			

(.2); review materials related to same (.3).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 38 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 11 October 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241307867 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 10/13/24 C K Cahow 1.50 1,912.50 Revise outline for October 24 status conference. 10/13/24 B B Erens 1.50 2,437.50 Prepare for October 24 status conference (1.40); draft emails to Johnson regarding same (.10). 10/13/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review emails from Erens regarding preparations for October 24 status conference (.1); review materials related to same (1.2). 10/14/24 C K Cahow 1.40 1,785.00 Attend meet and confer with Asbestos Committee, Future Claimants' Representative regarding October 24 status conference (.50); call with Johnson regarding outline for same (.40); call with Erens regarding same 10/14/24 M A Cody 2.30 3,622.50 Attend meet and confer with Asbestos Committee, Future Claimants' Representative regarding October 24 status conference matters (.5); review and revise draft outline for October 24 status conference presentation (.7); review related materials (1.1). 10/14/24 B B Erens 2.90 4,712.50 Telephone call with Cahow regarding preparation for October 24 status conference (.30); emails with Rayburn Cooper team regarding same (.20); review and revise outline for presentation regarding same (.60); attend meet and confer with Johnson, Hardman, Ramsey, Evert regarding status conference (.50); follow up with Cahow regarding same (.20); follow up with Miller regarding same (.20); review and revise email to Court regarding same (.20); prepare for meet and confer regarding same (.30); prepare for status conference (.20); emails with McGonigle regarding same (.20). 10/14/24 0.30 412.50 M R Hirst Communicate with internal team regarding preparations for October 24 status conference. 4.70 10/14/24 A P Johnson 4,347.50 Review outline for October 24 status conference (.4); revise same (1.3); analyze materials related to same (1.1); review emails from Erens, Cahow, Dowling regarding same (.4); discuss same with Cahow (.3); attend meet and confer for status conference with Erens, Hardman, Ramsey, Evert (.4); review emails from Miller, Erens regarding status conference logistics (.3); review presentation for status conference (.5). 10/15/24 C K Cahow 2.50 3,187.50 Attend call with internal team and advisors regarding preparations for October 24 status conference (1.00); call with Cody regarding same (.30); review email from Johnson regarding same (.10); communicate with Dowling regarding same (.20); address follow up related to same (.90). 10/15/24 M A Cody 4,882.50 Telephone conference with Cahow regarding preparation for October 24 status conference (.3); review outline and draft presentation regarding same (2.8). 10/15/24 7.00 E M Dowling 5,075.00 Draft and revise materials for October 24 status conference, including presentation and related outline (5.6); communicate with Cahow regarding same (0.2); communicate with Johnson regarding same (0.9); review internal team emails regarding same (0.3).

10/15/24 B B Erens 0.80
Telephone call with McGonigle regarding October 24 status conference (.30); review outline for

1,300.00

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 39 of 134

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 12 October 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241307867 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount presentation regarding same (.20); telephone calls with Johnson regarding same (.30). 10/15/24 A P Johnson 5.80 5,365.00 Review outline for October 24 status conference (.8); revise same (1.3); draft email to Cahow, Erens, Miller regarding same (.1); analyze materials related to same (1.1); review presentation for status conference (1.5); discuss same with Dowling (.7); review emails from Miller, Erens, Waldrep, Thompson regarding status conference logistics (.3). 10/16/24 C K Cahow 3.00 3,825.00 Review and revise materials for October 24 status conference (2.50); communications with Cody, Johnson regarding same (.30); call with Erens regarding same (.20). 10/16/24 M A Cody 2.90 4,567.50 Review and revise drafts of presentation for October 24 status conference (2.3); emails with Johnson and Cahow regarding same (.3); review comments to same (.3). 10/16/24 E M Dowling 6.90 5,002.50 Revise presentation for case status conference (2.0); review Asbestos Committee and Future Claimants' Representative case status reports in connection with same (1.4); confer with Johnson regarding presentation for October 24 status conference (1.0); revise materials regarding same (2.5). 10/16/24 B B Erens 2.80 4,550.00 Review and revise presentation for October 24 status conference (.60); telephone call with Cahow regarding same (.20); telephone calls with Johnson regarding same and preparations (.60); follow up tasks regarding same (.30); emails with Rayburn Copper team regarding same (.20); prepare for status conference (.90). 0.20 10/16/24 M R Hirst 275.00 Review edits to presentation for October 24 status conference. 10/16/24 5.10 A P Johnson 4,717.50 Review outline for October 24 status conference (.3); review presentation for status conference (1.6); revise same (.8); review emails from Erens, Dowling, Cahow, Miller, Cody regarding same (6.); discuss same with Erens (.6); discuss same with Dowling (1.0); review emails from Miller, Hardman regarding logistics for status conference (.2). 10/17/24 C K Cahow 1.20 1,530.00 Call with client, internal team and advisors regarding presentation for October 24 status conference. 10/17/24 3.00 4,725.00 M A Cody Telephone conference with Erens, Cahow, Johnson, Evert, Masiano and Rayburn regarding preparations for October 24 status conference (1.2); review and revise drafts of presentation for same (1.1); review and consider comments to same (.5); telephone conference with Erens regarding same (.2). 10/17/24 E M Dowling

2,755.00

Confer with Johnson, Cody, Erens, Evert, Masiano and Rayburn regarding October 24 status conference preparations (1.2); discuss same with Johnson (.6); draft and revise materials for same (1.0).

10/17/24 2.20 3,575.00 B B Erens Call with Evert, Cahow, Cody, Johnson, Masiano and Rayburn regarding presentation for October 24 status conference (1.20); call with Cody regarding same (.20); prepare for status conference (.80).

10/17/24 412.50 M R Hirst 0.30 Communicate with Evert and Masiano regarding October 24 status conference preparation.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 40 of 134 JONES DAY

		JOINED DITT		
161866				Page: 13 etober 31, 2024
Aldrich	. Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC	Invo	ice: 241307867
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/17/2	Review present same (1.2); draf	A P Johnson ation for October 24 status conference (1.9); revie t emails to Erens, Cahow, Evert regarding same ( ce outline and presentation with Erens, Evert, Ca	(.2); discuss same with Dow	ling (.6); discuss
10/18/2		C K Cahow tober 24 status conference (1.6); emails with John	2.00 son, Dowling regarding sa	2,550.00 me (.4).
10/18/2		M A Cody ise presentation for October 24 status conference	1.30	2,047.50
10/18/2		M R Hirst with Evert and Masiano regarding October 24 sta	0.30 tus conference preparation	412.50
10/18/2	Review present	A P Johnson ation for October 24 status conference (1.3); anal how, Dowling regarding same (.4); discuss same v		2,312.50 ne (.5); review
10/19/2	Review and rev	C K Cahow ise presentation for October 24 status conference (.4); emails with Johnson, Dowling regarding sam		5,992.50 ohnson
10/19/2		E M Dowling e presentation for October 24 status conference (	2.80 2.4); emails with Johnson,	2,030.00 Cahow regarding
10/19/2	Revise presenta	M R Hirst tion in preparation for October 24 status conferes conference (0.1).	1.00 nce (0.9); communicate wit	1,375.00 th Evert
10/19/2	Review present emails to Caho	A P Johnson ation for October 24 status conference (.6); analy w regarding same (.4); review emails from Cahow as conference (.5).		
10/20/2	Review and rev	C K Cahow ise presentation for October 24 status conference ommunications with Dowling, Johnson regarding same (.4).		
10/20/2		M A Cody ise presentation for October 24 status conference ce (.8).	2.30 e (1.5); review and revise dr	3,622.50 raft outline for
10/20/2	Review case sta	E M Dowling tus reports in connection with preparations for C r October 24 status conference (1.2); communications		
10/20/2	Telephone call regarding same	B B Erens with Cahow regarding preparation for October 2-(.20); preparation for presentation (1.50); review regarding same (30)		

consider issues regarding same (.30).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 41 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 14
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241307867

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

10/20/24 A P Johnson 4.60 4,255.00 Review presentation for October 24 status conference (.9); revise same (1.4); analyze materials for same (.5); discuss same with Cahow, Dowling (.8); review emails from Erens, Dowling, Cahow, Masiano regarding same (.4); review outline for status conference (.6).

10/21/24 C K Cahow 4.80 6,120.00 Attend call with co-counsel regarding preparations for October 24 status conference (1.50); prepare for same (1.40); discuss presentation for status conference with Dowling (.50); emails with Johnson, Dowling regarding same (.20); address follow up related to same (1.20).

10/21/24 M A Cody 5.40 8,505.00
Review and revise drafts of presentation for October 24 status conference (2.8); telephone conference with advisors regarding preparation for status conference (1.5); review outline for status conference presentation (1.1).

10/21/24 E M Dowling 7.40 5,365.00 Confer with Cahow, Erens, Johnson, Cody, Evert, Rayburn, Miller and Masiano regarding presentation for October 24 status conference (1.4); revise materials for same (5.5); confer with Cahow regarding revisions to same (0.5).

10/21/24 B B Erens 2.30 3,737.50
Attend call with internal team, client and advisors regarding presentation for October 24 status conference (1.40); prepare regarding same (.30); communications with Hirst, Evert regarding same (.20); review outline for status conference (.40).

10/21/24 M R Hirst 2.10 2,887.50 Review presentation for October 24 status conference (0.4); attend call with client, advisors and internal team regarding same (1.5); communicate with Erens, Evert regarding status conference (0.2).

10/21/24 A P Johnson 4.20 3,885.00 Review presentation for October 24 status conference (1.3); review emails from Cahow, Dowling regarding same (.2); review outline for status conference (.9); analyze materials for same (.3); discuss same with Cahow, Dowling, Erens, Evert, Masiano, Cody (1.5).

10/22/24 C K Cahow 5.90 7,522.50 Review comments and revisions to presentation for October 24 status conference (3.10); follow up with

Erens regarding same (.30); discuss same with Johnson, Dowling (.60); emails with internal team and advisors regarding same (.30); call with Erens regarding same (.30); prepare for status conference (1.30).

10/22/24 M A Cody 2.60 4,095.00 Review and revise drafts of presentation and outlines for October 24 status conference.

10/22/24 E M Dowling 7.90 5,727.50

Draft and revise presentation for October 24 status conference (7.0); confer with Johnson and Cahow regarding same (.6); emails with internal team and advisors regarding same (.3).

10/22/24 B B Erens 2.00 3,250.00 Telephone call with Cahow regarding presentation for October 24 status conference (.30); prepare for same (1.40); follow up call with Cahow regarding presentation (.30).

10/22/24 M R Hirst 0.60 825.00

Review and revise October 24 status conference preparation materials.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 42 of 134

	Document Pagi JONES D	e 42 of 134 <b>DAY</b>	
161866	3		Page: 15
Aldrich Pump	o LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	I	October 31, 2024 nvoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Erens,	A P Johnson w presentation for October 24 status conference , Evert regarding same (.3); discuss same with Do rence logistics from Erens, Miller (.1); review out	owling, Cahow (.6); review email	
	C K Cahow re for October 24 status conference (3.80); comm tation for same (.30); meet with client, internal to		
with E	M A Cody w and revise outline and related presentation for Erens, Evert, Masiano, Cahow, Johnson, Rayburn rence and related matters (3.5).		
	E M Dowling e presentation for October 24 status conference ( ling same and preparations for status conference		2,175.00 and Johnson
confer	B B Erens d meeting with internal and Rayburn Cooper tear rence (4.00); call with Guy regarding same (2.00); nunications with Johnson regarding same (.30); re	call with counsel for Trane rega	rding same (.50);
10/23/24 Comm	M R Hirst nunicate with internal team in preparation for Oc	0.20 ctober 24 status conference.	275.00
confer (1.1); ( (.3); re	A P Johnson d meeting with internal team and Rayburn Coppe rence (4.0); discuss same with Erens (.3); review p discuss same with Dowling, Cahow (.2); review en eview outline for status conference (.6); review en rence (.2).	presentation for status conference mails from Evert, Cahow, Dowl	e (1.6); revise same ing regarding same
	C K Cahow ipate in status conference (5.00); prepare for sam ling same (1.80).	9.70 e (2.90); meet with client, interna	12,367.50 al team and advisors
10/24/24 Attend	M A Cody d status conference (5.2); attend meetings with cl	7.90 ient, internal team and advisors 1	12,442.50 regarding same (2.7).
10/24/24 Telepl	E M Dowling honically attend case status conference.	4.50	3,262.50
	B B Erens re with internal team for status conference (2.10) ling outcome of same (.30).	5.10; attend same (2.70); emails with	8,287.50 internal team
10/24/24	M R Hirst	0.80	1,100.00

same (0.4). 10/24/24 A P Johnson 8.80 8,140.00

Communicate with internal team regarding outcome of status conference (0.4); review presentations from

Review presentation for status conference (.7); revise same (.5); attend meeting with internal team and advisors to prepare for status conference (1.3); prepare for status conference (2.8); attend same (3.5).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 43 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	L.I.		
161866			Octo	Page: 16 ober 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC			e: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/24/24 Telephonica	C K Marshall lly attend portion of status conference.	0.80		1,160.00
10/24/24 Review Asbo	D S Torborg estos Committee's status conference presenta	0.30 tion.		420.00
10/25/24 Telephone o	M A Cody conference with Erens regarding outcome of s	0.50 status conference and	related matters	787.50
	B B Erens all with Evert regarding outcome of October ing same (.50); emails with Rayburn Cooper to			1,625.00 e call with
	Matter Total	234.40	USD	275,242.50
General Corporate a	and Real Estate			
10/23/24 Prepare for	T B Lewis upcoming board meetings.	1.00		1,450.00
10/27/24 Prepare for 1	B B Erens board meetings.	0.50		812.50
10/28/24 Attend boar	M A Cody d meetings.	1.00		1,575.00
10/28/24 Prepare for 1	B B Erens board meetings (.20); preparation with client r	1.70 regarding same (.50); a	attend board m	2,762.50 eetings (1.00).
meetings, in	T B Lewis n call with Tananbaum, Erens and Evert to pr cluding review and revision of outlines for sar ; attend board meeting of 200 Park and Clima	ne (1.3); attend board		
10/30/24 Draft board	T B Lewis meeting minutes.	2.00		2,900.00
10/31/24 Review and same (.1).	M A Cody provide comments to board meeting minutes	0.90 (.8); telephone confe	rence with Lew	1,417.50 is regarding
10/31/24 Review and	T B Lewis revise minutes for board meetings (1.3); partic	1.50 cipate in call with Coo	dy regarding sar	2,175.00 me (0.2).
	Matter Total	13.40	USD	20,052.50
Schedules/SOFA/E	Matter Total  Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting  A P Johnson	<b>13.40</b> 0.30	USD	<b>20,05</b> 2

Draft email to Hakim regarding monthly status reports (.2); review emails from Clarrey, Miller regarding

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 44 of 134 **JONES DAY**

		JONES	DAY	
161866				Page: 17
Aldrich	Pump LLC 2	and Murray Boiler LLC		October 31, 2024 Invoice: 241307867
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	same (.1).			
10/28/2	Review draft m	A P Johnson nonthly status reports (.2); review emainsth Lombardi (.1).	0.60 ls from Bowen, Hakim, Loml	555.00 bardi regarding same (.3);
10/28/2	Review emails	P Lombardi from Hakim, Roeder and Bowen conc ning same (.1); discuss same with John		425.00 s (.2); communicate with
10/29/2	Review draft m	A P Johnson nonthly status reports (.2); review quarreview emails from Hakim, Lombardi		1,017.50 ss same with Cody,
10/29/2	Review month	P Lombardi ly status reports (.5); communicate wit ne (.1); draft email to Hakim concernir		765.00 .2); draft email to Cody
10/30/2	Review month	M A Cody ly status reports for filing (.5); emails w ling same and quarterly fee issues (.2).	0.80 with Lombardi regarding same	1,260.00 e (.1); meeting with
10/30/2	Review month	A P Johnson ly status reports (.1); review emails from hith Miller, Lombardi (.2).	0.50 m Hakim, Lombardi, Roeder	462.50 regarding same (.2);
10/30/2	Review month Miller concerns	P Lombardi ly status reports for filing (.4); review A ing same (.1); draft email to Roeder co concerning same (.2); draft email to Co	ncerning quarterly fee stateme	ents (.1); communicate
10/31/2		M A Cody ly fee statements.	0.10	157.50
10/31/2		A P Johnson ly fee statements (.2); review emails fro	0.50 om Hakim, Lombardi, Roede	462.50 r, Cody, Miller regarding
		Matter Total	6.40	USD 6,317.50
Nonwo	rking Travel			
10/23/2		C K Cahow lotte for status conference.	4.00	2,550.00
10/23/2		M A Cody lotte for status conference.	2.50	1,968.75
10/23/2		B B Erens lotte for status conference.	2.50	2,031.25
10/23/2		A P Johnson lotte for status conference.	3.50	1,618.75

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 45 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT	Ĺ		
161866			Octo	Page: 18 ber 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC			: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
10/24/24 Return trav	C K Cahow rel from Charlotte after status conference.	4.00		2,550.00
10/24/24 Return trav	M A Cody rel from Charlotte after status conference.	2.50		1,968.75
10/24/24 Return trav	B B Erens rel from Charlotte after status conference.	3.00		2,437.50
10/24/24 Return trav	A P Johnson rel from Charlotte after status conference.	2.50		1,156.25
	Matter Total	24.50	USD	16,281.25
Litigation and Adv	ersary Proceedings			
10/01/24 Review ord	P Lombardi ler extending removal period (.1); draft email to 2	0.20 Miller and Lindsay o	concerning same	170.00
	B B Erens call with Evans regarding amicus briefing in Bes 20); telephone call with Marshall regarding same			
10/11/24 Calls with I relating to s	C K Marshall Erens regarding Bestwall Fourth Circuit appeal o same.	0.20 of order denying disr	missal and amicu	290.00 as issues
10/14/24 Review pre	P Lombardi cedent from relevant case raising related litigatio	1.20 on issues.		1,020.00
10/23/24 Review lett proceeding	M R Hirst er from Asbestos Committee regarding discover s.	0.20 y matters in derivati	ive litigation adv	275.00 versary
10/23/24 Review lett proceeding	D S Torborg er from the Asbestos Committee on discovery n s.	0.20 natters in derivative	litigation advers	280.00 sary
10/25/24 Analyze let	M R Hirst ter from Asbestos Committee regarding derivati	0.30 ve litigation adversa	ry proceeding di	412.50 iscovery.
10/28/24 Review em	M A Cody ails and hearing transcripts regarding derivative l	0.80 itigation adversary p	proceeding disco	1,260.00 overy issues.
10/30/24 Review and	C K Cahow I analyze materials in connection with dismissal a	1.20 appeals matters.		1,530.00
10/30/24 Review and	M A Cody I analyze transcripts and pleadings related to disr	1.80 missal appeals issues	i.	2,835.00
10/30/24	B B Erens	0.50		812.50

Telephone call with Marshall regarding amicus briefs in connection with Bestwall Fourth Circuit appeal of

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 46 of 134

JONES DAY

	JUNES	DAI	
161866			Page: 19 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	denying dismissal (.20); review correspondence on adversary proceeding discovery (.30).	e from Asbestos Committee r	egarding derivative
10/31/24 Comm	M R Hirst nunicate with Trane team regarding derivative	0.20 litigation adversary proceedin	275.00 gs.
	Matter Total	7.50	USD 10,297.50
Professional R	etention/Fee Issues		
10/01/24 Update	C L Smith e electronic file management system with mon	0.10 athly statements.	52.50
10/02/24 Review	M A Cody v professional monthly statements.	0.30	472.50
10/02/24 Review	L C Fischer v and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports	4.00 in connection with Jones Day	2,600.00 y supplemental disclosure.
	A P Johnson email to Bowen regarding billing questions (.1) ing same (.2).	0.30 ); review emails from Ankura,	277.50 Orrick, Winston
10/08/24 Review	M A Cody w monthly statements from professionals.	0.50	787.50
10/09/24 Review	L C Fischer v and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports	1.80 in connection with Jones Day	1,170.00 y supplemental disclosure.
10/09/24 Update	C L Smith e electronic file management system with mon	0.10 nthly statements.	52.50
10/10/24 Review	L C Fischer v and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports	3.50 in connection with Jones Day	2,275.00 y supplemental disclosure.
10/11/24 Update	C L Smith e electronic file management system with mon	0.10 nthly statements.	52.50
10/12/24 Review	A P Johnson v charts related to outstanding amounts.	0.20	185.00
10/14/24 Review	J L Gale v ordinary course professional monthly statem	0.60 nents.	435.00
	A P Johnson v ordinary course professional monthly statem wen regarding outstanding payments (.1).	0.50 nent (.2); review materials rela	462.50 ted to same (.2); draft email
	A P Johnson v emails from Pratt regarding ordinary course parties (.1); draft email to Bowen regarding or		462.50 ent (.2); submit same to

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 47 of 134 JONES DAY

161866	<b>J</b> 0 2 1 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2	_	Page: 20 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/15/24 Communication	E Pratt ons with Johnson regarding ordinary course p	0.20 professional billing matte	75.00 ers.
10/22/24 Review emails Wright regard	A P Johnson s from Felder, Wright regarding outstanding a ing same (.2).	0.40 amounts (.2); draft emails	370.00 s to Bowen, Felder,
10/24/24 Review Bates	P Lombardi White monthly statement for privilege.	1.60	1,360.00
10/25/24 Telephone cal	B B Erens ll with Hardman regarding Winston Strawn m	0.20 nonthly statements.	325.00
10/25/24 Review ordina	J L Gale ary course professional and professionals' mo	0.50 onthly statements.	362.50
10/25/24 Review emails Gale regardiną	A P Johnson s from Bowen, Erens, Hardman regarding mo g same (.1).	0.30 onthly statements (.2); dr	277.50 aft emails to Bonito,
10/25/24 Update electro	C L Smith onic file management system with monthly st	0.10 ratements.	52.50
10/27/24 Review AlixPa	A P Johnson artners' monthly statements (.2); draft email to	0.30 o Bonito regarding same	277.50 (.1).
Bowen regard	A P Johnson s from Hardman, Felder, Wright regarding outing same (.4); review Winston Strawn interimentice parties (.2).		
concerning sa- statement and application (.1 application (.2 concerning Ev	P Lombardi arn Cooper Durham monthly statement (.5); of me and interim fee application (.2); communicate with interim fee application (.2); communicate with ); communicate with Cumbo concerning Bate (2); draft email to Smith concerning Claro intervert Weathersby Houff interim fee application conthly statements (.2).	icate with Steele concernith Bonito concerning Ales White monthly statement in fee application (.1); c	ing K&L Gates monthly ixPartners interim fee tent and interim fee communicate with Canup
	A P Johnson s from Cumbo, Steele regarding outstanding a sp; review LAS interim fee application (.3).	0.90 amounts (.2); review Win	832.50 ston Strawn interim fee
	P Lombardi Weathersby Houff monthly statement (.8); d nonthly statement (.2); review Bates White m		1,020.00 terning same (.1); review
	J L Gale Pratt and Johnson regarding ordinary course mary course professional (0.8).	1.00 e professional monthly st	725.00 ratement (0.2); prepare
10/30/24	A P Johnson	1.10	1,017.50

Review emails from Bowen regarding outstanding amounts (.2); draft response to same (.4); discuss same

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 48 of 134 JONES DAY

		JUNES DA	LI		
161866				Octol	Page: 21 per 31, 2024
Aldrich Pu	amp LLC and Murray Boiler	LLC			: 241307867
Date of Ser	vice Timekeeper/Fee Ea	arner Name	Hours		Amount
	th Cody, Lombardi (.2); review em nails regarding ordinary course pro				s (.1); review
	E Pratt ommunicate with ordinary course p mmunicate with Gale regarding sa				
10/30/24 U <sub>1</sub>	C L Smith	ystem with monthly	0.10 statements.		52.50
10/31/24 U <sub>1</sub>	C L Smith odate electronic file management s	system with monthly s	0.10 statements.		52.50
	Matter Total		23.90	USD	18,725.00
Fee Applic	ation Preparation				
10/02/24 Re	C L Smith eview and revise September invoice	e for privilege and co	2.20 mpliance.		1,155.00
10/03/24 Re	C L Smith eview and revise September invoic	e for privilege and co	0.80 mpliance.		420.00
10/04/24 Re	C L Smith eview and revise September invoic	e for privilege and co	0.60 mpliance.		315.00
10/07/24 Re	C L Smith	e for privilege and co	1.70 mpliance.		892.50
10/10/24 Re	C L Smith eview and revise September invoic	e for privilege and co	0.80 mpliance.		420.00
10/14/24 Re	C L Smith eview and revise September invoic	e for privilege and co	0.60 mpliance.		315.00
10/15/24 Re	B B Erens eview September invoice for privile	ege and compliance.	0.30		487.50
10/21/24 Eı	C L Smith nails with Johnson, Lombardi rega	arding September mo	0.10 nthly statement matters.		52.50
10/24/24 Co	C L Smith ommunications with Fresenko regr	arding September inv	0.10 oice matters.		52.50
10/28/24 E <sub>1</sub>	C L Smith mails with Fresenko regarding Sep	tember invoice matte	0.10		52.50
10/29/24 Re	P Lombardi eview September monthly stateme	nt (.4); draft email to	0.50 Smith concerning same	(.1).	425.00
	A P Johnson eview September monthly statement plication (.1); review materials for		0.60 rom Lombardi regarding	Jones Day in	555.00 aterim fee

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 49 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	<b>1</b> 1	
161866			Page: 22 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump L	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	P Lombardi ail to Fresenko and Ernst concerning Jones Day revise interim fee application (.3); analyze mon		
10/30/24 Submit Se	C L Smith eptember monthly statement to notice parties.	0.10	52.50
10/31/24 Review m	A P Johnson naterials for Jones Day interim fee application.	0.20	185.00
	Matter Total	10.80	USD 7,165.00
Asbestos Matters			
10/01/24 Revise cas	C K Cahow se status report (2.4); discuss same with Dowlin	3.10 g (.5); discuss same wit	3,952.50 h Erens (.2).
	M A Cody ications with Erens regarding case status report review case status report and related materials		6,457.50 ence with Miller regarding
10/01/24 Confer w	E M Dowling ith Cahow regarding case status report.	0.50	362.50
telephone telephone regarding	B B Erens e call with client regarding case status report (.3) c call with Evert regarding same (.20); conference c call with Ramsey regarding preparation for case same (.30); call with internal team regarding same on for October 24 status conference (.50); telep	the with Cody regarding the status filings (.20); telephone call	revisions to same (.60); ephone call with Guy with Miller regarding
Committe	M R Hirst asse status report (0.8); communicate with internet regarding estimation matters (0.2); diligence to cate with internal team regarding estimation plant	regarding planning for e	
10/01/24 Review ca	A P Johnson ase status report (.6); review emails from Miller,	0.80 Erens, Hirst regarding	740.00 estimation (.2).
10/02/24 Revise cas	C K Cahow se status report (1.0); communications with Ere	1.20 ens regarding same (.2).	1,530.00
conference	M A Cody and revise case status report (3.8); telephone con the with Erens regarding same (.3); telephone con this regarding same (.3).		
	B B Erens or call with client regarding case status report (		

Cody regarding same (.30); follow up with Cahow regarding same (.20); call with Hirst regarding same (.30);

review comments from Cahow to case status report (.20).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 50 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES D	AI	
161866			Page: 23 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/02/24 Review and re estimation ma	M R Hirst evise draft case status report (1.7); draft con atters (0.2); communicate with Erens regard	2.10 rrespondence to Asbestos Co ding case status report (0.2).	2,887.50 ommittee regarding
	C K Cahow anbaum, Erens, Hirst, Evert regarding case same with Cody (.3); discuss same with Er		
	M A Cody onferences with Miller regarding case statusing same (.5); review and revise draft case sine (.3).		
client call rega case status rep	B B Erens ly and Evert regarding case status report (.9 arding case status (.80); prepare regarding s port (.60); emails with Hirst and Evert rega scovery protocol (.20).	same (.20); review materials fr	om Miller regarding
	M R Hirst ith Tananbaum regarding case status (1.0); evise draft correspondence to Wright regarding same (0.2).		
10/03/24 Review case s	A P Johnson status report (.3); review emails from Caho	0.40 w, Erens regarding same (.1).	370.00
materials in co	M A Cody evise drafts of case status report (3.4); revie connection with same (1.3); communication arding comments to report and related issu	ns with Erens regarding same	. ,
	B B Erens ons to case status report (.50); telephone can ne (2.60); telephone call with Cody regardin		6,175.00 (.20); review and revise
10/04/24 Attend calls w	J L Gale with Cody regarding case status report (0.8)	4.50); revise case status report (3.7	3,262.50
10/04/24 Review case s	A P Johnson status report (.7); review emails from Caho	0.80 w, Erens, Gale regarding same	740.00 e (.1).
10/05/24 Review revise	C K Cahow ed case status report and comment on same	3.30 e.	4,207.50
	B B Erens ation for October 24 statuom Cahow (.30).	0.50 as conference (.20); review cas	812.50 se status report
10/06/24 Review comm	C K Cahow nents to case status report.	0.50	637.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 51 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES D.	ΛI	
161866 Aldrich Pump l	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 24 October 31, 2024 Invoice: 241307867
1	,		
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/06/24 Review :	B B Erens revisions to case status report.	0.50	812.50
10/07/24 Review :	C K Cahow and revise case status report (1.8); discuss same	2.10 with Cody (.3).	2,677.50
issues re regardin	M A Cody and revise drafts of case status report (5.5); com- clating to same (.8); review materials in connection g same (.5); telephone conferences with Cahow g comments to case status report (.3).	on with same (1.3); comm	unications with Erens
with clie	B B Erens revisions to case status report (.50); telephone can regarding same (.20); call with Future Claima case status report (.50).		
	J L Gale case status report with Cody (0.8); revise case steport (1.8); discuss same with Johnson (.2).	9.60 atus report (6.8); draft ma	6,960.00 aterials related to case
	M R Hirst nicate with Wright, Asbestos Committee counse ion with estimation discovery.	0.30 el regarding claims file col	412.50 lection status in
	A P Johnson case status report (.8); analyze materials related to Cody regarding same (.3); discuss same with Gale		1,572.50 from Tananbaum, Erens,
follow u review a	M A Cody one conference with Erens, Johnson, Evert and Operalls with internal team regarding same (.8); countries drafts of case status report (4.8); common with Johnson regarding comments and filing	ommunications with Eren nunications with Gale reg	s regarding same (.3); arding same (.5); telephone
with Co	B B Erens with client regarding issues relating to case status dy and review revised case status report (.20); case case status report (.50).		
	J L Gale call with Erens, Johnson, Cody regarding case st nications with Cody regarding same (.5).	2.20 atus report (0.3); revise ca	1,595.00 se status report (1.4);
10/08/24 Commu	M R Hirst nicate with internal team regarding case status re	0.30 eport.	412.50
	A P Johnson case status report (.7); discuss same with Erens, filing matters with Cody (.4); discuss same with S		1,757.50 me (.4); discuss same and
10/08/24 Commu	C L Smith nications with Johnson regarding case status rep	0.10 port and filing matters rela	52.50 sting to same.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 52 of 134

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 25 October 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241307867 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 10/09/24 C K Cahow 1,275.00 Review and comment on case status report (.50); discuss same with Cody (.50). 10/09/24 M A Cody 8.10 12,757.50 Review and revise drafts of case status report (3.8); review and analyze comments to same (1.6); communications with Tananbaum regarding same (.3); communications with Sands regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Evert regarding open issues and comments (.2); communications with Erens regarding status report and comments (.3); telephone conferences with Cahow regarding status report and related comments (.5); telephone conference with Johnson regarding open issues and filing process (.3); communications with Gale regarding case status report and related comments (.8). 10/09/24 1,787.50 Emails with internal team regarding case status report filing (.30); telephone call with client regarding same (.20); telephone calls with Cody and Evert regarding same (.40); emails with internal team regarding same 10/09/24 I L Gale 9.70 7,032.50 Discuss case status report with Johnson (0.3); discuss case status report with Cody (0.8); revise case status report (4.9); email with Hirst regarding revisions to same (.2); review revisions from client (0.9); further revise case status report (2.6). 10/09/24 M R Hirst 1.80 2,475.00 Revise case status report (1.6); communicate with Cody, Gale regarding same (0.2). 2,405.00 10/09/24 A P Johnson Revise case status report (1.0); discuss same and related filing matters with Cody (.3); review same (.9); review emails from Tananbaum, Gale, Cody, Cahow regarding same (.4). 10/10/24 C K Cahow 3,060.00 Review and revise case status report (2.0); discuss same with Cody, Erens, Johnson and Gale (.4). 10/10/24 M A Cody 7.60 11,970.00 Review and revise drafts of case status report (3.8); review related comments (1.1); communications with Gale regarding same and related comments (.8); telephone conferences with Erens, Johnson, Gale and Cahow regarding same (.4); telephone conferences with Johnson regarding comments and filing matters (.3); communications with Smith regarding filing of status report (.1); review Future Claimants' Representative status report (.8); review Asbestos Committee status report (.3). 10/10/24 1.80 2,925.00 B B Erens Review outline regarding asbestos matters and potential next steps relating to same (.30); telephone calls with Johnson, Cahow and Cody regarding case status report and filing matters relating to same (.50); review revisions regarding same (.30); review case status report for filing (.70). 10/10/24 J L Gale 6,742.50 Revise case status report (6.0); discuss same with Cody (.8); calls with Cody, Cahow, Erens and Johnson regarding same (.5); communications with Smith regarding same (.1); review comments to case status report (1.6); emails with client and internal team regarding same (.3). 10/10/24 M R Hirst 1.20 1,650.00

10/10/24 A P Johnson 4.60 4,255.00 Revise case status report (1.7); review same (2.1); review emails from Tananbaum, Gale, Cody, Cahow

Review and revise case status report (1.0); draft email to Cody, Gale regarding same (0.2).

regarding same (.3); discuss same with Erens, Gale, Cahow, Cody (.3); draft emails to Smith, Miller regarding

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 53 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	11	
161866			Page: 26 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pun	np LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241307867
Date of Servi	ce Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
sam	2 (.2).		
	C L Smith amunications with Gale regarding case status report ( munications with Johnson regarding same (.20); prep		
10/11/24 Revi	M A Cody ew and analyze case status reports (3.2); communicat	3.30 tions with Erens regarding sa	5,197.50 mme (.1).
10/11/24 Revi	J L Gale ew Asbestos Committee case status report.	0.40	290.00
	A P Johnson ew Asbestos Committee case status report (1.9); revi rt (1.4); review Maune Raichle case status report (.9);		
10/11/24 Revi	P Lombardi ew case status reports (2.1); communicate with Johns	2.20 son concerning same (.1).	1,870.00
	B B Erens ew case law regarding case status reports (.20); review e (.30); further review case status reports and consider		
	B B Erens ew memorandum regarding estimation issues (1.00); rding same (.50).	1.50 emails with internal team an	2,437.50 d Bates White
10/13/24 Revi	A P Johnson ew Asbestos Committee case status report (.8); revie	1.00 w emails from Erens regardi	925.00 ng same (.2).
	E M Dowling ew and analyze Asbestos Committee, Future Claimar rts (3.5); communicate with Johnson regarding same		2,900.00 ne Raichle case status
10/15/24 Call	C K Cahow with Bates White regarding estimation matters.	0.30	382.50
conf (.30)	B B Erens phone calls with Evert regarding estimation issues (.5 erence with Cody regarding same (.20); prepare for c ; attend Bates White call regarding estimation (.50); c ; prepare for upcoming calls (.40).	call with Trane counsel regard	ding upcoming filings
10/15/24 Revi	J L Gale ew Future Claimants' Representative's case status rep	0.20 port.	145.00
10/15/24 Atte	A P Johnson nd call with Bates White and Erens, Evert, Cody, Ma	0.50 asiano regarding estimation.	462.50
	E Pratt amunicate with Hirst regarding estimation discovery of t and Masiano regarding issues relating to same (.6); of		

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 54 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES	DAI	
161866			Page: 27 October 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC	1	nvoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/15/24 Review case sta	D S Torborg atus reports.	0.50	700.00
	B B Erens in relevant case raising related estimat s of pending matters in case (.20).	0.50 tion discovery issues (.30); prepare	812.50 e for client call
10/16/24 Review estimat	A P Johnson tion motion filed in case raising related	0.50 issues.	462.50
	B B Erens all regarding case status, next steps (.30 imation discovery (.20).	0.50 )); review updates from Bestwall p	812.50 proceeding
10/17/24 Attend call wit	M R Hirst h Tananbaum regarding case status and	0.70 d next steps (.3); prepare for same	962.50 (.4).
10/17/24 Monitor hearin (2.3).	P Lombardi ng in Bestwall concerning estimation di	6.90 scovery matters (4.6); draft summ	5,865.00 ary concerning same
10/18/24 Attend call wit	M R Hirst h Tananbaum regarding case status.	0.70	962.50
10/18/24 Review summa	A P Johnson ary of Bestwall hearing concerning estin	0.60 mation matters.	555.00
10/22/24 Attend call wit	C K Cahow h Bates White regarding estimation.	0.50	637.50
10/22/24 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with Bates White regarding est	0.50 timation issues.	787.50
10/22/24 Attend Bates V	B B Erens White call regarding estimation.	0.50	812.50
10/22/24 Attend Bates V	M R Hirst White call regarding estimation (0.5); att	1.10 tend estimation work in process c	1,512.50 all (0.6).
10/24/24 Review motion	B B Erens in Bestwall relating to estimation disc	0.30 overy issues.	487.50
10/25/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with Evert regarding estimation next st	0.30 teps (0.1); diligence regarding sam	412.50 e (0.2).
10/28/24 Attend call wit	B B Erens h internal team regarding status and ne	0.50 ext steps.	812.50
10/28/24 Review preced	M R Hirst ent materials regarding estimation issue	1.20 es.	1,650.00
10/28/24 Attend call wit	D S Torborg h internal team regarding development	0.20 as and planning.	280.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 55 of 134 **JONES DAY**

Page: 28

161866

Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC	I	October 31, 2024 nvoice: 241307867
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
10/29/24 Telephone co	M A Cody nference with Bates White team regardin	0.50 ng estimation issues.	787.50
10/29/24 Attend Bates (.50).	B B Erens White call regarding estimation (.50); cal	1.00 l with Guy regarding status of pe	1,625.00 nding matters in case
	M R Hirst White call regarding estimation (0.5); conduction of claim files in estimation disco		1,100.00 by Houff team
	A P Johnson stos Committee's status report (.2); attendeding estimation (.5).	0.70 d call with Bates White and Eren	647.50 s, Evert, Cody,
10/29/24 Review and re	J M Jones espond to memo from Hirst concerning	0.30 document production in estimati	525.00 on discovery.
	E Pratt ons with advisors regarding plan for revir attorney review (2.8); draft email to Hi		
10/30/24 Review motion	B B Erens on in Bestwall regarding estimation disco	0.30 very matters.	487.50
10/30/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with Evert regarding estimation planning	0.20 ng matters.	275.00
	C K Cahow anbaum, Evert, Hirst, and Erens regardi epare for same (.80).	1.50 ng asbestos matters and potential	1,912.50 I next steps relating to
10/31/24 Prepare for cl (.60).	BB Erens ient call regarding asbestos matters and 1	0.80 potential next steps (.20); attend o	1,300.00 call regarding same
	M R Hirst rt regarding estimation planning matters ding asbestos matters and potential next		2,475.00 , internal team and
	Matter Total	199.30 U	SD 243,700.00

Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 56 of 134

JONES DAY Case 20-30608 Doc 2576

161866 Page: 29 October 31, 2024

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Disbursement Detail

Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date Location Amount Total

Invoice: 241307867

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

### FIFTY-THIRD MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2024

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Fifty-Third Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From November 1, 2024 Through November 30, 2024 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

#### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

1. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period November 1, 2024 through November 30, 2024 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

#### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$293,755.00
Total Expenses	\$3,446.97
TOTAL	\$297,201.97

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 58 of 134

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$267,826.47 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

#### **Billing Adjustments**

4. Consistent with its own internal policies and to comply with the "reasonableness" requirements of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Jones Day has reviewed its monthly service descriptions and expense detail and has determined that certain fees and expenses should not be charged to the Debtors. In particular, Jones Day has voluntarily determined that \$416.06 in expenses will not be charged to the Debtors. This Monthly Fee Statement reflects this adjustment.

#### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

5. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this
Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively,
the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036
(Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the
United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North
Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel
to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc.,
(I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103
(Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four
Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq.,
abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter
& English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019
(Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC,

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 59 of 134

1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 6. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than January 13, 2025 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 7. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 8. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 60 of 134

Dated: December 30, 2024 Chicago, Illinois Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 61 of 134

#### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

#### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

November 30, 2024 161866 Invoice: 241308427

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through November 30, 2024:

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	13.80	17,627.50
Automatic Stay	0.70	970.00
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	10.20	16,065.00
Claims Administration	5.60	8,820.00
General Corporate and Real Estate	2.60	3,897.50
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator		
Reporting	5.10	5,375.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	25.40	35,967.50
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	117.80	96,097.50
Fee Application Preparation	27.90	23,052.50
Asbestos Matters	66.70	85,882.50
Total Fees	275.80 USD	293,755.00
Total Billed Disbursements	USD _	3,446.97_**
TOTAL	USD	297,201.97

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 63 of 134 JONES DAY

Page: 2

November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

161866

#### Disbursement & Charges Summary

Travel - Air Fare	2,493.60
Travel - Food and Beverage Expenses	35.11
Travel - Hotel Charges	487.62
Travel - Taxi Charges	430.64

USD 3,446.97 \*\*

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 64 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3 November 30, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – November 30, 2024

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	4.90	1,275.00	6,247.50
M A Cody	Partner	1996	60.30	1,575.00	94,972.50
B B Erens	Partner	1991	14.60	1,625.00	23,725.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.10	2,000.00	200.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	20.70	1,375.00	28,462.50
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	2.40	1,450.00	3,480.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	1.20	1,400.00	1,680.00
Total			104.20		158,767.50
A Anderson	Associate	2021	5.20	825.00	4,290.00
J L Gale	Associate	2022	34.10	725.00	24,722.50
R Hart	Associate	2021	1.00	825.00	825.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	32.00	925.00	29,600.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	61.40	850.00	52,190.00
A R Pruitt	Associate	2023 _	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
Total			137.70		114,427.50
L C Fischer	Staff Attorney	1996	22.10	650.00	14,365.00
Total			22.10		14,365.00
C L Smith	Paralegal	_	11.80	525.00	6,195.00
Total			11.80		6,195.00
Total		_	275.80	USD	293,755.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 65 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 4

November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Fee Detail

	Fee Detail		
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Case Administration a	and Business Operations		
11/01/24 Attend work is	C K Cahow n process call with company, internal team and	0.80 advisors.	1,020.00
11/01/24 Telephone cor	M A Cody nference with client and advisors regarding wor	0.70 k in process matters.	1,102.50
11/01/24 Attend client v	B B Erens work in process call.	0.70	1,137.50
11/01/24 Attend client v	M R Hirst work in process call (0.7); prepare for same (0.2)	0.90	1,237.50
11/01/24 Attend work is	A P Johnson process call with client and advisors.	0.60	555.00
11/01/24 Participate in v	T B Lewis work in process call with client and advisors.	0.80	1,160.00
11/01/24 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/01/24 Attend work is	D S Torborg a process call with client and advisors.	0.70	980.00
11/02/24 Draft calendar	J L Gale of key dates and deadlines.	0.20	145.00
11/05/24 Review and di	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/06/24 Communicate	C K Cahow with internal team regarding case administratio	0.20 on matters.	255.00
11/06/24 Review and an and work in pr	M A Cody alyze status conference transcript and related mocess.	1.50 naterials regarding case	2,362.50 e administration matters
11/06/24 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/06/24 Update electro	C L Smith onic file management system with case materials	0.10 s.	52.50
11/07/24 Analyze matte	C K Cahow rs related to next steps.	0.20	255.00
11/07/24 Review and dissystem with sa	C L Smith stribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed docume (.10).	0.20 ments and update elec	105.00 tronic file management

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 66 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES DI	11	
161866 Aldrich Pump LL	.C and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 5 November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/08/24 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/11/24 Coordinate	C K Cahow with internal team regarding work in process.	0.30	382.50
11/11/24 Prepare for	B B Erens rupcoming work in process calls.	0.20	325.00
11/11/24 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/12/24 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/13/24 Prepare for	B B Erens rupcoming work in process calls.	0.20	325.00
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed on same (.10); update case calendar (.10).	0.30 documents and update	157.50 electronic file management
	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed on same (.10); update case calendar (.10).	0.30 documents and update	157.50 electronic file management
11/15/24 Review and	C L Smith I distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/18/24 Review and	C L Smith I distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/19/24 Attend wor	C K Cahow rk in process call with internal team and adviso	0.50 ors.	637.50
	M A Cody conference with advisors regarding work in p (.5); review and analyze email summary from I		
11/19/24 Attend adv	B B Erens isor work in process call.	0.60	975.00
11/19/24 Attend wor	M R Hirst rk in process call with advisors.	0.50	687.50
11/19/24 Attend wor	A P Johnson rk in process call with advisors.	0.50	462.50
11/19/24 Review and	C L Smith I distribute docket.	0.10	52.50
11/20/24 Review and	C L Smith d distribute docket.	0.10	52.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 67 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DAT			
161866				Page: 6 per 30, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
11/21/24 Review and di	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10		52.50
11/22/24 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10		52.50
	Matter Total	13.80	USD	17,627.50
Automatic Stay				
11/11/24 Emails with M review order (.	M A Cody Eiller regarding draft order for submission to Court 2).	0.30 relating to Se	mian lift stay mo	472.50 tion (.1);
11/18/24 Call with inter	P Lombardi nal team regarding Semian lift stay order.	0.10		85.00
11/27/24 Review materi	M R Hirst als relating to Semian Fourth Circuit appeal of stay	0.30 order.		412.50
	Matter Total	0.70	USD	970.00
Plan of Reorganizatio	n and Disclosure Statement			
11/01/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and related memoranda regar	2.70 ding same.		4,252.50
11/04/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze materials regarding plan issues (.8); diligence	1.30 regarding sam	ne (.5).	2,047.50
11/05/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and related materials.	1.80		2,835.00
11/06/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan precedent and consider open issues.	2.20		3,465.00
11/07/24 Review plan p	M A Cody recedent and related materials.	1.10		1,732.50
11/08/24 Review and an	M A Cody alyze plan and related precedent.	1.10		1,732.50
	Matter Total	10.20	USD	16,065.00
Claims Administration	n			
11/04/24 Review and re	M A Cody vise claim amendment and withdrawal stipulations.	0.50		787.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 68 of 134 JONES DAY

	JONES DAT			
161866				Page: 7 per 30, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
11/05/24 Emails with M	M A Cody fasiano and Miller regarding claims stipulations.	0.20		315.00
11/06/24 Review and ar	M A Cody nalyze hearing transcripts and materials regarding c	2.80 laims treatmen	t issues.	4,410.00
11/13/24 Review claims	M A Cody database update and related emails.	0.50		787.50
	M A Cody pondence and related materials regarding requests objection precedent and claim objection procedure		drawals (.8); revi	2,520.00 ew and
	Matter Total	5.60	USD	8,820.00
General Corporate an	d Real Estate			
11/06/24 Review and ar	T B Lewis nalyze issues related to corporate matters.	1.00		1,450.00
11/18/24 Attend call wi	C K Cahow th insurers regarding case status update.	0.10		127.50
11/18/24 Telephone con same (.3).	M A Cody nference with insurers regarding case status and up	0.60 odate (.3); revie	w materials in pr	945.00 reparation for
11/18/24 Prepare for ca	B B Erens ll with insurers regarding case status update (.10); a	0.40 attend same (.3	0).	650.00
11/20/24 Participate in o	T B Lewis call with Tananbaum and others regarding corpora	0.50 ate matters.		725.00
	Matter Total	2.60	USD	3,897.50
Schedules/SOFA/Ba	nkruptcy Administrator Reporting			
11/01/24 Communicate (.1).	P Lombardi with Johnson concerning monthly status reports (	0.20 (.1); draft email	to Miller concer	170.00 ming same
11/06/24 Review email	A P Johnson from Lombardi, Hakim regarding monthly status r	0.10 reports.		92.50
	P Lombardi Hakim and Clarrey concerning monthly status reperning same (.1).	0.20 port deadlines (	(.1); communicat	170.00 e with
11/15/24 Review month	A P Johnson aly status reports (.2); draft emails to Hirst, Lewis r	0.40 egarding same	(.2).	370.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 69 of 134 JONES DAY

		J = \_\		
161866 Aldrich		nd Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 8 November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427
Tuditeii	Tump EEC a	nd Muliay Doller LLC		111VOICE. 241500427
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/20/2	24 Review monthly	A P Johnson y status reports.	0.20	185.00
11/20/2	Review draft m	P Lombardi onthly status reports (.4); review em with Johnson concerning same (.1).	0.60 nails from Hakim and Bowen re	510.00 egarding same (.1);
11/21/2	Communicate v	P Lombardi with Johnson concerning monthly st email to Hakim and Clarrey concer		340.00 with Cody concerning
11/22/2		M A Cody f monthly status reports (.5); emails	0.70 with Lombardi regarding sam	1,102.50 e (.2).
11/22/2		P Lombardi onthly status reports (.1); communic ng same (.1).	0.30 cate with Hakim concerning sa	255.00 me (.1); communicate with
11/25/2		M A Cody ersions of monthly status reports (.5	0.60 ); emails with Lombardi regard	945.00 ling same (.1).
11/25/2		A P Johnson related to monthly status reports fro	0.60 m Hakim, Lombardi (.4); discu	555.00 ass same with Hakim,
11/25/2	Review monthly	P Lombardi y status reports (.4); draft email to F cerning same (.1); draft emails to Co te (.1).		
		Matter Total	5.10	USD 5,375.00
Litigati	on and Adversa	ry Proceedings		
11/01/2	Telephone conf	M A Cody ference with Trane counsel regardin ed matters (.4); review and analyze of		
11/01/2		B B Erens Trane counsel regarding derivative	0.30 litigation adversary proceeding	487.50 g discovery.
11/01/2		M R Hirst Trane counsel relating to derivativ	0.40 e litigation adversary proceedir	550.00 ag discovery.
11/01/2		A P Johnson Trane counsel relating to derivativ	0.30 e litigation adversary proceedir	277.50 ag discovery.
11/04/2		M A Cody llyze amicus brief in Bestwall Fourth	1.80 n Circuit dismissal appeal.	2,835.00
11/04/2		M R Hirst e plan for derivative litigation adver-	1.30 sary proceeding discovery (1.10	1,787.50 )); review meet and confer

letters regarding same (.20).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 70 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DA	11	
161866			Page: 9 November 30, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/05/24 Draft and rev	M R Hirst vise plan for derivative litigation adversary p	1.00 proceeding discovery.	1,375.00
11/08/24 Review amic	B B Erens us briefs in Bestwall Fourth Circuit dismissa	0.30 ıl appeal.	487.50
11/10/24 Review and a	C K Cahow analyze Fourth Circuit Bestwall amicus brief	1.60 ing on dismissal.	2,040.00
11/11/24 Review and a and cases (1.8	M A Cody analyze amicus briefs in Bestwall Fourth Circ 8).	4.30 cuit dismissal appeal (2.5); re	6,772.50 eview related materials
11/12/24 Review and a	M A Cody analyze Bestwall Fourth Circuit dismissal app	1.30 peal amicus briefs.	2,047.50
11/13/24 Emails with a adversary pro	M R Hirst internal team regarding status and next steps occeedings.	0.80 s relating to discovery in deri	1,100.00 ivative litigation
11/14/24 Prepare for r	M R Hirst meeting with Trane counsel regarding deriva	0.80 tive litigation adversary proc	1,100.00 eeedings.
11/15/24 Call with Tra	C K Cahow ane counsel relating to discovery in derivativ	0.20 e litigation adversary proceed	255.00 dings.
11/15/24 Conference of proceedings.	M A Cody call with internal team and Trane counsel rel	0.30 lating to discovery in derivati	472.50 ive litigation adversary
	R Hart est regarding discovery in derivative litigation connection with same (.5).	0.80 n adversary proceedings (.3)	660.00 ; review prior document
proceedings	M R Hirst with Trane team and internal team relating to (0.3); prepare for same (0.6); review derivation unicate with Anderson and Hart regarding sa	ve litigation adversary proces	
11/15/24 Attend call w	A P Johnson with Trane counsel relating to derivative litig	0.50 ation adversary proceeding d	462.50 liscovery.
	M R Hirst to client concerning discovery in derivative lediscovery requests and document review sta		1,925.00 ags (0.3); review
11/21/24 Review status	M R Hirst s of discovery in derivative litigation adversa	0.40 ary proceedings.	550.00
11/22/24 Call with inte	C K Cahow ernal and Trane teams relating to discovery i	0.40 In derivative litigation advers	510.00 ary proceedings.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 71 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JOI LO DI	L I		
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 10 ber 30, 2024 : 241308427
1	J			
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
11/22/24 Telephone co	M A Cody onference with counsel to Trane and internal occedings.	0.50 team relating to disco	very in derivativ	787.50 ve litigation
(0.5); review i	M R Hirst rnal team and Trane counsel relating to disco issues relating to discovery in derivative litiga num and Sands regarding same (0.4).			
11/22/24 Attend call w	A P Johnson ith Trane counsel relating to derivative litigate	0.40 tion adversary proceed	ling discovery.	370.00
11/22/24 Attend call w proceedings.	D S Torborg ith internal team and counsel to Trane relatin	0.50 ng to discovery in deriv	vative litigation	700.00 adversary
	Matter Total	25.40	USD	35,967.50
Professional Retention	on/Fee Issues			
11/01/24 Draft interim	J L Gale fee application for ordinary course profession	1.80 onal.		1,305.00
11/01/24 Review email	A P Johnson s from Bowen, Wright regarding outstanding	0.50 g amounts (.2); draft re	esponses to sam	462.50 ae (.3).
11/03/24 Revise ordina (0.5).	J L Gale ary course professional interim fee application	3.00 n (2.5); draft email rega	arding same to	2,175.00 Lombardi
11/03/24 Draft ordinar	P Lombardi ry course professionals report (.3); draft emai	0.40 l to Johnson concernin	ng same (.1).	340.00
11/04/24 Telephone co	M A Cody onferences with Johnson regarding profession	0.50 nal fee issues (.3); revie	ew related emai	787.50 ls (.2).
11/04/24 Communicate same (0.1).	J L Gale e with Lombardi regarding interim fee applic	0.20 cation for ordinary cou	rse professiona	145.00 l (0.1); revise
	A P Johnson s from Bowen, Cumbo regarding outstanding ails to Bowen regarding same (.3); review ma			1,665.00 dy, Lombardi
	P Lombardi e with Johnson concerning outstanding amount outstanding amounts course professionals report (.1); draft ema			765.00 me (.1);
11/06/24 Review profe	M A Cody ssional monthly statements.	0.70		1,102.50
11/06/24	L C Fischer	6.50	lay cupolement	4,225.00

Review and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports in connection with Jones Day supplemental disclosure.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 72 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 11 November 30, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/06/24 A P Johnson 1.10 1,017.50 Review draft ordinary course professionals report (.1); review emails from Bowen, Lombardi regarding same (.1); draft emails to Bowen, Felder, Wright regarding outstanding payments (.4); review Future Claimants' Representative monthly statements (.2); review Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application (.3). 11/07/24 0.50 M A Cody 787.50 Review professionals' monthly statements. 11/07/24 P Lombardi 3.60 3,060.00 Review ordinary course professional interim fee application (1.1); review Bates White interim fee application (1.2); review K&L Gates interim fee application (.6); review Rayburn Cooper interim fee application (.7). 11/08/24 2.10 3,307.50 M A Cody Review interim fee application and monthly statements of professionals. 11/08/24 2.20 1,595.00 I L Gale Revise ordinary course professional interim fee application (1.30); emails with Pratt, Johnson, Lombardi regarding same (.30); discuss same with Lombardi (.60). 11/08/24 A P Johnson 1.50 Review ordinary course professional interim fee application (1.2); review emails from Pratt, Gale, Lombardi regarding same (.3). 11/08/24 P Lombardi 2.20 Review and revise ordinary course professional interim fee application (.9); draft email to Cody concerning same (.1); review comments from Cody concerning same (.3); communicate with Gale concerning revisions to same (.6); draft email to Cumbo concerning Bates White interim fee application (.1); draft email to Miller concerning comments to Rayburn Cooper Durham interim fee application (.1); draft email to Steele concerning comments to K&L Gates interim fee application (.1). 11/09/24 P Lombardi 1,360.00 1.60 Review Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application (.9); review Claro Group interim fee application (.7).11/10/24 A P Johnson 277.50 Review ordinary course professionals report (.2); discuss same with Lombardi (.1). 11/10/24 0.70 595.00 P Lombardi Review ordinary course professionals report (.4); communicate with Johnson concerning ordinary course professionals report and payment issues (.2); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.1). 11/11/24 L C Fischer 3.80 2,470.00 Review and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports in connection with Jones Day supplemental disclosure. 11/11/24 A P Johnson 3.00 2,775.00 Review ordinary course professionals report (.1); revise same (.2); review recently submitted monthly statements (.5); review emails from Lombardi, Bowen regarding same (.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.9); review K&L Gates interim fee application (.2); review emails from Lombardi regarding interim fee applications (.3); review AlixPartners interim fee application (.4). 11/11/24 3,230.00 P Lombardi 3.80

Review revised ordinary course professionals report (.9); revise same (.3); review comments from Johnson concerning same (.1); communicate with Johnson concerning fee matters (1.1); draft emails to Bowen

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 73 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 12 November 30, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount concerning same (.6); review AlixPartners interim fee application (.4); draft email to Smith concerning Claro interim fee application (.1); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1); draft email to Canup concerning Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application (.1); review revised K&L Gates interim fee application (.1). 11/12/24 M A Cody 0.30 472.50 Review professional monthly statements and emails concerning same. 11/12/24 6.80 4,420.00 L C Fischer Review and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports in connection with Jones Day supplemental disclosure. 11/12/24 0.80 580.00 J L Gale Review ordinary course professional interim fee application (.7); review email from Johnson regarding interim fee applications (.1). 11/12/24 A P Johnson 1.40 1,295.00 Review recently filed interim fee applications (.7); discuss same with Lombardi (.1); draft emails to Miller, Gale, Lombardi, Bonito, Smith regarding interim fee applications (.4); review emails from Bowen, Lombardi regarding monthly statements (.2). 11/12/24 P Lombardi 0.90 765.00 Draft email to Miller and Lindsay concerning Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application (.1); review K&L Gates' interim fee application and communicate with Miller and Lindsay concerning K&L Gates' interim fee application (.1); communicate with Johnson concerning interim fee applications (.1); review Bates White's interim fee application (.2); review and revise ordinary course professional interim fee application (.3); review Winston Strawn fee materials and communicate with Bowen concerning same (.1). 11/12/24 C L Smith 0.10 52.50 Update electronic file management system with monthly statements. 11/13/24 787.50 M A Cody Emails with Gale regarding professional fee issues (.2); review related materials (.3). 11/13/24 L C Fischer 5.00 3,250.00 Review and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports in connection with Jones Day supplemental disclosure. 11/13/24 5.40 3,915.00 Emails with Cody regarding professional fee matters (.2); discuss same with Johnson (.2); review professional monthly statements (2.1); review monthly statement and interim fee application of Verus (2.5); draft summary of same for Johnson (.2); emails with Johnson, Hirst, Erens regarding same (.2). 11/13/24 A P Johnson 3.70 3,422.50 Review monthly statements (.3); discuss same with Bowen, Lombardi (.4); review emails from Bowen, Lombardi regarding same (.2); analyze interim fee applications (1.9); review Verus October monthly statement (.5); review Gale summary of same (.2); review emails from Hirst, Gale, Erens regarding same (.2). 11/13/24 1.70 1,445.00 P Lombardi Review materials concerning outstanding payments to professionals (1.1); call with Bowen and Johnson concerning same (.2); communicate with Johnson concerning same (.1); draft summary chart concerning same (.2); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.1).

0.20

325.00

Communications with Johnson regarding fee issues.

B B Erens

11/14/24

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 74 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 13 November 30, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date of Service Hours Amount 3.80 11/14/24 J L Gale 2,755.00 Discuss Verus monthly statement with Johnson (0.2); review and draft summary of same (3.0); discuss summary with Johnson (0.1); discuss review of monthly statements with Pruitt (0.1); emails with Johnson, Pruitt regarding tracking of same (0.4). 11/14/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review Verus October monthly statement (.3); review Gale summary of same (.2); discuss same with Gale (.1); discuss professional fees and expenses tracking chart with Gale, Lombardi (.3); review emails from Gale, Pruitt related to same (.4). 11/14/24 340.00 P Lombardi 0.40 Communicate with Johnson concerning professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); analyze same (.1); discuss same with Gale (.1). 11/14/24 980.00 A R Pruitt 1.40 Communications with Gale regarding review of monthly statements and related amounts outstanding (.10); emails with Gale, Johnson regarding same (.40); review monthly statements for professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.90). 11/15/24 J L Gale 0.40 290.00 Review monthly statements in connection with professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); emails with Johnson, Pruitt regarding professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2). 11/15/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review Gale summary of Verus monthly statements (.2); review emails from Gale, Pruitt related to professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); review materials related to same (.3); review emails from Lombardi, Miller, Steele, Canup, Cumbo regarding October monthly statements (.2); review ordinary course professional October monthly statement (.1); draft emails to Gale, Divya, Pratt regarding same (.2); submit same to notice parties (.1). 11/15/24 0.30 255.00 P Lombardi Communicate with Johnson concerning October monthly statements (.1); draft emails to professionals concerning same (.2). 11/15/24 A R Pruitt 2.60 1,820.00 Review monthly statements in connection with professional fees and expenses tracking chart (2.40); communications with Johnson, Gale regarding same (.20). 11/17/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review Gale summary of Verus monthly statements (.1); review emails from Gale, Pruitt related to professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); review monthly statements related to same (1.0). 11/18/24 B B Erens 0.50 812.50 Attend call with internal team regarding Verus fee matters. 7.50 11/18/24 J L Gale 5,437.50 Draft professional fees and expenses tracking chart (7.0); communications with Lombardi regarding same (.5).510.00 11/18/24 P Lombardi 0.60 Review draft professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); communicate with Gale concerning same

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 75 of 134 JONES DAY

		JOINE	SDAI			
161866					November	
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	nd Murray Boiler LLC			Invoice: 2	41308427
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Н	ours		Amount
11/19/2		J L Gale onal fees and expenses tracking char		8.80 e with Lombar	rdi (.2).	6,380.00
11/19/2	Communicate	P Lombardi with Gale concerning professional f hite October monthly statement (.4	ees and expenses t	0.90 racking chart (.	2); review sam	765.00 e (.3);
11/20/2		A P Johnson from Taylor, Felder, Pratt regarding		0.20		185.00
11/20/2	Review Bates V	P Lombardi White interim fee application (.6); re Sessional fees and expenses tracking	view Rayburn Coo		terim fee appl	2,805.00 ication
11/25/2		A P Johnson Petruolo, Lombardi regarding rece		0.50 iscuss same wit	th Lombardi (.	462.50 2).
11/25/2	Review K&L C	P Lombardi Gates interim fee application (.2); revivith Johnson concerning same (.1).		0.40 cerning paymen	nt matters (.1);	340.00
11/26/2		A P Johnson or monthly statements for Debtors'		0.50 otice parties.		462.50
11/26/2	Review Evert V draft emails to	P Lombardi Weathersby Houff's monthly statem Steele, Canup, and Miller concerning monthly statements to notice partie	ent (.8); review Bat ag same (.2); comm	unicate with Jo	hnson concer	ning
11/27/2	Review and rev (2.6); review an	P Lombardi rise professional fees and expenses of d revise same concerning Future Clarening same (1.6).	tracking chart (1.2)		· - ·	_
11/29/2	Review Future	P Lombardi Claimants' Representative professiong chart (.8); review Asbestos Com	onals' fees in conne			
		Matter Total	117	7.80	USD	96,097.50
Fee App	lication Prepa	ration				
11/02/2		P Lombardi Day monthly statement in connection (.9).		6.20 terim fee applic	cation (5.3); dr	5,270.00 aft interim
11/05/2	Review Octobe	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliant internal team regarding same (.10).		0.70 ications with Fi	resenko regard	367.50 ling same
11/06/2		P Lombardi		1.70		1,445.00

Draft Jones Day interim fee application (.8); analyze materials concerning same (.9).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 76 of 134 JONES DAY

		JUNESD	AI	
161866	11.0	1M D 7 11C		Page: 15 November 30, 2024
Aldrich P	ump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 241308427
Date of Se	rvice	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
		P Lombardi ay's interim fee application (1.7); review n neerning interim (.1).	2.30 nonthly statements concern	1,955.00 ning same (.5); draft email
11/08/24 R	evise Jones D	A P Johnson Day interim fee application (1.2); review sa	1.80 ame (.6).	1,665.00
11/08/24 R	eview Octobo	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.40	210.00
		M A Cody vise Jones Day interim fee application (1 ference with Johnson regarding same and		2,520.00 regarding same (.1);
11/11/24 R	eview Jones I	A P Johnson Day interim fee application (.3); review er	0.40 mails from Lombard, Cody	370.00 regarding same (.1).
st	atements con	P Lombardi ents from Johnson concerning Jones Day acerning same (.4); revise interim fee appl ne (.1); review comments from Cody (.1);	ication concerning same (.	3); draft email to Cody
11/11/24 R	eview Octobo	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance.	3.30	1,732.50
11/12/24 R	eview and rev	M A Cody vise Jones Day interim fee application (1.	1.20 10); emails with Lombardi	1,890.00 regarding same (.10).
		P Lombardi Day interim fee application (.1); draft emancerning same (.1).	0.30 ail to Cody concerning sam	255.00 ne (.1); draft email to Miller
11/14/24 R	eview Octobo	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance.	1.80	945.00
11/15/24 R	eview Octobo	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance.	1.40	735.00
11/19/24 R	eview Octobo	C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance.	1.20	630.00
11/20/24 R	eview Octobo	B B Erens er invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.30	487.50
		C L Smith er invoice for privilege and compliance (.: Erens regarding same (.10).	0.40 20); draft monthly stateme	210.00 ent (.10); communications
11/21/24 E	mails with Er	C L Smith enst regarding October invoice matters.	0.10	52.50
11/22/24 R	evise Octobe	C L Smith r monthly statement (.10); prepare same	0.30 for submission (.10); email	157.50 to Johnson, Lombardi

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 77 of 134 JONES DAY

	J = 1 = 2 = 2			
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 16 ber 30, 2024 : 241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
regarding sam	e (.10).			
11/24/24 Review Jones	P Lombardi Day October monthly statement.	0.40		340.00
11/26/24 Review Jones	A P Johnson Day October monthly statement (.2); subr	0.40 nit same to notice parties	s (.2).	370.00
J	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	1	· /	
	Matter Total	27.90	USD	23,052.50
Asbestos Matters				
11/02/24 Review materi	B B Erens ials from precedent cases relating to estimate	0.50 ation matters.		812.50
11/02/24 Review materi	M R Hirst ials from precedent cases relating to estima	0.40 ation matters.		550.00
11/03/24 Review materi	B B Erens lals from precedent cases relating to estima	1.00 ation matters.		1,625.00
11/04/24 Review materi	M A Cody lals from precedent cases relating to estima	3.80 ation matters.		5,985.00
11/06/24 Telephone cal	B B Erens l with Evert regarding asbestos matters an	0.50	0); review mat	812.50 erials from
precedent case	es relating to estimation matters (.20).			
	M A Cody IP status conference (4.3); review emails reases (.8); telephone conference with Future (.8).			
estimation dis-	B B Erens  IP status conference (1.10); call with Johns covery (.40); attend call with Future Claim regarding potential pleading (.20); review regarding potential pleading (.20);	ants' Representative rega	rding status (.4	40); follow up
11/07/24	M R Hirst	1.40		1,925.00
	th Tananbaum regarding estimation planni mation matters (.6).	ing (.8); review materials	from preceder	nt cases
	A P Johnson  IP case status conference (1.1); review estir  ding related to estimation discovery with E			
11/07/24 Call with John	P Lombardi ason concerning potential pleading relating	0.70 to estimation discovery.		595.00
11/08/24	M R Hirst	0.80		1,100.00

Review materials from precedent cases relating to estimation matters.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 78 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JUNEST	JAI	
161866	and Mannay Railon II C		Page: 17 November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		111VOICE: 241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/11/24 Draft memora	B B Erens andum regarding asbestos matters and po	1.30 otential next steps relating to s	2,112.50 ame.
11/11/24 Review draft o	M R Hirst orders concerning estimation discovery a	0.30 and emails relating to same.	412.50
11/12/24 Telephone co	M A Cody nference with Bates White regarding esti	0.30 imation matters and case status	472.50 s.
11/12/24 Telephone cal	B B Erens ll with Evert regarding asbestos matters a	0.20 and potential next steps relatin	325.00 g to same.
11/12/24 Attend Bates discovery (0.1)	M R Hirst White call regarding estimation and statu ).	0.40 as (0.3); review revised orders of	550.00 concerning estimation
11/12/24 Attend estima	A P Johnson tion work in process call with Bates Whi	0.20 ite.	185.00
11/13/24 Telephone cal	B B Erens ll with internal team regarding potential r	0.20 next steps concerning estimation	325.00 on.
11/14/24 Call with Tana	C K Cahow anbaum and advisors regarding case statu	0.60 us.	765.00
11/14/24 Attend client	B B Erens call regarding case status.	0.50	812.50
11/14/24 Attend Tanan	M R Hirst baum call regarding case status.	0.70	962.50
11/14/24 Research prec	P Lombardi redent concerning estimation discovery n	3.30 natters (2.9); draft materials co	2,805.00 ncerning same (.4).
	M A Cody ials from precedent cases regarding asbesonal materials regarding same (2.3).	3.70 stos issues (1.2); emails with M	5,827.50 Eiller regarding same (.2);
11/15/24 Review mater	B B Erens ials regarding potential pleading relating	0.30 to estimation discovery.	487.50
11/15/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with internal team regarding estimation	0.20 discovery issues.	275.00
11/15/24 Review poten	A P Johnson tial pleading related to estimation discove	0.30 ery.	277.50
	P Lombardi dent concerning estimation discovery ma edent concerning same (1.2); draft potent		
11/18/24 Attend call wi	B B Erens th internal team regarding developments	0.30 s and planning.	487.50

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 79 of 134

JONES DAY

161866	<b>J</b> = 1 = 2 = 1		Dago: 19
	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 18 November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
11/18/24 Call with inter	G M Gordon rnal team regarding developments and plans	0.10 ning.	200.00
	M R Hirst as, Evert, Masiano and Miller regarding pot estimation related issue (0.3).	0.70 rential pleading relating to	962.50 estimation discovery
	A P Johnson tial pleading related to estimation discovery with Erens, Lombardi (.1).	2.20 7 (1.5); analyze precedent r	2,035.00 elated to same (.6);
11/18/24 Participate in o	T B Lewis call with internal team regarding developme	0.10 ents and planning.	145.00
11/19/24 Conference w	B B Erens ith Johnson regarding pleading relating to ε	0.40 estimation discovery.	650.00
11/19/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with internal team regarding estimation ma	0.50 atters and estimation disco	687.50 overy issues.
-	A P Johnson tial pleading related to estimation discoveryens, Lombardi (.3).	1.40 (.9); analyze precedent re	1,295.00 lated to same (.2); discuss
11/19/24 Meet with Ere	P Lombardi ens and Johnson concerning estimation disc	0.40 covery matters (.3); discuss	340.00 s same with Johnson (.1).
11/20/24 Review and ar	M A Cody nalyze materials from precedent case concer	2.70 rning asbestos matters.	4,252.50
11/20/24 Communicate	M R Hirst with internal team regarding estimation dis	0.20 scovery status.	275.00
11/20/24 Review potent	A P Johnson tial pleading related to estimation discovery	0.70 (.6); draft email to Lomba	647.50 ardi regarding same (.1).
11/20/24 Review preced same (.2).	P Lombardi dent concerning estimation discovery (.4); d	0.60 lraft revisions to potential	510.00 pleading concerning
11/21/24 Review Asbes	A Anderson tos Committee proposed search terms in co	3.10 onnection with estimation	2,557.50 discovery.
	M A Cody wall hearing regarding estimation discovery ng asbestos matters (2.1).	4.40 (2.3); review and analyze	6,930.00 materials from precedent
	B B Erens wall hearing regarding estimation discovery up with Evert regarding same (.20).	3.00 (2.60); prepare for client of	4,875.00 call regarding case status
11/21/24	R Hart	0.20	165.00

Review summary of status of estimation discovery.

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 80 of 134 **JONES DAY**

161866 Page: 19 November 30, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 11/21/24 M R Hirst 1.50 2,062.50 Review summary of Bestwall hearing concerning estimation discovery (0.3); call with Evert and Masiano regarding estimation issues (0.3); communicate with Asbestos Committee counsel regarding estimation issues (0.2); attend call with Tananbaum regarding status (0.7). 11/22/24 A Anderson 2.10 1,732.50 Communicate with Hirst regarding estimation discovery (.3); review Asbestos Committee proposed search terms relating to same (.9); review search term report (.7). 11/22/24 B B Erens 0.20 325.00 Telephone call with client regarding status. 11/22/24 0.50 M R Hirst 687.50 Review summary of Bestwall hearing concerning estimation discovery (0.2); communicate with internal team regarding estimation discovery (0.3). 11/25/24 1.10 M R Hirst 1,512.50 Attend call with Asbestos Committee counsel regarding claims file protocol, Rule 502(d) order (0.4); prepare for call with Asbestos Committee counsel (0.4); call with Evert and Masiano regarding estimation work in process (0.3). 11/27/24 M R Hirst 0.60 825.00 Communicate with internal team regarding estimation discovery issues (0.3); review draft potential pleading relating to same (0.3).

66.70

**USD** 

85,882.50

**Matter Total** 

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 81 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 20

November 30, 2024 Invoice: 241308427

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

### Disbursement Detail

Date Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name L	ocation	Amount	Total
Case Administration and Business Operations			
TRAVEL - AIR FARE			
11/07/24 A P Johnson	CHI	281.57	
Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend June 19, 2024 client meeting.	CIII	201.57	
11/07/24 A P Johnson Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend June 19, 2024 client meeting.	СНІ	266.57	
11/14/24 B B Erens Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	312.48	
11/14/24 B B Erens Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	CHI	249.72	
11/14/24 B B Erens Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	CHI	40.00	
11/14/24 B B Erens Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	414.17	
11/14/24 M A Cody Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	514.92	
11/14/24 M A Cody Airfare - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	414.17	
Travel - Air Fare Subtotal			2,493.60
TRAVEL - FOOD AND BEVERAGE EXPENSES			
11/14/24 B B Erens  Meals Lunch - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	27.33	
11/14/24 B B Erens Meals Dinner - Travel to Charlotte, NC to attend October 24, 2024 hearing.	СНІ	7.78	
Travel - Food and Beverage Expenses Subtotal			35.11
TRAVEL - HOTEL CHARGES			
11/14/24 B B Erens Hotel - Travel to Charlotte, NC for June 19, 2024 client meeting.	CHI	487.62	
Travel - Hotel Charges Subtotal			487.62
TRAVEL - TAXI CHARGES			
11/07/24 A P Johnson Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for June 19, 2024 client meeting.	CHI	60.81	
11/07/24 A P Johnson Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for June 19, 2024 client meeting.	CHI	31.37	
11/07/24 M A Cody Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for October 24, 2024 hearing (home to airport).	CHI	102.25	
11/07/24 M A Cody Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for October 24, 2024 hearing (airport to home).	СНІ	106.45	
11/14/24 B B Erens Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for October 24, 2024 hearing (airport to home).	CHI	42.60	

Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Page 82 of 134 Document

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 21 November 30, 2024

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 241308427

Date Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Location Amount Total 11/14/24 B B Erens CHI 46.96

Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for October 24, 2024 hearing (home to airport).

B B Erens CHI 40.20 11/14/24

Taxi - Travel to Charlotte, NC for October 24, 2024 hearing (to airport).

Travel - Taxi Charges Subtotal 430.64

Matter Total USD 3,446.97

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

## FIFTY-FOURTH MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM DECEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2024

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Fifty-Fourth Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From December 1, 2024 Through December 31, 2024 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

1. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period December 1, 2024 through December 31, 2024 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$ 264,192.50
Total Expenses	\$0.00
TOTAL	\$264,192.50

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 84 of 134

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$237,773.25 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin,

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 85 of 134

PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than February 13, 2025 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 86 of 134

Dated: January 30, 2025

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 87 of 134

### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

December 31, 2024 161866 Invoice: 251300273

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through December 31, 2024:

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	5.40		6,632.50
Automatic Stay	47.00		62,455.00
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	4.10		6,067.50
Claims Administration	0.50		787.50
General Corporate and Real Estate	11.30		16,510.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator			
Reporting	3.70		3,257.50
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	57.70		60,542.50
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	63.20		56,082.50
Fee Application Preparation	7.80		4,732.50
Asbestos Matters	39.30		47,125.00
Total Fees	240.00	USD _	264,192.50
TOTAL	1	USD	264,192.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 89 of 134 JONES DAY

Page: 2 December 31, 2024

Invoice: 251300273

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – December 31, 2024

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	3.20	1,275.00	4,080.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	58.60	1,575.00	92,295.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	8.10	1,625.00	13,162.50
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.10	2,000.00	200.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	21.30	1,375.00	29,287.50
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	10.40	1,450.00	15,080.00
C K Marshall	Partner	2001	1.00	1,450.00	1,450.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998 _	1.20	1,400.00	1,680.00
Total			103.90		157,235.00
A Anderson	Associate	2021	2.90	825.00	2,392.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	1.70	725.00	1,232.50
R Hart	Associate	2021	12.50	825.00	10,312.50
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	29.40	925.00	27,195.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	36.20	850.00	30,770.00
A R Pruitt	Associate	2023 _	32.40	700.00	22,680.00
Total			115.10		94,582.50
L C Fischer	Staff Attorney	1996 _	12.00	650.00	7,800.00
Total			12.00		7,800.00
C L Smith	Paralegal	_	8.00	525.00	4,200.00
Total			8.00		4,200.00
E Pratt	Project Manager	_	1.00	375.00	375.00
Total			1.00		375.00
Total		_	240.00	USD	264,192.50

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 90 of 134

JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3
December 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 251300273

#### Fee Detail

Fee Detail				
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount	
Case Administration a	nd Business Operations			
12/02/24 Review and dis system with sar	C L Smith tribute docket (.20); obtain recently file me (.10).	0.30 ed documents and update electron	157.50 nic file management	
12/03/24 Attend work in	C K Cahow process call with internal team and ad	0.50 lvisors.	637.50	
12/03/24 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with advisors regarding work i	0.50 in process matters.	787.50	
12/03/24 Attend call with	B B Erens n client regarding case status, next step	1.70 os (1.20); attend advisor work in p	2,762.50 rocess call (.50).	
12/03/24 Attend work in	M R Hirst process call with advisors.	0.60	825.00	
12/03/24 Attend work in	A P Johnson process call with advisors.	0.20	185.00	
12/03/24 Review and dis system with sar	C L Smith tribute docket (.10); obtain recently file me (.20).	0.30 ed documents and update electron	157.50 nic file management	
12/03/24 Attend work in	D S Torborg process call with advisors.	0.50	700.00	
12/04/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/05/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/06/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/09/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/10/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/11/24 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	52.50	
12/12/24 Review and dis system with sar	C L Smith tribute docket (.10); obtain recently file me (.10).	0.20 ed documents and update electron	105.00 nic file management	

5.40

USD

6,632.50

Matter Total

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 91 of 134 JONES DAY

		JOINEOD	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	
161866				Page: 4 December 31, 2024
Aldrich	ı Pump LLC 2	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300273
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Automa	atic Stay			
12/03/2		A P Johnson of Semian stay appeal (.1); review Semian	0.70 n lift stay motion (.6).	647.50
12/05/2		A P Johnson a lift stay motion.	0.90	832.50
12/11/2	Review and an regarding same	M A Cody alyze Semian lift stay appellate issues and e (.1); email with Miller regarding same (. ew briefing, hearing transcript and related	1); telephone conference wit	h Johnson regarding
12/11/2		B B Erens all, Cody emails regarding Semian lift sta	0.20 y appeal.	325.00
12/11/2	Review Semiar	A P Johnson a lift stay motion (.2); review statement o ew email from Miller regarding next step		740.00 .2); discuss same with
12/11/2	Correspond wi	C K Marshall th Erens regarding Semian lift stay appear opeal and send to Bradley (.20).	0.40 al (.10); call with Bradley reg	580.00 arding same (.10); gather
12/12/2	Communicatio	M A Cody ons with Lombardi regarding Semian lift for additional record designations (.5); re one (3.8).		
12/12/2		B B Erens ons with Rayburn Cooper team regarding	0.30 Semian lift stay issues.	487.50
12/12/2		M R Hirst a lift stay appeal filings (0.3); review next	0.60 steps regarding responding	825.00 to same (0.3).
12/12/2		A P Johnson ent of issues for appeal of Semian lift sta	0.50 ny motion (.2); analyze preced	462.50 dent related to same (.3).
12/13/2	Review and an	M A Cody alyze briefing and related materials regardal in connection with same (1.1).	2.90 ding Semian stay relief issues	4,567.50 s (1.8); review issues and
12/16/2		M A Cody alyze pleadings, filings and related mater	3.80 ials regarding Semian stay rel	5,985.00 lief appeal.
12/17/2	Review Semiar	P Lombardi a lift stay appellate record designations ( 2); draft additional record designations		5,015.00 g additional record
12/18/2		M A Cody ns with Lombardi regarding record desig	3.80 gnations for Semian lift stay	5,985.00 appeal (.2); review and

Communications with Lombardi regarding record designations for Semian lift stay appeal (.2); review and revise draft of additional record designations (.8); review various pleadings and materials regarding same

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 92 of 134

**IONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 5 December 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 251300273 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount (1.3); review Semian designations and related precedent (1.5). 12/18/24 P Lombardi 1.40 1,190.00 Review precedent concerning record designations in connection with Semian lift stay appeal (.6); revise draft additional record designations (.7); draft email to Cody concerning same (.1). 12/19/24 2,362.50 M A Cody Review and analyze pleadings and precedent related to appellate record designations in connection with Semian stay appeal. 12/19/24 P Lombardi 0.80 680.00 Call with internal team concerning appellate record designations in connection with Semian lift stay appeal (.1); discuss same with Cody (.1); review designation of additional record (.4); revise same (.2). 12/20/24 M A Cody 2.80 4,410.00 Review and revise draft designation of additional items to be included in the record for Semian lift stay appeal (.8); communications with Lombardi regarding same (.5); review precedent, pleadings and related materials (1.5). 12/20/24 P Lombardi 1.30 1,105.00 Call with Cody concerning appellate designations in Semian lift stay appeal (.5); draft revisions to additional record designations concerning same (.6); communicate with Cody concerning same (.1); draft email to Erens, Hirst, Marshall, Bradley, Evert and Miller concerning same (.1). 2,835.00 12/23/24 M A Cody Communications with Lombardi regarding record for Semian lift stay appeal (.2); review and revise designation of additional items for record (1.1); communications with internal team regarding same (.5). 12/23/24 P Lombardi 1,020.00 Review comments from Miller concerning additional appellate record designations for Semian lift stay appeal (.1); discuss same with Cody (.1); review dockets concerning same (.6); review Fourth Circuit docket concerning same (.2); draft revisions to additional appellate record designations concerning same (.2). 12/26/24 1.30 P Lombardi 1,105.00 Review email from Miller concerning precedent regarding appellate designations for Semian lift stay appeal (.2); revise additional appellate record designations concerning same (.6); review same (.3); draft email to internal team concerning same (.2). 12/27/24 M A Cody 3.30 5,197.50 Review and revise designation of additional items for record for Semian lift stay appeal (.8); emails with Lombardi and Miller regarding same (.3); review and analyze briefs in precedent case regarding stay relief (2.2).12/27/24 M R Hirst 275.00 Communicate with internal team regarding record for Semian lift stay appeal. 12/27/24 P Lombardi 935.00 Review additional record designations for Semian lift stay appeal (.7); communicate with internal team concerning same (.4). 12/30/24 C K Marshall 0.60 870.00 Review pleadings and materials relating to Semian lift stay appeal.

> Matter Total 47.00 **USD** 62,455.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 93 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	AI		
161866				Page: 6 ber 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	: 251300273
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
Plan of Reorgan	nization and Disclosure Statement			
12/19/24 Review	C K Cahow plan-related matters.	1.30		1,657.50
12/27/24 Review	M A Cody and analyze precedent and materials regarding pl	2.80 lan and voting issues.		4,410.00
	Matter Total	4.10	USD	6,067.50
Claims Adminis	stration			
12/05/24 Review	M A Cody and analyze claims register and related emails.	0.50		787.50
	Matter Total	0.50	USD	787.50
General Corpora	ate and Real Estate			
12/02/24 Emails v	M A Cody with Lewis regarding corporate issues (.2); review	1.00 related documents (.8)		1,575.00
12/12/24 Attend o	T B Lewis call with client regarding corporate matters, inclu	2.50 ading review of materials	s relating to san	3,625.00 me.
12/17/24 Draft m	T B Lewis naterials concerning corporate matters.	1.80		2,610.00
12/18/24 Draft m	T B Lewis naterials concerning corporate matters.	4.00		5,800.00
12/19/24 Revise r	T B Lewis materials concerning corporate matters (1.80); em	2.00 nail to client regarding sa	ame (.20).	2,900.00
	Matter Total	11.30	USD	16,510.00
Schedules/SOF	A/Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting			
12/19/24 Review reports	A P Johnson emails from Roeder, Lombardi, Clarrey regarding (.4).	0.60 g monthly status reports	s (.2); review m	555.00 onthly status
12/20/24 Review	A P Johnson emails from Bowen, Clarrey regarding monthly s	0.40 status reports (.2); review	v monthly statu	370.00 as reports (.2).
	P Lombardi monthly status reports and emails concerning san nicate with Johnson concerning same (.1); draft e			

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 94 of 134 JONES DAY

161866	<b>,</b> 0.	- 1 - 0 - 1 - 1	Page: 7 December 31, 2024
Aldrich Pum	p LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300273
Date of Servic	e Timekeeper/Fee Earner Na.	nme Hours	Amount
12/22/24 Revie	P Lombardi ew monthly status reports (.1); draft ema	0.20 ail to Clarrey and Hakim con-	170.00 cerning same (.1).
12/23/24 Revie	A P Johnson ew emails from Lombardi, Clarrey, Cody	0.20 y regarding monthly status re	185.00 ports (.2).
	P Lombardi municate with Cody concerning monthly erning same (.1).	0.20 ly status reports (.1); draft em	170.00 nail to Clarrey and Hakim
	A P Johnson ew emails from Lombardi, Clarrey, Cody ets (.2).	0.30 y regarding monthly status re	277.50 ports (.1); review monthly status
	P Lombardi ew final monthly status reports (.6); draft erning same (.2); draft email to Miller an		
	Matter Total	3.70	USD 3,257.50
Litigation and	d Adversary Proceedings		
12/02/24 Revie	A Anderson ew search term report in connection with	1.40 h discovery in derivative litig	1,155.00 ation adversary proceedings.
	M A Cody ew hearing transcript from precedent cas s and related matters.	3.20 se regarding derivative litigat	5,040.00 ion adversary proceeding discovery
12/02/24 Revie	M R Hirst ew status of derivative litigation adversar	0.60 ry proceeding discovery.	825.00
	M R Hirst to outline for response to Asbestos Commercial discovery (0.9); communications		
12/04/24 Revie	B B Erens ew research regarding potential litigation	0.30 n issues.	487.50
12/04/24 Com	M R Hirst municate with internal team regarding st	0.30 tatus of derivative litigation a	412.50 dversary proceeding discovery.
12/04/24 Resea	A R Pruitt arch regarding derivative litigation adver	3.20 rsary proceeding discovery m	2,240.00 atters.
	M A Cody ew and analyze pleadings and related ma very issues and related matters (3.4); em		
12/05/24 Revie	M R Hirst w derivative litigation adversary proceed	0.40 ding discovery issues.	550.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 95 of 134 **JONES DAY**

		JON	ES DA I		
161866					Page: 8 December 31, 2024
Aldrich	Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC			Invoice: 251300273
Date of	Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	?	Hours	Amount
12/05/2		A R Pruitt ding derivative litigation adversar	ry proceeding disco	4.50 very issues (3.50);	3,150.00 draft memo concerning
12/06/2		M A Cody alyze pleadings from precedent ca	ases regarding deriv	2.80 vative litigation ad	4,410.00 versary proceeding
12/06/2		B B Erens briefs in Bestwall dismissal appe	al.	0.50	812.50
12/06/2		A P Johnson for leave to file amicus brief file	d by Aldrich Asbes	0.40 stos Committee in	370.00 Bestwall dismissal
12/06/2		A R Pruitt ding derivative litigation adversar	ry proceeding disco	5.70 very matters (4.7);	3,990.00 draft memo regarding
12/08/2		A R Pruitt ding derivative litigation adversar	y proceeding disco	3.00 very matters (2.5);	2,100.00 draft memo on same
12/09/2		M A Cody alyze pleadings related to dismiss	al issues.	2.30	3,622.50
12/09/2	Draft outline fo	R Hart or response to Asbestos Commit ers, including review of Pruitt res			990.00 on adversary proceeding
12/09/2		A R Pruitt ding derivative litigation adversar	y proceeding disco	3.80 very matters (3.2);	2,660.00 draft memo on same
12/10/2	Attend call with	A Anderson h co-defendants regarding deriva of proposed search terms (.2); ca	0	, 1	825.00 iscovery matters (.5);
12/10/2	Call with Ande proceedings (0.	R Hart rson regarding proposed search to 3); review Pruitt research related esearch regarding same (0.5); draf	to derivative litigat	tion adversary pro	ceeding discovery issues
12/10/2	Attend call with	M R Hirst h co-defendants regarding deriva review follow-up tasks concernir		1.00 rsary proceeding d	1,375.00 iscovery (0.5); prepare
12/10/2	Research regard	A R Pruitt ding derivative litigation adversar Hart regarding same (.1).	y proceeding disco	1.10 very matters (1.0);	770.00 communications with
12/11/2	4	R Hart		2.00	1,650.00

Draft letter to Asbestos Committee regarding derivative litigation adversary proceeding discovery matters.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 96 of 134 JONES DAY

161866	<b>y</b> = 1.2 = 1.2	-		Page: 9
	and Murray Boiler LLC			per 31, 2024 251300273
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
12/11/24 Research regar	A R Pruitt rding derivative litigation adversary proceedi	0.80 ing discovery matters.		560.00
-	M A Cody ngs from precedent cases regarding derivativ ated emails (.2).	1.00 ve litigation adversary pr	roceeding disc	1,575.00 overy issues
	R Hart O Asbestos Committee regarding derivative lew Pruitt research concerning same.	0.40 litigation adversary proc	eeding discov	330.00 ery matters,
12/17/24 Review preced	M A Cody lent regarding derivative litigation adversary	1.30 proceeding discovery m	natters.	2,047.50
12/17/24 Revise letter to	R Hart o Asbestos Committee regarding derivative l	0.20 litigation adversary proc	eeding discov	165.00 ery matters.
matters (0.9); c	M R Hirst tter to Asbestos Committee concerning deri- communicate with internal team regarding se scovery requests (0.4).			
	M R Hirst ons with client and co-defendants regarding ters (0.3); prepare for upcoming call regardin		ersary proceed	825.00 ding
12/20/24 Attend call wit	B B Erens th co-defendants regarding derivative litigati	0.70 on adversary proceeding	g matters.	1,137.50
	R Hart ch co-defendants regarding derivative litigati g research concerning discovery relating to s		g matters (0.7)	660.00; emails with
12/20/24 Attend call wit	M R Hirst h co-defendants regarding derivative litigati	0.70 on adversary proceeding	g matters.	962.50
12/20/24 Attend call wit	A P Johnson th co-defendants regarding derivative litigati	0.60 on adversary proceeding	g matters.	555.00
12/20/24 Attend call wit	D S Torborg h co-defendants regarding derivative litigati	0.50 on adversary proceeding	g matters.	700.00
	Matter Total	57.70	USD	60,542.50
Professional Retention	n/Fee Issues			
	P Lombardi tos Committee professionals interim fee app ing chart (1.1); review same (.5); draft email			2,380.00 s and
-	A P Johnson sional fees and expenses tracking chart (1.2). Lombardi regarding recent payments (.3).	1.60 ; discuss same with Lon	nbardi (.1); re	1,480.00 view emails

from Petruolo, Lombardi regarding recent payments (.3).

## Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 97 of 134

**JONES DAY** 161866 Page: 10 December 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 251300273 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount 12/02/24 P Lombardi 1,785.00 2.10 Review interim fee applications for Debtors' professionals (.3); draft summary of same for distribution to Bowen (1.2); communicate with Johnson concerning same (.2); analyze outstanding Ankura payments (.3); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.1). 12/03/24 0.30 217.50 J L Gale Revise draft proposed order for professionals' interim fee applications (0.1); discuss professional fees and expenses tracking chart with Lombardi (0.2). 12/03/24 3.30 A P Johnson 3,052.50 Review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (1.7); review recently filed interim fee applications (1.0); communicate with Gale, Lombardi regarding same (.3); review emails from Lombardi regarding interim fee application orders (.1); review emails from Winston Strawn, FTI regarding outstanding amounts 12/03/24 P Lombardi 1.10 935.00 Draft emails to professionals concerning preparation of orders for interim fee applications (.3); draft email to Bowen concerning fee matters (.1); communicate with Johnson concerning same (.4); review Bates White's interim fee application order (.1); review Evert Weathersby Houff interim fee application order (.1); review Claro's interim fee application order (.1). 12/04/24 0.70 647.50 A P Johnson Review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.5); review emails from Lombardi regarding interim fee application orders (.2). 12/04/24 P Lombardi 1.80 1,530.00 Draft email to Westbrook concerning K&L Gates interim fee application order (.1); review AlixPartners interim fee application order (.2); draft email to Bonito concerning same (.1); further review K&L Gates interim fee application order (.2); draft email to Westbrook concerning same (.1); revise professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.6); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.4); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1). 12/05/24 A P Johnson 1.40 1,295.00 Review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.8); review emails from Lombardi regarding interim fee application orders (.1); draft email to Bowen regarding same (.4); discuss same with Lombardi (.1). 12/05/24 0.70 595.00 P Lombardi Review K&L Gates interim fee application order (.1); revise AlixPartners interim fee application order (.1); communicate with Johnson concerning same (.1); draft email to Bonito concerning same (.1); prepare interim fee application orders for submission to Court (.2); draft email to Miller concerning same (.1). 12/06/24 M A Cody 0.50 787.50 Review fee submissions from professionals. 12/06/24 0.90 P Lombardi 765.00 Revise professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.4); prepare materials to be included in email to Bowen concerning same (.3); review Hamilton Stephens monthly statement (.2). 12/09/24 B B Erens 0.20 325.00 Emails with Evert regarding Verus matters.

12/09/24 A P Johnson 1.60 1,480.00 Review recently entered interim fee application orders (.2); review professional fees and expenses tracking

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 98 of 134

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 11 December 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 251300273 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount chart (.6); discuss same with Lombardi (.1); review emails from Lombardi, Bowen regarding same (.3); review Rayburn Cooper August and September monthly statements (.2); review Winston Strawn March and April monthly statements (.2). 12/09/24 0.70 P Lombardi 595.00 Communicate with Steele concerning K&L Gates interim fee application order (.1); review entered interim fee application orders (.1); revise email to Bowen concerning professional fees and expenses tracking chart and prepare materials for circulation relating to same (.4); communicate with Bowen concerning same (.1). J L Gale 0.50 12/10/24 362.50 Revise professional fees and expenses tracking chart. 12/10/24 A P Johnson 1.20 1,110.00 Review emails from Lombardi, Petruolo, Bowen regarding outstanding amounts (.5); draft email to Lombardi regarding same (.1); review Claro's recent monthly statements (.2); review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.4). 12/10/24 P Lombardi 0.90765.00 Communicate with Johnson concerning professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.2); review tracking chart and emails from Bowen concerning same (.1); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.2); draft email to Petruolo concerning payments received by Ankura (.1); review related materials (.3). 12/11/24 L C Fischer 2,925.00 Review updated conflict inquiry reports in connection with Jones Day supplemental disclosure. B B Erens 0.20 325.00 12/12/24 Emails with internal team regarding Verus matters. J L Gale 0.30 12/12/24 217.50 Review ordinary course professional monthly statement. 12/12/24 A P Johnson 1.70 1,572.50 Review emails from Lombardi, Simpson, Winston Strawn, Bowen regarding outstanding amounts (.3); review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.6); discuss same with Lombardi, Bowen (.3); draft email to Simpson regarding same (.1); draft email to Tomsic regarding November monthly statements (.1); review ordinary course professional November monthly statement (.2); submit same to notice parties (.1). 12/12/24 1.10 P Lombardi Call with Johnson concerning fee issues (.2); review Rayburn Cooper monthly statement (.4); review fee materials in preparation for call with Bowen and Johnson (.2); call with Bowen and Johnson concerning fee matters (.2); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.1). 12/12/24 E Pratt 1.00 375.00 Review ordinary course professional monthly statement (.2); communicate with Johnson regarding submission of same (.2); update tracking chart of ordinary course professional invoices (.4); communicate with ordinary course professional regarding same (.2). 0.50 12/13/24 M A Cody 787.50 Review professionals monthly statements. P Lombardi 1.60 1,360.00

Review Robinson Cole's August monthly statement (.2); review Robinson Cole's September monthly statement (.2); review Robinson Cole's interim fee application (.4); review Legal Analysis System's interim fee application (.3); draft email to Johnson concerning same (.1); revise professional fees and expenses

#### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 99 of 134

**JONES DAY** 

161866 Page: 12 December 31, 2024 Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC Invoice: 251300273 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount tracking chart (.3); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.1). 12/16/24 0.40 290.00 J L Gale Review ordinary course professional monthly statements. 3.30 12/16/24 A P Johnson 3,052.50 Review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (1.8); discuss outstanding payments with Lombardi (.4); review emails from Grier Wright regarding outstanding amounts (.2); review materials related to same (.5); draft emails to Wright, Robinson Cole regarding same (.1); draft emails to Bowen, Felder, Grier Wright regarding billing (.3). 12/16/24 1.90 1,615.00 P Lombardi Review professionals monthly statements (.5); revise professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.3); review materials concerning outstanding balances (.3); calls with Johnson concerning same (.4); draft email to Bowen concerning same (.3); review emails from Bowen concerning same (.1). 12/17/24 1,260.00 M A Cody Telephone conferences with Johnson regarding professional fee issues (.3); review emails and filings regarding same (.5). 12/17/24 A P Johnson 2.10 1,942.50 Review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.7); discuss interim compensation procedures with Kisner, Winston Strawn (.1); review email from Bowen regarding same (.1); discuss outstanding payments with Lombardi, Cody (.5); review emails from Halevy, Lombardi regarding same (.3); review monthly statements related to same (.4). 12/17/24 P Lombardi 1.60 1,360.00 Review Bates White monthly statement (.8); review precedent concerning same (.3); communicate with Johnson concerning same (.1); communicate with Johnson concerning outstanding fee issues (.1); communicate with Bowen concerning same (.3). 12/18/24 M A Cody 0.50 787.50 Telephone conferences with Johnson regarding issues regarding professional fees (.3); review related emails 12/18/24 A P Johnson 2.50 2,312.50 Review emails from Bowen, Lombardi regarding information needed for payments to professionals (.5); discuss same with Lombardi (.3); discuss outstanding amounts with Cody, Lombardi, Erens (.8); review emails from Lombardi, Bowen, Smith, Erens, Fresenko regarding same (.7); draft emails to Fresenko regarding same (.2). 1,530.00 12/18/24 P Lombardi 1.80 Attend calls with Johnson concerning fee matters (.7); draft emails to Bowen concerning same (.4); draft emails to professionals concerning information needed for payments (.4); draft emails to professionals concerning November monthly statement matters (.3). 12/19/24 M A Cody 0.60 945.00 Telephone conferences with Johnson regarding professional fee issues (.3); review related emails (.3) 12/19/24 A P Johnson 1.30 1,202.50 Review emails from Bowen, Lombardi, Cody regarding outstanding amounts (.3); review monthly

statements related to same (.5); review professional fees and expenses tracking chart (.5).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 100 of 134 JONES DAY

		J = 1 = 0 =		
161866 Aldrich P	himo II Car	nd Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 13 December 31, 2024 Invoice: 251300273
7 HGHCH 1	ump EEC a	na marray boner him		111VOICE: 231300273
Date of Se	ervice	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	'elephone conf ubmissions (.3)	M A Cody erence with Johnson regarding profes	0.50 ssional fee issues (.2); review r	787.50 related emails and
V	Vright regardin	A P Johnson ding amounts with Cody, Lombardi (. g same (.3); review recently entered in g same (.1); analyze professional fees	terim fee application orders (	(.3); draft email to Grier
12/23/24 T	elephone conf	M A Cody erence with Johnson regarding profes	0.80 sional fee issues (.3); review f	1,260.00 ee submissions (.5).
12/23/24 R	Review Verus n	P Lombardi nonthly statement (.1); review Bates W	0.20 Thites' monthly statement (.1)	170.00
12/28/24 П	Oraft and revise	L C Fischer e Jones Day supplemental disclosure.	7.50	4,875.00
12/30/24 R	Review professi	M A Cody onal fee submissions and related mate	0.50 erials.	787.50
	Review emails f egarding same	A P Johnson from Tomsic, Lombardi regarding Nov (.1).	0.40 vember monthly statements (	370.00 .3); draft email to Tomsic
		P Lombardi Veathersby Houff monthly statement ( nthly statement (.3); communicate wit	` '	. ,
12/31/24 R	Review monthly	J L Gale statement for ordinary course profes	0.20 ssional.	145.00
		Matter Total	63.20	USD 56,082.50
Fee Appli	cation Prepar	ation		
12/04/24 D	Oraft Jones Day	P Lombardi y interim fee application order (.2); dra	0.30 aft email to Johnson concerni	255.00 ng same (.1).
		C L Smith ber invoice for privilege and complian ers (.20); call with Ernst regarding sam		472.50 garding October monthly
		C L Smith also regarding October invoice matters ice for privilege and compliance (1.90		1,102.50 ng same (.10); review
	Communication ompliance (.80	C L Smith as with Fresenko regarding November ).	1.00 rinvoice matters (.20); review	525.00 same for privilege and
12/11/24	Povrjeny Novem	B B Erens	0.30	487.50

Review November invoice for privilege and compliance.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 101 of 134 IONES DAY

	JONES D	AY	
161866	-		Page: 14
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		December 31, 2024 Invoice: 251300273
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	C L Smith ember invoice for privilege and compliance o Johnson, Lombardi regarding monthly sta		` ,
internal team communication (.20); communication same (.20); ca	C L Smith s comments to November invoice (.10); re- regarding same (.10); review and revise No ons with Fresenko regarding same (.10); re- inications with Fresenko regarding same (.2 all with Erens regarding same (.10); revise Na arding same (.10); email to Johnson, Lomb	ovember invoice for comp view issues relating to Oct 20); communications with a November monthly statem	liance and privilege (.30); ober monthly statement nternal team regarding
12/30/24 Review Nove	A P Johnson ember monthly statement.	0.20	185.00
	P Lombardi ember monthly statement (.2); submit same nonthly statement (.1).	0.40 e to notice parties (.1); com	340.00 municate with Fresenko
	Matter Total	7.80	USD 4,732.50
Asbestos Matters			
12/02/24 Prepare for a	B B Erens dvisor call concerning estimation.	0.20	325.00
12/03/24 Attend call w	C K Cahow ith Bates White and Evert Weathersby Ho	0.40 uff on estimation matters.	510.00
12/03/24 Telephone co	M A Cody onference with Bates White regarding case	0.50 status and estimation issue	787.50 s.
12/03/24 Attend Bates	B B Erens s White call on estimation.	0.50	812.50
12/03/24 Review corre	R Hart spondence concerning estimation discover	0.60 y.	495.00
12/03/24 Attend Bates (0.8).	M R Hirst White call concerning estimation (0.7); rev	1.50 view estimation discovery of	2,062.50 laims file protocol issues
12/03/24 Attend estima	A P Johnson ation work in process call with Bates White	0.40 e and Erens, Hirst, Evert.	370.00
12/04/24 Review corre	R Hart spondence related to estimation discovery	2.20 matters and draft outline f	1,815.00 for response to same.
	C K Cahow status call with Tananbaum, Evert, Hirst, M ants' Representative (.40).	1.00 fasiano (.60); attend case st	1,275.00 atus update call with

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 102 of 134 JONES DAY

	JONES DA	Y	
161866			Page: 15 December 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300273
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
12/05/24 Attend clier	B B Erens nt case status call (.40); call with Future Claima	0.80 ants' Representative regardi	1,300.00 ing same (.40).
12/05/24 Attend case	M R Hirst e status call with Tananbaum (0.6); prepare for	0.80 same (0.2).	1,100.00
12/05/24 Attend case	A P Johnson e status call with Future Claimants' Representat	0.10 tive and advisors.	92.50
12/06/24 Review and regarding sa	M R Hirst revise estimation discovery claims file protocomme (0.3).	1.00 ol (0.7); communicate with	1,375.00 Evert and Masiano
12/09/24 Review and	M A Cody analyze materials regarding asbestos matters.	0.80	1,260.00
12/09/24 Attend call	B B Erens with internal team regarding status and planning	0.30 ng.	487.50
12/09/24 Attend call	G M Gordon with internal team regarding status and planning	0.10 ng.	200.00
12/09/24 Attend call	M R Hirst with internal team regarding status and planning	0.60 ng.	825.00
12/09/24 Attend call	T B Lewis with internal team regarding status and planning	0.10 ng.	145.00
12/09/24 Attend call	D S Torborg with internal team regarding status and planning	0.20 ng.	280.00
	M R Hirst e call with Evert and Masiano regarding estimat in Evert and Masiano (0.2); revise claims file pro	, ,	1,925.00 protocol (0.6); prepare
12/12/24 Preparation same (.50).	B B Erens for client call regarding asbestos matters and p	0.70 potential next steps (.20); a	1,137.50 attend call regarding
	M R Hirst e status call with Tananbaum (0.8); prepare for concerning estimation discovery matters (0.3).		1,787.50 indence to Asbestos
	M R Hirst ate with internal team regarding estimation disc te with Asbestos Committee regarding claims of (0.3).		
12/19/24 Monitor Be	M A Cody estwall hearing in connection with estimation m	4.80 natters (4.5); review summa	7,560.00 ary of same (.3).
12/19/24 Monitor Be (.20).	B B Erens estwall hearing concerning estimation matters (	0.50 (.30); telephone call with E	812.50 vert regarding same

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 103 of 134 JONES DAY

	JONES DA	11		
161866				Page: 16
				per 31, 2024
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	: 251300273
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
12/19/24	M R Hirst	4.50		6,187.50
Monitor Best same (0.6).	wall hearing concerning estimation issues (	3.9); communicate with in	ternal team re	egarding
12/20/24	B B Erens	0.50		812.50
	case status call.			
10/00/01	M.D.W.	4.40		• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
12/20/24	M R Hirst	1.60	1 ****** ******************************	2,200.00
	ith Tananbaum regarding case status (0.7); oscovery research issues (0.4); review corresp			
	sues (0.3); communicate with internal team			
		<u> </u>		` ,
12/27/24	A R Pruitt	4.30		3,010.00
Research pred	cedent related to estimation discovery matte	ers (4.0); draft memo on s	ame (.3).	
12/30/24	A Anderson	0.50		412.50
	ions with Pruitt regarding research related t	o estimation matters.		
12/30/24	A R Pruitt	3.40	(F) 1	2,380.00
	ions with Anderson regarding research con- mation matters (1.5); draft memo on same		s (.5); researci	n precedent
12/31/24	B B Erens	0.20		325.00
	ll with Johnson regarding status relating to	asbestos matters and pote	ential next ste	ps.
10/01/01	A.D.D. Su	2.40		4.000.00
12/31/24 Research pred	A R Pruitt cedent related to estimation matters (2.0); d	2.60		1,820.00
research prec	tedent related to estimation matters (2.0), the	tate memo on same (.0).		
	Matter Total	39.30	USD	47,125.00

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)

# FIFTY-FIFTH MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2025

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, counsel to Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC as debtors and debtors in possession (together, the "Debtors"), submits its Fifty-Fifth Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Jones Day as Counsel for the Debtors for the Period From January 1, 2025 Through January 31, 2025 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").

### **Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred**

Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is Jones Day's invoice for the period
 January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025 (the "<u>Statement Period</u>").

### **Total Fees and Expenses for the Statement Period**

2. The total amounts of fees and expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Statement Period are as follows:

Total Fees	\$439,162.50
Total Expenses	\$0.00
TOTAL	\$439,162.50

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 105 of 134

3. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jones Day seeks payment of \$395,246.25 from the Debtors for the Statement Period (the "Interim Amount"), representing (a) 90% of Jones Day's fees and (b) 100% of its incurred expenses.

### **Notice and Objection Procedures**

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been served by e-mail upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (a) the Debtors, 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036 (Attn: Allan Tananbaum, Esq., atananbaum@tranetechnologies.com); (b) the office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator, 402 West Trade Street, Suite 200, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Shelley K. Abel, Esq., feeapplications@ncwba.uscourts.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtors' non-debtor affiliates, Trane Technologies Company LLC and Trane U.S. Inc., (I) McCarter & English, LLP, 1600 Market Street, Suite 3900, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19103 (Attn: Philip D. Amoa, Esq., pamoa@mccarter.com), (II) McCarter & English, LLP, Four Gateway Center, 100 Mulberry Street, Newark, New Jersey 07102 (Attn: Anthony Bartell, Esq., abartell@mccarter.com and Phillip S. Pavlick, Esq., ppavlick@mccarter.com), (III) McCarter & English, LLP, Worldwide Plaza, 825 Eighth Ave, 31st Floor, New York, New York 10019 (Attn: Gregory J. Mascitti, Esq., gmascitti@mccarter.com) and (IV) Cordes Law, PLLC, 1800 East Blvd., Charlotte, North Carolina 28203 (Attn: Stacy C. Cordes, Esq., stacy@cordes-law.com; (d) counsel to the Official Asbestos Claimants' Committee, (I) Robinson & Cole LLP, 1201 North Market Street, Suite 1406, Wilmington, Delaware 19801 (Attn: Natalie D. Ramsey, Esq., nramsey@rc.com and Davis Lee Wright, Esq., dwright@rc.com), (II) Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered, One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 (Attn: Kevin C. Maclay, Esq., kmaclay@capdale.com, James P. Wehner, Esq., jwehner@capdale.com and Todd E. Phillips, Esq., tphillips@capdale.com and (III) Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin,

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 106 of 134

PLLC, 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: Glenn Thompson, Esq., gthompson@lawhssm.com) and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, (I) Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, 1152 15th Street, N.W., Washington, D.C. 20005 (Attn: Jonathan P. Guy, jguy@orrick.com) and (II) Grier Wright Martinez, P.A., 521 E. Morehead Street, Suite 440, Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 (Attn: A. Cotton Wright, cwright@grierlaw.com).

- 5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Monthly Fee Statement (each, an "Objection"), if any, must be served upon the Notice Parties, including Jones Day, no later than March 17, 2025 (the "Objection Deadline"). Any Objection must set forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.
- 6. Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will be authorized to pay Jones Day an amount equal to the lesser of (a) 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in this Monthly Fee Statement and (b) the aggregate amount of fees and expenses not subject to an Objection.
- 7. All fees and expenses in this Monthly Fee Statement will be included in the next interim fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses to be filed and served by Jones Day at a later date.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 107 of 134

Dated: March 3, 2025

Chicago, Illinois

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Brad B. Erens

Brad B. Erens (IL Bar No. 06206864) Mark A. Cody (IL Bar No. 6236871) Caitlin K. Cahow (IL Bar No. 6317676)

JONES DAY

110 North Wacker Drive, Suite 4800

Chicago, Illinois 60606 Telephone: (312) 782-3939 Facsimile: (312) 782-8585 E-mail: bberens@jonesday.com

macody@jonesday.com ccahow@jonesday.com

(Admitted *pro hac vice*)

ATTORNEYS FOR DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 108 of 134

### **EXHIBIT A**

Invoice

### **JONES DAY**

Chicago Office 110 North Wacker Drive Suite 4800 Chicago, IL 60606 (312) 782-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

February 24, 2025 161866 Invoice: 251300891

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC 800 Beaty Street Davidson, NC 28036 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through January 31, 2025:

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration and Business Operations	25.40	36,835.00
Automatic Stay	22.20	35,032.50
Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	6.20	10,540.00
Claims Administration	3.20	5,440.00
Court Hearings	20.30	32,682.50
General Corporate and Real Estate	34.30	55,610.00
Schedules/SOFA/Bankruptcy Administrator		
Reporting	3.80	4,510.00
Nonworking Travel	11.20	9,500.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	18.50	25,832.50
Professional Retention/Fee Issues	44.40	52,355.00
Fee Application Preparation	5.30	3,635.00
Asbestos Matters	123.30	167,190.00
Total Fees	318.10 USD	439,162.50
TOTAL	USD	439,162.50

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 110 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 2 February 24, 2025

Invoice: 251300891

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – January 31, 2025

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C K Cahow	Partner	2014	7.60	1,400.00	10,640.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	111.30	1,700.00	189,210.00
M A Cody	Partner	1996	5.00	850.00	4,250.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	32.90	1,800.00	59,220.00
B B Erens	Partner	1991	4.00	900.00	3,600.00
G M Gordon	Partner	1980	0.10	2,200.00	220.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	36.10	1,500.00	54,150.00
M R Hirst	Partner	2001	2.20	750.00	1,650.00
T B Lewis	Partner	1987	19.10	1,550.00	29,605.00
D S Torborg	Partner	1998	1.60	1,550.00	2,480.00
Total			219.90		355,025.00
A Anderson	Associate	2021	4.50	925.00	4,162.50
J L Gale	Associate	2022	12.80	825.00	10,560.00
R Hart	Associate	2021	13.00	925.00	12,025.00
A P Johnson	Associate	2018	15.60	1,075.00	16,770.00
P Lombardi	Associate	2021	13.20	950.00	12,540.00
A R Pruitt	Associate	2023	30.80	750.00	23,100.00
Total			89.90		79,157.50
C L Smith	Paralegal		8.30	600.00	4,980.00
Total			8.30		4,980.00
Total		_	318.10	USD	439,162.50

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 111 of 134 JONES DAY

161866 Page: 3

February 24, 2025 Invoice: 251300891

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

#### Fee Detail

	rec Detai	п	
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Case Administration a	and Business Operations		
01/02/25 Review and die	C L Smith stribute docket (.20); update case calenda	0.30 r (.10).	180.00
01/03/25 Telephone cor and update ch	M A Cody nference with Erens regarding case admir ecklist (.8).	1.30 nistration matters (.5); review wo	2,210.00 ork in process matters
01/03/25 Review and die	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/05/25 Prepare for wo	B B Erens ork in process call.	0.30	540.00
01/07/25 Attend work is	C K Cahow n process call with internal team and advi	0.50 isors.	700.00
	M A Cody nference with advisors regarding work in and materials relating to same (1.8).	2.40 process matters (.6); review and	4,080.00 d analyze work in
01/07/25 Attend work is	B B Erens n process call with advisors.	0.50	900.00
01/07/25 Attend work is	M R Hirst process call with advisors.	0.50	750.00
01/07/25 Attend work is	A P Johnson process call with advisors.	0.60	645.00
01/07/25 Participate in v	T B Lewis work in process call with advisors.	0.50	775.00
01/07/25 Review and die	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/08/25 Review and dis	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/09/25 Attend client v	C K Cahow work in process call.	0.50	700.00
01/09/25 Prepare for cli	B B Erens ent work in process call (.20); attend call	0.70 regarding same (.50).	1,260.00
01/09/25 Attend client v	M R Hirst work in process call.	0.50	750.00
01/09/25 Review and di	C L Smith stribute docket.	0.10	60.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 112 of 134 **JONES DAY**

Page: 4

	February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	Invoice: 251300891

Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/10/25 Attend work in	C K Cahow process call with company, internal team and advis	0.30 sors.	420.00
01/10/25 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with client and advisors regarding work in p	0.80 process matters.	1,360.00
01/10/25 Prepare for clie	B B Erens ent work in process call (.20); attend call regarding sa	1.00 ame (.80).	1,800.00
01/10/25 Attend client w	M R Hirst vork in process call.	0.50	750.00
01/10/25 Attend client w	A P Johnson ork in process call.	0.90	967.50
01/10/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/13/25 Communicate	M A Cody with Erens regarding work in process matters.	0.10	170.00
01/13/25 Prepare for clie matters (.10).	B B Erens ent and advisor work in process calls (.10); commun	0.20 icate with Cody regard	360.00 ling work in process
01/13/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/14/25 Attend work in	C K Cahow process call with internal team and advisors.	0.50	700.00
01/14/25 Telephone con	M A Cody ference with advisors regarding work in process ma	0.50 tters.	850.00
01/14/25 Prepare for adv	B B Erens visor work in process call (.30); attend call regarding	0.80 same (.50).	1,440.00
01/14/25 Prepare for (.3)	A P Johnson and attend (.5) work in process call with advisors.	0.80	860.00
01/14/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/14/25 Attend work in	D S Torborg process call with advisors.	0.50	775.00
01/15/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/16/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00
01/17/25 Review and dis	C L Smith tribute docket.	0.10	60.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 113 of 134 **JONES DAY**

161866

Page: 5

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC	February 24, 2025 Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours Amount
01/21/25 C K Cahow Attend work in process call with internal team and ad	0.40 560.00 visors.
01/21/25 M A Cody Telephone conference with advisors regarding work in	0.50 850.00 n process matters.
01/21/25 B B Erens Prepare for advisor work in process call (.20); attend	0.60 1,080.00 call regarding same (.40).
01/21/25 M R Hirst Prepare for (.40) and attend (.40) work in process call	0.80 1,200.00 with advisors.
01/21/25 A P Johnson Attend work in process call with advisors.	0.40 430.00
01/21/25 T B Lewis Prepare for ( .40) and attend (.40) work in process cal	0.30 465.00 l with advisors.
01/21/25 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently file system with same (.10).	0.20 120.00 ed documents and update electronic file management
01/21/25 D S Torborg Attend work in process call with advisors.	0.30 465.00
01/22/25 C L Smith Review and distribute docket.	0.10 60.00
01/23/25 C L Smith Review and distribute docket.	0.10 60.00
01/24/25 C L Smith Review and distribute docket.	0.10 60.00
01/26/25 B B Erens Review and organize upcoming tasks in case.	0.20 360.00
01/27/25 C L Smith Review and distribute docket (.10); obtain recently file system with same (.10).	0.20 120.00 ed documents and update electronic file management
01/28/25 M A Cody Telephone conference with advisors regarding work in	0.50 850.00 n process matters.
01/28/25 B B Erens Prepare for advisor work in process call (.20); attend	0.90 1,620.00 call regarding same (.70).
01/28/25 M R Hirst Attend work in process call with advisors.	0.60 900.00
01/28/25 A P Johnson Prepare for (.2) and attend (.7) work in process call w	0.90 967.50 ith advisors.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 114 of 134

**JONES DAY** 

	JUNES DE	7.1		
161866				Page: 6 ary 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/28/25 Participate ir	T B Lewis n work in process call with advisors.	0.50		775.00
01/28/25 Review and o	C L Smith distribute docket.	0.10		60.00
01/28/25 Attend work	D S Torborg and process call with advisors.	0.60		930.00
01/29/25 Review and o system with	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed c same (.10).	0.20 documents and update	electronic file ma	120.00 anagement
01/30/25 Review and 0	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); update case calendar	0.20 (.10).		120.00
01/31/25 Review and of system with	C L Smith distribute docket (.10); obtain recently filed c same (.10).	0.20 documents and update	electronic file ma	120.00 anagement
	Matter Total	25.40	USD	36,835.00
Automatic Stay				
01/03/25	M A Cody n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appea me (1.1).	1.40 al (.3); review and analy	ze filings and no	2,380.00 otices
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appea		ze filings and no	
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25 Review precedure 01/06/25 Telephone co	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appea me (1.1). B B Erens	al (.3); review and analy 0.20 1.20		360.00 2,040.00
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25 Review prece 01/06/25 Telephone coregarding san 01/06/25	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appearme (1.1).  B B Erens edent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.  M A Cody onference with Miller regarding Semian stay	0.20  1.20 relief appeal (.3); teleple 0.20		360.00 2,040.00
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25 Review precedors 01/06/25 Telephone or regarding san 01/06/25 Telephone or regarding san 01/06/25	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appearme (1.1).  B B Erens edent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.  M A Cody conference with Miller regarding Semian stay me (.1); review related materials (.8).  B B Erens	0.20  1.20 relief appeal (.3); teleple 0.20		360.00 2,040.00 with Erens
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25 Review precedors 01/06/25 Telephone coregarding san 01/06/25 Telephone coregarding san 01/06/25 Review precedors 01/07/25 Review precedors	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appearme (1.1).  B B Erens edent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.  M A Cody onference with Miller regarding Semian stay me (.1); review related materials (.8).  B B Erens all with Cody regarding Semian lift stay appearance of the cody regarding Semi	0.20 1.20 relief appeal (.3); teleple 0.20 eal issues. 0.50 2.80		360.00 2,040.00 with Erens 360.00
01/03/25 Review open regarding san  01/05/25 Review precedure of the properties of t	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appearme (1.1).  B B Erens edent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.  M A Cody onference with Miller regarding Semian stay me (.1); review related materials (.8).  B B Erens all with Cody regarding Semian lift stay appear B B Erens edent relating to Semian stay relief appeal.  M A Cody	0.20 1.20 relief appeal (.3); telepl 0.20 al issues. 0.50 2.80 ef appeal. 2.10		360.00  2,040.00 with Erens  360.00  900.00
01/03/25 Review open regarding san 01/05/25 Review prece 01/06/25 Telephone coregarding san 01/06/25 Telephone coregarding san 01/06/25 Review prece 01/07/25 Review prece 01/08/25 Review and a 01/09/25 Review pleace 01/10/25	n issues list regarding Semian stay relief appearme (1.1).  B B Erens edent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.  M A Cody onference with Miller regarding Semian stay me (.1); review related materials (.8).  B B Erens all with Cody regarding Semian lift stay appear B B Erens edent relating to Semian stay relief appeal.  M A Cody analyze precedent regarding Semian stay relief M A Cody	1.20 relief appeal (.3); telepl 0.20 al issues. 0.50 2.80 ef appeal. 2.10 elief appeal.		360.00  2,040.00 with Erens  360.00  900.00  4,760.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 115 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JONES DAT			
161866				Page: 7 ary 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice	251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/15/25 Review pleading	M A Cody ngs and precedent related to Semian stay relief	0.80 Eappeal.		1,360.00
01/16/25 Review preced	J L Gale lent relating to Semian lift stay appeal and dra	1.30 ft summary of same.		1,072.50
01/17/25 Review pleading	M A Cody ngs and precedent related to Semian stay relief	1.30 Eappeal.		2,210.00
01/17/25 Draft summar	J L Gale y of precedent in connection with Semian lift	2.00 stay appeal.		1,650.00
01/21/25 Review pleadin	M A Cody ngs and precedent related to Semian stay relief	1.70 appeal.		2,890.00
01/22/25 Review issues	M A Cody relating to Semian stay relief appeal (.3); email	0.50 s with Erens regardi	ng same (.2).	850.00
01/22/25 Emails with C	B B Erens ody regarding Semian lift stay appeal.	0.20		360.00
01/23/25 Emails with co	M A Cody ounsel to Semian regarding motion to stay app	0.30 peal of stay relief.		510.00
01/23/25 Emails with in	B B Erens sternal team regarding Semian lift stay appeal.	0.20		360.00
01/24/25 Review Semiar same (.2).	M A Cody n motion to stay appeal of order denying lift s	0.50 tay motion (.3); emai	ils with Marsha	850.00 ll regarding
01/31/25 Review preced	B B Erens lent relating to Semian lift stay appeal.	0.50		900.00
	Matter Total	22.20	USD	35,032.50
Plan of Reorganizatio	n and Disclosure Statement			
01/03/25 Review and an	M A Cody nalyze materials regarding plan issues.	0.80		1,360.00
01/27/25 Review memo	M A Cody randa regarding plan issues (1.6); telephone co	1.80 onference with Johns	son regarding s	3,060.00 ame (.2).
01/28/25 Review and an	M A Cody nalyze memoranda and precedent regarding pla	1.80 an and confirmation	issues.	3,060.00
01/29/25 Review and an	M A Cody nalyze memoranda regarding plan issues.	1.80		3,060.00
	Matter Total	6.20	USD	10,540.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 116 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES DI	11	
161866			Page: 8 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump L	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
Claims Administr	ation		
01/27/25 Review co	M A Cody orrespondence and memoranda regarding claims	1.10 s issues.	1,870.00
01/28/25 Review cl	M A Cody aims data and related materials.	0.80	1,360.00
01/29/25 Review ar	M A Cody and analyze claims objection procedures and rela	1.30 ted emails.	2,210.00
	Matter Total	3.20	USD 5,440.00
Court Hearings			
01/23/25 Commun	M A Cody ications with Erens regarding January omnibus	0.30 hearing (.3).	510.00
01/23/25 Prepare fo	B B Erens or January omnibus hearing (.20); conference wi	0.50 ith Cody regarding same	900.00 (.30).
01/24/25 Emails wi	B B Erens th internal team regarding preparation for Janua	0.20 ary omnibus hearing.	360.00
01/24/25 Review m	M R Hirst atters relating to January omnibus hearing.	0.40	600.00
01/26/25 Emails wi	B B Erens th internal team regarding January omnibus hea	0.30 aring logistics (.30).	540.00
01/27/25 Prepare fo	B B Erens or January omnibus hearing.	0.70	1,260.00
	M R Hirst Evert Weathersby Houff team in preparation fo on for hearing (1.9).	2.30 or January omnibus hear	3,450.00 ing (0.4); revise draft
01/28/25 Prepare fo	B B Erens or January omnibus hearing (.40); telephone call	0.60 s with Cahow and Cody	1,080.00 regarding same (.20).
	M R Hirst aft January omnibus hearing presentation (1.2); ano regarding hearing preparation (0.3).	1.50 communicate with Ever	2,250.00 t Weathersby Houff team
call with I	B B Erens or January omnibus hearing (.30); review emails Evert Weathersby Houff team regarding same (.30); further prepare for hearing (.70).		
01/29/25	M R Hirst	2.40	3,600.00

Prepare for January omnibus hearing (2.2); emails with internal team regarding same (.2).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 117 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES DA	XX	
161866			Page: 9 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LL	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/30/25 Telephonic	C K Cahow ally attend hearing.	1.40	1,960.00
01/30/25 Prepare for	M A Cody hearing (1.0); attend hearing (1.3).	2.30	3,910.00
01/30/25 Prepare for	B B Erens hearing (1.00); attend hearing (1.30); commun	2.60 nications with internal to	4,680.00 eam regarding same (.30).
01/30/25 Prepare for	M R Hirst hearing (1.5); attend hearing (1.3).	2.80	4,200.00
01/30/25 Telephonic	A P Johnson ally attend omnibus hearing (partial) (.2); discu	0.30 uss same with Erens (.1)	322.50
	Matter Total	20.30	USD 32,682.50
General Corporate	and Real Estate		
01/06/25 Review and	M A Cody I analyze materials in connection with respond	1.30 ling to audit letter reque	2,210.00 st.
01/06/25 Telephone	B B Erens call with client and Lewis regarding corporate	0.30 matters.	540.00
	M R Hirst terials regarding corporate matters (1.2); common regarding same (.5).	1.70 nunicate with Tananbau	2,550.00 nm and Evert Weathersby
01/06/25 Participate	T B Lewis in call with Tananbaum, Turtz and Erens rega	0.50 arding corporate matters	775.00 (.3); prepare for same (.2).
01/09/25 Draft email	M R Hirst to McGonigle regarding insurance issue.	0.50	750.00
01/13/25 Participate	T B Lewis in call with client regarding corporate matters.	0.50	775.00
	M A Cody I revise audit letter response (1.3); review mate regarding same (.3).	3.40 erials relating to same (1	5,780.00 .8); telephone conference
01/14/25 Review and	T B Lewis I analyze corporate matters (.2); call with Cody	0.50 regarding response to	775.00 audit letter request (.3).
01/15/25 Review and	M A Cody I revise audit letter response (1.1); review relat	1.60 ed materials (.5).	2,720.00
01/16/25 Review and	M A Cody I revise audit letter response (1.2); emails with	1.50 internal team regarding	2,550.00 same (.3).
01/16/25	B B Erens	0.20	360.00

Review audit letter response.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 118 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES DA	l I		
161866	C and Murray Boiler LLC			Page: 10 ry 24, 2025 251300891
Marien Fump Lax	c and Murray Bollet LLC		mvoice.	231300071
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/16/25 Review and	T B Lewis revise corporate materials.	4.30		6,665.00
01/17/25 Review and	T B Lewis revise corporate materials.	1.00		1,550.00
01/21/25 Review draf	M A Cody t corporate disclosure regarding bankruptcy c	0.80 ases.		1,360.00
01/22/25 Review and same (1.1).	M A Cody revise draft corporate disclosure regarding ba	2.90 inkruptcy cases (1.8); re	view materials r	4,930.00 related to
01/23/25 Review and (.8).	M A Cody revise corporate disclosure regarding bankrup	1.90 otcy cases (1.1); review r	materials regard	3,230.00 ing same
	M A Cody revise corporate disclosure regarding bankrup onsider issues regarding same (.5).	1.50 otcy cases (.8); emails w	ith Tananbaum	2,550.00 regarding
01/24/25 Review ema	B B Erens ills from Cody and Lewis regarding corporate	0.30 disclosure concerning l	oankruptcy case	540.00 s.
01/27/25 Telephone o	M A Cody conference with McGonigle regarding insuran	0.50 ce issues.		850.00
01/27/25 Prepare for	T B Lewis and participate in board meeting (1.5); prepar	2.50 re draft minutes for boa	rd meeting (1.0)	3,875.00
01/28/25 Telephone o	M A Cody conference with Lewis regarding corporate iss	0.30 ues.		510.00
01/28/25 Review and	T B Lewis analyze corporate issues (3.6); participate in c	3.90 all with Cody regarding	same (0.3).	6,045.00
	T B Lewis distribute materials regarding corporate matt ding call with Turtz regarding same (1.3).	1.60 ers (0.3); review and an	alyze corporate	2,480.00 planning
01/31/25 Review and	T B Lewis analyze corporate materials.	0.80		1,240.00
	Matter Total	34.30	USD	55,610.00
Schedules/SOFA/I	Bankruptcy Administrator Reporting			
01/15/25 Review Rule	P Lombardi e 2015.3 reports for Aldrich and Murray (.5); o	0.60 draft email to Clarrey co	oncerning same	570.00 (.1).
01/16/25 Review draf	M A Cody ft Rule 2015.3 reports.	0.50		850.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 119 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES DI	11		
161866	IM D-'l II C			Page: 11 ry 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice:	251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
01/17/25 Review emails same (.1).	P Lombardi from Clarrey and Tananbaum regarding R	0.40 ule 2015.3 report (.1); rev	vise report (.2):	380.00 review
01/27/25 Review month Hakim concern	P Lombardi ly status reports (.6); review quarterly fee s ning same (.1).	1.10 tatements (.1); analyze sa	me (.3); comm	1,045.00 nunicate with
01/28/25 Review drafts of	M A Cody of monthly status reports and quarterly fee	0.70 statements.		1,190.00
01/28/25 Review revised	P Lombardi I monthly status reports (.2); draft email to	0.30 Cody concerning same (	.1).	285.00
01/30/25 Review month	P Lombardi ly status reports (.1); communicate with M	0.20 iller concerning same (.1)	).	190.00
	Matter Total	3.80	USD	4,510.00
Nonworking Travel				
01/29/25 Travel to Char	M A Cody lotte for hearing and client meetings.	3.00		2,550.00
01/29/25 Travel to Char	B B Erens lotte for hearing and meetings.	2.00		1,800.00
01/30/25 Return travel t	M A Cody o Chicago.	2.00		1,700.00
01/30/25 Return travel t	B B Erens o Chicago.	2.00		1,800.00
01/30/25 Return travel t	M R Hirst o Chicago from Charlotte after hearing and	2.20 d meetings.		1,650.00
	Matter Total	11.20	USD	9,500.00
Litigation and Adversa	ary Proceedings			
01/02/25 Review and an	M A Cody alyze precedent concerning derivative litiga	2.50 ation adversary proceeding	ng discovery.	4,250.00
01/02/25 Communication	M R Hirst ons with co-defendants regarding derivative	0.20 e litigation adversary proc	ceedings matte	300.00 rs.
01/06/25 Communicate proceeding dis	M R Hirst with internal team regarding status of docu	0.20 ament review in derivativ	e litigation adv	300.00 versary

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 120 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINES DI	<b>11</b>	
161866			Page: 12 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/08/25 Review and a	M A Cody nalyze precedent and materials relating to d	2.70 erivative litigation adversa	4,590.00 ary proceeding matters.
	A Anderson stos Committee proposed search terms for and analyze same.	2.40 discovery in derivative liti	2,220.00 gation adversary
01/10/25 Telephone co	M A Cody onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.30 vative litigation adversary	510.00 proceedings matters.
01/10/25 Telephone co	B B Erens onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.30 ivative litigation adversary	540.00 proceedings matters.
01/10/25 Telephone co	R Hart onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.30 ivative litigation adversary	277.50 proceedings matters.
	M R Hirst ith co-defendants regarding derivative litiga and analysis of same in connection with dis-		
01/10/25 Telephone co	A P Johnson onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.30 vative litigation adversary	322.50 proceedings matters.
	M R Hirst e with co-defendants regarding search terms itigation adversary proceedings.	0.30 s and document review m	450.00 atters relating to discovery
	A Anderson ith co-defendants regarding discovery in demnittee comments to search terms relating		925.00 y proceedings (.5); review
01/15/25 Emails with A relating to sar	M A Cody Asbestos Committee regarding derivative liti ne.	0.50 igation adversary proceedi	850.00 ings matters and discovery
	R Hart onference with co-defendants regarding disc prior document productions in connection		740.00 on adversary proceedings
- ·	M R Hirst 0.3) and attend (0.6) telephone conference we ceedings and related discovery matters.	0.90 with co-defendants regardi	1,350.00 ng derivative litigation
01/17/25 Telephone co	C K Cahow onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.40 evative litigation adversary	560.00 proceedings matters.
01/17/25 Telephone co	M A Cody onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.50 vative litigation adversary	850.00 proceedings matters.
01/17/25 Telephone co	B B Erens onference with co-defendants regarding deri	0.30 ivative litigation adversary	540.00 proceedings matters.

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 121 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	Y T		
161866			Page February 24, 2	025
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300	891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amo	ount
01/17/25 Attend confe	M R Hirst rence call with co-defendants regarding statu	0.40 as of derivative litigation		0.00
01/17/25 Telephone co	A P Johnson onference with co-defendants regarding deriv	0.30 vative litigation adversa		2.50
01/23/25 Communicati	M R Hirst ons with co-defendants regarding derivative	0.30 e litigation adversary pr		0.00
01/28/25 Draft and rev adversary pro	R Hart ise correspondence to Asbestos Committee ceedings.	1.00 regarding discovery in		5.00
	M R Hirst pondence to Asbestos Committee regarding [1.1]; communicate with client and co-defend			0.00
01/29/25 Review corresproceedings.	B B Erens spondence to Asbestos Committee regardin	0.20 g discovery in derivativ		0.00
	Matter Total	18.50	USD 25,832	2 50
	Matter 10tal	10.50	23,032	2.50
Professional Retention		16.50	20,002	2.30
01/02/25		0.10	·	7.50
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater	on/Fee Issues A P Johnson	0.10 payments.	107	7.50 0.00
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater (.2); draft emails 01/02/25	on/Fee Issues  A P Johnson s from Lombardi, Bowen regarding recent p P Lombardi rials concerning Ankura December payment	0.10 payments.  0.40 (.1); communicate with	107 380 n Bowen concerning same	7.50 0.00
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater (.2); draft emails 01/02/25 Update electr 01/07/25 Call with Bate	A P Johnson s from Lombardi, Bowen regarding recent p P Lombardi rials concerning Ankura December payment ail to Petruolo concerning same (.1). C L Smith	0.10 payments.  0.40 (.1); communicate with 0.10 statements.	380 Bowen concerning same 60 1,800	7.50 0.00 e
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater (.2); draft emails 01/02/25 Update electr 01/07/25 Call with Bate Committee re	A P Johnson s from Lombardi, Bowen regarding recent p P Lombardi rials concerning Ankura December payment ail to Petruolo concerning same (.1).  C L Smith onic file management system with monthly B B Erens es White and Evert Weathersby Houff team	0.10 payments.  0.40 (.1); communicate with 0.10 statements.	380 Bowen concerning same 60 1,800 for call with Asbestos	7.50 0.00 e
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater (.2); draft emails 01/02/25 Update electr 01/07/25 Call with Bate Committee re 01/07/25 Review profe	A P Johnson s from Lombardi, Bowen regarding recent p P Lombardi itals concerning Ankura December payment ail to Petruolo concerning same (.1).  C L Smith onic file management system with monthly B B Erens es White and Evert Weathersby Houff team egarding Verus fees.  J L Gale	0.10 bayments.  0.40 (.1); communicate with  0.10 statements.  1.00 s regarding preparation  0.10  0.20	380 n Bowen concerning same 60 1,800 for call with Asbestos	7.50 0.00 e 0.00
01/02/25 Review emails 01/02/25 Review mater (.2); draft emails 01/02/25 Update electr 01/07/25 Call with Bate Committee re 01/07/25 Review profe 01/07/25 Draft follow to	A P Johnson s from Lombardi, Bowen regarding recent p P Lombardi rials concerning Ankura December payment rial to Petruolo concerning same (.1).  C L Smith onic file management system with monthly B B Erens es White and Evert Weathersby Houff team regarding Verus fees.  J L Gale ssional monthly statement. P Lombardi	0.10 bayments.  0.40 (.1); communicate with  0.10 statements.  1.00 s regarding preparation  0.10  0.20 sted information for particles of the	380 Bowen concerning same 60 1,800 for call with Asbestos 82 190 syments.	7.50 0.00 e 0.00 0.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 122 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNEST	JAI	
161866	1M D 7 110		Page: 14 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/08/25 Review emails	A P Johnson s from Smith, Lombardi, Fresenko regard	0.40 ding Jones Day outstanding an	430.00 mounts.
01/08/25 Review emails regarding sam	C L Smith s from internal team regarding Jones Day e (.30).	0.40 y outstanding amounts (.10); c	240.00 all with Lombardi
	B B Erens all with Asbestos Committee regarding V egarding same (.20).	0.70 Verus fees (.50); follow up with	1,260.00 Evert Weathersby
01/09/25 Review emails	A P Johnson s from Hardman, Lombardi regarding red	0.20 cent payments.	215.00
materials cond	P Lombardi es to professional fees and expenses trac eerning same (.2); review communication or payments (.1); draft email to Bowen c	ns with professionals concerning	
01/10/25 Review profes	J L Gale ssionals' monthly statements.	0.50	412.50
01/10/25 Review profes	A P Johnson ssional fees and expenses tracking chart (	0.60 (.4); draft email to Lombard re	645.00 egarding same (.2).
draft email to	P Lombardi sional fees and expenses tracking chart (. Bowen concerning same (.5); communic rning same (.1).		
	A P Johnson t monthly statements with Bowen, Loml iller regarding Verus fees (.4).	1.00 bardi (.3); review materials rela	1,075.00 ated to same (.3); review
	P Lombardi nson and Bowen concerning payment iss ofessional fees and expenses tracking cha		
01/14/25 Communication	B B Erens ons with Johnson regarding Verus fees.	0.20	360.00
01/14/25 Discuss Verus regarding Ver	J L Gale s fees issues with Johnson (0.1); review n us fees (0.4).	0.80 nonthly statements regarding s	660.00 same (0.3); draft letter
01/14/25 Review Verus	A P Johnson recent monthly statements (.6); draft em	0.80 nail to Erens regarding same (.	860.00
client regardin	B B Erens lls with Johnson regarding revisions to le ag same (.20); telephone call with Evert V ng revisions to same (.30); finalize and so	Weathersby Houff team regard	

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 123 of 134 **JONES DAY**

	JUNES DA	<u> </u>	
161866			Page: 15 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump Ll	LC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
	A P Johnson erus recent monthly statements (.2); draft letter ; revise same (.5); draft emails to Erens, Evert V		
01/16/25 Review pr	J L Gale ofessionals' monthly statements.	0.50	412.50
01/16/25 Review Ve	M R Hirst erus fee issues (.30); review Johnson email regar	0.50 rding letter concerning sam	750.00 e (.20).
	A P Johnson dinary course professional monthly statement (submit same to notice parties (.1).	0.50 .2); draft emails to Pratt, G	537.50 sale, Nguyen regarding
01/16/25 Draft ema Winston f	P Lombardi iil to Bowen concerning outstanding payments (sees (.3).	0.40 (.1); review email from Fler	380.00 ming concerning
	B B Erens e call with Johnson regarding Verus fees (.20); re ; telephone call with Evert Weathersby Houff to		1,260.00 on procedures regarding
01/17/25 Update pr	J L Gale rofessional fees and expenses tracking chart.	1.50	1,237.50
01/17/25 Review let	A P Johnson tters related to Verus fees (.1); call with Erens re	0.30 egarding issues relating to s	322.50 same (.2).
01/20/25 Review co	M A Cody orrespondence regarding Verus fee issues (.5); re	0.80 eview related emails (.3).	1,360.00
01/20/25 Telephone	B B Erens e calls with Evert Weathersby Houff team regar	0.20 rding Verus fee issues.	360.00
	M R Hirst cate with internal team regarding Verus fee issu dence regarding same (0.2).	0.40 nes (0.2); review Asbestos C	600.00 Committee
	M A Cody erus monthly statements and related correspond same (.3); telephone conference with Hirst rega		3,740.00 ferences with Johnson
	B B Erens nternal team regarding Verus interim fee applic on regarding same (.30).	1.00 ration (.70); call with Evert	1,800.00 Weathersby Houff team
01/21/25 Review Ve	M R Hirst erus fee issues (.3); call with Cody regarding sam	0.40 ne (.1).	600.00
01/21/25 Review let	A P Johnson tters regarding Verus fees (.3); discuss same with	0.80 h Cody (.5).	860.00
01/21/25 Communi	P Lombardi cate with Johnson concerning fee matters (.1); of	0.30 draft emails to professional	285.00 Is concerning December

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 124 of 134 JONES DAY

161866	JO1420 1	2111	Page: 16
101000			February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump l	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		nvoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
monthly	statements (.2).		
01/22/25	M A Cody	1.50	2,550.00
Review a	and analyze correspondence and filings regardinces with Johnson regarding same (.3).		
01/22/25	J L Gale	0.50	412.50
Review 1	professionals' monthly statements (0.3); draft s	summary of same for Johnson (0.	2).
01/23/25	M A Cody	1.70	2,890.00
	and revise drafts of correspondence regarding sby Houff team and Johnson regarding same ().		
01/23/25	B B Erens	0.60	1,080.00
Emails v	with Cody regarding Verus fee letter (.20); revious	ew comments and final draft rega	rding same (.40).
01/23/25	J L Gale	0.10	82.50
Review 1	professionals' monthly statements.		
01/23/25	A P Johnson	2.50	2,687.50
Draft let	ter regarding Verus fees (1.6); revise same (.5) num, Erens regarding same (.3).	; discuss same with Cody (.1); rev	
01/23/25 Review 1	P Lombardi Bates White's monthly statement.	0.70	665.00
01/27/25	J L Gale	1.50	1,237.50
Review <sub>1</sub> (1.1).	professionals' interim fee applications (0.4); up	date professional fees and expens	ses tracking chart
01/27/25	A P Johnson	0.30	322.50
Review of	email from Lombardi regarding recent monthl	y statements.	
01/27/25	P Lombardi	0.40	380.00
Revise o (.1).	ordinary course professionals report (.3); comm	nunicate with Johnson and Bower	n concerning same
01/28/25	P Lombardi	2.60	2,470.00
Review same (1.	professional fees and expenses tracking chart ( 4).	(.4); review precedent concerning	same (.8); revise
01/29/25	P Lombardi	0.80	760.00
	Evert Weathersby Houff monthly statement (. Cooper monthly statement (.3); draft email to		ng same (.1); review
01/31/25	J L Gale	1.10	907.50
Revise p	professional fees and expenses tracking chart.		
01/31/25	C L Smith	0.10	60.00
Update (	electronic file management system with month	nly statements.	

Matter Total 44.40 USD 52,355.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 125 of 134 JONES DAY

	JONES DA	. <b>4</b>		
161866	•			Page: 17 y 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 2	251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		Amount
Fee Application Prep	paration			
01/10/25 Review Dece	C L Smith ember invoice for privilege and compliance.	2.40		1,440.00
01/14/25 Review Dece	C L Smith ember invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.70		420.00
01/16/25 Review Dece	C L Smith ember invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.80		480.00
01/17/25 Review Dece	C L Smith ember invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.60		360.00
01/21/25 Review Dece	B B Erens ember invoice for privilege and compliance.	0.30		540.00
01/29/25 Draft Decem	C L Smith aber monthly statement (.10); email to Johnso	0.20 on regarding same (.10)	).	120.00
01/30/25 Review Jones	A P Johnson s Day monthly statement.	0.20		215.00
01/30/25 Submit Dece	C L Smith mber monthly statement to notice parties.	0.10		60.00
	Matter Total	5.30	USD	3,635.00
Asbestos Matters				
01/01/25 Review and r	A Anderson revise research memorandum related to estima	1.10 ation.		1,017.50
	M A Cody analyze asbestos matters and potential next storing same (.5).	0.80 eps concerning resolu	tion of same (.3);	1,360.00 call with
	B B Erens all with client regarding asbestos matters and pone call with Cody regarding same (.50); telephone (.50).			
01/03/25 Communicat issues.	M R Hirst e with internal team and Bates White team re	0.30 garding meeting with	LAS, estimation [	450.00 blanning
01/03/25 Research pre	A R Pruitt cedent related to estimation (4.0); draft memo	5.70 o regarding same (1.7)		4,275.00
01/06/25 Review and a	M A Cody analyze asbestos matters and potential next sto	0.80 eps regarding resolution	on of same.	1,360.00

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 126 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNEST	JAI	
161866			Page: 18 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump	LLC and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/06/25 Researc	A R Pruitt h precedent related to estimation (1.4); draft m	2.00 emo regarding same (0.6).	1,500.00
01/07/25 Call wit matters.	C K Cahow h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houff tea	0.80 ams regarding estimation and	1,120.00 estimation discovery
matters	M A Cody one conference with Bates White team regardin (.7); review and analyze pleadings and materials mation issues (3.6).		
	M R Hirst Asbestos Committee comments to draft order ternal team regarding same (0.1).	0.30 concerning estimation discov	450.00 very (0.2); communicate
01/07/25 Attend	A P Johnson call with Bates White team, Erens, Evert Weath	0.80 hersby Houff team regarding	860.00 estimation.
01/07/25 Researc	A R Pruitt h precedent related to estimation (0.8); draft m	1.20 emo regarding same (0.4).	900.00
01/08/25 Review	M R Hirst correspondence concerning Asbestos Commit	0.20 tee meeting.	300.00
	M A Cody and analyze materials in connection with asbes view correspondence regarding asbestos cases		5,610.00 t steps relating to same
01/09/25 Review	R Hart Pruitt research related to estimation matters (0.	1.90 .7); further research regarding	1,757.50 g same (1.2).
	M R Hirst ence call with LAS and Bates White teams regar on discovery order from Asbestos Committee		1,650.00 review updated
01/10/25 Review	M A Cody materials in connection with asbestos matters a	1.30 and potential next steps regar	2,210.00 ding resolution of same.
	M R Hirst unicate with internal team regarding estimation vise draft order (0.2).	0.50 discovery order and estimation	750.00 on claims file protocol
01/11/25 Researc	A R Pruitt h precedent related to estimation (1.2); draft m	2.20 emo regarding same (1.0).	1,650.00
01/12/25 Researc	A R Pruitt h precedent related to estimation (1.8); draft m	5.60 emo regarding same (3.8).	4,200.00
01/13/25 Review	M A Cody materials in connection with asbestos matters a	0.80 and potential next steps regar	1,360.00 ding resolution of same.
01/13/25	B B Erens	0.40	720.00

Attend call with internal team regarding developments and planning.

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 127 of 134 **JONES DAY**

161866

Page: 19

Aldrich Pump LLC	and Murray Boiler LLC		February 24, 2025 Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/13/25 Attend call wi	G M Gordon th internal team regarding status and plann	0.10 ming.	220.00
01/13/25 Review Pruitt	R Hart research related to estimation matters.	2.30	2,127.50
communicate	M R Hirst regarding estimation matters (.4); commu- with Asbestos Committee, co-counsel rega- attend call with internal team regarding dev	arding estimation discovery	order and claims file
01/13/25 Attend call wi	T B Lewis th internal team regarding status and plann	0.10 ning.	155.00
01/13/25 Research prec	A R Pruitt edent related to estimation (1.1); draft men	1.90 no regarding same (0.8).	1,425.00
01/13/25 Attend call wi	D S Torborg th internal team regarding status and plann	0.20 ning.	310.00
01/14/25 Review materi	M A Cody als in connection with asbestos matters an	1.80 d potential next steps regard	3,060.00 ling resolution of same.
	M R Hirst vise memo regarding estimation (1.4); comion work in process call (0.7); review estimation		4,350.00 n regarding memo (0.4);
01/14/25 Revise memo	A R Pruitt regarding estimation.	0.50	375.00
	M R Hirst with internal team regarding estimation di covery issues (0.3).	0.70 iscovery issues (0.4); review	1,050.00 draft letter regarding
01/15/25 Revise memo	A R Pruitt regarding estimation (4.3); research preced	7.30 lent regarding same (3.0).	5,475.00
	M A Cody als in connection with agenda for upcominarding resolution of same.	1.30 ng meeting relating to asbest	2,210.00 tos matters and potential
	B B Erens Il with client regarding asbestos matters an eam and Evert Weathersby Houff team reg		
01/16/25 Review Pruitt	R Hart research regarding estimation.	0.60	555.00
01/16/25 Call with Tana	M R Hirst anbaum regarding estimation matters.	0.50	750.00

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 128 of 134 JONES DAY

	JOINED DI	. <b>4</b>	
161866 Aldrich Pump LLC a	and Murray Boiler LLC		Page: 20 February 24, 2025 Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/16/25 Revise research	A R Pruitt nemo regarding estimation.	0.20	150.00
	M A Cody als in connection with agenda for upcoming rding resolution of same.	2.10 g meeting relating to asbess	3,570.00 tos matters and potential
01/17/25 Review issues 1	M R Hirst regarding claims files and document collecti	0.50 ion in connection with esti	750.00 imation discovery.
01/21/25 Call with Evert	C K Cahow t Weathersby Houff and Bates White teams	0.80 regarding asbestos matter	1,120.00 rs.
	M A Cody h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houfi ns with internal team regarding estimation d		1,530.00 matters (.8);
01/21/25 Review Pruitt 1	R Hart research and underlying case law related to e	3.10 estimation issues.	2,867.50
letter regarding	M R Hirst h Bates White and Evert Weathersby Houfi g asbestos matters (0.3); communications wi discovery issues (0.4).		
01/22/25 Draft and revis regarding resol	M A Cody se outline for upcoming meeting relating to ution of same.	2.30 asbestos matters and pote	3,910.00 ential next steps
	B B Erens from Cody for upcoming meeting regardin lution of same.	0.30 ng asbestos matters and po	540.00 stential next steps
01/22/25 Revise memo r	A R Pruitt regarding estimation.	2.50	1,875.00
regarding resol	M A Cody als in connection with upcoming meeting re ution of same (2.0); draft email to Erens rep nation and estimation discovery matters (.8)	garding same (.3); monitor	· Bestwall hearing
	B B Erens rall hearing regarding estimation matters (.7) stential next steps for resolution of same (.2)		
	M R Hirst h Tananbaum regarding estimation matters overy issues (0.8); communicate with intern		
	M A Cody als in connection with upcoming meeting re	_	5,270.00 and potential next steps

regarding resolution of same (1.3); draft outline for meeting (1.8).

# Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 129 of 134 JONES DAY

	JUNES DA	ΔY	
161866			Page: 21 February 24, 2025
Aldrich Pump LLC	C and Murray Boiler LLC		Invoice: 251300891
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	Amount
01/24/25 Review and	R Hart analyze Pruitt research related to estimation i	3.00 issues.	2,775.00
01/24/25 Review draft	M R Hirst t memorandum regarding estimation matters	0.60 (.5); communicate with Pr	900.00 ruitt regarding same (.1).
01/24/25 Revise resea	A R Pruitt rch memo regarding estimation (1.6); commu	1.70 unicate with Hirst regarding	1,275.00 g same (0.1).
01/26/25 Review men	M R Hirst no regarding outcome of Bestwall hearing on	0.20 estimation discovery.	300.00
	M A Cody erials in connection with upcoming meeting r solution of same (1.1); draft and revise agend eeting (.5).		
next steps for telephone ca same (.30); e	B B Erens Future Claimants' Representative regarding or resolution of same (.20); conference with Call with Evert Weathersby Houff team regardemails with client regarding same (.20); prepare (.30); attend call with internal team regarded.	Cody regarding client meeting same (.20); review ager re for Future Claimants' Ro	ing regarding same (.30); nda from Cody regarding epresentative meeting
regarding As	M R Hirst estos Committee revisions to claims file prote sbestos Committee revisions to claims file pro- me and estimation discovery order (0.4); atter 3).	otocol (0.3); emails with A	sbestos Committee
01/27/25 Attend call v	T B Lewis with internal team regarding status and planni	0.10 ing.	155.00
	M A Cody erials in connection with upcoming meeting resolution of same.	2.70 relating to asbestos matters	4,590.00 and potential next steps
	M A Cody erials in connection with upcoming meeting resolution of same.	3.80 relating to asbestos matters	6,460.00 and potential next steps
	B B Erens Future Claimants' Representative meeting reg on of same (.80); prepare for meeting with clie		2,880.00 and potential next steps
	C K Cahow ing with client, advisors and internal team relation of same.	2.00 lating to asbestos matters a	2,800.00 and potential next steps
regarding res	M A Cody  ting with Future Claimants' Representative re solution of same (.5); prepare for and attend a	meeting with client, interna	al team and advisors

regarding same (3.5); review and analyze materials regarding estimation discovery matters (1.5).

### Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 130 of 134 **JONES DAY**

161866 Page: 22 February 24, 2025

Aldrich Pump LLC and Murray Boiler LLC

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Amount

01/30/25 B B Erens 3.40 6,120.00

Attend Future Claimants' Representative meeting regarding asbestos matters and potential resolution of same (.70); attend meeting with internal team regarding same (2.00); communications with Miller and Cody regarding meeting with Future Claimants' Representative (.40); attend meeting with Cody regarding potential upcoming filings (.30).

Invoice: 251300891

01/30/25 M R Hirst 1.20 1,800.00

Attend meeting with client, advisors and internal team relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps regarding resolution of same.

01/30/25 T B Lewis 2.00 3,100.00

Attend meeting with client, internal team and advisors relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps regarding resolution of same.

01/31/25 M A Cody 5.60 9,520.00

Review and revise outline regarding issues relating to asbestos matters and potential next steps for resolution of same (1.3); emails with Johnson regarding same (.2); review and analyze pleadings, transcripts and related materials regarding estimation discovery issues (2.8); consider next steps concerning same in connection with Court request for schedule (1.3).

01/31/25 M R Hirst 0.30 450.00

Review matters relating to estimation discovery and next steps.

Matter Total 123.30 USD 167,190.00

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 131 of 134

### **EXHIBIT B**

**Proposed Order** 

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re

Chapter 11

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., 

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)

(Jointly Administered)

ORDER GRANTING THE FOURTEENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF JONES DAY FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2025

This matter coming before the Court on the Fourteenth Interim Application of

Jones Day for Allowance of Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of

Expenses as Counsel to the Debtors for the Period From October 1, 2024 Through January 31,

2025 (the "Interim Fee Application")<sup>2</sup> filed by Jones Day as counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (the "Debtors"); the Court having reviewed the Interim Fee

The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses): Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein have the meanings given to them in the Interim Fee Application.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 133 of 134

Application; the Court having found that (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334, (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b), (c) notice of the Interim Fee Application and the notice of an opportunity for hearing were served upon the parties required by Local Rule 2002-1(g) and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Dkt. 171] (the "Interim Compensation Order") and no other or further notice is required, (d) the compensation requested in the Interim Fee Application is reasonable and for actual and necessary services rendered by Jones Day on behalf of the Debtors during the period from October 1, 2024 through January 31, 2025 (the "Compensation Period"), (e) the expenses for which reimbursement is sought in the Interim Fee Application are actual and necessary expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Compensation Period on behalf of the Debtors, and (f) the Interim Fee Application fully complies with the Interim Compensation Order, the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Compensation Guidelines; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Interim Fee Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein;

#### IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- 1. The Interim Fee Application is GRANTED.
- 2. Jones Day is awarded, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$1,729,798.75 and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred by Jones Day during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$5,956.84.
- 3. The Debtors are authorized and directed to pay promptly to Jones Day the amount of fees and expenses approved by this Order, to the extent that such amounts have not previously been paid by the Debtors.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2576 Filed 03/12/25 Entered 03/12/25 17:13:09 Desc Main Document Page 134 of 134

- 4. The Debtors and Jones Day are authorized and empowered to take all actions necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order.
- 5. This Court shall retain exclusive jurisdiction over any and all matters arising from or related to the implementation, enforcement, or interpretation of this Order.

This Order has been signed electronically. The Judge's signature and Court's seal appear at the top of the Order. United States Bankruptcy Court