Case 20-30608 Doc 2942 Filed 11/26/25 Entered 11/26/25 12:10:32 Dec Main Docket #2942 Date Filed: 11/26/2025

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)
ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al.,1) Chapter 11
and the first block to the same) Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)

SIXTEENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS, FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

Name of applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants of Aldrich Pump LLC, et al.
Date retention approved:	August 24, 2020 nunc pro tunc July 16, 2020
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	June 1, 2025, through September 30, 2025
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$ 821,983.50 ²
Amount of expenses sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$ 0.00
Total amount of compensation paid as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$ 323,990.11
Total amount of expenses reimbursement paid as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$ 0.00
Total amount of unpaid fees and expenses sought for applicable period:	\$ 497,993.39

This is a/an monthlyx_	interim	final application
------------------------	---------	-------------------

² On November 20, 2025, the Debtors served an objection to FTI's September 2025 Monthly Fee Statement. FTI and the Debtors are complying with the procedures set forth in the Interim Compensation Order to try to resolve this objection.



¹ The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses) Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

This is the Interim Fee Application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses.³

Fee Statement Date Served	Filing Period	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Approved Fees	Approved Expenses	Total Fees and Expenses Sought	Total Fees and Expenses Outstanding
First Interim	July 16, 2020 -	154,847.00	-	154,847.00	-	154,847.00	-
Application	September 30, 2020						
Second Interim	October 1, 2020 -	311,364.50	630.06	311,364.50	630.06	311,994.56	-
Application	January 31, 2021						
Third Interim	February 1, 2021 -	644,343.50	-	644,343.50	-	644,343.50	-
Application Fourth Interim	May 31, 2021 June 1, 2021 -						
Application	September 30, 2021	102,935.50	-	102,935.50	-	102,935.50	-
Fifth Interim	June 1, 2021 -						
Application	January 31, 2022	174,112.00	-	174,112.00	-	174,112.00	-
Sixth Interim	February 1, 2022 -						
Application	May 31, 2022	162,281.50	-	162,281.50	-	162,281.50	-
Seventh Interim	June 1, 2022 -						
Application	September 30, 2022	94,733.50	-	94,733.50	-	94,733.50	-
Eighth Interim	October 1, 2022 -						
Application	January 31, 2023	459,017.00	265.40	459,017.00	265.40	459,282.40	-
Ninth Interim	February 1, 2023 -	220 225 50	20.00	220 225 50	20.00	220 255 50	
Application	May 31, 2023	238,235.50	20.00	238,235.50	20.00	238,255.50	-
Tenth Interim	June 1, 2023 -	175,616.50		175,616.50	427.79	176,044.29	
Application	September 30, 2023	175,616.50	ı	175,010.50	427.79	176,044.29	•
Eleventh Interim	October 1 2023 -	170,174.50		170,174.50		170,174.50	
Application	January 31, 2024	170,174.30		170,174.30		170,174.50	
Twelfth Interim	Febuary 1, 2024 -	339,666.50	_	339,666.50	_	339,666.50	_
Application	May 31, 2024	333,000.30		555,555.55		333,000.30	
Thirteenth Interim	June 1, 2024 -	283,339.50	_	283,339.50	_	283,339.50	_
Application	September 30, 2024	===,=====					
Fourteenth Interim	October 1, 2024 -	705,078.50	120.00	705,078.50	120.00	705,198.50	_
Application	January 31, 2025	,-				,	
Fifteenth Interim	February 1, 2025 -	439,028.00	-	439,028.00	-	439,028.00	-
Application	May 31, 2025	,		ŕ		,	
Sixtieth	June 1, 2025 -	319,685.50	-	287,716.95	-	319,685.50	319,685.50
8/13/2025	June 30, 2025						
Sixty - First	July 1, 2025 -	122,435.00	-	110,191.50	-	122,435.00	12,243.49
9/26/2025 Sixty - Second	July 31, 2025 August 1, 2025 -						
10/9/2025	August 1, 2025 - August 31, 2025	237,554.00	-	213,798.60	-	237,554.00	23,755.40
Sixty - Third	September 1, 2025 -						
11/6/2025	September 30, 2025	142,309.00	-	-	-	142,309.00	142,309.00
Sixteenth Interim	June 1, 2025 -						_
Application	September 30, 2025	\$ 821,983.50	\$ -	\$ 611,707.05	\$ -	\$ 821,983.50	\$ 497,993.39
Grand Total	July 16, 2020 - September 30, 2025	\$ 5,276,757.00	\$ 1,035.46	\$ 5,066,480.55	\$ 1,463.25	\$ 5,278,220.25	\$ 497,993.39

³ Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order [Docket No. 171] during the Compensation Period, FTI served Monthly Fee Statements on the Notice Parties (as defined in the Interim Compensation Order). Specifically, FTI's Sixtieth Monthly Statement was submitted on August 13, 2025, FTI's Sixty-First Monthly Statement was submitted on September 26, 2025, FTI's Sixty-Second Monthly Statement was submitted on October 9, 2025, and FTI's Sixty-Third Monthly Statement was submitted on November 6, 2025.

SUMMARY OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

The FTI Consulting professionals that rendered professional services in these cases during the Interim Period are:

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Diaz, Matthew	Senior Managing Director	\$ 1,445	24.2	\$ 34,969.00
Tully, Conor	Senior Managing Director	1,445	40.8	58,956.00
Berkin, Michael	Managing Director	1,155	119.7	138,253.50
Butterfield, Linda	Senior Director	1,065	20.8	22,152.00
Kersey, Jeffrey	Senior Director	1,065	4.7	5,005.50
VanPraag, Christopher	Senior Director	1,045	174.6	182,457.00
Harsha, Adam	Senior Director	1,020	38.8	39,576.00
Halevy, Richard	Director	935	83.0	77,605.00
Karasinski, Christopher	Director	910	6.5	5,915.00
Jackson, Audrey	Director I	705	0.2	141.00
Salm, Andrew	Senior Consultant	690	1.3	897.00
Harron, Liam	Senior Consultant	690	261.8	180,642.00
Weltman, Allison	Senior Consultant I	565	1.0	565.00
Wellman, Zachary	Consultant	575	5.5	3,162.50
Chen, Vicky	Consultant	515	1.8	927.00
Song, Abigail	Consultant	515	137.0	70,555.00
Stahl, Max	Consultant	515	2.8	1,442.00
Lordan, Claire	Consultant	435	8.2	3,567.00
Valcarcel, Teyah	Consultant	435	1.6	696.00
SUBTOTAL			934.3	\$ 827,483.50
Less: Voluntary Reduction	4			(5,500.00)
Grand Total			934.3	\$ 821,983.50

^{4.} FTI voluntarily reduced billing for certain items in the exercise of its billing discretion.

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

		Total	Total Compensation		Total Compensation
Task		Hours During the	During the	Total Hours During	During the
Code	Task Description	Application Period	Application Period	the Engagement	Engagement
1	Current Operating Results & Events	143.5	\$ 123,688.00	1,672.0	\$ 1,417,539.50
11	Prepare for and Attend Court Hearings	-	-	121.5	108,199.00
12	Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs	-	-	61.9	47,561.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	=	-	69.9	65,818.00
16	Analysis, Negotiate and Form of POR & DS	=	-	75.3	65,330.50
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation	685.5	609,650.00	3,059.4	2,615,614.00
19	Case Management	25.9	31,380.50	365.6	371,774.00
20	General Mtgs with Debtors & Debtors' Prof	=	-	2.2	2,034.50
21	General Mtgs with ACC & ACC Counsel	22.8	25,079.00	101.5	109,545.00
23	Firm Retention	-	-	12.1	6,858.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	45.6	32,717.00	472.0	299,657.50
28	Strategic Communications	11.0	4,969.00	377.4	178,825.50
Total C	ompensation	934.3	\$ 827,483.50	6,390.8	\$ 5,288,757.00
Less: V	oluntary Reduction ⁴		(5,500.00)		(12,000.00)
Total R	evised Compensation	934.3	\$ 821,983.50	6,390.8	\$ 5,276,757.00

 $^{{\}bf 4.} \ \ {\bf FTI} \ voluntarily \ reduced \ billing \ for \ certain \ items \ in \ the \ exercise \ of \ its \ billing \ discretion.$

EXPENSES BY EXPENSE CLASSIFICATION JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

Expense Type	Total Expenses During the Application Period	Total Expenses During the Engagement
Transportation	\$ -	\$ 436.60
Working Meals	-	396.59
Other	-	630.06
Total Expenses	\$ -	\$ 1,463.25

SUMMARY OF PREVIOUS INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS FILED BY FTI CONSULTING, INC.

Date Filed	Docket Number	Compensation Period	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Approved Fees	Approved Expenses	Docket No. Approving Application
11/13/2020	434	July 16, 2020 - September 30, 2020	\$ 154,847.00	\$ -	\$ 154,847.00	\$ -	457
4/9/2021	671	October 1, 2020 - January 31, 2021	311,364.50	630.06	311,364.50	630.06	695
7/23/2021	778	February 1, 2021 - May 31, 2021	644,343.50	-	644,343.50	-	806
1/14/2022	965	June 1, 2021 - September 30, 2021	102,935.50	-	102,935.50	-	985
4/1/2022	1085	October 1, 2021 - January 31, 2022	174,112.00	-	174,112.00	-	1137
7/22/2022	1285	February 1, 2022 - May 31, 2022	162,281.50	-	162,281.50	-	1327
11/11/2022	1409	June 1, 2022 - September 30, 2022	94,733.50	-	94,733.50	-	1500
3/30/2023	1679	October 1, 2022 - January 31, 2023	459,017.00	265.40	459,017.00	265.40	1722
7/25/2023	1890	February 1, 2023 - May 31, 2023	238,235.50	20.00	238,235.50	20.00	1927
12/5/2023	2033	June 1, 2023 - September 30, 2023	175,616.50	427.79	175,616.50	427.79	2052
3/8/2024	2125	October 1, 2023 - January 31, 2024	170,174.50	-	170,174.50	-	2160
7/11/2024	2297	February 1, 2024 - May 31, 2024	339,666.50	-	339,666.50	-	2335
12/16/2024	2489	June 1, 2024 - September 30, 2024	283,339.50	=	283,339.50	-	2505
3/12/2025	2572	October 1, 2024 - January 31, 2025	705,078.50	120.00	705,078.50	120.00	2632
7/18/2025	2723	February 1, 2025 - May 31, 2025	439,028.00	=	439,028.00	-	2782

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)
) Chapter 11
ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., ¹)
) Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ
)
Debtors.)

SIXTEENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS, FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

FTI Consulting, Inc. ("<u>FTI</u>"), financial advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the "<u>Committee</u>") of Aldrich Pump LLC, *et al.* (the "<u>Debtors</u>"), hereby submits its sixteenth interim fee application (the "<u>Interim Fee Application</u>") for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred for the period June 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025 (the "<u>Application Period</u>").

INTRODUCTION

- 1. On June 18, 2020 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtors commenced these proceedings (the "Chapter 11 Cases") by filing petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 2. Pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Debtors have continued to operate their businesses and manage their properties and assets as debtors in possession. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these Chapter 11 Cases.

¹ The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses) Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

- 3. On July 6, 2020, the Committee selected Robinson & Cole, LLP ("Robinson & Cole") and Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered ("Caplin & Drysdale", and together with Robinson & Cole, the "Committee Counsel") to serve as its bankruptcy counsel in these Chapter 11 Cases [Docket No. 210].
- 4. On July 6, 2020, the Committee selected Winston & Strawn, LLC ("Winston & Strawn") to serve as special litigation counsel [Docket No. 212].
- 5. On July 6, 2020 the Committee selected Hamilton Stephens Steele + Martin, PLLC ("HSSM") as local counsel [Docket No. 215].
- 6. On July 16, 2020, the Committee selected FTI as its financial advisor [Docket No. 277].

FTI'S FEE STATEMENTS DURING THE APPLICATION PERIOD

- 7. In accordance with the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals promulgated by the Court (the "Compensation Guidelines"), since its retention FTI has submitted monthly invoices with fee and expense detail describing the fees and expenses incurred by such retained professionals in accordance and any additional information required by the Compensation Guidelines.
- 8. During the Application Period, FTI provided the notice parties with the following monthly fee statements:
 - For June 1, 2025 through June 30, 2025 fees of \$319,685.50 and no expenses (the "Sixtieth Monthly Statement").
 - For July 1, 2025 through July 31, 2025 fees of \$122,435.00 and no expenses (the "Sixty-First Monthly Statement").

- For August 1, 2025 through August 31, 2025 fees of \$237,554.00 and no expenses (the "Sixty-Second Monthly Statement").
- For September 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025 fees of \$142,309.00 and no expenses (the "Sixty-Third Monthly Statement").
- 9. FTI does not hold a retainer in respect of its services as financial advisor to the Committee.
- 10. In total, FTI submitted Monthly Fee Statements during the Interim Fee Period for fees of \$821,983.50 and no expenses. A chart summarizing the Monthly Fee Statements submitted during the Application Period:

Fee Statement			Requested		Approved	Total Fees and	Total Fees and Expenses
Date Served	Filing Period	Requested Fees	Expenses	Approved Fees	Expenses	Expenses Sought	Outstanding
Sixtieth 8/13/2025	June 1, 2025 - June 30, 2025	319,685.50	-	287,716.95	-	319,685.50	319,685.50
Sixty - First 9/26/2025	July 1, 2025 - July 31, 2025	122,435.00	1	110,191.50	•	122,435.00	12,243.49
Sixty - Second 10/9/2025	August 1, 2025 - August 31, 2025	237,554.00	1	213,798.60	1	237,554.00	23,755.40
Sixty - Third 11/6/2025	September 1, 2025 - September 30, 2025	142,309.00	-	1	-	142,309.00	142,309.00
Sixteenth Interim Application	June 1, 2025 - September 30, 2025	\$ 821,983.50	\$ -	\$ 611,707.05	\$ -	\$ 821,983.50	\$ 497,993.39

11. Pursuant to the Interim Fee Order, FTI submits this Interim Fee Application seeking interim approval and allowance of compensation in the amount of \$821,983.50 and no expenses, as detailed in the chart above.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

- 12. The professional services performed by FTI were necessary and appropriate to the administration of the Debtors' chapter 11 cases. These services were in the best interest of the Debtors, the Committee, and other parties in interest. The compensation requested is commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues and tasks involved.
 - 13. Time by each professional and paraprofessional during the Application Period, and

a summary of the time incurred by task, followed by detailed time entries, are attached hereto as **Exhibit A, Exhibit B, and Exhibit C**.

14. During the Application Period, FTI provided reasonable and necessary financial advisory services to the Committee. The primary services rendered by FTI include, but are not limited to, the categories set forth below (each a "<u>Task Code</u>") which were billed pursuant to the requirements of Section C(8)(c) of the U.S. Trustee Guidelines:

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

15. The following is a summary of the primary activities performed by FTI professionals and paraprofessionals during the Application Period, organized by project billing category.

16. Current Operating Results & Events (1) – 143.5 Hours/ \$123,688.00 Fees

During the Application Period, FTI reviewed and analyzed financial and operating information filed by the Debtors and its affiliates. Based on these filings, FTI provided the Committee with an understanding of the Debtors' current financial position.

17. Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation (18) – 685.5 Hours/\$609,650.00 Fees

During the Application Period, FTI assisted counsel with the preparation and review of various litigation items, including those in connection with the fraudulent transfer and substantive consolidation complaints. In addition, FTI prepared certain economic analyses as requested by Counsel during the Application Period. FTI conducted research on the litigation updates and coordinated with counsel to determine next steps and outstanding items

18. Strategic Communications (28) – 11.0 Hours/\$4,969.00 Fees

FTI monitored the media landscape as it relates to asbestos litigation in connection to the Debtors' bankruptcy case and advised the Committee on its communication obligations consistent

with the Bankruptcy Code requirements.

EXPENSES INCURRED BY FTI

19. FTI is not seeking reimbursement for any expenses during this Application Period. FTI reserves the right to request, in subsequent fee statements, reimbursement of any additional expenses incurred during this Application Period, as such expenses may not have been captured in FTI's billing system on the date of filing this Interim Fee Application.

BASIS FOR RELIEF REQUESTED

- 20. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court's award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under Section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and . . . reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A) and (B).
- 21. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded to . . . [a] professional person, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including --

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;

- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title. *Id.* § 330(a)(3)(A)-(F).
- 22. The foregoing professional services performed by FTI were appropriate and necessary to the effective administration of these Chapter 11 Cases. The services were in the best interests of the Committee. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, as well as issues or tasks involved. The professional services were performed in an appropriately expeditious and efficient manner.
- 23. In accordance with Section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016(a), no agreement or understanding exists between FTI and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with these cases.
- 24. No agreement or understanding prohibited by 18 U.S.C. § 155 has been or will be made by FTI.

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED

25. The services for which FTI seeks compensation in this Application Period were, at the time rendered, necessary for, beneficial to, and in the best interests of, the Committee and the Debtors' estate. The services rendered by FTI were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the issues involved. In accordance with the factors enumerated in sections 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, it is respectfully submitted that the amount requested by FTI is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

NO PRIOR REQUEST

26. No prior request for the relief sought in this Interim Fee Application has been made to this or any other court in connection with these Chapter 11 Cases apart from the delivery of the monthly fee statements.

RESERVATION OF RIGHTS

27. The Committee expressly reserves all rights with respect to challenging the validity, propriety, jurisdiction and venue of these Chapter 11 Cases, including without limitation seeking to dismiss these Chapter 11 Cases pursuant 11 U.S.C. § 1112 and seeking to transfer these Chapter 11 Cases pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1406, 1408 and 11 U.S.C. § 105.

NOTICE

28. Notice of this Interim Fee Application has been provided in accordance with the Interim Fee Order. FTI submits that no other or further notice need be provided.

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, FTI respectfully requests that the Court: (i) enter the form of order attached as <u>Schedule 1</u> granting this Interim Fee Application and authorizing interim allowance of compensation in the amount of \$821,983.50 for professional services rendered on behalf of the Committee; (ii) direct payment by the Debtors of the foregoing amounts; and (iii) grant such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York November 26, 2025

FTI CONSULTING, INC.

/s/ Matthew Diaz
Matthew Diaz
Senior Managing Director
FTI CONSULTING, INC.
1166 Avenue of the Americas, 14th Floor
New York, NY 10036
Telephone: (212) 499-3611
Matt.Diaz@fticonsulting.com

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants of Aldrich Pump, LLC, et al. Exhibit A

Case 20-30608 Doc 2942 Filed 11/26/25 Entered 11/26/25 12:19:32 Desc Main Document Page 16 of 33

EXHIBIT A

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 20-30608 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Diaz, Matthew	Senior Managing Director	\$ 1,445	24.2	\$ 34,969.00
Tully, Conor	Senior Managing Director	1,445	40.8	58,956.00
Berkin, Michael	Managing Director	1,155	119.7	138,253.50
Butterfield, Linda	Senior Director	1,065	20.8	22,152.00
Kersey, Jeffrey	Senior Director	1,065	4.7	5,005.50
VanPraag, Christopher	Senior Director	1,045	174.6	182,457.00
Harsha, Adam	Senior Director	1,020	38.8	39,576.00
Halevy, Richard	Director	935	83.0	77,605.00
Karasinski, Christopher	Director	910	6.5	5,915.00
Jackson, Audrey	Director I	705	0.2	141.00
Salm, Andrew	Senior Consultant	690	1.3	897.00
Harron, Liam	Senior Consultant	690	261.8	180,642.00
Weltman, Allison	Senior Consultant I	565	1.0	565.00
Wellman, Zachary	Consultant	575	5.5	3,162.50
Chen, Vicky	Consultant	515	1.8	927.00
Song, Abigail	Consultant	515	137.0	70,555.00
Stahl, Max	Consultant	515	2.8	1,442.00
Lordan, Claire	Consultant	435	8.2	3,567.00
Valcarcel, Teyah	Consultant	435	1.6	696.00
SUBTOTAL			934.3	\$ 827,483.50
Less: Voluntary Reduction	1			(5,500.00)
Grand Total			934.3	\$ 821,983.50

^{1.}FTI voluntarily reduced billing for certain items in the exercise of its billing discretion.

Exhibit B

Case 20-30608 Doc 2942 Filed 11/26/25 Entered 11/26/25 12:19:32 Desc Main Document Page 18 of 33

EXHIBIT B

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 20-30608 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	143.5	\$ 123,688.00
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation	685.5	609,650.00
19	Case Management	25.9	31,380.50
21	General Mtgs with ACC & ACC Counsel	22.8	25,079.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	45.6	32,717.00
28	Strategic Communications	11.0	4,969.00
	SUBTOTAL	934.3	\$ 827,483.50
	Less: Voluntary Reduction ¹		(5,500.00)
	Grand Total	934.3	\$ 821,983.50

^{1.}FTI voluntarily reduced billing for certain items in the exercise of its billing discretion.

Exhibit C

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	6/2/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review Aldrich and Murray monthly operating reports.
1	6/2/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.8	Review latest financial reporting for Trane Parent.
1	6/2/2025	Richard Halevy	0.3	Review correspondence from FTI team re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/2/2025	Richard Halevy	0.6	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/2/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/2/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/3/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/4/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/4/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/5/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/6/2025	Conor Tully		Review workplan re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/6/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/6/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/9/2025	Michael Berkin		Review March 2025 Aldrich monthly operating report.
1	6/9/2025	Michael Berkin	0.7	Review March 2025 Murray monthly operating report.
1	6/9/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1./	Review financial reporting updates.
1	6/9/2025	Richard Halevy Liam Harron		Review financial reporting updates.
1	6/11/2025			Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/13/2025 6/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: financial reporting updates. Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.1	Review analysis re: financial reporting updates. Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	6/30/2025	Conor Tully	0.6	Review financial reporting updates.
1	6/30/2025	Liam Harron	1.1	Review Aldrich and Murray monthly operating reports.
1	6/30/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: Aldrich and Murray monthly operating reports.
1	7/2/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	7/7/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review the QSF summary report.
1	7/14/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review recent financial reporting updates.
1	7/21/2025	Michael Berkin		Review and analyze May 2025 Aldrich monthly status report.
1	7/21/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: financial reporting updates.
1	7/23/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review recent financial statements.
1	7/23/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review Trane Technologies plc ("Trane Parent") financial reporting updates.
1	7/30/2025	Michael Berkin		
1	7/30/2025	Michael Berkin		Review and analyze Trane Parent 2Q 2025 results news release.
1	7/30/2025	Abigail Song		Review Trane Parent earnings presentation.
1	7/30/2025	Abigail Song	1.2	Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	7/30/2025	Abigail Song	2.8	Continue to prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	7/30/2025	Abigail Song	0.7	Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	7/31/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review 2Q 2025 Trane Parent earnings release.
1	7/31/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.7	Review Trane Parent earnings release.
1	8/1/2025	Conor Tully	1.1	Review analysis re: Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	8/5/2025	Abigail Song	0.6	Review Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	8/6/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review analysis re: Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	8/6/2025	Michael Berkin	1.1	Analyze June 2025 Aldrich monthly status report.
1	8/6/2025	Michael Berkin	1.1	Analyze June 2025 Murray monthly status report.
1	8/6/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: MOR update.
1	8/8/2025	Conor Tully		Provide comments to FTI team re: analysis of MOR updates.
1	8/13/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Trane Technologies plc ("Trane Parent") Q2 earnings report.
1	8/13/2025	Liam Harron		
1	8/13/2025	Liam Harron	3.4	Review Trane Parent Q2 earnings reports.
1	8/21/2025	Zachary Wellman	2.1	Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	8/22/2025	Zachary Wellman		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	8/25/2025	Zachary Wellman		Review financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	8/28/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent Q2 earnings report.
1	9/2/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Trane Technologies plc ("Trane Parent") earnings report.
1	9/3/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	9/4/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review financial reporting updates.
1	9/4/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/5/2025	Liam Harron	3.3	Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 20-30608 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	9/5/2025	Liam Harron		Perform quality check re: analysis of Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/9/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: Trane Parent earnings update.
1	9/10/2025	Conor Tully		Review financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	9/10/2025	Conor Tully		Review updates from Counsel re: status of financial analysis.
1	9/10/2025	Richard Halevy		Review Trane financial update report.
1	9/10/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: Aldrich and Murray MOR.
1	9/10/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/11/2025	Conor Tully		Review financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	9/11/2025	Richard Halevy	1.8	Review analysis re: Trane Parent financial update.
1	9/11/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare updates to analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting.
1	9/15/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: Aldrich MOR.
1	9/15/2025	Michael Berkin	0.9	Review analysis re: Murray MOR.
1	9/17/2025	Conor Tully		Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	9/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag	3.3	Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	9/19/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.1	Review analysis re: financial reporting updates.
1	9/19/2025	Liam Harron	3.1	Prepare financial reporting updates for Debtors' subsidiaries.
1	9/22/2025	Conor Tully	0.8	Review analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/22/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Review financial reporting updates.
1	9/22/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.3	Review analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/22/2025	Liam Harron	3.4	Prepare updates to analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/22/2025	Liam Harron	3.8	Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/23/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.5	Correspond with FTI team re: financial reporting updates.
1	9/23/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/23/2025	Richard Halevy		Review correspondence from FTI team re: Trane Parent financial update.
1	9/23/2025	Liam Harron	3.7	Prepare analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/23/2025	Liam Harron	2.9	Continue to prepare analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/24/2025	Matthew Diaz	1.4	Review analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/24/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Review correspondence from FTI team re: analysis of financial reporting updates.
1	9/24/2025	Liam Harron	2.7	Prepare updates to analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Review Trane Parent reporting updates.
1	9/25/2025	Liam Harron	2.2	Prepare updates to analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/26/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.9	Review analysis re: Trane Parent earnings report.
1	9/26/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.5	Review updates to analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/26/2025	Liam Harron	2.3	Prepare updates to analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1	9/29/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Review analysis re: Trane Parent financial reporting updates.
1 Total			143.5	
18	6/1/2025	Abigail Song	1.5	Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/1/2025	Abigail Song	1.0	Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/2/2025	Michael Berkin	2.0	Review research re: industry reports.
18	6/2/2025	Michael Berkin	1.6	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/2/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.6	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/2/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/2/2025	Richard Halevy	2.2	Prepare analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/2/2025	Richard Halevy	1.1	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/2/2025	Richard Halevy	1.8	Assist ACC Counsel with request re: claims database.
18	6/2/2025	Liam Harron	1.1	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/2/2025	Abigail Song	1.3	Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/2/2025	Abigail Song	1.2	Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/3/2025	Michael Berkin		Review research re: historical filings.
18	6/3/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/3/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: claims database.
18	6/3/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/3/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/3/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review data room documents re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/3/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Review analysis re: claims database.
10	6/3/2025	Dishard Halary	2.0	Paviary analysis ray rasaarch inquiry from ACC Counsel

2.8 Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.

0.3 Correspond with FTI team re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.

1.3 Conduct research re: historical filings.

18

18

18

6/3/2025

6/3/2025

6/3/2025

Richard Halevy

Richard Halevy

Richard Halevy

Task				
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	6/3/2025	Christopher Karasinski	2.7	Prepare analysis re: claims database.
18	6/3/2025	Christopher Karasinski	2.7	Assist ACC Counsel with request re: claims database.
18	6/3/2025	Abigail Song	1.1	Prepare analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/4/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review workplan re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/4/2025	Michael Berkin	2.5	Review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/4/2025	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/4/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.3	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/4/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.2	Review document production re: adversary proceedings.
18	6/4/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.5	Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/4/2025	Richard Halevy		Review document production re: adversary proceedings.
18	6/4/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare analysis re: claims database.
18	6/4/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/4/2025	Christopher Karasinski	1.1	Prepare analysis re: claims database.
18	6/4/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/4/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: claims database.
18	6/4/2025	Abigail Song		Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/5/2025	Michael Berkin	1.5	Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/5/2025	Michael Berkin	2.6	Review document production re: adversary proceedings.
18	6/5/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review research re: historical filings.
18	6/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.3	Review research re: industry reports.
18	6/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.3	Review historical financial information.
18	6/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Review document production re: adversary proceedings.
18	6/5/2025	Adam Harsha		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/5/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare analysis for ACC Counsel re: Debtor's historical financial information.
18	6/5/2025	Richard Halevy	1.6	Continue to prepare analysis for ACC Counsel re: Debtor's historical financial information.
18	6/5/2025	Dishard Halary	1.0	
18	6/5/2025	Richard Halevy Liam Harron		Review analysis re: claims database. Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/6/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis for ACC Counsel re: Debtor's historical financial information.
18	6/6/2025	Conor Tully		Review workplan re: historical financial updates.
18	6/6/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis for ACC Counsel re: Debtor's historical financial information.
18	6/6/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare workplan re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/6/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/6/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Linda Butterfield		Review research re: historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/6/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.1	Prepare workplan re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/6/2025	Adam Harsha		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Adam Harsha		Review historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Richard Halevy	2.1	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/6/2025	Richard Halevy		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Abigail Song	1.6	Review historical filings.
18	6/6/2025	Abigail Song	1.1	Prepare analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/7/2025	Abigail Song	1.3	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/9/2025	Michael Berkin	0.5	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	6/9/2025	Michael Berkin	2.1	Review analysis re: research inquiry from ACC Counsel.
18	6/9/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	6/9/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Review analysis re: claims database.
18	6/9/2025	Richard Halevy	1.6	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/9/2025	Richard Halevy	0.4	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/9/2025	Richard Halevy	1.2	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/9/2025	Abigail Song		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/9/2025	Abigail Song		Review historical filings.
18	6/10/2025	Conor Tully		Review workplan re: request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/10/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/10/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/10/2025	Richard Halevy	2.1	Prepare workplan re: request from ACC Counsel.

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	6/10/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/10/2025	Liam Harron		Review research re: industry reports.
18	6/10/2025	Abigail Song	1.1	Prepare analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/11/2025	Michael Berkin		Review workplan re: request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/11/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/11/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/11/2025	Richard Halevy	1.8	Prepare analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/11/2025	Liam Harron	2.5	Review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/11/2025	Abigail Song	2.1	Review historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Conor Tully	0.7	Review workplan re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Michael Berkin	1.2	Prepare workplan re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Michael Berkin		Assist ACC Counsel with request re: claims database.
18	6/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/12/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare analysis for ACC Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Richard Halevy		Continue to prepare analysis for ACC Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/12/2025	Liam Harron		Review research re: industry reports.
18	6/12/2025	Abigail Song		Review historical annual reports.
18	6/13/2025	Conor Tully		Review analysis for ACC Counsel re: historical financial information.
18 18	6/13/2025 6/13/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin	1.5	Review analysis for ACC Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	6/13/2025	Linda Butterfield		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings. Conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	6/13/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	6/13/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/13/2025	Richard Halevy	1.3	Review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/13/2025	Richard Halevy		Continue to review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/13/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/13/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/16/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/16/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/16/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/16/2025	Adam Harsha	6.4	Conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	6/16/2025	Richard Halevy	0.7	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial analysis.
18	6/17/2025	Linda Butterfield	2.6	Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Correspond with FTI team re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/17/2025	Adam Harsha	0.6	Conduct research re: historical filings.
18	6/18/2025	Michael Berkin		Analyze research re: historical filings.
18	6/18/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: industry reports.
18	6/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/18/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/18/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/19/2025	Michael Berkin		Review research re: historical financial information.
18	6/19/2025	Linda Butterfield		Conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	6/19/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/19/2025	Richard Halevy		Assist ACC Counsel with request re: claims database.
18	6/20/2025	Linda Butterfield		Review research re: historical financial information.
18	6/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: historical filings.
18 18	6/20/2025 6/20/2025	Adam Harsha Richard Halevy		Conduct research re: historical filings. Review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/20/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Linda Butterfield		Analyze research re: historical filings.
18	6/23/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review correspondence from FTI team re: historical filings.
18	6/23/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Adam Harsha		Review research re: historical filings.
18	6/23/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: historical filings.
-	- 	,		

Task	Dat.	Dag Constant	TT -	A -4::4
Category 18	Date 6/23/2025	Professional Richard Halevy	Hours	Activity Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Andrew Salm	1.3	Review research re: historical filings.
18	6/23/2025	Vicky Chen	1.8	Conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Abigail Song	1.9	Review historical financial information.
18	6/23/2025	Abigail Song	0.7	Prepare analysis re: financial request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/24/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare workplan re: historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.3	Review historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Adam Harsha	1.2	Review historical filings.
18	6/24/2025	Richard Halevy	1.7	Review analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Richard Halevy	0.9	Review research re: industry reports.
18	6/24/2025	Richard Halevy	2.1	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Abigail Song	1.5	Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Abigail Song	2.5	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/24/2025	Abigail Song	2.7	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.1	Review historical financial information.
18	6/25/2025	Richard Halevy	1.3	Review analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18	6/25/2025	Abigail Song		Review historical financial information.
18	6/25/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: written discovery in adversary proceedings.
18 18	6/26/2025 6/26/2025	Matthew Diaz Michael Berkin		Review workplan re: request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/26/2025	Liam Harron	1.5 3.1	Review analysis re: historical financial information. Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/26/2025	Liam Harron	2.9	Analyze research re: historical filings.
18	6/26/2025	Abigail Song	1.9	Prepare analysis re: historical financial updates.
18	6/26/2025	Abigail Song	1.3	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/27/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.5	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/27/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	6/27/2025	Richard Halevy		Review analysis re: historical financial updates.
18	6/27/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: historical financial updates.
18	6/27/2025	Abigail Song	1.6	Analyze research re: historical filings.
18	6/27/2025	Abigail Song	1.5	Prepare analysis re: financial request from ACC Counsel.
18	6/30/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Review analysis re: Debtor's historical financial updates.
18	6/30/2025	Liam Harron	1.6	Prepare analysis re: Debtors' historical financial updates.
18	6/30/2025	Liam Harron	3.4	Analyze research re: historical filings.
18	6/30/2025	Liam Harron	2.9	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/30/2025	Abigail Song	0.6	Review historical financial information.
18	6/30/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/30/2025	Abigail Song	1.0	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	6/30/2025	Abigail Song	1.2	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/1/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.6	Correspond with Counsel re: research query.
18	7/1/2025 7/1/2025	Liam Harron Liam Harron		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18 18	7/1/2025	Liam Harron	1.3 3.4	Continue to review analysis re: historical financial information. Continue to review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/1/2025	Abigail Song		Review historical financial information.
18	7/1/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	7/1/2025	Abigail Song	2.7	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.4	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Liam Harron	2.6	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Liam Harron	1.1	Prepare quality check of historical financial information analysis.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	1.9	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	0.2	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	0.8	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	1.2	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	0.7	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	0.8	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/2/2025	Abigail Song	0.4	Perform quality check re: analysis of historical financial information.
18	7/7/2025	Michael Berkin	1.8	Review historical financial information.

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	•
18	7/7/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/8/2025	Michael Berkin		Review historical financial information.
18	7/8/2025	Adam Harsha		Aggregate historical financial information.
18	7/8/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis of historical financial information.
18	7/9/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: next steps on historical financial information.
18	7/9/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: historical financial information research.
18	7/11/2025	Conor Tully		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/11/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: research support.
18	7/14/2025	Conor Tully	0.9	Review analysis requested by Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Michael Berkin	0.7	Assess next steps resulting from call with ACC counsel.
18	7/14/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare for call with ACC counsel to discuss historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Michael Berkin	1.2	Provide comments to FTI team re: analysis of historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.7	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare for call with Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Adam Harsha		Correspond with FTI team re: aggregation of historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Liam Harron	3.2	Conduct historical financial information research.
18	7/14/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to conduct historical financial information research.
18	7/14/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Abigail Song	2.9	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/14/2025	Abigail Song	1.4	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/15/2025	Liam Harron	1.4	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/15/2025	Abigail Song	1.4	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	7/15/2025	Abigail Song	1.3	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/15/2025	Abigail Song	1.7	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/16/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/16/2025	Liam Harron	2.1	Conduct historical financial information research.
18	7/16/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare updates re: historical financial information analysis.
18	7/16/2025	Abigail Song		Continue to prepare updates re: historical financial information analysis.
18	7/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/17/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/17/2025	Liam Harron		Conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	7/17/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	7/17/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to conduct research re: historical financial information.
18	7/17/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare updates to historical financial information analysis.
18	7/18/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/18/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.2	Review analysis re: historical financial research.
18	7/18/2025	Adam Harsha	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: aggregation of historical financial information.
18	7/18/2025	Liam Harron	3.1	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/18/2025	Liam Harron	0.7	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/19/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare workplan re: outstanding research requests.
18	7/23/2025	Liam Harron		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/24/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/25/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review workplan re: historical financial information analysis.
18	7/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.4	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/25/2025	Liam Harron	0.9	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/25/2025	Liam Harron	0.7	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information analysis.
18	7/28/2025	Liam Harron	2.1	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/29/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.7	Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	7/29/2025	Adam Harsha	3.3	Aggregate historical financial information at the request of counsel.
18	7/29/2025	Adam Harsha	2.1	Continue to aggregate historical financial information at the request of counsel.
18	7/29/2025	Abigail Song		Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	7/30/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	7/30/2025	Adam Harsha		Correspond with FTI team re: aggregation of historical financial information.
18	7/30/2025	Max Stahl	0.4	Review correspondence from FTI team re: aggregation of historical financial
				information.
18	7/31/2025	Adam Harsha	2.2	Aggregate historical financial information at the request of counsel.

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	·
18	7/31/2025	Adam Harsha		Continue to aggregate historical financial information at the request of counsel.
18	7/31/2025	Max Stahl	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: aggregation of historical financial information.
18	8/1/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Correspond with Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	8/1/2025	Adam Harsha	1.7	Aggregate historical financial information.
18	8/1/2025	Abigail Song		Correspond with FTI team re: historical financial information.
18	8/4/2025	Max Stahl	1.8	Aggregate historical financial information.
18	8/5/2025	Michael Berkin	1.1	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/5/2025	Adam Harsha		Aggregate historical financial information.
18	8/5/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/5/2025	Max Stahl	0.1	Aggregate historical financial information.
18	8/6/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/6/2025	Max Stahl		Aggregate historical financial information.
18	8/7/2025	Conor Tully		Review updates for Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	8/7/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Review analysis re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/7/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/7/2025	Abigail Song		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/7/2025	Abigail Song Matthew Diaz		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025 8/8/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18 18	8/8/2025		1.1	Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag Christopher VanPraag		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag Christopher VanPraag	2.6	Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel. Conduct quality check re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025	Abigail Song	2.7	Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/8/2025	Abigail Song	2.4	Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/11/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.6	Review updates for Counsel on historical financial information.
18	8/11/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/11/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.7	Correspond with Counsel re: historical financial information.
18	8/12/2025	Conor Tully		Review updates from team re: historical financial analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: economic analysis request from Counsel.
18	8/12/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/13/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/13/2025	Michael Berkin	1.7	Continue to review economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/13/2025	Jeffrey Kersey	0.9	Review correspondence from FTI team re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/14/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/14/2025	Conor Tully		Review economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/14/2025	Conor Tully		Prepare for call with Counsel re: economic research.
18	8/14/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/14/2025	Michael Berkin		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/14/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare for call with Counsel re: economic research.
18	8/14/2025	Jeffrey Kersey		Review analysis re: economic research.
18	8/14/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/14/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/14/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/15/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/15/2025	Conor Tully		Review analysis re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/15/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review correspondence from Counsel re: economic analysis.
18	8/15/2025	Liam Harron	3.6	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/15/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/15/2025	Liam Harron	2.7	Continue to prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/15/2025	Abigail Song	1.2	Prepare analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/15/2025	Abigail Song	2.6	Review analysis re: historical financial information.
18	8/17/2025	Liam Harron	2.1	Prepare updates to economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Michael Berkin	2.3	Review economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Michael Berkin	1.9	Continue to review economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare analysis re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Michael Berkin	1.4	Provide comments to FTI team re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.

ALDRICH PUMP LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 20-30608 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

Task			<u> </u>	
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	8/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag	2.7	Prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag	3.4	Continue to prepare analysis re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to review analysis re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Liam Harron		
18	8/18/2025	Liam Harron	2.9	Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Liam Harron	3.1	Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/18/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/19/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/19/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/19/2025	Liam Harron	3.4	Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/19/2025	Liam Harron	1.7	Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/19/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic information at request of Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/20/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/20/2025 8/21/2025	Liam Harron Matthew Diaz		Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18 18	8/21/2025	Conor Tully		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel. Review correspondence from FTI team: economic analysis performed at the request
10	6/21/2023	Collor Tully	0.7	Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Capar Tully	1.2	Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Conor Tully Michael Berkin		
18	8/21/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic analysis re: request from Counsel. Continue to review economic analysis re: request from Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare research re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Michael Berkin		Correspond with FTI team re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: economic request from Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.2	Continue to prepare analysis re: economic request from Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: economic request from Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/21/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis at the request of Counsel.
18	8/22/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review analysis re: economic-related request from Counsel.
18	8/22/2025	Conor Tully		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/22/2025	Michael Berkin		Assess economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/22/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/22/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare updates re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/25/2025	Liam Harron		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/26/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/26/2025	Liam Harron	2.6	Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/27/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/27/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/27/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Matthew Diaz	1.1	Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Matthew Diaz	0.5	Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Conor Tully		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Conor Tully		Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Conor Tully		Correspond with FTI team re: economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: economic request from Counsel.
18	8/28/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review analysis re: economic request from Counsel.
1.2	8/28/2025	Christopher Van Praga		Drange correspondence to ETI team reveconomic research

0.7 Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: economic research.

18

8/28/2025

Christopher VanPraag

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	8/28/2025	Liam Harron	3.3	Prepare updates to economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/29/2025	Conor Tully	0.6	Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	8/29/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.3	Review analysis re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	8/29/2025	Liam Harron	2.3	Update analysis re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	9/2/2025	Liam Harron	1.5	Review audio files from 8/28/2025 hearing.
18	9/2/2025	Liam Harron	0.9	Correspond with FTI team re: 8/28/2025 hearing.
18	9/3/2025	Matthew Diaz	1.4	Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/3/2025	Conor Tully	2.3	Review research requested by Counsel.
18	9/3/2025	Michael Berkin	1.4	Prepare for discussion with Counsel re: economic research.
18	9/3/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.8	Correspond with Counsel re: financial analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/3/2025	Liam Harron	3.4	Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/3/2025	Liam Harron	3.2	Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/4/2025	Michael Berkin	1.4	Review motion and related filings re: committee members.
18	9/4/2025	Michael Berkin	1.1	Review audio files from 8/28/2025 hearing.
18	9/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.0	Review financial analysis for Counsel.
18	9/8/2025	Richard Halevy	0.8	Review financial analysis per Counsel's request.
18	9/8/2025	Richard Halevy		Review motion and related filings re: committee members.
18	9/8/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/8/2025	Liam Harron		Continue to prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Michael Berkin		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Michael Berkin		
18	9/10/2025	Michael Berkin		Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Continue to review economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/10/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic analysis requested by Counsel.
18	9/11/2025	Michael Berkin		Review analysis re: economic information requested by Counsel.
18	9/11/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: economic information requested by Counsel.
18	9/12/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review economic research requested by Counsel.
18	9/12/2025	Michael Berkin		Prepare analysis re: economic information requested by Counsel.
18	9/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: economic information requested by Counsel.
18	9/12/2025	Richard Halevy		Review correspondence from FTI team re: economic research requested by Counsel.
18	9/16/2025	Conor Tully		Review financial reporting and analysis for Counsel.
18	9/19/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review economic research requested by Counsel.
18	9/19/2025	Conor Tully		Review status of analysis for Counsel.
18	9/19/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Prepare analysis re: financial reporting for Counsel.
18	9/19/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare economic research requested by Counsel.
18 Total	9/19/2023	Liaiii Haifoii	685.5	Trepare economic research requested by Counsel.
19	6/1/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: case updates.
19	6/13/2025	Michael Berkin		Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	6/16/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: case updates.
19	6/17/2025	Conor Tully		Review latest docket filings.
19	6/20/2025	Conor Tully		Review case updates from FTI team.
19	6/20/2025	Conor Tully		Review workplan re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	6/20/2025	Michael Berkin		Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	6/25/2025	Conor Tully		Review case updates from FTI team.
19	6/27/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Correspond with FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	6/27/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare workplan to address case issues.
19	7/3/2025	Conor Tully		Review status of key workstreams and case updates.
19	7/3/2025	Conor Tully Conor Tully		Review correspondence with FTI team re: case updates and next steps.
		•		
19 10	7/7/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: case updates.
19 10	7/12/2025	Matthew Diaz		Review workplan for near-term deliverables.
19	7/16/2025	Michael Berkin		Review recent docket filings.
19	7/16/2025	Michael Berkin		Continue to review recent docket filings.
19	7/16/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review recent docket filings.
	7/18/2025	Conor Tully	0.5	Review workplan for near-term deliverables.
19 19	7/18/2025	Michael Berkin		Review recent filings.

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
19	7/18/2025	Michael Berkin	0.3	Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	7/25/2025	Conor Tully	0.7	Review case status and updates from team.
19	7/25/2025	Michael Berkin	0.3	Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	7/25/2025	Michael Berkin	0.2	Review case updates and key next steps.
19	7/29/2025	Abigail Song	0.3	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: case updates.
19	7/31/2025	Michael Berkin	0.7	Prepare workplan for near-term deliverables.
19	8/1/2025	Michael Berkin	0.4	Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	8/1/2025	Michael Berkin	0.2	Review docket updates.
19	8/5/2025	Conor Tully	0.6	Review case protective order.
19	8/8/2025	Conor Tully	0.4	Review case status and update workplan.
19	8/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.5	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	8/13/2025	Conor Tully	0.8	Review correspondence with FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	8/14/2025	Conor Tully	0.8	Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	8/15/2025	Michael Berkin	0.3	Review docket updates.
19	8/22/2025	Michael Berkin	0.3	Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	8/22/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.1	Correspond with FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	8/22/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.5	Prepare workplan for near-term deliverables.
19	9/2/2025	Conor Tully	0.5	Review latest status of case updates.
19	9/2/2025	Michael Berkin		•
19	9/3/2025	Conor Tully		Provide team update on recent discussions with Counsel.
19	9/8/2025	Michael Berkin		Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	9/8/2025	Michael Berkin		Review correspondence from FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	9/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review correspondence from FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	9/8/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	9/9/2025	Michael Berkin		Review case status and key workstreams.
19	9/10/2025	Conor Tully	0.9	Review updates from FTI team re: case status.
19	9/10/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: workstreams for near-term deliverables.
19	9/12/2025	Michael Berkin		Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	9/19/2025	Conor Tully		Review recent case updates and status.
19	9/26/2025	Conor Tully		Review updates from FTI team on case status.
19	9/26/2025	Michael Berkin		Identify case issues to update workplan.
19	9/29/2025	Conor Tully		Review case updates.
19 Total	3,23,2020	conor runy	25.9	1000 apades.
21	6/3/2025	Conor Tully		Review correspondence from Counsel re: financial reporting updates.
21	6/4/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare correspondence to ACC Counsel re: claims database analysis.
21		referrer a riare v y	0.5	
	6/6/2025	Michael Berkin		• •
21		2	1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
	6/6/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin	1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025	Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis.
21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8 0.4	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8 0.4	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate on call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 2	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025 7/18/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2 0.3	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 2	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025 7/18/2025 8/14/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2 0.3 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 2	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025 7/18/2025 8/14/2025 8/14/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully Michael Berkin	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2 0.3 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC counsel re: historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: research request. Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 2	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025 7/18/2025 8/14/2025 8/14/2025 8/15/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2 0.3 0.8 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate on call with ACC counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: Poebtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis. Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis. Participate in call with Counsel re: financial updates for Debtor subsidiaries.
21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 21 2	6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/6/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/13/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 6/24/2025 7/14/2025 7/18/2025 8/14/2025 8/15/2025 8/21/2025	Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Richard Halevy Richard Halevy Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully Michael Berkin Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully	1.0 0.8 0.8 1.3 0.8 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.8 0.8 0.4 0.8 0.2 0.3 0.8 0.8	Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' claims database analysis. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Prepare for call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with ACC Counsel re: Debtors' historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: historical financial information. Participate in call with Counsel re: research request. Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis. Participate in call with Counsel re: financial updates for Debtor subsidiaries. Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis.

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	8/29/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.3	Participate in call with Counsel re: economic analysis.
21	9/3/2025	Conor Tully		Participate in call with Counsel re: financial reporting updates.
21	9/3/2025	Michael Berkin	0.8	Participate in call with Counsel re: financial reporting updates.
21	9/3/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Participate in call with Counsel re: financial reporting updates.
21	9/3/2025	Liam Harron	0.8	Participate in call with Counsel re: financial reporting updates.
21	9/12/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.5	Participate in call with Counsel re: economic information request.
21 Total			22.8	
24	6/3/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare fifteenth interim fee application.
24	6/6/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare fifteenth interim fee application.
24	6/11/2025	Richard Halevy		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: fifteenth interim fee application.
24	6/19/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare May 2025 fee statement.
24	6/19/2025	Abigail Song		Continue to prepare May 2025 fee statement.
24	6/20/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare May 2025 fee statement.
24	6/27/2025	Richard Halevy		Review May 2025 fee statement.
24	6/27/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare updates to May 2025 fee statement.
24	7/2/2025	Conor Tully		Review and comment on May fee statement. Propose correspondence to ETI team re: May fee statement
24	7/2/2025 7/3/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: May fee statement.
24 24	7/8/2025 7/8/2025	Christopher VanPraag Conor Tully		Review interim fee application. Review May fee statement.
24	7/9/2025	Abigail Song		Finalize May fee statement.
24	7/9/2025	Abigail Song Abigail Song		Prepare fifteenth interim fee application.
24	7/13/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare proposed order granting fifteenth interim fee application.
24	7/15/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review June fee statement.
24	7/15/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: fifteenth interim fee statement.
24	7/21/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare June fee statement.
24	7/22/2025	Abigail Song	1.1	Prepare June fee statement.
24	7/25/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare June fee statement.
24	7/28/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review June fee statement.
24	7/30/2025	Abigail Song		Finalize June fee statement.
24	8/5/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review June fee statement.
24	8/5/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare June fee statement.
24	8/7/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review May fee statement.
24	8/7/2025	Abigail Song		Prepare June fee statement.
24	8/22/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare July fee statement.
24	8/24/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare July fee statement.
24	8/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag		Review July fee statement.
24	8/26/2025	Christopher VanPraag	1.3	Review July fee statement.
24	8/26/2025	Liam Harron	2.2	Prepare updates to and finalize July fee statement.
24	9/8/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare August fee statement.
24	9/15/2025	Liam Harron	2.3	Prepare August fee statement.
24	9/17/2025	Liam Harron	1.1	Prepare August fee statement.
24	9/23/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare August fee statement.
24	9/25/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.8	Review August fee statement.
24	9/29/2025	Christopher VanPraag	0.3	Review updates to August fee statement.
24	9/29/2025	Liam Harron		Prepare August fee Statement.
24	9/30/2025	Conor Tully		e
24	9/30/2025	Liam Harron		Finalize August fee Statement.
24 Total			45.6	
28	6/3/2025	Claire Lordan		Prepare biweekly media monitor.
28	6/5/2025	Teyah Valcarcel		y
28	6/17/2025	Claire Lordan		Prepare biweekly media monitor.
28	6/19/2025	Claire Lordan	1.1	Prepare biweekly media monitor.
28	6/26/2025	Claire Lordan		Review biweekly media monitor.
28	7/2/2025	Teyah Valcarcel		Prepare compilation and review of biweekly media monitor report.
28	7/3/2025	Teyah Valcarcel		Prepare compilation and review of biweekly media monitor report.
28	7/7/2025	Claire Lordan		Prepare ACC media monitor.
28	7/17/2025	Claire Lordan		Prepare ACC media monitor.
28	8/6/2025	Claire Lordan	0.4	Prepare media monitor.

Case 20-30608 Doc 2942 Filed 11/26/25 Entered 11/26/25 12:19:32 Desc Main Document Page 31 of 33

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
28	8/13/2025	Allison Weltman	0.6	Create media monitor and legislative tracker.
28	8/14/2025	Allison Weltman	0.4	Finalize media monitor and legislative tracker.
28	8/29/2025	Claire Lordan	0.7	Finalize media monitor and legislative tracker.
28	9/9/2025	Claire Lordan	0.9	Prepare media monitor.
28	9/11/2025	Audrey Jackson	0.2	Create media monitor and legislative tracker.
28	9/30/2025	Claire Lordan	1.2	Prepare media monitor.
28 Total			11.0	
Grand Total			934.3	

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)
) Chapter 11
ALDRICH PUMP LLC, et al., ¹)
) Case No. 20-30608 (LMJ)
) (Jointly Administered)
Debtors.)

ORDER GRANTING THE SIXTEENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS OF ALDRICH PUMP LLC, FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 1, 2025, THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

This matter coming before the Court on the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application of FTI Consulting, Inc., as Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants of Aldrich Pump LLC, for Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period June 1, 2025 Through September 30, 2025 (the "Sixteenth Interim Fee Application")² filed by FTI Consulting, Inc. ("FTI"), financial advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the "Committee") of Aldrich Pump LLC, et al. (the "Debtors"); the Court having reviewed the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application; the Court having found that: (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334; (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); (c) notice of the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application was sufficient pursuant to Local Rule 2002-1(g) and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [D.I. 171] (the "Interim Fee

¹ The Debtors are the following entities (the last four digits of their respective taxpayer identification numbers follow in parentheses) Aldrich Pump LLC (2290) and Murray Boiler LLC (0679). The Debtors' address is 800-E Beaty Street, Davidson, North Carolina 28036.

² Capitalized terms used herein and not otherwise defined shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application.

Order") and no other or further notice is required; (d) the compensation requested in the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application is reasonable and for actual and necessary services rendered by FTI on behalf of the Committee during the period from June 1, 2025 through September 30, 2025 (the "Fee Period"); (e) the expenses for which reimbursement is sought in the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application are actual and necessary expenses incurred by FTI during the Fee Period on behalf of the Committee; and (f) the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application fully complies with the Interim Fee Order, the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Guidelines; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Sixteenth Interim Fee Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein:

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED THAT:

- 1. The Sixteenth Interim Fee Application is GRANTED.
- 2. FTI is awarded, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Fee Period in the amount of \$821,983.50.
- 3. The Debtors are authorized and directed to pay FTI promptly the fees and expenses approved in this Order to the extent such amounts have not been paid previously by the Debtors.
- 4. The Debtors and FTI are authorized and empowered to take all actions necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order.
- 5. This Court shall retain exclusive jurisdiction over any and all matters arising from or related to the implementation, enforcement, or interpretation of this Order.

This Order has been signed electronically The Judge's signature and court's seal appear at the top of the Order. United States Bankruptcy Court