

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI
SOUTHEASTERN DIVISION**

-----	X	
	:	
In re	:	Chapter 11
	:	
BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION, et al.,	:	Case No. 20-43597-399
	:	
Debtors.	:	(Jointly Administered)
	:	
	:	Obj. Deadline: March 31, 2021 at 4:00 p.m. (CT)
	:	Hearing Date: April 14, 2021 at 9:00 a.m. (CT)
	:	Hearing Location: Courtroom 5 North
-----	X	

**SUMMARY SHEET OF SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE
APPLICATION OF WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP FOR ALLOWANCE
AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL
TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021**

Name of Applicant:	Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Date of Retention:	August 19, 2020 (provisionally retained as of July 20, 2020)
Second Interim Compensation Period	
Period for which Compensation and Expense Reimbursement are Sought in this Application:	November 1, 2020 through January 6, 2021
Total Amount of Compensation and Expense Reimbursement Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$2,690,368.77
Total Amount of Compensation Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$2,682,719.00 ¹
Total Amount of Expense Reimbursement Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$7,649.77
Final Compensation Period	

¹ Due to an inadvertent error in a previous monthly fee statement sent to the Debtors, Weil billed for an associate's time at an incorrect hourly rate resulting in an overcharge of \$15,404.00 in fees. Accordingly, Weil provided the Debtors a credit by decreasing its fees sought by this same amount in its Sixth Monthly Fee Statement. Instead of \$1,369,328.50 in monthly fees incurred in December, Weil has sought reimbursement for \$1,353,924.50.



Period for which Compensation and Expense Reimbursement are Sought in this Application:	July 20, 2020 through January 6, 2021
Total Amount of Compensation and Expense Reimbursement Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$11,234,545.09
Total Amount of Compensation Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$11,220,438.50
Total Amount of Expense Reimbursement Sought to be Allowed in this Application:	\$14,106.59
Other Information	
Compensation Sought in this Application and Already Paid But Not Yet Allowed:	\$2,146,175.20
Expense Reimbursement Sought in this Application and Already Paid But Not Yet Allowed:	\$7,649.77
Blended Rate in this Application for Attorneys:	\$946.19
Blended Rate in this Application for All Paraprofessionals:	\$345.21
Blended Rate in this Application for All Timekeepers:	\$919.89
Number of Professionals Included in this Application:	77
Number of Professionals Billing Fewer than 15 Hours to the Case During this Period:	21
Are Any Rates Higher than those Approved or Disclosed at Retention? If yes, Calculate the Amount of Compensation Attributable to Any Rate Increase:	Yes. The amount of compensation attributable to the rate increase effective as of January 1, 2021 is \$5,400.
This is a(n): ___ monthly <u>X</u> interim <u>X</u> final application	

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI
SOUTHEASTERN DIVISION

----- X
In re : Chapter 11
BRIGGS & STRATTON : Case No. 20-43597-399
CORPORATION, *et al.*, :
Debtors. : (Jointly Administered)
Obj. Deadline: March 31, 2021 at 4:00 p.m. (CT)
Hearing Date: April 14, 2021 at 9:00 a.m. (CT)
Hearing Location: Courtroom 5 North
----- X

**SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF
WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP FOR ALLOWANCE AND
PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL
TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021**

Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP (“Weil”)¹ hereby submits its *Second Interim and Final Fee Application for Allowance and Payment of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors for the Period from July 20, 2020 through January 6, 2021* (the “**Application**”), pursuant to sections 330(a) and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “**Bankruptcy Code**”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “**Bankruptcy Rules**”), Rules 2016-1 and 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure for the Eastern District of Missouri (the “**Local Rules**”), and the Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, Effective as of November 1, 2013 (the “**Fee Guidelines**”), for entry of an order for final allowance of compensation in the amount of \$11,220,438.50 for professional services performed for the above-captioned debtors (the

¹ Capitalized terms used in this Application, but not defined herein, shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Second Amended Plan or the Confirmation Order (each as defined below), as applicable.

“**Debtors**”) and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$14,106.59 inclusive of (i) fees in the amount of \$8,537,719.50 and expenses incurred in the amount of \$6,456.82 during the period commencing July 20, 2020 through October 31, 2020 (the “**First Interim Compensation Period**”) and (ii) fees in the amount of \$2,682,719.00 and expenses incurred in the amount of \$7,649.77 during the period commencing November 1, 2020 through January 6, 2021 (the “**Second Interim Compensation Period**” and, together with the First Interim Compensation Period, the “**Final Compensation Period**”). In support of this Application, Weil respectfully represents as follows:

Preliminary Statement

1. On December 18, 2020, the Court entered an order [Docket No. 1485] (the “**Confirmation Order**”) confirming the *Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Docket No. 1434] (the “**Second Amended Plan**”). The Second Amended Plan became effective on January 6, 2021 [Docket No. 1538]. In accordance with the Second Amended Plan, and the Confirmation Order, this Application seeks approval of compensation and reimbursement of amounts incurred by Weil as counsel to the Debtors for the Second Interim Compensation Period and the Final Compensation Period.

2. The Debtors’ chapter 11 cases have been complex and demanding – comprised of a robust sale process in the middle of a global pandemic, hard-fought negotiations with key stakeholders culminating in the Global Settlement,² and an incredibly successful and primarily consensual chapter 11 plan process. Weil’s guidance and leadership at each stage of these chapter 11 cases were critical to effectuating the Sale Transaction (as defined below), preserving jobs,

² As defined in the *Order (I) Authorizing the Sale of the Assets and Equity Interests to the Purchaser Free and Clear of Liens, Claims, Interests, and Encumbrances; (II) Authorizing the Assumption and Assignment of Certain Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases; and (III) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 898] (the “**Sale Order**”).

confirming the Second Amended Plan, and maximizing value for creditors, all in a timeframe of just over five months.

3. The Debtors commenced these chapter 11 cases with a stalking horse bid from the Purchaser (as defined below) after a robust, months-long marketing process conducted by the Debtors and their advisors in pursuit of the most beneficial solution for the Debtors' stakeholders. With the assistance of the Debtors' other professional advisors, Weil secured a guaranteed purchase price of \$550 million (subject to adjustment) plus assumed liabilities for the Debtors' business on a going concern basis.

4. Following the commencement of these chapter 11 cases, Weil engaged in extensive negotiations and participated in contested evidentiary hearings to secure debtor-in-possession financing for the Debtors on a final basis. The evidentiary hearings required significant preparation for in-court testimony. If not for Weil's significant efforts, the Debtors would not have been able to access the necessary liquidity to manage their operations on a continuing basis and achieve the going concern Sale Transaction (as defined below).

5. Weil also expended extensive and continuous efforts in establishing the Debtors' Bidding Procedures (as defined below). Winning court approval for the Bidding Procedures (as defined below) over the objections filed by various parties (including the Ad Hoc Group³ and the Creditors' Committee) and on an abbreviated timetable required intensive, virtually around-the-clock efforts from Weil's attorneys. Although the Debtors did not receive a higher or better bid than the stalking horse bid, the Debtors still achieved a substantial purchase price for their assets

³ As defined in the *Preliminary Objection of Ad Hoc Group of Senior Noteholders to Motion of Debtors for Entry of an Order (I) Approving (A) Bidding Procedures, (B) Designation of Stalking Horse Bidder and Stalking Horse Bid Protections, (C) Scheduling Auction and Sale Hearing, (D) Form and Manner of Notice of Sale, Auction, and Hearing, and (E) Assumption and Assignment Procedures; (II) Authorizing (A) Sale of Debtors' Assets and Equity Interest Free and Clear of Liens, Claims, Interests, and Encumbrances and (B) Assumption and Assignment of Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases; and (III) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 300].

on a going concern basis, allowing the Debtors to maximize recoveries for all creditors, while also preserving jobs.

6. In the weeks leading to the hearing to approve the Sale Transaction (as defined below), Weil led extensive negotiations on behalf of the Debtors with the Creditors' Committee (as defined below), the Pension Guaranty Benefit Corporation (the "PBGC"), the DIP Agent⁴ and DIP Lenders,⁵ and the Purchaser (as defined below), which culminated in the Global Settlement. As the Court is aware, the Global Settlement ensured the support of the Debtors' key stakeholders for the Sale Transaction (as defined below) and throughout the balance of these chapter 11 cases – indeed, only a small group of creditors objected to the *Amended Disclosure Statement for Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Docket No. 1227] (the "**Amended Disclosure Statement**"), and only four (4) objections to the Second Amended Plan were filed by creditors, all of which were resolved consensually prior to the confirmation hearing on December 18, 2020. The remaining objections were filed by the United States Trustee and the United States Securities and Exchange Commission.

7. The professional services performed and expenses incurred by Weil were actual and necessary to preserve and protect the value of the Debtors' estates. Weil assisted the Debtors in achieving a going-concern, value-maximizing Sale Transaction (as defined below) and obtaining approval of a consensual chapter 11 plan, which set the Debtors up for an efficient and equitable process of winding down the Debtors' remaining assets and distributing the proceeds to creditors. Given the circumstances of these chapter 11 cases, the efficiency with which they were administered, and the successful outcome for the Debtors and their stakeholders, Weil's charges

⁴ As defined in the *Final Order (I) Authorizing Debtors to Obtain Postpetition Financing, (II) Authorizing Debtors to Use Cash Collateral, (III) Granting Liens and Superpriority Claims, (IV) Granting Adequate Protection to Prepetition Secured Parties, and (V) Modifying Automatic Stay* [Docket No. 526] (the "**Final DIP Order**").

⁵ As defined in the Final DIP Order.

for professional services performed and expenses incurred are reasonable and appropriate under the applicable standards. Weil respectfully requests that the Court grant the Application.

Jurisdiction

8. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Missouri (the “**Court**”) has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157, 1334 and Local Rule 1001 (D). This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is proper before the Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

Background

9. On July 20, 2020 (the “**Petition Date**”), the Debtors each commenced with this Court a voluntary case under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors are authorized to continue to operate their business and manage their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors’ chapter 11 cases are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only pursuant to Rule 1015(b) of the Bankruptcy Rules and Rule 1015(b) of the Local Rules.

10. On August 5, 2020, the United States Trustee appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the “**Creditors’ Committee**”) in these chapter 11 cases pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these chapter 11 cases.

11. On the Petition Date, the Debtors filed their Bidding Procedures Motion.⁶ On August 19, 2020, the Court entered the Bidding Procedures Order,⁷ which, among other things, (a) approved bidding procedures in connection with the sale of the Debtors' assets, (b) approved the designation of a stalking horse bidder and stalking horse bid, (c) scheduled an auction to take place on September 1, 2020, and (d) scheduled a sale hearing for September 15, 2020. On September 15, 2020, the Court entered the Sale Order authorizing the Debtors to sell substantially all of their assets (the "**Sale Transaction**") to Bucephalus Buyer, LLC (the "**Purchaser**"). On September 21, 2020, the Debtors closed the Sale Transaction.⁸

12. Following the successful sale of substantially all of their assets, the Debtors focused their efforts and resources on developing and filing a workable and confirmable chapter 11 plan of liquidation supported by the Creditors' Committee. On October 9, 2020, the Debtors filed the *Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Docket No. 1066] and the *Disclosure Statement for Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Docket No. 1067] (together with the Amended Disclosure Statement, the "**Disclosure Statement**"). On November 9, 2020, the Debtors filed the *Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* (the "**Amended Plan**" and, together with the Second Amended Plan, the "**Plan**") [Docket No. 1226] and the Amended

⁶ *Motion of Debtors for Entry of an Order (I) Approving (A) Bidding Procedures, (B) Designation of Stalking Horse Bidder and Stalking Horse Bid Protections, (C) Scheduling Auction and Sale Hearing, (D) Form and Manner of Notice of Sale, Auction, and Sale Hearing, and (E) Assumption and Assignment Procedures; (II) Authorizing (A) Sale of Debtors' Assets and Equity Interests Free and Clear of Liens Claims, Interests, and Encumbrances and (B) Assumption and Assignment of Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases; and (III) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 53] (the "**Bidding Procedures Motion**").

⁷ *Order (I) Approving (A) Bidding Procedures, (B) Designation of Stalking Horse Bidder and Stalking Horse Bid Protections, (C) Scheduling Auction and Sale Hearing, (D) Form and Manner of Notice of Sale, Auction, and Sale Hearing, and (E) Assumption and Assignment Procedures and Form and Manner of Notice of Assumption and Assignment and (II) Granting Related Relief* (Docket No. 505) (the "**Bidding Procedures Order**").

⁸ *See Notice of (I) Filing of Amendment to Stock and Asset Purchase Agreement, And (II) the Occurrence of Closing of the Sale Transaction* [Docket No. 964].

Disclosure Statement. On November 10, 2020, the Court entered an order approving the Amended Disclosure Statement and scheduled the hearing for confirmation of the Amended Plan for December 18, 2020.⁹ On December 16, 2020, the Debtors filed the Second Amended Plan [Docket No. 1434].

13. On December 18, 2020, the Court entered the Confirmation Order confirming the Second Amended Plan [Docket No. 1485]. The effective date of the Second Amended Plan (the “**Effective Date**”) occurred on January 6, 2021 [Docket No. 1538]. On the Effective Date, Alan D. Halperin was appointed as Plan Administrator¹⁰ to implement the Plan and effectuate the winding down of the Debtors’ estates.

14. Additional information regarding the Debtors’ business and capital structure and the circumstances leading to the commencement of these chapter 11 cases is set forth in the (i) *Declaration of Jeffrey Ficks, Financial Advisor of Briggs & Stratton Corporation, in Support of the Debtors’ Chapter 11 Petitions and First Day Relief* [Docket No. 51] and (ii) the Amended Disclosure Statement.

The Debtors’ Retention of Weil

15. On July 20, 2020, Weil filed the *Application of Debtors Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 327(a) Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2014(a) and 2016, and Local Rules 2014 and 2016-1 for Authority to Retain and Employ Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Effective as of the Petition Date* [Docket No. 28] (the “**Retention Application**”). The Court approved the Retention Application on a provisional basis on July 20, 2020 [Docket No. 73] and on a final basis by Order

⁹ See *Order (I) Approving Disclosure Statement; (II) Establishing Notice and Objection Procedures for Confirmation of Plan; (III) Approving Solicitation Packages and Procedures for Distribution Thereof; (IV) Approving the Form of Ballots and Establishing Procedures for Voting on the Plan; and (V) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 1233].

¹⁰ As defined in the Second Amended Plan.

dated August 19, 2020 [Docket No. 511] (the “**Retention Order**”). The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse Weil in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, and the Fee Guidelines. The Retention Order also authorizes the Debtors to compensate Weil for services rendered and to reimburse Weil for its reasonable and necessary expenses incurred at Weil’s normal hourly rates and disbursement policies, subject to application to this Court. The Retention Order authorizes Weil to, among other things:

- a. prepare on behalf of the Debtors, as debtors in possession, all necessary motions, applications, answers, orders, reports and other papers in connection with the administration of the Debtors’ estates;
- b. take all necessary actions in connection with any chapter 11 plan and related disclosure statement and all related documents, and such further actions as may be required in connection with the administration of the Debtors’ estates;
- c. take all necessary action to protect and preserve the Debtors’ estates, including the prosecution of actions on the Debtors’ behalf, the defense of any actions commenced against the Debtors, the negotiation of disputes in which the Debtors are involved, and the preparation of objections to claims filed against the Debtors’ estates; and
- d. perform all other necessary legal services in connection with the prosecution of these chapter 11 cases; provided, however, that to the extent Weil determines that such services fall outside of the scope of services historically or generally performed by Weil as lead debtors’ counsel in a bankruptcy case, Weil will file a supplemental declaration.

**Summary of Professional Compensation
and Reimbursement of Expenses Requested**

16. On September 25, 2020, Weil submitted its first monthly fee statement (the “**First Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$1,246,859.70 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of July 20, 2020 through and including July 31, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$997,062.00, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$1,246,327.50) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors

during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$532.20. No objections were received with respect to the First Monthly Fee Statement.

17. On October 7, 2020, Weil submitted its second monthly fee statement (the “**Second Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$3,077,463.50 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of August 1, 2020 through and including August 31, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$2,460,321.60, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$3,075,402.00) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$2,061.05. No objections were received with respect to the Second Monthly Fee Statement.

18. On November 12, 2020, Weil submitted its third monthly fee statement (the “**Third Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$2,854,229.50 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of September 1, 2020 through and including September 30, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$2,282,977.20, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$2,853,721.50) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$508.00. No objections were received with respect to the Third Monthly Fee Statement.

19. On December 1, 2020, Weil submitted its fourth monthly fee statement (the “**Fourth Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$1,365,624.07 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of October 1, 2020

through and including October 31, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$1,089,814.80, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$1,362,268.50) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$3,355.57. No objections were received with respect to the Fourth Monthly Fee Statement.

20. On December 18, 2020, Weil submitted its first interim fee application (the “**First Interim Fee Application**”) seeking interim allowance of \$8,537,719.50 in compensation for professional services rendered and \$6,456.82 in reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors during the First Interim Compensation Period, which covered the period commencing July 20, 2020 through October 31, 2020. No objections were received with respect to the First Interim Fee Application. The Court entered an order approving the First Interim Fee Application on January 22, 2021 [Docket No. 1586].

21. On January 5, 2021, Weil submitted its fifth monthly fee statement (the “**Fifth Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$1,243,111.58 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of November 1, 2020 through and including November 30, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$990,820.40, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$1,238,525.50) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$4,586.08. No objections were received with respect to the Fifth Monthly Fee Statement. Weil’s fees and expenses from the Fifth Monthly Fee Statement are annexed hereto as **Exhibit I**.

22. On February 2, 2021, Weil submitted its sixth monthly fee statement (the “**Sixth Monthly Fee Statement**”) seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil’s compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$1,354,902.24 for the total amount of fees and actual and

necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of December 1, 2020 through and including December 31, 2020; (ii) payment in the amount of \$1,083,139.60, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$1,353,924.50) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$977.74. No objections were received with respect to the Sixth Monthly Fee Statement. Weil's fees and expenses from the Sixth Monthly Fee Statement are annexed hereto as **Exhibit J**.

23. On February 17, 2021, Weil submitted its seventh monthly fee statement (the "**Seventh Monthly Fee Statement**") seeking (i) interim allowance of Weil's compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$92,354.95 for the total amount of fees and actual and necessary expenses incurred on behalf of the Debtors for the period of January 1, 2021 through and including January 6, 2021; (ii) payment in the amount of \$72,215.20, which is equal to 80% of the total compensation (\$90,269.00) sought for professional services rendered to the Debtors during the period; and (iii) reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the amount of \$2,085.95. No objections were received with respect to the Seventh Monthly Fee Statement. Weil's fees and expenses from the Seventh Monthly Fee Statement are annexed hereto as **Exhibit K**.

24. Weil seeks allowance of compensation for professional services performed during the Second Interim Compensation Period (covering the period commencing November 1, 2020 through January 6, 2021) in the amount of \$2,682,719.00 and during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$11,220,438.50. Weil also seeks reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services in the Second Interim Compensation Period in the amount of \$7,649.77 and during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$14,106.59. During the Second Interim Compensation Period, Weil attorneys and paraprofessionals expended a total of 2,980.50 hours in connection with the necessary services performed. During the Final

Compensation Period, Weil attorneys, paraprofessionals and other non-legal staff expended a total of 12,197.60 hours in connection with the necessary services performed.

25. There is no agreement or understanding between Weil and any other person, other than members of the firm, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in these chapter 11 cases. During the Final Compensation Period, Weil received no payment or promises of payment from any source for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered by this Application.

26. Prior to the Petition Date, the Debtors paid Weil certain amounts as fee advances for professional services to be performed and expenses to be incurred in connection with its representation of the Debtors and in preparation of the Debtors seeking relief under chapter 11. Based on a reconciliation of all charges and expenses through the date of this Application, the balance of the advances as of the date of this Application is \$0.00. Pursuant to the Retention Order, Weil applied the entirety of its prepetition advances against the first monthly invoice.

27. The fees charged by Weil in these cases are billed in accordance with Weil's existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the applicable compensation periods. The rates Weil charges for the services rendered by its professionals and paraprofessionals in these chapter 11 cases generally are the same rates Weil charges for professional and paraprofessional services rendered in comparable bankruptcy and non-bankruptcy related matters. Such fees are reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable bankruptcy and non-bankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market.

Supporting Documents

28. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is the Declaration of Ronit J. Berkovich regarding Weil's compliance with the Fee Guidelines.

29. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a summary of Weil's monthly fee statements during the Final Compensation Period.

30. Attached hereto as **Exhibit C** is a schedule of all Weil attorneys, paraprofessionals and other non-legal staff who have performed services for the Debtors during the Second Interim Compensation Period and the Final Compensation Period, respectively, the capacities in which each individual is employed by Weil, the department in which each individual practices, the hourly billing rate charged by Weil for services performed by such individuals, the year in which each attorney was first licensed to practice law, where applicable, and the aggregate number of hours expended in this matter and fees billed in connection therewith.

31. Weil maintains computerized records of the time spent by all Weil attorneys and paraprofessionals in connection with the prosecution of these chapter 11 cases. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** is a schedule of Weil's computerized time records billed during the Second Interim Compensation Period using project categories hereinafter described in the format specified by the Fee Guidelines.

32. Attached hereto as **Exhibit E** is an itemized schedule of the expenses during the Second Interim Compensation Period and the Final Compensation Period, respectively, for which Weil is seeking reimbursement and a summary specifying the categories of expenses included in the schedule and the total amount for each such expense category.

33. Attached hereto as **Exhibit F** is a summary and comparison of the aggregate blended hourly rates billed by Weil's domestic offices timekeepers to non-bankruptcy matters during the prior twelve-month period ending January 31, 2021, and the blended hourly rates billed to the Debtors during the Second Interim Compensation Period.

34. Attached hereto as **Exhibit G** is a budget prepared in connection with Weil's representation of the Debtors during the Second Interim Compensation Period.

35. Attached hereto as **Exhibit H** is a summary of Weil's staffing plan for the Second Interim Compensation Period.

36. To the extent that time or disbursement charges for services rendered or disbursements incurred relate to the Second Interim Compensation Period and the Final Compensation Period, but were not processed prior to the preparation of this Application, Weil reserves the right to request additional compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses in a future application to the Court.

**Summary of Services Performed by
Weil During the Second Interim Compensation Period**

37. During the Second Interim Compensation Period, Weil devoted substantial resources and rendered significant professional services to negotiate, draft, and confirm a chapter 11 plan. The following is a summary of the significant professional services rendered by Weil during the Second Interim Compensation Period, organized in accordance with Weil's internal time-tracking system, and broken down by project or task codes:

a. Administrative Expense Claims (Task Code 001)

Fees: \$93,700.00; Total Hours: 100.50

- Reviewed applications for payment of administrative expense claims and drafted responses and objections thereto.
- Communicated and negotiated with claimants' counsel to resolve applications for payment of administrative expense claims.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized stipulations resolving applications for payment of administrative expense claims.

b. Asset Disposition/363 Asset Sales (Task Code 003)

Fees: \$49,785.50; Total Hours: 52.30

- Attend to numerous post-closing issues arising from the Sale Transaction, including working capital adjustment, organizational document amendments, accounts receivable allocation, and severance adjustment.

- Obtained approval of a motion to establish procedures for *de minimis* asset sales and purchases,¹¹ and advised the Debtors with respect to the sale of certain *de minimis* assets pursuant to such procedures, including filing notices with respect to the same.

c. Automatic Stay (Task Code 004)

Fees: \$96,407.50; Total Hours: 95.80

- Reviewed and analyzed motions to lift the automatic stay.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized objections to motions for relief from the automatic stay.
- Conferred with counsel for moving parties to negotiate stipulations in resolution of the motions to lift the automatic stay.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized stipulations resolving motions to lift the automatic stay.
- Reviewed and revised proposed order lifting the automatic stay.

d. Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues (Task Code 005)

Fees: \$191,044.50; Total Hours: 219.50

- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors on the claims process and related matters, and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
- Analyzed filed claims, conferred with the Debtors and the Debtors' advisors regarding the claims reconciliation process, and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
- Negotiated with counsel to various parties that filed proofs of claim to resolve such claims.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized fourteen objections to claims on grounds of wrong debtor, amended or superseded claims, and no liability.¹²

¹¹ *Motion of Debtors for Order (I) Authorizing Use, Sale, or Lease of Certain Property of the Estate, (II) Establishing Procedures for De Minimis Asset Sales, and (III) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 1124].

¹² *See* Docket Nos. 1265 – 1278.

e. Case Administration (Task Code 006)

Fees: \$47,110.00; Total Hours: 71.60

- Prepared and maintained case calendars and comprehensive work-in-process list for use by the Debtors, the Debtors' other professionals, and the Weil team.
- Reviewed newly filed pleadings on the docket and summarized same for the Weil team and the Debtors.

f. Chapter 11 Plan/Confirmation/Implementation/Plan Supplement (Task Code 007)

Fees: \$875,332.50; Total Hours: 977.80

- Drafted, revised, and finalized the Plan and the information and documents to be included in the supplement to the Plan (“the **Plan Supplement**”).¹³
- Coordinated with the Debtors, the Debtors' other advisors, and various Weil practice groups regarding amendments to the Plan and the Plan Supplement.
- Reviewed various formal and informal objection to the Plan, and conferred with counsel for objecting parties to resolve the same.
- Conducted research regarding various potential chapter 11 issues in connection with the Second Amended Plan, including issues relating to the confirmation and implementation of the Second Amended Plan.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized the *Memorandum of Law in Support of Confirmation of Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors and Response to Objections to Confirmation* [Docket No. 1445] and related filings in support of confirmation.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized several documents, including the proposed Confirmation Order, in preparation for the confirmation hearing on the Second Amended Plan and the Debtors' emergence from chapter 11.
- Advised the Debtors, in consultation and coordination with the Debtors' other advisors, Weil practice groups, and the Plan Administrator and his counsel, regarding the implementation of the Second Amended Plan.

¹³ *Notice of Filing of Plan Supplement in Connection with Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Docket No. 1369]

- Conferred with and prepared reference materials for the Plan Administrator to facilitate the transition of post-Effective Date work streams.
- g. Corporate Governance/Securities (Task Code 008)
Fees: \$92,546.00; Total Hours: 86.30
- Drafted, revised, and filed form filings with the Securities and Exchange Commission, including form 4, 8-K, S-8, and 15 filings, to provide update on bankruptcy related events, and conducted research regarding the same.
 - Drafted, revised, and finalized materials in preparation for meetings of the Debtors' board of directors and participated in the same.
 - Prepared response to inquiry from the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority regarding the Plan.
- h. Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims (Task Code 009)
Fees: \$10,048.50; Total Hours: 10.10
- Attended to various vendor-related matters, including corresponding with vendors regarding the status of their claims and providing matrices of critical vendor payments to certain parties in interest pursuant to the Critical Vendor Order.¹⁴
- i. DIP Financing/Cash Management (Task Code 010)
Fees: \$17,873.00; Total Hours: 19.80
- Conferred with the Debtors regarding their cash management system and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
 - Reviewed payoff documents in connection with the termination of debtor-in-possession financing and the release of liens.
- j. Disclosure Statement/Solicitation/Voting (Task Code 011)
Fees: \$195,386.00; Total Hours: 217.20
- Drafted, negotiated, revised, and finalized the Disclosure Statement.
 - Reviewed various formal and informal objection to the Disclosure Statement, conducted research in connection therewith, and conferred with counsel for objecting parties to resolve the same.

¹⁴ *Final Order (I) Authorizing Debtors to Pay Prepetition Obligations in the Ordinary Course of Business to (A) Critical Vendors, (B) Foreign Creditors, and (C) 503(b)(9) Claimants; and (II) Granting Related Relief [Docket No. 534] (the "Critical Vendor Order").*

- Drafted, revised, and finalized the *Debtors' Omnibus Reply to Objections to Debtors' Motion for Approval of Disclosure Statement and Related Relief* [Docket No. 1213] and related filings in support of approval.
- Drafted, revised, and finalized *Order (I) Approving Disclosure Statement; (II) Establishing Notice and Objection Procedures for Confirmation of Plan; (III) Approving Solicitation Packages and Procedures for Distribution Thereof; (IV) Approving the Form of Ballots and Establishing Procedures for Voting on the Plan; and (V) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 1233].
- Prepared for solicitation of the Plan, drafted materials necessary for solicitation, and managed solicitation process.
- Communicated with the Debtors' claims and voting agent regarding the voting process, publication of solicitation and voting, and the Voting Declaration.¹⁵

k. Employee Issues (Task Code 012)

Fees: \$156,559.00; Total Hours: 150.10

- Conferred with the Debtors, the Debtors' other advisors, and Weil practice groups regarding various employee matters, including deferred compensation, pensions, life insurance, severance, workers' compensation, employee claims, employment tax deferrals, and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
- Reviewed claims filed by the PBGC and conferred with the Debtors and their advisors to analyze the same.
- Reviewed claims filed by employees, and drafted a memorandum to filers of employee equity claims.
- Coordinated and negotiated with workers' compensation boards from various states on the administration of workers' compensation claims, and prepared stipulations addressing security payments regarding the same.

l. Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues) (Task Code 014)

Fees: \$189,603.50; Total Hours: 204.30

- Conferred with Debtors and their advisors regarding executory contracts and leases and strategy for the assumption and assignment of same.

¹⁵ Declaration of Angela M. Nguyen with Respect to the Tabulation of Votes on the Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton and its Affiliated Debtors [Docket No. 1410] (the "Voting Declaration").

- Coordinated a list of contracts to be assumed and assigned with the Debtors and the Debtors' advisors and reconciled the cure costs of the same.
 - Drafted, revised, and finalized notices of contracts to be assumed and assigned, and negotiated with counsel to various contract counterparties to resolve any objections thereto.
 - Reviewed and revised amendments to contracts the Debtors held with various parties in relation to the assumption and assignment of such contracts.
 - Updated exhibits to motion to reject certain executory contracts.¹⁶
- m. General Case Strategy (including Client/Team calls) (Task Code 015)
Fees: \$119,820.50; Total Hours: 120.80
- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors regarding case strategy, pending and upcoming matters, filings, key dates, and deadlines and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
 - Conducted internal Weil team calls and meetings to discuss case strategy and case progress.
- n. Hearing and Court Matters (Task Code 016)
Fees: \$67,924.50; Total Hours: 79.20
- Prepared for and represented the Debtors at hearings, including the disclosure statement hearing, the confirmation hearing, and various omnibus hearings.
 - Conferred and coordinated with the Debtors and their advisors in preparation for various hearings regarding related matters and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
- o. Insurance Issues (Task Code 017)
Fees: \$144,425.50; Total Hours: 159.60
- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors regarding various insurance matters, including surrender of life insurance policies, and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.

¹⁶ *Notice of Filing of Updated Exhibit to Debtors' Motion for Order (I) Authorizing (A) Rejection of Certain Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases and (B) Abandonment of Property in Connection Therewith; and (II) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 1287].

- Drafted, revised, and finalized *Motion of Debtors for Order (I) Authorizing Debtors to Surrender Life Insurance Policies and (II) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 1338].
- p. Non-Bankruptcy Litigation (Task Code 018)
Fees: \$58,129.00; Total Hours: 58.00
- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors regarding various outstanding and potential litigations, including the Exmark Litigation,¹⁷ and advised the Debtors in connection therewith.
 - Drafted, revised, and finalized *Motion of Debtors for Order Authorizing and Approving Settlement Between Exmark Manufacturing Company, Inc. and Debtor Briggs & Stratton Corporation* [Docket No. 1316].
 - Negotiated and revised the proposed order authorizing and approving the settlement with Exmark Manufacturing Co., Inc.
 - Revised and finalized a memorandum in connection with internal investigation of potential claims of the estate.
- q. Real Property Leases/Real Estate Lease Issues (Task Code 020)
Fees: \$19,281.50; Total Hours: 22.90
- Reviewed and revised listing agreements for various real property.
 - Drafted, revised, and finalized *Motion of the Debtors for Authority to Extend the Time to Assume or Reject Unexpired Lease of Nonresidential Real Property* [Docket No. 1290].
- r. Regulatory/Environmental Issues (Task Code 021)
Fees: \$12,297.00; Total Hours: 11.10
- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors and the advisors to various stakeholders regarding certain regulatory and environmental matters related to the Debtors' marketing and sale process.
- s. Retention/Fee Application: OCPs (Task Code 022)
Fees: \$12,780.50; Total Hours: 15.50
- Drafted, revised, and finalized *Debtors' First Quarterly Statement Regarding Payments Made to Ordinary Course Professional for Services Rendered During the Period July 20, 2020 Through October 20, 2020* [Docket No. 1309].

¹⁷ As defined in the *Motion of Debtors to Lift the Automatic Stay Solely to Permit Appeals Court to Issue a Ruling in the Exmark Appeal* [Docket No. 549].

- Communicated with Ordinary Course Professionals¹⁸ to obtain reasonable estimates of unpaid fee claims through the Effective Date.
- t. Retention/Fee Applications: Retained Professionals non Weil (Task Code 023)
Fees: \$64,601.00; Total Hours: 88.60
- Drafted, revised, and finalized retention applications for the Debtors' professionals, including Perkins Coie LLP; Kohner, Mann & Kailas, S.C.; Polsinelli PC; and CBRE Group, Inc., and conferred with the respective professionals and their counsel regarding same.
 - Reviewed and summarized monthly fee statements submitted by various professionals retained by the Debtors, the Creditors' Committee, and the Debtors' lenders.
 - Reviewed and coordinated the filing of the first interim fee applications of the Debtors' professionals.
 - Communicated with various professionals retained by the Debtors and the Creditors' Committee to obtain reasonable estimates of unpaid fee claims through the Effective Date.
- u. Retention/Fee Application: Weil (Task Code 024)
Fees: \$81,704.50; Total Hours: 120.00
- Prepared Weil's monthly fee statements, interim fee applications, final fee application, and budget and staffing plans.
 - Drafted, revised, and finalized Weil's supplemental retention declarations.
- v. Schedules/Statement of Financial Affairs/2015.3 Report (Task Code 025)
Fees: \$10,658.50; Total Hours: 14.60
- Drafted, revised, and finalized the Debtors' Amended Schedules of Assets and Liabilities (the "**Amended Schedules**") and the related notice.¹⁹
 - Reviewed and prepared for filing the Amended Schedules, and conferred with Debtors and their advisors regarding same.

¹⁸ As defined in the *Motion for Order Authorizing Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession to Employ Professionals Used in Ordinary Course of Business* [Docket No. 208].

¹⁹ See Docket Nos. 1370 – 1373.

w. Tax Issues (Task Code 027)

Fees: \$81,219.00; Total Hours: 74.10

- Conferred with the Debtors and their advisors with regard to various tax issues, including transfer tax, deferred payroll tax, future sales tax refund, and conducted research in connection therewith.
- Reviewed and revised the Plan Administrator Agreement²⁰ with respect to tax issues and conducted related research and analysis.

x. US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report (Task Code 030)

Fees: \$7,693.50; Total Hours: 7.50

- Reviewed and revised monthly operating reports.²¹

38. The professional services performed by partners, counsel, and associates of Weil were rendered by the Restructuring, Corporate, Litigation, and Tax, Benefits & Executive Compensation Departments predominantly in the New York office. Weil has a preeminent Restructuring practice and enjoys a national reputation for its expertise in financial reorganizations and restructurings of troubled entities, with approximately 100 attorneys that specialize in this area of law.

39. The professional services performed by Weil on behalf of the Debtors during the Second Interim Compensation Period required an aggregate expenditure of approximately 2,980.50 hours by Weil's partners, counsel, associates, and paraprofessionals. Of the aggregate time expended, approximately 683.20 recorded hours were expended by partners and counsel of Weil, approximately 2,159.70 recorded hours were expended by associates, and approximately 137.60 recorded hours were expended by paraprofessionals of Weil. Of the forty (40) Weil attorneys who billed time, nineteen (19) billed fewer than 15 hours to this matter. Of the sixteen (16) Weil paraprofessionals who billed time, thirteen (13) billed fewer than 15 hours to this matter.

²⁰ As defined in the Second Amended Plan.

²¹ *Monthly Operating Report for Briggs & Stratton Corporation, et al. for the Period September 28, 2020 Through October 25, 2020* [Docket No. 1313]; *Monthly Operating Report for Briggs & Stratton Corporation, et al. for the Period October 26, 2020 Through November 22, 2020* [Docket No. 1450].

40. During the Second Interim Compensation Period, Weil billed the Debtors for time expended by attorneys based on hourly rates ranging from \$595.00 to \$1,695.00 per hour for attorneys. Allowance of compensation in the amount requested would result in a blended hourly billing rate for Weil attorneys in this Application of approximately \$927.59 (based on 2,842.90 recorded hours for attorneys at Weil's agreed billing rates in effect at the time of the performance of services).

Actual and Necessary Disbursements of Weil

41. Weil has disbursed \$7,649.77 as expenses incurred in providing professional services during the Second Interim Compensation Period. These expenses are reasonable and necessary and were essential to, among other things, timely respond to motions and objections filed in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases and the overall administration of the cases.

42. With respect to black-and-white photocopying expenses, in compliance with the Fee Guidelines and Local Rule 2016-1, Weil charges all of its clients \$.10 per page; for color copies, Weil charges \$.50 per page. Each of these categories of expenses does not exceed the maximum rate set by the Local Rules or the "Guidelines for Compensation" set forth in the appendix to the Procedures Manual that accompanies the Local Rules (the "**Local Guidelines**"). These charges are intended to cover Weil's direct operating costs, which costs are not incorporated into the Weil hourly billing rates. Only clients who actually use services of the types set forth in the summary sheet are separately charged for such services. Including such expenses as part of the hourly billing rates would impose that cost upon clients who do not require extensive photocopying and other facilities and services. The amount of the standard photocopying charge is intended to allow Weil to cover the related expenses of its photocopying service. A determination of the actual expenses per page for photocopying, however, is dependent on both the volume of copies and the total expenses attributable to photocopying on an annual basis.

43. On certain occasions, overnight delivery of documents and other materials was required as a result of circumstances necessitating the use of such express services. These disbursements are not included in Weil's overhead for the purpose of setting billing rates. Weil has made every effort to minimize its disbursements in these cases. The actual expenses incurred in providing professional services were absolutely necessary, reasonable, and justified under the circumstances to serve the needs of the Debtors and their estates and creditors.

Requested Compensation Should Be Allowed

44. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 to govern the Court's award of such compensation. 11 U.S.C. § 331. Section 330 provides that a Court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered [and] reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330 also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded to [a] professional person, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including –

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;

(E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and

(F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

Id. § 330(a)(3).

45. In addition to the factors set forth in section 330(a)(3) of the Bankruptcy Code, in evaluating the reasonableness of attorneys' fees, Local Rule 2016-1(B)(1) (by reference to the Local Guidelines) requires that all professional fee applications analyze the twelve factors for allowance of compensation as set forth in *Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express*, 388 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974) (the "**Johnson Factors**"); *see also P.A. Novelly v. Palans*, 960 F.2d 728 (8th Cir. 1992); *Chamberlain v. Kula*, 213 B.R. 729, 736–39 (B.A.P. 8th Cir. 1997).

46. Weil submits that this Application satisfies section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code Section 330 and the *Johnson* Factors, as outlined below:

a. The Time and Labor Required. Weil's attorneys and paraprofessionals have expended 12,197.60 hours during the Final Compensation Period in the representation of the Debtors. All of the time spent was necessary and appropriate for the representation of the Debtors in these cases to ensure that the Debtors maximized the value of their estates to the benefit of the Debtors' creditors. This is especially true when considering the urgency of the tasks and issues that arose in these chapter 11 cases during the Final Compensation Period, including, among other things, drafting procedural and operational motions, finalizing the debtor-in-possession financing and the Sale Transaction, negotiating the treatment of creditors under the Plan with interested parties, and drafting the Disclosure Statement, the Plan, the Plan Supplement, the Confirmation Order, and other related documents to consummate the Plan. Weil submits that the hours spent were reasonable given the size and complexity of these cases, the significant and often urgent legal and business issues raised, and the numerous pleadings filed in these cases. All of the services performed were necessary to assist the Debtors in fulfilling their statutory duties and proceeding through these chapter 11 cases in an expeditious and efficient manner. Weil has additionally made every effort to avoid any unnecessary duplication of time or services.

b. The Novelty and Difficulty of the Questions Involved. These chapter 11 cases involve a significant number of complex issues in the areas of restructuring, acquisitions, corporate finance, tax, insurance, and labor law. These cases are a large and complex restructuring, involving approximately \$500 million

of outstanding debt-funded obligations as of the Petition Date, significant obligations to vendors and contract counterparties, the sale of substantially all of the Debtors' assets to the Purchaser, and the confirmation of a plan of reorganization in the middle of a global pandemic. Weil's effective advocacy and creative approach helped clarify and resolve a number of complex issues as described in this Application.

c. The Skill to Perform the Professional Services Properly. Weil believes that its recognized expertise in the area of corporate reorganization, its ability to draw from highly experienced professionals in other areas of Weil's practice, and its creative approach to the resolution of issues have contributed to the successful administration of these cases and benefitted the Debtors' estates and creditors. Due to the nature and complexity of the legal issues presented in these cases, Weil was required to exhibit a high degree of legal skill in areas related to, among others, bankruptcy, litigation, tax, labor, insurance, acquisitions, and other corporate matters. Additionally, Weil's strong working relationship with the legal and financial advisors retained on behalf of the various interested parties involved in these cases enabled Weil to work with such professionals towards consensual resolutions of many of the issues that have arisen thus far in these cases. Weil respectfully submits that its professionals have provided substantial benefits to the Debtors and their estates during the Final Compensation Period.

d. The Preclusion of Other Employment by the Professional Due to Acceptance of the Case. Due to the size of Weil's restructuring department, Weil's representation of the Debtors did not preclude its acceptance of new clients.

e. The Customary Fee. The rates charged by Weil attorneys, paraprofessional, and other-non legal staff in these chapter 11 cases are the same rates charged by Weil in connection with non-bankruptcy work. The professional fee sought herein are based upon Weil's normal hourly rates for services of this kind. Weil respectfully submits that the professional fees sought herein are not unusual given the magnitude and complexity of these cases and time expended in representing the Debtors, and are commensurate with fee Weil has been awarded in other cases, as well with professional fees charged by other attorneys of comparable experience.

f. Whether the Fee is Fixed or Contingent. Weil's fees in these chapter 11 cases are based upon the hourly billing rates of Weil's attorneys and paraprofessionals. As in all bankruptcy cases, however, pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, fees for professionals employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code are subject to court approval and the availability of funds in the Debtors' estates. In this limited sense, Weil's fees are contingent in nature.

g. Time Limitations Imposed by the Client or the Circumstances. Many of the matters Weil has handled for the Debtors have been on an expedited basis, including first day motions, approval of the Sale Transaction, and confirmation of the Plan. Weil guided the Debtors through all stages of these

chapter 11 cases with speed and efficiency and has helped to preserve the value of the Debtors' assets and businesses.

h. The Amount Involved and the Results Obtained. During the Final Compensation Period, Weil assisted the Debtors' efforts to, among other things, finalize the Sale Transaction, arrange for the treatment of pensions and other employment obligations under the Sale Transaction, and obtain approval of a plan of reorganization. The end result, a consensual reorganization, is a significant and satisfying result given the complex issues that arose in these chapter 11 cases. Accordingly, Weil submits that the fees requested in this Application are reasonable and appropriate when considering the results obtained on behalf of the Debtors.

i. The Experience, Reputation and Ability of the Professionals. Weil has an extensive, diversified experience and expertise, including Weil's recognized expertise in the field of debtors' protections, creditors' rights, and the administration of cases under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. For example, Weil currently represents or has represented, among others, the following debtors and their affiliates: CBL & Associates Properties, Inc.; Fieldwood Energy LLC; Brooks Brothers Group, Inc.; Vivus, Inc.; NPC International, Inc.; Speedcast International Limited; EP Energy Corporation; Skillsoft Corporation; Chinos Holdings, Inc.; Chisholm Oil & Gas Operating, LLC; 24 Hour Fitness Worldwide, Inc.; Fairway Group Holdings Corp.; Gavilan Resources Holdings, Inc.; Exide Holdings, Inc.; Kingfisher Midstream LLC; Halcon Resources Corporation; Fusion Connect, Inc.; Insys Therapeutics, Inc.; CTI Foods, LLC; Ditech Holding Corporation; PG&E Corporation and Pacific Gas and Electric Company; Checkout Holding Corp.; Waypoint Leasing Holdings Ltd.; LBI Media, Inc.; Sears Holdings Corporation; Tops Holding Company LLC; Southeastern Grocers, LLC; Claire's Inc.; Walter Inv. Mgmt. Corp.; Westinghouse Electric Company LLC; TK Holdings Inc.; Angelica Corp.; Azure Midstream Partners, LP; Memorial Production Partners LP; CHC Group Ltd.; Breitburn Energy Partners LP; Basic Energy Services, Inc.; American Gilsonite Company; and Aéropostale, Inc. Weil's experience enabled it to perform the services described herein competently and expeditiously. In addition to its expertise in the area of restructuring, Weil called upon the expertise of its partners and associates in other practice areas to perform the wide ranging scope of legal work necessitated by these chapter 11 cases, including corporate, tax, labor, and litigation work.

j. The Undesirability of the Case. Weil does not consider these cases to be undesirable.

k. The Nature and Length of the Professional Relationship with the Client. Weil has acted as counsel to the Debtors since April 2020 and has rendered services continuously to the Debtors.

l. Awards in Similar Cases. Weil submits that the fees and expenses for which it seeks compensation and reimbursement in this Application are not excessive and are commensurate with the rates awarded in similar cases in the United States Bankruptcy Court for similar services rendered and results obtained.

The fees requested by Weil are more fully described in **Exhibits C and D** attached hereto and in the invoices attached hereto as **Exhibits I, J, and K**.

47. In the instant case, Weil submits that the services for which it seeks compensation and the expenditures for which it seeks reimbursement in this Application were necessary for and beneficial to the preservation and maximization of value for all stakeholders. The compensation requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the Debtors, their estates, and all parties in interest.

48. In sum, the services rendered by Weil were necessary and beneficial to the Debtors' estates and were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the types of issues involved in these chapter 11 cases. Accordingly, approval of the compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses sought in this Application is warranted.

Notice

49. Notice of this Application will be provided to (i) the Debtors (Attn: Kathryn Buono, Esq. (Buono.Kathryn@basco.com)), (ii) Halperin Battaglia Benzijia, LLP (Attn: Alan D. Halperin, Esq., Debra Cohen, Esq., and Julie Goldberg, Esq.) and Carmody MacDonald P.C. (Attn: Robert E. Eggman, Esq., Christopher J. Lawhorn, Esq., and Thomas H. Riske, Esq.), as counsel to the Plan Administrator; (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri (Attn: Sirena Wilson, Esq.); (iv) the holders of the thirty (30) largest unsecured claims against the Debtors on a consolidated basis; (v) Latham & Watkins LLP (Attn: Peter P. Knight, Esq. and Jonathan C. Gordon, Esq.), as counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A., as the administrative agent and collateral agent under the ABL Credit Facility and DIP Facility; (vi) Pryor Cashman LLP (Attn: Seth H. Lieberman, Esq. and David W. Smith, Esq.), as counsel to Wilmington Trust, N.A., as successor indenture trustee under the Unsecured Notes; (vii) the United States Attorney's Office for the Eastern District of Missouri; (viii) Brown Rudnick LLP (Attn: Oksana P. Lashko, Esq.), as

counsel to the Creditors' Committee; (ix) any other party that has requested notice pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2002; and (x) any other party entitled to notice pursuant to Local Rule 9013-3(E). Notice of this Application and any order entered hereon will be served in accordance with Local Rule 9013-3(E)(1).

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank]

Conclusion

50. Weil respectfully requests that the Court (i) award interim allowance of Weil's compensation for professional services rendered during the Second Interim Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,690,368.77, consisting of \$2,682,719.00 in fees and \$7,649.77 in actual and necessary expenses, in all instances as incurred during the Second Interim Compensation Period, (ii) final allowance of Weil's compensation for professional services rendered during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$11,234,545.09, consisting of \$11,220,438.50 in fees and \$14,106.59 in actual an necessary expenses, in all instances as incurred during the Final Compensation Period, and that such allowance be without prejudice to Weil's right to seek additional compensation for services performed and expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period, which were not processed at the time of this Application, (iii) direct payment of the difference between the amounts allowed and any amounts previously paid, and (iv) grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: March 5, 2021
New York, New York

Respectfully Submitted,

/s/ Ronit J. Berkovich
WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP
Ronit J. Berkovich (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Debora A. Hoehne (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Martha E. Martir (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Eli Blechman (admitted *pro hac vice*)
767 Fifth Avenue
New York, New York 10153
Telephone: (212) 310-8000
Facsimile: (212) 310-8007
Email: Ronit.Berkovich@weil.com
Debora.Hoehne@weil.com
Martha.Martir@weil.com
Eli.Blechman@weil.com

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

EXHIBIT A

BERKOVICH DECLARATION

Application are permissible under the relevant rules, court orders and Bankruptcy Code provisions;

- b. the fees and disbursements sought in the Application are billed at rates customarily employed by Weil and generally accepted by Weil's clients. In addition, none of the professionals seeking compensation varied their hourly rates based on the geographic location of the Debtors' cases;
- c. the fees sought in this fee application were not higher than the fees budgeted by 10% or more, as shown in **Exhibit G**;
- d. the Application includes (i) 28.80 hours (\$21,552.00 in fees) for reviewing or revising Weil's time records and invoices and (ii) 2.50 hours (\$3,135.00 in fees) for reviewing time records to redact any privileged or confidential information;
- e. Effective as of January 1, 2021, Weil increased the rates it charges for the services rendered by its professionals and paraprofessionals in all its domestic offices and in both bankruptcy and non-bankruptcy related matters. An additional \$5,400 in fees are billed on account of this rate increase;
- f. in providing a reimbursable expense, Weil does not make a profit on that expense, whether the services is performed by Weil in-house or through a third party;
- g. in accordance with Bankruptcy Rule 2016(a) and Bankruptcy Code section 504, no agreement or understanding exists between Weil and any other person for the sharing of compensation to be received with these chapter 11 cases except as authorized pursuant to the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules and Local Rules; and
- h. all services for which compensation is sought were professional services on behalf of the Debtors and not on behalf of any other person.

Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Dated: March 5, 2021

/s/ Ronit J. Berkovich

Ronit J. Berkovich

WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP

EXHIBIT B

SUMMARY OF MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS

FIRST INTERIM COMPENSATION PERIOD

Date Served	Period Covered	Total Compensation and Expenses Incurred for Period Covered		Total Amount Paid to Date	
		Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
9/25/2020	7/20/2020 through 7/31/2020	\$1,246,327.50	\$532.20	\$1,246,327.50	\$532.20
10/07/2020	8/1/2020 through 8/31/2020	\$3,075,402.00	\$2,061.05	\$3,075,402.00	\$2,061.05
11/12/2020	9/1/2020 through 9/30/2020	\$2,853,721.50	\$508.00	\$2,853,721.50	\$508.00
12/01/2020	10/01/2020 through 10/31/2020	\$1,362,268.50	\$3,355.57	\$1,362,268.50	\$3,355.57
Total for First Interim Fee Application		\$8,537,719.50	\$6,456.82	\$8,537,719.50	\$6,456.82

SECOND INTERIM COMPENSATION PERIOD

Date Served	Period Covered	Total Compensation and Expenses Incurred for Period Covered		Total Amount Previously Requested with Prior Monthly Fee Statement		Total Amount Paid to Date		Holdback Fees Requested
		Fees	Expenses	Fees (@ 80%)	Expenses (@ 100%)	Fees (@ 80%)	Expenses (@ 100%)	Fees (@ 20%)
1/5/2021	11/01/2020 through 11/30/2020	\$1,238,525.50	\$4,586.08	\$990,820.40	\$4,586.08	\$990,820.40	\$4,586.08	\$247,705.10
2/2/2021	12/1/2020 through 12/31/2020	\$1,353,924.50	\$977.74	\$1,083,139.60	\$977.74	\$1,083,139.60	\$977.74	\$270,784.90
2/17/2020	1/1/2021 through 1/6/2021	\$90,269.00	\$2,085.95	\$72,215.20	\$2,085.95	\$72,215.20	\$2,085.95	\$18,053.80
Total for Second Interim Fee Application		\$2,682,719.00	\$7,649.77	\$2,146,175.20	\$7,649.77	\$2,146,175.20	\$7,649.77	\$536,543.80

Summary of Any Objections to Monthly Fee Statements: None.

Compensation Sought in this Application Not Yet Paid: \$536,543.80

EXHIBIT C

**COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL
NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021**

The attorneys who rendered professional services in these chapter 11 cases from November 1, 2020 through January 6, 2021 (the “**Second Interim Compensation Period**”) are:

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL	POSITION	DEPARTMENT	YEAR ADMITTED¹	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Soto, Edward	Partner	Litigation	1978	\$1,400.00	11.50	\$16,100.00
Goldring, Stuart J.	Partner	Tax	1984	\$1,695.00	12.90	\$21,865.50
Wessel, Paul J.	Partner	Tax	1988	\$1,695.00	4.00	\$6,780.00
Connolly, Annemargaret	Partner	Corporate	1988	\$1,400.00	1.20	\$1,680.00
Pappas, Nicholas J.	Partner	Litigation	1989	\$1,275.00	7.10	\$9,052.50
Himelfarb, P.J.	Partner	Corporate	1991	\$1,300.00	7.40	\$9,620.00
Yoon, Andrew J.	Partner	Corporate	2000	\$1,450.00	2.30	\$3,335.00
Yoon, Andrew	Partner	Corporate	2000	\$1,375.00	1.00	\$1,375.00
Berkovich, Ronit J.	Partner	Restructuring	2002	\$1,650.00	4.30	\$7,095.00
Berkovich, Ronit J.	Partner	Restructuring	2002	\$1,450.00	128.50	\$186,325.00
Featherman, Greg W.	Partner	Tax	2003	\$1,375.00	4.00	\$5,500.00
Nettleton, Stacy	Partner	Litigation	2003	\$1,200.00	1.70	\$2,040.00
Rahman, Faiza N.	Partner	Corporate	2006	\$1,175.00	1.40	\$1,645.00
Margolis, Steven M.	Counsel	Tax	1990	\$1,125.00	65.80	\$74,025.00
Morton, Matthew D.	Counsel	Corporate	2001	\$1,100.00	10.40	\$11,440.00
Hoehne, Debora	Counsel	Restructuring	2008	\$1,150.00	9.90	\$11,385.00
Hoehne, Debora	Counsel	Restructuring	2008	\$1,100.00	347.50	\$382,250.00
Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos	Counsel	Litigation	2008	\$1,100.00	1.30	\$1,430.00
Berman, Corey D.	Counsel	Litigation	2012	\$1,100.00	15.80	\$17,380.00
Kim, Aileen	Counsel	Corporate	2012	\$1,100.00	14.20	\$15,620.00
Guthrie, Hayden	Counsel	Corporate	2012	\$1,050.00	6.20	\$6,510.00
Arikat, Saleh Hashim	Counsel	Tax	2014	\$1,050.00	24.80	\$26,040.00
Friedman, Julie	Associate	Restructuring	2003	\$625.00	17.90	\$11,187.50
Fliman, Ariel	Associate	Corporate	2009	\$1,075.00	1.50	\$1,612.50

¹ * – Not Yet Admitted to Practice

Fliman, Ariel	Associate	Corporate	2009	\$1,010.00	42.60	\$43,026.00
Martir, Martha	Associate	Restructuring	2012	\$1,075.00	13.50	\$14,512.50
Martir, Martha	Associate	Restructuring	2012	\$1,010.00	334.80	\$338,148.00
Mendez, Samuel J.	Associate	Litigation	2015	\$1,050.00	6.20	\$6,510.00
Holt, Andrew	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$1,040.00	5.80	\$6,032.00
Holt, Andrew	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$980.00	24.40	\$23,912.00
Blechman, Eli	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$1,040.00	6.40	\$6,656.00
Blechman, Eli	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$980.00	267.60	\$262,248.00
Citron, Andrew	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$985.00	3.40	\$3,349.00
Citron, Andrew	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$930.00	124.10	\$115,413.00
Sevalrud, Robert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$985.00	1.40	\$1,379.00
Sevalrud, Robert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$930.00	31.70	\$29,481.00
Richards, Lauren E.	Associate	Litigation	2018	\$930.00	21.80	\$20,274.00
Roth, Tamara	Associate	Tax	2018	\$930.00	16.90	\$15,717.00
Luster, Courtney	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$895.00	1.30	\$1,163.50
Luster, Courtney	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$845.00	126.10	\$106,554.50
Paddock, Alyssa	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$845.00	182.70	\$154,381.50
Myers, Janiel	Associate	Restructuring	2019	\$895.00	3.00	\$2,685.00
Myers, Janiel	Associate	Restructuring	2019	\$845.00	144.50	\$122,102.50
Kutilek, Lukas	Associate	Tax	2019	\$845.00	23.10	\$19,519.50
Gohary, Sarah	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$770.00	5.40	\$4,158.00
Gohary, Sarah	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$730.00	1.40	\$1,022.00
Liu, Ting	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$730.00	2.00	\$1,460.00
Schnorrenberg, Sarah	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$730.00	228.20	\$166,586.00
Christie, Quinn	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$730.00	1.70	\$1,241.00
Bardini, Elissabeth	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$770.00	14.70	\$11,319.00
Bardini, Elissabeth	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$730.00	301.00	\$219,730.00
Chan, Christopher M.	Associate	Corporate	*	\$630.00	1.20	\$756.00
Chan, Christopher M.	Associate	Corporate	*	\$595.00	1.20	\$714.00
Zhang, Jiaheng	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$630.00	22.80	\$14,364.00
Zhang, Jiaheng	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$595.00	179.40	\$106,743.00
Total for Attorneys:					2,842.90	\$2,652,450.00

The paraprofessionals who rendered professional services during the Second Interim Compensation Period are:

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL AND OTHER NON-LEGAL STAFF	POSITION	DEPARTMENT ²	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Lee, Kathleen Anne	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$435.00	15.70	\$6,829.50
Reyes, Yahayra	Paralegal	Corporate	\$420.00	1.80	\$756.00
Stauble, Christopher A.	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$420.00	12.90	\$5,418.00
Ellsworth, John A.	Paralegal	Corporate	\$400.00	2.00	\$800.00
Gilchrist, Roy W.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	11.10	\$4,440.00
Jones, Allen	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	7.20	\$2,880.00
Frayle, Barbara	Paralegal	Corporate	\$400.00	2.20	\$880.00
Hoilett, Leason	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	3.50	\$1,400.00
Zaslav, Benjamin	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$390.00	5.00	\$1,950.00
Oliva, Angela E.F.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$390.00	3.20	\$1,248.00
Chan, Herbert	Paralegal	Litigation	\$370.00	5.70	\$2,109.00
Biratu, Sirak D.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$345.00	1.00	\$345.00
Altman-Desole, Jacob	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	24.50	\$6,125.00
Kleissler, Matthew	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	6.30	\$1,575.00
Peene, Travis J.	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$275.00	1.70	\$467.50
Peene, Travis J.	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	30.50	\$7,625.00
Pal, Himansu	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	3.30	\$825.00
Total for Paraprofessionals and other non-legal staff:				137.60	\$45,673.00

² LSS – Litigation Support Services

**COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL
JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021**

The attorneys who rendered professional services in these chapter 11 cases from July 20, 2020 through January 6, 2021 (the “**Final Compensation Period**”) are:

NAME OF PROFESSIONAL	POSITION	DEPARTMENT	YEAR ADMITTED ¹	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Newborn, Steven A.	Partner	Litigation	1975	\$1,695.00	4.20	\$7,119.00
Odoner, Ellen J.	Partner	Corporate	1978	\$1,695.00	2.80	\$4,746.00
Soto, Edward	Partner	Litigation	1978	\$1,400.00	170.70	\$238,980.00
Epstein, Michael A.	Partner	Corporate	1980	\$1,575.00	34.60	\$54,495.00
Dixon, Catherine T.	Partner	Corporate	1982	\$1,575.00	1.70	\$2,677.50
Goldring, Stuart J.	Partner	Tax	1984	\$1,695.00	53.20	\$90,174.00
Wessel, Paul J.	Partner	Tax	1988	\$1,695.00	64.10	\$108,649.50
Connolly, Annemargaret	Partner	Corporate	1988	\$1,400.00	4.30	\$6,020.00
Pappas, Nicholas J.	Partner	Litigation	1989	\$1,275.00	85.90	\$109,522.50
Dicker, Howard B.	Partner	Tax	1990	\$1,575.00	1.60	\$2,520.00
Holtzer, Gary T.	Partner	Restructuring	1991	\$1,695.00	31.80	\$53,901.00
Himelfarb, P.J.	Partner	Corporate	1991	\$1,300.00	102.90	\$133,770.00
Tappeiner, Christian	Partner	Corporate	1999 (Germany)	\$880.00	1.00	\$880.0
Yoon, Andrew J.	Partner	Corporate	2000	\$1,450.00	2.30	\$3,335.00
Yoon, Andrew J.	Partner	Corporate	2000	\$1,375.00	62.00	\$85,250.00
Berkovich, Ronit J.	Partner	Restructuring	2002	\$1,650.00	4.30	\$7,095.00
Berkovich, Ronit J.	Partner	Restructuring	2002	\$1,450.00	576.20	\$835,490.00
Featherman, Greg W.	Partner	Tax	2003	\$1,375.00	46.80	\$64,350.00
Nettleton, Stacy	Partner	Litigation	2003	\$1,200.00	1.70	\$2,040.00
Rahman, Faiza N.	Partner	Corporate	2006	\$1,175.00	5.20	\$6,110.00
Granger, Megan A.	Partner	Litigation	2012	\$1,125.00	22.10	\$24,862.50
Margolis, Steven M.	Counsel	Tax	1990	\$1,125.00	419.00	\$471,375.00
Bloomberg, Linton	Counsel	Restructuring	1999	\$1,200.00	9.90	\$11,880.00

¹ * – Not Yet Admitted to Practice

Morton, Matthew D.	Counsel	Corporate	2001	\$1,100.00	39.00	\$42,900.00
Hoehne, Debora	Counsel	Restructuring	2008	\$1,150.00	9.90	\$11,385.00
Hoehne, Debora	Counsel	Restructuring	2008	\$1,100.00	1,017.90	\$1,119,690.00
Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos	Counsel	Litigation	2008	\$1,100.00	232.60	\$255,860.00
Brown-Reilly, Alexis	Counsel	Litigation	2009	\$1,100.00	43.30	\$47,630.00
Resnick, Cynthia Allyson	Counsel	Corporate	2009	\$1,100.00	2.00	\$2,200.00
Wachtel, Svenja	Counsel	Litigation	2011 (Germany)	\$580.00	2.50	\$1,450.00
Berman, Corey D.	Counsel	Litigation	2012	\$1,100.00	187.20	\$205,920.00
Kim, Aileen	Counsel	Corporate	2012	\$1,100.00	230.60	\$253,660.00
Guthrie, Hayden	Counsel	Corporate	2012	\$1,050.00	6.20	\$6,510.00
Arikat, Saleh Hashim	Counsel	Tax	2013	\$1,050.00	24.80	\$26,040.00
Hamilton, Ian	Special Consultant	Corporate	1995	\$1,200.00	1.10	\$1,320.00
Friedman, Julie	Associate	Restructuring	2003	\$625.00	56.30	\$35,187.50
Fliman, Ariel	Associate	Corporate	2009	\$1,075.00	1.50	\$1,612.50
Fliman, Ariel	Associate	Corporate	2009	\$1,010.00	64.80	\$65,448.00
Fliman, Ariel	Associate	Corporate	2009	\$980.00	135.40	\$132,692.00
Wang, Kevin Xin	Associate	Corporate	2010	\$980.00	56.00	\$54,880.00
Fielding, Harriet	Associate	Restructuring	2010	\$1,050.00	42.50	\$44,625.00
Goltser, Jonathan	Associate	Corporate	2011	\$980.00	1.20	\$1,176.00
Guthrie, Hayden	Associate	Corporate	2012	\$1,050.00	246.80	\$259,140.00
Martir, Martha	Associate	Restructuring	2012	\$1,075.00	13.50	\$14,512.50
Martir, Martha	Associate	Restructuring	2012	\$1,010.00	455.00	\$459,550.00
Martir, Martha	Associate	Restructuring	2012	\$980.00	651.40	\$638,372.00
Arikat, Saleh Hashim	Associate	Tax	2014	\$1,050.00	50.30	\$52,815.00
Jia, Carol	Associate	Corporate	2014	\$845.00	15.40	\$13,013.00
Mendez, Samuel J.	Associate	Litigation	2015	\$1,050.00	35.60	\$37,380.00
Mendez, Samuel J.	Associate	Litigation	2015	\$1,010.00	161.40	\$163,014.00
Springer, Lauren	Associate	Corporate	2015	\$1,050.00	1.10	\$1,155.00
Springer, Lauren	Associate	Corporate	2015	\$1,010.00	17.70	\$17,877.00
Whittam, Kevin	Associate	Corporate	2015	\$1,010.00	30.50	\$30,805.00
de Fays, Marie-Marie O.	Associate	Litigation	2015	\$845.00	43.60	\$36,842.00

Holt, Andrew	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$1,040.00	5.80	\$6,032.00
Holt, Andrew	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$980.00	36.80	\$36,064.00
Holt, Andrew	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$930.00	58.50	\$54,405.00
Neuhauser, David	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$930.00	1.50	\$1,395.00
Neuhauser, David	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$845.00	56.50	\$47,742.50
Cho, Joon	Associate	Litigation	2017	\$930.00	12.90	\$11,997.00
Anderson, Joseph Caleb	Associate	Corporate	2017	\$845.00	36.00	\$30,420.00
Rosemberg, William	Associate	Corporate	2017 (Canada)	\$845.00	65.20	\$55,094.00
Blechman, Eli	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$1,040.00	6.40	\$6,656.00
Blechman, Eli	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$980.00	459.10	\$449,918.00
Blechman, Eli	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$930.00	325.30	\$302,529.00
Citron, Andrew	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$985.00	3.40	\$3,349.00
Citron, Andrew	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$930.00	163.00	\$151,590.00
Citron, Andrew	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$845.00	333.80	\$282,061.00
Richards, Lauren E.	Associate	Litigation	2018	\$930.00	34.10	\$31,713.00
Richards, Lauren E.	Associate	Litigation	2018	\$845.00	115.10	\$97,259.50
Roth, Tamara	Associate	Tax	2018	\$930.00	36.80	\$34,224.00
Roth, Tamara	Associate	Tax	2018	\$845.00	95.50	\$80,697.50
Sevalrud, Robert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$985.00	1.40	\$1,379.00
Sevalrud, Robert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$930.00	69.90	\$65,007.00
Sevalrud, Robert	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$845.00	342.10	\$289,074.50
Luster, Courtney	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$895.00	1.30	\$1,163.50
Luster, Courtney	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$845.00	267.60	\$226,122.00
Luster, Courtney	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$730.00	330.50	\$241,265.00
Paddock, Alyssa	Associate	Restructuring	2018	\$845.00	182.70	\$154,381.50
McMorris, Elisabeth T.	Associate	Corporate	2018	\$845.00	11.90	\$10,055.50
Myers, Janiel	Associate	Restructuring	2019	\$895.00	3.00	\$2,685.00
Myers, Janiel	Associate	Restructuring	2019	\$845.00	195.50	\$165,197.50
Myers, Janiel	Associate	Restructuring	2019	\$730.00	171.90	\$125,487.00
Kutilek, Lukas	Associate	Tax	2019	\$845.00	45.30	\$38,278.50
Kutilek, Lukas	Associate	Tax	2019	\$730.00	42.00	\$30,660.00
Sosa, Nathalie A.	Associate	Litigation	2019	\$730.00	3.40	\$2,482.00

Sosa, Nathalie A.	Associate	Litigation	2019	\$595.00	246.50	\$146,667.50
Chaudhry, Bilal	Associate	Corporate	2019	\$730.00	116.80	\$85,264.00
Thompson, Maryann	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$845.00	3.70	\$3,126.50
Thompson, Maryann	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$730.00	38.00	\$27,740.00
Gohary, Sarah	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$770.00	5.40	\$4,158.00
Gohary, Sarah	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$730.00	1.40	\$1,022.00
Liu, Ting	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$730.00	8.60	\$6,278.00
Liu, Ting	Associate	Corporate	2020	\$595.00	197.00	\$117,215.00
Schnorrenberg, Sarah	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$730.00	369.90	\$270,027.00
Schnorrenberg, Sarah	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$595.00	392.00	\$233,240.00
Christie, Quinn	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$730.00	10.10	\$7,373.00
Christie, Quinn	Associate	Litigation	2020	\$595.00	50.00	\$29,750.00
Bardini, Elissabeth	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$770.00	14.70	\$11,319.00
Bardini, Elissabeth	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$730.00	410.10	\$299,373.00
Bardini, Elissabeth	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$595.00	395.40	\$235,263.00
Mihaescu, Adina	Associate	Corporate	*	\$725.00	40.80	\$29,580.00
Chan, Christopher M.	Associate	Corporate	*	\$630.00	1.20	\$756.00
Chan, Christopher M.	Associate	Corporate	*	\$595.00	1.20	\$714.00
Zhang, Jiaheng	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$630.00	22.80	\$14,364.00
Zhang, Jiaheng	Associate	Restructuring	*	\$595.00	179.40	\$106,743.00
Zhao, Wenyuan	Contract Attorney	Corporate	*	\$510.00	7.40	\$3,774.00
Schwanebeck, Julian	Associate	Corporate	*	\$470.00	18.90	\$8,883.00
Afschar-Hamdi, Sara	Associate	Corporate	*	\$415.00	6.70	\$2,780.50
Dagley, Elena	Clerk	Corporate	*	\$415.00	15.00	\$6,225.00
Din, Abdul Wahaab	Clerk	Restructuring	*	\$415.00	16.40	\$6,806.00
Portier, Jean-Baptiste	Clerk	Corporate	*	\$275.00	2.10	\$577.50
Total for Attorneys:					11,671.10	\$11,055,307.00

The paraprofessionals who rendered professional services during the Final Compensation Period are:

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL AND OTHER NON-LEGAL STAFF	POSITION	DEPARTMENT ²	HOURLY BILLING RATE	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Lee, Kathleen Anne	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$435.00	45.00	\$19,575.00
Stauble, Christopher A.	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$420.00	57.30	\$24,066.00
Arias, Juan C.	Paralegal	Corporate	\$420.00	2.90	\$1,218.00
Reyes, Yahayra	Paralegal	Corporate	\$420.00	1.80	\$756.00
Ellsworth, John A.	Paralegal	Corporate	\$400.00	2.00	\$800.00
Gilchrist, Roy W.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	15.00	\$6,000.00
Frayle, Barbara	Paralegal	Corporate	\$400.00	56.40	\$22,560.00
Hoilett, Leason	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	3.50	\$1,400.00
Jones, Allen	Paralegal	Litigation	\$400.00	7.20	\$2,880.00
Sawyer, Jayme R.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$390.00	3.60	\$1,404.00
Zaslav, Benjamin	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$390.00	47.10	\$18,369.00
Fabsik, Paul	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$390.00	1.50	\$585.00
Merlin, Ann	Paralegal	Litigation	\$390.00	5.00	\$1,950.00
Oliva, Ann	Paralegal	Litigation	\$390.00	3.20	\$1,248.00
Kunz, Trevor	Litigation Support	LSS	\$375.00	19.40	\$7,275.00
Chan, Herbert	Paralegal	Litigation	\$370.00	9.80	\$3,626.00
Nudelman, Peter	Litigation Support	LSS	\$360.00	6.70	\$2,412.00
Biratu, Sirak D.	Paralegal	Litigation	\$345.00	1.00	\$345.00
Mo, Suihua	Litigation Support	LSS	\$345.00	9.00	\$3,105.00
Aaron-Yard, Merlyn	Paralegal	Corporate	\$345.00	37.70	\$13,006.50
Speath, Natascha	Paralegal	Corporate	\$275.00	2.50	\$687.50
Peene, Travis J.	Paralegal	Restructuring	275.00	1.70	\$467.50
Peene, Travis J.	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	109.60	\$27,400.00
Altman-Desole, Jacob	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	64.50	\$16,125.00
Kleissler, Matthew	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	9.80	\$2,450.00
Pal, Himansu	Paralegal	Restructuring	\$250.00	3.30	\$825.00
Total for Paraprofessionals and other non-legal staff:				526.50	\$180,535.50

² LSS – Litigation Support Services

EXHIBIT D

COMPENSATION BY MATTER NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021

TASK CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
001	Administrative Expense Claims	100.50	\$93,700.00
002	Adversary Proceedings	1.00	\$250.00
003	Asset Disposition/ 363 Sales	52.30	\$49,785.50
004	Automatic Stay	95.80	\$96,407.50
005	Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues	219.50	\$191,044.50
006	Case Administration	71.60	\$47,110.00
007	Chapter 11 Plan/ Confirmation/ Implementation/ Plan Supplement	977.80	\$875,332.50
008	Corporate Governance/ Securities	86.30	\$92,546.00
009	Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims	10.10	\$10,048.50
010	DIP Financing/ Cash Management	19.80	\$17,873.00
011	Disclosure Statement/ Solicitation/ Voting	217.20	\$195,386.00
012	Employee Issues	150.10	\$156,559.00
014	Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues)	204.30	\$189,603.50
015	General Case Strategy (Including Client/Team Calls)	120.80	\$119,820.50
016	Hearings and Court Matters	79.20	\$67,924.50
017	Insurance Issues	159.60	\$144,425.50
018	Non-Bankruptcy Litigation	58.00	\$58,129.00
020	Real Property/ Real Estate Lease Issues	22.90	\$19,281.50
021	Regulatory/Environmental Issues	11.10	\$12,297.00
022	Retention/ Fee Application: OCPs	15.50	\$12,780.50
023	Retention/ Fee Applications: Retained Professionals	88.60	\$64,601.00
024	Retention/ Fee Applications: Weil	120.00	\$81,704.50
025	Schedules/ SOFAs/ 2015.3 Report	14.60	\$10,658.50
026	Secured Creditor Issues/ Meetings/ Communications/ UCC	0.40	\$440.00
027	Tax Issues	74.10	\$81,219.00
029	Unsecured Creditors Issues/ Meetings/ Communications/ UCC	0.90	\$657.00
030	US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report	7.50	\$7,693.50
031	Utility Adequate Assurance	1.00	\$845.00
TOTAL		2980.5	\$2,698,123.00

COMPENSATION BY MATTER JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021

TASK CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
001	Administrative Expense Claims	153.30	\$141,501.50
002	Adversary Proceedings	30.50	\$22,707.50
003	Asset Disposition/ 363 Sales	2,379.00	\$2,178,148.50
004	Automatic Stay	230.30	\$217,903.50
005	Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues	360.50	\$327,600.00
006	Case Administration	177.70	\$121,047.00
007	Chapter 11 Plan/ Confirmation/ Implementation/ Plan Supplement	1,326.00	\$1,190,401.50
008	Corporate Governance/ Securities	388.80	\$414,718.50
009	Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims	348.50	\$307,287.00
010	DIP Financing/ Cash Management	382.50	\$388,142.50
011	Disclosure Statement/ Solicitation/ Voting	585.00	\$512,603.50
012	Employee Issues	1,317.80	\$1,318,387.00
013	Exclusivity	11.10	\$7,683.00
014	Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues)	972.60	\$853,501.00
015	General Case Strategy (Including Client/Team Calls)	449.20	\$455,593.50
016	Hearings and Court Matters	609.00	\$559,568.50
017	Insurance Issues	349.70	\$337,768.00
018	Non-Bankruptcy Litigation	365.80	\$353,793.00
020	Real Property/ Real Estate Lease Issues	124.30	\$88,868.00
021	Regulatory/Environmental Issues	199.10	\$200,166.00
022	Retention/ Fee Application: OCPs	111.80	\$77,526.50
023	Retention/ Fee Applications: Retained Professionals	233.90	\$174,331.00
024	Retention/ Fee Applications: Weil	221.40	\$151,055.00
025	Schedules/ SOFAs/ 2015.3 Report	203.90	\$159,497.50
026	Secured Creditor Issues/ Meetings/ Communications/ UCC	2.50	\$2,995.00
027	Tax Issues	269.40	\$309,154.00
028	International Issues	133.80	\$107,702.00
029	Unsecured Creditors Issues/ Meetings/ Communications/ UCC	197.90	\$198,147.50
030	US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report	35.90	\$36,637.50
031	Utility Adequate Assurance	26.40	\$21,407.50
TOTAL		12,197.60	\$11,235,842.50

EXHIBIT E

EXPENSE SUMMARY
NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021

EXPENSE CATEGORY	AMOUNT
Air Courier/Express Mail	\$73.94
Duplicating	\$1,676.74
Court Telephone Call	\$169.60
Filing Fees	\$5,650.00
Transportation	\$79.49
TOTAL	\$7,649.77

EXPENSE SUMMARY
JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021

EXPENSE CATEGORY	AMOUNT
Air Courier/Express Mail	\$220.63
Court Reporting	\$13.98
Duplicating	\$3,607.89
Court Telephone Call	\$1,359.60
Filing Fees	\$8,825.00
Transportation	\$79.49
TOTAL	\$14,106.59

EXHIBIT F

CUSTOMARY AND COMPARABLE COMPENSATION DISCLOSURES

Category of Timekeeper	Blended Hourly Rate	
	Billed by timekeepers in all domestic offices, excluding bankruptcy ¹	Billed in this Application
Partner	\$1,258.00	\$1,454.00
Counsel	\$1,001.00	\$1,105.00
Senior Associate (7 years or more since first admission)	\$955.00	\$894.00
Mid-level Associate (4-6 years since first admission)	\$876.00	\$968.00
Junior Associate (0-3 years since first admission)	\$655.00	\$754.00
Contract Attorney	\$366.00	N/A
Staff Attorney	\$373.00	N/A
Paralegal	\$332.00	\$330.00
Other	\$334.00	\$390.00
All timekeepers aggregated	\$876.00	\$900.00

¹ In accordance with the *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, effective November 1, 2013*, preceding year is a rolling 12 months year ending January 31, 2021; blended rates reflect work performed in preceding year in each of the domestic offices in which timekeepers collectively billed at least 10% of the hours to the case during the application period, excluding all data from bankruptcy law matters.

EXHIBIT G

BUDGETED AND ACTUAL FEES AND EXPENSES

Task Code	Project Category	Hours Budgeted	Fees Budgeted	Hours Billed	Fees Sought
001	Administrative Expense Claims	107.50	\$100,000.00	100.50	\$93,700.00
002	Adversary Proceedings	21.50	\$20,000.00	1.00	\$250.00
003	Asset Acquisitions/Dispositions/363 Matters	268.80	\$250,000.00	52.30	\$49,785.50
004	Automatic Stay	268.80	\$250,000.00	95.80	\$96,407.50
005	Bar Date and Claims Matters	1,075.30	\$1,000,000.00	219.50	\$191,044.50
006	Case Administration (WIP and Calendar)	107.50	\$100,000.00	71.60	\$47,110.00
007	Chapter 11 Plan/ Confirmation/Implementation/Plan Supplement	1,612.90	\$1,500,000.00	977.80	\$875,332.50
008	Corporate Governance/Securities	268.80	\$250,000.00	86.30	\$92,546.00
009	Customer/Vendor Matters and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims	322.60	\$300,000.00	10.10	\$10,048.50
010	DIP Financing/ Cash Management	32.30	\$30,000.00	19.80	\$17,873.00
011	Disclosure Statement/Solicitation/Voting	322.60	\$300,000.00	217.20	\$195,386.00
012	Employee Issues	537.60	\$500,000.00	150.10	\$156,559.00
013	Exclusivity	107.50	\$100,000.00	0.00	\$0.00
014	Executory Contracts/Lease/(Non-Real Property Issues)	537.60	\$500,000.00	204.30	\$189,603.50
015	General Case Strategy (Including Team /Client Calls)	322.60	\$300,000.00	120.80	\$119,820.50
016	Hearings and Court Matters	537.60	\$500,000.00	79.20	\$67,924.50
017	Insurance Issues	537.60	\$500,000.00	159.60	\$144,425.50
018	Non-bankruptcy Litigation	161.30	\$150,000.00	58.00	\$58,129.00
019	Non-Working Travel	0.00	\$0.00	0.00	\$0.00
020	Real Property/Real Estate Lease Issues	107.50	\$100,000.00	22.90	\$19,281.50
021	Regulatory/Environmental Matters	107.50	\$100,000.00	11.10	\$12,297.00
022	Retention/ Fee Applications: OCP	64.50	\$60,000.00	15.50	\$12,780.50
023	Retention/ Fee Applications: Non-Weil Professionals	64.50	\$60,000.00	88.60	\$64,601.00
024	Retention/ Fee Applications: Weil	64.50	\$60,000.00	120.00	\$81,704.50
025	Schedules/SOFAs/2015.3 Report	53.80	\$50,000.00	14.60	\$10,658.50
026	Secured Creditors Issues/ Meetings/ Communications	21.50	\$20,000.00	0.40	\$440.00
027	Tax Issues	537.60	\$500,000.00	74.10	\$81,219.00
028	International Issues	107.50	\$100,000.00	0.00	\$0.00
029	Unsecured Creditors Issues/Meetings/Communications/UCC	268.80	\$250,000.00	0.90	\$657.00
030	US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report	32.30	\$30,000.00	7.50	\$7,693.50
031	Utility Adequate Assurance	21.50	\$20,000.00	1.00	\$845.00
Total		8602.20	\$8,000,000.00	2,980.50	\$2,698,123.00

EXHIBIT H
STAFFING PLAN

CATEGORY OF TIMEKEEPER	NUMBER OF TIMEKEEPERS PROJECTED TO WORK ON MATTER DURING BUDGET PERIOD	AVERAGE HOURLY RATE
Partner	18	\$1,439
Counsel	11	\$1,120
Associate	40	\$817
Paraprofessionals and Other Non-Legal Staff	15	\$375

EXHIBIT I

FEES AND EXPENSES (NOVEMBER)

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS RE ADMINISTRATIVE APPLICATIONS (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER RE DRAFT EMAIL RE SAME (0.7); DRAFT FORM STIPULATION RE SAME (1.5).	3.10	3,131.00	001	60428778
11/04/20	Martir, Martha ANALYSIS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM APPLICATION AND THE COMPANY'S CLAIM RECONCILIATION (1.0); DRAFT CORRESPOND WITH APPLICANT RE SETTLEMENT (0.8).	1.80	1,818.00	001	60409109
11/07/20	Martir, Martha CONDUCT RESEARCH AND DRAFT OBJECTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE APPLICATIONS.	5.30	5,353.00	001	60428731
11/08/20	Luster, Courtney DRAFT OBJECTION AND DECLARATION TO IMMEDIATE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS (2.6).	2.60	2,197.00	001	60415027
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW OBJECTION TO REQUESTS FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.	1.00	1,100.00	001	60463306
11/09/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND REVISE OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES (.5).	0.50	422.50	001	60425077
11/09/20	Martir, Martha REVISE OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS (2.0); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.5).	2.50	2,525.00	001	60428799
11/10/20	Martir, Martha REVISE OBJECTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE APPLICATION (0.9); DRAFT STIPULATION RE SAME (3.7).	4.60	4,646.00	001	60428794
11/11/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS RE OBJECTIONS TO MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.	0.10	145.00	001	60445798
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.90	990.00	001	60463946

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW PROPOSED STIPULATION TO RESOLVE UFP TECHNOLOGIES' MOTION AND CURE OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW REVISED RESPONSE TO MOTIONS TO COMPEL PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS (.5).				
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED OBJECTION TO UFP TECHNOLOGIES' MOTION (.3).	0.30	330.00	001	60848978
11/11/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND FINALIZE OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO IMMEDIATE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS.	0.70	591.50	001	60437150
11/11/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE OMNIBUS ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE OBJECTION AND UFP OBJECTION (6.0); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, EY, AND D. HOEHNE, AND C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.5).	6.50	6,565.00	001	60439398
11/12/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RESOLVING UFP ADMINISTRATIVE APPLICATION (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH KIRKLAND RE SAME (0.5).	1.40	1,414.00	001	60474087
11/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW PRO METAL WORKS MOTION AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT OBJECTION.	0.30	435.00	001	60465425
11/13/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED OBJECTION TO UFP AND DRAFT STIPULATION TO RESOLVE UFP MOTION.	0.40	440.00	001	60464374
11/13/20	Martir, Martha REVISE UFP STIPULATION AND OBJECTION (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY RE SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE PRO METAL WORKS OBJECTION (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH PRO METAL WORKS RE SAME (0.2).	1.00	1,010.00	001	60474336
11/13/20	Martir, Martha DRAFT OBJECTION TO PRO METAL WORKS APPLICATION.	2.20	2,222.00	001	60474471

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/15/20	Luster, Courtney DRAFT A.B. BOYD STIPULATION.	1.20	1,014.00	001	60459776
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION FOR RESOLUTION OF AB BOYD REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM.	0.60	660.00	001	60473798
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS (X2) OF OBJECTION TO UFP TECHNOLOGIES' MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ASSERTED ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS.	0.30	330.00	001	60473871
11/16/20	Luster, Courtney DRAFT AAVID ALLCAST AND PRO METAL WORKS STIPULATION (1.3); REVIEW, REVISE, AND UPDATE OBJECTION TO UFPT MOTION (1.0).	2.30	1,943.50	001	60476858
11/16/20	Martir, Martha REVISE OBJECTION TO PRO METAL WORK'S APPLICATION (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH UFP AND PRO METAL WORKS RE ADMINISTRATIVE APPLICATIONS (0.9); REVISE UFP OBJECTION (2.0); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.8).	4.60	4,646.00	001	60474151
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION TO RESOLVE AAVID REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE PAYMENT.	0.10	110.00	001	60486494
11/17/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND REVISE AB BOYD AND AAVID ALLCAST STIPULATIONS AND SEND TO COUNSEL.	1.40	1,183.00	001	60494438
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH EY RE: ANALYSIS OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS.	0.10	110.00	001	60546397
11/24/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM APPLICATION (0.8); REVIEW SLIDEMASTER OBJECTION (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.2).	1.30	1,313.00	001	60578263

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/25/20	Martir, Martha ANALYSIS OF SLIDEMATIC'S ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE APPLICATION AND PROOF OF CLAIM (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE RECONCILING 503(B)(9) CLAIM (0.2).	0.70	707.00	001	60578357
SUBTOTAL TASK 001 - Administrative Expense Claims:		47.80	\$47,351.50		
11/30/20	Peene, Travis J. CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: ADV. PROCEEDING 15-CV-00941 (MDPA) COMPLAINT AND RELATED PLEADINGS FOR M. MARTIR.	1.00	250.00	002	60614977
SUBTOTAL TASK 002 - Adversary Proceedings:		1.00	\$250.00		
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW TSA/SAPA TRANSITION ISSUE AND EMAIL FROM R. SEVALRUD RE: SAME.	0.30	330.00	003	60361062
11/02/20	Guthrie, Hayden REVIEW TSA ISSUES (0.3).	0.30	315.00	003	60359633
11/02/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH EY TEAM RE SHARING OF TAX REGISTRATIONS (0.5); EMAIL TO CLIENT SUMMARIZING FINDINGS RE SHARING OF REGISTRATIONS WITH NEWCO (0.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL BENEFITS TEAM RE EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS (0.2).	1.20	1,116.00	003	60359417
11/03/20	Kim, Aileen REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS (0.2).	0.20	220.00	003	60376334
11/03/20	Sevalrud, Robert REVIEW AND ANALYZE CHANGE OF CONTROL EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS FOR CHANGE IN CONTROL TRIGGERS (1.1); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM RE SAME (0.3); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL BFR TEAM RE FOREIGN TRANSFER TAXES (0.2).	1.60	1,488.00	003	60377765
11/04/20	Liu, Ting	1.40	1,022.00	003	60398680

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW LOCAL TRANSFER AGREEMENTS AND EMAILS FOR PAYMENT RESPONSIBILITY FOR TRANSFER TAXES.				
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAIL TO R. EGGMAN RE: SALE ORDER.	0.20	220.00	003	60401320
11/06/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON POST-PETITION CARES ACT DEFERRAL AND TREATMENT UNDER APA (0.3) AND RESEARCH ON SAME (0.4).	0.70	787.50	003	60475659
11/06/20	Sevalrud, Robert REVIEW AND CONSIDER EMAILS FROM WEIL TAX TEAM RE DEFERRED TAX OBLIGATIONS.	0.20	186.00	003	60408947
11/08/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT HEARING SCRIPT FOR DE MINIMIS ASSET SALE MOTION (.6); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.6).	1.20	1,014.00	003	60533576
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH J. MYERS RE HEARING ON DE MINIMIS ASSET SALE MOTION (.2).	0.20	290.00	003	60434593
11/09/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES AND ANALYSIS FROM A. ARIKAT ON DEFERRAL OF PAYROLL TAXES UNDER CARES ACT AND TREATMENT AS ASSUMED LIABILITY UNDER APA (0.5).	0.50	562.50	003	60423721
11/09/20	Guthrie, Hayden REVIEW TAX CREDIT QUESTIONS FROM EY.	0.30	315.00	003	60420943
11/09/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH WEIL TAX TEAM RE CUSTOMER SALES TAX CREDITS.	0.30	279.00	003	60421194
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	003	60685549

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	FOLLOW UP WITH M. MARTIR AND K. BUONO ON DE MINIMIS ASSET SALES (.1).				
11/10/20	Guthrie, Hayden CALL WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE SALES TAXES (0.8).	0.80	840.00	003	60428189
11/10/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: MUNNSVILLE PROPERTY AND DBS BANK ACCOUNT TRANSACTIONS (.1); DRAFT EMAIL NOTICE TO UCC AND U.S. TRUSTEE RE: CLOSURE OF DBS ACCOUNT (.2); DISTRIBUTE NOTICE BY EMAIL OF CLOSURE OF DBS BANK ACCOUNT TO UCC, U.S. TRUSTEE, AND DAIHAITSU (.3).	0.60	507.00	003	60533531
11/13/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH WEIL BFR TEAM RE EXECUTED SAPA.	0.20	186.00	003	60457072
11/16/20	Sevalrud, Robert REVISE POST-CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.2); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM RE SAME (0.2).	0.40	372.00	003	60470752
11/17/20	Sevalrud, Robert CONSIDER REQUEST FROM WEIL BFR TEAM AND K&E RE ASSUMED AGREEMENTS (0.3); PROVIDING INSTRUCTIONS TO TING LIU RE SAME (0.2).	0.50	465.00	003	60480459
11/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH EY RE WORKING CAPITAL CALCULATION UNDER SAPA (.2); CONFER WITH K. BUONO AND EY RE SAME (.2).	0.40	580.00	003	60581769
11/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW WORKING CAPITAL CALCULATION FROM KPS AND EMAIL EY AND WEIL TEAM RE SAME (.1).	0.10	145.00	003	60581984
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FIFTH AMENDED ASSUMPTION/ASSIGNMENT NOTICE.	0.20	220.00	003	60532802
11/20/20	Kim, Aileen	0.50	550.00	003	60511881

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH EY AND K. BUONO TO DISCUSS POST-CLOSING STATEMENT (0.5).				
11/20/20	Guthrie, Hayden	1.30	1,365.00	003	60510545
	REVIEW ADJUSTMENT STATEMENT PROVIDED BY KPS (0.8); ATTENDANCE ON CALL RE ADJUSTMENT STATEMENT (0.5).				
11/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	003	60582639
	CALL WITH J. HENRICH RE WORKING CAPITAL ADJUSTMENT (.1).				
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	003	60539927
	CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: SAPA QUESTION ON PROFESSIONAL FEE RETAINERS (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS W/M&A TEAM RE: SAME (.1).				
11/23/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.30	315.00	003	60531912
	REVIEW APA RE QUESTION FROM K. BUONO RE LITTLER RETAINER (0.3).				
11/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	003	60583275
	CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK RE PLAN AND SALE ISSUES (.2).				
11/24/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.50	525.00	003	60546207
	REVIEW LITTLER RETAINER ISSUES (0.5).				
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.40	580.00	003	60583269
	CALL WITH COUNSEL TO INSURERS AND FOLEY RE PLAN (PARTIAL) (.4).				
11/29/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.50	525.00	003	60570058
	REVIEW REQUIRED CHANGES TO ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS OF BRIGGS AND STRATTON CORPORATION (0.5).				
11/29/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.60	558.00	003	60570170

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM RE REVISION OF BSC BYLAWS AND CHARTER (0.2); RETRIEVE COPY OF CURRENT BYLAWS AND CHARTER OF BSC (0.4).				
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	003	60596910
	EMAILS WITH FOLEY AND TIPT TEAMS RE IP ISSUES RELATING TO THE SALE (.2); CONFER WITH L. SPRINGER RE IP ISSUES RE SALE AND EMAIL FOLEY RE SAME (.1); EMAIL TO EY RE IP ISSUES RE SALE (.1); EMAILS WITH R. SEVALRUD RE WORKING CAPITAL ADJUSTMENT UNDER SAPA (.1).				
11/30/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.50	525.00	003	60590061
	REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT CHANGES (0.5).				
11/30/20	Myers, Janiel	0.10	84.50	003	60632052
	EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: SALE OF FORT PIERCE PROPERTY.				
11/30/20	Liu, Ting	0.30	219.00	003	60589235
	REVIEW CONTRACTS FOR THIRD PARTY BENEFIT RESTRICTIONS.				
11/30/20	Sevalrud, Robert	3.70	3,441.00	003	60589123
	EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE CALCULATION OF FINAL PURCHASE PRICE (0.7); DRAFT NOTICE TO K&E TEAM RE CALCULATION OF FINAL PURCHASE PRICE (0.5); REVIEW AND ANALYZE SAPA IN REGARDS TO FINAL PURCHASE PRICE CALCULATION (0.4); EMAIL CLIENT RE SAME (0.2); COORDINATE THE DRAFT OF AMENDMENT TO THE BYLAWS OF B&S CORPORATION (0.9); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A GROUP RE NEED TO AMEND CORPORATE PURPOSE (0.6); REVIEW AND CONSIDER ORGANIZATION DOCUMENTS OF DEBTOR ENTITIES (0.4).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 003 - Asset Disposition/363		21.70	\$21,747.50		
Sales:					
11/02/20	Citron, Andrew	1.20	1,116.00	004	60603393
	DRAFT OPPOSITION TO WARD MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY (1.2).				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	004	60389026
	CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: LIFT STAY OBJECTION TO PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT OBJECTION TO LLOMA FIRE LIFT STAY (.2); CALL WITH T. WILL (FOLEY) RE: LLOMA AND WARD LIFT STAYS (.6).	0.80	744.00	004	60673500
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: OBJECTIONS TO PERSONAL INJURY LIFT STAY MOTIONS.	0.10	110.00	004	60401340
11/05/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO LLOMA FIRE AND WARD LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.7); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: LLOMA FIRE AND WARD LIFT STAYS (.3).	1.00	930.00	004	60673548
11/06/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: APPROACH TO LIFT STAY MOTIONS ALLEGING PRODUCT DEFECT/PERSONAL INJURY.	0.40	440.00	004	60463135
11/06/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH FOLEY RE LITIGATION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE SAME (0.5); ANALYSIS OF MOTION AND APPLICABLE INSURANCE POLICIES RE SAME (3.4); DRAFT OBJECTION RE SAME (2.2).	6.60	6,666.00	004	60428792
11/08/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT OBJECTION TO WARD LIFT STAY (1.6); EMAILS TO M. MARTIR RE SAME: (2); EMAIL TO K. BUONO RE: HARTKE AND WARD LIFT STAY (.3); EMAILS TO D. HOEHNE RE: RULE 9006 AND DEADLINE TO SUBMIT OBJECTIONS TO LIFT STAYS (.2).	2.30	2,139.00	004	60673618
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON OBJECTION TO MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY (.4).	0.40	580.00	004	60434607
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR, C. BERMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: LIFT STAY RESPONSES.	0.40	440.00	004	60463150
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.10	1,210.00	004	60463532

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO ASBESTOS-RELATED LIFT STAY OBJECTIONS (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF OBJECTION TO PERSONAL INJURY RELATED LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.8).				
11/09/20	Martir, Martha DRAFT AND REVISE OBJECTION TO LIFT STAY MOTION (5.3); CALL AND EMAILS WITH FOLEY RE SAME (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE SAME (0.5).	6.50	6,565.00	004	60428808
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.1).	0.10	145.00	004	60434982
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF OBJECTION TO LIFT STAY MOTIONS FILED BY ASBESTOS-RELATED CLAIMANTS.	0.20	220.00	004	60464196
11/10/20	Blechman, Eli DRAFT AND REVISE DEBTORS' OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO MOTIONS OF CERTAIN ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS TO LIFT THE AUTOMATIC STAY.	5.20	5,096.00	004	60615529
11/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER FOR LIFT STAY MOTION.	0.10	73.00	004	60431206
11/10/20	Martir, Martha REVISE OBJECTION TO HARTKE LIFT STAY MOTION (0.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH HARTKE'S COUNSEL RE SAME (0.7); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE WARD LIFT STAY OBJECTION (0.2).	1.40	1,414.00	004	60428804
11/11/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS TO TEAM RE OBJECTION TO LIFT STAY MOTION (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON OBJECTION TO MOTIONS TO LIFT THE STAY (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON OBJECTION TO MOTIONS TO LIFT THE STAY (.1); EMAILS RE OBJECTION TO MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.1).	0.60	870.00	004	60445639
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.80	880.00	004	60464086

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS (X2) OF OBJECTION TO ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS' LIFT STAY MOTION, INCLUDING COMMENTS FROM K. BUONO AND T. WILL TO SAME.				
11/11/20	Berman, Corey D. REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZING OBJECTION TO ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY RE: STATE COURT LITIGATION (0.6); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (0.3).	0.90	990.00	004	60454331
11/11/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO MOTIONS OF CERTAIN CLAIMANTS TO LIFT THE AUTOMATIC STAY PER COMMENTS FROM R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND K. BUONO.	2.20	2,156.00	004	60615585
11/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT ORDER FOR LIFT STAY.	1.60	1,168.00	004	60436953
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT OF STIPULATION AND CONSENT ORDER ON WARD LIFT STAY MOTION.	0.20	220.00	004	60464066
11/12/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RESOLVING WARD LIFT STAY (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.5); REVISE HARTKE OBJECTION (3.1); RESEARCH RE SAME (1.2); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH FOLEY RE INSURANCE INFORMATION FOR LIFT STAY OBJECTION (0.8); .	6.80	6,868.00	004	60474009
11/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY (.1); REVIEW HARTKE MOTION TO LIFT STAY AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON OBJECTION (.4); PROVIDE COMMENTS TO OBJECTION TO HARTKE MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.1).	0.60	870.00	004	60465843
11/13/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF REPLY TO HARTKE LIFT STAY (.7); REVIEW ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM T. WILL TO SAME (.1); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: FILINGS ON REQUESTS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE PAYMENT AND REMAINING LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.1).	0.90	990.00	004	60464034

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/13/20	Martir, Martha REVISE DE LAGE OBJECTION (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH DE LAGE AND CARMODY RE SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH WARD RE LIFT STAY MOTION (0.5); DRAFT STIPULATION RE SAME (0.5); CALLS WITH FOLEY RE HARTKE OBJECTION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, R. BERKOVICH, AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.7); REVISE SAME (2.1).	6.20	6,262.00	004	60503967
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW OMNIBUS REPLY OF ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS IN SUPPORT OF LIFT STAY MOTION.	0.30	330.00	004	60473783
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH C. BERMAN RE: ORAL ARGUMENT ON LIFT STAY MOTIONS.	0.20	220.00	004	60473815
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO LIFT STAY MOTION (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE ASBESTOS CLAIMANT LIFT STAY MOTION (.1); REVIEW EMAIL FROM COUNSEL TO INSURER RE LIFT STAY MOTION (.1) EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, C. BERMAN, FOLEY, AND K. BUONO RE MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY (.8).	1.20	1,740.00	004	60488652
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: HARTKE LIFT STAY MOTION BACKGROUND (.3); REVIEW PLEADINGS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON HARTKE LIFT STAY MOTION (2.1).	2.40	2,640.00	004	60486266
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH C. BERMAN RE: ASBESTOS-RELATED LIFT STAY MOTIONS.	0.10	110.00	004	60486402
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH T. WILL, K. BUONO, E. KHATCHATOURIAN, R. BERKOVICH AND C. BERMAN RE: LIFT STAY MOTIONS (ASBESTOS AND PERSONAL INJURY), INCLUDING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION IN ASBESTOS INSURERS' REPLY (.8); REVIEW ADDITIONAL FILED DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH LACK LIFT STAY MOTION/ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS' OMNIBUS REPLY (.2).	1.00	1,100.00	004	60486527
11/17/20	Berman, Corey D.	2.30	2,530.00	004	60491660

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY (0.4); DRAFT ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE RE: DEBTORS' OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO ASBESTOS CLAIMANT'S MOTIONS TO LIFT STAY (1.1); CALL WITH FOLEY, R. BERKOVICH, AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.8).				
11/17/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. KHATCHATOURIAN AND K. BUONO RE: INSURANCE AND AUTOMATIC STAY ISSUES.	0.80	784.00	004	60639394
11/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE AND SUMMARIZING ASBESTOS CLAIMANT REPLY TO DEBTORS' OBJECTION (.8); CORRESPONDENCE RE PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON ASBESTOS LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.2); CALL ON ASBESTOS CLAIMANT REPLY (.8).	1.80	1,314.00	004	60488864
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SCRIPT FOR HEARING ON HARTKE STAY MOTION (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE HEARING ON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.1).	0.50	725.00	004	60499263
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: STRATEGY FOR HEARING (.2); PREPARE FOR LIFT STAY HEARING, INCLUDING REVIEW AND REVISION OF HEARING OUTLINE AND EMAILS WITH C. BERMAN RE: ARGUMENT (1.5).	1.70	1,870.00	004	60495865
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER MODIFYING LIFT STAY FOR HARTKEY MOTION.	0.30	330.00	004	60495882
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: PREPARATION OF LIFT STAY ORDER RE: HARTKE MOTION.	0.20	220.00	004	60496008
11/18/20	Berman, Corey D. PREPARE FOR AND PRACTICE ORAL ARGUMENT RE: DEBTORS' OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS MOTION TO LIFT STAY.	1.10	1,210.00	004	60499461

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT ORDER FOR HARTKE LIFT STAY MOTION.	1.50	1,095.00	004	60497133
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PROPOSED STIPULATION WITH NMTC LENDERS TO LIFT STAY TO EXERCISE SECURITY INTEREST IN RESERVE ACCOUNTS (.3); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME (.1).	0.40	440.00	004	60532837
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW TRANSCRIPT FROM HEARING ON LIFT STAY MOTIONS (.2); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM T. WILL TO PROPOSED ORDER AND EMAILS WITH T. WILL RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH T. WILL AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: SAME (.2); EMAIL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME (.2).	0.80	880.00	004	60532831
11/20/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL ON HARTKE LIFT STAY ORDER WITH D. HOEHNE, T. WILL (.2); REVISE HARTKE LIFT STAY ORDER TO T. WILL EDITS AND SENDING THE SAME TO K. BUONO FOR REVIEW (.5).	0.70	511.00	004	60511642
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW COMMENTS FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL TO PROPOSED ORDER ON HARTKE LIFT STAY AND EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG AND OPPOSING COUNSEL ON SAME (.4); REVIEW INTERROGATORIES ON INSURANCE IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM T. WILL RE: SAME (.4).	0.90	990.00	004	60539983
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW OPPOSING COUNSEL EDITS TO HARTKE AUTOMATIC STAY ORDER AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND T. WILL (FOLEY) RE THE SAME.	0.30	219.00	004	60536921
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT PROPOSED LIFT STAY ORDER FROM ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL.	0.10	110.00	004	60590687
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. DIBENEDETTO RE: LIFT STAY ORDER (.5); REVISE PROPOSED ORDER AND EMAIL TO T. WILL RE: SAME (.2).	0.70	770.00	004	60590860

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/30/20	Martir, Martha DRAFT AUTOMATIC STAY STIPULATION (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH T. PEENE RE SAME (0.2); DRAFT AUTOMATIC STAY LETTER (1.1); REVIEW MATERIALS FROM COMPANY RE SAME (0.6).	2.70	2,727.00	004	60590678
SUBTOTAL TASK 004 - Automatic Stay:		70.70	\$72,137.00		
11/01/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.	0.30	330.00	005	60354485
11/01/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.3).	0.30	253.50	005	60533407
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM C. EVERHARDT (FOLEY) AND EY RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS, INCLUDING SPREADSHEET OF FURTHER ANALYSIS ON FILED LITIGATION CLAIMS.	0.50	550.00	005	60361061
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH J. MYERS AND EY RE: CLAIMS OBJECTION EXHIBITS.	0.10	110.00	005	60361078
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: ANALYSIS OF CERTAIN PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR POTENTIAL OBJECTION.	0.20	220.00	005	60361083
11/02/20	Martir, Martha RECONCILE VARIOUS CLAIMS (1.6); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.9).	2.50	2,525.00	005	60363629
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS RE: PRELIMINARY CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.1); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME (.3).	1.40	1,540.00	005	60389116
11/03/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH EY TEAM AND D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS.	1.20	1,176.00	005	60540677

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND EY TEAM RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: INSURANCE CLAIMS (.3); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.3); CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS TO DISCUSS INSURANCE ISSUES RE CLAIMS (1.0); DRAFT MOTION RE: NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (4.7).	7.40	6,253.00	005	60533557
11/03/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH A. CITRON RE RECONCILIATION OF CLAIMS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE SAME (0.4).	0.70	707.00	005	60408994
11/04/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON TESKE CLAIMS, REVIEW POC AND OPEN ISSUES (0.7).	0.70	787.50	005	60474855
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (2.2); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF EXHIBIT FOR SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH J. MYER RE: SAME AND OTHER CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.5).	3.00	3,300.00	005	60393392
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW M. MARTIR MEMO RE WTW CLAIM.	0.10	110.00	005	60393527
11/04/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT NOTICE AND MOTION RE: SATISFIED CLAIMS (2.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.5); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM D. HOEHNE ON DRAFT RE: SAME (.5).	3.30	2,788.50	005	60533521
11/04/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY RE CLAIM AMOUNTS (0.5); RECONCILE CLAIM (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.3).	1.30	1,313.00	005	60408968
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO APPROVE NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.9); CALL RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION WITH EY, M. MARTIR, E. BLECHMAN (.6).	1.50	1,650.00	005	60401282

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS WITH J. MYERS AND D. SUBERI RE: NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.1); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: DISCUSSIONS WITH CLERK OF COURT ON NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.1).	0.20	220.00	005	60401334
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, P. PRICKETT, L. RICHARDS AND T. ROTH RE: EMPLOYEE AND BENEFIT CLAIMS.	0.60	660.00	005	60401363
11/05/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS.	0.50	490.00	005	60569983
11/05/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. KO (CARMODY) TO DISCUSS PROCESS FOR NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.2); CALL WITH D. SUBERI (CARMODY) AND D. KO RE: SAME (.2); CONFER WITH D. SUBERI RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, M. MARTIR, E. BLECHMAN, AND EY TEAM RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS PROCESS (.3); CALL WITH COURT RE HEARING RE CLAIMS (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH FOREIGN CLAIMANTS RE: WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIMS; EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH A. NGUYEN RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH BROWN RUDNICK RE: NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.2); DRAFT MOTION RE: NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (3.6).	5.20	4,394.00	005	60533540
11/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION RE SATISFACTION OF CLAIMS (.4).	0.40	580.00	005	60418099
11/06/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: REVISED MOTION APPROVED NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW DRAFT OF MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR SAME (.2); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: NOTICE OF HEARING AND SERVICE OF MOTION (.1); COMPLETE REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF MOTION TO APPROVE NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.6).	1.10	1,210.00	005	60463442
11/06/20	Myers, Janiel	6.80	5,746.00	005	60533595

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE MOTION RE: SATISFIED CLAIM TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM D HOEHNE (1.7); REVISE RE: SAME TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM R. BERKOVICH (3.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MOTION FOR ORDER SHORTENING TIME RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SCHEDULES OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW DRAFT OF MOTION RE: SATISFIED CLAIMS TO PREPARE FOR FILING (.9); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH D. KO RE: SAME (.1).				
11/08/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND ANALYZE OUTSTANDING CLAIMS AT B&S INTERNATIONAL AND B&S TECH (.7).	0.70	591.50	005	60533611
11/09/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON TESKE PROOF OF CLAIM AND BACKGROUND (1.2); REVIEW ANALYSIS FOR LONG TERM INCENTIVE AWARDS AND PREPARE FOR CONF. WITH BROWN RUDNICK (0.6); CONF. WITH WEIL AND BROWN RUDNICK ON TESKE CLAIMS AND ANALYSIS, SERP VALUATION (0.6); CONF. WITH D. HOEHNE ON FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS ISSUES (0.2); FOLLOW-UP CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH T. ROTH ON SAME (0.2).	2.80	3,150.00	005	60423513
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.	0.60	660.00	005	60463173
11/09/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH GERMAN CLAIMANTS RE: WITHDRAWAL OF ERRONEOUSLY FILED CLAIMS (.2); CONFER WITH D. HEOHNE RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS WORKSTREAM (.5).	0.70	591.50	005	60533585
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS, E. BLECHMAN, M. MARTIR, AND EY RE: CLAIMS ANALYSIS.	0.70	770.00	005	60463903
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT FORM OF NO LIABILITY OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTION, INCLUDING REVIEW LOCAL RULES AND FORMS IN CONNECTION THEREWITH (1.4); EMAIL TO J. MYERS RE: SAME (.1).	1.50	1,650.00	005	60464258
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora DISCUSS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS WITH J. MYERS (.2); CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.1).	0.30	330.00	005	60464297

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.1).	0.10	110.00	005	60685550
11/10/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS (0.7); FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS AND S. HOFNER RE: SAME (0.5).	1.20	1,176.00	005	60615546
11/10/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND ANALYZE DAIHATISU PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND EY TEAM RE: CLAIMS WORKSTREAM (.7); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: DAIHATSU PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIM OBJECTION WORKSTREAMS (.2); CONFER WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.5); DRAFT SHELL FOR NO LIABILITY CLAIM OBJECTIONS (2.6).	4.50	3,802.50	005	60533599
11/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1); CALL WITH JANIEL TO DISCUSS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS WORKPLAN (0.1); REVIEW CLAIM INF/SPREADSHEET FROM J. MYERS (0.2).	0.70	511.00	005	60616620
11/10/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH EY, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECMAN, AND J. MYERS RE CLAIMS.	0.80	808.00	005	60428759
11/11/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPOND WITH BRIGGS OIN EMPLOYEE CLAIMS ISSUES.	0.30	337.50	005	60444419
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW D. KO COMMENTS TO FORM OF OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTION (NO LIABILITY) (.2); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND VOTING SPREADSHEET FROM KCC (.2).	0.40	440.00	005	60464027
11/11/20	Blechman, Eli	4.20	4,116.00	005	60615581

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW CLAIMS/VOTING SPREADSHEET FROM KCC/EY AND PROVIDE COMMENTS RE: SAME (1.5); REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE PROCEDURES FOR REMOVAL OF SATISFIED CLAIMS AND RELATED EXHIBITS (1.2); PREPARE SCRIPT RE: MOTION TO APPROVE PROCEDURES FOR REMOVAL OF SATISFIED CLAIMS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (1.5).				
11/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE; CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1); DRAFT FORM CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (3.4).	3.50	2,555.00	005	60590404
11/12/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES FROM EY ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.3); CONF. WITH EY, P. PRICKETT AND WEIL ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS RESOLUTION (0.5); CONF AND CORRESPONDENCE ON FOLLOWUP CLAIMS ISSUES (0.2) AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM EY (0.6).	1.60	1,800.00	005	60455053
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.1); REVIEW UPDATE SPREADSHEET FROM EY DETAILING UPDATE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND REASONING (.5); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN, J. MYERS AND E. BERDINI RE: OBJECTIONS (.4); EMAIL TO S. HOFNER RE: CLAIMS OBJECTION EXHIBITS (.1); CALL RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.3); CALL WITH S. GOLDRING RE: PRIORITY TAX CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW AMENDED/SUPERSEDED CLAIMS OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW REVISED NO LIABILITY CLAIMS OBJECTION (.1); REVIEW OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO WRONG DEBTOR CLAIMS (.6).	2.70	2,970.00	005	60463913
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SERVICE OF NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS AND ORDER ON SAME.	0.20	220.00	005	60464180
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED ORDER, NOTICE, AND EXHIBITS RE: SATISFIED/PARTIALLY SATISFIED CLAIMS (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.1).	0.20	220.00	005	60464360
11/12/20	Blechman, Eli	5.00	4,900.00	005	60638574

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE: CLAIMS PROCESS AND CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND EY TEAM RE: SAME AND REVIEW DRAFTS OF CLAIM SPREADSHEET (1.0); REVIEW MOTION SEEKING TO DISALLOW CERTAIN SATISFIED CLAIMS AND PREPARE SCRIPT IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING RE: SAME (1.8); ATTEND HEARING RE: SAME (0.5); REVISE PROPOSED ORDER AND NOTICE AND RELATED EXHIBITS (1.5).				
11/12/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: NO LIABILITY CLAIM OBJECTION FORM (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIM OBJECTION WORKSTREAM (.1).	0.20	169.00	005	60533579
11/12/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT AMENDED AND SUPERSEDED CLAIM OBJECTION (2.6); REVIEW AND REVISE NO LIABILITY CLAIM OBJECTION SHELL (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.2); RESEARCH CASE PRECEDENT RE: DECLARATIONS FOR CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: DECLARATION FOR CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.1); CALL WITH J. MYERS TO DISCUSS CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND DRAFT DECLARATIONS (3.9).	7.70	5,621.00	005	60590430
11/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS.	0.50	725.00	005	60465491
11/13/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED FORM OF NO LIABILITY OBJECTION (.6); REVIEW REVISED WRONG DEBTOR OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW REVISED AMENDED/SUPERSEDED OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS FROM E. BERDINI RE: OBJECTION DRAFTS (.1); CALL RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS WITH E. BLECHMAN, J. MYERS, E. BERDINI AND EY (.6); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: FINALIZING SAME (.1); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH CARMODY RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.2); EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW REVISED EXHIBITS FOR CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.4); REVIEW STATUS OF OBJECTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS OF MOTIONS BY STIPULATION WITH M. MARTIR (.2).	3.10	3,410.00	005	60464051
11/13/20	Blechman, Eli	3.20	3,136.00	005	60638714

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.7); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS OF CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND RELATED EXHIBITS AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS RE: SAME (2.5).				
11/13/20	Myers, Janiel	1.00	845.00	005	60533566
	CALL WITH EY TEAM, E. BLECHMAN, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BERDINI RE: CLAIM OBJECTIONS WORKSTREAM (.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EXHIBITS TO CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.4).				
11/13/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.50	4,015.00	005	60616711
	PREPARE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND DECLARATIONS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1); CALL WITH EY TO DISCUSS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND POTENTIAL 3007(D) WAIVER (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: DRAFT CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1); REVIEW CLAIM OBJECTION EXHIBITS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS, E. BLECHMAN, AND D. HOEHNE, AND RE: EXHIBITS FOR CLAM OBJECTIONS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: COMMENTS TO CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.2);REVIEW AND REVISE FORM CLAIM OBJECTIONS (2.7); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN AND D. HOEHNE RE: FORM CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3).				
11/14/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	005	60465789
	REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF WRONG DEBTOR CLAIMS OBJECTION.				
11/14/20	Blechman, Eli	0.50	490.00	005	60639305
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS OF CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND RELATED EXHIBITS AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS RE: SAME.				
11/14/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	3.70	2,701.00	005	60616731
	CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (2.1) CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN AND D. HOEHNE RE: REVISED CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CALL WITH EY TO DISCUSS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1); REVISE AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.1).				
11/15/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.80	880.00	005	60465540

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REVISED NO LIABILITY OBJECTIONS (.4); REVIEW REVISED EXHIBITS TO OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO DRAFT OBJECTIONS (.1); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM EY TO DECLARATION (.1).				
11/15/20	Blechman, Eli	1.00	980.00	005	60639318
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS OF CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND RELATED EXHIBITS AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS RE: SAME.				
11/15/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	4.00	2,920.00	005	60616677
	REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: NO LIABILITY CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CALL WITH EY TO DISCUSS EXHIBITS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND J. MYERS RE: EY EXHIBITS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: COMMENTS TO EXHIBITS (0.3) REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.7).				
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	005	60477500
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CLAIMS OBJECTION (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE COMMENTS ON CLAIMS OBJECTION (.2).				
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	005	60477558
	REVIEW OBJECTION TO CLAIM.				
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora	2.30	2,530.00	005	60473791
	CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: FOREIGN CLAIMANTS' PROOF OF CLAIMS (.1); REVIEW REVISED EXHIBITS TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM R. BERKOVICH TO OBJECTIONS (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BERDINI RE: NO LIABILITY OBJECTION (.2); CALL WITH E. BERDINI AND J. MYERS (PARTIAL) TO FINALIZE OBJECTIONS FOR FILING (.5); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF OBJECTIONS (.4); FOLLOW UP EMAILS TO FINALIZE SAME (.1); FOLLOW UP CALLS (X2) WITH J. MYERS (.2); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS TO COORDINATE SERVICE OF OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING FOR OBJECTIONS (.1).				
11/16/20	Blechman, Eli	3.40	3,332.00	005	60639343
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS OF CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND RELATED EXHIBITS AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, J. MYERS AND E. BERDINI RE: SAME.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/16/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: FOREIGN CLAIMANTS PROOF OF CLAIMS (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.2); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH KCC TEAM RE: SAME AND BALLOTS (.1); PREPARE OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTIONS FOR FILING (3.8); CALL WITH E. BERDINI AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.2); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. KO RE: SAME (.9); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.8).	6.10	5,154.50	005	60533417
11/16/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (3.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS RE: FILING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH C. STAUBLE RE: FILING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: SERVING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CALL WITH J. MYERS AND D. HOEHNE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: FILING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3); FINALIZE FILE CLAIMS FOR FILING (0.8); CALL WITH J. MYERS TO DISCUSSED PROPOSED ORDERS FOR CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.3).	6.30	4,599.00	005	60627431
11/16/20	Stauble, Christopher A. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF 4TH THROUGH 13TH MOTIONS FOR OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS TO CLAIMS.	4.90	2,058.00	005	60552507
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH J. MYERS RE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.1).	0.10	145.00	005	60848621
11/17/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW CLAIMS FOR LIFE INSURANCE AND EXECUTIVE OFFICERS LIFE INSURANCE AND EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS (1.6); CONF. WITH WEIL TEAM ON SAME (1.0); DRAFT ISSUES LIST FOR P. PRICKETT AND CORRESPONDENCE AND RESPONSES TO SAME (0.5).	3.10	3,487.50	005	60487723
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, E. BLECHMAN, AND M. MARTIR RE: CLAIMS ISSUES.	0.80	880.00	005	60486225
11/17/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CLAIMS ISSUES (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.2).	1.00	980.00	005	60639391

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/17/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NMTC STIPULATION TO LIFT STAY AND WITHDRAW CLAIMS.	0.80	676.00	005	60533409
11/17/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH -PENSION CLAIMANT MICHAEL PETERS RE: PENSION STATUS (.3); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH EY TEAM RE: SAME (.1).	0.40	338.00	005	60533433
11/17/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH EY, HOULIHAN, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BLECHMAN RE VARIOUS CLAIMS.	0.80	808.00	005	60496517
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: OSLIP CLAIMS.	0.20	220.00	005	60495834
11/18/20	Blechman, Eli CALL AND CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: SPECIAL BAR DATE NOTICE IN CONNECTION WITH REJECTION CLAIMS.	0.20	196.00	005	60639425
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS RE: CALCULATION OF OSLIP CLAIMS (.2); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (.1).	0.30	330.00	005	60532846
11/19/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CLAIMS ISSUES.	0.20	196.00	005	60639563
11/19/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF REJECTION DAMAGES BAR DATE AND CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER AND M. MARTIR RE: SAME.	0.20	196.00	005	60639571
11/19/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: DAIHATSU PROOF OF CLAIM (.1); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO COUNSEL FOR DAIHATSU RE: SAME (.3); REVIEW EMAIL FROM GERMAN CLAIMANT RE: WITHDRAWAL OF POC (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH KCC TEAM RE: SAME (.1).	0.70	591.50	005	60533609

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, S. MARGOLIS AND P. PRICKETT RE: OSLIP CLAIMS.	0.30	330.00	005	60532799
11/20/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY, T. RISKE AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS ISSUES AND POTENTIAL AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULES (0.3).	0.50	490.00	005	60640416
11/20/20	Myers, Janiel REVISE DRAFT OF NMTC STIPULATION (.5).	0.50	422.50	005	60533516
11/20/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. KO RE: FIFTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.1).	0.20	169.00	005	60533573
11/21/20	Blechman, Eli CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: LOCAL RULES AND RELEVANT PRECEDENT IN CONNECTION WITH AMENDING CLAIMS AND SCHEDULES.	0.20	196.00	005	60642024
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR AND C. LUSTER RE: PREPETITION INVOICE FOR ADVERTISING FEES.	0.10	110.00	005	60539976
11/23/20	Blechman, Eli CALLS AND CORRESPOND WITH T. RISKE, J. MYERS AND EY TEAM RE: AMENDED CLAIMS AND SCHEDULES AND REVIEW RELEVANT PRECEDENT.	0.80	784.00	005	60641951
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH M. SCHLAN AND O. LASHKO RE: CLAIM OBJECTION PROCEDURES MOTION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH S. HOFNER AND C. CARPENTER RE: ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS (.1).	0.20	169.00	005	60632098
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: NMTC STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE RE: SAME (.1).	0.20	169.00	005	60632173

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/23/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.	0.50	125.00	005	60789474
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM M. MARTIR RE: PREPETITION VENDOR INOVICES AND M&A TEAM RE: PROFESSIONAL RETAINERS.	0.10	110.00	005	60545896
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora RESPOND TO PHONE INQUIRY RE: AMENDING PROOF OF CLAIM.	0.20	220.00	005	60546070
11/24/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLAIMS ISSUES (0.5); CALL WITH J. MYERS AND J. ZHANG RE: AMENDED SCHEDULES (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS ISSUES (0.2); REVIEW CERTAIN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS FOLLOWING CALL WITH EY (0.3).	1.40	1,372.00	005	60696576
11/24/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH EY TEAM, E. BLECHMN, AND M. MARTIR RE: CLAIMS PROCESS (.5); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.1); REVIEW MOTION AND NOTICE RE: SATISFIED CLAIMS (.2).	0.80	676.00	005	60632203
11/24/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW COMMENTS FROM K. BUONO ON NMTC LENDER STIPULATION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH A. GOLVACH AND G. GAUTHIER RE: NMTC FEE RESERVE ACCOUNTS (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE NMTC STIPULATION (.4); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.1).	0.70	591.50	005	60632229
11/24/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH EY, E. BLECHMAN, AND J. MYERS RE VARIOUS CLAIMS (0.5); ANALYSIS OF CLAIM IN RESPONSE TO QUESTION FROM CLIENT (0.7).	1.20	1,212.00	005	60578258
11/25/20	Blechman, Eli CONDUCT DILIGENCE AND RESEARCH RE: CERTAIN CLAIMS AND CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME.	0.50	490.00	005	60726922

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/25/20	Myers, Janiel REVISE NMTC STIPULATION (.2).	0.20	169.00	005	60632168
11/25/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH CREDITOR RE PROOF OF CLAIM (0.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIALS IN PREPARATION OF CALL (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND FOLEY RE SAME (0.3).	1.00	1,010.00	005	60578136
11/25/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.	0.50	125.00	005	60789539
11/30/20	Blechman, Eli DISCUSS WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: OBJECTIONS TO CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED CLAIMS AND RELATED REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF RESPONSE DEADLINE.	0.20	196.00	005	60736776
11/30/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY RE VARIOUS PROOFS OF CLAIM.	1.10	1,111.00	005	60590715
SUBTOTAL TASK 005 - Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues:		147.20	\$132,604.00		
11/02/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP LIST (.7).	0.70	591.50	006	60359947
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE (.1); UPDATE WIP (.2).	0.30	219.00	006	60359900
11/02/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60475425
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE WIP (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60388676

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED WIP LIST.	0.10	110.00	006	60389054
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP.	0.20	220.00	006	60389080
11/03/20	Blechman, Eli UPDATE WIP LIST.	0.10	98.00	006	60540719
11/03/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW WIP LIST (0.1).	0.10	73.00	006	60680927
11/03/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60475279
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.20	220.00	006	60393478
11/04/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP (.8).	0.80	676.00	006	60406837
11/04/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60475109
11/05/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60400327
11/06/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60409043
11/06/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	0.50	125.00	006	60475165

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.				
11/09/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP (.6).	0.60	507.00	006	60424944
11/09/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP.	0.20	169.00	006	60533616
11/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	219.00	006	60421422
11/09/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60543192
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60435013
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL AND DOCKET UPDATES.	0.20	220.00	006	60463865
11/10/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP LIST (.6).	0.60	507.00	006	60428826
11/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	219.00	006	60431152
11/10/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60543170
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	110.00	006	60463959

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/11/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP LIST.	0.40	338.00	006	60437158
11/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.20	146.00	006	60436914
11/11/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60543198
11/12/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP LIST.	0.50	422.50	006	60450438
11/12/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.20	146.00	006	60450228
11/12/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60543230
11/13/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60543224
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP LIST.	0.60	660.00	006	60473846
11/16/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE WIP TO REFLECT LATEST STATUS UPDATES (0.4); REVIEW AND REVISE POSTPETITION BOILER TO REFLECT RECENT CASE UPDATES (1.0).	1.40	1,372.00	006	60639356
11/16/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP LIST.	1.10	929.50	006	60476543

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/16/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND UPDATE HEARING AGENDA.	1.10	929.50	006	60476926
11/16/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.20	169.00	006	60533443
11/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE (.2); REVISE WIP LIST (.2).	0.40	292.00	006	60474677
11/16/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60638106
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP LIST.	0.10	145.00	006	60488689
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND C. LUSTER RE: WIP UPDATES.	0.10	110.00	006	60486463
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DOCKET SUMMARY FROM S. SCHNORRENBURG.	0.10	110.00	006	60486516
11/17/20	Luster, Courtney UPDATE AND DISCUSS WIP (.9); DISCUSS WIP TRANSITION WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. ZHANG (.2).	1.10	929.50	006	60494429
11/17/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60638051
11/18/20	Luster, Courtney DISCUSS WIP TRANSITION WITH J. ZHANG.	0.40	338.00	006	60494444
11/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	006	60496957

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.				
11/18/20	Zhang, John CALL WITH C. LUSTER ABOUT WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR MANAGEMENT.	0.20	119.00	006	60494288
11/18/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60638039
11/19/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.20	146.00	006	60503442
11/19/20	Zhang, John CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: WIP LIST AND THE CASE CALENDAR.	0.20	119.00	006	60503590
11/19/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60638048
11/20/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60511660
11/20/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60638011
11/22/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.70	1,011.50	006	60513809
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP.	0.30	330.00	006	60539928
11/23/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND UPDATE WIP.	0.20	196.00	006	60642001

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/23/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP (.3).	0.30	253.50	006	60533775
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.40	338.00	006	60632192
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE (.3); REVIEW AND COMMENTING ON WIP (.2).	0.50	365.00	006	60536974
11/23/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	2.90	1,725.50	006	60533315
11/24/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60545636
11/24/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.50	297.50	006	60543545
11/24/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789492
11/27/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (1.1); PREPARE DEADLINE REMINDERS FOR TEAM (.6).	1.70	1,011.50	006	60566821
11/29/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60569873
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP LIST.	0.40	440.00	006	60590762
11/30/20	Blechman, Eli	0.20	196.00	006	60736800

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	UPDATE WIP.				
11/30/20	Luster, Courtney COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.20	169.00	006	60589258
11/30/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.40	338.00	006	60632199
11/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PROVIDE COMMENTS TO THE WIP LIST.	0.10	73.00	006	60590309
11/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.10	73.00	006	60685557
11/30/20	Paddock, Alyssa TEAM UPDATE CALL.	1.00	845.00	006	60850476
11/30/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.60	952.00	006	60587165
11/30/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789642
SUBTOTAL TASK 006 - Case Administration (docket updates and WIP ONLY):		34.60	\$22,922.00		
11/01/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISED PLAN AND BOARD MEETING MATERIALS SUMMARIZING CHANGES (.1);.	0.10	110.00	007	60354448
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	007	60361052

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW EMAILS WITH E. KHATCHOURIAN AND R. BERKOVICH ANALYZE INSURANCE ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN.				
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW K. BUONO'S COMMENTS TO PLAN.	0.10	110.00	007	60361080
11/02/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PAYMENT OF FEE CLAIMS UNDER PLAN (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.2); REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER AGREEMENT WITH PBGC (0.4); REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM K. BUONO (0.2).	1.00	980.00	007	60680526
11/02/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH ASBESTOS INSURERS RE: POTENTIAL PLAN CHANGES (.7).	0.70	651.00	007	60603389
11/03/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: PLAN AND INSURANCE ISSUES (1.2); REVISE PLAN TO ADDRESS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS (0.5).	1.70	1,666.00	007	60540662
11/03/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: PLAN RELEASE RESEARCH (.1).	0.10	84.50	007	60533605
11/03/20	Martir, Martha ANALYSIS OF INSURANCE PROVISIONS IN THE SAPA AND SALE ORDER IN CONNECTION WITH INSURER COMMENTS ON PLAN (0.8); COMMENT ON PLAN LANGUAGE RE SAME (0.4).	1.20	1,212.00	007	60409165
11/03/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAM RE: INSURANCE LANGUAGE FOR PLAN (1.1); DRAFT INSURANCE NEUTRALITY LANGUAGE FOR PLAN (.4).	1.50	1,395.00	007	60673593
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PLAN COMMENTS FROM UCC COUNSEL.	0.10	110.00	007	60393504

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN, S. SCHNORREBERG AND A. CITRON RE: PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REVISIONS AND REPLY BRIEF (.8); REVIEW PLAN COMMENTS FROM E. KHATCHOURIAN (.4); EMAIL TO R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1);.	1.30	1,430.00	007	60393552
11/04/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER COMMENTS FROM U.S. TRUSTEE (1.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: OBJECTIONS TO THE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2).	2.40	2,352.00	007	60543308
11/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN AND EMAIL TO D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REVISED PLAN (.1).	0.40	580.00	007	60407521
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS TO PLAN (.4); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN CHANGES FROM UCC IN RESPONSE TO U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTION (.2); EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: INSURANCE CLAIMS UNDER PLAN (.1); EMAIL TO E. KHATCHOURIAN RE: REVISIONS TO SAME (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON, S. SCHNORREBERG AND R. BERKOVICH RE: PLAN TREATMENT OF INSURED CLAIMS AND REPLY BRIEF TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (.4).	1.20	1,320.00	007	60401281
11/05/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE CHAPTER 11 PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM U.S. TRUSTEE AND UCC (1.0); REVISE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: CERTAIN INSURANCE CHANGES (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH UCC RE: PLAN CHANGES AND REVISE PLAN ACCORDINGLY (0.4); FURTHER REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL INSURANCE CHANGES (3.2).	5.60	5,488.00	007	60570010
11/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN LANGUAGE RE INSURANCE ISSUES AND EMAIL E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE SAME (.2).	0.20	290.00	007	60418070
11/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	1.10	1,595.00	007	60418112

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BERDINI, A. CITRON, AND FOLEY TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES IN PLAN (.7); REVIEW INSURERS' PROPOSED COMMENTS TO THE PLAN AND EMAIL INSURERS' COUNSEL RE SAME (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN (.2).				
11/06/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FURTHER CHANGES TO PLAN SECTIONS RE: INSURED CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW ASBESTOS INSURERS' COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5).	0.70	770.00	007	60463214
11/06/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM U.S. TRUSTEE RE: PLAN (0.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH UCC COUNSEL RE: SAME (0.2); CALLS WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS TO DISCUSS ADDITIONAL CHANGES TO INSURANCE PROVISIONS OF THE PLAN (1.0); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL CHANGES TO INSURANCE PROVISIONS (0.8); CALL WITH U.S. TRUSTEE, UCC, WEIL AND CARMODY RE: PLAN (0.5); REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE THE PLAN PER VARIOUS DISCUSSION AND COMMENTS (2.0).	5.00	4,900.00	007	60570012
11/06/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVISE CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE WITH COMMENTS FROM E. BLECHMAN (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISED CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE (0.1).	0.40	292.00	007	60684300
11/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAIL WITH FOLEY AND WEIL TEAMS RE INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.1); CALL WITH INSURERS' COUNSEL RE COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5).	0.60	870.00	007	60418116
11/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAM RE INSURANCE COMPANY PROPOSAL FOR PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.3).	1.30	1,885.00	007	60418220
11/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE COMMENTS TO PLAN (.1).	0.10	145.00	007	60418304
11/08/20	Hoehne, Debora	3.70	4,070.00	007	60684629

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH FOLEY TEAM, R. BERKOVICH AND E. BLECHMAN RE: INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (1.3); EMAILS TO BROWN RUDNICK RE: INSURER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS TO PLAN AND STATUS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.3); CALL WITH O. LASHKO RE: INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.6); CALL WITH OBJECTING INSURERS, FOLEY TEAM, AND R. BERKOVICH RE: DISCLOSURE OBJECTION AND COMMENTS TO PLAN (.6); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH FOLEY TEAM RE: INSURER COMMENTS (.3); REVIEW FURTHER COMMENTS FROM OBJECTING INSURERS TO PLAN (.5).				
11/08/20	Blechman, Eli	1.40	1,372.00	007	60586697
	CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: INSURANCE ISSUES IN PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: SAME (0.2).				
11/08/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.30	1,679.00	007	60414572
	CALL ON INSURANCE EDITS TO THE PLAN WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON, E. KHATCHATORIAN (1.3); RESEARCH RELATED TO INSURER COMMENTS ON PLAN (1.0).				
11/08/20	Citron, Andrew	2.20	2,046.00	007	60673584
	CALL WITH ASBESTOS INSURERS RE: POTENTIAL REVISIONS TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, R. BERKOVICH, AND FOLEY TEAM RE: INSURANCE NEUTRAL LANGUAGE FOR PLAN (1.3); REVIEW ASBESTOS INSURERS PROPOSED LANGUAGE TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).				
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	007	60434668
	REVIEW COMMENTS FROM INSURANCE COMPANIES ON PLAN AND EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.3); COORDINATE WITH TEAM ON INSURER LANGUAGE FOR PLAN (.2).				
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.70	1,870.00	007	60685405
	NEGOTIATE ADDITIONAL LANGUAGE FOR PLAN IN CONNECTION WITH INSURERS' OBJECTION (.9); EMAILS WITH TEAM TO FINALIZE ORDER AND SOLICITATION VERSIONS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (.8).				
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	007	60435077
	CONFER WITH G. HOLTZER RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY (.1).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: WORKSTREAMS RELATED TO CLAIMS AND CONFIRMATION (.3); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (.2).	0.50	550.00	007	60464280
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH OBJECTING INSURERS, T. WILL, E. KHACHATOURIAN, AND R. BERKOVICH RE PLAN ISSUES (.5); FOLLOW UP CALL RE: SAME WITH T. WILL, R. BERKOVICH AND E. KHACHATOURIAN (.4); FOLLOW UP EMAILS RE: SAME (.1).	1.00	1,100.00	007	60463840
11/12/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.5); CALL WITH ASBESTOS INSURERS' COUNSEL AND WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: PLAN CHANGES AND INSURANCE BUY-BACK PROPOSAL (0.5); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CERTAIN PLAN CHANGES (0.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH RELATED TO PLAN CONFIRMATION AND POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS RE: THIRD-PARTY RELEASES (2.0).	3.50	3,430.00	007	60638672
11/12/20	Paddock, Alyssa DISCUSS CASE AND CONFIRMATION PROCESS WITH E. BLECHMAN (.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DEAL HISTORY (1.2).	1.70	1,436.50	007	60521393
11/13/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH HANSEN REYNOLDS (T. REYNOLDS AND J. MCCAULEY), E. KHATCHATOURIAN, AND T. WILL RE: INSURANCE ISSUES FOR PLAN AND NEGOTIATIONS WITH INSURERS RE: SAME.	1.70	1,870.00	007	60464317
11/13/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO THE PLAN AND OTHER PLAN-RELATED ISSUES (1.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: THIRD PARTY RELEASES IN CONNECTION WITH POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO PLAN CONFIRMATION (1.5).	3.00	2,940.00	007	60638667
11/15/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED EDITS TO THE PLAN AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND FOLEY TEAM RE: SAME.	0.50	490.00	007	60639323

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
 30180.0005
 2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO PLAN FROM E. KHATCHATOURIAN AND EMAIL TEAM RE SAME.	0.20	290.00	007	60477560
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO FOLEY PROPOSED REVISIONS TO INSURANCE/INSURED CLAIM PROVISIONS IN PLAN, AND EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME.	0.40	440.00	007	60473852
11/16/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED EDITS TO THE PLAN AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH AND FOLEY TEAM RE: SAME (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.2).	0.60	588.00	007	60639345
11/16/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH C. HANNON (EY) RE: WIND DOWN BUDGET.	0.10	84.50	007	60533406
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE RE PLAN ISSUES.	0.10	145.00	007	60488679
11/17/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH K. BUONO, WEIL, FOLEY AND HANSEN RAYNOLDS TEAMS RE: INSURANCE AND PLAN ISSUES (1.2); INCORPORATE CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO THE PLAN PER DISCUSSIONS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS AND CORPORATE TEAM RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.3); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR CERTAIN DOCUMENTS TO BE INCLUDED IN PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.3).	2.80	2,744.00	007	60639390
11/17/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	0.10	84.50	007	60533392
11/17/20	Liu, Ting COMPILE LIST OF DOCUMENTS FOR THE AMENDED PLAN.	0.30	219.00	007	60487540
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.70	1,015.00	007	60499020

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH FOLEY TEAM, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BERDINI RE PLAN (.5); REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND EMAIL TO TEAM RE SAME (.1).				
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH CARMODY TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES.	0.30	435.00	007	60499108
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH T. WILL, E. KHATCHATOURIAN, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.5); CALL WITH CARMODY TEAM, J. MYERS, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3).	0.80	880.00	007	60495825
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW ADDITIONAL CHANGES TO PLAN LANGUAGE FOR INSURER COMMENTS FROM E. KHATCHATOURIAN.	0.20	220.00	007	60495963
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: CORPORATE DOCUMENTS TO BE AMENDED IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	0.10	110.00	007	60496013
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH T. WILL AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: INSURANCE PROVISIONS IN THE PLAN.	0.10	110.00	007	60685288
11/18/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW INSURANCE-RELATED COMMENTS FROM E. KHATCHATOURIAN TO THE PLAN (0.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: INSURANCE-RELATED COMMENTS TO THE PLAN (0.5); CALL WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: PLAN CONFIRMATION (0.3); FOLLOW-UP CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: SAME (0.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR PLAN CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.8); REVIEW ADDITIONAL PLAN CHANGES FROM FOLEY AND CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY AND BROWN RUDNICK TEAMS RE: SAME (0.5).	2.80	2,744.00	007	60639417
11/18/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH J. DE SOLE AND T. PEENE RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT RESEARCH (.2); CALL WITH CARMODY TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION PROCESS (.3).	0.50	422.50	007	60533466

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, J. MYERS, AND CARMODY ON PLAN CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS.	0.30	219.00	007	60497066
11/18/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT FOR J. MYERS.	2.00	500.00	007	60638082
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT.	0.10	145.00	007	60581341
11/19/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK AND WEIL TEAMS RE: INSURANCE AND PLAN ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.3); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES (1.2).	2.00	1,960.00	007	60639564
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT TALKING POINTS ON PLAN FOR CREDITOR INQUIRIES.	0.30	330.00	007	60532845
11/20/20	Blechman, Eli DRAFT TALKING POINTS RE: PLAN TREATMENT AND ALLOCATIONS OF NET CASH PROCEEDS PER REQUEST FROM K. BUONO (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH UCC AND D. HOEHNE RE: INSURANCE CHANGES TO PLAN (0.3); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: THIRD-PARTY RELEASES FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.5).	3.00	2,940.00	007	60640432
11/20/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN DISTRIBUTION TALKING POINTS.	0.40	404.00	007	60533832
11/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN (.2).	0.20	290.00	007	60582065
11/22/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: CALIFORNIA CARB INQUIRY RE: PLAN.	0.20	220.00	007	60517866
11/23/20	Blechman, Eli	2.50	2,450.00	007	60641956

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH WEIL BFR AND ENVIRONMENTAL TEAMS RE: CARB ISSUES (PLAN-RELATED) (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY TEAM RE: SAME (0.3); CALLS AND CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: PLAN CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY AND BROWN RUDNICK RE: PLAN CHANGES (INSURANCE-RELATED) (0.2); REVIEW DRAFT OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT FROM UCC AND RESEARCH RELEVANT PRECEDENT (1.0).				
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	007	60632142
	CONDUCT RESEARCH ON ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS FILED IN SALE CASES PLAN SUPPLEMENTS (.2).				
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.20	146.00	007	60536897
	CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN ON CONFIRMATION BRIEF WORKSTREAMS.				
11/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	007	60583243
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND M. MORTON RE PLAN COMMENTS FROM CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL REGULATORS (.2).				
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	007	60545879
	REVIEW EMAILS FROM J. MYERS AND FOLEY TEAM RE: AMENDMENT OF CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT.				
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	007	60546363
	CALL WITH O. LASHKO, E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: PLAN COMMENTS AND POST-CLOSING STATEMENT.				
11/24/20	Blechman, Eli	3.80	3,724.00	007	60696491

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND M. MORTON RE: TRANSFER OF CARB-RELATED LIABILITIES TO PURCHASER PER SALE TRANSACTION AND PROPOSED PLAN CARVE-OUT LANGUAGE (0.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, M. MORTON AND COUNSEL TO CARB RE: SAME (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY RE: SAME (0.2); REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION FROM EY RE: SAME (0.2); REVIEW SALE ORDER AND CORRESPOND WITH M. MORTON RE: SAME (0.2); CONDUCT ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE: SAME (0.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND O. LASHKO RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES IN THE PLAN (0.2); MAKE CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES IN THE PLAN (0.3); REVISE PROPOSED PLAN CARVE-OUT LANGUAGE FROM CARB AND DISCUSS WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PLAN ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS (RE: EXCULPATION AND RELEASES) (1.0).				
11/24/20	Myers, Janiel	1.80	1,521.00	007	60632106
	DRAFT CONFIRMATION ORDER (1.4); DRAFT EMAIL MEMO TO FOLEY TEAM RE: AMENDED ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS IN PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.4).				
11/24/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.20	1,606.00	007	60546078
	DRAFT INSERT FOR OPT-OUT PORTION OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF.				
11/24/20	Paddock, Alyssa	1.10	929.50	007	60639389
	REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT PRECEDENTS.				
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	007	60583272
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN ISSUES (.1).				
11/25/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	007	60561294
	EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: PLAN COMMENTS.				
11/25/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.60	1,760.00	007	60561301

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH INSURER GROUP RE: PLAN COMMENTS (.9); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: MODIFICATIONS TO PLAN TO RESOLVE COMMENTS, AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.5); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE: AMENDED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE: AMENDMENT OF CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND FINAL COMMENTS TO NMTC LENDERS' STIPULATION TO LIFT STAY IN CONNECTION WITH RESERVE ACCOUNTS (.1).				
11/25/20	Blechman, Eli	4.00	3,920.00	007	60726905
	CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS AND COUNSEL FOR INSURER GROUP RE: INSURANCE CHANGES TO THE PLAN (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND A. PADDOCK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (0.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: SAME (0.3); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS WITH J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN AND CONFIRMATION (0.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: CARVE-OUTS FOR GOVERNMENT AGENCIES IN CHAPTER 11 PLANS (1.2).				
11/25/20	Myers, Janiel	7.00	5,915.00	007	60632220
	REVIEW EMAILS RE SEC CARVEOUTS IN PLAN AND CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: SAME (.2); DRAFT CONFIRMATION ORDER (6.3); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH T. MOHAN (FOLEY) RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.2); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.2); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1).				
11/25/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	3.10	2,263.00	007	60554651
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT OPT OUT CONFIRMATIONS (1.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR GOVERNMENT CARVE OUTS (1.6).				
11/25/20	Paddock, Alyssa	2.40	2,028.00	007	60639377
	REVIEW PRECEDENT AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT.				
11/25/20	Martir, Martha	1.10	1,111.00	007	60578513
	CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.6); CONFIRM SALE RELATED DOCUMENTS RE SAME (0.5).				
11/25/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	2.00	500.00	007	60789533

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
 30180.0005
 2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONDUCT PLAN SUPPLEMENT RESEARCH FOR A. PADDOCK.				
11/26/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	0.20	290.00	007	60583273
11/26/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH H. GUTHRIE AND A. KIM RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND AMENDED ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS.	0.10	84.50	007	60632143
11/27/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT CONFIRMATION ORDER.	2.70	2,281.50	007	60632216
11/27/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW PRECEDENT AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT.	1.90	1,605.50	007	60639385
11/28/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT CONFIRMATION ORDER.	5.60	4,732.00	007	60632137
11/29/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	0.10	110.00	007	60576616
11/29/20	Blechman, Eli DRAFT CARVE-OUT PROVISION IN THE CHAPTER 11 PLAN FOR CERTAIN GOVERNMENTAL AGENCIES AND CONDUCT RELATED RESEARCH.	1.80	1,764.00	007	60732863
11/29/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT.	3.40	2,873.00	007	60639398
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.80	1,160.00	007	60596933

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN CONFIRMATION-RELATED TASKS (.2); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE PLAN COMMENTS FROM U.S. GOVERNMENT (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND J. MYERS RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.5).				
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora	5.00	5,500.00	007	60590696
	REVIEW PLAN SUPPLEMENT ISSUES AND EMAILS WITH J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (1); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.5); REVIEW DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION ORDER (3.1); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: RESOLUTION OF PLAN COMMENTS (.4).				
11/30/20	Kim, Aileen	2.00	2,200.00	007	60588511
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: CHARTER AMENDMENT (1.1). REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: POST CLOSING STATEMENT (0.9).				
11/30/20	Blechman, Eli	7.00	6,860.00	007	60736796
	REVIEW AND REVISE CHAPTER 11 PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM DOJ AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAM RE: ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES (1.0); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF PLAN (0.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: AMENDED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS (IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN SUPPLEMENT) (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL CORPORATE AND CARMODY TEAMS AND J. MYERS RE: SAME AND REVIEW RELATED DRAFTS (0.5); REVIEW COMMENTS TO THE PLAN FROM CHUBB AND CONDUCT RELATED RESEARCH RE: CERTAIN INSURANCE ASPECTS OF THE PLAN (1.0); CONDUCT RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH CONFIRMATION AND POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (1.5); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT ISSUES (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND DISCUSS WITH A. PADDOCK AND D. HOEHNE (1.5).				
11/30/20	Myers, Janiel	2.50	2,112.50	007	60632146

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONDUCT RESEARCH ON AMENDED ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.5); REVIEW CORRESPOND WITH COMPANY TO DETERMINE USES OF CERTAIN PROPERTIES IN RELATION TO ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE (.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN TO DISCUSS PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.5); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: SCHEDULE OF RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION (.1); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.2); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM D. HOEHNE ON CONFIRMATION ORDER DRAFT (.5).				
11/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	3.10	2,263.00	007	60590352
	CORRESPOND WITH ENVIRONMENTAL TEAM AND K. BUONO ON DOJ INQUIRY (.2); DRAFT OPT OUT INSERT FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.6); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN ON PLAN WORKSTREAMS (.3).				
11/30/20	Paddock, Alyssa	8.90	7,520.50	007	60639395
	FINALIZE REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND CIRCULATE (3.2); DISCUSS DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF WITH E. BLECHMAN (.5); REVIEW PRECEDENT AND CASE HISTORY IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (5.2).				
11/30/20	Zhang, John	1.20	714.00	007	60587195
	DRAFT NOTICE OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT.				
11/30/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	2.00	500.00	007	60789696
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR S. SCHNORRENBURG.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 007 - Chapter 11		151.70	\$141,606.50		
Plan/Confirmation/Implementation/Plan Supplement:					
11/01/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.80	1,980.00	008	60354458
	EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND T. ROTH RE: BOARD MEETING AND RESOLUTIONS FOR SAME (.2); EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1); DRAFT SLIDES FOR BOARD DECK ON PLAN CHANGES AND SERP VALUATION (1.5).				
11/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	008	60373491

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND K. BUONO RE BOARD MEETING (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD MINUTES (.2).				
11/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD DECK (.2).	0.20	290.00	008	60373619
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT RESOLUTIONS FOR COMPENSATION COMMITTEE RE: SERPS CLAIMS VALUATION AND EMAIL FROM MERCER IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.2); CALL WITH K. BUONO RE: SERP CLAIMS. AND BOARD MEETING (.3).	0.50	550.00	008	60361024
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: BOARD MEETING.	0.20	220.00	008	60361047
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED RESOLUTIONS FOR TERMINATION OF BENEFIT PLANS.	0.10	110.00	008	60361067
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. FICKS RE: BOARD MATERIALS RE: AMENDED CHAPTER 11 PLAN.	0.20	220.00	008	60361071
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVISE/DRAFT BOARD SLIDES (2.5); EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.2).	2.70	2,970.00	008	60361079
11/02/20	Blechman, Eli DRAFT SLIDES FOR BOARD PRESENTATION RE: AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.5); REVISE SLIDES FOR BOARD PRESENTATION RE: AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER COMMENTS FROM D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH (1.5).	4.00	3,920.00	008	60850478
11/02/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K.	1.40	1,372.00	008	60366294
11/03/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.20	255.00	008	60377058

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW BOARD DECK AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM K. BUONO AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.2).				
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE BOARD MEETING (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE BOARD MEETING (.2); EMAIL TO D. HOEHNE RE BOARD DECK (.1); PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING TO DISCUSS CHANGES TO PLAN AND SERP ISSUES (.8).	1.20	1,740.00	008	60388682
11/03/20	Wessel, Paul J. PREP AND PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING TO DISCUSS RESTRUCTURING MATTERS, INCLUDING PBGC SETTLEMENT TERMS AND SERP.	1.00	1,695.00	008	60379304
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: BOARD MEETING.	0.30	330.00	008	60389027
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING.	0.80	880.00	008	60389089
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVISE BOARD DECK (.6); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.2).	0.80	880.00	008	60389138
11/03/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE SLIDES IN BOARD DECK RELATING TO AMENDED PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM D. HOEHNE (0.5).	0.50	490.00	008	60540696
11/03/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K.	0.50	490.00	008	60379415
11/05/20	Himelfarb, P.J. DISCUSS 8-K TIMING (.1); REVIEW DRAFT 8-K (.2); REVIEW CHANGES FROM R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE (.1).	0.40	520.00	008	60608028
11/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	008	60407632

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON 8-K (.1).				
11/05/20	Hochne, Debora	0.40	440.00	008	60401293
	REVIEW DRAFT 8-K FOR FILING OF AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
11/05/20	Holt, Andrew	0.80	784.00	008	60403797
	DRAFT 8-K (.7); REVIEW EMAILS (.1).				
11/06/20	Himelfarb, P.J.	0.30	390.00	008	60607922
	REVIEW COMMENTS FROM K. BUONO AND DISCUSS WITH A. HOLT.				
11/06/20	Holt, Andrew	1.20	1,176.00	008	60410206
	DRAFT FORM 8-K (1.0), ATTENTION TO EMAILS RE SAME (.2).				
11/09/20	Himelfarb, P.J.	0.80	1,040.00	008	60608081
	REVIEW 8-K (.2) AND K. BUONO AND R. BERKOVICH'S COMMENTS ON SAME (.3) AND FURTHER REVISED VERSIONS OF SAME (.3).				
11/09/20	Hochne, Debora	0.20	220.00	008	60463354
	CONFER WITH A. HOLT RE: REVISED 8-K FOR APPROVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
11/09/20	Holt, Andrew	1.10	1,078.00	008	60421303
	DRAFT 8-K (.6), COORDINATE FILING (.3) REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE SAME (.2).				
11/18/20	Himelfarb, P.J.	0.30	390.00	008	60608313
	REVIEW AND DISCUSS MOR 8-K.				
11/19/20	Holt, Andrew	0.40	392.00	008	60514005
	ATTENTION TO EMAILS RE: 8-K (.2), DRAFT 8-K (.2).				
11/20/20	Himelfarb, P.J.	0.30	390.00	008	60523952

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DISCUSS 8-K AND EXMARK SETTLEMENT.				
11/20/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K (.8), REVIEW COURT ORDER IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.3).	1.10	1,078.00	008	60514019
11/21/20	Himelfarb, P.J. REVIEW A. HOLT'S COMMENTS TO THE 8-K.	0.30	390.00	008	60608321
11/23/20	Himelfarb, P.J. DISCUSS EXMARK SETTLEMENT AS RELATES TO DISCLOSURE REQUIREMENTS (.3); SEND E-MAILS RE SAME (.3); FURTHER DISCUSS 8-K (.3).	0.90	1,170.00	008	60608450
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS RE: FINALIZING 8-K ON MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING.	0.10	110.00	008	60539947
11/23/20	Holt, Andrew COORDINATE 8-K FILING.	0.50	490.00	008	60538900
11/23/20	Paddock, Alyssa DRAFT SETTLEMENT LANGUAGE FOR 8K.	0.50	422.50	008	60639392
11/24/20	Himelfarb, P.J. CONSIDER AND DISCUSS NEED FOR FILING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND SEND E-MAILS RE SAME.	0.50	650.00	008	60592620
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH PJ HIMELFARB RE SEC ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	008	60583208
SUBTOTAL TASK 008 - Corporate Governance/Securities:		27.00	\$30,247.50		
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.30	219.00	009	60359903

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE CV AND SHIPPERS MATRICES FOR DISTRIBUTION TO NOTICE PARTIES AND DISTRIBUTING THE SAME.				
11/02/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE CRITICAL VENDOR MATRIX.	0.40	404.00	009	60363587
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: MOTIONS FOR PAYMENT OF 503(B)(9) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES AND LIFT STAY MOTIONS.	0.40	440.00	009	60401376
11/06/20	Martir, Martha CONDUCT RESEARCH RE RECLAMATION CLAIMS.	1.70	1,717.00	009	60409081
11/12/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE RE VENDOR AGREEMENT.	0.10	73.00	009	60450224
11/16/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE STIPULATIONS RESOLVING 503(B)(9) CLAIMS.	3.20	3,232.00	009	60685111
11/18/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH COUNSEL TO AAVID AND BOYD RE TODAY'S HEARING (0.3); CALL WITH EY RE 503(B)(9) CLAIMS (0.5); COMMENT ON 503(B)(9) STIPULATION (0.5).	1.30	1,313.00	009	60496471
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPOND WITH G. GIORDANO (EY) RE CRITICAL VENDOR MATRICES.	0.10	73.00	009	60536856
11/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah FINALIZE CRITICAL VENDOR AND SHIPPERS MATRICES FOR NOVEMBER.	0.20	146.00	009	60590382
SUBTOTAL TASK 009 - Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims:		7.70	\$7,617.00		

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND TEAM RE: DBS ACCOUNT DISSOLUTION.	0.30	330.00	010	60463845
SUBTOTAL TASK 010 - DIP Financing/Cash Management:		0.30	\$330.00		
11/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.6).	0.60	870.00	011	60363454
11/01/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.2).	0.40	440.00	011	60354390
11/01/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	0.50	490.00	011	60539098
11/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS (2.5); DRAFT SHELL OMNIBUS REPLY TO REJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.5).	6.00	4,380.00	011	60350437
11/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BALLOTS (.2).	0.20	290.00	011	60373222
11/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAIL WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); CONFER WITH ATTORNEYS FOR INSURANCE COMPANIES RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.6); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).	1.40	2,030.00	011	60373642
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI AND E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISED BALLOTS.	0.10	110.00	011	60361008

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORREBERG RE: RECOVERY ANALYSIS SECTION OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN (PARTIAL), S. SCHNORREBERG AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.4).	0.80	880.00	011	60361033
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora FOLLOW UP WITH B. MARKS RE: RECOVERY ANALYSIS.	0.30	330.00	011	60361054
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS ON BALLOTS (.2);.	0.20	220.00	011	60361066
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FILED OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND S. SCHNORREBERG'S SUMMARY THEREOF.	0.50	550.00	011	60361068
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH B. MARKS AND J. HENRICH RE: UPDATE RECOVERY ANALYSIS/CLAIMS POOL ANALYSIS, INCLUDING FOR UPDATE TO BOARD (.2); REVIEW REVISED SOLICITATION FORM OF NOTEHOLDER BALLOT/EXHIBITS AND E. BERDINI COMMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (1).	1.20	1,320.00	011	60361086
11/02/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH COUNSEL TO THE PBGC, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND K. BUONO RE: PBGC'S REQUESTED CHANGES TO THE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	0.80	784.00	011	60538827
11/02/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORREBERG RE: AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND AMENDED PLAN (0.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORREBERG RE: AMENDED RECOVERY ANALYSIS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI RE: AMENDED BALLOTS AND REVIEW AMENDED BALLOTS (0.4).	1.20	1,176.00	011	60539100
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	6.80	4,964.00	011	60359860

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE ON RECOVERY ANALYSIS AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ACCORDING TO DISCUSSIONS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE (2.0); RESEARCH ON PRECEDENT FOR REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (2.0); PREPARE SLIDE ON EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR BOARD MEETING (.6); REVIEW INSURER OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); REVIEW U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); REVIEW R. BERKOVICH AND E. BERDINI COMMENTS TO BALLOTS (.5).				
11/02/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	3.30	2,409.00	011	60616672
	CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHONORRENBURG RE: REVISE BALLOTS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISE BALLOTS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE BALLOTS (2.4); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: REVISED BALLOTS (0.4).				
11/02/20	Citron, Andrew	0.50	465.00	011	60673846
	REVIEW ASBESTOS INSURERS OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5).				
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.80	1,160.00	011	60388734
	REVIEW INSURER OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND EMAIL TEAM RE SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE RESPONSE TO OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	3.10	3,410.00	011	60389034
	REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVIEW PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH REPLY TO OBJECTIONS AND IN PREPARATION FOR BOARD MEETING (2.3); CALL WITH A. CITRON, E. BLECHMAN, S. SCHNORRENBURG AND R. BERKOVICH RE: REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (.4) FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH TEAM AND CARMODY RE: SAME (.1).				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	011	60389090
	EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: CHANGES TO NOTES CLAIMS BALLOT.				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	011	60389139

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW FILED INSURERS' OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: FILED OBJECTIONS (.1).				
11/03/20	Blechman, Eli	3.00	2,940.00	011	60540702
	REVIEW OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FILED BY THE U.S. TRUSTEE AND THE SEC (1.0); CONDUCT RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RELATING TO OPT-OUT MECHANISM AND RELEASES (1.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE: OBJECTIONS TO MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5).				
11/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	7.50	5,475.00	011	60374053
	REVIEW SEC OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); RESEARCH OPT OUT PROVISIONS IN PRECEDENT AND CASE LAW IN CONNECTION WITH SEC OBJECTION (2.0); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ACCORDING TO K. BUONO COMMENTS (.7); CALL WITH J. HENRICH ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT IN RESPONSE TO THE SAME (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (.7); DRAFT REPLY TO SEC AND U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.3).				
11/03/20	Berdini, Elisabeth	2.00	1,460.00	011	60616582
	CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: OPT OUTS (0.1); REVIEW PRECEDENT RE: OPT OUTS (0.3); REVIEW PRECEDENT RE: BALLOT STRUCTURE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: BALLOTS (0.6); REVIEW AND REVISE BALLOTS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: BALLOT STRUCTURE (0.4).				
11/03/20	Citron, Andrew	0.70	651.00	011	60673611
	WEIL TEAM CALL RE: DRAFT RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.7).				
11/03/20	Peene, Travis J.	2.10	525.00	011	60417532
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: DEBTORS REPLIES TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS IN VARIOUS CHAPTER 11 CASES FOR S. SCHNORRENBERG.				
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.20	1,320.00	011	60393370
	REVIEW REVISED NOTES CLAIM BALLOTS (.1); REVIEW FOLEY TEAM CHANGES TO INSURANCE RELATED SECTIONS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.8); FOLLOW UP WITH T. WILL RE: QUESTIONS ON SAME (.3).				
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	011	60393395

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW RESEARCH RE: OPT-OUTS FOR THIRD-PARTY RELEASES.				
11/04/20	Blechman, Eli	5.80	5,684.00	011	60543262
	REVIEW AND REVISE DEBTORS' OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.3); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, A. CITRON AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: SAME (0.8); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.2); FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE DEBTORS' OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO APPROVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.5).				
11/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	6.00	4,380.00	011	60390374
	DRAFT REPLY TO SEC AND U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.6); ANALYZE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR POTENTIAL EDITS IN LIGHT OF INSURERS' OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW AND INCORPORATE FOLEY CHANGES TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ON INSURANCE SECTION (.9); REVIEW UCC COMMENTS TO THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND INCORPORATING THE SAME (.6); REVIEW RESEARCH FROM CARMODY RELATED TO OPT OUT PROVISIONS (.3); CALL WITH A. CITRON ON INSURER OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON ON PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (.9); CIRCULATING REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR COMMENTS (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION REPLY (.3); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION REPLY (.5).				
11/04/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.80	1,314.00	011	60614608
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: NOTEHOLDER BALLOTS (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE BALLOTS (1.6); CORRESPOND WITH UCC RE: UPDATE NOTEHOLDER BALLOTS (0.1).				
11/04/20	Citron, Andrew	1.60	1,488.00	011	60673530
	DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG AND E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISIONS FOR INSURER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).				
11/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	3.30	4,785.00	011	60407590
	REVIEW EMAILS RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE PLAN AND STATUS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT APPROVAL HEARING (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.6); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE SAME (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); CALL WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS ON RECOVERY ANALYSIS FROM R. BERKOVICH (.1); REVIEW RESEARCH ON OPT-OUTS FOR THIRD PARTY RELEASES (.6); REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED SOLICITATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS (.3); REVIEW FURTHER REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); REVIEW REVISED CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE (.1); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.2).	1.70	1,870.00	011	60401288
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); REVIEW DRAFT OF REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (3.8); CALLS (X2) WITH A. CITRON RE: REPLY TO INSURERS' OBJECTION (.6).	4.90	5,390.00	011	60401331
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW HANSEN REYNOLDS COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE: WISCONSIN COVERAGE ACTION.	0.10	110.00	011	60401365
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON, S. SCHNORRENBURG AND R. BERKOVICH RE: AMENDED PLAN, AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, AND REPLY BRIEF TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS.	0.30	330.00	011	60401384
11/05/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, A. CITRON AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: DEBTORS' REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE DEBTORS' REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE CHANGES TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, A. CITRON AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: UPDATE VERSIONS OF PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATE VERSION OF PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED EXHIBITS (1.6); FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE DEBTORS' REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2).	6.60	6,468.00	011	60569984
11/05/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	13.00	9,490.00	011	60400318

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY BASED ON E. BLECHMAN COMMENTS (2.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON ON THE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT STATUS (.4); CALL WITH R. EGGMAN RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.1); INCORPORATING D. HOEHNE EDITS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (1.5); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND A. CITRON (.3); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY TO R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS (1.5); CALL WITH A. CITRON AND HANSEN REYNOLDS ON INSURANCE ISSUES (.3); PREPARE OBJECTION RESPONSE CHART (3.0); REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND IMPLEMENTING THEM (.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON (.3); REVISE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (1.5).				
11/05/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	4.60	3,358.00	011	60614241
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: UPDATE SOLICITATION EXHIBITS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS (0.2); DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED PLAN (0.6); CIRCULATE NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED PLAN TO E. BLECHMAN (0.1); DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.4); CIRCULATE NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO E. BLECHMEN (0.1); PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS (1.1); PREPARE/FINALIZE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS C-1 TO C-3 (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: NOTICE OF AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS AND AMENDED EXHIBITS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE (1.1); CIRCULATE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE TO D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN (0.3).				
11/05/20	Citron, Andrew	5.00	4,650.00	011	60673486
	DRAFT STANDING ARGUMENT RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.2); CALL WITH S. SCHORRENBERG AND E. BLECHMAN RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (.3); INTERNAL WEIL TEAM CALL RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND INSURERS OBJECTION (.4); CALL WITH HANSEN REYNOLDS RE: POTENTIAL BUYBACK AND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); CALL WITH A. FLIMAN RE: OUTSTANDING INSURANCE ISSUES FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).				
11/05/20	Peene, Travis J.	3.00	750.00	011	60417413
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: CASES AND PLEADINGS CITED IN THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY FOR S. SCHNORRENBERG (2.5); ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED PLEADINGS FOR R. BERKOVICH (.5).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON NOTICE OF SOLICITATION EXHIBITS (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN AND REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REPLY TO OBJECTIONS (.8); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.2); CALL WITH TEAM RE SAME (.3); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1); COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); CALL WITH TEAM RE DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, AND EXHIBITS (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVIEW FOLEY COMMENTS TO DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1).	4.40	6,380.00	011	60418198
11/06/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); MULTIPLE CALLS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN (X4) (.8); CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: REPLY (.1); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON, E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBURG (X2) RE: REPLY (.2); CALL WITH O. LASHKO RE: RESOLVING U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTION AND REPLY (.2); CALL WITH U.S. TRUSTEE, CARMODY, G. WILLARD, AND BROWN RUDNICK TEAM RE: U.S. TRUSTEE COMMENTS TO PLAN (.6); FOLLOW UP CALL RE: SAME WITH R. EGGMAN AND T. RISKE (.2); CALL WITH E. KHATCHOURIAN RE: INSURANCE RELATED PLAN PROVISIONS AND REPLY (.2); CALL WITH E. KHATCHOURIAN, T. WILL, R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON AND E. BLECHMAN RE: INSURANCE NEUTRALITY PROVISIONS IN PLAN (.5); CALL WITH O. LASHKO, M. SCHLAN, E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: CHAPTER 11 PLAN CHANGES (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.8); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.2); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF SOLICITATION EXHIBITS (.8).	10.40	11,440.00	011	60463265
11/06/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE THE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DEBTORS' MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.2); CALLS WITH UCC AND WEIL TEAMS RE: SAME (0.8); REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE THE AMENDED EXHIBITS TO PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (3.5).	8.50	8,330.00	011	60570020
11/06/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	13.10	9,563.00	011	60409028

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REPLY (.7); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON RE SAME (.5); REVISE AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.5); REVISE REPLY TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (6.0); FINALIZING DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (1.4).				
11/06/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.60	4,088.00	011	60616700
	REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING AMENDED EXHIBITS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: STATUS OF TODAY'S FILINGS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE WITH COMMENTS FROM R. BERKOVICH (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: REVISED NOTICE AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS D AND E TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MOTION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN, D. HOEHNE, AND R. BERKOVICH RE: REVISED EXHIBITS D AND E (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBIT F (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN, D. HOEHNE, AND R. BERKOVICH RE: STATUS OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RELATED FILINGS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN AND D. HOEHNE RE; NOTICES OF FILING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: STATUS OF FILINGS (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE SOLICITATION EXHIBITS AND FINALIZE EXHIBITS AND ORDER FOR FILING (2.4).				
11/06/20	Citron, Andrew	7.80	7,254.00	011	60673527
	DRAFT CHART OF RESPONSES TO THE OBJECTIONS TO THE APPROVAL OF THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.1); DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (5.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, D. HOEHNE, AND S. SCHORRENBERG RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); CALL WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS RE: INSURANCE POLICIES THAT COVER ASBESTOS LITIGATION (.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).				
11/06/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne	0.40	174.00	011	60418555
	REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH T. PEENE RE: SAME (.2).				
11/06/20	Gilchrist, Roy W.	2.70	1,080.00	011	60409053
	ASSIST IN PREPARATION OF DEBTORS' OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS TO DEBTORS' MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED RELIEF.				
11/07/20	Hoehne, Debora	10.10	11,110.00	011	60463226

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND E. BERDINI TO FINALIZE THE REVISED SOLICITATION MOTION EXHIBITS FOR FILING (.2); PREPARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING, INCLUDING PREPARE REMARKS FOR SAME (8.8); REVIEW ADDITIONAL RESEARCH FROM TEAM IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (.6); CALLS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SEC COMMENTS TO PLAN (.1); REVIEW EMAIL FROM KCC RE: BALLOTING SPREADSHEET (.4).				
11/07/20	Blechman, Eli	1.20	1,176.00	011	60569987
	REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE THE AMENDED EXHIBITS TO PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME.				
11/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	4.00	2,920.00	011	60409679
	FINALIZING FILINGS (.3); PREPARE SCRIPT INSERT FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (3.7).				
11/07/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	2.70	1,971.00	011	60616702
	FINALIZE AND FILE SOLICITATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS (2.7).				
11/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.60	870.00	011	60418241
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SCRIPT FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.4); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE HEARING (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ISSUES (.1).				
11/08/20	Hoehne, Debora	8.20	9,020.00	011	60480389
	PREPARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING, INCLUDING DRAFT AND REVISE HEARING OUTLINE/REMARKS AND PREPARE TO WALK THROUGH CHANGES ON DOCUMENTS (7.2); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: FURTHER RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.4); EMAILS WITH S. WILSON (AND BROWN RUDNICK) RE: U.S. TRUSTEE INFORMAL COMMENTS (.1); REVIEW ADDITIONAL RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH ARGUMENT FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.5).				
11/08/20	Blechman, Eli	5.00	4,900.00	011	60586724

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT SCRIPT IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING TO CONSIDER THE DEBTORS' MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SOLICITATION PROCEDURES - SUMMARIZE AMENDMENTS TO THE PLAN AND THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.0) AND SUMMARIZE SOLICITATION PROCEDURES AND SOLICITATION TIMELINE (2.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: PREPARATION FOR HEARING (0.5).				
11/08/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW PREPARATION MATERIALS FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.3).	0.30	219.00	011	60684632
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PREPARATION FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SCRIPT FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE PREPARATION FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. EGGMAN RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.1); CONFER WITH COURT RE HEARING ISSUE (.1).	0.80	1,160.00	011	60434615
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME AND FINALIZING SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS (.2).	0.20	290.00	011	60434637
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: FILING DOCUMENTS.	0.20	220.00	011	60463544
11/09/20	Blechman, Eli PREPARE SCRIPT FOR HEARING ON APPROVAL OF DEBTORS' DISCLOSURE AND SOLICITATION PROCEDURES MOTION (2.0); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, S. SCHNORRENBERG AND E. BERDINI RE: CHANGES TO PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED EXHIBITS TO ORDER FOLLOWING HEARING (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOLLOWING HEARING AND PER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS (1.5); REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS TO PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOLLOWING HEARING AND PER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS (2.2); REVIEW AND FINALIZE PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED EXHIBITS PER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS (2.5).	8.50	8,330.00	011	60615418
11/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.40	1,752.00	011	60421405

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE AND FINALIZE SOLICITATION VERSION OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
11/09/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.80	4,234.00	011	60590273
	CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (0.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND S. SCHNORRENBERG TO DISCUSS CHANGES TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER (0.2); REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND EXHIBITS (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND EXHIBITS (1.7); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN TO DISCUSS FILING AMENDED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, PLAN AND EXHIBITS (0.2); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBERG TO DISCUSS FILING AND SOLICITATION PROCESS NEXT STEPS (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND EXHIBITS (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMEN RE: REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND EXHIBITS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY AND KCC RE REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ORDER AND EXHIBITS (0.2).				
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	011	60463816
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: SOLICITATION PACKAGES AND NOTICING OF CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2).				
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.80	880.00	011	60463866
	REVIEW SOLICITATION MATERIALS/CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE (.4); REVIEW EMAILS WITH KCC RE: SAME (.3); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE AND PUBLICATION NOTICE (.1).				
11/10/20	Blechman, Eli	1.20	1,176.00	011	60615534
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS TO ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT PER COMMENTS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH D. HOEHNE (1.0).				
11/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	2.00	1,460.00	011	60616535
	CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: FINAL DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS FOR SOLICITATION (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT EXHIBITS FOR SOLICITATION (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: EXHIBITS FOR SOLICITATION (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMEN RE: EXHIBITS FOR SOLICITATION (0.1).				
11/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.40	292.00	011	60684757

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE AND PUBLICATION NOTICE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: SAME (0.1).				
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW BALLOTING SPREADSHEET FROM KCC.	0.30	330.00	011	60463833
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PUBLICATION VERSIONS OF CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE.	0.30	330.00	011	60464081
11/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW CONFIRMATION HEARING PUBLICATION NOTICES AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMEN AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: PUBLICATION NOTICE (0.1).	0.20	146.00	011	60590264
11/12/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: PUBLICATION AND SOLICITATION PACKAGES.	0.10	73.00	011	60590246
11/30/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/SOLICITATION PROCEDURES ORDER IN CONNECTION WITH CERTAIN VOTING/SOLICITATION ISSUES AND DISCUSS WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: SAME.	0.30	294.00	011	60736804
SUBTOTAL TASK 011 - Disclosure Statement/Solicitation/Voting:		212.30	\$191,168.00		
11/01/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES IN SERP VALUATION AND TERMINATION (0.6).	0.60	675.00	012	60350954
11/01/20	Roth, Tamara DISCUSS RESOLUTIONS APPROVING SERP CLAIMS CALCULATION METHODOLOGY WITH K. BUONO, D. HOEHNE, A. CIEPLUCH AND P. WESSEL.	0.70	651.00	012	60352902
11/02/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.90	1,147.50	012	60361140

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. RICHARDS AND Q. CHRISTIE RE WHETHER CERTAIN EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS SHOULD BE REJECTED BECAUSE THEY CONTINUE TO BE EXECUTORY (.5); EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS RE REVISIONS TO DRAFT NOTE TO RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE SAME (.4).				
11/02/20	Wessel, Paul J. WORK ON BOARD RESOLUTIONS FOR MEETING RE: SERP AND BENEFIT PLANS (1.1); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BOARD DICKSON (.4); RELATED EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH BRIGGS AND FOLEY (.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: PBGC COMMENTS ON PLAN DOCUMENTS (.2).	2.00	3,390.00	012	60369656
11/02/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON SERP COMPENSATION COMMITTEE RESOLUTIONS AND BENEFIT PLAN ARRANGEMENT TERMINATION (0.5) AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SAME (0.4); REVIEW ISSUES FROM PBGC ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4).	1.30	1,462.50	012	60475110
11/02/20	Roth, Tamara DRAFT RESOLUTIONS APPROVING SERP CLAIMS CALCULATION METHODOLOGY AND DISCUSS WITH P. WESSEL AND D. HOEHNE AND MERCER (1.1); REVIEW RESOLUTIONS APPROVING BENEFIT PLAN TERMINATIONS, DISCUSS WITH P. WESSEL AND PROVIDE COMMENTS (1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO BOARD DECK (1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SERP CLAIMS (1).	4.10	3,813.00	012	60363782
11/02/20	Richards, Lauren E. CONFER WITH N. PAPPAS AND Q. CHRISTIE RE ANALYSIS OF POTENTIAL REJECTION OF EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS (0.7); DRAFT SUMMARY TO WEIL BANKRUPTCY AND CORPORATE TEAMS RE ANALYSIS OF SAME (1.0).	1.70	1,581.00	012	60396989
11/02/20	Christie, Quinn CALL WITH N. PAPPAS AND L. RICHARDS RE OUTSTANDING EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS FOR BRIGGS AND STRATTON (0.8).	0.80	584.00	012	60378610
11/03/20	Margolis, Steven M.	1.30	1,462.50	012	60475182

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW ISSUES AND DOCUMENTATION ON BOARD MATERIALS FOR SERP, SERP ANALYSIS, BOARD RESOLUTIONS FOR 401(K) AND WELFARE PLAN TERMINATION (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH T. ROTH ON SERP ANALYSIS AND RESOLUTION (0.2); REVIEW CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO, D. HOENHNE, A. CIEPLUCH ON SAME (0.3).				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. SCHLAN RE: SERPS CLAIMS (.6); FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO K. BUONO (.2).	0.80	880.00	012	60389140
11/03/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE RESOLUTIONS AND BOARD DECK RELATING TO CALCULATION OF SERP CLAIMS AND OTHER MATTERS RELATING TO BANKRUPTCY PLAN.	0.50	465.00	012	60384904
11/03/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH RETIREE TO DISCUSS PENSION.	0.20	146.00	012	60850479
11/04/20	Wessel, Paul J. CONFERENCE WITH T. ROTH RE: SERP AND RELATED FOLLOW UP.	0.20	339.00	012	60396872
11/04/20	Roth, Tamara DISCUSS BOARD MEETING RE SERP CLAIMS WITH P. WESSEL (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE SERP CLAIMS (.1).	0.30	279.00	012	60393754
11/04/20	Richards, Lauren E. CALLS AND EMAILS WITH J. GRANELL OF ERNST AND YOUNG AND WEIL TEAM RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.3).	0.30	279.00	012	60393437
11/05/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES FROM P. PRICKETT ON EMPLOYEE TERMINATIONS AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SAME (0.6).	0.60	675.00	012	60475583
11/05/20	Roth, Tamara	0.90	837.00	012	60404080

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH EY RE SERP AND OTHER CLAIMS (.6); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE LETTER TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEE (.3).				
11/05/20	Richards, Lauren E.	0.90	837.00	012	60410533
	CONFER WITH WEIL TEAMS AND ERNST AND YOUNG RE TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.6); REVISE DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES RE TERMINATION OF BENEFITS (0.3).				
11/05/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.90	909.00	012	60403528
	DISCUSS WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT ISSUES WITH TEAM (.2); ANALYZE OPTIONS TO ADDRESS NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PROPOSAL (.7).				
11/06/20	Margolis, Steven M.	0.60	675.00	012	60475626
	REVIEW ISSUES AND CORRESPONDENCE ON EMPLOYEE TERMINATION LETTERS (0.3); REVIEW ISSUES FROM EY ON SERP ANALYSIS AND TREATMENT (0.3).				
11/06/20	Roth, Tamara	0.10	93.00	012	60417741
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE EMPLOYEE TERMINATION LETTER.				
11/06/20	Richards, Lauren E.	0.20	186.00	012	60410629
	FINALIZE AND EMAIL BRIGGS TEAM WITH REVISED DRAFT OF COMMUNICATION TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES (0.1); REVIEW J. GRANELL SUMMARY RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED (0.1).				
11/08/20	Roth, Tamara	0.50	465.00	012	60417749
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT AND SERP CLAIMS.				
11/09/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.80	1,020.00	012	60428024
	EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS AND EMAIL TO P. PRICKET RE WHETHER OR NOT ESTATE SHOULD TERMINATE EMPLOYMENT OF PERSONS ON LEAVE OF ABSENCE (.8).				
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	012	60434658
	REVIEW A. FLIMAN SUMMARY OF WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIMS AND EMAIL TO D. HOEHNE AND A. FLIMAN RE SAME (.2).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/09/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ANALYSIS FROM L. RICHARDS ON EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS AND TREATMENT IN BR AND COMMENTS ON SAME (1.1); REVIEW ISSUES FROM PAUL PRICKETT ON EMPLOYEE TERMINATION, INACTIVE EMPLOYEES AND EMPLOYEE CORRESPONDENCE ON SAME AND COMMENTS ON SAME (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH EY ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS AND UPDATE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON EMPLOYEE ISSUES AND REVIEW SERP ANALYSIS (0.4).	2.30	2,587.50	012	60423696
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK, S. MARGOLIS, AND T. ROTH RE: TESKE PROOF OF CLAIM (.7); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: EMPLOYEE ISSUES (.1).	0.80	880.00	012	60463395
11/09/20	Roth, Tamara CALL WITH UCC COUNSEL RE TESKE PROOF OF CLAIM (.7); DISCUSS CLAIMS UNDER LTIP AND EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE PLAN WITH S. MARGOLIS AND D. HOEHNE (.3).	1.00	930.00	012	60424259
11/09/20	Richards, Lauren E. EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND WEIL BENEFITS AND LABOR TEAMS RE TERMINATION OF PAYROLL AND BENEFITS FOR INACTIVE EMPLOYEES (0.4).	0.40	372.00	012	60422752
11/09/20	Christie, Quinn EMAILS FROM L. RICHARDS AND S. MARGOLIS RE TERMINATION OF REMAINING INACTIVE EMPLOYEES (0.1).	0.10	73.00	012	60426124
11/09/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATORS RE WORKERS' COMPENSATION ISSUES (.3); ANALYZE WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT, STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS AND CLAIMS SUBMISSION ISSUES (2.3).	2.60	2,626.00	012	60423912
11/10/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, S. MARGOLIS AND L. RICHARDS RE WEHTHER VARIOUS EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS AND BENEFITS DOCUMENTS REMAIN EXECUTORY AND TIMING FOR REJECTION OF SAME IN BANKRUPTCY (.4).	0.40	510.00	012	60435135

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH K. BUONO AND A. FLIMAN RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES (.2).	0.20	290.00	012	60435010
11/10/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPOND WITH PBGC AND BRIGGS ON PENSION ADMINISTRATION AND TRANSFER ISSUES (0.3) AND COMMENTS ON SAME (0.1); REVIEW EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS, CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS, SALARY REDUCTION AGREEMENTS, ELIP PROGRAM DOCUMENTS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS FOR CLAIMS ANALYSIS (1.7); REVIEW CHART FROM L. RICHARDS ON PROPOSED TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE AGREEMENTS (0.4); CONF. WITH WEIL TEAM ON EXECUTORY CONTRACTS AND CLASSIFICATION OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.6); RESEARCH ON TREATMENT OF CONTINUING RESTRICTIVE COVENANTS AND EXECUTORY CONTRACTS (0.6); REVIEW EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE PLAN ISSUES (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH T. ROTH ON CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND REVIEW SAME (0.2).	4.30	4,837.50	012	60432662
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH N. PAPPAS, L. RICHARDS, Q. CHRISTIE, S. MARGOLIS AND T. ROTH RE: EXECUTIVE EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS (.7); REVIEW ANALYSIS FROM L. RICHARDS PRIOR TO CALL (.4).	1.10	1,210.00	012	60464248
11/10/20	Roth, Tamara CALL WITH WEIL LABOR, BENEFITS AND BFR TEAMS RE EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS AND CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS (.7); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE PBGC ASSUMPTION OF PENSION PLAN (.2).	0.90	837.00	012	60433532
11/10/20	Richards, Lauren E. CONFER WITH WEIL BANKRUPTCY AND BENEFITS TEAMS RE POTENTIAL REJECTION OF EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS (0.8).	0.80	744.00	012	60441096
11/10/20	Christie, Quinn CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, L. RICHARDS, S. MARGOLIS, AND T. ROTH RE REJECTING OUTSTANDING EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS.	0.70	511.00	012	60436821
11/10/20	Fliman, Ariel ADDRESS WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT ARGUMENTS AND CALCULATION BASIS (2.0); PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT ADDRESSING WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT ISSUES (.3).	2.30	2,323.00	012	60428193

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/11/20	Fliman, Ariel REVIEW MATERIALS ADDRESSING WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIM HISTORY AND INSURANCE POLICY CANCELLATION ISSUES.	0.40	404.00	012	60442410
11/12/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS RE: CLAIMS OF 4 EMPLOYEES FOR PAYMENTS UNDER THEIR EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS.	0.20	255.00	012	60455620
11/12/20	Margolis, Steven M. RESEARCH ON DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES IN BANKRUPTCY (0.9); VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH A. ARIKAT, D. HOEHNE AND S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (0.4).	1.30	1,462.50	012	60454986
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO PAYROLL TAX AND EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.5); EMAILS WITH S. GOLDRING AND A. ARIKAT RE: PAYROLL TAX ISSUES (.1).	0.60	660.00	012	60464207
11/12/20	Roth, Tamara CALL WITH EY RE EMPLOYEE RELATED CLAIMS (.5); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES (.2).	0.70	651.00	012	60454661
11/12/20	Richards, Lauren E. CONFER WITH WEIL AND ERNST AND YOUNG TEAMS RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED AND RELATED EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS AND DRAFT EMAIL TO N. PAPPAS SUMMARIZING REVIEW (1.3).	1.80	1,674.00	012	60455084
11/12/20	Fliman, Ariel ANALYZE WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIM HISTORY DATA.	0.50	505.00	012	60452270
11/13/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. REVIEW FOUR FORMS OF DRAFT TERMINATION LETTERS TO EMPLOYEES ON VARIOUS TYPES OF LEAVE AS PER PREVIOUS MARKUP.	0.30	382.50	012	60457272
11/13/20	Margolis, Steven M.	2.50	2,812.50	012	60463136

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH D. BAGIN AND BRIGGS TEAM ON PENSION PLAN AND PBGC ISSUES (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE ON PLAN INVESTMENTS AND CONTINUATION OF POLICIES AND RESEARCH ON SAME (0.3); VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH BRIGGS AND EY ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS AND REVIEW MATERIALS FOR SAME (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON EMPLOYEE ISSUES AND LETTERS FOR INACTIVES (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH L. RICHARDS ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.2).				
11/13/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED BASED ON EMPLOYMENT AND CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS (0.3); REVIEW LETTERS TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES RE TERMINATION OF BENEFITS (0.2).	0.50	465.00	012	60461492
11/15/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW EMPLOYEE COMMUNICATIONS FROM P. PRICKETT AND K. BUONO AND COMMENTS ON SAME.	0.60	675.00	012	60463955
11/15/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE LETTERS TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES.	0.20	186.00	012	60466813
11/15/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LETTERS TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES RE TERMINATION OF BENEFITS.	0.30	279.00	012	60461586
11/16/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS RE COMMENTS TO COMMUNICATIONS TO EMPLOYEES BEING TERMINATED.	0.10	127.50	012	60480074
11/16/20	Wessel, Paul J. CONFERENCE CALL WITH BRIGGS AND FOLEY TO DISCUSS SERP MATTERS, MERCER RECORDS AND PENSION PLAN INVESTMENTS.	0.60	1,017.00	012	60478786
11/16/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW CHANGES TO EMPLOYEE TERMINATION LETTERS AND COMMENTS TO SAME (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH L. RICHARDS ON SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON SAME (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES FROM P. PRICKETT ON INSURANCE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. CIEPLUCH ON EMPLOYEE LETTERS AND PBGC ISSUES (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES FROM EY ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS, EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS, AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR SAME (1.4).	3.00	3,375.00	012	60474498

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
 30180.0005
 2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH K. BUONO, P. WESSEL, A. CIEPLUCH, AND P. PRICKETT RE: ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES FOR KESIP/SERP/DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLANS AND WIND DOWN OF SAME.	0.40	440.00	012	60473682
11/16/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE LETTERS TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES.	0.10	93.00	012	60476037
11/16/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INACTIVE EMPLOYEES RE TERMINATION OF PAYROLL AND BENEFITS AND EMAILS WITH WEIL TEAM RE SAME.	0.20	186.00	012	60513211
11/16/20	Fliman, Ariel ANALYZE WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIM HISTORY AND NY SECURITY PAYMENT PROPOSAL.	1.10	1,111.00	012	60473988
11/17/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, S. MARGOLIS, AND L. RICHARDS RE SUBSTANCE OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FOR LIFE INSURANCE, BONUSES, SALARY AND CHANGE OF CONTROL BENEFITS AND NEXT STEPS REGARDING ANALYSIS OF SUCH CLAIMS.	0.60	765.00	012	60480247
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW FORM RECEIVED RE WORKERS COMPENSATION (.1); CALL WITH A. FLIMAN AND NY WORKERS COMPENSATION BOARD RE SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. FLIMAN RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES (.1).	0.40	580.00	012	60488627
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH N. PAPPAS, L. RICHARDS, S. MARGOLIS, AND T. ROTH RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (1.1); REVIEW FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH S. MARGOLIS AND P. PRICKETT RE: CERTAIN EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.2).	1.30	1,430.00	012	60486330
11/17/20	Roth, Tamara CALL WITH WEIL BENEFITS, LABOR AND BFR TEAMS RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS.	1.30	1,209.00	012	60490877
11/17/20	Richards, Lauren E.	2.10	1,953.00	012	60513261

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW EMPLOYEE CLAIMED FILED (0.8); CONFER WITH N. PAPPAS RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED UNDER EMPLOYMENT AND CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS (0.3); CONFER WITH WEIL BANKRUPTCY AND BENEFITS TEAMS RE SAME (1.0).				
11/17/20	Fliman, Ariel	1.60	1,616.00	012	60488633
	PREPARE FOR DISCUSSION WITH NY REGULATOR RE WORKERS' COMPENSATION PAYMENT PROPOSAL (1.3); PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATOR ADDRESSING PAYMENT PROPOSALS (.3).				
11/18/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.20	255.00	012	60494004
	EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS RE EMPLOYMENT CLAIMS AND E&Y CALL RE SAME.				
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	012	60499025
	EMAIL TO A. PADDOCK RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH A. PADDOCK RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES (.3).				
11/18/20	Margolis, Steven M.	3.10	3,487.50	012	60496836
	REVIEW EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS, CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS, LIFE INSURANCE AGREEMENTS, EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE PROGRAMS AND RELATED AGREEMENTS FOR CLAIMS REVIEW (1.8); CONF. WITH D. HOEHNE ON P. PRICKETT DESCRIPTION OF CLAIMS (0.3); CONF. WITH EY, BRIGGS AND WEIL ON CLAIMS ISSUES (0.6); CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH L. LEVERSON ON CLAIMS ANALYSIS ISSUES (0.4).				
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	012	60495862
	CALL WITH A. FLIMAN, R. BERKOVICH AND M. SCHLAN RE: STATUS OF WORKERS COMPENSATION CLAIMS AND NEGOTIATIONS WITH STATES OVER ADMINISTRATION OF CLAIMS.				
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.80	880.00	012	60495904
	CALL WITH EY, PAUL PRICKETT, S. MARGOLIS, L. RICHARDS AND T. ROTH RE: EMPLOYEE CLAIMS.				
11/18/20	Roth, Tamara	1.00	930.00	012	60498856
	CALL WITH BRIGGS, EY AND WEIL LABOR, BENEFITS AND BFR TEAMS RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS, AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RELATED THERETO.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/18/20	Richards, Lauren E. CALL WITH ERNST AND YOUNG AND WEIL TEAMS TO DISCUSS EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.8); SUMMARY EMAIL TO N. PAPPAS RE SAME (0.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR W. FRAZIER TO ASSESS EMPLOYEE CLAIM (0.2).	1.10	1,023.00	012	60513278
11/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa DISCUSS WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES WITH R. BERKOVICH (.4); REVIEW HISTORY AND PRESENT ISSUES INSURANCE/WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUES (2.9); CALL WITH THE CREDITORS COMMITTEE RE: SAME (.4).	3.70	3,126.50	012	60522926
11/18/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE ADDRESSING WORKERS' COMPENSATION ISSUES (.3); REVIEW WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY, INSURANCE AND CANCELLATION ISSUES AHEAD OF CREDITORS' COMMITTEE CALL (1.4).	1.70	1,717.00	012	60496469
11/18/20	Fliman, Ariel REVIEW PREMIUM AUDIT AND NY SECURITY PROPOSAL CORRESPONDENCE.	0.50	505.00	012	60496782
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH EY, A. FLIMAN, AND A. PADDOCK RE WORKERS COMPENSATION, INSURANCE, AND EXMARK.	0.60	870.00	012	60581116
11/19/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ANALYSIS ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS, LIFE INSURANCE AND EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT AND CHANGE IN CONTROL AGREEMENTS.	0.70	787.50	012	60851955
11/19/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS.	0.10	93.00	012	60507983
11/19/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW WILLIAM REITMAN PROOF OF CLAIM (0.3); REVIEW BRIGGS' SCHEDULES (0.2).	0.50	365.00	012	60851956

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/19/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH E&Y ADDRESSING WORKERS' COMPENSATION ISSUES (.7); ATTEND TO INSURANCE AUDIT ISSUES, INVOICE PAYMENTS AND REGULATOR INFORMATION REQUESTS (.8); ADDRESS WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY ISSUES WITH SURETY PROVIDER (.3).	1.80	1,818.00	012	60514784
11/20/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM A. FLIMAN AND L. RICHARDS RE TERMINATION OF WORKER'S COMPENSATION POLICY (.2).	0.20	255.00	012	60512558
11/20/20	Wessel, Paul J. EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH BRIGGS AND FOLEY RE: PBGC ASSUMPTION OF PLAN.	0.20	339.00	012	60525597
11/20/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPONDENCE ON PBGC ISSUES AND PENSION ISSUES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. CIEPLUCH ON SAME (0.1).	0.30	337.50	012	60851957
11/20/20	Richards, Lauren E. EMAILS WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM AND N. PAPPAS RE TERMINATION OF WORKERS COMPENSATION INSURANCE (0.4).	0.40	372.00	012	60513363
11/20/20	Christie, Quinn EMAILS FROM L. RICHARDS AND N. PAPPAS RE WISCONSIN WORKERS' COMPENSATION POLICY (0.1).	0.10	73.00	012	60520338
11/22/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS.	0.30	279.00	012	60523061
11/22/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RELATING TO EMPLOYEE CLAIM FOR RETIREE LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS AND DRAFT SUMMARY OF SAME FOR N. PAPPAS (1.3).	1.30	1,209.00	012	60518912
11/22/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.30	219.00	012	60616363

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CALL WITH CLARY (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLARY RE: CALL ON 11.22 (0.2).				
11/23/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM A. FLIMAN RE TERMINATION OF WORKERS COMPENSATION POLICY (.1).	0.10	127.50	012	60542062
11/23/20	Fliman, Ariel ATTEND TO WORKERS' COMPENSATION CANCELLATION ISSUES, CLAIM HISTORY, ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM AND BENEFITS ISSUES.	1.40	1,414.00	012	60536789
11/24/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON TAX DEFERRALS AND CORRESPONDENCE FROM EY AND WEIL TEAM ON SAME.	0.30	337.50	012	60851959
11/24/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE EMPLOYMENT TAX ISSUES.	0.10	93.00	012	60548800
11/25/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPONDENCE ON PRE-PETITION EMPLOYMENT TAX DEFERRAL ISSUES (0.3); CONF. WITH WEIL TEAM ON SAME (0.6).	0.90	1,012.50	012	60851960
11/25/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE IRS EMPLOYMENT TAX CLAIMS.	0.30	279.00	012	60562696
11/30/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPOND WITH A. CIEPLUCH ON EMPLOYEE PLAN ISSUES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON PLAN ISSUES (0.2); REVIEW EY CHARTS ON EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.2).	0.60	675.00	012	60591593
SUBTOTAL TASK 012 - Employee Issues:		85.40	\$90,121.00		
11/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW EMAILS RE REJECTION MOTION (.1).	0.10	145.00	014	60363724

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/02/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.9).	0.90	760.50	014	60359980
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPOND WITH COUNSEL TO VENDOR RE CURE AMENDMENT.	0.30	219.00	014	60359855
11/02/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS CONTRACTS.	0.20	202.00	014	60363545
11/03/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (4.5).	4.50	3,802.50	014	60374156
11/03/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE OBJECTION AND COUNTERPARTY INQUIRIES (1.7); CORRESPOND WITH COUNTERPARTIES RE SAME (1.7).	3.40	3,434.00	014	60428747
11/03/20	Martir, Martha REVISE PROPOSED ORDER (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE POSTING OF SAME TO CASE WEBSITE (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE REJECTION MOTION (0.5).	0.90	909.00	014	60428788
11/04/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (2.7); DRAFT CURE NOTICE UPDATE TEMPLATE TO EY (1.0).	3.70	3,126.50	014	60406693
11/04/20	Martir, Martha	4.10	4,141.00	014	60428789

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ANALYSIS OF CURE OBJECTION AND EMAILS FROM COUNSEL RE SAME (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER RE RESPONSE TO COUNTERPARTY RE SAME (0.2); CALL WITH COUNTERPARTY AND C. LUSTER RE CONTRACT AMENDMENT (0.4); CALL WITH C. LUSTER RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS FORMAL AND INFORMAL CURE OBJECTIONS AND INQUIRIES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE TRANSFERRED LEASES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND COUNTERPARTY RE CURE AMOUNT RECONCILIATION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, EY, AND C. LUSTER RE CURE OBJECTION (0.5); ANALYSIS FOR TSA (1.0).				
11/05/20	Luster, Courtney	7.30	6,168.50	014	60406786
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (3.6); REVIEW AND ANALYZE EQUIPMENT LEASE CONTRACTS TO DETERMINE CURE AMOUNT ASSOCIATED WITH ASSUMED CONTRACTS TO RESOLVE DISPUTE (2.3); REVIEW REJECTION MOTION RE HR CONTRACTS (.4); CALL AND DISCUSSION WITH M. MARTIR AND EY RE HR CONTRACTS AND THE NEXT REJECTION EXHIBIT/MOTION (1.0).				
11/05/20	Martir, Martha	6.80	6,868.00	014	60428797
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH C. LUSTER RE TREATMENT OF HR RELATED CONTRACTS (1.0); ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS SPREADSHEETS RE SAME (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH COUNTERPARTIES RE CURE AMOUNT (1.2); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER RE STATUS OF CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY, NEW BRIGGS, AND C. LUSTER RE RECONCILIATION OF CLAIM (0.9); CALLS WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE TREATMENT OF CERTAIN HUMAN RESOURCE CONTRACTS (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE CURE OBJECTIONS (0.5).				
11/06/20	Luster, Courtney	4.50	3,802.50	014	60415821
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (2.0); CALL WITH EY (J. HESS) TO DISCUSS FINAL CURE NOTICE (.7); REVIEW CERTAIN VENDOR CONTRACTS TO DETERMINE ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT (1.8).				
11/06/20	Martir, Martha	2.20	2,222.00	014	60428795
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH NEW BRIGGS RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS CURE OBJECTIONS (1.1); ANALYSIS OF CONTRACT TO DETERMINE CURE AMOUNT (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE SAME (0.2).				
11/09/20	Luster, Courtney	0.60	507.00	014	60425033

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.6).				
11/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE AMENDMENT TO CURE AGREEMENT.	1.40	1,022.00	014	60421407
11/09/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW CURE AMENDMENTS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE SAME (0.3).	0.60	606.00	014	60422823
11/10/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.2).	1.20	1,014.00	014	60428822
11/10/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE CURE OBJECTIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH COMPANY RE REJECTION OF CERTAIN EMPLOYMENT RELATED AGREEMENTS (0.2).	0.40	404.00	014	60428810
11/11/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.2); ANALYZED CONTRACTS TO DETERMINE IF NEEDED TO BE REJECTED OR ADDED TO CURE NOTICE (.6); UPDATE REJECTION EXHIBIT (.7).	2.50	2,112.50	014	60437160
11/11/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE REJECTION MOTION (0.1); CALL WITH C. LUSTER RE REJECTION EXHIBIT (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND COUNTERPARTY RE SAME (0.2).	1.10	1,111.00	014	60439414
11/12/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.7); REVIEW CONTRACTS TO UPDATE REJECTION EXHIBIT FOR SECOND REJECTION MOTION (1.7).	3.40	2,873.00	014	60450450
11/12/20	Martir, Martha	1.00	1,010.00	014	60474107

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE AMOUNT RECONCILIATION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS CURE OBJECTIONS (0.5).				
11/13/20	Luster, Courtney	4.80	4,056.00	014	60458797
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (2.7); ANALYZED REJECTION EXHIBIT AND REVISE CONTRACTS THAT HAD BEEN ASSUMED AND ASSIGNED (2.1).				
11/13/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	014	60457114
	CORRESPOND WITH VENDOR COUNSEL RE NOTICE OF ASSUMPTION.				
11/13/20	Martir, Martha	0.60	606.00	014	60474435
	CORRESPOND WITH EY, KIRKLAND, AND NEW BRIGGS RE CURE AMOUNTS.				
11/15/20	Luster, Courtney	1.00	845.00	014	60459767
	UPDATE AND CURE NOTICE TEMPLATE (.5); EMAILS WITH OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.5).				
11/16/20	Luster, Courtney	3.30	2,788.50	014	60476810
	UPDATE AND DISTRIBUTED CURE NOTICE TEMPLATE (.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (2.8).				
11/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	014	60475371
	CORRESPOND WITH COUNSEL TO VENDOR RE CURE AGREEMENT AND CLAIMS.				
11/16/20	Martir, Martha	1.00	1,010.00	014	60474018
	CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE OBJECTION INQUIRIES (1.0).				
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	014	60486444
	CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: MOTION TO EXTEND LEASE ASSUMPTION/REJECTION DEADLINE (.1); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF SAME (.1).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED EXHIBIT TO OMBNIBUS REJECTION MOTION AND NOTICE THEREOF.	0.10	110.00	014	60486482
11/17/20	Luster, Courtney UPDATE AND CURE NOTICE TEMPLATE (.3); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.1); REVIEW, UPDATE, AND REVISE REJECTION EXHIBIT (2.8); COORDINATE AND FINALIZE UPDATE REJECTION EXHIBIT FOR FILING (.5).	4.70	3,971.50	014	60494466
11/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW CURE AMENDMENT.	0.50	365.00	014	60489090
11/17/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY, NEW BRIGGS, AND C. LUSTER RE REJECTION MOTION AND CURE NOTICE (1.1); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND C. LUSTER RE REVISED EXHIBIT TO REJECTION MOTION (1.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SAME (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH VARIOUS COUNTERPARTIES RE THE STATUS OF CURE OBJECTION AND REJECTION EXHIBIT (2.1); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICE TO REVISED EXHIBIT (0.7).	6.30	6,363.00	014	60496738
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING OMNIBUS MOTION TO REJECT CONTRACTS AND LEASES.	0.10	110.00	014	60495869
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: REJECTION DAMAGES BAR DATE NOTICE IN CONNECTION WITH OMNIBUS ORDER APPROVING REJECTION OF CONTRACTS.	0.20	220.00	014	60495876
11/18/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.7); DRAFT REJECTION ORDER NOTICE (2.2); DRAFT CURE NOTICE UPDATE TEMPLATE TO EY (1.1).	5.00	4,225.00	014	60494443
11/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	014	60497052

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH COUNSEL TO VENDOR RE CURE ISSUE.				
11/18/20	Martir, Martha	6.30	6,363.00	014	60496705
	PREPARE REVISED PROPOSED ORDER FOR REJECTION MOTION FOR POSTING ON CASE WEBSITE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE NOTICE AND CURE OBJECTIONS (2.8); REVISE REJECTION PROPOSED ORDER (0.7); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE THE NOTICE ACCOMPANYING SERVICE OF THE REJECTION ORDER (0.4); REVISE LANGUAGE FOR CONTRACT AMENDMENT (2.0).				
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	014	60532836
	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF REJECTION ORDER AND DEADLINE TO FILE REJECTION DAMAGES CLAIMS.				
11/19/20	Luster, Courtney	3.60	3,042.00	014	60506711
	REVIEW AND UPDATE REJECTION NOTICE (1.0); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.8); DRAFT CURE NOTICE UPDATE TEMPLATE TO EY (.8).				
11/19/20	Martir, Martha	5.40	5,454.00	014	60503757
	PREPARE REVISED PROPOSED ORDER FOR REJECTION MOTION FOR POSTING ON CASE WEBSITE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE NOTICE AND CURE OBJECTIONS (0.6); REVISE REJECTION PROPOSED ORDER (0.7); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE THE NOTICE ACCOMPANYING SERVICE OF THE REJECTION ORDER (0.4); CALL WITH VENDOR RE ASSUMPTION OF CONTRACTS (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE PAYMENT OF CURE AMOUNTS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE CURE NOTICE (0.5); REVIEW CURE EXHIBIT (1.6).				
11/20/20	Luster, Courtney	5.40	4,563.00	014	60523895
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.4); DRAFT CURE NOTICE (1.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CURE NOTICE EXHIBITS FOR SIGN-OFF (2.8).				
11/20/20	Martir, Martha	5.10	5,151.00	014	60533825
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CURE EXHIBIT (2.2); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE SAME (1.8); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, KPS, KIRKLAND, AND C. LUSTER RE CURE NOTICE AND EXHIBITS (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CURE NOTICE (0.5).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/23/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.8); UPDATE FIFTH AMENDED CURE NOTICE AND SUBMITTED FOR FILING (.5).	1.30	1,098.50	014	60533840
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW EDITS TO CURE AMENDMENT AND REVISE SAME.	0.70	511.00	014	60536935
11/23/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CONTRACT AMENDMENT (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE SAME (0.1); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND C. LUSTER RE CURE COST QUESTION FROM COMPANY (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE CURE NOTICE (0.4); REVIEW CURE NOTICE PRIOR TO FILING (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE SERVICE OF CURE NOTICE (0.1).	1.70	1,717.00	014	60533851
11/24/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (1.3).	1.30	1,098.50	014	60547700
11/24/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE RE CURE AMENDMENT WITH VENDOR.	0.10	73.00	014	60546300
11/24/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH NEW BRIGGS RE CONTRACT AMENDMENT NEGOTIATIONS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER RE CURE OBJECTIONS (0.1); REVISE INSERT TO ORDER FORM (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.1).	1.20	1,212.00	014	60578571
11/25/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.6).	0.60	507.00	014	60568522
11/25/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW SAP STIPULATION (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND R. BERKOVICH RE SAME (1.0).	1.70	1,717.00	014	60578475

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/30/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.2); DRAFT REJECTION EXHIBIT OF NON-ASSUMED CONTRACTS FOR DEBTORS REVIEW (1.8).	2.00	1,690.00	014	60589330
11/30/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AMENDMENT TO EXECUTORY CONTRACT (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND CLIENT RE SAME (0.2).	0.80	808.00	014	60590900
SUBTOTAL TASK 014 - Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues):		116.80	\$107,014.00		
11/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY WIP CALL (1.0).	1.00	1,450.00	015	60373540
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora RESTRUCTURING TEAM WORK IN PROCESS CALL AND DISCUSSION OF CASE STRATEGY.	1.00	1,100.00	015	60361084
11/02/20	Blechman, Eli ATTEND WEEKLY TEAM MEETING (BFR) (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60539086
11/02/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60533421
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.	1.00	730.00	015	60359881
11/02/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PARTICIPATE ON RX WIP CALL (1.0).	1.00	730.00	015	60616593
11/02/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL TEAM CONFERENCE CALL RE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	1.00	1,010.00	015	60363489

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/02/20	Citron, Andrew ATTEND WORK IN PROGRESS MEETING (1.0).	1.00	930.00	015	60603403
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60388749
11/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60398391
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora COORDINATION CALL WITH M. MARTIR, EY, K. BUONO, E. BLECHMAN RE: WORK IN PROCESS, CLAIMS ANALYSIS, AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/PLAN ISSUES.	0.50	550.00	015	60393571
11/04/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY CALL WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS AND K. BUONO RE: CASE STATUS AND NEXT STEPS.	0.50	490.00	015	60543265
11/04/20	Martir, Martha PARTICIPATE ON CLIENT CALL WITH EY, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	0.50	505.00	015	60428766
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY WIP MEETING (.9).	0.90	1,305.00	015	60434612
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60434638
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE ON RESTRUCTURING TEAM CALL RE: STRATEGY AND CHAPTER 11 CASE WORKSTREAMS.	0.90	990.00	015	60463518
11/09/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY BFR TEAM MEETING (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60615425

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WEIL BFR TEAM WIP CALL.	0.90	657.00	015	60421393
11/09/20	Berdini, Elissabeth BANKRUPTCY TEAM WIP MEETING (0.9).	0.90	657.00	015	60590307
11/09/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL CONFERENCE CALL RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	1.00	1,010.00	015	60428806
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.7); CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE GENERAL CASE UPDATE (.2); CONFER WITH J. MYERS RE STRATEGY (.1).	1.00	1,450.00	015	60434921
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: WORKSTREAMS (.1); COORDINATION WITH TEAM ON ASSIGNMENTS (.1);.	0.20	220.00	015	60464282
11/11/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY CALL WITH EY AND K. BUONO RE STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS.	0.30	435.00	015	60445753
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE MAIL (.3); COORDINATION CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, M. MARTIR, K. BUONO AND EY TEAM (.3).	0.60	660.00	015	60464033
11/11/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY CALL WITH K. BUONO AND WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CASE STATUS AND OPEN ISSUES.	0.30	294.00	015	60615583
11/12/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS.	0.10	145.00	015	60454369
11/13/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.30	330.00	015	60464336

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS.	0.10	145.00	015	60477538
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY WIP CALL.	0.80	1,160.00	015	60477571
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY WIP CALL WITH TEAM.	1.00	1,100.00	015	60473736
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE MAIL.	1.00	1,100.00	015	60473746
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: FILINGS AND MATTERS FOR OMNIBUS HEARING ON 11/18.	0.30	330.00	015	60473759
11/16/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY TEAM CALL (BFR) (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60639344
11/16/20	Luster, Courtney INTERNAL BFR WIP CALL.	1.20	1,014.00	015	60476616
11/16/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM.	0.80	676.00	015	60533401
11/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.	0.90	657.00	015	60474639
11/16/20	Bardini, Elissabeth PARTICIPATE ON RX TEAM WIP CALL.	1.00	730.00	015	60627108
11/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa	1.00	845.00	015	60522927

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ATTEND TEAM MEETING.				
11/16/20	Zhang, John	0.80	476.00	015	60470382
	ATTEND RESTRUCTURING DEPARTMENT'S WEEKLY WIP MEETING.				
11/16/20	Martir, Martha	1.00	1,010.00	015	60474167
	INTERNAL TEAM CONFERENCE CALL RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.				
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.70	1,015.00	015	60488771
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE STRATEGY (.5); CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE STRATEGY (.1).				
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.60	660.00	015	60486326
	REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.				
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	015	60486508
	CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: STRATEGY AND WORKSTREAMS.				
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	015	60499027
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS.				
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	015	60499233
	WEEKLY CALL WITH EY AND K. BUONO RE CLAIMS AND STRATEGY.				
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	015	60495988
	REVIEW CASE MAIL RE: REJECTION NOTICE, EXMARK APPEAL SETTLEMENT AND SETTLEMENT MOTION.				
11/18/20	Blechman, Eli	0.50	490.00	015	60639424
	CALL WITH K. BUONO AND WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CASE STATUS AND UPDATES AND NEXT STEPS.				
11/18/20	Martir, Martha	0.50	505.00	015	60496410

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, AND R. BERKOVICH RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.				
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS.	0.10	145.00	015	60581132
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL (FILINGS AND NOTICING, DBS ACCOUNT DISSOLUTION/UNSECURED CLAIM, 8-K FOR MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT) AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.50	550.00	015	60532800
11/19/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE WORK IN PROGRESS WORKSTREAM (.2); REVIEW SAME (.1).	0.30	303.00	015	60503754
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM (CLAIMS, AMENDED 8-K , EXMARK SETTLEMENT).	0.60	660.00	015	60532835
11/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60582051
11/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60582582
11/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY TEAM WIP MEETING.	1.00	1,450.00	015	60582694
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora WEEKLY RESTRUCTURING TEAM WIP MEETING RE: CASE WORKSTREAMS.	1.00	1,100.00	015	60539940
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.60	660.00	015	60539956
11/23/20	Blechman, Eli	1.00	980.00	015	60641981

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WEEKLY TEAM MEETING (BFR) (WIP).				
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60632200
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.	1.00	730.00	015	60536952
11/23/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW WIP LIST AND CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: WIP LIST (0.1); RESTRUCTURING COMMITTEE WIP MEETING (1.0).	1.10	803.00	015	60590282
11/23/20	Paddock, Alyssa TEAM WIP.	1.00	845.00	015	60639393
11/23/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL TEAM CALL RE THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	1.00	1,010.00	015	60533854
11/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH K. BUONO RE STRATEGY (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.20	290.00	015	60583179
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.70	770.00	015	60546133
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60583284
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS.	0.10	145.00	015	60596744
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	1.00	1,450.00	015	60596929

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WEEKLY TEAM WIP MEETING.				
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL, INCLUDING DOCKET UPDATE, AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.50	550.00	015	60590654
11/30/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: WORK IN PROCESS AND STRATEGY.	1.20	1,320.00	015	60590803
11/30/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY TEAM CALL (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60733519
11/30/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM.	1.20	1,014.00	015	60632108
11/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.	1.20	876.00	015	60590291
11/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PARTICIPATE ON RX WIP CALL (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: BRIGGS CALLER (0.1).	1.30	949.00	015	60614432
11/30/20	Zhang, John ATTEND WEEKLY WIP MEETING.	1.00	595.00	015	60587140
11/30/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL CONFERENCE CALL RE ONGOING WORKSTREAMS.	1.10	1,111.00	015	60590727
SUBTOTAL TASK 015 - General Case Strategy (Including Client/Team Calls):		54.20	\$54,677.00		
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT HEARING AGENDA.	0.10	110.00	016	60401270

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/06/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF NOVEMBER 9, 2020 HEARING MATERIALS.	1.20	300.00	016	60417406
11/07/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF 11.09.2020 HEARING MATERIALS FOR R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE.	1.00	250.00	016	60417465
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON APPROVAL OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	1.00	1,450.00	016	60850480
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora PREPARE FOR HEARING, INCLUDING CONFERRING WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: RESOLUTION OF OBJECTIONS AND COMMENTS IN ADVANCE OF HEARING (3.7); DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (1.3); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE SAME (.1).	5.10	5,610.00	016	60545681
11/09/20	Blechman, Eli ATTEND HEARING ON APPROVAL OF DEBTORS' DISCLOSURE AND SOLICITATION PROCEDURES MOTION (1.0).	1.00	980.00	016	60685436
11/09/20	Myers, Janiel PREPARE FOR HEARING ON DE MINIMIS ASSET SALE MOTION (2.4); ATTEND AND PARTICIPATE IN HEARING RE: SAME (.8).	3.20	2,704.00	016	60533487
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PROPOSED AGENDA FOR NOV. 12 HEARING AND EMAILS WITH CARMODY RE: SAME.	0.10	110.00	016	60464233
11/10/20	Peene, Travis J. PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE CALENDAR INVITE RE: NOVEMBER 12, 2020 HEARING TO TEAM AND CLIENTS.	0.10	25.00	016	60458665
11/11/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND C. LUSTER RE: STATUS OF OBJECTIONS FOR THE NOVEMBER 18 HEARING.	0.40	404.00	016	60439426

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH T. RISKE RE: HEARING (.3); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.1); PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON MOTION TO APPROVE NOTICE OF SATISFIED CLAIMS (.4).	0.80	880.00	016	60464286
11/16/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE SAME (0.4).	0.80	808.00	016	60473989
11/17/20	Martir, Martha PREPARE FOR HEARING.	0.70	707.00	016	60496762
11/17/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF NOVEMBER 18, 2020 HEARING MATERIALS FOR TEAM.	0.80	200.00	016	60566062
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON LIFT STAY HEARING.	1.00	1,450.00	016	60499299
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE IN OMNIBUS HEARING (1.4); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: RELIEF GRANTED (.1);.	1.50	1,650.00	016	60495868
11/18/20	Berman, Corey D. ATTEND AND PARTICIPATE ON HEARING RE: MOTION TO LIFT THE AUTOMATIC STAY.	1.00	1,100.00	016	60685376
11/18/20	Martir, Martha PREPARE FOR HEARING (3.7); PARTICIPATE IN HEARING (1.4).	5.10	5,151.00	016	60496453
SUBTOTAL TASK 016 - Hearings and Court Matters:		24.90	\$23,889.00		
11/01/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM K. BUONO AND A. CITRON RE: PREMIUM FINANCING PAYMENT (.1); REVIEW A. CITRON'S DRAFT SUMMARY FOR COMMITTEE ON PREMIUM FINANCING ARRANGEMENTS (.2).	0.30	330.00	017	60354439

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: INSURERS' COMMENTS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO LIFT STAY MOTIONS BY PERSONAL INJURY PLAINTIFFS.	0.30	330.00	017	60361013
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH FOLEY AND WEIL TEAM RE INSURANCE (1.1); EMAIL WITH J. MYERS RE INSURANCE CLAIMS (.1).	1.20	1,740.00	017	60388717
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR INSURANCE POLICIES.	2.50	2,750.00	017	60389070
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH FOLEY, E. BLECHMAN, R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON AND J. MYERS RE: INSURANCE CLAIMS AND INSURERS' OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	1.20	1,320.00	017	60389143
11/03/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PREPARE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (2.0).	2.00	1,460.00	017	60614627
11/03/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW INSURANCE ORDER IN RESPONSE TO CLIENT QUESTION.	0.30	303.00	017	60409062
11/03/20	Fliman, Ariel REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ADDRESSING INSURANCE PREMIUM AND CANCELLATION ISSUES.	0.10	101.00	017	60378666
11/04/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.4); PREPARE MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (3.5).	3.90	2,847.00	017	60616732
11/04/20	Citron, Andrew EMAILS TO HANSEN REYNOLDS TEAM RE: POTENTIAL INSURANCE BUYBACK (.2).	0.20	186.00	017	60673587
11/06/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.40	292.00	017	60616736

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.4).				
11/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FOLEY MEMO RE: INSURANCE COVERAGE AND ISSUES.	0.60	660.00	017	60463450
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW FOLEY MEMORANDUM ON INSURANCE (.5).	0.50	725.00	017	60850452
11/09/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW, REVISE, DRAFT MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5).	0.50	365.00	017	60590134
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60434918
11/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS.	6.30	4,599.00	017	60590319
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR POLICY AGREEMENTS.	2.20	2,420.00	017	60464290
11/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS (3.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS (0.3); PREPARE ORDER FOR MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (2.0).	6.10	4,453.00	017	60616586
11/12/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAIL FOLEY TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1); CALL WITH INSURANCE COMPANIES COUNSEL RE BUYBACK PROPOSAL AND PLAN (.5); CALL WITH FOLEY AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.3).	0.90	1,305.00	017	60454390
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: MOTION TO APPROVE TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS.	0.80	880.00	017	60464375

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/12/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE (0.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE BENEFITS (0.8); REVISE SAME (0.1).	1.10	803.00	017	60616616
11/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES.	0.10	145.00	017	60465838
11/14/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW ANALYSIS FROM HANSEN REYNOLDS OF INSURER PROPOSAL (.1); EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.2).	0.40	580.00	017	60466751
11/14/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS RE: POTENTIAL INSURANCE SETTLEMENT (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH FOLEY AND K. BUONO RE: SAME (.2).	0.70	770.00	017	60465758
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE AND OTHER ISSUES (.1); CALL WITH K. BUONO, D. HOEHNE, FOLEY, AND INSURANCE COUNSEL RE PROPOSED INSURANCE SETTLEMENT (1.2).	1.30	1,885.00	017	60488717
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND M. MARTIR RE: INSURANCE INFORMATION REQUESTS FOR NON-BANKRUPTCY LITIGATION.	0.20	220.00	017	60486431
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH K. BUONO, FOLEY, HANSEN REYNOLDS, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: POTENTIAL INSURANCE SETTLEMENT (1.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH SAME RE: NEXT STEPS WITH INSURERS AND UCC (.3).	1.50	1,650.00	017	60486557
11/17/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT/PREPARE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES.	7.40	5,402.00	017	60614375
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	017	60499231

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES.				
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS.	2.30	2,530.00	017	60495889
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH O. LASHKO, R. BERKOVICH AND E. KHATCHOURIAN RE: INSURANCE ISSUES FOR DISCUSSION.	0.10	110.00	017	60495978
11/18/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (2.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.2).	2.70	1,971.00	017	60616531
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH UCC RE INSURANCE ISSUES.	0.50	725.00	017	60581139
11/19/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPOND WITH L. LEVERSON ON OLIP CALCULATIONS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON SAME (0.3); CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE ON ANALYSIS (0.2).	0.90	1,012.50	017	60503445
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS TERMINATION MOTION.	0.30	330.00	017	60532795
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH O. LASHKO, R. BERKOVICH, E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: INSURANCE PROPOSAL AND PLAN COMMENTS.	0.50	550.00	017	60532847
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS (1.8); REVIEW EXHIBITS FOR SAME (.6); EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.1).	2.50	2,750.00	017	60532855
11/19/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	9.60	7,008.00	017	60627265

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (2.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: UPDATES TO LIFE INSURANCE MOTION (0.3); DRAFT NOTICES TO PARTICIPANTS (5.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: NOTICES TO PARTICIPANTS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT RE: CERTAIN PARTICIPANTS OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: QUESTION ABOUT TAX IMPLICATIONS OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1).				
11/19/20	Fliman, Ariel REVIEW INSURANCE POLICY CANCELLATION ISSUES.	0.40	404.00	017	60514837
11/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH EY RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60581815
11/20/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW MOTION FOR TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND ARRANGEMENTS AND COMMENTS TO SAME (2.2); CONF. WITH E. BERDINI AND P. PRICKETT ON SPLIT DOLLAR ARRANGEMENTS (0.6); REVIEW SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES AND ARRANGEMENTS (1.1).	3.90	4,387.50	017	60519013
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS (.5); CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.6).	1.10	1,210.00	017	60532827
11/20/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH P. PRICKETT AND S. MARGOLIS TO DISCUSS EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE (0.6); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT AND S. MARGOLIS RE: INCLUDING LANGUAGE IN ORDER TO ACCOMMODATE INSURERS AND ADMINISTRATOR TO EFFECTUATE SURRENDER (0.3); REVIEW TERMS OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES RE: AUTHORITY TO SURRENDER (0.6); RESEARCH AUTHORITY TO SURRENDER SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.7); ANALYZE TREATMENT OF VESTED ENDORSEMENT POLICY PARTICIPANTS AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (1.8); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND CONDUCT RESEARCH FOR SAME (2.5).	7.20	5,256.00	017	60616588
11/20/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.40	404.00	017	60514795

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ANALYZE INSURANCE PREMIUM, AUDIT AND CANCELLATION ISSUES.				
11/21/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES AND MATERIALS ON SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE, 409A ISSUES (0.4); CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI AND D. HOEHNE ON SAME (0.2).	0.60	675.00	017	60518716
11/21/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS AND RELATED NOTICES.	1.90	2,090.00	017	60532821
11/21/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND EXHIBITS FOR SAME (10.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.8); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS AND P. PRICKETT RE: SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (0.1).	12.00	8,760.00	017	60616398
11/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE (.9).	0.90	1,305.00	017	60582184
11/22/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES.	0.30	219.00	017	60851958
11/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE (.4).	0.50	725.00	017	60582630
11/23/20	Margolis, Steven M. VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT, CLARYS AND WEIL ON SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE (0.6); CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT ON SAME (0.2); REVIEW POLICIES AND ARRANGEMENTS (0.7); REVIEW MOTION FOR TERMINATION OF LIFE INSURANCE PLANS AND SURRENDER OF POLICIES (1.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. BUONO ON SAME (0.3).	2.90	3,262.50	017	60537920
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.10	1,210.00	017	60539898

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BERDINI RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS (.4); CALL WITH CLARY, P. PRICKETT, S. MARGOLIS, AND E. BERDINI RE: SAME (.5); FOLLOW UP EMAILS RE: SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1).				
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS.	1.10	1,210.00	017	60539948
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH T. WILL RE: FOLLOW UP WITH ASBESTOS INSURERS RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL (.1).	0.10	110.00	017	60539978
11/23/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH TO DISCUSS MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE (0.4); CALL WITH CLARY, S. MARGOLIS, P. PRICKETT AND D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: EXEC LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO TERMINATE EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (5.0); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE: MOTION TO TERMINATE EXEC LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.7); REVIEW EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE PLANS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PROVISIONS OF LIFE INSURANCE PLANS (0.4).	8.00	5,840.00	017	60614441
11/23/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY RE INSURANCE INFORMATION IN RESPONSE TO WARD STIPULATION (0.4); REDACT INSURANCE POLICIES FOR PRODUCTION RE SAME (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH WARD RE SAME (0.2); REVIEW AND REDACT INSURANCE POLICIES (1.0).	2.60	2,626.00	017	60533837
11/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON THE MOTION TO APPROVE THE SURRENDER OF THE INSURANCE POLICIES (1.3); EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE MOTION TO APPROVE THE SURRENDER OF THE INSURANCE POLICIES (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE MOTION TO APPROVE THE SURRENDER OF THE INSURANCE POLICIES (.9).	2.30	3,335.00	017	60583288
11/24/20	Margolis, Steven M.	1.40	1,575.00	017	60547261

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW ISSUES ON ESLIP FROM E. BERDINI (0.2), REVIEW DOCUMENTS ON SAME (0.2) AND CORRESPOND WITH J. CLARYS AND P. PRICKETT ON SAME (0.3); VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI ON SAME (0.5); FOLLOWUP CONF. WITH J. CLARYS AND P. PRICKETT ON SAME (0.2).				
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora	2.10	2,310.00	017	60546383
	EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS (.5); REVIEW FOLLOW UP INFORMATION FROM S. MARGOLIS, P. PRICKETT AND CLARY RE: MOTION (.5); REVIEW CURRENT DRAFT OF MOTION IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.2); CALL WITH E. BERDINI AND R. BERKOVICH RE: MOTION (.9).				
11/24/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.30	3,869.00	017	60616371
	REVIEW EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. MARGOLIS RE: SCOPE AND TERMS OF INSURANCE POLICIES (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH CLARY RE: SCOPE AND TERMS OF INSURANCE POLICIES (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (1.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH TO DISCUSS MOTION TO TERMINATE LIFE INSURANCE (0.9); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (1.5).				
11/24/20	Martir, Martha	1.70	1,717.00	017	60578370
	CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY, CARMODY, AND FASSETT RE REQUESTED INSURANCE INFORMATION (1.1); ANALYSIS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE SAME (0.6).				
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	1.20	1,740.00	017	60583202
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (.9); EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE MOTION RE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (.2).				
11/25/20	Margolis, Steven M.	2.20	2,475.00	017	60576896
	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION ON TERMINATION OF EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE PLAN AND SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (1.5) AND CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI ON SAME (0.4); VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT AND J. CLARYS ON SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO ON SAME (0.1).				
11/25/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.10	1,210.00	017	60561264

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS (X2) OF MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT-DOLLAR AGREEMENTS (.8); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BERDINI TO FINALIZE SAME (.3).				
11/25/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	10.80	7,884.00	017	60616383
	PREPARE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (4.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (1.8); CIRCULATE SAME TO R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (0.1); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: COMMENTS TO SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH UCC RE: SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLARY AND P. PRICKETT RE: SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (1.6); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: FILING SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: FILING SAME (0.2); PREPARE ANNEX OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND AGREEMENTS FOR SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH KCC RE: ADDRESSES FOR SERVICE OF MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND NOTICE TO PARTICIPANTS (0.3); FINALIZE MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES FOR FILING (0.3); PREPARE NOTICE OF HEARING FOR SAME (0.4).				
11/25/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.20	202.00	017	60576684
	ADDRESS INSURANCE POLICY CANCELLATION ISSUES.				
11/26/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	017	60583229
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE LIFE INSURANCE ISSUES.				
11/30/20	Margolis, Steven M.	1.10	1,237.50	017	60851961
	CORRESPOND WITH E. BERDINI ON LIFE INSURANCE MOTION (0.2); REVIEW FILED MOTION FOR TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR PLANS AND POLICIES (0.9).				
11/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.10	73.00	017	60614774
	CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1).				
11/30/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.60	606.00	017	60591897

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
ADDRESS NEBRASKA REGULATOR INFORMATION REQUESTS, BOND PAYMENT STATUS AND POLICY CANCELLATION STEPS.					
SUBTOTAL TASK 017 - Insurance Issues:		137.90	\$124,015.00		
11/01/20	Soto, Edward ADDITIONAL REVIEW AND COMMENT ON THE FINAL REVISED DRAFT OF THE INTERNAL INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME (.2).	0.50	700.00	018	60354388
11/01/20	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos REVIEW AND FINALIZE MEMO RE: INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS.	0.80	880.00	018	60353267
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH K. BUONO AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK APPEAL (.2); EMAIL BROWN RUDNICK RE ISSUES RE SAME (.2).	0.40	580.00	018	60434667
11/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAIL TO ARNOLD AND PORTER TEAM RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.1).	0.10	145.00	018	60435004
11/11/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH M. COHN RE POTENTIAL EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); EMAIL TO BROWN RUDNICK RE SAME (.1).	0.20	290.00	018	60445750
11/12/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK LITIGATION.	0.10	145.00	018	60454639
11/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.1); EMAILS WITH ARNOLD AND PORKER, K. BUONO, AND O. LASHKO RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.1).	0.20	290.00	018	60465441
11/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.90	1,305.00	018	60477544

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH EXMARK AND EMAIL TO TEAM RE SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM AND M. COHN RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.2); CALL WITH K. BUONO AND ARNOLD AND PORTER TEAM RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.4); EMAIL TO E. BERDINI RE SAME (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON THE EXMARK SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.1).				
11/16/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BERDINI RE: EXMARK SETTLEMENT AND 9019 MOTION FOR SAME.	0.20	220.00	018	60473686
11/16/20	Berdini, Elisabeth REVIEW PRECEDENT 8TH CIRCUIT 9019 MOTIONS (0.1); DRAFT 9019 MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH EXMARK (0.8).	0.90	657.00	018	60602639
11/17/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ADDITIONAL PROPOSED REVISIONS TO THE REPORT RE THE INTERNAL INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS (.4); CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME (.1).	0.50	700.00	018	60487044
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW ZURICH SURETY PROOF OF CLAIM IN CONNECTION WITH EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH K. BUONO AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK TERM SHEET (.2); EMAILS WITH ARNOLD AND PORTER AND K. BUONO RE EXMARK TERM SHEET (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT ORDER APPROVING EXMARK SETTLEMENT. (.1).	0.60	870.00	018	60488796
11/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: 9019 MOTION FOR EXMARK APPEAL SETTLEMENT.	0.10	110.00	018	60486277
11/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW S. MENDEZ EDITS TO INVESTIGATION MEMO.	1.10	803.00	018	60489212
11/17/20	Berdini, Elisabeth DRAFT EXMARK 9019 MOTION (2.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND A. PADDOCK RE: EXMARK 9019 (0.2); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK TO DISCUSS EXMARK 9019 (0.4).	2.80	2,044.00	018	60616574

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/17/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW CASE HISTORY AND DRAFT 9019 MOTION (3.1); DISCUSS WITH D. HOEHNE (.3).	3.40	2,873.00	018	60523068
11/17/20	Mendez, Samuel Joaquin REVISE MEMO RE: POTENTIAL DEBTOR CLAIMS (3.8); DISCUSS SAME WITH L. ALEXANDER, N. SOSA, S. SCHNORRENBERG (0.4).	4.20	4,410.00	018	60496608
11/18/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL REVISIONS TO THE REPORT ON THE INTERNAL INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS (.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME (.2).	0.50	700.00	018	60499820
11/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON ORDER APPROVING EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK TERM SHEET (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO APPROVE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.3); CALL WITH EXMARK COUNSEL AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO APPROVE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CONFER WITH O. LASHKO RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.2); EMAIL TO EY RE SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH K. BUONO AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.2); CALL WITH COUNSEL TO EXMARK AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT. (.3).	1.90	2,755.00	018	60499137
11/18/20	Bardini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: 9019 MOTION (0.1); DRAFT PRELIMINARY STATEMENT FOR 9019 MOTION (0.3).	0.40	292.00	018	60602636
11/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa DRAFT 9019 MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH EXMARK.	5.40	4,563.00	018	60522548
11/18/20	Mendez, Samuel Joaquin REVISE MEMO RE: POTENTIAL DEBTOR CLAIMS (1.7); DISCUSS SAME WITH L. ALEXANDER, N. SOSA, S. SCHNORRENBERG (0.3).	2.00	2,100.00	018	60496647
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.80	1,160.00	018	60581426

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REVISED EXMARK PROPOSAL AND EMAIL TO ARNOLD AND PORTER TEAM AND K. BUONO RE SAME (.2); CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE REVISED EXMARK PROPOSAL (.1); REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.4); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND ARNOLD AND PORTER TEAM RE EXMARK LITIGATION (.1).				
11/19/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW AND REVISE 9019 MOTION TO APPROVE EXMARK SETTLEMENT.	3.90	3,295.50	018	60522694
11/20/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL PROPOSED REVISIONS TO THE REPORT RE THE INTERNAL INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS (.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME (.2).	0.50	700.00	018	60539502
11/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM, K. BUONO, AND ARNOLD AND PORTER RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CONFER WITH M. MARTIR RE LITIGATION SETTLEMENT (.1).	0.30	435.00	018	60581846
11/20/20	Alexander, Lauren Zerbinopoulos REVIEW MEMORANDUM RE INVESTIGATION OF POTENTIAL CLAIMS AND CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE SAME.	0.50	550.00	018	60511782
11/20/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: COORDINATING WITH CARMODY AND KCC TO FILE 9019 MOTION (0.2).	0.20	146.00	018	60616346
11/20/20	Paddock, Alyssa FINALIZE AND FILE 9019 MOTION TO APPROVE EXMARK SETTLEMENT.	4.40	3,718.00	018	60522638
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAIL TO C. LUSTER RE: LITIGATION CLAIMS.	0.10	110.00	018	60539949
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	018	60546159

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN AND T. WILL RE: MEDIATION IN HARTKE CASE (.1).				
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH FOLEY RE DISMISSAL OF LITIGATION AND AUTOMATIC STAY.	0.10	145.00	018	60596761
SUBTOTAL TASK 018 - Non-Bankruptcy Litigation:		38.10	\$37,801.50		
11/02/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND REVISE FORT PIERCE LISTING AGREEMENT WITH RELEVANT BANKRUPTCY LANGUAGE (.8).	0.80	676.00	020	60360000
11/05/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AGREEMENTS RELATED TO CBRE TO DETERMINE WHETHER TRANSFERRED AS PART OF SALE TRANSACTION (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY RE SAME (0.4); REVIEW MARK-UP RE SAME (1.1);.	2.20	2,222.00	020	60428801
11/06/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE TRANSFERRED LEASES.	0.20	202.00	020	60409148
11/06/20	Frayle, Barbara REVIEW LEASES UPLOADED ON WEIL'S INTERNTAL SITE AND PREPARE ZIP FOLDER AND FORWARD BY EMAIL.	1.80	720.00	020	60410207
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CBRE LISTING AGREEMENT FOR FLORIDA PROPERTY.	0.30	330.00	020	60463216
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED CBRE LISTING AGREEMENT FOR MURRAY PROPERTY.	0.10	110.00	020	60464091
11/10/20	Martir, Martha REVISE CBRE LISTING AGREEMENT.	0.50	505.00	020	60428807

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/11/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND REVISE CBRE LISTING AGREEMENT (.4).	0.40	338.00	020	60437175
11/11/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE TRANSFERRED LEASES.	0.20	202.00	020	60439486
11/11/20	Frayle, Barbara RECEIVE EMAIL COMMUNICATION RE DISCREPANCIES WITH CERTAIN OF THE LEASES THAT WERE INCLUDED IN THE ZIP FOLDER BEING CIRCULATED TO BASCO.	0.40	160.00	020	60442179
11/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW CASE HISTORY AND DRAFT 365(D)(4) MOTION.	2.50	2,112.50	020	60522903
11/16/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE 365(D)(4) MOTION (0.2).	0.20	202.00	020	60848745
11/16/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob CONDUCT RESEARCH RE 365(D)(4) MOTION FOR A. PADDOCK.	2.00	500.00	020	60638123
11/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ASSUME OR REJECT LEASE (.2).	0.20	290.00	020	60488755
11/17/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW AND REVISE 365(D)(4) MOTION (2.9); CIRCULATE (.2) AND ASSIST WITH FINALIZATION (.3).	3.40	2,873.00	020	60522780
11/17/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE 365(D)(4) MOTION (0.2); REVISE SAME (2.9); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND THE COMPANY RE SAME (0.7).	3.80	3,838.00	020	60496532
SUBTOTAL TASK 020 - Real Property/Real Estate		19.00	\$15,280.50		
Lease Issues:					

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/22/20	Morton, Matthew D. RESEARCH AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO E. BLECHMAN RE: CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD EXECUTIVE ORDER MATTER (.9).	0.90	990.00	021	60523554
11/22/20	Sevalrud, Robert REVIEW AND CONSIDER EMAILS FROM WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE CARB DILIGENCE.	0.30	279.00	021	60515190
11/23/20	Morton, Matthew D. CORRESPOND WITH D. HEOHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CALIFORNIA EXECUTIVE ORDER TRANSFER ISSUE (.2); RESEARCH RE: EXECUTIVE ORDER TRANSFER PROCEDURES (.4).	0.60	660.00	021	60539444
11/24/20	Morton, Matthew D. PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT INTERNAL CALL RE: CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD CONFERENCE ON TRANSFER OF EXECUTIVE ORDERS (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WEIL TEAM AND CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD (.5); CONFERENCE WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD CALL AND DOJ PLAN LANGUAGE (.2); REVIEW DOJ PLAN LANGUAGE (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTATION RE: DEBTOR DISCLOSURE SCHEDULE MATTERS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.1).	1.70	1,870.00	021	60546129
11/24/20	Hoejne, Debora CALL WITH M. MORTON, R. BERKOVICH AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CARB INQUIRY INTO PLAN AND SCHEDULES (.3); EMAIL TO CARB ATTORNEYS RE: PRIOR CORRESPOND WITH CARB RE: EMISSIONS RELATED EO'S (.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTATION SENT BY CARB IN CONNECTION WITH CALL ON PLAN (.1); CALL WITH CARB RE: PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER (.4); CALL WITH M. MORTON RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW FOLLOW UP DOCUMENTATION RE: SCHEDULE EXCERPTS RELATED TO CARB (.2);.	1.20	1,320.00	021	60545623
11/25/20	Morton, Matthew D. RESEARCH APPLICABILITY OF PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE PLAN LANGUAGE (.4); REVIEW SALE ORDER (.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. KENDRICK RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.1).	0.90	990.00	021	60578316
11/30/20	Morton, Matthew D. RESEARCH AND CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: DOJ INQUIRY INTO REMAINING PROPERTIES (.5).	0.50	550.00	021	60593183

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
SUBTOTAL TASK 021 - Regulatory/Environmental		6.10	\$6,659.00		
Issues:					
11/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW AMENDED ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL DECLARATION AND SENDING TO CARMODY FOR FILING.	0.20	146.00	022	60390351
11/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPOND WITH DEBTOR AND ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL EXCESS FEE PAYMENTS.	0.10	73.00	022	60474592
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL QUARTERLY REPORT (.1) AND EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG AND M. MARTIR RE: SAME (.2).	0.30	330.00	022	60496050
11/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (.3); REVIEW ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL ORDER RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT ISSUE (.4); DRAFT NOTICE OF ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL (.5).	1.20	876.00	022	60496885
11/18/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (0.6); REVIEW SAME (0.4).	1.00	1,010.00	022	60496689
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CLASS COUNSEL RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.50	725.00	022	60581383
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (.3); EMAILS WITH S. SHNORRENBURG AND M. MARTIR RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW REVISED EXHIBIT FOR SAME (.1); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG AND M. MARTIR RE: ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORTING (.4).	0.90	990.00	022	60532806
11/19/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.00	1,460.00	022	60503443

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND M. MARTIR ON ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (.2); REVISE NOTICE OF FILING OF ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT (.6); REVISE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL REPORT AND PREPARE FOR FILING (.8).				
11/19/20	Martir, Martha	1.80	1,818.00	022	60503761
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL QUARTERLY REPORT (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICE RE SAME (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EXHIBIT TO QUARTERLY REPORT (0.6).				
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	022	60539938
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO K. BUONO EMAIL RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE RETAINER FOR ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL.				
11/23/20	Martir, Martha	0.40	404.00	022	60533829
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND H. GUTHRIE RE PROFESSIONAL RETAINER.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 022 - Retention/Fee Application:		8.50	\$7,942.00		
OCPs:					
11/02/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	023	60361005
	CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: K. BUONO QUESTIONS ON HOULIHAN INVOICE.				
11/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	023	60359880
	PREPARE UPDATE SUMMARY OF FOLEY INVOICE AND SENDING THE SAME.				
11/02/20	Martir, Martha	1.30	1,313.00	023	60363673
	ANALYSIS OF HOULIHAN'S SALE TRANSACTION FEE CALCULATION AND QUESTIONS FROM CLIENT RE SAME (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.3).				
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	023	60389069
	REVIEW EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND M. MARTIR RE: HOULIHAN INVOICE.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH HOULIHAN RE SALE TRANSACTION FEE CALCULATION (0.2); CORESPOND WITH COMPANY RE SAME (0.4).	0.60	606.00	023	60409086
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: PERKINS COIE CLASS COUNSEL RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.10	110.00	023	60393493
11/06/20	Luster, Courtney REVIEW AND INCORPORATED LANGUAGE INTO LISTING AGREEMENT (.6).	0.60	507.00	023	60415717
11/06/20	Bardini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE LATHAM INVOICE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR AND K. BUONO RE; LATHAM INVOICE (0.1); UPDATE FEE TRACKER (0.5).	0.90	657.00	023	60614225
11/06/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CBRE LISTING AGREEMENT.	1.10	1,111.00	023	60409031
11/07/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LISTING AGREEMENT.	0.40	404.00	023	60428740
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG, PERKINS COIE, POLSINELLI AND KOHNER FIRMS RE: RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.50	550.00	023	60464367
11/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND ATTORNEYS FROM PERKINS COIE, POLSINELLI, AND KALIS ABOUT PROFESSIONAL RETENTION APPLICATION (.5); CALL WITH T. RISKE FROM CARMODY RE: SAME (.1).	0.60	438.00	023	60431087
11/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW HOULIHAN DRAFT FEE STATEMENT FOR SEPTEMBER (SALE CLOSING FEE).	0.30	330.00	023	60463883
11/11/20	Bardini, Elissabeth	0.10	73.00	023	60590438

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: CARMODY FEE STATEMENT.				
11/12/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW SEPTEMBER FEE STATEMENT AND EMAIL M. MARTIR RE SAME.	0.10	145.00	023	60454376
11/12/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW AND SUMMARIZING BROWN RUDNICK INVOICE.	1.10	803.00	023	60450219
11/13/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW HOULIHAN LOKEY AND EY INVOICES.	0.50	365.00	023	60457110
11/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW PERKINS COIE/POLSINELLI/KALIS RETENTION APPLICATION.	1.40	1,022.00	023	60474833
11/17/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW MEMO RE: DEBTORS' PROFESSIONALS' FEE STATEMENTS AND APPLICATIONS.	0.20	196.00	023	60639383
11/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW PERKINS COIE/POLSINELLI/KALIS RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.30	219.00	023	60488882
11/18/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH T. RISKE RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATION PROCESS (0.2); CORRESPONDE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: SAME (0.2).	0.40	392.00	023	60639426
11/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON EXMARK SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	0.40	580.00	023	60581376
11/19/20	Blechman, Eli CALLS AND CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG AND T. RISKE RE: FEE APPLICATIONS.	0.50	490.00	023	60639572
11/19/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	4.70	3,431.00	023	60503454

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH PROFESSIONALS RE INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.5); CALL WITH B. MARKS ON FEE APPLICATIONS (.1); CALL WITH J. ZHANG ABOUT REVIEW PROFESSIONAL FEE STATEMENTS (.2); REVISE PERKINS COIE/POLSINELLI/KALIS RETENTION APPLICATION (1.0); REVIEW EY FEE STATEMENT (2.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH FOR PRECEDENT NON-ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATIONS IN THE JURISDICTION (.4).				
11/19/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	023	60503510
	CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG ABOUT REVIEW FEE APPLICATION.				
11/19/20	Zhang, John	4.40	2,618.00	023	60503570
	CALL WITH M. MARTIR ABOUT REVIEW FEE STATEMENTS OF NON-WEIL PROFESSIONALS (.2); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG ABOUT REVIEW FEE STATEMENT FROM CARMODY MACDONALD P.C. (.2); REVIEW OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT OF CARMODY MACDONALD P.C. (3.7). DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM HIGHLIGHTING POTENTIAL ISSUES (0.3).				
11/19/20	Martir, Martha	0.50	505.00	023	60503742
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG, E. BERDINI, AND J. ZHANG RE REVIEW PROFESSIONAL INVOICES.				
11/19/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	3.00	750.00	023	60637999
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE FEE APPLICATIONS FOR EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI FOR S. SCHNORRENBURG.				
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora	1.20	1,320.00	023	60532808
	REVIEW DRAFT RETENTION AGREEMENT FOR CBRE (.8); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF CBRE RETENTION APPLICATION (.3); EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: HANSEN REYNOLDS FEE STATEMENT (.1).				
11/20/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.70	511.00	023	60511630
	CALL WITH B. MARKS ABOUT INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.1); REVIEW DOSTER ULLOM AND BOYLE FEE STATEMENT (.4); REVIEW HANSEN REYNOLDS RETENTION ORDER (.2).				
11/20/20	Zhang, John	2.00	1,190.00	023	60512450
	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO EY AND CLIENT SUMMARIZING OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT OF CARMODY MACDONALD P.C. (.5); REVIEW OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT OF BROWN RUDNICK LLP (1.5).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/20/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CBRE RETENTION APPLICATION (3.1); REVIEW SUMMARY OF MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS FOR CARMODY (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE SAME (0.1); REVIEW SUMMARIES OF OTHER INVOICES (0.4).	3.90	3,939.00	023	60533861
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH J. ZHANG AND M. MARTIR RE: HANSEN REYNOLDS MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	0.10	110.00	023	60539950
11/23/20	Luster, Courtney UPDATE CBRE RETENTION APPLICATION AND SENT TO CBRE FOR SIGN-OFF (.3).	0.30	253.50	023	60533763
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPOND WITH PERKINS COIE/POLSINELLI/KAILAS ABOUT UPDATE PIIL LIST.	0.10	73.00	023	60536756
11/23/20	Zhang, John REVIEW FEE STATEMENT OF HANSEN REYNOLDS LLC (1.3). DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM HIGHLIGHTING POTENTIAL ISSUES (0.3).	1.60	952.00	023	60533311
11/23/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW SUMMARY OF HANSEN REYNOLDS INVOICE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. ZHANG RE SAME (0.1).	0.40	404.00	023	60533835
11/24/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW EDITS TO PERKINS COIE RETENTION APPLICATION (.3); REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS ON THE PERKINS COIE RETENTION APPLICATION (.7).	1.00	730.00	023	60545618
11/24/20	Zhang, John DRAFT EMAIL TO HANSEN REYNOLDS LLC RE FEE STATEMENT ISSUES.	0.70	416.50	023	60543529
11/24/20	Martir, Martha	0.60	606.00	023	60578200

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW SALE ORDER IN CONNECTION WITH KING AND SPALDING'S FEE STATEMENT (0.2); REVISE HANSEN REYNOLDS EMAIL (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE SAME (0.2).				
11/25/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE AND FINALIZE CLASS COUNSEL RETENTION APPLICATION FOR FILING.	0.50	365.00	023	60554631
11/25/20	Zhang, John REVIEW REVISED FEE STATEMENT OF HANSEN REYNOLDS LLC (1.1). DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM HIGHLIGHTING POTENTIAL ISSUES (0.3).	1.40	833.00	023	60554170
11/25/20	Zhang, John DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO K. BUONO RE HANSEN REYNOLDS'S INVOICE.	0.30	178.50	023	60554271
11/26/20	Myers, Janiel CIRCULATE PARTIES IN INTEREST LIST TO HANSEN REYNOLDS.	0.10	84.50	023	60632054
11/30/20	Zhang, John REVIEW HOULIHAN LOKEY'S ENGAGEMENT LETTER AND OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT (.4); CALL WITH B. MARKS RE MONTHLY FEES AND SALE TRANSACTION FEE (.2).	0.60	357.00	023	60587135
11/30/20	Zhang, John DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO K. BUONO RE HANSEN REYNOLDS'S INVOICES.	0.30	178.50	023	60587191
11/30/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE HOULIHAN'S FEE STATEMENT (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY RE SAME (0.2).	0.40	404.00	023	60590771
SUBTOTAL TASK 023 - Retention/Fee Applications:		40.80	\$31,106.50		
Retained Professionals non Weil:					
11/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW WEIL SEPTEMBER FEE APPLICATION (.4).	0.40	580.00	024	60388696

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/03/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH CARMODY RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING REVIEW LOCAL RULES IN CONNECTION WITH SAME.	0.30	330.00	024	60389051
11/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL SEPTEMBER FEE APPLICATION (.8).	0.80	1,160.00	024	60398404
11/04/20	Martir, Martha COMPILE LIST FOR PARTIES IN INTEREST REFRESH.	0.80	808.00	024	60409024
11/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL SEPTEMBER INVOICE (.9).	0.90	1,305.00	024	60418103
11/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL SEPTEMBER INVOICE (.4).	0.40	580.00	024	60418173
11/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SEPTEMBER WEIL INVOICE (.9).	0.90	1,305.00	024	60434636
11/10/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (0.2); REVIEW MEMORANDUM RE: FEE STATEMENTS AND APPLICATIONS (0.2).	0.40	392.00	024	60615496
11/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN ON WEIL FEE APPLICATION.	0.30	219.00	024	60431155
11/11/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH U.S. TRUSTEE GUIDELINES.	1.00	625.00	024	60448490
11/11/20	Martir, Martha	0.90	909.00	024	60439459

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW LOCAL RULES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. FRIEDMAN RE SAME (0.2); REVIEW FEE STATEMENT (0.5).				
11/11/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF WEIL'S THIRD MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	1.80	450.00	024	60458683
11/12/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: WGM 3RD FEE STATEMENT (0.1); REVIEW WGM 3RD FEE STATEMENT (0.2); CIRCULATE 3RD FEE STATEMENT TO NOTICE PARTIES (0.1).	0.40	292.00	024	60590479
11/12/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF WEIL'S THIRD MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	0.50	125.00	024	60458674
11/16/20	Hohne, Debora REVIEW TIME ENTRIES FOR CONFIDENTIALITY IN CONNECTION WITH WEIL MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	1.50	1,650.00	024	60473711
11/16/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW PARTIES IN INTEREST LIST FOR UPDATES (.1); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH J. HESS (EY) RE: REVISED PARTIES IN INTEREST LIST (.1).	0.20	169.00	024	60533456
11/18/20	Hohne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.10	110.00	024	60495875
11/19/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.50	365.00	024	60503413
11/19/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne REVIEW AND REVISE THIRD SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE.	0.90	391.50	024	60592190
11/20/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT WEIL FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.80	584.00	024	60511610

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/22/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW INVOICE FOR CLIENT.	4.40	2,750.00	024	60514369
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW TIME ENTRIES FOR CONFIDENTIALITY IN CONNECTION WITH WEIL FEE APPLICATION.	0.30	330.00	024	60539926
11/23/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW WEIL INVOICES AND DRAFT WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	2.80	2,044.00	024	60536902
11/24/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT WEIL FEE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	2.90	2,117.00	024	60546044
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BRIGGS OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT (1.7).	1.70	2,465.00	024	60583227
11/25/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	146.00	024	60554636
11/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	2.40	1,752.00	024	60590397
11/30/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF WEIL'S FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	0.50	125.00	024	60614978
SUBTOTAL TASK 024 - Retention/Fee Applications:		29.00	\$24,078.50		
Weil:					
11/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM J. MYERS AND S. HOFNER RE: AMENDED SCHEDULES E/F.	0.10	110.00	025	60539906
11/23/20	Myers, Janiel	0.80	676.00	025	60632133

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND T. RISKE RE: FILING AMENDED SCHEDULES (.4); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.3); EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH S. HOFNER (EY) RE: SAME (.1).				
11/24/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG AND E. BLECHMAN TO DISCUSS NOTICE OF AMENDED SCHEDULES (.1).	0.10	84.50	025	60632070
11/24/20	Zhang, John DRAFT NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULES E/F OF THE SCHEDULES OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES (2.5); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS ABOUT THE DRAFT OF NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULES E/F OF THE SCHEDULES OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES (.5).	3.00	1,785.00	025	60543515
11/25/20	Zhang, John DRAFT NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULES E/F OF THE SCHEDULES OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES.	0.40	238.00	025	60554248
SUBTOTAL TASK 025 - Schedules/SOFAs/2015.3		4.40	\$2,893.50		
Report:					
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED STIPULATION FOR NMTC LENDERS TO EXERCISE SECURITY INTEREST IN RESERVE ACCOUNTS AND RESOLVING UNSECURED CLAIMS.	0.10	110.00	026	60532848
11/24/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS RE: NMTC LENDERS' RESERVE ACCOUNTS AND STIPULATION RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW STIPULATION TO LIFT STAY TO EXERCISE SECURITY INTEREST IN RESERVE ACCOUNTS/RELEASE UNSECURED CLAIMS (.2).	0.30	330.00	026	60545980
SUBTOTAL TASK 026 - Secured Creditor		0.40	\$440.00		
Issues/Meetings/Communications:					
11/03/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim REVIEW REVISED EY SOW.	0.20	210.00	027	60390342

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/04/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR AND WEIL M&A TEAM RE: TRANSFER TAX ISSUES.	0.50	550.00	027	60393426
11/04/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. KUTILEK RE: SALES AND USE TAX MATRIX (.4). CORRESPOND WITH L. KUTILEK RE: PREPARE SOW SIGNATURE PAGES (.1).	0.50	525.00	027	60390365
11/04/20	Kutilek, Lukas FINALIZE AMENDMENT TO EY STATEMENT OF WORK (0.2); COMMUNICATE WITH EY AND WEIL RE: TRANSFER TAX ISSUES (0.4).	0.60	507.00	027	60415539
11/04/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH H. GUTHRIE, T. LIU, A. ARIKAT, AND L. KUTILEK RE TRANSFER TAXES.	0.40	404.00	027	60409143
11/05/20	Goldring, Stuart J. REVIEW EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH L. KUTILEK AND EY RE TRANSFER TAX (.3).	0.30	508.50	027	60407916
11/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH S. GOLDRING RE: DEFERRED CARES ACT PAYROLL TAXES.	0.40	440.00	027	60401387
11/05/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE RE: TRANSFER TAX LIABILITY (.2).	0.20	210.00	027	60399923
11/05/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW TRANSFER TAX DOCUMENTATION (0.5); COMMUNICATE WITH EY RE: TRANSFER TAXES (0.2).	0.70	591.50	027	60415686
11/06/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER EMAILS FROM S. RUGG RE TAX REFUNDS AND PAYMENTS (.5); CALL WITH A. ARIKAT RE SAME (.4).	0.90	1,525.50	027	60418439
11/06/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim	2.90	3,045.00	027	60409343

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REQUESTS FROM S. RUGG RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAX AND AMENDED TAX RETURN (.3). TAX RESEARCH - DEFERRED PAYROLL TAX REPAYMENT (.3). CORRESPOND WITH WEIL TEAMS RE: PAYROLL TAX DEFERRAL (.4). TAX RESEARCH - PROMPT DETERMINATIONS AND REQUESTS FOR REFUND (1.1). CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING RE: REQUESTS FROM S. RUGG (.5). CORRESPOND WITH S. RUGG RE: REFUND REQUEST (.3).				
11/09/20	Goldring, Stuart J. EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. ARIKAT AND OTHERS RE SALE RETURNS (.4).	0.40	678.00	027	60423011
11/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. ARIKAT RE: POSTPETITION TAX ISSUE (.1).	0.10	110.00	027	60463550
11/09/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPOND WITH S. RUGG RE: PAYROLL TAXES (.2). CORRESPOND WITH WEIL BFR, TAX, CORPORATE RE: CUSTOMER SALES TAX REFUNDS (.6).	0.80	840.00	027	60434810
11/09/20	Kutilek, Lukas RESEARCH TAX ISSUES (0.5); ADDRESS CARES ACT QUESTIONS (0.2).	0.70	591.50	027	60452606
11/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. ARIKAT AND N. FLAGG RELATED TO POSTPETITION TAX ISSUES (.2); CALL WITH A. ARIKAT, N. FLAGG, H. GUTHRIE RE: TAX REFUND ISSUES (.8).	1.00	1,100.00	027	60463984
11/10/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE SETTING UP CONFERENCE CALL RE: FUTURE SALES TAX REFUNDS (.2). CONFERENCE CALL WITH BRIGGS TAX TEAM, N. FLAGG, EY, WEIL RE: SALES TAX REFUNDS (.9). SUMMARY EMAIL TO K. BUONO RE: SALES TAX REFUNDS RESOLUTION (.5).	1.60	1,680.00	027	60434827
11/10/20	Kutilek, Lukas CONFERENCE CALL WITH EY AND THE CLIENT RE: CUSTOMER SALES TAX REFUNDS (1.0); REVIEW PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.3).	1.30	1,098.50	027	60452859
11/12/20	Goldring, Stuart J.	0.60	1,017.00	027	60456188

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONSIDER A. ARIKAT EMAIL RE SALES TAXES (.1) AND DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES (.2); FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH D. HOEHNE AND A. ARIKAT RE SAME (.2).				
11/12/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	027	60463803
	REVIEW EMAIL FROM S. RUGG RE: CARES ACT PAYROLL TAX DEFERRAL.				
11/12/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim	0.80	840.00	027	60450042
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAX LIABILITIES (.4). DRAFT EMAIL TO BRIGGS RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAX LIABILITIES (.4).				
11/12/20	Kutilek, Lukas	0.20	169.00	027	60452902
	ADDRESS CARES ACT DEFERRAL QUESTION FROM THE CLIENT.				
11/16/20	Goldring, Stuart J.	0.10	169.50	027	60479761
	FOLLOW-UP RE PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION PROCESS.				
11/16/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim	0.20	210.00	027	60480391
	CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION.				
11/24/20	Goldring, Stuart J.	0.50	847.50	027	60553619
	CONSIDER EY EMAIL RE TAX CLAIMS AND REVIEW IRS CLAIM (.5).				
11/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	027	60583267
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE TAX CLAIMS (.1).				
11/24/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim	2.10	2,205.00	027	60554461
	REVIEW IRS PROOF OF CLAIM - EMPLOYMENT TAXES (.7). RESEARCH PRIORITY CLAIMS (.8). CORRESPOND WITH WEIL RE: IRS PROOF OF CLAIM (.6).				
11/24/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.60	558.00	027	60543373

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH WEIL GERMANY OFFICE AND T. LIU RE INQUIRY FROM GERMAN TAX AUTHORITIES ABOUT THE TRANSACTION.				
11/25/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER PRIORITY OF CERTAIN TAX PAYMENTS, AND RESEARCH SAME (1.0); DISCUSS SAME WITH A. ARIKAT (.2); INTERNAL CALL WITH WEIL TAX, R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.6).	1.80	3,051.00	027	60583844
11/25/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE TAX CLAIMS (.1); REVIEW RESEARCH RE PRIORITY OF TAX CLAIMS (.2); CALL WITH TAX TEAM AND D. HOEHNE RE PRIORITY TAX CLAIMS (.6); RESEARCH RE SAME (.2).	1.10	1,595.00	027	60583249
11/25/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH TAX TEAM AND R. BERKOVICH RE: DEFERRED FICA TAX ANALYSIS (.6); REVIEW CASES INTERPRETING PRIORITY PROVISION FOR PAYROLL TAXES (.5); REVIEW FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM A. ARIKAT AND S. GOLDRING RE: DEFERRED FICA TAX CLAIMS (.4); CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: TAX RESEARCH RE: FICA TAX CLAIMS (.2).	1.80	1,980.00	027	60561265
11/25/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRIORITY CLAIMS (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WEIL BFR, TAX RE: EMPLOYMENT TAXES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: EMPLOYMENT TAXES (.3).	2.10	2,205.00	027	60554455
11/25/20	Kutilek, Lukas RESEARCH BANKRUPTCY TAX ISSUES (2.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH TEAM (0.6).	2.70	2,281.50	027	60567868
11/25/20	Zhang, John REVIEW EMAIL CHAIN FORWARDED BY D. HOEHNE RE 507(A) (.2). CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS SAME (.2); RESEARCH 507(A) (1.0). DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO D. HOEHNE SUMMARIZING RESEARCH (1.1).	2.50	1,487.50	027	60554198
11/28/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT.	2.70	2,281.50	027	60569719

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/29/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.7). CORRESPOND WITH L. KUTILEK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.2).	0.90	945.00	027	60603554
11/29/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT.	0.80	676.00	027	60569712
11/30/20	Goldring, Stuart J. EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH TAX TEAM RE VALUATION AND PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION.	0.20	339.00	027	60591631
11/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE TAX CLAIMS.	0.10	145.00	027	60596865
11/30/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPOND WITH BRG, EY, WEIL RE: PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION TIMING.	0.30	315.00	027	60603429
11/30/20	Kutilek, Lukas ANALYZE EMPLOYMENT TAX CLAIM PRIORITY AND OTHER RELATED ISSUES.	0.90	760.50	027	60609276
SUBTOTAL TASK 027 - Tax Issues:		36.70	\$38,947.50		
11/03/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PREPARE FOR CALL WITH NOTEHOLDER M. DA SILVA (0.1); CALL WITH NOTEHOLDER M. DA SILVA TO DISCUSS NOTEHOLDER RECOVERIES, ETC. (0.3); SUMMARIZE CALL WITH NOTEHOLDER (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH GROUP RE: CALL WITH NOTEHOLDER (0.2).	0.90	657.00	029	60614501
SUBTOTAL TASK 029 - Unsecured Creditors Issues/Meetings/Communications/UCC:		0.90	\$657.00		
11/17/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: STATUS OF MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT.	0.10	84.50	030	60533452

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
11/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW M. MARTIR MARKUP OF MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR OCTOBER AND EMAIL RE: CHANGES TO SAME TO M. MARTIR.	0.50	550.00	030	60495812
11/18/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (2.0); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND D. HOEHNE RE SAME (0.6).	2.60	2,626.00	030	60496359
11/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED GLOBAL NOTES FOR OCTOBER MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT.	0.20	220.00	030	60532797
11/19/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT.	0.90	909.00	030	60503763
11/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR OCTOBER FOR FILING.	0.30	330.00	030	60532818
11/20/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING.	0.30	303.00	030	60533863
SUBTOTAL TASK 030 - US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report:		4.90	\$5,022.50		
Total Fees Due		1,330.00	\$1,238,525.50		

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u> <u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>DISB TYPE</u>	<u>DISB ID#</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
11/27/20	Schwanebeck, Julian AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL PAYEE: SPEED COURIER SERVICE GMBH (360180); INVOICE#: 214057; DATE: 12/2/2020 - COSTS FOR DELIVERY ON 11/27/2020 FOR MR. SCHWANEBECK FROM THE FRANKFURT OFFICE	H071	40555512	57.48
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H071:				<u>\$57.48</u>
11/19/20	Peene, Travis J. TELEPHONE PAYEE: RELIABLE WILMINGTON (18280-03); INVOICE#: WL095707; DATE: 11/05/2020 - RESEARCH: INSYS DS HEARING TRANSCRIPT 12/4/2019	H143	40544106	99.60
11/19/20	Stauble, Christopher A. TELEPHONE INVOICE#: CREX435151311191438; DATE: 11/19/2020 - BRIGGS COURTSOLUTIONS TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE 9/17/2020	H143	40544220	70.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H143:				<u>\$169.60</u>
11/05/20	Holt, Andrew FILING FEES PAYEE: BROADRIDGE ICS (44195-02); INVOICE#: BRHC10016133; DATE: 10/28/2020 - EDGAR FILING SERVICE - HTML CONVERSION & SEC SUBMISSION	H181	40530579	565.00
11/16/20	Himelfarb, P.J. FILING FEES PAYEE: BROADRIDGE ICS (44195-02); INVOICE#: BRHC10016746; DATE: 11/10/2020 - EDGAR FILING SERVICE - HTML CONVERSION & SEC SUBMISSION	H181	40539368	2,445.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H181:				<u>\$3,010.00</u>

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2020014620

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u> <u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>DISB TYPE</u>	<u>DISB ID#</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
11/11/20	WGM, Firm DUPLICATING 2676 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 11/07/2020 TO 11/07/2020	S011	40536160	1,338.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE S011:				<u>\$1,338.00</u>
11/04/20	Dallas, Office DUPLICATING 110 PRINT(S) MADE IN DALLAS BETWEEN 10/28/2020 TO 10/31/2020	S117	40530436	11.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE S117:				<u>\$11.00</u>
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS				<u><u>\$4,586.08</u></u>

EXHIBIT J

FEES AND EXPENSES (DECEMBER)

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/01/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS.	0.20	202.00	001	60605225
12/02/20	Luster, Courtney EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING STIPULATION COUNTERPARTIES AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (.3).	0.30	253.50	001	60615648
12/02/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.4).	1.60	1,616.00	001	60641306
12/03/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING COUNTERPARTIES AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (.8).	0.80	676.00	001	60631932
12/03/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION RE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.3).	0.90	909.00	001	60680849
12/07/20	Zhang, John DRAFT CLAIM STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER RESOLVING SLIDEMATIC'S APPLICATION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE.	1.70	1,011.50	001	60657090
12/07/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW SLIDEMATIC AND DANTherm ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE APPLICATIONS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND COUNTERPARTIES REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVISE STIPULATION (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING SAME (0.2); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING VARIOUS STIPULATIONS (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT STIPULATIONS (0.9).	4.00	4,040.00	001	60680858
12/08/20	Hochne, Debora	0.20	220.00	001	60669070

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION TO RESOLVE PAYMENT OF SLIDEMATIC ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIM.				
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	001	60669125
	EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR AND J. ZHANG RE: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE AND 503(B)(9) CLAIM (.1); REVIEW J. ZHANG RESEARCH RE: SAME (.2).				
12/08/20	Zhang, John	6.10	3,629.50	001	60667579
	RESEARCH CASE LAW REGARDING PERMISSIBILITY OF POST-BAR DATE AMENDMENTS TO PROOFS OF CLAIM (2.3); EMAIL TEAM WITH SUMMARY OF SAME (0.9); REVISE CLAIM STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER RESOLVING SLIDEMATIC'S APPLICATION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (0.6); DRAFT CLAIM STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER RESOLVING CURTIS MACHINE'S APPLICATION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (2.3).				
12/08/20	Martir, Martha	4.50	4,545.00	001	60693919
	REVISE VARIOUS ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIM STIPULATIONS (3.3); CORRESPOND WITH VARIOUS CLAIMANTS REGARDING SAME (1.2).				
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	001	60777740
	REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATIONS FOR PAYMENT OF 503(B)(9) CLAIMS (CURTIS MACHINE AND PRO METAL WORKS).				
12/09/20	Zhang, John	2.80	1,666.00	001	60677221
	REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIM STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER RESOLVING PRO METAL WORKS'S APPLICATION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (.9); REVISE CLAIM STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER RESOLVING CURTIS MACHINE'S APPLICATION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (1.4); DRAFT COVER EMAIL TO K. BUONO ATTACHING CLAIM STIPULATIONS (.3); RESPOND TO K. BUONO'S EMAIL REGARDING TIMING OF PAYMENT TO SLIDEMATIC (.2).				
12/09/20	Martir, Martha	3.00	3,030.00	001	60694097
	REVISE VARIOUS STIPULATIONS RE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS (2.0); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING SAME (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS REGARDING SAME (0.4).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/10/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATIONS RESOLVING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE APPLICATIONS (2.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS RE SAME (0.5).	2.70	2,727.00	001	60693788
12/11/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH UFP AND SLIDEMATIC REGARDING STIPULATIONS (0.4); REVISE SAME (0.2).	0.60	606.00	001	60694099
12/13/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED STIPULATION ON UFP REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE PAYMENT AND EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR RE: SAME.	0.50	550.00	001	60777755
12/13/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON STIPULATION (1.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.4); DRAFT EMAIL TO UCC REGARDING SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING RECONCILIATION OF CLAIMS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS REGARDING STIPULATION NEGOTIATIONS (0.5).	2.60	2,626.00	001	60721792
12/14/20	Zhang, John ADD ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES AND DATES TO CURTIS MACHINE AND SLIDEMATIC CLAIM STIPULATIONS (.3); EMAIL K. BUONO REGARDING UPDATES ON THE SAME (.1).	0.40	238.00	001	60707373
12/14/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH UCC REGARDING STIPULATIONS RESOLVING VARIOUS ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE APPLICATIONS (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON STIPULATIONS (3.6); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND VARIOUS CLAIMANTS REGARDING STIPULATION AND ADMIN APPLICATIONS (1.1).	5.20	5,252.00	001	60746299
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED STIPULATIONS WITH AAVID, AB BOYD RE: ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS.	0.10	110.00	001	60777953
12/15/20	Zhang, John COMPARE CHANGES SUGGESTED BY AAVID AND BOYD'S COUNSEL AGAINST CLAIM REGISTER AND PROOF OF CLAIMS (.6); SEND ENTERED ORDERS FOR CURTIS MACHINE AND SLIDEMATIC TO OPPOSING COUNSEL (.2).	0.60	357.00	001	60718840

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/15/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATIONS RESOLVING ADMIN APPLICATIONS (2.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS REGARDING SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS REGARDING QUESTIONS FROM EY REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM OBJECTIONS (0.8).	3.20	3,232.00	001	60746162
12/16/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON STIPULATIONS (1.7); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS C. LUSTER AND J. ZHANG REGARDING SAME (0.7).	2.40	2,424.00	001	60746402
12/17/20	Zhang, John REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE COURT ENTERED CLAIM STIPULATIONS (3.7); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT (.3); SEND FINAL DRAFT TO EY (.1).	4.10	2,439.50	001	60736636
12/21/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING UPDATING LIST OF ALLOWED ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS.	0.40	404.00	001	60778303
12/22/20	Zhang, John COORDINATE WITH J. ALTMAN-DESOLE TO ACCESS AMENDED PROOFS OF CLAIM FILED BY CURTIS MACHINE (.2); FURTHER UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATIONS CHART (.3).	0.50	297.50	001	60778233
12/22/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH FASSETT REGARDING STIPULATION (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE PRO METAL WORKS STIPULATION (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING DANThERM ADMIN APPLICATION (0.2).	0.90	909.00	001	60783752
12/30/20	Martir, Martha REVISE PRO METAL WORKS STIPULATION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH PRO METAL WORKS REGARDING SAME (0.1).	0.60	606.00	001	60823558
SUBTOTAL TASK 001 - Administrative Expense Claims:		51.50	\$45,236.50		
12/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	003	60613755

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH A. KIM RE WORKING CAPITAL ADJUSTMENT UNDER SAPA (.1).				
12/01/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.30	315.00	003	60603548
	REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT AMENDMENTS (0.3).				
12/01/20	Sevalrud, Robert	3.70	3,441.00	003	60605644
	DRAFT AMENDMENT TO ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION (1.6); REVIEW AND ANALYZE WISCONSIN LAW RE SAME (0.5); DRAFT JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS FOR RELEASE OF ADJUSTMENT ESCROW AMOUNT (0.7); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.5); EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND K&E TEAM REGARDING FINAL PURCHASE PRICE (0.4).				
12/02/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.40	420.00	003	60615493
	REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT ISSUES AND CLOSING STATEMENT ISSUES (0.4).				
12/03/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.40	420.00	003	60631205
	REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT CHANGES REQUIRED BY THE PLAN (0.4).				
12/03/20	Myers, Janiel	0.10	84.50	003	60884499
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: DONATION OF MUNNSVILLE PROPERTY (.1).				
12/03/20	Sevalrud, Robert	1.80	1,674.00	003	60633210
	EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAMS REGARDING CHARTER AMENDMENTS FOR DEBTOR ENTITIES (0.5); DRAFT CHARTER AMENDMENTS FOR DEBTOR ENTITIES (1.3).				
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.50	550.00	003	60641049
	REVIEW POST-SALE RECEIVABLES ISSUE AND COORDINATE WITH M&A TEAM RE: ANALYSIS OF SAME.				
12/04/20	Guthrie, Hayden	0.30	315.00	003	60638322
	REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT CHANGES (0.3).				
12/04/20	Sevalrud, Robert	2.40	2,232.00	003	60638650

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT REVISIONS TO ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION FOR DEBTOR ENTITIES (0.8); FINALIZE SAME (0.3); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE AMENDMENTS TO DEBTOR ARTICLES (0.7); EMAILS WITH K&E TEAM REGARDING FINAL PURCHASE PRICE (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMMENTS ON ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT BY LOCAL COUNSEL (0.3).				
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR RE: POST-SALE RECEIVABLES QUESTION.	0.10	110.00	003	60660083
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: POTENTIAL SALE OF MURRAY PROPERTY.	0.10	110.00	003	60660135
12/07/20	Guthrie, Hayden REVIEW ESCROW ISSUES (0.3).	0.30	315.00	003	60657271
12/07/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH K&E TEAM AND CITI TEAM REGARDING JOINT DIRECTION FOR RELEASE OF ESCROW FUNDS (0.3); EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND WEIL M&A TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.2).	0.50	465.00	003	60657287
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FOLLOW UP EMAILS RE: POST-SALE RECEIVABLES ISSUE.	0.10	110.00	003	60669096
12/09/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH CITI, K&E AND CLIENT REGARDING RELEASE OF ESCROW FUNDS.	0.40	372.00	003	60677727
12/10/20	Martir, Martha ANALYZE SAPA AND CONTRACTS TO DETERMINE ALLOCATION OF RECEIVABLE.	0.70	707.00	003	60693902
12/11/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH T LIU REGARDING INQUIRY FROM EY.	0.20	186.00	003	60694106
12/13/20	Martir, Martha	0.70	707.00	003	60721734

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS SCHEDULE.				
12/14/20	Martir, Martha	1.00	1,010.00	003	60746321
	CALL WITH EY AND NEW BRIGGS REGARDING TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS SCHEDULE (0.8); FOLLOW UP CALLS WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
12/15/20	Martir, Martha	0.40	404.00	003	60746201
	RESPOND TO VARIOUS INQUIRIES FROM EY REGARDING TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS SCHEDULE.				
12/15/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.20	186.00	003	60718981
	EMAILS WITH T. LIU REGARDING CLOSING BOOK.				
12/16/20	Sevalrud, Robert	1.30	1,209.00	003	60727189
	EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING SAPA AMENDMENT IN RELATION TO REVISED LIST OF TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS (1.0); REVIEWING EXECUTED COPY OF SAPA IN RESPECT OF SURVIVABILITY (0.3).				
12/17/20	Sevalrud, Robert	1.50	1,395.00	003	60736853
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING DRAFT WIP (0.4); REVIEW AND CONSIDER SAPA AND POST-CLOSING CHECKLIST IN REGARDS TO SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND CONSIDER SAPA IN REGARDS TO RESPONSIBILITY FOR FOIA DISCLOSURE (0.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.3).				
12/18/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.90	837.00	003	60747045
	EMAILS AND CALLS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING POST-CLOSING ACTIONS (0.6); EMAILS WITH HL AND EY TEAMS REGARDING VACATION AND SEVERANCE ADJUSTMENT PAYMENT (.3).				
12/19/20	Myers, Janiel	0.50	422.50	003	60884582
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BILL OF SALE RE: MURRAY ASSETS (.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1).				
12/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	003	60759293

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAPA ISSUE (.1).				
12/20/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.20	186.00	003	60750651
	EMAILS WITH EY TEAM AND K&E TEAM REGARDING SEVERANCE ADJUSTMENT AMOUNT.				
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	003	60781033
	EMAILS WITH M&A AND LABOR/BENEFITS TEAMS RE: POST-CLOSING SEVERANCE PAYMENT.				
12/22/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	003	60884478
	DRAFT NOTICE TO US TRUSTEE AND UCC RE: SALE OF DE MINIMIS ASSETS AT MURRAY PROPERTY (.2).				
12/22/20	Sevalrud, Robert	3.00	2,790.00	003	60778744
	REVIEW AND CONSIDER EMAILS FROM K&E TEAM REGARDING VACATION SEVERANCE AMOUNT (0.3); ANALYZE SAPA AMENDMENT IN RESPECT OF VACATION SEVERANCE AMOUNT (0.5); DRAFT RESPONSE EMAIL TO K&E (0.3); EMAILS WITH WEIL TEAM, EY TEAM AND CLIENT REGARDING DRAFT RESPONSE TO K&E (0.4); CALLS WITH K&E TEAM REGARDING VACATION AND SEVERANCE AMOUNT (0.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING DEPOSITED AMOUNTS FOR UTILITIES (0.3); EMAILS WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING CLOSING SETS (0.3); EMAILS AND CALLS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING LETTER TO K&E (0.4).				
12/23/20	Sevalrud, Robert	1.60	1,488.00	003	60791760
	EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING DRAFT LETTER TO K&E (0.5); CONSIDER AND MARK UP DRAFTS OF LETTER TO K&E REGARDING SEVERANCE PAYMENTS (0.8); ANALYZING SAPA AMENDMENT IN RESPECT OF SAME (0.3).				
12/28/20	Sevalrud, Robert	0.30	279.00	003	60805315
	EMAILS WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT.				
12/29/20	Ellsworth, John A.	0.50	200.00	003	60872667
	ASSIST R. SEVALRUD WITH STATE FILINGS.				
12/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	003	60833576

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE CLAIMS AND DE MINIMIS PROPERTY SALE (.1).				
12/30/20	Myers, Janiel PREPARE NOTICE EMAILS TO US TRUSTEE AND CREDITORS' COMMITTEE RE: THE MUNNSVILLE PROPERTY DONATION (.3).	0.30	253.50	003	60884584
12/30/20	Sevalrud, Robert COORDINATE FILING OF ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT FOR WISCONSIN AND NEBRASKA ENTITIES (0.5); EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.3).	0.80	744.00	003	60818166
12/30/20	Ellsworth, John A. ASSIST R. SEVALRUD WITH WI AND NE FILINGS, FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH CT CORP RE STATUS OF FILINGS.	1.50	600.00	003	60872793
SUBTOTAL TASK 003 - Asset Disposition/363		27.70	\$25,361.50		
Sales:					
12/01/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW COMMENTS FROM FOLEY TO PROPOSED LIFT STAY ORDER FOR ASBESTOS-RELATED PLAINTIFFS (.1); REVIEW PROPOSED DRAFTS (X2) MARK UP SAME (.2); EMAIL K. BUONO RE: FURTHER REVISED HARTKE PROPOSED LIFT STAY ORDER (.1); CALL WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL A. DIBENEDETTO RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION TO LIFT STAY FOR INSURANCE INFORMATION (.2).	0.80	880.00	004	60605531
12/01/20	Berman, Corey D. REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PROPOSED ORDER FROM COUNSEL OF ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS RE: MOTION TO LIFT STAY (0.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: SAME (0.2).	0.50	550.00	004	60634427
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW AND REVISE OPPOSING COUNSEL'S PROPOSED ORDER FOR ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS (1.4); DRAFT AUTOMATIC STAY LETTER TO PARTY FILING LAWSUIT AGAINST DEBTORS (.7); CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.3).	2.40	1,752.00	004	60603391
12/01/20	Martir, Martha	1.50	1,515.00	004	60605246

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE STIPULATION REGARDING DELIVERY OF INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5); FINALIZE AUTOMATIC STAY LETTER TO CLAIMANT (1.0).				
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	004	60615603
	REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO REVISED DRAFT OF ORDER ON LIFT STAY MOTION FOR ASBESTOS-RELATED PLAINTIFFS.				
12/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	004	60615498
	REVISE PROPOSED ORDER FOR ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS.				
12/03/20	Berman, Corey D.	0.30	330.00	004	60639831
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ASBESTOS MOTION CLAIMANTS RE: DEBTORS' MARKUP OF PROPOSED ORDER (0.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' BALLOTS FOR PLAN (0.1).				
12/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.30	219.00	004	60633537
	FINALIZE HARTKE ORDER AND SEND TO LOCAL COUNSEL.				
12/03/20	Martir, Martha	0.30	303.00	004	60680673
	CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY REGARDING STIPULATION (0.1); FINALIZE AUTOMATIC STAY LETTER (0.2).				
12/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	004	60638843
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLAIMANT COUNSEL RE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
12/07/20	Martir, Martha	0.90	909.00	004	60680646
	REVISE STIPULATION INCORPORATING COMMENTS FROM FOLEY (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	004	60669086
	EMAILS WITH T. RISKE AND R. COONEY RE: LITIGATION PLAINTIFF REQUEST TO LIFT STAY (.2); CALL WITH R. COONEY RE: SAME (.1).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/08/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: EXMARK 9019 HEARING SCRIPT (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: ZURICH OBJECTION TO EXMARK 9019 (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.1); REVIEW EXMARK 9019 MOTION AND EXMARK OBJECTION (0.3).	0.60	438.00	004	60760973
12/09/20	Soto, Edward PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH WEIL-TEAM REGARDING METROPOWER'S MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.3).	0.30	420.00	004	60684412
12/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE AUTOMATIC STAY ISSUE (.2).	0.20	290.00	004	60682833
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATED TO DRAFT LIFT STAY ORDER FOR ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS, INCLUDING EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG AND T. WILL RE: SAME.	1.10	1,210.00	004	60777723
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH T. WILL RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION IN CONNECTION WITH LIFT STAY ORDER IN HARTKE CASE.	0.30	330.00	004	60777775
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CONSENT MOTION AND ORDER RE: SMYSER LIFT STAY FOR VOLUNTARY DISMISSAL (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH T. MOHAN RE: SAME (.1).	0.30	330.00	004	60777812
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW OPPOSING COUNSEL'S COMMENTS TO PROPOSED ORDER FOR ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS MOTIONS TO LIFT AUTOMATIC STAY (.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.0).	1.20	876.00	004	60677210
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEFENSE COUNSEL IN UNDERLYING ASBESTOS LITIGATION RE: LIFT STAY MOTION (.2); CALL WITH C. BERMAN RE: ORDER ON LIFT STAY MOTION FOR ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH C. BERMAN (.1).	0.50	550.00	004	60777832

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/10/20	Berman, Corey D. CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: NEGOTIATIONS WITH ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' COUNSEL RE PROPOSED ORDER LIFTING STAY (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED CHANGES TO ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR CALL WITH ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' COUNSEL RE: SAME (0.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME (0.2).	0.60	660.00	004	60690620
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO MOVANT REQUESTING AUTOMATIC STAY BE LIFTED.	0.40	292.00	004	60688714
12/10/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE MARKUP TO STIPULATION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.1).	0.60	606.00	004	60693837
12/11/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH C. BERMAN AND T. WILL RE: LIFT STAY ORDER FOR ASBESTOS PLAINTIFFS.	0.10	110.00	004	60777658
12/11/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW TRANSCRIPT FOR LIFT STAY HEARING (.1); CALL WITH J. EDMONSON, C. BRADY AND D. BERQUIST RE: PROPOSED ORDER FOR LIFT STAY RELIEF FOR ASBESTOS LITIGANTS (.4); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH C. BERMAN RE: SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: FURTHER REVISIONS TO ORDER (.1);.	0.70	770.00	004	60777857
12/11/20	Berman, Corey D. CALL WITH ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' COUNSEL AND D. HOEHNE RE: DISCUSSION ON PROPOSED ORDER ON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (0.4); REVISE PROPOSED ORDER RE: SAME (0.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND PRODUCTS LIABILITY/ASBESTOS COUNSEL RE: SAME (0.1); CALL WITH T. FOLEY AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: DEBTORS' EDITS TO PROPOSED ORDER BASED ON DISCUSSIONS AND CLIENT INPUT (0.1).	1.20	1,320.00	004	60715685
12/11/20	Martir, Martha REVISE STIPULATION.	0.40	404.00	004	60693676
12/14/20	Berman, Corey D.	0.30	330.00	004	60735568

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS' COUNSEL AND AT WEIL RE: PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO LIFT STAY.				
12/14/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW COMMENTS TO FASSETT STIPULATION (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH FASSETT REGARDING SAME (0.1).	0.30	303.00	004	60746203
12/15/20	Paddock, Alyssa FINALIZE EXMARK SETTLEMENT PROPOSED ORDER (1.7); PREPARE FOR PRESENTMENT OF THE SETTLEMENT MOTION IN COURT (1.5).	3.20	2,704.00	004	60757213
12/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa PREPARE FOR EXMARK MOTION PRESENTATION (1.9); COORDINATE WITH PARTIES FOLLOWING APPROVAL OF MOTION/PROPOSED ORDER (.6).	2.50	2,112.50	004	60757516
12/17/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON INQUIRIES REGARDING THE EFFECT OF THE EXISTING STAY ON FOIA REQUESTS (.3); REVIEW PRIOR RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RELATED TO SAME (.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES PRESENTED BY THE FOIA REQUEST AT ISSUE HERE (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	1.00	1,400.00	004	60743769
12/17/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: LIFT STAY CONSENT MOTION (SMYSER).	0.10	110.00	004	60778040
12/17/20	Berman, Corey D. RESEARCH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. SOTO RE: CPSC FOIA REQUEST IMPLICATING BRIGGS CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION (0.5).	0.50	550.00	004	60752455
12/17/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW MATERIALS RE SMYSER LIFT STAY MOTION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY, UCC, AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH FASSETT REGARDING STIPULATION (0.1).	0.80	808.00	004	60746391
12/28/20	Martir, Martha	0.30	303.00	004	60806336

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
FINALIZE FASSETT STIPULATION (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH FASSETT REGARDING STIPULATION (0.2).					
SUBTOTAL TASK 004 - Automatic Stay:		25.10	\$24,270.50		
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, M. MARTIR, E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION.	0.50	550.00	005	60615553
12/02/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY CALL WITH EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS.	0.50	490.00	005	60778063
12/02/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH EY TEAM, E. BLECHMAN, AND M. MARTIR RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROGRESS (.5).	0.50	422.50	005	60884546
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATED TO PRIORITY TAX CLAIMS (.5); CALL WITH C. LUSTER RE: ANALYSIS OF LITIGATION CLAIMS (.1).	0.60	660.00	005	60641072
12/07/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES FROM L. RICHARDS ON WARNER FRAZIER AND SPLIT DOLLAR INSURANCE AND COMPANY LIFE INSURANCE REVIEW PROOF OF CLAIM AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (0.9); CONF. WITH L. RICHARDS RE SAME (0.2).	1.10	1,237.50	005	60660460
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN, K. LEMKE, K. BUONO AND T. MOHAN RE: STIPULATION TO EFFECTUATE DISMISSAL OF NON-BANKRUPTCY PERSONAL INJURY LITIGATION AND WITHDRAWAL OF CREDITOR'S PROOF OF CLAIM.	0.20	220.00	005	60660060
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION.	0.30	330.00	005	60660069
12/07/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. NELSON RE: NMTC STIPULATION (.1).	0.10	84.50	005	60884772

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/07/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.3).	0.40	292.00	005	60760953
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLAIMS (.1).	0.10	145.00	005	60672467
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO PBGC CLAIM AND EMAILS WITH P. PRICKETT, S. MARGOLIS AND P. WESSEL RE: SAME (.6); CALLS (X2) WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (.3); EMAILS WITH MERCER RE: SAME (.1).	0.90	990.00	005	60669123
12/08/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON QUESTIONS FROM S. HOFNER RE: CLAIMS WORKSTREAMS (.7).	0.70	591.50	005	60884807
12/09/20	Soto, Edward PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH L. ALEXANDER AND K. BUONO REGARDING COMPLETION OF INTERNAL INVESTIGATION OF POSSIBLE CLAIMS (.3).	0.30	420.00	005	60977851
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH MERCER RE: PBGC CLAIMS (.5); CALL WITH O. LASHKO RE: APPROACH TO PBGC CLAIMS (.1); EMAIL WITH PBGC RE: CLAIMS (.1); EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: POTENTIAL LATE FILED CLAIM AND NOTICING FOR SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH R. COONEY (COUNSEL TO CLAIMANT) RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: PBGC CLAIM (.1); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS AND P. PRICKETT RE: SAME (.2).	1.20	1,320.00	005	60777777
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH J. MYERS RE: NMTC STIPULATION AND INQUIRIES FROM UCC COUNSEL RE: SAME.	0.20	220.00	005	60777796
12/09/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND FINALIZE NMTC STIPULATION FOR FILING (.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CARMODY RE: FILING THE SAME (.1).	0.70	591.50	005	60884747

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/09/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW PRECEDENT CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTIONS AND DRAFT CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (3.3).	3.30	2,409.00	005	60760923
12/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLAIMS (.1).	0.10	145.00	005	60691039
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH M. SCHLAN AND J. HENRICH RE: NMTC STIPULATION.	0.20	220.00	005	60777787
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CHANGES TO FASSETT STIPULATION.	0.10	110.00	005	60777845
12/10/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EY'S QUESTIONS RE: CLAIM WORKSTREAMS (.4); CALL WITH EXECUTOR OF DECEASED RETIRED EMPLOYEE RE: REMOVAL FROM MAILING LIST (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SILVERWOOD RE: DAIHATSU PROOF OF CLAIM (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR DAIHATSU RE: SAME (.1).	0.70	591.50	005	60884791
12/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (3.2).	3.20	2,336.00	005	60760967
12/11/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING OPT-OUT FORM (.1); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR U-SHIN RE: TREATMENT OF ITS UNSECURED AND ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.1); REVIEW AND ANALYZE U-SHIN PROOF OF CLAIM (.4);.	0.60	507.00	005	60884783
12/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.8).	0.80	584.00	005	60760969
12/12/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW L. RICHARDS' ANALYSIS OF EMPLOYMENT/DISCRIMINATION RELATED CLAIMS.	0.20	220.00	005	60777717

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/12/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON REGARDING UNEMPLOYMENT CLAIMS (0.2); REVIEW SAPA AND SALE ORDER REGARDING SAME (0.5).	0.70	707.00	005	60696679
12/14/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: DECEMBER 16 HEARING ON CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. SILVERWOOD RE: DAIHATSU CLAIMS AND PAYMENT (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO B. SARGENT (COUNSEL TO DAIHATSU RE: SAME (.1).	0.40	338.00	005	60884605
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH L. RICHARDS RE: ANALYSIS OF EMPLOYMENT LITIGATION CLAIMS.	0.10	110.00	005	60777987
12/16/20	Myers, Janiel REVISE ORDERS FOR 14 CLAIM OBJECTIONS.	1.90	1,605.50	005	60884616
12/17/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH S. HOFNER, C. CARPENTER, M. MARTIR AND J. MYERS RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION.	0.40	440.00	005	60778049
12/17/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH EY TEAM, D. HOEHNE, AND M. MARTIR RE: CLAIMS WORKSTREAMS (.4).	0.40	338.00	005	60884635
12/17/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH EY, D. HOEHNE, AND J. MYERS REGARDING CLAIM RECONCILIATION.	0.40	404.00	005	60746382
12/20/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS RE: SUSTAINED CLAIMS OBJECTIONS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS.	0.10	110.00	005	60756819
12/20/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CHUBB CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.3).	0.30	253.50	005	60884554
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	005	60778073

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SUSTAINED CLAIMS OBJECTIONS.				
12/21/20	Blechman, Eli	0.50	490.00	005	60872651
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH LOCAL COUNSEL AND COUNSEL FOR CERTAIN INSURERS RE: CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (0.2); REVIEW LOCAL RULES RE: SAME (0.1); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME (0.2).				
12/21/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	005	60884543
	CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR U-SHIN RE: PROOF OF CLAIM (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND A. CITRON RE: CHUBB CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.1).				
12/21/20	Zhang, John	0.60	357.00	005	60766058
	UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATION SUMMARY CHART TO REFLECT DAN THERM'S 503(B)(9) CLAIM.				
12/21/20	Citron, Andrew	0.30	279.00	005	60859819
	CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS RE: CHUBB CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.3).				
12/22/20	Myers, Janiel	0.10	84.50	005	60884468
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY AND KCC RE: U-SHIN PROOF OF CLAIM (.1).				
12/22/20	Zhang, John	0.80	476.00	005	60778248
	UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATION FOR PRO METAL WORKS TO REFLECT POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT ON ASSERTED GUC CLAIMS.				
12/22/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	0.50	125.00	005	60803436
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.				
12/23/20	Myers, Janiel	0.10	84.50	005	60884534
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: CHUBB CLAIMS (.1).				
12/23/20	Zhang, John	0.70	416.50	005	60790273
	FURTHER REVISE AND FINALIZE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART (.6); SEND THE FINAL CHART TO EY (.1).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/23/20	Zhang, John FURTHER UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART.	0.20	119.00	005	60790297
12/23/20	Martir, Martha REVISE CHART DESCRIBING STIPULATED CLAIMS (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING SAME (0.2).	0.90	909.00	005	60790339
12/24/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.	0.50	125.00	005	60803429
12/28/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH M. MARTIR RE: CHUBB CLAIMS (.2).	0.20	169.00	005	60884604
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT MOTION FOR CLAIMS PROCEDURES, SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES, HEARING PROCEDURES (3.3).	3.30	2,409.00	005	60885985
12/28/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND EY REGARDING TRANSFER OF CLAIMS.	0.20	202.00	005	60806210
12/29/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION.	0.60	660.00	005	60817629
12/29/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT STIPULATION RE: CHUBB CLAIMS (1.0); REVISE RE: SAME TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS (.5); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.2); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. MCGEHRIN RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM COUNSEL FOR CHUBB (.4).	2.30	1,943.50	005	60884701
12/29/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.30	3,869.00	005	60886176

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT AND FINALIZE MOTION FOR CLAIMS OBJECTION PROCEDURES, SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES, HEARING PROCEDURES (3.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (0.1); REVIEW PRECEDENT EXHIBITS FOR CLAIMS AND SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES MOTIONS AND DRAFT EXHIBITS (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH D HOEHNE RE: SETTLEMENT PRECEDENT WITH RESPECT TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES (0.3).				
12/29/20	Martir, Martha	0.70	707.00	005	60813929
	CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING REVISING THE CLAIMS REGISTER TO REFLECT RECENT STIPULATIONS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING ADDING VARIOUS STIPULATIONS TO THE STIPULATION TRACKER (0.4).				
12/29/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	0.50	125.00	005	60849366
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.				
12/30/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	005	60837186
	EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION.				
12/30/20	Myers, Janiel	0.50	422.50	005	60884649
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: CHUBB STIPULATION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. MCGEHRIN RE: SAME (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO T. RISKE RE: SAME (.1).				
12/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	8.80	6,424.00	005	60885869
	RESEARCH/ANALYZE PRECEDENT CLAIM SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES AMOUNTS AND NUMBER OF CLAIMS THAT MAY BE INCLUDED IN SUBSTANTIVE OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (3.4); SUMMARIZE RESEARCH AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES AND SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION, SETTLEMENT AMOUNTS (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIM/SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES MOTION (3.2).				
12/30/20	Zhang, John	1.90	1,130.50	005	60818021

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART TO INCLUDE STIPULATIONS/SETTLEMENTS INVOLVING PICOSPRAY, UNITED STEELWORKERS, JAMES WIER, AND DON SCHOONENBERG (1.7); COMMUNICATE WITH EY REGARDING PAYMENT OF PICOSPRAY'S ALLOWED SECURED ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2).				
12/30/20	Martir, Martha	1.50	1,515.00	005	60823552
	CALLS WITH E. BERDINI AND J. ZHANG REGARDING PREPETITION CLAIM (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND EY REGARDING SAME (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CLAIM SETTLEMENT CHART (0.5).				
12/30/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob	0.50	125.00	005	60849282
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. ZHANG.				
12/31/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	005	60837346
	REVIEW REVISED CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS.				
12/31/20	Myers, Janiel	0.90	760.50	005	60884683
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. RISKE RE: CHUBB STIPULATION (.2); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. MCGEHRIN RE: SAME (.3); REVISE AND PREPARE FOR FILING RE: SAME (.3); CONFER WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1).				
12/31/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	6.70	4,891.00	005	60886180
	REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND DRAFT/REVISE EXHIBITS TO MOTION (6.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (0.2).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 005 - Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues:		62.00	\$49,530.50		
12/01/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.20	146.00	006	60653054
	PROVIDE WIP LIST UPDATE TO J. ZHANG (0.2).				
12/01/20	Zhang, John	0.30	178.50	006	60602938
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING CASE CALENDAR (.1); AND STATUS OF THIRD MONTHLY FEE PAYMENT (.2).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/01/20	Zhang, John FINALIZE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR FOR R. BERKOVICH'S MEETING WITH K. BUONO.	0.30	178.50	006	60603019
12/01/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789672
12/02/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: CASE DEADLINES.	0.30	219.00	006	60653104
12/02/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (.6); REVISE CALENDAR REMINDERS FOR CASE DEADLINES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. KO REGARDING DEADLINES FOR HEARING AGENDA AND W&E LIST (.3).	1.00	595.00	006	60615050
12/02/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789606
12/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW NEW FILINGS ON DOCKET AND SUMMARIZE SAME FOR WEIL TEAM.	0.10	73.00	006	60633347
12/03/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789643
12/04/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.20	119.00	006	60638559
12/04/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60789699
12/05/20	Myers, Janiel COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.10	84.50	006	60884509

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/06/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.80	476.00	006	60641471
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP.	0.10	110.00	006	60660147
12/07/20	Blechman, Eli UPDATE WIP.	0.20	196.00	006	60825314
12/07/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP (.2).	0.20	169.00	006	60884804
12/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE (.2); REVIEW WIP AND PROVIDE COMMENTS (.2).	0.40	292.00	006	60657338
12/07/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW WIP LIST (0.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM TEAM RE: CASE UPDATES (0.1); RX WIP CALL TO DISCUSS STATUS OF CASE AND ACTIVE WORKSTREAMS (1.2).	1.40	1,022.00	006	60760962
12/07/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (.9).	0.90	535.50	006	60657060
12/07/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.60	150.00	006	60767053
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60672429
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP.	0.20	220.00	006	60669083

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/08/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60667730
12/08/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60766213
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60677184
12/09/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60766963
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60688623
12/10/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.50	297.50	006	60686797
12/10/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.20	50.00	006	60766973
12/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.20	146.00	006	60694020
12/11/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60766804
12/13/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.40	238.00	006	60696405
12/14/20	Blechman, Eli	0.20	196.00	006	60864305

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE WIP PER LATEST CASE UPDATES.				
12/14/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.30	253.50	006	60884581
12/14/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP.	0.20	146.00	006	60707237
12/14/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (1.1).	1.10	654.50	006	60707367
12/14/20	Citron, Andrew REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO WIP (.2).	0.20	186.00	006	60793961
12/14/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST T. PEENE WITH PREPARATION OF CONFIRMATION HEARING (.6); RESEARCH CONFIRMATION PLEADINGS FOR E. BLECHMAN (.6).	1.20	522.00	006	60715596
12/14/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60793640
12/15/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW VARIOUS DOCKET ENTRIES (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60725254
12/15/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP (.2).	0.20	290.00	006	60725327
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW WIP.	0.20	220.00	006	60777964
12/15/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	006	60719261

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.				
12/15/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (1.1); CIRCULATE SAME TO K. BUONO AND EY (.1).	1.20	714.00	006	60718893
12/15/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60793646
12/16/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.40	100.00	006	60793598
12/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	219.00	006	60736750
12/17/20	Zhang, John ARRANGE CALENDAR REMINDER FOR JANUARY OMNIBUS HEARING (.1); UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR (.1).	0.20	119.00	006	60736630
12/17/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60793532
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW UPDATED POST-CONFIRMATION/PRE-EFFECTIVE DATE WIP (.2).	0.20	220.00	006	61027375
12/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE DOCKET UPDATE.	0.10	73.00	006	60746698
12/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.	0.60	438.00	006	60746717
12/18/20	Martir, Martha	0.60	606.00	006	60746413

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
INTERNAL TEAM CALL REGARDING THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.					
12/18/20	Pal, Himansu PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.30	75.00	006	60793508
12/20/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.00	595.00	006	60748859
12/21/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60769741
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW POST-CONFIRMATION WORK IN PROCESS LIST.	0.10	110.00	006	60778065
12/21/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP PER CASE UPDATES.	0.20	196.00	006	60872707
12/21/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP (.3).	0.30	253.50	006	60884527
12/21/20	Paddock, Alyssa PARTICIPATE ON WEIL TEAM CALL.	1.20	1,014.00	006	60864803
12/21/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.50	892.50	006	60765957
12/21/20	Citron, Andrew TEAM WIP MEETING (1.2).	1.20	1,116.00	006	60848295
12/21/20	Altman-DeSole, Jacob OBTAIN RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE DAILY DOCKET UPDATE.	0.50	125.00	006	60803448

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP LIST (.3).	0.30	435.00	006	60782709
12/22/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.60	952.00	006	60778223
12/22/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG REGARDING UPDATES TO WORK IN PROGRESS LIST.	0.20	202.00	006	60783611
12/23/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.20	119.00	006	60790287
12/23/20	Martir, Martha CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, AND E. BLECHMAN REGARDING THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	0.10	101.00	006	60790345
12/27/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.50	297.50	006	60796539
12/28/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP (.1).	0.10	84.50	006	60884647
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE RECENTLY FILED PLEADINGS (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON WIP LIST (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: WIP LIST ITEMS (0.1).	0.80	584.00	006	61000667
12/28/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.10	654.50	006	60804049
12/29/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WIP (.1).	0.10	145.00	006	60814879

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/29/20	Zhang, John UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.80	476.00	006	60810129
SUBTOTAL TASK 006 - Case Administration (docket updates and WIP ONLY):		32.40	\$20,557.00		
12/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE WORKING CAPITAL CALCULATION, PLAN, AND RELATED ITEMS (.3); CALL WITH FOLEY, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BERDINI RE PLAN (PARTIAL) (.6); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.1).	1.00	1,450.00	007	60613670
12/01/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW COMMENTS FROM WEIL TAX AND A. PADDOCK TO DRAFT PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT.	0.10	110.00	007	60605592
12/01/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.1); CALL WITH E. KHATCHOURIAN, R. BERKOVICH AND E. BLECHMAN RE: INSURANCE RELATED COMMENTS TO PLAN (.9); REVIEW RESPONSES FROM E. BLECHMAN TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR QUESTIONS RE: PLAN (.1); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: PLAN AND DISTRIBUTIONS (.3); REVIEW AMENDMENT TO CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION FOR B&S CORP. AND EMAIL FOLEY TEAM RE: WISCONSIN LAW REVIEW OF SAME (.1); REVIEW WEIL MARKUP OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND EMAILS WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (.1).	1.60	1,760.00	007	60605685
12/01/20	Kim, Aileen REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: POST CLOSING STATEMENT (0.9); REVIEW DRAFT JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS AND ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.6); REVIEW CHARTER AMENDMENT AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (0.8).	2.30	2,530.00	007	60605001
12/01/20	Blechman, Eli	5.50	5,390.00	007	60777859

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND CONFORM TO THE PLAN (RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR'S AUTHORITY) (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (0.2); CALL WITH K. BUONO AND WEIL TEAM RE: REMAINING ASSETS AND POTENTIAL ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES (0.3); CALL WITH A. CITRON AND CHUBB COUNSEL RE: PLAN MODIFICATIONS TO ADDRESS CHUBB'S INFORMAL COMMENTS (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO A. PADDOCK (1.0); CALL WITH FOLEY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: PLAN CHANGES (INSURANCE RELATED) (1.0); REVIEW PLAN AND RESPOND TO QUERIES FROM UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TEAMS RE: SAME (0.5); REVIEW AND FURTHER REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (1.5).				
12/01/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.3).	0.30	253.50	007	60884482
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE OPT OUT PORTION OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	1.10	803.00	007	60603430
12/01/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALLS WITH CREDITORS TO DISCUSS OPT OUT FORMS (0.4).	0.40	292.00	007	60977427
12/01/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (1.8); REVIEW BACKGROUND AND DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (9.6).	11.40	9,633.00	007	60639407
12/01/20	Zhang, John DRAFT NOTICE OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	0.90	535.50	007	60602942
12/01/20	Martir, Martha CALL AND EMAILS WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.9); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SPREADSHEETS REGARDING SAME (3.1).	4.00	4,040.00	007	60605174
12/01/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: CHUBB INSURERS AND POTENTIAL PLAN OBJECTION.	0.30	279.00	007	60675309

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/02/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS RELATED TO POTENTIAL CONTESTED ISSUES REQUIRING LITIGATION SUPPORT IN CONNECTION WITH CONFIRMATION HEARING ON DECEMBER 18TH (.4); REVIEW OF PRIOR DECLARATIONS AND TESTIMONY BY POTENTIAL WITNESSES RELATED TO SAME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.2).	1.00	1,400.00	007	60627660
12/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY (.2); EMAIL TEAM RE CONFIRMATION (.1).	0.30	435.00	007	60628311
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. SCHLAN, E. BLECHMAN AND A. PADDOCK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT AND OTHER CONFIRMATION RELATED ISSUES (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE: RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.2); EMAILS RE: AMENDED CORPORATE ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH M& TEAM RE: AMENDMENTS TO CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME AND PLAN PROVISIONS FOR DISSOLUTION/CANCELLATION OF EQUITY INTERESTS (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: PLANNING FOR CONFIRMATION (.4).	1.60	1,760.00	007	60615554
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAIL FROM E. BLECHMAN RE: CURE PROVISIONS IN PLAN FOR ASSUMED CONTRACTS (.1); REVIEW DRAFT RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION INSERT FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1).	0.20	220.00	007	60615555
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora ANALYZE CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS AND PLAN AROUND PREPARATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.3); COORDINATION CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, M. MARTIR, AND EY RE: CHAPTER 11 CASE WORKSTREAMS AND WIND-DOWN (.5).	1.80	1,980.00	007	60615574
12/02/20	Kim, Aileen CORRESPONDENCE RE: POST-CLOSING STATEMENT (0.1). REVIEW REVISED CHARTER AMENDMENT AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (0.9).	1.00	1,100.00	007	60623413
12/02/20	Blechman, Eli	6.50	6,370.00	007	60778042

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE, A. PADDOCK, J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND CONFIRMATION CHECKLIST (0.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: OPT-OUT ISSUES FOR BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (1.2); CALL WITH M. SCHLAN RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (0.5); REVIEW PLAN FOLLOWING CERTAIN QUESTIONS RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AUTHORITY AND CLAIMS ISSUES (0.4); CONDUCT ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE: OPT-OUT ISSUES FOR BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (0.6); REVIEW AMENDED CERTIFICATES OF INCORPORATION AND OTHER RELATED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR PROVISIONS RE: ASSUMPTION OF EXECUTORY CONTRACTS IN SALE/LIQUIDATION PLANS AND CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND M. MARTIR RE: SAME (1.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE, M. MARTIR, J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT ISSUES (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND M. MARTIR RE: ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE TO BE FILED AS PART OF THE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.4).				
12/02/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	007	60884568
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR NMTC LENDERS RE: BALLOTS AND NOTICE OF NON-VOTING STATUS (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. KIM, E. BLECHMAN, AND D. HOEHNE RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.1).				
12/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	3.30	2,409.00	007	60615595
	DRAFT OPT OUT INSERT FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH FOR SAME (.5); DRAFT SCHEDULE OF RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (1.3).				
12/02/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	3.90	2,847.00	007	60653158
	CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND RELATED WORKSTREAMS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.5); DRAFT SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (3.1).				
12/02/20	Paddock, Alyssa	9.50	8,027.50	007	60639406
	CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.4); DISCUSS CONFIRMATION BRIEF WITH E. BERDINI (.5); REVIEW BACKGROUND AND DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (8.6).				
12/02/20	Zhang, John	1.00	595.00	007	60614938
	REVISE DRAFT NOTICE OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/02/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND REVISE ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (1.6); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, EY, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.7).	2.30	2,323.00	007	60641219
12/03/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS RELATED TO POTENTIAL CONTESTED ISSUES REQUIRING A DECLARATION AND POTENTIAL TESTIMONY IN CONNECTION WITH DECEMBER 18TH CONFIRMATION HEARING (.5); REVIEW PRIOR DECLARATIONS AND TESTIMONY BY POTENTIAL WITNESSES RELATED TO SAME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	1.00	1,400.00	007	60635555
12/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE SAME (.1).	0.60	870.00	007	60636173
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH M. MARTIR, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: CURE AMOUNTS/PROCESS FOR ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE, INCLUDING REVIEW OF CONTRACTS TO BE LISTED ON ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (.6); EMAILS WITH J. ZHANG RE: NOTICE OF FILING OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.2); EMAILS WITH J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: STATUS OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT FILINGS (.1); REVIEW EMAILS RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT WITH M&A TEAM, BROWN RUDNICK, AND RESTRUCTURING TEAM (.5); CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF RIDER (.2).	2.00	2,200.00	007	60641030
12/03/20	Kim, Aileen REVIEW ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENT AMENDMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (1.1).	1.10	1,210.00	007	60632836
12/03/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE DRAFT OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT PER COMMENTS FROM UCC AND K. BUONO (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, M. MARTIR, J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: VARIOUS PLAN SUPPLEMENT ISSUES (0.5).	1.50	1,470.00	007	60789997
12/03/20	Myers, Janiel	1.30	1,098.50	007	60884542

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT AMENDED ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS (.2); CONFER WITH D. ZHANG RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.2); REVIEW AMENDED ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION (.1); CALL WITH R. SEVALRUD RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH FOLEY TEAM RE: AMENDED ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT WORKSTREAMS (.2); CALL WITH J. ZHANG TO DISCUSS 1129 DISCLOSURES (.1); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF 1129 DISCLOSURE (.2).				
12/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.80	2,044.00	007	60633413
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH LITIGATION TEAM RE CONFIRMATION WITNESS PREPARATION (.1).				
12/03/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	9.00	6,570.00	007	60653288
	DRAFT SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (9.0).				
12/03/20	Paddock, Alyssa	13.30	11,238.50	007	60639405
	REVIEW BACKGROUND AND DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF.				
12/03/20	Zhang, John	6.00	3,570.00	007	60631890
	RESEARCH PER PLAN AND PER DEBTOR INTERPRETATIONS OF SECTION 1129(A)(10) (0.7); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING DRAFTING OF RIDER TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.1); DRAFT RIDER TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (4.2); REVISE DRAFT NOTICE OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT (1.0).				
12/03/20	Martir, Martha	8.70	8,787.00	007	60680854
	CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH AND EY REGARDING ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.5); CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING ASSUMPTION NOTICE (1.0); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT ASSUMPTION NOTICE (6.0); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH C. LUSTER AND EY REGARDING SAME (1.2).				
12/04/20	Himelfarb, P.J.	0.20	260.00	007	60650368
	DISCUSS PLAN SUPPLEMENT 8-K.				
12/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	007	60655838

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); CONFER WITH J. MYERS RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1).				
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (.1); CALL WITH R. SEVALRUD RE: FINALIZING CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (.1); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: FINALIZING PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.2); EMAILS AND DOCUMENT REVIEW TO RESOLVE ISSUES AND FINALIZE PLAN SUPPLEMENT FOR FILING (1.7); REVIEW VOTING RESULTS UPDATE AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: SAME (.4).	2.50	2,750.00	007	60641020
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF RIDER.	0.40	440.00	007	60641062
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PLAN COMMENTS FROM CARB.	0.30	330.00	007	60641092
12/04/20	Kim, Aileen CORRESPONDENCE RE: CHARTER AMENDMENTS (0.8). CORRESPONDENCE RE: ESCROW AGREEMENT (0.2).	1.00	1,100.00	007	60638930
12/04/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE DRAFT OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT PER ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM UCC AND K. BUONO (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, M. MARTIR, J. MYERS AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: VARIOUS PLAN SUPPLEMENT ISSUES (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE VARIOUS PLAN SUPPLEMENT FILINGS (0.5); REVISE PLAN TO REFLECT CHANGES TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF RE: OPT-OUT MECHANISM (2.0).	4.50	4,410.00	007	60790207
12/04/20	Myers, Janiel	5.30	4,478.50	007	60884487

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW COMMENTS FROM FOLEY AND CARMODY ON AMENDMENTS TO ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. SEVALRUD AND H. GUTHRIE RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH D. KO TO DISCUSS PLAN SUPPLEMENT FILING (.1); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.4); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ZHANG RE SAME (.9); CONFER WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: AMENDED ARTICLES FOR ALLMAND BROS. (.1); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON COMPILED PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: AMENDED ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION (.3); CALL WITH B. ZIMMERMAN RE: AMENDED ARTICLES FOR BILLY GOAT (.3); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. SEVALRUD RE: AMENDED ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC TEAM RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT FILING (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. RISKE RE: AMENDED ARTICLES FOR BILLY GOAT (.1); COORDINATE WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM TO FILE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (2.3).				
12/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	5.40	3,942.00	007	60638840
	REVIEW PRECEDENT CONFIRMATION DECLARATIONS (.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC RE SCHEDULE OF RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION (.1); CALL WITH M. SCHLAN RE SAME (.1) FINALIZE SCHEDULE OF RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION (.1); DRAFT CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (4.4).				
12/04/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	8.10	5,913.00	007	60653270
	DRAFT SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (8.1).				
12/04/20	Paddock, Alyssa	11.40	9,633.00	007	60639409
	DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (11.1) AND CIRCULATE TO TEAM (.3).				
12/04/20	Zhang, John	4.80	2,856.00	007	60638552
	REVISE PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.3); PREPARE EXHIBITS FOR PLAN SUPPLEMENT NOTICE (.5); FINALIZE ALL PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED (1.9); DRAFT RIDER TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.8); REVISE DRAFT RIDER PER D. HOEHNE'S COMMENTS (.3).				
12/04/20	Martir, Martha	8.10	8,181.00	007	60684976
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE AND NOTICE (4.5); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (1.9); REVIEW SAP CONTRACTS REGARDING SAME (1.7).				
12/05/20	Soto, Edward	0.50	700.00	007	60650247

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PROPOSED TESTIMONY IN SUPPORT OF THE PLAN CONFIRMATION HEARING (.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).				
12/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.1).	0.10	145.00	007	60655749
12/05/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER (.8); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.4); CALL E. BLECHMAN RE: CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.2).	1.40	1,540.00	007	60641077
12/05/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CHANGES TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.7).	0.70	591.50	007	60884570
12/05/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE OPT OUT SECTION OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	2.50	1,825.00	007	60640957
12/05/20	Zhang, John REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF RIDER.	2.30	1,368.50	007	60639473
12/06/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	1.60	1,760.00	007	60653967
12/06/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF RE: OPT-OUT MECHANISM AND EXCULPATION PROVISION.	2.00	1,960.00	007	60815575
12/06/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT CONFIRMATION DECLARATION.	1.50	1,095.00	007	60648390
12/07/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	007	60663977

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN (.1); REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1).				
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW LANGUAGE TO RESOLVE INFORMAL COMMENTS TO PLAN/CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.3); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW FURTHER EMAILS FROM E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS TO PLAN TO ADDRESS INSURER COMMENTS (.2); EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.1).	1.00	1,100.00	007	60659845
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT OF FICKS DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION.	1.30	1,430.00	007	60660028
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO DRAFT BRIEF RIDER ON OPT-OUT RELEASE MECHANISM.	1.30	1,430.00	007	60660095
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED RIDER FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	0.10	110.00	007	60660167
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION/EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.20	220.00	007	60660169
12/07/20	Kim, Aileen CORRESPONDENCE RE: JOINT WRITTEN INSTRUCTION (0.5).	0.50	550.00	007	60659232
12/07/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM VARIOUS PARTIES (DOJ, CARB, ASBESTOS INSURERS) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE AND COUNSEL TO VARIOUS PARTIES RE: SAME (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF AND DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION AND PROPOSED ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN (2.5).	4.50	4,410.00	007	60825287
12/07/20	Myers, Janiel REVISE DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION ORDER.	2.60	2,197.00	007	60884785

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (2.0); REVISE OPT OUT SECTION (1.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE STANDARD FOR CONSENT IN BANKRUPTCY CONTEXT AND DECISIONS ON OPT OUT MECHANISMS (4.1).	7.60	5,548.00	007	60657373
12/07/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (1.6).	1.70	1,241.00	007	60761008
12/07/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	2.20	1,859.00	007	60756217
12/07/20	Zhang, John DRAFT NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE.	3.70	2,201.50	007	60657089
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE BOARD ISSUES, CONFIRMATION AND OTHER ISSUES (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION AND OTHER STRATEGY ISSUES (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE POTENTIAL PLAN OBJECTION (.1).	1.10	1,595.00	007	60672415
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW PROPOSED LANGUAGE TO CARB RE: COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION ORDER (.1); REVIEW PLAN COMMENTS FROM MDOR AND COORDINATE WITH J. MYERS AND E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.6); REVIEW RESEARCH ON CONSENSUAL THIRD PARTY RELEASES (.4); EMAILS WITH T. RISKE AND BROWN RUDNICK RE: UST PLAN COMMENTS RAISED AT DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING (.1).	1.20	1,320.00	007	60669104
12/08/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM ASBESTOS INSURERS AND D&O INSURERS, CONDUCT RELATED RESEARCH, AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE, FOLEY TEAM AND COUNSEL TO INSURERS RE: SAME (2.2); REVISE PLAN PER COMMENTS FROM OTHER PARTIES (DOJ, CARB, MDOR) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE, AND COUNSEL TO PARTIES RE: SAME (1.5); REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF AND DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION AND PROPOSED ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN (2.8).	6.50	6,370.00	007	60825303

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/08/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING ASSOCIATES RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE FROM MISSISSIPPI DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE (.1); REVIEW AND ANALYZE RE: SAME (.2); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER TO INCLUDE LANGUAGE FROM U.S. DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE (.1); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER; CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (4.7);.	5.10	4,309.50	007	60884816
12/08/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (2.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH ON THIRD PARTY RELEASE CASE LAW AND RELATED CONSENT ISSUES (3.0); REVISE OPT OUT AND THIRD PARTY RELEASE ARGUMENT IN CONFIRMATION BRIEF (4.0).	9.20	6,716.00	007	60667714
12/08/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALLS WITH VARIOUS CREDITORS AND EQUITY HOLDERS TO DISCUSS OPT OUT FORMS, PLAN, CONFIRMATION, ETC. (0.7).	0.70	511.00	007	60760940
12/08/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (2.9); CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: CURE/EXECUTORY CONTRACTS QUESTIONS FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH UCC RE: STATEMENT IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.1); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.5).	3.80	2,774.00	007	60761010
12/08/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	1.70	1,436.50	007	60756625
12/08/20	Zhang, John REVISE NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.60	357.00	007	60667615
12/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	3.40	4,930.00	007	60682983

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.9); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE PLAN IMPLEMENTATION ISSUES (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION ORDER (.4); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION ORDER (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN-RELATED ISSUES (.2).				
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	4.00	4,400.00	007	60777735
	REVIEW REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER DRAFT (1); CALL WITH D. CHRISTIAN RE: PLAN TIMELINE AND POTENTIAL FOR INSURANCE SETTLEMENT IN CONTEXT OF PLAN DOCUMENTS (.3); REVIEW DRAFT CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.4); CALL WITH TAX TEAM RE: MDOR COMMENTS FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER (.7); REVIEW US TRUSTEE COMMENTS TO PLAN (.2); EMAILS TO T. RISKE AND O. LASHKO, G. WILLARD AND M. SCHLAN RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS TO MDOR COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.1); EMAILS WITH J. ZHANG AND E. BLECHMAN RE: NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE (.2).				
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	007	61027360
	CALL WITH A. CITRON AND R. BERKOVICH RE: POST-CONFIRMATION / PRE-EFFECTIVE DATE WORK PLAN (.4).				
12/09/20	Blechman, Eli	4.20	4,116.00	007	60825317
	REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN PER COMMENTS AND PROPOSED MARK-UP FROM MDOR AND UST (1.0); CALL WITH WEIL TAX TEAM AND D. HOEHNE RE: MDOR MARK-UP (0.7); FURTHER REVISE PLAN PER MDOR LANGUAGE AND DISCUSSION WITH TAX TEAM (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION AND REPLY TO POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (2.0).				
12/09/20	Myers, Janiel	2.90	2,450.50	007	60884767
	REVISE DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION ORDER (2.9).				
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.90	2,117.00	007	60677187
	REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (1.0); REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.9).				
12/09/20	Bardini, Elisabeth	1.90	1,387.00	007	60761006
	REVIEW R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.4).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/09/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	1.40	1,183.00	007	60756707
12/09/20	Zhang, John RESEARCH NEED FOR ANOTHER ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE BAR DATE FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS THAT MAY HAVE ARISEN BETWEEN OCTOBER 19 AND EFFECTIVE DATE (.9); EMAIL D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (.6).	1.50	892.50	007	60677230
12/09/20	Citron, Andrew ANALYZE PLAN AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT TO PREPARE WORKING DRAFT OF MATERIALS TO HAND OFF TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (1.1); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: REVISIONS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.1).	1.20	1,116.00	007	60793991
12/09/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE: CONFIRMATION WORK STREAMS AND PREPARING FOR EFFECTIVE DATE (.5).	0.50	465.00	007	61027807
12/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO PLAN (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (.4); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE PLAN IMPLEMENTATION ISSUES (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH FOLEY RE PLAN (PARTIAL) (.8);.	1.80	2,610.00	007	60690970
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora	5.80	6,380.00	007	60777669

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: STATUS/RESOLUTION OF PLAN COMMENTS (.4); REVIEW ADDITIONAL PLAN COMMENTS FROM CHUBB (.2); REVIEW OBJECTIONS TO PLAN CONFIRMATION FROM ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMANTS (.4); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE: ADDITIONS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.2); EMAILS WITH S. GOLDRING AND R. BERKOVICH RE: MDOR LANGUAGE (.7); REVIEW REVISED DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (.2); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.4); CALL WITH M. SCHLAN RE: CONFIRMATION ARGUMENTS AND BRIEFING AROUND UST COMMENTS (.5); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN, R. BERKOVICH AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: INSURANCE RELATED PLAN COMMENTS FROM CHUBB, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND ASBESTOS INSURERS (1.5); REVIEW FURTHER REVISED DRAFT PLAN, UPDATED FOR INSURER COMMENTS (.2); REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. SCHLAN AND ADDITIONAL MODIFICATION TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (.1); EMAILS WITH E. KHATCHOURIAN RE: INSURANCE RELATED PLAN COMMENTS (.1); REVIEW ADDITIONAL INSURANCE ISSUES RE: PERSONAL INJURY LITIGATION (.3); REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR COMMENTS TO INSURER MARKUP (.2); REVIEW ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM ASBESTOS INSURERS TO PLAN (.2).				
12/10/20	Blechman, Eli	8.00	7,840.00	007	60825290
	REVISE MDOR PLAN MARK-UP PER COMMENTS FROM S. GOLDRING AND D. HOEHNE (0.5); CALL WITH S. GOLDRING RE: SAME (0.5); CONDUCT RELATED RESEARCH AND FURTHER REVISE MDOR PLAN MARK-UP PER DISCUSSION WITH S. GOLDRING (1.0);CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO AND BROWN RUDNICK RE: PLAN CHANGES (0.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. KHACHATOURIAN RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO THE PLAN (1.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: INSURANCE NEUTRALITY IN BANKRUPTCY (1.0); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE CERTAIN INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES PER DISCUSSIONS WITH WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS AND PER COMMENTS FROM ASBESTOS INSURERS (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE DECLARATION AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION AND PROPOSED ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAM RE: SAME (1.5).				
12/10/20	Myers, Janiel	2.40	2,028.00	007	60884755
	REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (2.4).				
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.70	1,971.00	007	60688718
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.0); REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (1.7).				
12/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	2.90	2,117.00	007	60760960

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF REVISION (0.1); CALL WITH M. MARTIR TO DISCUSS OUTSTANDING CURE OBJECTIONS FOR SECTION OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.4).				
12/10/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	1.10	929.50	007	60756955
12/10/20	Zhang, John RESEARCH PLAN MODIFICATIONS SUFFICIENTLY MATERIAL TO REQUIRE RE-SOLICITATION (3.9); PREPARE PLAN OBJECTION RESPONSE CHART (.2); SUMMARIZE PLAN OBJECTIONS (.7).	4.80	2,856.00	007	60686801
12/10/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW PLAN OBJECTIONS (0.4); SUMMARIZE SAME FOR TEAM (0.2).	0.60	606.00	007	60694032
12/10/20	Citron, Andrew ANALYZE PLAN RELATED DOCUMENTS TO CREATE WORKING LIST OF REQUIREMENTS FOR PLAN EFFECTIVENESS (3.6); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: CONDITIONS PRECEDENT TO EFFECTIVE DATE (.2); CALL WITH FOLEY TEAM RE: ASBESTOS INSURERS PROPOSED LANGUAGE TO PLAN (1.5).	5.30	4,929.00	007	60793994
12/11/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT J. FICKS DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF THE PLAN CONFIRMATION HEARING (.4); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.50	700.00	007	60701196
12/11/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, FOLEY, AND BROWN RUDNICK RE PLAN PROVISIONS (1.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN OBJECTIONS (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY (.3); CALL WITH TEAM RE SAME (.5).	2.10	3,045.00	007	60704006
12/11/20	Hoehne, Debora	9.10	10,010.00	007	60777728

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: FURTHER REVISED PLAN (1.5); EMAILS TO COMMITTEE, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF RESOLVING INSURANCE RELATED COMMENTS TO PLAN (.1); REVIEW FURTHER REVISED MARKUP OF PLAN (.2); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS/STATUS OF OBJECTIONS AND PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING (.3); CALL WITH T. RISKE RE: PREPARATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND CONFIRMATION RELATED FILINGS (.3); CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TREAM TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.8); UPDATE CONFIRMATION WIP AND REVIEW STATUS OF ALL DOCUMENTS (.3); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION ORDER (1.3); CALL WITH COMMITTEE COUNSEL, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND COUNSEL, R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, E. KHATCHATOURIAN, AND T. WILL (PARTIAL) RE: INSURANCE RELATED PLAN COMMENTS (1.2); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: APPROACH TO INSURERS (.4); CALL WITH INSURER GROUP COUNSEL, E. BLECHMAN AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN (1.1); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN AND E. BLECHMAN (.4); FOLLOW UP EMAILS RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW INSURANCE COMMENTS TO PLAN (.4); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND M. MARTIR RE: OBJECTIONS (.7).				
12/11/20	Blechman, Eli	7.80	7,644.00	007	60830422
	CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR MDOR RE: PLAN CHANGES (0.5); REVISE PLAN TO INCORPORATE CERTAIN CHANGES PER CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR MDOR (0.5); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR UCC, COUNSEL FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND WEIL TEAM RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO THE PLAN (1.0); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR ASBESTOS INSURERS AND WEIL AND FOLEY TEAMS (1.0); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH E. KHACHATOURIAN AND D. HOEHNE (0.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND M. MARTIR RE: OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION OF PLAN (0.4); CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. KHACHATOURIAN AND D. HOEHNE RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO PLAN (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: FEE APPLICATIONS PROCESS (0.2); REVIEW OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION OF PLAN (1.0); CALL WITH WEIL TEAM RE: OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. KHACHATOURIAN AND D. HOEHNE RE: INSURANCE-RELATED CHANGES TO PLAN (0.5); REVIEW OBJECTION CHART FROM J. ZHANG AND PROVIDE COMMENTS (1.0).				
12/11/20	Myers, Janiel	1.20	1,014.00	007	60884602
	REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.3); CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING GROUP TO DISCUSS PLAN WORKSTREAMS FOR CONFIRMATION (.9).				
12/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.90	657.00	007	60693744
	CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW OBJECTIONS FILED (.7); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE UST OBJECTION (.5); DRAFT REPLY TO UST OBJECTION (2.9).	4.10	2,993.00	007	60693808
12/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (0.5); CALL WITH RX TEAM TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.8); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS) AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (3.8).	5.10	3,723.00	007	60760946
12/11/20	Paddock, Alyssa TEAM UPDATE CALL RE: CONFIRMATION RELATED MATTERS.	0.50	422.50	007	60757007
12/11/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF INCLUDING DRAFTING REPLY TO OBJECTIONS.	9.40	7,943.00	007	60757028
12/11/20	Zhang, John REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE PLAN OBJECTIONS (2.1); REVISE PLAN OBJECTION SUMMARY CHART (1.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM REGARDING ACTION ITEMS IN CONFIRMATION WORK STREAM (.8); RESEARCH PLANS CONFIRMED IN EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI INCLUDING SIMILAR DEFINITIONS OF EXCULPATED/RELEASED PARTIES (1.7); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE REVIEW OF VOTING DECLARATION (.2); CALL WITH M. MARTIR REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT VOTING DECLARATION PREPARED BY KCC (2.2).	8.50	5,057.50	007	60693958
12/11/20	Martir, Martha ANALYZE ORACLE OBJECTION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH ORACLE AND NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAME (0.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN REGARDING SAME (0.4); INTERNAL TEAM CALL REGARDING CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS (0.8).	2.20	2,222.00	007	60694011
12/11/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND UCC RE: POTENTIAL REVISIONS TO PLAN TO RESOLVE OBJECTIONS (1.1); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.3); INTERNAL WEIL TEAM CALL RE: DRAFTING RESPONSES TO PLAN OBJECTIONS (.7); REVIEW FILED OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (.8);	2.90	2,697.00	007	60793913

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/12/20	Soto, Edward ADDITIONAL REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT J. FICKS DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF THE PLAN CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2); REVIEW OF PRIOR FICKS DECLARATIONS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.2); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.50	700.00	007	60701205
12/12/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS TO TEAM RE OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (.2).	0.20	290.00	007	60704090
12/12/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT OBJECTION CHART FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.6); REVIEW AND ANALYZE CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS (2.5); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: OBJECTIONS (.3); REVIEW E. BLECHMAN ANALYSIS OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMANTS' OBJECTION (.1); CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: BRIEF RIDER FOR POTENTIAL INSURANCE OBJECTIONS (.6); REVIEW INSURER GROUP'S ISSUES LIST (.4); CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF VOTING DECLARATION (.3); CALL WITH J. MYERS RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION (.7); REVIEW CHANGES TO EXCULPATED PARTIES TO RESOLVE US TRUSTEE OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.5).	8.70	9,570.00	007	60777846
12/12/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: CHANGES TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.4); REVIEW OBJECTIONS FILED BY CERTAIN PARTIES (BOYD, AAVID, UFPT), CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND DRAFT CERTAIN LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER TO RESOLVE OBJECTIONS (2.0).	2.40	2,352.00	007	60837191
12/12/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: CARVE OUT LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER (.8); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (2.0).	2.90	2,450.50	007	60884621
12/12/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CONDUCT RESEARCH RE INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES (1.0); REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.3); REVISE CONFIRMATION OBJECTION (.2).	3.40	2,482.00	007	60695012
12/12/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.40	1,022.00	007	60760996

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS) AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (1.4).				
12/12/20	Paddock, Alyssa	4.10	3,464.50	007	60757014
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF TO INCLUDE RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS.				
12/12/20	Zhang, John	5.80	3,451.00	007	60694764
	COMPARE DRAFT VOTING DECLARATION CIRCULATED BY KCC TO VOTING DECLARATIONS FILED IN OTHER CASES (1.3); FURTHER REVISE SAME (1.7); FURTHER REVISE KCC'S DRAFT VOTING DECLARATION IN RESPONSE TO D. HOEHNE'S COMMENTS (1.0); CIRCULATE UPDATED DRAFT TO KCC (.1); REVISE PLAN OBJECTION SUMMARY CHART (1.5); EMAIL SAME TO K. BUONO AND OTHER DEBTOR PROFESSIONALS (.2).				
12/12/20	Citron, Andrew	4.70	4,371.00	007	60793941
	DRAFT REPLY TO ASBESTOS INSURERS' PLAN OBJECTION (2.7); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.3); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: REPLY IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (.5); ANALYZE PROPOSED PLAN CHANGES BY ASBESTOS INSURERS (1.2).				
12/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.80	1,160.00	007	60704200
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFERENCE ORDER (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE OBJECTIONS TO PLAN (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE REVISING PLAN (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.1).				
12/13/20	Hoehne, Debora	9.30	10,230.00	007	60777768

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW R. BERKOVICH'S COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.3); REVIEW BRIEF RIDER FOR POTENTIAL INSURERS' OBJECTIONS (.3); REVIEW FURTHER COMMENTS FROM COMMITTEE/PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TO PLAN (.4); REVIEW PRECEDENT FROM PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: HANDLING OF ASBESTOS RELATED INSURANCE CLAIMS (.3); CALLS (X2) WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: EXCULPATION LANGUAGE (.6); CALL WITH D. COHEN RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR COMMENTS (.8); CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: PLAN REVISIONS (.5); CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: RESEARCH ON INSURANCE NEUTRALITY (.2); REVIEW REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER (.2); REVIEW VARIOUS COMMENTS TO PLAN FROM INSURERS' COUNSEL AND COUNSEL TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (1.1); EMAILS WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN, R. BERKOVICH AND A. CITRON RE: SAME (.5); EMAILS RE: EXCULPATION WITH E. BLECHMAN (.3); REVIEW AND ANALYZE INSURANCE NEUTRALITY PROVISIONS IN PLAN (.5); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.6); REVIEW REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER (.4); REVIEW NOTICE OF FILING OF AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND EXHIBITS (.3).				
12/13/20	Blechman, Eli	2.00	1,960.00	007	60838755
	CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR CERTAIN INSURERS RE: CHANGES TO PLAN TO RESOLVE OBJECTIONS (0.5); DRAFT CERTAIN PLAN CHANGES TO RESOLVE UST OBJECTION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO, D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH AND COUNSEL FOR UCC RE: SAME (1.5).				
12/13/20	Myers, Janiel	4.10	3,464.50	007	60884734
	REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (3.5); DRAFT NOTICE RE: AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.6).				
12/13/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	2.00	1,460.00	007	60696705
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.8); CONDUCT RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (1.2).				
12/13/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	9.70	7,081.00	007	60760964
	REVIEW D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF & REVISING DRAFT (0.2); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF NEXT STEPS (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF, INCLUDING RESEARCHING ISSUES RELATED TO OBJECTIONS (4.0); CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: SECTION 364 RESEARCH (0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (2.9); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK TO DISCUSS D. HOEHNE COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.2); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK AND D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS COMMENTS TO PORTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.7); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK TO DISCUSS NEXT STEPS RE: EDITS TO CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF RE: GLOBAL SETTLEMENT ISSUES (1.1).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/13/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	6.90	5,830.50	007	60757025
12/13/20	Zhang, John RESEARCH SECTION 364(B) AS APPLIED TO DEBTOR SETTLEMENTS PROVIDING FOR PAYMENT OF INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES.	3.90	2,320.50	007	60696418
12/13/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN AND COUNSEL TO CERTAIN OBJECTOR REGARDING PLAN PROVISIONS (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK REGARDING CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH KWT REGARDING CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICE OF AMENDED ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS REGARDING SAME (0.1).	2.10	2,121.00	007	60721618
12/13/20	Citron, Andrew ANALYZE INSURERS' PROPOSED CHANGES TO INSURANCE PROVISIONS OF PLAN (1.4); DRAFT REPLY TO ASBESTOS INSURERS OBJECTION (.9).	2.30	2,139.00	007	60793919
12/14/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (.5); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY (.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK RE PLAN ISSUES (.5); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.3); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE OBJECTIONS TO PLAN (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.1).	2.30	3,335.00	007	60718055
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora	9.50	10,450.00	007	60777943

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND FURTHER REVISE DRAFTS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (5.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: BRIEF AND RESOLUTION OF PLAN RELATED OBJECTIONS AND COMMENTS (.6); CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: PLAN CHANGES AND STATUS OF INSURERS' OBJECTION (.1); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND FICKS DECLARATION (.2); REVIEW REVISED FICKS DECLARATION (.2); CALL WITH WEIL, BROWN RUDNICK AND CARMODY RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING AND BRIEFING IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.6); REVIEW EY COMMENTS TO FICKS DECLARATION (.4); EMAILS WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: SAME (.2); EMAILS WITH M. SCHLAN RE: EXCULPATION (.3); EMAILS WITH D. COHEN, M. SCHLAN AND O. LASHKO RE: INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.2); REVIEW ADDITIONAL PLAN CHANGES FROM D. COHEN (.2); EMAILS WITH INSURER GROUP RE: SAME (.2); EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: STATUS OF PLAN COMMENTS (.1); REVIEW UPDATED OBJECTION CHART (.2); REVIEW ADDITIONAL FILED OBJECTIONS FROM INSURERS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH A. CITRON RE: RIDER TO BRIEF FOR SAME (.5).				
12/14/20	Hoechne, Debora	1.40	1,540.00	007	60777986
	CALL WITH E. BERDINI AND A. PADDOCK RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.6); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN AND J. MYERS (PARTIAL) RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER (.8).				
12/14/20	Blechman, Eli	3.80	3,724.00	007	60864205
	CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK, CARMODY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.8); REVISE PLAN AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION TO REFLECT CERTAIN CHANGES MADE TO RESOLVE CERTAIN OBJECTIONS (1.5); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.5); REVISE PROPOSED ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN TO REFLECT CERTAIN CHANGES MADE TO RESOLVE CERTAIN OBJECTIONS (1.0).				
12/14/20	Myers, Janiel	0.30	253.50	007	60884583
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER.				
12/14/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	5.80	4,234.00	007	60707195
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (3.0); REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (2.1); CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK AND CAMRODY RE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (.7).				
12/14/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	4.90	3,577.00	007	60763266

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (FOCUSING ON GLOBAL SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS) AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SAME (4.1); CALL WITH UCC AND RX CONFIRMATION BRIEF TEAM TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.8).				
12/14/20	Paddock, Alyssa	7.60	6,422.00	007	60757240
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (6.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI (.5); CALL WITH UCC AND LOCAL COUNSEL RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES (1).				
12/14/20	Zhang, John	1.30	773.50	007	60707364
	SUMMARIZE NEW PLAN OBJECTION (.5); SUMMARIZE DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS FILED (.8).				
12/14/20	Martir, Martha	3.40	3,434.00	007	60746251
	CALL WITH CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY REGARDING ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. HIMELFARB AND THE COMPANY REGARDING SAME (0.3); DRAFT AND REVISE ORACLE INSERT FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER REGARDING AMENDED ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SAME (0.3); REVIEW ORACLE IN CONNECTION WITH CURE AND PLAN OBJECTION (1.1).				
12/14/20	Citron, Andrew	1.80	1,674.00	007	60793904
	DRAFT REPLY TO ASBESTOS INSURER'S PLAN OBJECTION (1.8).				
12/14/20	Citron, Andrew	1.20	1,116.00	007	60793973
	DRAFT EFFECTIVE DATE CHECKLIST (1.2).				
12/14/20	Peene, Travis J.	0.90	225.00	007	60735098
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED PLEADINGS FOR CASE NO. 18-10700 FOR E. BLECHMAN.				
12/15/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	4.50	6,525.00	007	60725281

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.3); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR PLAN CONSUMMATION (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.2); CONFER WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.5); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.4); CALL WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.5); REVIEW DRAFT COMMITTEE STATEMENT IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (.1).				
12/15/20	Hochne, Debora	11.50	12,650.00	007	60777963
	REVIEW REVISED VOTING DECLARATION FOR FILING (.2); EMAILS WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW PROPOSED CONFIRMATION LANGUAGE TO RESOLVE ORACLE OBJECTION (.1); CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: INSURER COMMENTS TO PLAN (.2); CALL WITH E. KHATCHATOURIAN, O. LASHKO, M. SCHLAN, A. HALPERIN, D. COHEN, M. PLEVIN, D. CHRISTIAN, W. FACTOR RE: PLAN CHANGES (1.1); REVIEW UPDATED LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER TO RESOLVE OBJECTIONS (.3); CALL WITH C. HANNON RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: BRIEF (.1); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: BRIEF (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN, J. MYERS, R. BERKOVICH RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER COMMENTS FROM UCC (.6); REVIEW K. BUONO COMMENTS TO BRIEF (.2); REVIEW UPDATED FICKS DECLARATION (.1); REVIEW REVISED AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE FROM INSURERS (.2); TEAM CALL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR FILING PLEADINGS AND STATUS OF ARGUMENTS IN CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.6); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (5.4); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF CONFIRMATION ORDER (1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS WITH OBJECTING INSURERS RE: PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER (.2); REVIEW MULTIPLE REDLINES OF AMENDED PLAN (.8).				
12/15/20	Blechman, Eli	12.40	12,152.00	007	60865342

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER PER LATEST CHANGES TO PLAN AND RESOLUTIONS WITH OBJECTING PARTIES (1.2); REVISE PLAN TO REFLECT ADDITIONAL CHANGES PER NEGOTIATIONS WITH CERTAIN INSURERS (1.0); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR INSURERS, COUNSEL FOR UCC AND FOLEY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CHANGES TO THE PLAN (1.0); FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME (0.2); REVISE PLAN PER DISCUSSIONS AND COMMENTS (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF AND DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (2.5); CALLS WITH K. BUONO AND D. HOEHNE RE: EXCULPATION PROVISION IN THE PLAN AND PROPOSED CHANGES TO RESOLVE UST OBJECTION (0.5); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY AND K. BUONO RE: SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER PER DISCUSSIONS AND COMMENTS (0.5); TEAM CALL RE: CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.7); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PROPOSED LANGUAGE RE: INSURANCE BUYBACK (PLAN-RELATED) (0.2); REVISE PROPOSED LANGUAGE RE: INSURANCE BUYBACK (0.5); REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION FOLLOWING PLAN MODIFICATIONS (1.8).				
12/15/20	Myers, Janiel	6.70	5,661.50	007	60884727
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (5.3); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH, AND E. BLECHMAN RE: UCC COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.6); CALL WITH D. KO TO DISCUSS FILINGS FOR CONFIRMATION (.2); CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.6).				
12/15/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	10.00	7,300.00	007	60719286
	REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF TO IMPLEMENT FURTHER COMMENTS FROM R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE (7.7); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, J. MYERS, A. PADDOCK, AND E. BERDINI RE CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.6); REVISE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (1.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY RE THE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (.2).				
12/15/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	5.70	4,161.00	007	60763378

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: BALLOTS (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF WITH R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS (2.7); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: STATUS OF CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.1); CALL WITH A. PADDOCK RE: STATUS OF CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.1); RESTRUCTURING TEAM CALL TO DISCUSS HEARING PREP FOR 12.16 AND CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: OBJECTIONS TO RELEASES (0.2); COORDINATE WITH D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH, AND T. PEENE RE: PREPARING BINDER FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.2); REVIEW OBJECTION CHART (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG, J. MYERS, E. BLECHMAN AND M. MARTIR RE: OBJECTION CHART OUTSTANDING ITEMS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SECTIONS OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (1.0).				
12/15/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF.	6.50	5,492.50	007	60757229
12/15/20	Zhang, John SUMMARIZE DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS FILED.	3.80	2,261.00	007	60718838
12/15/20	Zhang, John RESEARCH POST-SALE LIQUIDATION CASES AND CASES DECIDED IN THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI TO ASCERTAIN TIME PERIODS BETWEEN CONFIRMATION ORDER DATES AND PLAN EFFECTIVE DATES, AND WHETHER NOTICES OF ENTRY OF CONFIRMATION ORDER ARE FILED TOGETHER WITH NOTICES OF EFFECTIVE DATE (1.1); COORDINATE WITH CARMODY TO ARRANGE CONFIRMATION HEARING WEBEX INVITE FOR A. NGUYEN AND J. LEE FROM KCC (.3); COORDINATE CIRCULATION OF CONFIRMATION HEARING AGENDA (.2); REVIEW TENTATIVE AGENDA CIRCULATED BY D. KO (.2).	1.80	1,071.00	007	60718868
12/15/20	Martir, Martha REVISE ORACLE CONFIRMATION LANGUAGE FOR ORDER (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND ORACLE REGARDING PLAN OBJECTION (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH WILLIS TOWERS REGARDING ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.5).	2.00	2,020.00	007	60746831
12/15/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (1.2); CALL WITH ASBESTOS INSURERS RE: OPEN ISSUES ON THE PLAN (.9).	2.10	1,953.00	007	60793893
12/15/20	Chan, Herbert	2.60	962.00	007	60731047

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/15/20	Stauble, Christopher A.	1.90	798.00	007	60835458
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/15/20	Gilchrist, Roy W.	4.80	1,920.00	007	60729652
	ASSIST IN PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/15/20	Peene, Travis J.	0.80	200.00	007	60735150
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED PLEADINGS IN CASE NO. 19-12748 FOR E. BLECHMAN.				
12/15/20	Jones, Allen	3.50	1,400.00	007	60722796
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	3.60	5,220.00	007	60733458
	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE SEC OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION AND UPCOMING OMNIBUS HEARING (.2); CONFER WITH KCC AND D. HOEHNE RE SEC OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.3); COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE FINALIZING CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (PARTIAL) (.6); FINALIZE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.2); EMAILS RE FINALIZING BRIEF (.1); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE PLAN (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION AND FOR MEETING WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (1.5); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN IMPLEMENTATION (.1).				
12/16/20	Hoehne, Debora	11.80	12,980.00	007	60777934

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	TEAM CALL TO FINALIZE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING AND POSTING TO KCC WEBSITE (.8); REVIEW FINAL DRAFTS OF PLEADING (BRIEF, DECLARATION) FOR FILING (2); REVIEW MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND COMMITTEE COMMENTS TO SAME (1.5); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBERG AND E. BERDINI RE: FINAL CHANGES TO BRIEF (.1); CALL WITH D. COHEN, M. SCHLAN, O. LASHKO AND J. MYERS RE: CONFIRMATION ORDER COMMENTS (.3); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH J. MYERS (.1); CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: STATUS OF FILING OF CONFIRMATION RELATED DOCUMENTS AND COURT BINDERS (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREPARATIONS (1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM INSURERS RE: SUGGESTED LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER (.8); EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE COUNSEL AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME (.4); CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: INSURERS' PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE (.2); DRAFT ORAL ARGUMENT OUTLINE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (4.4); REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF SECOND AMENDED PLAN (.1).				
12/16/20	Kim, Aileen CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS (0.4); CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (0.2).	0.60	660.00	007	60735376
12/16/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE SECOND AMENDED PLAN AND PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER PER COMMENTS FROM UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (0.7); CALL WITH WEIL TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS AND OPEN ISSUES AND FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH D. HOEHNE AND J. MYERS RE: SAME (0.8); REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE SECOND AMENDED PLAN (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, K. BUONO AND D. HOEHNE RE: PROPOSED INSURANCE BUYBACK LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.5); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARMODY, KCC AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CONFIRMATION (0.6); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON, D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: CONFIRMATION AND POST-CONFIRMATION ISSUES (0.4); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: INSURANCE BUYBACK AND POST-CONFIRMATION SALE OF ASSETS FREE AND CLEAR (PLAN/CONFIRMATION-RELATED) (1.2); CALL WITH WEIL BFR TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION ISSUES (1.0); ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE WITH UCC, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND K. BUONO RE: PROPOSED INSURANCE BUYBACK LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.5); CONDUCT ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE: INSURANCE BUYBACK AND POST-EFFECTIVE DATE SALE FREE AND CLEAR (2.0).	8.20	8,036.00	007	60865634
12/16/20	Luster, Courtney DISCUSSION WITH INTERNAL WEIL TEAM REGARDING OBJECTION CHART (1.1).	1.10	929.50	007	60727171
12/16/20	Myers, Janiel	6.00	5,070.00	007	60884704

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW CONFIRMATION ORDER (3.9); CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION FILINGD AND CONFIRMATION ORDER (.8); CALL WITH BROWN RUDNICK TEAM AND COUNSEL TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: COMMENTS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER (.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.1); CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: PREP FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND MEETING WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR ON DECEMBER 18 (1.0).				
12/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	9.40	6,862.00	007	60727085
	TEAM CALL RE CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (1.1); FINALIZE AND FILE CONFIRMATION DECLARATION (1.0); REVISE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (4.0); COORDINATE COURTESY MATERIALS FOR CHAMBERS (.3); RESEARCH SEC CITATIONS IN PREPARE FOR HEARING (3.0).				
12/16/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	10.80	7,884.00	007	60767340
	REVIEW, REVISE, FINALIZE & FILE CONFIRMATION BRIEF, INCLUDING CORRESPONDING WITH VARIOUS PARTIES (INCLUDING WEIL RX TEAM, PARALEGAL TEAM AND LOCAL COUNSEL) RE: SAME (7.9); RESTRUCTURING CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP CALL (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE SCRIPT FOR 12.16 HEARING (0.8); DRAFT SCRIPT FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.2); CALL WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG TO DISCUSS CONFIRMATION HEARING SCRIPT (0.2); DRAFT CONFIRMATION HEARING SCRIPT (0.7).				
12/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa	1.50	1,267.50	007	60757488
	ASSIST TEAM WITH FINALIZING CONFIRMATION BRIEF.				
12/16/20	Zhang, John	3.60	2,142.00	007	60727108
	UPDATE OBJECTION RESPONSE CHART (1.1); PARTICIPATE ON CONFIRMATION CATCH-UP CALL WITH TEAM (.7); FURTHER CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM TO PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.0); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT CONFIRMATION HEARING AGENDA CIRCULATED BY D. KO (.8).				
12/16/20	Citron, Andrew	6.00	5,580.00	007	60793881
	INTERNAL TEAM CALL RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3); ANALYZE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR'S ABILITY TO SELL PROPERTY (.5); TEAM CALL RE: DRAFTING CHART ON OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION (1.0); REVIEW COURT PRECEDENT (INCLUDING TRANSCRIPTS) ON PLAN CONFIRMATION (2.2); DRAFT MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3); DRAFT EFFECTIVE DATE WIP LIST (.4); ANALYZE SEC'S CITED CASES IN OPPOSITION TO CONFIRMATION (1.3).				
12/16/20	Hoilett, Leason	3.50	1,400.00	007	60810267

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Chan, Herbert	3.10	1,147.00	007	60731067
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Stauble, Christopher A.	3.20	1,344.00	007	60835573
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Oliva, Angela E.F.	3.20	1,248.00	007	60728862
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Gilchrist, Roy W.	3.60	1,440.00	007	60729368
	ASSIST IN PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Biratu, Sirak D.	1.00	345.00	007	60806725
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/16/20	Peene, Travis J.	0.50	125.00	007	60735146
	CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: CASE NO. 16-42529 CONFIRMATION HEARING TRANSCRIPT FOR S. SCHNORRENBURG.				
12/16/20	Jones, Allen	3.70	1,480.00	007	60731797

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED JOINT CHAPTER 11 PLAN OF BRIGGS & STRATTON CORPORATION AND ITS AFFILIATED DEBTORS AND RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION.				
12/17/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	2.60	3,770.00	007	60745155
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION (.1); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); CONFER WITH A CITRON RE PLAN ISSUE (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CLOSING CHECKLIST (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.6); EMAILS WITH EY AND A. CITRON RE EFFECTIVE DATE ITEMS (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON AGENDA FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON AGENDA/OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SCRIPT FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.5); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON AGENDA FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (.2); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONFIRMATION SCRIPT (.1).				
12/17/20	Morton, Matthew D.	0.20	220.00	007	60744910
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. CITRON RE: WORK IN PROGRESS FOR EFFECTIVE DATE (.2).				
12/17/20	Hoehne, Debora	13.50	14,850.00	007	60778048
	CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: AGENDA FOR MEETING WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (.3); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: HEARING (.2); CALL WITH T. RISKE RE: HEARING (.3); CALL WITH C. BERMAN RE: HEARING (.2); CALL WITH J. FICKS, C. HANNON, J. HENRICH AND C. BERMAN TO PREPARE J. FICKS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (.2); CALL WITH T. RISKE RE: ATTEMPTS TO RESOLVE US TRUSTEE OBJECTION (.1); CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: HEARING OUTLINE (.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: HEARING PRESENTATION (.1); REVIEW CASES AND OBJECTIONS AND PREPARE ARGUMENT PRESENTATION FOR HEARING, INCLUDING REVIEW DRAFTS OF OVERALL SCRIPT FOR HEARING (11.7).				
12/17/20	Berman, Corey D.	4.00	4,400.00	007	60752709
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP (0.2); CALL WITH J. FICKS, D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.3); REVIEW FICKS AND VOTING DECLARATION IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYZE SEC AND UST OBJECTIONS TO PLAN CONFIRMATION (0.8); REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEBTORS' MEMO OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF PLAN CONFIRMATION, WILMINGTON TRUST BRIEF, AND UCC BRIEF (2.4).				
12/17/20	Blechman, Eli	5.80	5,684.00	007	60865551

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (DRAFT AND REVISE HEARING SCRIPT (1.2); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR UCC AND A. CITRON RE: INSURANCE BUYBACK LANGUAGE (RELATED TO CONFIRMATION) (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO, A. CITRON, D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (0.5); FOLLOW-UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR INSURERS AND K. BUONO RE: SAME (0.2); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON, D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: POST-COFIRMATION ISSUES (0.4); DRAFT CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.0); PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (DRAFT AND REVISE HEARING SCRIPT) (2.0).				
12/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	9.90	7,227.00	007	60736756
	CONDUCT RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR OPT OUT ARGUMENTS AT CONFIRMATION HEARING (4.5); CALLS WITH D. HOEHNE RE CONFIRMATION HEARING ARGUMENT (.6); DRAFTING FICKS PROFFER SCRIPT (.7); DRAFTING HEARING SCRIPT AND RELATED REFERENCE MATERIALS (3.4).				
12/17/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	9.80	7,154.00	007	60765277
	DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION HEARING SCRIPT AND CORRESPOND WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: SAME (5.8); REVIEW CASE LAW CITED IN CONFIRMATION BRIEF IN PREPARATION OF CONFIRMATION HEARING (4.0).				
12/17/20	Paddock, Alyssa	2.20	1,859.00	007	60757276
	REVIEW CASES AND ASSIST WITH PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.4); REVIEW AND REVISE FICKS PROFFER (.8).				
12/17/20	Zhang, John	3.60	2,142.00	007	60736633
	RESEARCH BANKRUPTCY CASES IN THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI THAT ADOPT NON-MISSOURI LAW AS GOVERNING LAW (.8); CALL WITH S. SCHNORREBERG REGARDING COURT MODIFICATIONS OF THIRD PARTY RELEASES THAT NARROW SCOPE OF RELEASING PARTIES (.1); RESEARCH THE SAME (1.3); CALL WITH A. CITRON REGARDING PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING AGENDA (.1); UPDATE SECTIONS OF THE AGENDA REGARDING BAR DATES, OMNIBUS REJECTIONS AND ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS (1.3).				
12/17/20	Martir, Martha	7.50	7,575.00	007	60746390

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AGENDA FOR CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (0.8); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH A. CITRON REGARDING SAME (0.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI REGARDING CONFIRMATION HEARING AND SCRIPT (0.9); REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIRMATION SCRIPT (2.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH KCC, EY, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SERVICE OF ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING THE BASIS FOR THE ASSUMPTION OF CERTAIN CONTRACTS (0.2); REVISE ORACLE CONFIRMATION LANGUAGE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY AND ORACLE REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW AND REVISE OBJECTION CHART IN BRIEF (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH UFP, AAVID, BOYD REGARDING CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE TO RESOLVE OBJECTIONS (0.8).				
12/17/20	Citron, Andrew	8.80	8,184.00	007	60847950
	CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: INSURERS PROPOSED CHANGES TO PLAN (.3); DRAFT OUTLINE OF MATERIALS FOR THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TO UTILIZE DURING TRANSITION (5.5); EMAILS WITH E. BLECHMAN, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE RE: OBJECTING INSURERS PROPOSED CHANGES TO PLAN (.4); DRAFT CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EFFECTIVE DATE (1.1); CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: INSURERS OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION (.3); PREPARE MATERIALS AND REVIEW SCRIPTS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.2).				
12/17/20	Stauble, Christopher A.	1.50	630.00	007	60743818
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING ON 12/18/2020.				
12/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	3.40	4,930.00	007	60758496
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON AGENDA/OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (.3); CALL WITH TEAM RE REVISING CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PARTICIPATING IN MEETING WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE EFFECTIVE DATE (.3); CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE EFFECTIVE DATE (2.0); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE TASKS TO CONSUMMATE PLAN (.6).				
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	007	60778030
	REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF CONFIRMATION ORDER IMPLEMENTING CHANGES FROM HEARING.				
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	007	61027370
	CALL WITH TEAM FOLLOWING HEARING TO PREPARE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TRANSITION CALL AND REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER (.2).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/18/20	Kim, Aileen CALL WITH R. SEVALRUD TO DISCUSS POST-CLOSING ACTION ITEMS (0.4). CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.3).	0.70	770.00	007	60746716
12/18/20	Blechman, Eli PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (REVISE HEARING SCRIPT) (1.8); PARTICIPATE ON WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM CALL FOLLOWING CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.3); REVISE CONFIRMATION ORDER PER JUDGE'S INSTRUCTIONS AT THE CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5); CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: POST-CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND CLOSING CHECKLIST (2.0); PARTICIPATE IN WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM CALL RE: SAME (0.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT AGREEMENT (0.2); DRAFT NOTE TO PROFESSIONALS RE: ESTIMATED OF PROFESSIONAL FEE CLAIMS PURSUANT TO THE CONFIRMED PLAN (0.2); REVISE NOTE TO BOARD RE: CONFIRMATION PER CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO (0.3).	5.80	5,684.00	007	60865524
12/18/20	Myers, Janiel CALL WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM TO DISCUSS POST-CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS (.2); CIRCULATE REVISED DRAFT OF CONFIRMATION ORDER TO SEC, US TRUSTEE, CREDITORS COMMITTEE, AND COUNSEL FOR INDENTURE TRUSTEE (.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARMODY TEAM RE: SAME (.1).	0.60	507.00	007	60884636
12/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.3); WEIL TEAM CALL POST CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2).	0.50	365.00	007	60746704
12/18/20	Bardini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE SCRIPT FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND CORRESPOND WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: SAME (3.6).	3.60	2,628.00	007	60989950
12/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa PREPARE FOR (.2) AND ATTEND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (2).	2.20	1,859.00	007	60757484
12/18/20	Zhang, John	0.90	535.50	007	60746388

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	RESEARCH U.S. TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION (.7); SUMMARIZE VOTE TABULATION PROCESS FOR M. MARTIR IN PREPARATION FOR THE CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2).				
12/18/20	Martir, Martha PREPARE FOR HEARING (2.0); DRAFT NGUYGEN PROFFER (0.5); FOLLOW-UP TEAM CALL REGARDING HEARING (0.3); CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, UCC, EY, THE COMPANY, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, A. CITRON, AND A. PADDOCK REGARDING POST-EFFECTIVE DATE TRANSITION (2.1).	4.90	4,949.00	007	60746407
12/18/20	Citron, Andrew WEIL TEAM MEETING RE: POST CONFIRMATION AND GOING EFFECTIVE (.5).	0.50	465.00	007	60848398
12/18/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH WEIL, UCC, EY, AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: TRANSITIONING TO THE EFFECTIVE DATE (1.9).	1.90	1,767.00	007	60848591
12/18/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFIRMATION HEARING CONFERENCE CALL.	0.40	404.00	007	60749501
12/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CONFIRMATION (.1).	0.10	145.00	007	60759279
12/21/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH J. HENRICH RE CONFIRMATION ISSUE (.1).	0.10	145.00	007	60769715
12/21/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH BROWN RUDNICK AND PRYOR CASHMAN RE: PAYMENT OF INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (0.3); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRECEDENT FOR PROFESSIONAL FEES ESCROW ACCOUNT AGREEMENT (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (0.5); DRAFT PROFESSIONAL FEES ESCROW ACCOUNT AGREEMENT (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (1.8); CALLS WITH A. CITRON RE: CLOSING ISSUES (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (0.2);.	2.80	2,744.00	007	60872693
12/21/20	Paddock, Alyssa	2.30	1,943.50	007	60864572

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE.				
12/21/20	Martir, Martha	0.60	606.00	007	60778323
	CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON AND A. PADDOCK REGARDING THE STATUS OF CURE OBJECTIONS AND ADMIN EXPENSE APPLICATIONS FOR THE HANDOFF TO THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR.				
12/21/20	Citron, Andrew	1.80	1,674.00	007	60848464
	DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (1.8).				
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	007	60782712
	CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1).				
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	3.30	4,785.00	007	60782824
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TRANSITION OUTLINE (.6); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE COORDINATION WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.3); CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE TRANSITION ISSUES (1.7); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); CALL WITH TEAM RE UPDATING PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.5).				
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora	3.10	3,410.00	007	60990525
	PREPARE FOR FOLLOW UP MEETING WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, INCLUDING REVIEWING AND RESPONDING TO EMAILS TO FINALIZE ANNOTATED AGENDA/OUTLINE FOR DISCUSSION (1.5); CALL WITH UCC, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND K. BUONO RE POST-EFFECTIVE DATE ITEMS (1.5); FOLLOW UP EMAILS RE: SAME (.1).				
12/22/20	Blechman, Eli	3.40	3,332.00	007	60872820
	CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, COUNSEL FOR UCC AND WEIL TEAM RE: IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN, TRANSITION OF SERVICES AND GOING EFFECTIVE (1.7); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.2); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH AND A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.5); DRAFT PROFESSIONAL FEES ESCROW ACCOUNT AGREEMENT (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (1.0).				
12/22/20	Myers, Janiel	1.00	845.00	007	60884523

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.9); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: NEBRASKA COUNSEL (.1).				
12/22/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	2.50	1,825.00	007	60886169
	PROVIDE WIP LIST UPDATE TO J. ZHANG RE: OFFICER LIFE INSURANCE (0.1); REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE AND R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS TO SAME (0.1); DRAFT BULLETS RE: LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND CIRCULATE TO RX TEAM (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.1); SUMMARIZE PBGC CLAIMS INFO FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE AND CIRCULATE TO A. PADDOCK (0.3); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS TO DISCUSS TRANSITION OF PENSION PLAN TO PBGC AND PURCHASER (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE BULLETS RE: MONETIZATION OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5); DRAFT BULLETS FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.1).				
12/22/20	Paddock, Alyssa	6.80	5,746.00	007	60864509
	CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND TEAM (1.2); REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE AND ANCILLARY TASKS.				
12/22/20	Zhang, John	0.20	119.00	007	60778228
	UPDATE NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE TO REFLECT CONFIRMATION OF SECOND AMENDED PLAN.				
12/22/20	Martir, Martha	2.40	2,424.00	007	60783641
	REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR HAND-OFF MATERIALS (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON REGARDING SAME (0.1); CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, EY, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON REGARDING TRANSITION (1.8).				
12/22/20	Citron, Andrew	1.60	1,488.00	007	60848372
	CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS CALL ON TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (1.6).				
12/22/20	Citron, Andrew	5.20	4,836.00	007	60848570

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (4.1); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, A. PADDOCK RE: PREPARING MATERIALS FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A RE: DISTRIBUTING CLOSING SAPA DOCUMENTS TO THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (.2); EMAILS WITH WEIL CORPORATE AND J. MYERS RE: NEBRASKA COUNSEL FOR AMENDED ORG DOCUMENTS (.4).				
12/23/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	007	60798264
	FOLLOW UP TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING RE: WORK IN PROCESS FOR ACHIEVING EFFECTIVE DATE OF CONFIRMED PLAN.				
12/23/20	Blechman, Eli	1.50	1,470.00	007	60872774
	CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON AND R. BERKOVICH RE: PLAN IMPLEMENTATION AND VARIOUS CLOSING ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR UCC AND INDENTURE TRUSTEE RE: PAYMENT OF INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES PURSUANT TO CONFIRMED PLAN AND OTHER CLOSING ISSUES (0.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY TEAM RE: SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO, COUNSEL FOR UCC, PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND WEIL TEAM RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION) (0.5).				
12/23/20	Citron, Andrew	2.50	2,325.00	007	60848309
	REVISE CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EFFECTIVE DATE (.7); REVISE REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (1.6); CALL WITH A. RICHMOND (PRYOR CASHMAN) RE: INDENTURE TRUSTEE'S INVOLVEMENT IN DISTRIBUTION TO UNSECURED NOTES (.2).				
12/24/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	007	60817610
	REVIEW INCOMING MAIL RE: PREPARATIONS FOR EFFECTIVE DATE AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: SAME.				
12/24/20	Blechman, Eli	0.30	294.00	007	60872971
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON AND J. ZHANG RE: PLAN IMPLEMENTATION AND VARIOUS CLOSING ISSUES.				
12/24/20	Citron, Andrew	3.70	3,441.00	007	60859702

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE (.3); REVISE CLOSING CHECKLIST (.3); DRAFT OUTLINE OF MATERIALS FOR THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TO UTILIZE DURING TRANSITION (3.1).				
12/26/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. COORDINATE WITH A. CITRON ON CLOSING ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	007	60800997
12/27/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (2.4).	2.40	2,232.00	007	60848569
12/28/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE CLOSING ISSUES (.2); CALL WITH TEAM, K. BUONO, AND EY RE CLOSING ISSUES (.4); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE AND EMAIL A. CITRON RE SAME (.3); EMAILS WITH A. CITRON AND E. BERDINI RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1); CLOSING ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1).	1.20	1,740.00	007	60806828
12/28/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL RE: POST-CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS AND PREPARATIONS FOR EFFECTIVE DATE, AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: SAME.	0.70	770.00	007	60817619
12/28/20	Blechman, Eli PARTICIPATE IN CLOSING CALL WITH K. BUONO, R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON AND EY TEAM (0.5); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS, COUNSEL FOR UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT AND RELATED ISSUES (1.0).	1.50	1,470.00	007	60872673
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE LIFE INSURANCE PORTIONS OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.2).	0.20	146.00	007	61000668
12/28/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (1.8); REVIEW, UPDATE AND OBTAIN SIGNATURE PAGES FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AGREEMENT (2.1).	3.90	3,295.50	007	60864448
12/28/20	Martir, Martha	1.50	1,515.00	007	60806272

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH EY, THE COMPANY, R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON REGARDING CONDITIONS TO EFFECTIVE DATE (0.4); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EY LIST OF EFFECTIVE DATE PAYMENTS (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.5).				
12/28/20	Citron, Andrew	2.80	2,604.00	007	60848414
	CALL WITH COLM (EY) RE: CLOSING AND GOING EFFECTIVE (.4); PREPARE AND FINALIZE AMENDMENTS TO ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION (.6); DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (1.3); CALL WITH K. BUONO, EY, AND WEIL RE: CLOSING CALL (.5).				
12/29/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	2.00	2,900.00	007	60814997
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.3); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING ISSUES (.4); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PLAN ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE VARIOUS CLOSING RELATED ISSUES (.2); CONFER WITH K. BUONO RE CLOSING ITEMS (.2); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE SAME (.1); DAILY CALL WITH WEIL TEAM, EY, AND K. BUONO RE CLOSING ISSUES (PARTIAL) (.3); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING DATE ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE SAME (.1); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE CLOSING DATE ISSUES (.2).				
12/29/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.50	550.00	007	60817648
	REVIEW INCOMING CASE MAIL RE: OPEN POST-CONFIRMATION ITEMS AND PLANNING FOR EFFECTIVE DATE.				
12/29/20	Blechman, Eli	1.00	980.00	007	60872721
	PARTICIPATE IN CLOSING CALL WITH K. BUONO, R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON AND EY TEAM (0.5); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON, C. HANNON AND K. BUONO RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT AND RELATED ISSUES (0.5).				
12/29/20	Myers, Janiel	0.30	253.50	007	60884677
	DRAFT SUMMARY BULLETS RE: NMTC STIPUALTION AND CHUBB STIPULATION FOR THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.3).				
12/29/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.30	219.00	007	60885974
	REVIEW AND REVISE BULLETS RE: LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE AND CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.3).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/29/20	Paddock, Alyssa WORK WITH A. CITRON TO REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE.	1.50	1,267.50	007	60864470
12/29/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH WITH A. CITRON AND A. PADDOCK REGARDING PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.9); CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN, AND A. CITRON REGARDING CONDITIONS TO EFFECTIVE DATE (0.5); FOLLOW UP CALL WITH A. CITRON REGARDING SAME (0.1).	1.50	1,515.00	007	60813922
12/29/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (4.4); CALL WITH K. BUONO, EY, AND WEIL RE: CLOSING CALL (.7); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: EFFECTIVE DATE (.3); EMAIL ADVISOR TEAM RE: DELAY OF EFFECTIVE DATE (.3); CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: PLAN EFFECTIVE DATE (.6).	6.30	5,859.00	007	60848345
12/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING ISSUES (.2); DAILY CALL WITH WEIL TEAM, EY, AND K. BUONO RE CLOSING ISSUES (.2).	0.60	870.00	007	60833570
12/30/20	Hoejne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL RE: POST-CONFIRMATION WORKSTREAMS AND PREPARATIONS FOR EFFECTIVE DATE, AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: SAME.	0.30	330.00	007	60837197
12/30/20	Blechman, Eli PARTICIPATE IN CLOSING CALL WITH K. BUONO, R. BERKOVICH, A. CITRON AND EY TEAM.	0.50	490.00	007	60872657
12/30/20	Bardini, Elissabeth REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON RE: COMMENTS TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.1).	0.30	219.00	007	60885944
12/30/20	Citron, Andrew	5.00	4,650.00	007	60859841

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (4.7); CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW (.3).				
12/31/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.2).	0.20	290.00	007	60833972
12/31/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE.	1.40	1,183.00	007	60864684
12/31/20	Martir, Martha DRAFT BULLETS FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON REGARDING SAME (0.2).	0.50	505.00	007	60823550
12/31/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT REFERENCE OUTLINE FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITION TO EFFECTIVE DATE (3.2).	3.20	2,976.00	007	60860000
SUBTOTAL TASK 007 - Chapter 11		811.80	\$717,635.00		
Plan/Confirmation/Implementation/Plan Supplement:					
12/01/20	Himelfarb, P.J. CONSIDER SEC EXIT FILINGS.	0.30	390.00	008	60860692
12/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD MINUTES (.1).	0.10	145.00	008	60655789
12/06/20	Hochne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT NOV. 3RD BOARD MEETING MINUTES.	0.10	110.00	008	60654016
12/07/20	Himelfarb, P.J. REVIEW MS. BUONO'S COMMENTS TO THE 8-K (.1); DISCUSS FINAL SEC FILINGS (.1).	0.20	260.00	008	60666705
12/07/20	Hochne, Debora	0.10	110.00	008	60659871

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REVISED 8-K ON FILING OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT AND RELATED EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND A. HOLT.				
12/07/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K (.8), COORDINATE FILING (.4).	1.20	1,176.00	008	60661182
12/10/20	Himelfarb, P.J. DISCUSSION OF FINAL SEC FILINGS.	0.30	390.00	008	60696611
12/10/20	Holt, Andrew CALL WITH CLIENT (.2); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE SEC FILINGS (1.2).	1.40	1,372.00	008	60699890
12/14/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-KS REGARDING DISCLOSURE OF FILINGS AND FORM 15 FILING.	2.70	2,646.00	008	60715306
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. HOLT RE: 8-K FILINGS FOR CONFIRMATION MATERIALS AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT.	0.20	220.00	008	60777980
12/15/20	Holt, Andrew REVIEW BANKRUPTCY COURT FILINGS (.7), DRAFT 8-K REGARDING THE SAME (1.7).	2.40	2,352.00	008	60744300
12/16/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH A. HOLT RE: 8-K FOR MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND AMENDED PLAN.	0.10	110.00	008	60777988
12/17/20	Himelfarb, P.J. DISCUSS GOING DARK FILINGS (.2); DISCUSS 8-K ON PLAN CONFIRMATION (.1).	0.30	390.00	008	60756862
12/17/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS RE: DRAFT 8-K FOR MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND AMENDED PLAN.	0.30	330.00	008	60778046
12/17/20	Kim, Aileen	0.40	440.00	008	60737773

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE RE: FOIA AND CORP RESOLUTIONS (0.4).				
12/17/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K.	1.20	1,176.00	008	60743665
12/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE BOARD ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM AND K. BUONO RE BOARD ISSUES (.1).	0.20	290.00	008	60758464
12/18/20	Holt, Andrew CALL WITH CLIENT RE SEC FILINGS (.2), DRAFT 8-K (1.4), CONFER INTERNALLY RE SAME (.3).	1.90	1,862.00	008	60748854
12/18/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT POST-CONFIRMATION BOARD DECK (1.4).	1.40	1,302.00	008	60848554
12/19/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW BOARD SLIDES ON D&O INSURANCE AND EMAIL A. FLIMAN RE SAME (.1).	0.10	145.00	008	60757815
12/19/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW BOARD SLIDES ON D&O INSURANCE FOR DECEMBER 21 BOARD MEETING (.2); REVIEW ADDITIONAL BOARD UPDATE SLIDES ON CONFIRMATION HEARING AND REVISIONS TO SECOND AMENDED PLAN (.6).	0.80	880.00	008	60756564
12/19/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT BOARD DECK RE: DECEMBER BOARD MEETING (4.2).	4.20	3,906.00	008	60848294
12/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD SLIDES (1.2).	1.20	1,740.00	008	60759291
12/20/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW UPDATE BOARD SLIDES FOR DECEMBER 21 MEETING.	0.50	550.00	008	60756617
12/20/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	008	60756830

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW DRAFTS OF 8-K FOR CONFIRMATION OF PLAN AND EMAILS WITH A. HOLT AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME.				
12/20/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT BOARD DECK RE: POST CONFIRMATION.	4.30	3,999.00	008	60848286
12/21/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS TO A. CITRON RE BOARD SLIDES (.1); COORDINATE A. CITRON TO FINALIZE BOARD DECK (.2); COORDINATE WITH D. HOEHNE RE BOARD MEETING (.2); PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING (.9); EMAILS WITH A. CITRON RE REVISED BOARD SLIDES (.1); EMAILS WITH A. CITRON RE BOARD SLIDES (.1).	1.60	2,320.00	008	60769710
12/21/20	Morton, Matthew D. CONDUCT RESEARCH AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO, AND CONFERENCE, WITH D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE: ADDITIONS TO BOARD DECK ON ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES (.9).	0.90	990.00	008	60762451
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW ADDITIONAL CHANGES TO BOARD SLIDES (.3); PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING (.9); CALL WITH N. PAPPAS RE: STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS FOR POTENTIAL ERISA CAUSES OF ACTION (.3); EMAILS WITH A. CITRON, A. FLIMAN, M. MORTON, AND M. SCHILLER RE: REVISED BOARD SLIDES AND DIRECTOR FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS (.5); REVIEW DRAFT BOARD MINUTES (.1).	2.10	2,310.00	008	60778051
12/21/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT BOARD DECK RE: POST CONFIRMATION (2.7).	2.70	2,511.00	008	60848477
12/21/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON BOARD OF DIRECTORS MEETING CONFERENCE CALL (.9); PREPARE FOR D&O INSURANCE DISCUSSION AT BOARD MEETING (.2); REVIEW BOARD MEETING MINUTES AND WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATOR PROPOSAL (.4).	1.50	1,515.00	008	60762245
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD DECK AND EMAILS WITH A. CITRON RE SAME (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD MINUTES (.1).	0.20	290.00	008	60782750

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/22/20	Citron, Andrew DRAFT BOARD DECK RE: POST CONFIRMATION (.8).	0.80	744.00	008	60848541
12/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REVISED BOARD DECK (.1); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON BOARD PRESENTATION (.1).	0.20	290.00	008	60800936
12/23/20	Hoejne, Debora REVIEW UPDATED BOARD DECK.	0.10	110.00	008	60798283
12/23/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. ZIMMERMAN AND T. RISKE RE: ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT FOR BILLY GOAT (.1).	0.10	84.50	008	60884548
12/23/20	Citron, Andrew REVISE BOARD DECK RE: POST-CONFIRMATION (.6).	0.60	558.00	008	60848603
12/24/20	Himelfarb, P.J. ATTENTION TO FINRA RELATED ISSUES (.4); COORDINATE WITH TEAM ON SEC FILINGS (.4).	0.80	1,040.00	008	60884348
12/24/20	Holt, Andrew CONFER WITH PJ HIMELFARB RE SEC FILINGS (.2), DRAFT 8-K (.5), DRAFT FINRA NOTICE (.3).	1.00	980.00	008	60795377
12/26/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON 8-K (.1).	0.10	145.00	008	60800977
12/28/20	Himelfarb, P.J. CONSIDER AND DISCUSS SUSPENSION OF BOND TRADING (.5); CONSIDER TIMING OF EXIT FILINGS (.4).	0.90	1,170.00	008	60865148
12/28/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	008	60806910

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE DTC STOPPING TRADES ON BONDS (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE DTC STOPPING TRADES ON BONDS (.1); CONFER WITH P. J. HIMELFARB RE SEC AND DTC ISSUES (.1).				
12/28/20	Rahman, Faiza N. CALL WITH CAPITAL MARKETS PARTNER RE DTC ISSUE (0.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE DTC MATTERS (0.5).	0.90	1,057.50	008	60808057
12/28/20	Myers, Janiel EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: BILLY GOAT ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. ZIMMERMAN RE: SAME (.1); REVISE CONSENT ACTION (.2).	0.50	422.50	008	60884609
12/28/20	Holt, Andrew CONDUCT RESEARCH RE DISCLOSURE ISSUES WITH 8-K.	1.80	1,764.00	008	60815527
12/28/20	Citron, Andrew EMAILS WITH KCC RE: DTC FREEZE ON UNSECURED BONDS (.2).	0.20	186.00	008	60859979
12/29/20	Himelfarb, P.J. REVIEW SECURITIES LAW MATTER QUESTION AND CALLS RE SAME.	0.60	780.00	008	60865645
12/29/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW EMAIL FROM K. BUONO RE SECURITIES ISSUE AND CONFER WITH P. J. HIMELFARB RE SAME (.1); CONFER WITH P. J. HIMELFARB AND S. NETTLETON RE SAME (.3).	0.40	580.00	008	60814891
12/29/20	Kim, Aileen REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: ORG DOCUMENT AMENDMENTS (0.8); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: REQUEST FOR BOARD MATERIALS (0.3).	1.10	1,210.00	008	60813046
12/29/20	Holt, Andrew DRAFT 8-K/FORM 15 (.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH RE DISCLOSURES (2.8); CONFER WITH PJ HIMELFARB RE SAME (.5).	3.80	3,724.00	008	60813369

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/29/20	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS AND CALLS WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT (0.9); EMAILS WITH PARALEGAL TEAM COORDINATING FILING OF ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT (0.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.4); PREPARE AND FINALIZE ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT FOR DEBTOR ENTITIES (0.8); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH CARMODY TEAM REGARDING MISSOURI FILINGS (0.3); EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM REGARDING FINALIZED ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT (0.4).	3.30	3,069.00	008	60810142
12/30/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SECURITIES LAW QUESTION (.1); CALL WITH K. BUONO, S. NETTLETON, AND P. J. HIMELFARB RE SECURITIES LAW QUESTION (.5).	0.60	870.00	008	60833611
SUBTOTAL TASK 008 - Corporate Governance/Securities:		53.30	\$55,776.50		
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah SEND CV AND SHIPPERS NOTICES TO NOTICE PARTIES AS REQUIRED BY ORDERS.	0.10	73.00	009	60603401
12/29/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING INQUIRY FROM CLAIMANT (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING ASSERTED CLAIMS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING CRITICAL VENDOR AND SHIPPER MATRICES (0.1).	1.00	1,010.00	009	60813962
12/31/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY REGARDING CREDITOR AND CRITICAL VENDOR MATRICES.	0.20	202.00	009	60823555
SUBTOTAL TASK 009 - Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims:		1.30	\$1,285.00		
12/17/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY REGARDING BANK ACCOUNTS (0.3); REVIEW CASH MANAGEMENT ORDER REGARDING SAME (0.5).	0.80	808.00	010	60746404
12/23/20	Yoon, Andrew J.	0.40	550.00	010	60791882

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW DIP ORDER.				
12/28/20	Chan, Christopher M. REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAILS ON PAYOFF LETTERS (0.1); CALL WITH S. GOHARY RE: SAME (0.1).	0.20	119.00	010	60804191
12/28/20	Martir, Martha CALLS WITH LATHAM REGARDING DIP PAYOFF LETTER AND RELEASE OF LIENS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. YOON REGARDING SAME (0.2).	0.50	505.00	010	61027554
12/30/20	Yoon, Andrew J. REVIEW DIP PAYOFF DOCUMENTS.	0.60	825.00	010	60818657
12/30/20	Gohary, Sarah CATCH UP WITH A. YOON ON PAYOFF PROCESS FOR BRIGGS (0.2); REVIEW PAYOFF LETTER (0.2); CATCH UP WITH RX ASSOCIATE ON PROCESS (0.3).	0.70	511.00	010	60828575
12/31/20	Gohary, Sarah WORK WITH C. CHAN ON UCC-3 CHECKLIST (.3); REVIEW CHECKLIST (.4).	0.70	511.00	010	60830302
12/31/20	Chan, Christopher M. DRAFT EMAIL TO R. NAGAR RE: UCC-3 CHECKLIST FOR BRIGGS MATTER (.2); SEARCH FOR UNDERLYING FILE STAMPED UCC-1 FORMS (.1); SENDING FILE STAMPED UCC-1 FORMS, UCC3 FORMS, AND PAYOFF LETTER TO PARALEGAL TO ORGANIZE DRAFT OF UCC-3 CHECKLIST (.1); REVIEW UCC-3 CHECKLIST AND DOCUMENTS FOR PAYOFF (.6).	1.00	595.00	010	60821038
12/31/20	Reyes, Yahayra EMAILS TO AND FROM C. CHAN REGARDING UCC CHECKLIST (.2); DRAFT UCC-3 CHECKLIST (1.6).	1.80	756.00	010	60865632
SUBTOTAL TASK 010 - DIP Financing/Cash Management:		6.70	\$5,180.00		
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	011	60615586

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW REPORT OF VOTING RESULTS.				
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS RE: SOLICITATION MATERIALS FOR ASBESTOS-RELATED LIFT STAY PLAINTIFFS.	0.10	110.00	011	60641054
12/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC AND COUNSEL TO CREDITOR REGARDING INQUIRY ABOUT CREDITOR BALLOT.	0.20	146.00	011	60633519
12/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE RE VOTING ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	011	60655795
12/05/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: VOTING UPDATE.	0.30	330.00	011	60641105
12/06/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE VOTING ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	011	60655825
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora FOLLOW UP WITH S. SCHNORRENBURG RE: UNDELIVERABLE ADDRESSES (.2); CALL WITH S. HOFNER RE: VOTING UPDATE/PROGRESS (.2); REVIEW VOTING RESULTS UPDATE (.1).	0.50	550.00	011	60669112
12/08/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE RE UNDELIVERABLE ADDRESSES FOR SOLICITATION PACKAGES.	0.20	146.00	011	60667706
12/08/20	Martir, Martha CALLS WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING BALLOTS.	0.30	303.00	011	60680900
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW VOTING UPDATE.	0.10	110.00	011	60777756
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.70	511.00	011	60677209

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC AND CARMODY RE NOTICE AND SOLICITATION ISSUE FOR A PARTICULAR CREDITOR (.5); CORRESPONDENCE WTH K. BUONO AND UCC RE SAME (.2).				
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT OF VOTING DECLARATION AND COORDINATE WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME.	0.20	220.00	011	60777759
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FINAL VOTING TABULATION REPORT.	0.30	330.00	011	60777971
12/14/20	Zhang, John COORDINATE FILING OF THE VOTING DECLARATION (.5). PREPARE AND SEND FINAL VOTING DECLARATION AND EXHIBITS TO CARMODY FOR FILING (1.1).	1.60	952.00	011	60707382
SUBTOTAL TASK 011 - Disclosure Statement/Solicitation/Voting:		4.90	\$4,218.00		
12/01/20	Fliman, Ariel CORRESPOND WITH NEBRASKA WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATOR RE WORKER'S COMPENSATION CLAIMS.	0.10	101.00	012	60606077
12/03/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES AND CORRESPONDENCE RE TREATMENT OF CLAIM FOR DEFERRED PAYROLL (0.2).	0.20	225.00	012	60633698
12/03/20	Luster, Courtney CORRESPOND WITH INTERNAL WEIL TEAMS REGARDING OUTSTANDING EMPLOYEE CLAIMS AND LITIGATION (.4).	0.40	338.00	012	60631927
12/04/20	Roth, Tamara DISCUSS ANALYSIS OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS UNDER LTIP WITH S. MARGOLIS.	0.10	93.00	012	60653175
12/04/20	Richards, Lauren E.	0.60	558.00	012	60640601

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED AND EMAILS WITH WEIL BANKRUPTCY TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.6).				
12/04/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: PAYMENT OF EMPLOYEE SEVERANCE CLAIMS (0.2).	0.20	146.00	012	60653040
12/04/20	Fliman, Ariel ANALYZE WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIM PROCESSING ISSUES.	0.10	101.00	012	60647742
12/07/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS WITH L. RICHARDS REGARDING FRAZIER CLAIM (.2).	0.20	255.00	012	60656859
12/07/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPOND WITH MAI LIN RODGERS (PBGC) RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITION ISSUES AND REVIEW SAME (0.3); REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM T. ROTH RE TREATMENT OF PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR RESTRICTED STOCK AND PERFORMANCE UNIT AWARDS (0.8).	1.10	1,237.50	012	60660494
12/07/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS TO ASSESS NEXT STEPS (0.8); CONFER WITH J. ARNOLD AT BRIGGS REGARDING BACKGROUND FOR EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.5).	1.30	1,209.00	012	60659244
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION BOARD RE SETTLEMENT (.2); EMAILS WITH A. FLIMAN RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUE (.1).	0.30	435.00	012	60672590
12/08/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES ON PBGC BALLOT VOTE AND CONFIRMATION OF PBGC PROOF OF CLAIM (0.3); VARIOUS CALLS AND EMAILS WITH P, PRICKETT AND D. HOEHNE RE PBGC CLAIM (0.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE RE PBGC AND CONFIRMATION ORDER (0.1).	1.30	1,462.50	012	60670557
12/08/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT SCRIPT FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (1.1).	1.10	803.00	012	60760980

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/08/20	Fliman, Ariel ADDRESS WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT PROPOSAL ISSUES AND POTENTIAL RESPONSE (.7); PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATOR (.2).	0.90	909.00	012	60671283
12/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE PBGC CLAIM ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE PBGC CLAIM ISSUE (.3).	0.40	580.00	012	60682818
12/09/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW PBGC PROOFS OF CLAIM AND PREPARE FOR CALL WITH P. PRICKETT, R. HARRIS AND D. HOEHNE (0.4); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND P. PRICKETT (0.3); CONFER WITH R. HARRIS (MERCER), P. PRICKETT AND D. HOEHNE ON PBGC ISSUES (0.5); DRAFT ISSUES LIST FOR SAME (0.3); CONFER WITH K. BUONO, EY AND D. HOEHNE RE PBGC ISSUES (0.4).	1.90	2,137.50	012	60679403
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: PBGC CLAIMS, GLOBAL SETTLEMENT, LIFT STAY ORDER (.5).	0.50	550.00	012	61027359
12/09/20	Bardini, Elissabeth FINALIZE SCRIPT FOR MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.1).	0.30	219.00	012	60760950
12/09/20	Fliman, Ariel ADDRESS WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PROPOSALS AND CORRESPOND WITH NY REGULATOR AND UCC (1.1); ATTEND TO WORKERS' COMPENSATION BOND STATUS AND SURETY PAYMENT DEVELOPMENTS (.6).	1.70	1,717.00	012	60677559
12/10/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. REVIEW SUMMARY OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FROM L. RICHARDS AND PROPOSED NEXT STEPS RE POSSIBLE RESOLUTION OF SAME AND EMAILS WITH L. RICHARDS RE SAME (.3).	0.30	382.50	012	60692048
12/10/20	Margolis, Steven M.	0.50	562.50	012	60688895

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE ON PBGC ISSUES AND BALLOT AND REVIEW SAME (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES FROM E. BERDINI ON 1114 (0.3).				
12/10/20	Richards, Lauren E. REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMPLOYEE CLAIMS FILED AND RELATED DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY THE COMPANY TO ASSESS NEXT STEPS AND POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS (2.8); EMAILS WITH N. PAPPAS REGARDING SAME (0.2).	3.00	2,790.00	012	60689944
12/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: HEARING ON MOTION TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (0.3).	0.60	438.00	012	60760939
12/11/20	Margolis, Steven M. CONFER WITH WEIL TEAM RE 1114 ISSUES AND TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE ARRANGEMENTS (0.5); RESEARCH 1114 ISSUES FOR SPLIT DOLLAR (1.2).	1.70	1,912.50	012	60699569
12/11/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE PBGC BALLOTS.	0.20	186.00	012	60703992
12/11/20	Richards, Lauren E. DRAFT RECOMMENDATIONS REGARDING TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.3).	0.30	279.00	012	60695767
12/11/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS AND D. HOEHNE RE: EXEC LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS AND D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS ISSUES FOR 12.6 HEARING ON MOTION TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5); REVIEW EMPLOYEE INFORMATION (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT RE: YEARLY INCOME OF EXECUTIVES (0.1).	0.90	657.00	012	60761001
12/12/20	Richards, Lauren E. EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE REGARDING TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.1).	0.10	93.00	012	60695818
12/13/20	Richards, Lauren E.	0.50	465.00	012	60698846

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT RECOMMENDATIONS FOR TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.5).				
12/14/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES AND CLAIMS ON SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE PLAN TREATMENT AND DOCUMENTS FROM P. PRICKETT ON 1114(M) EXCEPTIONS (0.7); CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE W/ E. BERDINI ON SAME (0.2).	0.90	1,012.50	012	60712887
12/14/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH P. PRICKETT RE: COMPENSATION OF EXECUTIVES AND REVIEW FILES OF COMPENSATION OF EXECUTIVES (0.2).	0.20	146.00	012	60763484
12/15/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS REGARDING DRAFT NOTE TO CLIENT REGARDING RECOMMENDED NEXT STEPS IN RESOLVING EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.2).	0.20	255.00	012	60724578
12/15/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW DATA FROM P. PRICKETT ON GROSS INCOME LEVELS OF SPLIT DOLLAR PARTICIPANTS AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SAME (0.6); REVIEW ISSUES FOR MOTION ON SAME (0.6); REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM T. ROTH ON TREATMENT OF RESTRICTED STOCK AND PERFORMANCE UNIT AWARDS (0.5).	1.70	1,912.50	012	60724346
12/15/20	Richards, Lauren E. EMAILS WITH N. PAPPAS AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.2).	0.20	186.00	012	60720128
12/16/20	Margolis, Steven M. CONF. WITH E. BERDINI ON SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE MOTION (0.1), REVIEW COMPENSATION CHART AND SCRIPT (0.5); HEARING ON SPLIT DOLLAR MOTION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE ON SAME (0.5).	1.10	1,237.50	012	60729012
12/16/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND EQUITY DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MEMO SUMMARIZING TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE EQUITY CLAIMS.	1.20	1,116.00	012	60734004
12/16/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.40	292.00	012	60766742

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL AND CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: EXECUTIVE SALARIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH DORMIE RE: EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE ORDER (0.2).				
12/17/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW CLOSING AGREEMENT CHECKLIST (0.2).	0.20	225.00	012	60744218
12/17/20	Roth, Tamara REVIEW EQUITY DOCUMENTATION AND DRAFT MEMO TO FILERS OF EMPLOYEE EQUITY CLAIMS.	1.10	1,023.00	012	60741781
12/17/20	Fliman, Ariel REVISE OVERVIEW OF WORKERS' COMPENSATION INSURANCE, SECURITY AND PREMIUM RETURN ISSUES.	1.10	1,111.00	012	60741631
12/18/20	Margolis, Steven M. CORRESPONDENCE ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2).	0.20	225.00	012	60752656
12/18/20	Fliman, Ariel ADDRESS WORKERS' COMPENSATION INSURANCE ISSUES.	0.10	101.00	012	60749545
12/21/20	Pappas, Nicholas J. EMAILS TO AND FROM AND CALLS WITH S. MARGOLIS AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING ANSWERING QUESTION FROM BOARD MEMBER REGARDING CARVE OUT FROM PBGC RELEASE FOR ERISA TITLE 1 CLAIMS AND FURTHER STEPS IN ASSESSING SAME, AND STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS FOR FIDUCIARY BREACH CLAIMS (.5); REVIEW ARTICLE REGARDING ACCRUAL AND TOLLING OF ERISA FIDUCIARY BREACH STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS (.3).	0.80	1,020.00	012	60762826
12/21/20	Margolis, Steven M. REVIEW ISSUES AND CORRESPONDENCE ON DOL AUDIT AND DOCUMENTS REQUEST WITH A. CIEPLUCH AND D. HOEHNE (0.2); REVIEW ISSUES ON ERISA FIDUCIARY CLAIMS, LIABILITY AND STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS AND RESEARCH ON SAME (0.6); CONF. WITH N. PAPPAS ON SAME (0.1) ; REVIEW ISSUES FROM P. PRICKETT ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2).	1.10	1,237.50	012	60766920
12/21/20	Roth, Tamara	0.10	93.00	012	60767012

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE TITLE I FIDUCIARY CLAIMS.				
12/21/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.20	146.00	012	60883078
	CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2).				
12/22/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.90	1,147.50	012	60778466
	REVIEW EMAILS FROM D. HOEHNE, S. MARGOLIS AND L. RICHARDS REGARDING BACKGROUND AS TO "TRUE UP" OF SEVERANCE OF BURLEIGH EMPLOYEES WHOSE TERMINATIONS WERE DEFERRED (.3); EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS AND FROM D. HOEHNE, R. BERKOVICH AND A. KIM REGARDING NEED FOR LETTER TO KPS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW DRAFT LETTER FROM L. RICHARDS AND NOTE COMMENTS AND REVISIONS TO SAME (.3).				
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.60	870.00	012	60782789
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAPA/EMPLOYEE ISSUE (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE WORKERS COMPENSATION ISSUE (.1); CALL WITH M&A TEAM RE SAPA/EMPLOYEE DISPUTE (.3).				
12/22/20	Margolis, Steven M.	2.70	3,037.50	012	60781764
	REVIEW PROPOSED PENSION PLAN TRANSITION ISSUES AND DRAFT BULLET POINT FOR SAME (0.3); VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE W/ E. BERDINI ON SAME (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE W/ D. HOEHNE ON SAME (0.1); REVIEW ISSUES AND HISTORICAL CORRESPONDENCE ON APA AND SEVERANCE ADJUSTMENT AND TREATMENT OF WAUWATOSA EMPLOYEES (0.6); CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE W/ WEIL TEAM ON SAME (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE W/ J. CLARY ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2); DRAFT LETTER FOR P. PRICKETT TO CLARY ON SURRENDER (0.2) AND CORRESPONDENCE W/ WEIL TEAM ON SAME (0.2); CORRESPONDENCE W/ A. CIEPLUCH AND DOL ON DOL AUDIT (0.1).				
12/22/20	Kim, Aileen	1.50	1,650.00	012	60779856
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE RE: SEVERANCE (1.2); INTERNAL CALL RE: SAME (0.3).				
12/22/20	Roth, Tamara	1.10	1,023.00	012	60784414
	DRAFT MEMO TO FILERS OF EMPLOYEE EQUITY CLAIMS (.8); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE PBGC PENSION MATTERS (.3).				
12/22/20	Richards, Lauren E.	2.20	2,046.00	012	60780829

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND HISTORIC CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSESS EMAILS WITH K&E AND CALCULATION OF FINAL SEVERANCE AND VACATION PAYMENTS PURSUANT TO AMENDED PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.5); EMAILS WITH WEIL BANKRUPTCY AND CORPORATE TEAMS REGARDING SAME (0.3); DRAFT LETTER TO K&E OUTLINING SELLER AND ESTATE POSITION REGARDING SAME (1.3); EMAILS WITH N. PAPPAS REGARDING SAME (0.1).				
12/22/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.60	1,168.00	012	60883091
	DRAFT EMAIL TO CLARY RE: TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2); EMAIL CLARY RE: TERMINATION OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS, T. ROTH AND FOLEY RE: PROCESS OF TRANSITIONING PENSION TO PBGC (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH, E. BLECHMAN & A. CITRON RE: PBGC RETENTION REQUIREMENTS (0.2); REVIEW SALE ORDER FOR PBGC RETENTION REQUIREMENTS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE & S. MARGOLIS RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITION (0.5); CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITIONS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITIONS (0.1).				
12/22/20	Fliman, Ariel	4.80	4,848.00	012	60780066
	ANALYZE STATES' DEMANDS FOR SECURITY TO ADDRESS GAP IN WORKERS' COMPENSATION COVERAGE, POLICY CANCELLATION ISSUES AND REMAINING BROKER TASKS (1.7); DRAFT STIPULATION ADDRESSING SECURITY PAYMENT FOR WORKERS' COMPENSATION GAP PERIOD (3.1).				
12/23/20	Pappas, Nicholas J.	0.70	892.50	012	60794973
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO K&E REGARDING RESPONSIBILITY FOR SEVERANCE PAYMENTS FOR BURLEIGH TERMINATIONS AND EMAILS TO AND FROM L. RICHARDS AND R. BERKOVICH RE SAME (.5); REVIEW EMAILS FROM L. RICHARDS, S. MARGOLIS AND K. BUONO REGARDING FURTHER COMMENTS TO LETTER (.2).				
12/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.40	580.00	012	60800932
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON LETTER TO KIRKLAND RE SAPA/EMPLOYEE ISSUE (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WORKERS COMPENSATION STIPULATION (.1).				
12/23/20	Margolis, Steven M.	1.60	1,800.00	012	60795514

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	VARIOUS CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE ON ISSUES FOR PENSION PLAN AND DOCUMENTATION AND TRANSITION TO PBGC (0.4); REVIEW ISSUES AND LETTER AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SEVERANCE ADJUSTMENT AND LETTER TO K&E (0.5); CONF. WITH L. RICHARDS ON SAME (0.1); REVIEW UPDATED CHANGES TO SAME (0.2); CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.4).				
12/23/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.50	550.00	012	60798245
	CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: PBGC TRANSITION AND SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICY (AND ASSOCIATED FEES).				
12/23/20	Kim, Aileen	1.30	1,430.00	012	60791196
	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER RE: FINAL SEVERANCE AND VACATION AMOUNT (0.8); CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME (0.5).				
12/23/20	Richards, Lauren E.	1.60	1,488.00	012	60798405
	DRAFT AND REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO KIRKLAND & ELLIS REGARDING CALCULATION OF SEVERANCE AND VACATION PAY FOR TRANSFERRED EMPLOYEES (1.2); EMAILS WITH WEIL CORPORATE AND BANKRUPTCY TEAMS REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
12/23/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.50	1,095.00	012	60885973
	PREPARE FOR CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS PENSION PLAN TRANSITION (0.2); CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITION (0.3); REVIEW PENSION PLAN SUMMARY FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH FOLEY RE: PENSION PLAN TRANSITION (0.5); REVIEW LETTER TO BUYER RE: SEVERANCE ADJUSTMENT (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON & A. PADDOCK RE: REVISED BULLETS FOR PA OUTLINE RE: PENSION PLANS (0.2).				
12/23/20	Fliman, Ariel	2.70	2,727.00	012	60792522
	DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION ADDRESSING PAYMENT TO NY WORKERS' COMPENSATION REGULATOR.				
12/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	012	60800964
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON STIPULATION WITH NY WORKERS COMPENSATION BOARD (.2).				
12/24/20	Margolis, Steven M.	0.70	787.50	012	60795512

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW SURRENDER DOCUMENTATION FROM S. JOPE (0.3); CONF. AND CORRESPONDENCE ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES WITH K. BUONO AND E. BERDINI (0.4).				
12/25/20	Fliman, Ariel	2.00	2,020.00	012	60798529
	REVIEW EDITS TO WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT STIPULATION (.2); REVISE WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT STIPULATION (1.8).				
12/26/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.50	505.00	012	60798785
	REVISE WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT STIPULATION.				
12/27/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.40	580.00	012	60800940
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WORKERS COMPENSATION INSURANCE STIPULATION (.4).				
12/27/20	Citron, Andrew	0.40	372.00	012	60859933
	REVIEW AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH NY WORKERS COMPENSATION (.4).				
12/27/20	Fliman, Ariel	1.10	1,111.00	012	60798607
	INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL EDITS TO WORKERS' COMPENSATION SECURITY PAYMENT STIPULATION.				
12/28/20	Margolis, Steven M.	0.50	562.50	012	60805708
	CORRESPONDENCE ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND REVIEW FORMS AND REQUIREMENTS FOR SAME (0.3); CONFER WITH E. BERDINI ON SURRENDER CHARGES (0.2).				
12/28/20	Martir, Martha	0.10	101.00	012	60806180
	CORRESPOND WITH COMPANY REGARDING CONSULTING AGREEMENT.				
12/28/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.30	303.00	012	60806187
	REVISE NEW YORK WORKERS' COMPENSATION PAYMENT STIPULATION.				
12/29/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.50	505.00	012	60814024

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT, REGULATOR AND TEAM ON WORKERS' COMPENSATION PAYMENT STIPULATION.				
12/30/20	Margolis, Steven M.	0.30	337.50	012	60818931
	REVIEW ISSUES ON SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES AND EY RESPONSES (0.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 012 - Employee Issues:		64.30	\$66,008.00		
12/01/20	Luster, Courtney	5.30	4,478.50	014	60603698
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.9); DRAFT ESTATE'S CONTRACT ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (3.9); DRAFT CURE NOTICE UPDATE TEMPLATE TO EY (.5).				
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	014	60603413
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL AND EY REGARDING PAYMENT OF CURE AMOUNTS.				
12/01/20	Martir, Martha	0.80	808.00	014	60605119
	CALL WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING TREATMENT OF CONTRACTS (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, KPS, EY, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING FINAL CURE NOTICE (0.7).				
12/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	014	60628456
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE EXECUTORY CONTRACTS ISSUES (.1).				
12/02/20	Luster, Courtney	0.50	422.50	014	60615640
	EMAILS WITH EY AND M. MARTIR RE ESTATE'S CONTRACT ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (.5).				
12/02/20	Martir, Martha	0.80	808.00	014	60641304
	REVISE AMENDMENT TO EXECUTORY CONTRACT (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
12/03/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	1.00	1,450.00	014	60636160
	CALL WITH EY, K. BUONO, AND EY RE CONTRACT ASSUMPTION ISSUES (1.0).				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/03/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY, COMPANY, R. BERKOVICH, AND M. MARTIR RE ESTATE CONTRACTS FOR ASSUMPTION (1.7); DRAFT AND REVISE ESTATE CONTRACT ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (1.4); REVIEW NOTICE OF CONTRACT ASSUMPTION (.5).	3.60	3,042.00	014	60631935
12/03/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW MATERIALS FROM EY REGARDING CURE OBJECTION (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, EY, C. LUSTER, AND COUNTERPARTY REGARDING TREATMENT OF EQUIPMENT LEASE (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, EY, AND C. LUSTER REGARDING CURE NOTICE (0.8); CALL WITH CREDITOR REGARDING TIMING OF CURE PAYMENT (0.4); REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO CURE AMOUNT (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME (0.2).	3.80	3,838.00	014	60680734
12/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON CONTRACT ASSIGNMENT NOTICE (.3); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REVISED ASSUMPTION NOTICE (.1); CONFER WITH M. MARTIR RE EXECUTORY CONTRACTS (.1).	0.50	725.00	014	60655824
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM M. MARTIR RE: RESOLUTION OF CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CURE, INCLUDING REVIEW OF PROPOSED STIPULATION FOR SAME (.4); REVIEW EMAILS WITH UCC RE: SAME (.1).	0.50	550.00	014	60641022
12/04/20	Luster, Courtney DRAFT CURE NOTICE TEMPLATE UPDATE FOR EY (.6); REVIEW AND FINALIZE ASSUMPTION EXHIBIT FOR ASSUMPTION OF CONTRACTS BY DEBTORS (1.6); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY AND M. MARTIR RE FINALIZATION OF ASSUMPTION OF CONTRACTS EXHIBIT (1.3); EMAILS WITH EY, M. MARTIR, AND VARIOUS COUNTERPARTIES TO RESOLVE CURE OBJECTIONS (.4); DRAFT AND DISCUSS SIXTH CURE NOTICE EXHIBIT (1.1); REVIEW VARIOUS CONTRACTS FOR DEBTOR'S POTENTIAL ASSUMPTION (2.1).	6.10	5,154.50	014	60646333
12/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE RE CURE AMENDMENT.	0.20	146.00	014	60638834
12/04/20	Martir, Martha	4.30	4,343.00	014	60684983

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH THE COMPANY AND NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAP NEGOTIATIONS (1.1); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH NEW BRIGGS AND SAP REGARDING SAME (0.8); REVIEW AND REVISE SAP STIPULATION (2.4).				
12/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	014	60655826
	REVIEW SAP CONTRACT STIPULATION AND RELATED EMAILS (.1); EMAIL M. MARTIR RE SAME (.1).				
12/05/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	014	60641029
	REVIEW EMAILS RE: RESOLUTION OF SAP STIPULATION AND RELATED CONTRACTUAL ISSUES.				
12/05/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.30	219.00	014	60640954
	REVISE CURE AMENDMENT AND CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT RE SAME.				
12/06/20	Luster, Courtney	1.00	845.00	014	60646102
	DRAFT SIXTH AMENDED ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT CURE NOTICE (1.0).				
12/06/20	Martir, Martha	0.90	909.00	014	60680705
	CORRESPOND WITH COUNTERPARTY REGARDING CURE AMOUNT (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND THE COMPANY REGARDING TRANSFERRED LEASES (0.3); CORREPPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAP STIPULATION (0.3).				
12/07/20	Luster, Courtney	0.90	760.50	014	60657147
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.8).				
12/07/20	Martir, Martha	2.10	2,121.00	014	60680765
	CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING CURE OBJECTION AND CURE AMOUNTS (0.4); CALL WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING CURE OBJECTION (0.5); REVIEW MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH RETAINED RECEIVABLES (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.3).				
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	014	60777781

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH A. CITRON RE: 365(D)(4) EXTENSION MOTION (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH A. CITRON RELATED TO SAME (.1).				
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE RE PAYMENT TO EXECUTORY CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY.	0.20	146.00	014	60677232
12/09/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING CURE OBJECTION.	0.20	202.00	014	60693690
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM K. BUONO AND M. MARTIR RE: CONTRACT CURE AND POST-SALE RECEIVABLES ISSUE.	0.10	110.00	014	60777690
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL TO CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY RE PAYMENT OF CURE AMOUNTS.	0.10	73.00	014	60688771
12/10/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND CLAIMANT REGARDING CONTRACT (0.5); CALL WITH COUNTERPARTY REGARDING SAME (0.5); REVIEW INVOICES RELATED TO INFORMAL CURE OBJECTION (0.6).	1.60	1,616.00	014	60694079
12/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW PROPOSED CONTRACT AMENDMENT FROM K. LEMKE.	0.20	146.00	014	60693898
12/11/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING CURE NOTICE (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND VENDOR REGARDING AGREEMENT (0.2); CALL WITH EY REGARDING NDA AGREEMENTS FOR CURE NOTICE (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND EY REGARDING SAME (0.2); CALL WITH UNITED HEALTHCARE REGARDING ASSUMPTION OF BENEFIT PLANS (0.3); CALL WITH EY AND NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAME (0.6).	2.30	2,323.00	014	60693862
12/12/20	Martir, Martha	1.10	1,111.00	014	60696667

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND S. SCHNORRENBURG REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
12/12/20	Martir, Martha	3.00	3,030.00	014	60696674
	CORRESPOND WITH VARIOUS COUNTERPARTIES CONFIRMING RESOLUTION OF CURE OBJECTIONS (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS, THE COMPANY AND EY REGARDING CURE NOTICE AND ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.9); PREPARE TRACKER FOR CHANGES REGARDING CURE NOTICE (0.7); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND EY REGARDING HR RELATED CONTRACTS (0.5).				
12/13/20	Martir, Martha	1.30	1,313.00	014	60721580
	REVIEW CHANGES TO CURE NOTICE (0.9); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS AND EY REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
12/14/20	Luster, Courtney	5.20	4,394.00	014	60707331
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTIONS/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES WITH EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.4); REVIEWED CERTAIN CONTRACTS AND UPDATED CURE NOTICE SCHEDULE ACCORDINGLY (1.1); REVIEWED, UPDATED, AND COMPILED REVISED ASSUMPTION NOTICE (1.6); DRAFTED AND SENT EY ASSUMPTION NOTICE UPDATES (1.2); CALL WITH EY AND M. MARTIR CONCERNING THE DEBTORS' ASSUMPTION OF CERTAIN CONTRACTS (.9).				
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	014	60777968
	REVIEW DRAFT OF SIXTH AMENDED CURE NOTICE.				
12/15/20	Luster, Courtney	4.80	4,056.00	014	60719206
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH ALL OUTSTANDING OBJECTION/CURE NOTICE COUNTERPARTIES, EY, AND M. MARTIR TO RESOLVE CURE NOTICE OBJECTIONS (.8); REVIEW, EDIT, AND UPDATE SIXTH CURE NOTICE AND CORRESPONDING SCHEDULE (2.1); REVIEW AND EDIT ASSUMPTION NOTICE AND SCHEDULE (1.4); DISCUSSION WITH INTERNAL WEIL TEAM REGARDING CURRENT OBJECTION STATUS, NEXT STEPS, AND RESOLUTIONS (.5).				
12/15/20	Martir, Martha	5.30	5,353.00	014	60746849

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH EY AND NEW BRIGGS REGARDING CURE SCHEDULE (2.4); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CURE NOTICE (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CURE EXHIBIT (2.0).				
12/16/20	Luster, Courtney	1.30	1,098.50	014	60727168
	FINALIZE AND FILE SIXTH AMENDED CURE NOTICE AND CORRESPONDING SCHEDULE (.9); DISCUSSION WITH EY, M. MARTIR, AND WEIL CORPORATE CONCERNING TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS EXHIBIT FOR THE SAPA (.4).				
12/16/20	Martir, Martha	4.10	4,141.00	014	60746383
	REVIEW EXCELS LISTING CONTRACTS ASSUMED AND ASSIGNED TO KPS (2.8); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH A. KIM REGARDING SAME (0. 8); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.5).				
12/16/20	Martir, Martha	0.50	505.00	014	60746389
	REVIEW REVISED ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE.				
12/17/20	Luster, Courtney	1.00	845.00	014	60748018
	CALL WITH EY AND M. MARTIR REGARDING TRANSFERRED CONTRACTS AND SAPA AMENDMENTS (1.0).				
12/17/20	Martir, Martha	0.50	505.00	014	60746393
	FINALIZE CURE NOTICE FOR FILING.				
12/21/20	Luster, Courtney	0.20	169.00	014	60759813
	EMAILS WITH COUNTERPARTIES AND M. MARTIR RE: OUTSTANDING CURE OBJECTIONS (.2).				
12/21/20	Martir, Martha	1.20	1,212.00	014	60778314
	CORRESPOND WITH ORACLE AND C. LUSTER REGARDING ORACLE ASSIGNMENT (0.4); DRAFT NOTICE OF REJECTION DAMAGES BAR DATE (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.20	220.00	014	60781007
	REVIEW DRAFT REJECTION NOTICE.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/22/20	Luster, Courtney DRAFT AND UPDATE REJECTION NOTICES FOR SAP STIPULATION AND UFPT STIPULATION (.8).	0.80	676.00	014	60778157
12/22/20	Martir, Martha REVISE REJECTION NOTICE (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, C. LUSTER, AND KCC REGARDING SAME (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH ORACLE REGARDING CURE OBJECTION (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING TIMING OF PAYMENT OF CURE AMOUNT (0.1).	1.60	1,616.00	014	60783757
12/29/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH VARIOUS CLAIMANTS REGARDING CURE OBJECTIONS.	0.90	909.00	014	60814117
12/30/20	Luster, Courtney DISCUSSION WITH COUNTERPARTIES ANSWERING PLAN SUPPLEMENT VS CURE NOTICE CONTRACT ASSUMPTION QUESTIONS (.3).	0.30	253.50	014	60817919
12/30/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING EMAIL PROPOSED RESPONSE TO COUTERPART (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLAIMANTS REGARDING CURE OBJECTIONS (0.5).	0.70	707.00	014	60823564
12/31/20	Martir, Martha ANALYSIS OF SMARTEQUIP CURE OBJECTION (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS REGARDING SAME (0.5).	1.30	1,313.00	014	60823554
SUBTOTAL TASK 014 - Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues):		73.50	\$69,721.00		
12/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60613760
12/01/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING CASE MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.70	770.00	015	60605753
12/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.70	1,015.00	015	60628465

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE GENERAL STRATEGY (.2); WEEKLY CALL WITH EY AND K. BUONO RE STRATEGY (.5).				
12/02/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY CALL WITH K. BUONO AND WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CASE STRATEGY AND OPEN ITEMS.	0.50	490.00	015	60778047
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.50	550.00	015	60641055
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL RE: PLAN SUPPLEMENT (ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE AND CURE COSTS, RETAINED CAUSES OF ACTION), ANALYSIS OF LITIGATION CLAIMS, AMENDED SCHEDULES AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM RE: SAME.	1.00	1,100.00	015	60641053
12/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH D. HOEHNE RE STRATEGY (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60655858
12/07/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY TEAM WIP MEETING (1.0); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	1.10	1,595.00	015	60663953
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora PARTICIPATE ON TEAM WORK IN PROCESS CALL (1.2).	1.20	1,320.00	015	60660003
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL INCLUDING DOCKET UPDATE AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.80	880.00	015	60660178
12/07/20	Blechman, Eli PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY TEAM CALL (RESTRUCTURING) (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60825319
12/07/20	Luster, Courtney PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY RESTRUCTURING TEAM UPDATE CALL (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60657183

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/07/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (1.2).	1.20	1,014.00	015	60884762
12/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah WIP MEETING WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM.	1.20	876.00	015	60657366
12/07/20	Paddock, Alyssa PARTICIPATE ON WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM CALL.	1.10	929.50	015	60756495
12/07/20	Zhang, John ATTEND WEEKLY WIP MEETING (1.0).	1.00	595.00	015	60977829
12/07/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL MEETING REGARDING VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS.	1.10	1,111.00	015	60680647
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60672726
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CASE MAIL AND DOCKET UPDATES, AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.70	770.00	015	60669110
12/08/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH O. LASHKO RE: CASE ISSUES (.4); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: CASE ISSUES (.5).	0.90	990.00	015	60669122
12/09/20	Soto, Edward PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY ADVISORS' CONFERENCE CALL (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.40	560.00	015	60977850
12/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60682865

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora COORDINATION CALL WITH EY, K. BUONO, AND WEIL TEAM RE OPEN ISSUES AND CONFIRMATION/WIND-DOWN WORKSTREAMS (.5); REVIEW INCOMING MAIL, INCLUDING NMTC LENDERS' STIPULATION, RESOLUTION OF PLAN COMMENTS, AND UPDATES FROM EY RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION AND POST-CLOSING CASH FLOW (.8).	1.30	1,430.00	015	60777676
12/09/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH K. BUONO AND WEIL AND EY TEAMS RE: CASE STATUS (UPDATE AND NEXT STEPS).	0.50	490.00	015	60825332
12/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60690942
12/10/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: WORK IN PROCESS AND PREPARATIONS FOR DEC 16 OMNIBUS HEARING.	0.50	550.00	015	60777666
12/14/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY WIP CALL (.9); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	1.10	1,595.00	015	60718069
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora TEAM MEETING TO DISCUSS OPEN WORKSTREAMS AND CONFIRMATION STRATEGY.	1.10	1,210.00	015	60777948
12/14/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY TEAM MEETING (BFR) (WIP).	1.00	980.00	015	60864351
12/14/20	Luster, Courtney PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY BFR TEAM UPDATE CALL (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60707319
12/14/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (1.1).	1.10	929.50	015	60884600
12/14/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	1.10	803.00	015	60707253

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	WIP MEETING WITH WEIL BFR TEAM.				
12/14/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PARTICIPATE ON RX WIP CALL (1.0).	1.00	730.00	015	60760951
12/14/20	Paddock, Alyssa PARTICIPATE ON WEIL TEAM UPDATE CALL.	1.00	845.00	015	60757205
12/14/20	Zhang, John ATTEND WEEKLY WIP MEETING (1.0).	1.00	595.00	015	60988158
12/14/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL TEAM MEETING REGARDING THE STATUS OF CURRENT WORKSTREAMS.	1.00	1,010.00	015	60746292
12/14/20	Citron, Andrew WEEKLY TEAM WIP MEETING (.6).	0.60	558.00	015	60859269
12/16/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH EY, K. BUONO AND WEIL TEAM RE: COORDINATION AND WIND-DOWN WORKSTREAMS.	0.50	550.00	015	60777960
12/16/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INCOMING CASE MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.70	770.00	015	60777991
12/16/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH K. BUONO, EY TEAM AND WEIL TEAM RE: CASE STATUS, CONFIRMATION HEARING AND NEXT STEPS.	0.50	490.00	015	60865681
12/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa PARTICIPATE ON WEIL TEAM UPDATE CALL (.5); COORDINATE WITH OUTSIDE PARTIES TO SCHEDULE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR MEETING (1).	1.50	1,267.50	015	60757508
12/16/20	Martir, Martha	0.60	606.00	015	60746376

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING CURRENT WOKSTREAMS.				
12/17/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.20	220.00	015	60778064
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR TO DISCUSS TRANSITION (2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH TEAM RE: OUTSTANDING ITEMS FROM MEETING AGENDA (.2);	2.20	2,420.00	015	60778050
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora TEAM MEETING TO DISCUSS WORK IN PROCESS (.6); REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM (.6).	1.20	1,320.00	015	60778068
12/18/20	Luster, Courtney WIP TEAM CALL UPDATE (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60748010
12/18/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (.6).	0.60	507.00	015	60884657
12/18/20	Berdini, Elissabeth PARTICIPATE ON RX TEAM CALL (0.2); ZOOM CALL WITH RX TEAM (0.6).	0.80	584.00	015	60760965
12/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa POST-CONFIRMATION TEAM CALL.	0.30	253.50	015	60757442
12/18/20	Zhang, John FIRST POST-CONFIRMATION CALL WITH TEAM (.2); SECOND POST-CONFIRMATION CALL WITH TEAM (.6).	0.80	476.00	015	60746398
12/18/20	Citron, Andrew	1.10	1,023.00	015	60848348

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT OUTLINE OF MATERIALS FOR THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR FOR TRANSITIONING TOWARDS EFFECTIVE DATE (1.1).				
12/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.2).	0.20	290.00	015	60759294
12/21/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY WIP (PARTIAL) (.9).	0.90	1,305.00	015	60990318
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM (.4); CALL WITH TEAM RE: WORK IN PROCESS (1.3); FOLLOW UP EMAILS AFTER CALL (.2).	1.90	2,090.00	015	60778060
12/21/20	Blechman, Eli WEEKLY TEAM MEETING (BFR) (WIP).	1.20	1,176.00	015	60872790
12/21/20	Luster, Courtney PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY INTERNAL BFR UPDATE CALL (1.0).	1.00	845.00	015	60759817
12/21/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (1.2).	1.20	1,014.00	015	60884520
12/21/20	Bardini, Elissabeth REVIEW WIP LIST & CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: UPDATES TO WIP LIST (0.2); SUMMARIZE RECENTLY FILED PLEADINGS (1.0); RX WEEKLY TEAM CALL (1.2).	2.40	1,752.00	015	60883086
12/21/20	Zhang, John WEEKLY WIP MEETING WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM.	1.20	714.00	015	60765894
12/21/20	Martir, Martha	1.60	1,616.00	015	60778313

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	INTERNAL TEAM CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS (1.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CHART REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM (.9).	0.90	990.00	015	60781251
12/23/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60801005
12/23/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM ON RESPONSES.	0.20	220.00	015	60798262
12/24/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60800946
12/28/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PARTICIPATE ON WEEKLY TEAM WIP CALL (.6).	0.60	870.00	015	60806857
12/28/20	Luster, Courtney PARTICIPATE ON INTERNAL WEIL UPDATE CALL (.6).	0.60	507.00	015	60803041
12/28/20	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH BFR TEAM (.6).	0.60	507.00	015	60884723
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth WIP CALL TO DISCUSS STATUS OF CASE (0.5).	0.50	365.00	015	60886006
12/28/20	Paddock, Alyssa PARTICIPATE ON WEIL TEAM CALL.	0.60	507.00	015	60864460
12/28/20	Zhang, John	0.60	357.00	015	60804097

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ATTEND WEEKLY WIP MEETING.				
12/28/20	Martir, Martha INTERNAL TEAM MEETING REGARDING THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS (0.6); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CHART REGARDING SAME (0.3).	0.90	909.00	015	60806175
12/28/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: STATUS UPDATE ON CLOSING AND EFFECTIVE DATE (.2).	0.20	186.00	015	60848335
12/28/20	Citron, Andrew ATTEND WIP MEETING (.8).	0.80	744.00	015	60848549
12/29/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CASE EMAILS (.1).	0.10	145.00	015	60814985
12/31/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW INCOMING MAIL AND COORDINATE WITH TEAM.	0.30	330.00	015	60837252
SUBTOTAL TASK 015 - General Case Strategy (Including Client/Team Calls):		61.00	\$59,327.00		
12/01/20	Peene, Travis J. REVIEW RECENTLY FILED PLEADINGS, PREPARE AND DISTRIBUTE CALENDAR INVITE RE: DECEMBER 18, 2020 CONFIRMATION HEARING TO TEAM AND CLIENTS.	0.10	25.00	016	60615007
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: DEC 16 OMNIBUS HEARING AND AGENDA FOR SAME.	0.40	440.00	016	60777984
12/14/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AGENDA FOR DECEMBER 16 HEARING (.4).	0.40	338.00	016	60884666
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	016	60777939

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW MOTIONS FOR DECEMBER 16 OMNIBUS HEARING (.2); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: AMENDED HEARING AGENDA (.1).				
12/15/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AMENDED AGENDA FOR DECEMBER 16 HEARING (.1); PREPARE HEARING SCRIPT FOR DECEMBER 16 HEARING (1.0).	1.10	929.50	016	60884617
12/15/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DECEMBER 16, 2020 OMNIBUS HEARING (1.4); PROVIDE SAME TO T. PEENE (.2); UPDATE MATERIALS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (.2); CORRESPOND WITH T. PEENE RE: SAME (.1); ASSIST WITH CONFIRMATION RESEARCH FOR E. BLECHMAN (.2).	2.10	913.50	016	60722914
12/15/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DECEMBER 18, 2020 CONFIRMATION HEARING MATERIALS FOR D. HOEHNE.	1.40	350.00	016	60735105
12/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN OMNIBUS HEARING (.7).	0.70	1,015.00	016	60733510
12/16/20	Hoehne, Debora PREPARE FOR OMNIBUS HEARING (1.4); PRESENT MOTIONS AT OMNIBUS HEARING (.5).	1.90	2,090.00	016	60778002
12/16/20	Myers, Janiel DRAFT HEARING SCRIPT FOR DECEMBER 16 HEARING (.8); PREPARE FOR DECEMBER 16 HEARING (.7); ATTEND AND PRESENT AT HEARING RE: SAME (.4).	1.90	1,605.50	016	60884658
12/16/20	Paddock, Alyssa ATTEND AND PRESENT AT OMNIBUS HEARING.	0.40	338.00	016	60757430
12/16/20	Martir, Martha PREPARE FOR HEARING (1.0); PARTICIPATE IN HEARING (0.7); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AGENDA (0.5).	2.20	2,222.00	016	60746396

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/16/20	Citron, Andrew ATTEND OMNIBUS HEARING (.4).	0.40	372.00	016	60793951
12/16/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST T. PEENE WITH HEARING ON DECEMBER 16 (.2); ASSIST T. PEENE WITH CONFIRMATION HEARING (7.3).	7.50	3,262.50	016	60733420
12/16/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF DECEMBER 18, 2020 CONFIRMATION HEARING MATERIALS FOR TEAM.	8.40	2,100.00	016	60735107
12/17/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST WITH MATERIALS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING BASED ON FILED AGENDA (.6); CORRESPOND WITH T. PEENE RE: SAME (.2).	0.80	348.00	016	60736219
12/18/20	Goldring, Stuart J. ATTEND CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.5).	1.50	2,542.50	016	60989442
12/18/20	Soto, Edward PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN PLAN CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.0).	2.00	2,800.00	016	60751878
12/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFIRMATION HEARING (3.3).	3.30	4,785.00	016	60758498
12/18/20	Rahman, Faiza N. PARTIAL ATTENDANCE AT CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5).	0.50	587.50	016	60756744
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora PRESENT ARGUMENT AT CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.7); PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.6); CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH BEFORE HEARING (.1); CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: HEARING OUTLINE/SCRIPT IN ADVANCE OF HEARING (.1).	5.50	6,050.00	016	60778039
12/18/20	Berman, Corey D.	3.10	3,410.00	016	60757849

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PLAN CONFIRMATION HEARING.					
12/18/20	Blechman, Eli ATTEND AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.7).	2.70	2,646.00	016	60989935
12/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa ATTEND CONFIRMATION HEARING.	2.30	1,943.50	016	60757542
12/18/20	Martir, Martha PARTICIPATE IN CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.8).	1.80	1,818.00	016	60990253
12/18/20	Stauble, Christopher A. COORDINATE TELECONFERENCE APPEARANCE FOR TEAM FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING ON 12/18/2020.	1.40	588.00	016	60836357
12/22/20	Citron, Andrew COORDINATE WITH CARMODY TO OBTAIN FEBRUARY OMNIBUS DATE (.2).	0.20	186.00	016	60848305
SUBTOTAL TASK 016 - Hearings and Court Matters:		54.30	\$44,035.50		
Matters:					
12/01/20	Fliman, Ariel ANALYZE AND SUMMARIZE INSURANCE PREMIUM PAYMENT STATUS AND REQUIRED NEXT STEPS.	0.70	707.00	017	60605985
12/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE LIFE INSURANCE (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60628479
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE MOTION.	0.10	110.00	017	60615576
12/02/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.90	657.00	017	60653143

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW LIFE INSURANCE POLICY PROCEEDS (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH HL RE: INSURANCE POLICY PROCEEDS (0.3).				
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH K. BUONO RE: CANCELLATION OF FINANCING FOR INSURANCE POLICIES.	0.30	330.00	017	60641098
12/03/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH EY TEAM RE INSURANCE POLICY ISSUES (.9); REVIEW POLICY CANCELLATION, PREMIUM RETURN AND COVERAGE GAP SECURITY PAYMENT ISSUES (.5).	1.40	1,414.00	017	60635975
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM E. KHATCHATOURIAN AND T. WILL RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL IN CONNECTION WITH ASBESTOS-RELATED INSURANCE POLICIES.	0.20	220.00	017	60641037
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH K. BUONO AND S. FOLEY (US PREMIUM FINANCE) RE: TERMINATION OF EXCESS COVERAGE POLICIES.	0.10	110.00	017	60641086
12/05/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM AND FOLEY RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60655850
12/05/20	Hoehne, Debora UPDATE COMMITTEE COUNSEL RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT WITH ASBESTOS-RELATED INSURANCE CARRIERS ON POLICY BUY-BACK.	0.20	220.00	017	60641104
12/07/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW EMAILS WITH FOLEY AND INSURANCE COMPANY RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM AND FOLEY RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1).	0.20	290.00	017	60663949
12/07/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH T. WILL AND E. KHATCHATOURIAN RE: POTENTIAL INSURANCE SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL.	0.10	110.00	017	60660001

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/07/20	Fliman, Ariel REVIEW CANCELED INSURANCE POLICY CONFIRMATION MATERIALS.	0.10	101.00	017	60657402
12/08/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE INSURANCE ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60672642
12/08/20	Hoejne, Debora REVIEW EMAILS FROM INSURERS' COUNSEL RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OFFERS.	0.40	440.00	017	60669075
12/09/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL ADDRESSING SURETY BOND PAYMENT STATUS.	0.40	404.00	017	60677591
12/10/20	Hoejne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INSURERS RESPONDING TO POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OFFER.	0.10	110.00	017	60777720
12/10/20	Hoejne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT OUTLINE FOR PRESENTATION OF MOTION TO TERMINATE SPLIT DOLLAR AGREEMENTS.	0.20	220.00	017	60777762
12/10/20	Hoejne, Debora CALL WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: INSURANCE AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR ISSUES.	0.20	220.00	017	60777773
12/10/20	Fliman, Ariel PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL RE CHUBB PLAN EDITS (.5); PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL RE INSURER SETTLEMENT OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE INSURANCE PREMIUM AUDIT ISSUES (.3); REVIEW INSURER MATERIALS RE PLAN AND SETTLEMENT OBJECTIONS (.2).	1.30	1,313.00	017	60689137
12/11/20	Hoejne, Debora CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS AND E. BERDINI RE: EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE MOTION (.5); REVIEW EMAIL RE: PREMIUM FINANCING ISSUE (.1).	0.60	660.00	017	60777670
12/11/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.10	101.00	017	60701267

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE INSURANCE PREMIUM FINANCE ISSUES.				
12/13/20	Citron, Andrew	0.40	372.00	017	60793894
	REVIEW PREMIUM FUNDING ASSOCIATES AGREEMENTS (.4).				
12/14/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.60	606.00	017	60715283
	PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH PREMIUM FINANCING PROVIDER (.3); REVIEW INSURANCE PREMIUM FINANCING AND FEE BALANCE ISSUES (.3).				
12/15/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.20	202.00	017	60722378
	ANALYZE INSURANCE POLICY CANCELLATION ISSUES.				
12/16/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.40	404.00	017	60729050
	REVIEW EXMARK SETTLEMENT MATERIALS AND BOND PAYMENT ISSUES.				
12/16/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.20	202.00	017	60729091
	ADDRESS INSURANCE PREMIUM FINANCE ISSUES.				
12/17/20	Citron, Andrew	0.50	465.00	017	60848303
	EMAILS TO D. HOEHNE AND K. BUONO RE: TERMINATING PREMIUM FINANCE AGREEMENT (.5).				
12/17/20	Fliman, Ariel	0.30	303.00	017	60741795
	REVIEW TAIL COVERAGE PROVISIONS IN D&O INSURANCE POLICY.				
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	017	60778029
	CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES, CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (.1).				
12/18/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.10	73.00	017	60989947
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE TO DISCUSS SURRENDER OF EXEC LIFE INSURANCE (0.1).				
12/18/20	Fliman, Ariel	2.20	2,222.00	017	60749528

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE OVERVIEW OF D&O INSURANCE COVERAGE SCOPE AND STRUCTURE.				
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH E. BERDINI RE: ADMINISTRATIVE FEES FOR SURRENDER OF EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES.	0.10	110.00	017	60778061
12/21/20	Fliman, Ariel ATTEND TO SHAREHOLDER OBJECTOR POTENTIAL LITIGATION ISSUES.	0.20	202.00	017	60762434
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT EMAIL TO CLARY RE: SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES.	0.10	110.00	017	60781079
12/23/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: EFFECTUATING SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.6).	0.60	438.00	017	60885909
12/24/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW ORDER AUTHORIZING SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: SURRENDERING LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); REVIEW FORMS TO SURRENDER LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME FORMS AND NEXT STEPS (0.3).	0.90	657.00	017	60887078
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW FORMS TO SURRENDER SPLIT-DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. MARGOLIS RE: SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2); LIST QUESTIONS FOR CLARY RE: FORMS TO SURRENDER SPLIT-DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: SPLIT DOLLAR LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.6); CALLS WITH S. MARGOLIS TO DISCUSS SURRENDERING SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLARY RE: SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES AND TERMINATION FEES ASSOCIATED THEREWITH (0.5).	2.30	1,679.00	017	60885933
12/29/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON STIPULATION RE CHUBB CLAIMS (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60814991

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/29/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH FASSETT REGARDING INSURANCE POLICY.	0.20	202.00	017	60809972
12/29/20	Fliman, Ariel ATTEND TO INSURANCE TAIL COVERAGE NOTIFICATION ISSUES.	0.10	101.00	017	60814030
12/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: TAX ASPECTS OF SURRENDERING LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); REVIEW EY ANALYSIS (0.4); ANALYZE LIFE INSURANCE TAX ISSUES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: LIFE INSURANCE TAX ANALYSIS (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON, R. BERKOVICH, AND A. PADDOCK RE: EY LIFE INSURANCE TAX ANALYSIS (0.2); REVIEW LIFE INSURANCE POLICY SURRENDER FORMS (0.2); CORRESPOND WITHEY RE: PREFERRED PAYMENT METHOD FOR CASH VALUE OF INSURANCE POLICIES (0.2).	1.60	1,168.00	017	60887304
12/30/20	Fliman, Ariel DISCUSS D&O TAIL COVERAGE ISSUES WITH MARSH BROKER.	0.10	101.00	017	60819073
12/31/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH J. MYERS RE CHUBB CLAIMS STIPULATION (.1).	0.10	145.00	017	60834219
SUBTOTAL TASK 017 - Insurance Issues:		19.30	\$18,189.00		
12/04/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DOCUMENTS RELATED TO TREATMENT OF PENDING ASBESTOS-RELATED CLAIMS (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.50	700.00	018	60650661
12/04/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE LITIGATION CLAIMS (.1).	0.10	145.00	018	60655877
12/08/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW OBJECTION FROM ZURICH TO 9019 SETTLEMENT MOTION WITH EXMARK.	0.70	591.50	018	60756599

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/09/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH A. FLIMAN RE ZURICH OBJECTION TO EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH EY, A. FLIMAN, AND A. PADDOCK RE SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. FLIMAN AND A. PADDOCK RE SAME (.1); REVIEW ZURICH OBJECTION TO EXMARK AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (.2).	0.60	870.00	018	60683179
12/09/20	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT SCRIPT FOR EXMARK 9019 HEARING AND REVIEW RELEVANT DOCUMENTS RELATED THERETO (0.5); CALL WITH WEIL AND EY TEAMS TO DISCUSS ZURICH SURETY BONDS (0.3); DRAFT SCRIPT FOR EXMARK HEARING (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. PADDOCK RE: SCRIPT FOR EXMARK 9019 HEARING (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (0.1).	2.40	1,752.00	018	60760931
12/09/20	Paddock, Alyssa CALL WITH ZURICH'S COUNSEL RE: 9019 OBJECTION (.5) AND RELATED MATTER (1.1).	1.60	1,352.00	018	60756669
12/10/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH COUNSEL TO ZURICH RE EXMARK ORDER (.3); CONFER WITH COUNSEL TO EXMARK RE ZURICH OBJECTION (.1).	0.40	580.00	018	60690935
12/10/20	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH ZURICH TO DISCUSS ZURICH OBJECTION TO EXMARK 9019 (0.3).	0.30	219.00	018	60760945
12/13/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAIL A. PADDOCK RE REVISING ORDER APPROVING EXMARK SETTLEMENT (.1); REVIEW ORDER APPROVING EXMARK SETTLEMENT AND EMAIL A. PADDOCK RE SAME (.3).	0.40	580.00	018	60704100
12/13/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE EXMARK SETTLEMENT PROPOSED ORDER TO REFLECT ZURICH'S REQUESTED CHANGES AND CIRCLUATE TO TEAM (1.9); DRAFT REPLY TO OBJECTION (1.5).	3.40	2,873.00	018	60757037
12/14/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.70	1,015.00	018	60718051

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON REPLY TO ZURICH OBJECTION TO EXMARK MOTION (.3); REVIEW DRAFT EXMARK ORDER RECEIVED FROM ZURICH (.1); EMAILS WITH A. PADDOCK AND LATHAM RE SAME (.1); FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE EXMARK ORDER (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE EXMARK (.1).				
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND A. PADDOCK RE: EXMARK SETTLEMENT.	0.10	110.00	018	60777937
12/14/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVISE EXMARK SETTLEMENT ORDER WITH COMMENTS FROM EXMARK AND ZURICH (2.5); REVISE REPLY TO OBJECTION (.9); CIRCULATE SAME (.2).	3.60	3,042.00	018	60757198
12/16/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SCRIPT FOR HEARING ON EXMARK MOTION (.6); COORDINATE WITH A. PADDOCK TO PREPARE FOR HEARING ON EXMARK LITIGATION (.4).	1.00	1,450.00	018	60733430
12/17/20	Paddock, Alyssa REVIEW AND REVISE EXMARK SUMMARY.	0.40	338.00	018	60757308
12/22/20	Soto, Edward PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE ON CALL WITH WEIL-TEAM REPRESENTATIVES REGARDING PENDING LITIGATION HOLDS RELATED TO THREATENED LITIGATION THAT HAS NOT AS YET BEEN FILED (.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.00	1,400.00	018	60783789
12/22/20	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH E. SOTO RE: LITIGATION HOLD FOR ZIMMERMAN POTENTIAL CLAIM.	0.10	110.00	018	60781034
12/23/20	Soto, Edward REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ADDITIONAL ANALYSIS REGARDING THE STATUS OF THREATENED LITIGATION WHICH WAS THE SUBJECT OF A LITIGATION DOCUMENT HOLD (.4); ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.50	700.00	018	60793285
12/29/20	Nettleton, Stacy	1.00	1,200.00	018	60836547

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ATTENTION TO POTENTIAL LITIGATION ISSUE RE REQUESTED RECORDS; REVIEW RELEVANT AGREEMENT; TELECONFERENCE TEAM RE SAME (1.0).				
12/30/20	Nettleton, Stacy	0.70	840.00	018	60836448
	TELECONFERENCE RE POTENTIAL LITIGATION ISSUE AND REVIEW AGREEMENT RE SAME (.7).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 018 - Non-Bankruptcy		19.50	\$19,867.50		
Litigation:					
12/01/20	Morton, Matthew D.	2.20	2,420.00	020	60614107
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BOOKER RE: DATABASE REPORT ON REMAINING PROPERTIES (.3); CONDUCT CALL WITH K. BUONO PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONS AND SALE STATUS (.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: PROPERTY HISTORY AND CONDITIONS (1.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CONNOLLY RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO AND D. HOEHNE RE: PROPERTY SALE STATUS (.1).				
12/09/20	Citron, Andrew	1.40	1,302.00	020	60793965
	ANALYZE POTENTIAL EXCEPTIONS TO ASSUMING REAL PROPERTY LEASES POST CONFIRMATION (1.1); CALL WITH M. MARTIR RE: ASSUMING LEASES POST CONFIRMATION (.3).				
12/09/20	Citron, Andrew	0.30	279.00	020	60987397
	CALL WITH D. HOEHNE RE: 365(D)(4) (.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 020 - Real Property/Real Estate		3.90	\$4,001.00		
Lease Issues:					
12/01/20	Connolly, Annemargaret	1.10	1,540.00	021	60608898
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT AND WEIL TEAMS REGARDING ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES AT RETAINED REAL ESTATE AND RESPONSE TO JUSTICE DEPARTMENT'S INQUIRIES (.4); REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE QUERIES (.3); REVIEW PHASE I REPORT FOR KENTUCKY SITE (.3); AND FOLLOW UP WITH M. MORTON RE SAME.				
12/01/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	440.00	021	60605593

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CALL WITH K. BUONO, E. BLECHMAN AND M. MORTON RE: RESPONSES TO DOJ QUESTIONS RE: POTENTIAL ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES AND STATUS FOR REMAINING PROPERTIES (.3); REVIEW FOLLOW UP EMAILS FROM K. BUONO RE: STATUS OF PROPERTIES (.1).				
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.60	438.00	021	60603388
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH ENVIRONMENTAL TEAM RE REMAINING REAL PROPERTY ASSETS (.3); CALL RE POTENTIAL ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES WITH D. HOEHNE, E. BLECHMAN, A. CONNOLLY, M. MORTON AND K. BUONO (.3).				
12/02/20	Morton, Matthew D.	0.10	110.00	021	60627128
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. BLECHMAN AND D. HOEHNE RE: DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD RESPONSE (.1).				
12/03/20	Connolly, Annemargaret	0.10	140.00	021	60638132
	REVIEW M. MORTON'S RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE'S REQUESTS.				
12/03/20	Morton, Matthew D.	1.00	1,100.00	021	60637224
	CONFERENCE WITH D. HOEHNE RE: REAL PROPERTY REMAINING IN ESTATE (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE RE: REAL PROPERTY REMAINING IN ESTATE (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE RE: DISPOSITION OF REAL PROPERTY REMAINING IN ESTATE (.4).				
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	330.00	021	60641046
	CALL WITH M. MORTON RE: RESPONSE TO DOJ INQUIRIES RE: RETAINED PROPERTIES (.2); REVIEW M. MORTON EMAIL TO A. TENENBAUM RE: SAME (.1).				
12/04/20	Morton, Matthew D.	0.30	330.00	021	60651875
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. KENDRICK RE: PROPOSED PLAN LANGUAGE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE RE: POTENTIAL DEBTOR LIABILITIES UNDER EMISSIONS CERTIFICATES (.2).				
12/06/20	Morton, Matthew D.	0.10	110.00	021	60651762
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM E. BLECHMAN RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO PLAN LANGUAGE (.1).				
12/07/20	Morton, Matthew D.	0.30	330.00	021	60665852

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. TENENBAUM AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: PROPOSED RELEASE LANGUAGE IN PLAN (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM E. BLECHMAN RE: RESPONSE TO CARB (.1).				
12/08/20	Morton, Matthew D. REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM E. BLECHMAN AND A. TENENBAUM RE: DOJ AND CALIFORNIA AIR RESOURCES BOARD PLAN LANGUAGE (.1).	0.10	110.00	021	60674313
12/09/20	Morton, Matthew D. REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. KENDRICK RE: CARB LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER.	0.10	110.00	021	60684954
12/14/20	Morton, Matthew D. CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE RE: DOJ INQUIRIES ON ESTATE PROPERTY SALES AND MURRAY, KY SALE PROCESS (.3).	0.30	330.00	021	60713966
12/22/20	Morton, Matthew D. CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. CITRON RE: POTENTIAL ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES.	0.20	220.00	021	60782886
SUBTOTAL TASK 021 - Regulatory/Environmental Issues:		5.00	\$5,638.00		
12/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH OCP RE PAYMENT QUESTION.	0.10	73.00	022	60727093
12/23/20	Blechman, Eli CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ZHANG AND A. CITRON RE: ESITMATES OF OCP FEES (FOR PURPOSES OF THE PROFESSIONAL FEES ESCROW ACCOUNT) (PLAN IMPLEMENTATION).	0.50	490.00	022	60872655
12/23/20	Zhang, John CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN TO DISCUSS OCP FEE ESTIMATES (.1); ANALYZE PAYMENT PATTERN OF OCPS BASED ON THE FIRST QUARTERLY STATEMENT (1.8).	1.90	1,130.50	022	60790312
12/24/20	Zhang, John	0.70	416.50	022	60795500

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	DRAFT, REVISE, AND SEND EMAIL TO K. LEMKE REGARDING THE ESTIMATION OF ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL FEES.				
12/28/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.10	73.00	022	60807704
	CORRESPONDENCE RE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS AND PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT.				
12/28/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.70	511.00	022	60885918
	REVIEW OCP INFORMATION FOR PURPOSES OF OBTAINING FEE ESTIMATES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG AND S. SCHNORRENBERG RE: SAME (0.2).				
12/28/20	Zhang, John	0.80	476.00	022	60804117
	PROCURE CONTACT INFORMATION OF AND REACH OUT TO MAJOR ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS REGARDING FEE ESTIMATES.				
12/29/20	Zhang, John	0.20	119.00	022	60810119
	CALL WITH J. KELLY FROM MERCER REGARDING MERCER'S ESTIMATED UNPAID FEE CLAIMS.				
12/30/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.20	146.00	022	60823406
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. MARTIR RE WAIVER OF OCP PREPETITION CLAIMS.				
12/30/20	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.60	438.00	022	60885936
	CORRESPOND AND CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: MERCER CLAIM (0.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH MERCER AND OCP DECLARATION RE: MERCER CLAIM (0.2); CALL WITH J. ZHANG AND M. MARTIR TO DISCUSS MERCER CLAIM (0.2).				
12/30/20	Zhang, John	0.70	416.50	022	60818017
	CALL WITH E. BERDINI REGARDING MERCER'S PREPETITION FEE (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. BERDINI AND M. MARTIR REGARDING THE SAME (2); CALL WITH M. MARTIR TO FURTHER DISCUSS THE SAME (.2).				
12/31/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	022	60834191

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE OCP ISSUES (.1).				
12/31/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY AND THE COMPANY REGARDING OCP REIMBURSEMENTS.	0.40	404.00	022	60823557
SUBTOTAL TASK 022 - Retention/Fee Application:		7.00	\$4,838.50		
OCPs:					
12/01/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH CBRE AND COUNSEL CONCERNING RETENTION APPLICATION (.7).	0.70	591.50	023	60603701
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH FOLEY REGARDING INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS.	0.10	73.00	023	60603385
12/01/20	Zhang, John REVIEW AND SUMMARIZE FOLEY & LARDNER LLP'S OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT (3.1); EMAIL K. BUONO REGARDING SAME (.2).	3.30	1,963.50	023	60603027
12/01/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH C. LUSTER REGARDING CBRE RETENTION.	0.30	303.00	023	60605256
12/02/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED CBRE RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.20	220.00	023	60615562
12/02/20	Luster, Courtney CALLS AND EMAILS WITH CBRE AND COUNSEL RE RETENTION APPLICATION (.7); REVIEW, UPDATE AND FINALIZE CBRE'S RETENTION APPLICATION FOR FILING (2.3).	3.00	2,535.00	023	60615612
12/02/20	Martir, Martha CALLS AND EMAILS WITH CBRE AND C. LUSTER REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATION (0.9); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CBRE RETENTION APPLICATION (1.7).	2.60	2,626.00	023	60641310

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/04/20	Luster, Courtney DISCUSSION WITH CBRE COUNSEL RE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATIONS (.4).	0.40	338.00	023	60646241
12/04/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY RE INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); UPDATE PROFESSIONALS ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TIMELINE (.2).	0.40	292.00	023	60638848
12/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC REGARDING INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	146.00	023	60657404
12/07/20	Zhang, John FINALIZE AND SEND EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING FOLEY & LARDNER LLP'S OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT.	0.20	119.00	023	60657077
12/09/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW CBRE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION IN CONNECTION WITH RETENTION APPLICATION.	0.10	110.00	023	60777682
12/09/20	Zhang, John REVIEW E&Y OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT.	2.20	1,309.00	023	60677200
12/09/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW CBRE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND CBRE REGARDING SAME (0.1).	0.50	505.00	023	60694030
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW DRAFT KCC INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.2); REVIEW DRAFT HOULIHAN FEE APPLICATION (.3); CALL WITH B. MARKS FROM HOULIHAN RE FEE APPLICATION (.1).	0.60	438.00	023	60688609
12/10/20	Zhang, John REVIEW E&Y OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT.	3.70	2,201.50	023	60686817
12/13/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.20	146.00	023	60696721

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH HOULIHAN AND KCC RE INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS.				
12/14/20	Luster, Courtney	0.90	760.50	023	60707339
	REVIEW AND UPDATE CBRE ORDER TO REFLECT SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION (.9).				
12/14/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.30	219.00	023	60707125
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH VARIOUS RETAINED PROFESSIONALS RE INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS.				
12/14/20	Zhang, John	2.20	1,309.00	023	60707350
	REVIEW CARMODY'S NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (1.9); DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM FLAGGING ISSUES (.3).				
12/15/20	Luster, Courtney	0.50	422.50	023	60719253
	COORDINATE WITH CBRE RE: UPDATED ORDER (.5).				
12/15/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.40	292.00	023	60719275
	PREPARE SCRIPT INSERT FOR PERKINS COIE RETENTION APPLICATION.				
12/16/20	Luster, Courtney	0.30	253.50	023	60727170
	EMAIL CBRE REGARDING FINALIZED ORDER (.3);.				
12/16/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	0.30	219.00	023	60727098
	FINALIZE PERKINS COIE RETENTION ORDER AND SENDING TO FILE.				
12/16/20	Zhang, John	2.20	1,309.00	023	60727079
	DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (2.2).				
12/16/20	Zhang, John	0.50	297.50	023	60727087
	ADDRESS M. MARTIR'S QUESTION REGARDING CARMODY'S OCTOBER AND NOVEMBER FEE APPLICATIONS.				
12/17/20	Luster, Courtney	0.70	591.50	023	60748015

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW HOULIHAN SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION AND COORDINATED FILING (.7).				
12/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah CORRESPONDENCE WITH PROFESSIONALS REGARDING VARIOUS ORDERS AND FEE APPLICATIONS.	0.10	73.00	023	60736751
12/17/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY AND J. ZHANG REGARDING DISCREPANCIES IN FEE STATEMENTS.	0.50	505.00	023	60746405
12/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah PREPARE VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS' FEE APPS FOR FILING.	1.30	949.00	023	60746712
12/18/20	Zhang, John REVISE AND FINALIZE DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING ON FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.6); SEND THE DRAFT NOTICE TO D. HOEHNE AND E. BLECHMAN FOR REVIEW (.1).	0.70	416.50	023	60746392
12/18/20	Zhang, John EMAIL OTHER PROFESSIONALS REGARDING FEE ESTIMATES FOR PROFESSIONAL FEES ESCROW ACCOUNT.	0.70	416.50	023	60746703
12/21/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH PROFESSIONALS RE: FEE ESTIMATES FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT (PER CONFIRMED PLAN) AND UPDATE TRACKER PER CORRESPONDENCE.	0.50	490.00	023	60872822
12/21/20	Zhang, John REVIEW FEE STATEMENTS FOR HOULIHAN LOKEY AND LATHAM & WATKINS (.8); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL SUMMARIZING THE SAME TO K. BUONO (.4).	1.20	714.00	023	60765903
12/21/20	Zhang, John REVIEW CARMODY'S REVISED FEE STATEMENT (.2); DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM FLAGGING FURTHER ISSUES (.4); SEND EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING CARMODY'S REVISED FEE STATEMENT (.2).	0.80	476.00	023	60766093
12/21/20	Zhang, John	1.00	595.00	023	60766157

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	PREPARE AND UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE TRACKER.				
12/22/20	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS RE: SAME.	0.50	490.00	023	60872675
12/22/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ZHANG, C. HANNON AND VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS RE: FEE ESTIMATES FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT.	0.20	196.00	023	60872796
12/22/20	Zhang, John UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE TRACKER.	0.60	357.00	023	60778230
12/22/20	Zhang, John PREPARE EXCEL SPREADSHEET FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE CLAIMS AND ESTIMATES.	0.80	476.00	023	60778529
12/22/20	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH HOULIHAN REGARDING TERMINATION OF ENGAGEMENT LETTER.	0.20	202.00	023	60783860
12/23/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ZHANG RE: FEE TRACKER AND FEE ESTIMATES FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT.	0.20	196.00	023	60872731
12/23/20	Zhang, John REVIEW NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT FOR BROWN RUDNICK LLP (1.4); DRAFT EMAIL TO TEAM FLAGGING POTENTIAL ISSUES (.2); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING BROWN RUDNICK LLP'S NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (.2).	1.80	1,071.00	023	60790293
12/23/20	Zhang, John FURTHER UPDATE WORD AND EXCEL CHARTS FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE CLAIMS AND ESTIMATES.	1.10	654.50	023	60790298
12/28/20	Zhang, John	0.60	357.00	023	60804074

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	FINALIZE PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE CHART AND CIRCULATE SAME TO EY (.2); UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE BASED ON EY'S COMMENTS AND FOLEY'S NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (.4).				
12/29/20	Zhang, John	0.20	119.00	023	60810132
	PROVIDE A. CITRON WITH A LIST OF NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENTS FILED AND OBJECTION DEADLINES FOR THE SAME.				
12/29/20	Zhang, John	1.70	1,011.50	023	60810152
	CALLS WITH A. CITRON TO DISCUSS STATUS OF PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATES AND NEXT STEPS (.4); UPDATE PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE CHART IN RESPONSE TO A. CITRON'S COMMENTS (1.0); DRAFT EMAIL TO DEBTOR AND UCC PROFESSIONALS REGARDING PAYMENT LOGISTICS (.3).				
12/30/20	Zhang, John	3.00	1,785.00	023	60818009
	DRAFT EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING HANSEN REYNOLDS'S NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (.8); DRAFT EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING FOLEY'S NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (2.2).				
12/31/20	Zhang, John	0.30	178.50	023	60821106
	SEND BREAKDOWN OF NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENTS TO A. CITRON.				
12/31/20	Martir, Martha	0.40	404.00	023	60823560
	REVIEW PROFESSIONAL INVOICE SUMMARIES.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 023 - Retention/Fee Applications:		45.40	\$31,722.50		
Retained Professionals non Weil:					
12/01/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.20	290.00	024	60613752
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT (.1).				
12/01/20	Friedman, Julie T.	0.30	187.50	024	60630133
	REVIEW FEE STATEMENT AND COMMENT ON SAME.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/01/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.90	1,387.00	024	60603412
12/01/20	Zhang, John CORRESPOND WITH J. FRIEDMAN REGARDING STATUS OF PAYMENT FOR WEIL'S THIRD MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	0.30	178.50	024	60603014
12/01/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION, AND SERVE WEIL'S FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT.	2.60	650.00	024	60614923
12/02/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW OCTOBER FEE STATEMENT AND DRAFT FIRST INTERIM FEE STATEMENT.	2.80	2,044.00	024	60615495
12/02/20	Peene, Travis J. ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF WEIL'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	3.80	950.00	024	60647860
12/03/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND COMMENT ON SAME.	1.40	875.00	024	60643897
12/03/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.00	730.00	024	60633312
12/03/20	Zaslav, Benjamin ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	5.00	1,950.00	024	60656855
12/07/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SUPPLEMENTAL WEIL DISCLOSURE (.1).	0.10	145.00	024	60664064
12/07/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW MATERIALS FOR THIRD SUPPLEMENT DISCLOSURE (1.1).	1.10	929.50	024	60884737

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/07/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.10	73.00	024	60657416
12/09/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE GUIDELINES (3.6); REVIEW FEE APPLICATION AND COMMENT ON SAME (.5).	4.10	2,562.50	024	60676986
12/09/20	Blechman, Eli PREPARE BUDGET AND STAFFING PLAN FOR SECOND INTERIM PERIOD.	0.50	490.00	024	60825307
12/09/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE (.1).	0.10	84.50	024	60884741
12/09/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah DRAFT AND REVISE WEIL'S INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	2.40	1,752.00	024	60677216
12/10/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE GUIDELINES.	2.60	1,625.00	024	60686472
12/10/20	Blechman, Eli PREPARE BUDGET AND STAFFING PLAN FOR SECOND INTERIM PERIOD.	0.50	490.00	024	60825292
12/10/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.80	584.00	024	60688690
12/10/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST WITH FINALIZING THIRD SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS RE: SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH FINANCE RE: SAME (.2); PROVIDE SAME TO J. MYERS (.1).	1.50	652.50	024	60692302
12/11/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW INVOICE FOR COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE GUIDELINES.	2.40	1,500.00	024	60720724

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/11/20	Myers, Janiel REVIEW AND REVISE DISCLOSURE SCHEDULE FOR SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE (.8).	0.80	676.00	024	60884726
12/11/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE FEE APPLICATION.	0.80	584.00	024	60693863
12/11/20	Lee, Kathleen Anne ASSIST J. MYERS WITH THIRD SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION REVISION (1.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. MYERS (.2).	1.30	565.50	024	60700226
12/13/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE WEIL'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.00	980.00	024	60863749
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT BUDGET AND STAFFING PLAN FOR NOVEMBER-DECEMBER.	0.30	330.00	024	60777979
12/14/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW FEE APPLICATION AND COMMENT ON AND EMAILS RE: SAME.	0.70	437.50	024	60706185
12/14/20	Blechman, Eli REVISE BUDGET AND STAFFING PLAN FOR SECOND INTERIM PERIOD PER COMMENTS FROM D. HOEHNE.	1.00	980.00	024	60864157
12/14/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE WEIL'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.50	1,470.00	024	60864332
12/14/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVISE WEIL FEE APPLICATION.	0.90	657.00	024	60707167
12/14/20	Kleissler, Matthew Joseph ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.50	375.00	024	60769215

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/15/20	Friedman, Julie T. REVIEW FEE APPLICATION AND COMMENT ON SAME.	1.00	625.00	024	60720529
12/15/20	Blechman, Eli CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FRIEDMAN AND M. KLEISSLER RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (0.2); UPDATE BUDGET AND STAFFING PLAN (0.2).	0.40	392.00	024	60865344
12/15/20	Myers, Janiel REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION.	0.10	84.50	024	60884595
12/15/20	Kleissler, Matthew Joseph ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR J. FRIEDMAN.	2.60	650.00	024	60769149
12/16/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. SCHNORENBERG, J. FRIEDMAN AND M. KLEISSLER RE: SAME.	0.80	784.00	024	60865521
12/16/20	Kleissler, Matthew Joseph ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1.00	250.00	024	60769161
12/17/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah REVIEW EDITS TO INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.30	219.00	024	60736732
12/18/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.4); REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL RETENTION DISCLOSURE (.1).	0.50	725.00	024	60758456
12/18/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND FINALIZE WEIL'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	196.00	024	60865828
12/18/20	Myers, Janiel	0.60	507.00	024	60884626

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL DISCLOSURE (.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. KO RE: SAME (.1).				
12/18/20	Schnorrenberg, Sarah	1.90	1,387.00	024	60746723
	REVISE WEIL INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO R. BERKOVICH COMMENTS AND PREPARE SAME FOR FILING.				
12/18/20	Kleissler, Matthew Joseph	1.20	300.00	024	60769189
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF MATERIALS RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.				
12/21/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	024	60884485
	FINALIZE SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION FOR FILING (.2).				
12/22/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.30	435.00	024	60782881
	REVIEW NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT (WEIL) (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE WEIL FEE STATEMENT FOR NOVEMBER (.1).				
12/22/20	Blechman, Eli	0.30	294.00	024	60872653
	REVIEW WEIL'S OUTSTANDING FEES AND PROVIDE FEE ESTIMATE FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. HOEHNE RE: SAME.				
12/22/20	Blechman, Eli	0.50	490.00	024	60872727
	CALL WITH J. ZHANG RE: WEIL'S FINAL FEE APPLICATION.				
12/22/20	Myers, Janiel	0.20	169.00	024	60884522
	REVISE THIRD SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND D. KO RE: SAME (.2).				
12/22/20	Zhang, John	0.80	476.00	024	60778234
	CALL WITH E. BLECHMAN REGARDING SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.				
12/23/20	Blechman, Eli	0.10	98.00	024	60872679

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FRIEDMAN RE: FINAL FEE APPLICATION AND OUTSTANDING FEES.					
12/23/20	Blechman, Eli	0.20	196.00	024	60872809
CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND J. FRIEDMAN RE: REMAINING FEE STATEMENTS AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.					
12/28/20	Zhang, John	4.50	2,677.50	024	60804112
DRAFT SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.					
12/29/20	Zhang, John	7.30	4,343.50	024	60810114
DRAFT SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.					
12/31/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.50	725.00	024	60834186
REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION (.5).					
SUBTOTAL TASK 024 - Retention/Fee Applications:		70.80	\$43,377.50		
Weil:					
12/02/20	Berkovich, Ronit J.	0.10	145.00	025	60628354
EMAILS WITH TEAM RE AMENDED SCHEDULES AND OTHER ISSUES (.1).					
12/03/20	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	110.00	025	60641078
REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF AMENDED SCHEDULES E/F FOR CERTAIN DEBTORS.					
12/03/20	Blechman, Eli	1.00	980.00	025	60790029
REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING OF AMENDED SCHEDULES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MYERS, J. ZHANG AND T. RISKE RE: SAME.					
12/03/20	Myers, Janiel	0.70	591.50	025	60884471
REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICE OF AMENDED SCHEDULES (.7).					
12/03/20	Zhang, John	3.00	1,785.00	025	60631902

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	ADDRESS COMMENTS ON AND REVISE DRAFT NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULES E/F.				
12/03/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW REVISED SCHEDULE EF.	0.80	808.00	025	60680842
12/04/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF NOTICE OF AMENDED SCHEDULES.	0.10	110.00	025	60641027
12/04/20	Blechman, Eli REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING OF AMENDED SCHEDULES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY TEAM AND J. MYERS, J. ZHANG AND T. RISKE RE: SAME.	0.50	490.00	025	60790202
12/04/20	Myers, Janiel CIRCULATE NOTICE OF AMENDED SCHEDULES TO EY TEAM AND K. BUONO (.1); CONFER WITH E. BLECHMAN RE: SAME (.2); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME (.2); CALL WITH S. HOFNER (EY) RE: FINAL AMENDED SCHEDULES (.1); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. KO RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICE OF AMENDED SCHEDULES AND EXHIBITS (.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH KCC TEAM RE: SAME (.1);.	1.20	1,014.00	025	60884500
12/04/20	Zhang, John REVISE NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULE E/F (1.1); PREPARE EXHIBITS FOR NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULE E/F (.5); FINALIZE ALL AMENDED SCHEDULE E/F DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED (.6).	2.20	1,309.00	025	60638546
12/18/20	Paddock, Alyssa WEIL INTERNAL TEAM MEETING.	0.50	422.50	025	60757482
SUBTOTAL TASK 025 - Schedules/SOFAs/2015.3		10.20	\$7,765.00		
Report:					
12/01/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW FINALIZED EY STATEMENT OF WORK AND COMMUNICATE WITH EY.	0.10	84.50	027	60609435

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/02/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER N. FLAGG EMAIL REGARDING TAX FILINGS, AND DISCUSS SAME WITH A. ARIKAT (.2).	0.20	339.00	027	60629033
12/02/20	Kutilek, Lukas COMMUNICATE WITH CLIENT'S ACCOUNTING ADVISORS RE: TAX FILING STRATEGIES AND OBLIGATIONS.	0.30	253.50	027	60633910
12/03/20	Featherman, Greg W. REVIEW PLAN ADMINISTRATION AGREEMENT.	0.50	687.50	027	60634631
12/03/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim RESEARCH EMPLOYMENT TAXES AND DUE DATES (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TAX RE: RESEARCH (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. FLAGG RE: PROOF OF CLAIM OBJECTION (.4).	1.80	1,890.00	027	60637315
12/03/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW IRS PROOFS OF CLAIMS (.2); DISCUSS WITH TEAM (.2); RESEARCH TAX ISSUES (.4).	0.80	676.00	027	60633918
12/07/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER A. ARIKAT EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH EY REGARDING PURCHASE PRICE ADJUSTMENT (.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH A. ARIKAT (.1).	0.30	508.50	027	60665860
12/07/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY RE: PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION.	0.30	315.00	027	60677425
12/09/20	Goldring, Stuart J. REVIEW PROPOSED STATE TAX CONFIRMATION ORDER LANGUAGE (.4); DISCUSS SAME WITH D. HOEHNE AND OTHERS (.7); REVIEW REVISED LANGUAGE AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGES REGARDING SAME (.2).	1.30	2,203.50	027	60685510
12/09/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim	1.40	1,470.00	027	60677474

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL RESTRUCTURING RE: IRS FOLLOW UP RE: ALMAND BROS FILING (.2); REVIEW MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE PLAN AMENDMENT (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WEIL TAX AND RESTRUCTURING RE: REVISED DRAFT OF MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE PLAN AMENDMENT (.9).				
12/09/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW PROPOSED LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER (.3); DISCUSS SAME WITH TAX AND RESTRUCTURING TEAMS (.2); RESEARCH RELATED ISSUES (1.4).	1.90	1,605.50	027	60690742
12/10/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER REVISED TAX LANGUAGE CHANGES TO CONFIRMATION ORDER, INCLUDING FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME (1.0); DISCUSS SAME WITH E. BLECHMAN (.5); FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGES REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.80	3,051.00	027	60692202
12/10/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL RE: MDOR PLAN AMENDMENT.	0.30	315.00	027	60694122
12/10/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVIEW FINALIZED LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER.	0.10	84.50	027	60690770
12/11/20	Goldring, Stuart J. REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED LANGUAGE FOR CONFIRMATION ORDER.	0.10	169.50	027	60704970
12/13/20	Kutilek, Lukas COMMUNICATE WITH EY RE: UPDATE ON NEXT STEPS.	0.10	84.50	027	60700061
12/14/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim REVIEW WSD REQUEST.	0.30	315.00	027	60706918
12/14/20	Kutilek, Lukas RESEARCH BANKRUPTCY-RELATED TAX ISSUES.	2.40	2,028.00	027	60715433

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
12/15/20	Goldring, Stuart J. CONSIDER L. KUTILEK EMAIL REGARDING TAX QUESTION FROM K. BUONO, AND RESPOND TO SAME (.3); REVIEW DRAFT EMAIL TO K. BUONO (.3).	0.60	1,017.00	027	60726064
12/15/20	Featherman, Greg W. REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. KUTILEK RELATING TO 165 TIMING.	0.50	687.50	027	60720536
12/15/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. KUTILEK RE: WSD (.3). TAX RESEARCH - WSD (.6).	0.90	945.00	027	60718681
12/15/20	Kutilek, Lukas RESEARCH TAX ISSUES AND DRAFTING A RESEARCH SUMMARY (2.1); DRAFT AN EMAIL FOR THE CLIENT (.3).	2.40	2,028.00	027	60723767
12/16/20	Goldring, Stuart J. RESPOND TO L. KUTILEK REGARDING DRAFT EMAIL TO K. BUONO REGARDING STOCK LOSSES (.3).	0.30	508.50	027	60734711
12/16/20	Featherman, Greg W. REVIEW EMAIL RELATING TO TIMING OF WORTHLESS STOCK LOSS.	0.50	687.50	027	60728571
12/16/20	Kutilek, Lukas REVISE TAX RESEARCH SUMMARY (.5); DRAFT E-MAIL TO THE CLIENT RE: DEDUCTION FOR TAX LOSSES (.4).	0.90	760.50	027	60731724
12/17/20	Goldring, Stuart J. REVIEW AND CONSIDER PRELIMINARY TAX CLAIM REVIEW NUMBERS (.3).	0.30	508.50	027	60745484
12/17/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim REVIEW N. FLAGG CORRESPONDENCE RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES.	0.80	840.00	027	60745095
12/17/20	Kutilek, Lukas	0.40	338.00	027	60743898

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE CLIENT'S ACCOUNTING ADVISORS (.1); DISCUSS NEXT STEPS WITHIN THE FIRM (.3).				
12/18/20	Goldring, Stuart J. EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. ARKAT AND OTHERS REGARDING IRS TAX CLAIM (.3).	0.30	508.50	027	60758625
12/18/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH R. BERKOVICH AND TAX TEAM RE: TAX REFUND ISSUES.	0.10	110.00	027	60778058
12/18/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAMS RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES (.4). TAX RESEARCH - RIGHT OF SETOFF (1.3). CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAMS RE: RIGHT OF SETOFF (.6). CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY TEAM RE: DEFERRED PAYROLL TAXES (.4).	2.70	2,835.00	027	60748798
12/18/20	Kutilek, Lukas CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: PRIORITY OF IRS TAX CLAIMS.	1.70	1,436.50	027	60746889
12/20/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. EMAILS WITH TEAM RE TAX ISSUES (.1).	0.10	145.00	027	60759296
12/21/20	Featherman, Greg W. REVIEW EMAILS ABOUT PRE-PETITION EMPLOYMENT TAX DEFERRAL. (1.5).	1.50	2,062.50	027	60764001
12/21/20	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH TAX TEAM RE: POTENTIAL REFUNDS AND TAX CLAIMS.	0.20	220.00	027	60778041
12/21/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. FLAGG RE: IRS ADMIN CLAIMS (.4). TAX RESEARCH - DEFINITION OF PREPETITION TAXES (1.2). CORRESPONDENCE WITH WEIL TEAMS RE: DEFINITION OF PREPETITION TAXES (.3).	1.90	1,995.00	027	60763049
12/22/20	Goldring, Stuart J.	0.10	169.50	027	60784027

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. ARIKAT REGARDING IRS TAX CLAIM (.1).				
12/22/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim CORRESPONDENCE WITH EY RE: PRIORITY TAX CLAIMS.	0.30	315.00	027	60790179
12/28/20	Goldring, Stuart J. PARTICIPATE ON GROUP TAX CALL WITH INCOMING PLAN ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING TAX ITEMS (1.3).	1.30	2,203.50	027	60809094
12/28/20	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR AND OTHERS RE TAX ISSUES AND CLAIMS (PARTIAL) (.3).	0.30	435.00	027	60806899
12/28/20	Featherman, Greg W. CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN ADMINISTRATION.	1.00	1,375.00	027	60805466
12/28/20	Arikat, Saleh Hashim REVIEW OUTSTANDING TAX ISSUES (.3). CONFERENCE CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, WEIL, EY, BRIGGS RE: OUTSTANDING TAX ISSUES (1.2).	1.50	1,575.00	027	60814850
12/28/20	Kutilek, Lukas DISCUSS OUTSTANDING TAX ITEMS WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (1.0); REVIEW CASE STATUS (0.4).	1.40	1,183.00	027	60806227
12/28/20	Citron, Andrew CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR RE: TAX OPEN ITEMS (1.4).	1.40	1,302.00	027	60848582
SUBTOTAL TASK 027 - Tax Issues:		37.40	\$42,271.50		
12/14/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATED MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR NOVEMBER REPORTING PERIOD (.4).	0.40	440.00	030	60777945
12/14/20	Martir, Martha	1.50	1,515.00	030	60746230

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW DRAFT NOVEMBER MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (1.1); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
12/15/20	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR NOVEMBER.	0.10	110.00	030	60777966
12/15/20	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND D. HOEHNE REGARDING SAME (0.1).	0.60	606.00	030	60746211
SUBTOTAL TASK 030 - US Trustee/Monthly Operating Report:		2.60	\$2,671.00		
12/22/20	Myers, Janiel CONFER WITH R. SEVALRUD RE: EFFECT OF SAPA ON PREPETITION AND POSTPETITION UTILITY DEPOSITS (.4); CALL WITH J. HENRICH RE: SAME (.2); VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.4).	1.00	845.00	031	60884530
SUBTOTAL TASK 031 - Utility Adequate Assurance:		1.00	\$845.00		
Total Fees Due		1,551.90	\$1,369,328.50		

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021000542

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u> <u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>DISB TYPE</u>	<u>DISB ID#</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
12/11/20	Soto, Edward DUPLICATING PAYEE: SPEED PRINT ONE, INC. (17463-01); INVOICE#: 172664; DATE: 11/02/2020 - COPIES AND BINDER.	H025	40563778	61.94
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H025:				<u><u>\$61.94</u></u>
12/29/20	Holt, Andrew FILING FEES PAYEE: BROADRIDGE ICS (44195-02); INVOICE#: BRHC10017233; DATE: 12/23/2020 - EDGAR FILING SERVICE - HTML CONVERSION & SEC SUBMISSION	H181	40580144	650.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H181:				<u><u>\$650.00</u></u>
12/23/20	WGM, Firm DUPLICATING 2658 COLOR PRINT(S) MADE IN NEW YORK BETWEEN 12/16/2020 TO 12/16/2020	S011	40581325	265.80
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE S011:				<u><u>\$265.80</u></u>
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS				<u><u><u>\$977.74</u></u></u>

EXHIBIT K

FEES AND EXPENSES (JANUARY 1, 2021 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021)

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
01/04/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART TO INCLUDE PROPOSED STIPULATION FOR PRO METAL WORKS.	0.40	252.00	001	60841794
01/04/21	Martir, Martha CALL WITH PRO METAL WORKS (0.2); FINALIZE STIPULATION (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH UCC, EY, AND CARMODY RE: SAME (0.3).	0.60	645.00	001	60860833
01/05/21	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH EY AND J. ZHANG RE: PRO METAL WORKS STIPULATION.	0.20	215.00	001	60870774
SUBTOTAL TASK 001 - Administrative Expense		1.20	\$1,112.00		
Claims:					
01/04/21	Myers, Janiel DRAFT NOTICE RE: DE MINIMIS ASSET TRANSACTIONS (1.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (.1); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: SAME (.1).	1.60	1,432.00	003	61070449
01/04/21	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH CT CORPORATION RE: FILED ARTICLES OF AMENDMENT (0.2); EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND WEIL RESTRUCTURING TEAM RE: SAME (0.2).	0.40	394.00	003	60843588
01/05/21	Myers, Janiel REVISE NOTICE OF DE MINIMIS ASSET TRANSACTIONS.	0.30	268.50	003	61023376
01/05/21	Sevalrud, Robert EMAILS WITH WEIL M&A TEAM RE: SAPA QUESTIONS.	0.50	492.50	003	60863603
01/06/21	Myers, Janiel EMAIL WITH A. CITRON RE: VALUE OF MUNNSVILLE PROPERTY.	0.10	89.50	003	61023447
SUBTOTAL TASK 003 - Asset Disposition/363		2.90	\$2,676.50		
Sales:					

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
01/02/21	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS (3.0); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND R. BERKOVICH RE: REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS (0.2).	3.20	2,464.00	005	60969605
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISED CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS.	1.00	1,150.00	005	60848497
01/04/21	Berdini, Elissabeth CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: PROOFS OF CLAIMS DATA FOR CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION (0.4).	0.70	539.00	005	60972198
01/05/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE AND CIRCULATE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART WITH EY.	0.30	189.00	005	60862912
01/05/21	Martir, Martha REVISE CLAIM STIPULATION CHART (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG RE: SAME (0.1).	0.40	430.00	005	60870674
01/06/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS AND TRANSITION EMAIL FOR PLAN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.30	345.00	005	60871660
01/06/21	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE, J. MYERS AND EY TEAM RE: CLAIMS ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND E. BERDINI RE: CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCEDURES MOTION AND CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: SAME (1.0).	1.50	1,560.00	005	60959836
01/06/21	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW AND REVISE CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION AND EXHIBITS AND CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE RE: SAME (2.9).	2.90	2,233.00	005	60972118

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
SUBTOTAL TASK 005 - Bar Date Motion and Claims Issues:		10.30	\$8,910.00		
01/03/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.70	441.00	006	60824997
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW UPDATED WIP.	0.50	575.00	006	61100458
01/04/21	Myers, Janiel COMMENT ON WIP LIST.	0.30	268.50	006	61070455
01/04/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	1.90	1,197.00	006	60841791
01/04/21	Martir, Martha REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CHART OF OUTSTANDING WORKSTREAMS (0.3).	0.30	322.50	006	60860808
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW POST-CONFIRMATION WIP AND PRE-EFFECTIVE DATE CLOSING WIP.	0.50	575.00	006	60863697
01/05/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE WIP AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.20	126.00	006	60862724
01/06/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE WIP LIST AND CASE CALENDAR.	0.20	126.00	006	60869443
SUBTOTAL TASK 006 - Case Administration (docket updates and WIP ONLY):		4.60	\$3,631.00		
01/04/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. CALL WITH TEAM AND K. BUONO RE CLOSING ISSUES (PARTIAL) (.1); EMAILS RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1).	0.20	330.00	007	60851820

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
01/04/21	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH K. BUONO, EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLOSING ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS WITH A. CITRON AND J. ZHANG RE: IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN AND CLOSING ISSUES (0.5).	1.00	1,040.00	007	60959767
01/04/21	Martir, Martha CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, AND A. CITRON RE: THE CONDITION PRECEDENT TO GOING EFFECTIVE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON RE: SAME (0.3).	0.70	752.50	007	60860791
01/04/21	Citron, Andrew INTERNAL CLOSING CALL (.5).	0.50	492.50	007	60958537
01/05/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. DAILY CLOSING CALL (.3); EMAILS RE CLOSING ISSUES (.2).	0.50	825.00	007	60864823
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora CLOSING CALL FOR EFFECTIVE DATE WITH EY AND K. BUONO.	0.30	345.00	007	60863534
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: EFFECTIVE DATE PREPARATIONS.	0.40	460.00	007	60863646
01/05/21	Blechman, Eli CALL WITH K. BUONO, EY AND WEIL TEAMS RE: CLOSING ISSUES (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS WITH R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE AND A. CITRON RE: IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN AND CLOSING ISSUES (1.0).	1.50	1,560.00	007	60959850
01/05/21	Martir, Martha CALL WITH THE COMPANY, EY, R. BERKOVICH, D. HOEHNE, AND A. CITRON RE: CONDITIONS PRECEDENT FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.40	430.00	007	60870882
01/06/21	Berkovich, Ronit J.	1.00	1,650.00	007	60873290

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.2); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH A. CITRON RE CLOSING ISSUES (.1); CLOSING CALL (PARTIAL) (.5).				
01/06/21	Hoehne, Debora CALLS WITH A. CITRON (X3) TO PREPARE FOR TRANSITION TO PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, DIP PAYOFF/LIEN RELEASE, AND CLOSING CALL.	0.40	460.00	007	60871666
01/06/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW UPDATED PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.3); CLOSING CALL (.8); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS IN CONNECTION WITH PREPARATIONS FOR EFFECTIVE DATE AND TRANSITION (.8); FOLLOW UP FROM CLOSING CALL (.3).	2.20	2,530.00	007	61101219
01/06/21	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH A. CITRON RE: IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN AND CLOSING ISSUES (0.7); CLOSING CALL WITH K. BUONO, WEIL AND EY TEAMS, COUNSEL FOR UCC AND PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (0.8).	1.50	1,560.00	007	60959876
01/06/21	Gohary, Sarah CLOSING CALL.	0.50	385.00	007	61101240
01/06/21	Holt, Andrew ATTEND CLOSING CALL.	1.00	1,040.00	007	61101243
01/06/21	Zhang, Jiaheng UPDATE NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE AND CIRCULATE SAME TO A. CITRON.	0.20	126.00	007	60869444
01/06/21	Martir, Martha CALL WITH THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR, THE COMPANY, AND EY RE: CONDITIONS PRECEDENT TO EFFECTIVE DATE (0.9); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH A. CITRON AND EY RE: SAME (0.6).	1.50	1,612.50	007	60870870
01/06/21	Sevalrud, Robert REVIEW FILING EVIDENCE FOR WISCONSIN DEBTOR ENTITIES (0.3); EMAILS WITH T. LIU RE: SAME (0.2).	0.50	492.50	007	60871669

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
SUBTOTAL TASK 007 - Chapter 11		14.30	\$16,091.00		
Plan/Confirmation/Implementation/Plan Supplement:					
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFTS OF SEC FILINGS WITH CLIENT COMMENTS AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO FINRA.	0.10	115.00	008	60848420
01/04/21	Holt, Andrew DRAFT SEC FILINGS (.5), CONFER WITH PJ HIMELFARB RE SAME (.1), ATTENTION TO EMAILS (.1).	0.70	728.00	008	60856878
01/05/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. CONFER WITH P. J. HIMELFARB RE SECURITIES ISSUES (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SAME (.1); EMAILS WITH TEAM RE SECURITIES ISSUES (.1).	0.30	495.00	008	60864805
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora CALL WITH A. HOLT RE: FINRA RESPONSE LETTER (.2); EMAILS WITH A. HOLT AND PJ HIMELFARB RE: SAME (.1); REVIEW REVISE RESPONSE LETTER (.1).	0.40	460.00	008	60863635
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora EMAILS WITH A. HOLT AND PJ HIMELFARB FOLLOWING UP ON ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS FROM FINRA.	0.40	460.00	008	60863652
01/05/21	Holt, Andrew ATTEND CALL WITH CLIENT (.2), DRAFT 8-K (1.8), CONFER WITH PJ HIMELFARB RE ISSUES (.2.), DRAFT FINRA NOTICE (.5).	2.70	2,808.00	008	60866785
01/06/21	Holt, Andrew DRAFT AND COORDINATE 8-K FILING (1.2); ATTENTION TO EMAILS (.2).	1.40	1,456.00	008	60943350
SUBTOTAL TASK 008 - Corporate Governance/Securities:		6.00	\$6,522.00		
01/01/21	Martir, Martha	0.90	967.50	009	60826885

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	FINALIZE CRITICAL VENDOR AND SHIPPERS MATRICES (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH LATHAM, KIRKLAND, BROWN RUDNICK, AND CARMODY RE: SAME (0.4).				
01/05/21	Myers, Janiel	0.20	179.00	009	61023375
	EMAIL CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: WELLS FARGO TERMINATION AGREEMENT.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 009 - Customer/Vendor Issues and Reclamation/503(b)(9) Claims:		1.10	\$1,146.50		
01/04/21	Gohary, Sarah	1.40	1,078.00	010	60851623
	COORDINATE WITH LW/RESTRUCTURING TEAMS ON GETTING PAYOFF LETTER SIGNED UP (0.6); CALL TO CONFIRM ALL PAYOFFS HAVE BEEN COMPLETED WITH LW ASSOCIATE (0.3); COORDINATE WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM ON AUSTRALIAN ACCOUNTS (0.5).				
01/04/21	Chan, Christopher M.	0.70	441.00	010	60834712
	DISCUSS NEXT STEPS WITH S.GOHARY (.1); EMAIL LW RE: COMMENTS TO UCC-3 TERMINATION AND DRAFT PAY OFF LETTER (.2); EMAIL R. NAGAR RE QUESTION ON UCC-3 BOX 6A (.1); SAVE USPTO NOTICES OF RECORDATION/DIP RELEASES ON SYSTEM (.1); PREPARE COMPANY SIGNATURE PAGE TO PAYOFF LETTER (.2).				
01/05/21	Yoon, Andrew J.	1.50	2,175.00	010	60862905
	REVIEW DIP TERMINATION AND PAYOFF DOCUMENTS.				
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	460.00	010	61100899
	EMAILS WITH TEAM RE: PAYOFF LETTER FOR DIP LIENS AND RELATED ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH EFFECTIVE DATE, INCLUDING REVIEW OF UPDATED DRAFT PAYOFF LETTER (.4).				
01/05/21	Gohary, Sarah	1.80	1,386.00	010	60872671
	COORDINATE WITH BRIGGS/EY/LW FOR SIGN-OFF ON PAYOFF LETTER AND TRACK DOWN MISSING INVOICES.				
01/05/21	Chan, Christopher M.	0.50	315.00	010	60859265

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	TRACKING COMMUNICATIONS WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM ON PAYOFF DOCUMENTATION (0.2); SEND JPM INVOICE TO LATHAM (GLOBAL) AND CONFIRM THAT IT IS COVERED BY PAYOFF LETTER (0.1); COMMUNICATE WITH LATHAM (GLOBAL) RE PAYOFF LETTER QUESTION AND WHETHER IT COVERS JPM INVOICE (0.1); COMMUNICATE WITH LATHAM (GLOBAL) RE PAYOFF EFFECTIVE DATE AND SIGNATURE PAGES (0.1).				
01/05/21	Martir, Martha	1.10	1,182.50	010	60870654
	CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, D. YOON, D. HOEHNE, AND A. CITRON RE: PAYOFF AMOUNTS (0.4); REVIEW WELLS FARGO AGREEMENTS RE: SAME (0.7).				
01/06/21	Yoon, Andrew J.	0.80	1,160.00	010	60870607
	REVIEW PAYOFF DOCUMENTS.				
01/06/21	Gohary, Sarah	1.70	1,309.00	010	60872968
	COORDINATE WITH LW/BRIGGS FOR FINAL SIGN-OFF ON PAYOFF LETTER (1.5); REVIEW FINAL PAYOFF LETTER AND CONFIRM AMOUNTS (0.2).				
01/06/21	Citron, Andrew	2.90	2,856.50	010	60959837
	COORDINATE WITH L&W RE: DIP PAYOFF LETTER AND LIEN TERMINATIONS (1.4); CLOSING CALL WITH PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (1.5).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 010 - DIP Financing/Cash Management:		12.80	\$12,363.00		
01/06/21	Fliman, Ariel	0.40	430.00	012	60870848
	REVIEW REGULATORS' WORKERS' COMPENSATION INSURANCE CANCELLATION INFORMATION REQUESTS.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 012 - Employee Issues:		0.40	\$430.00		
01/03/21	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.60	1,232.00	014	60972132
	DRAFT STIPULATION WITH MERCER RESOLVING CURE COSTS ISSUES.				

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION RE: CURE DISPUTE IN CONNECTION WITH ASSUMPTION OF MERCER AGREEMENT.	0.20	230.00	014	60848561
01/04/21	Berdini, Elissabeth DRAFT STIPULATION WITH MERCER TO RESOLVE CURE COSTS ISSUE (4.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. MARTIR RE: SAME (0.1).	4.20	3,234.00	014	61100883
01/04/21	Martir, Martha CORRESPOND WITH NEW BRIGGS RE: REJECTED CONTRACTS (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CURE STIPULATION (1.9).	2.40	2,580.00	014	60860823
01/05/21	Luster, Courtney EMAIL WITH M. MARTIR RE: CERTAIN COUNTERPARTIES CONTRACTS (0.1); EMAIL WITH EY RE: STATUS UPDATES ON CURE ITEMS (0.1).	0.20	179.00	014	60864311
01/05/21	Berdini, Elissabeth CALL WITH M. MARTIR, J. ZHANG AND MERCER RE: MERCER STIPULATION.	0.20	154.00	014	60972260
01/05/21	Zhang, Jiaheng SET UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH AND CIRCULATE DIAL-IN INFORMATION TO MERCER (.3); ATTEND CALL WITH MERCER RE: PREPETITION CLAIMS AND PROPOSED STIPULATION (.2).	0.50	315.00	014	60862749
01/05/21	Martir, Martha REVISE MERCER STIPULATION (0.6); CORRESPOND WITH THE COMPANY, D. HOEHNE, AND E. BERDINI RE: SAME (0.5); CALLS AND EMAILS WITH MERCER RE: SAME (0.8); CORRESPOND WITH THE UCC AND CARMODY RE: SAME (0.5); CORRESPOND WITH WILLIS TOWERS RE: ASSUMPTION SCHEDULE (0.4); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND THE COMPANY RE: SAME (0.2).	3.00	3,225.00	014	60870850
01/06/21	Luster, Courtney CALL WITH EY AND M. MARTIR TO DISCUSS CURE NOTICES AND OTHER CONTRACT ACTIONS WITH VARIOUS COUNTERPARTIES.	0.60	537.00	014	60883753

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
01/06/21	Martir, Martha FINALIZE MERCER STIPULATION (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH CARMODY RE: SAME (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH EY RE: PAYMENT OF CURE AMOUNT ON EFFECTIVE DATE (0.4); CALL WITH EY AND C. LUSTER RE: CURE NOTICES (0.4).	1.10	1,182.50	014	60870782
SUBTOTAL TASK 014 - Executory Contracts/Leases/ (Non-Real Property Issues):		14.00	\$12,868.50		
01/04/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. WEEKLY TEAM WIP MEETING.	0.50	825.00	015	60851703
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora TEAM WIP CALL (.5); REVIEW UPDATED PLAN ADMINISTRATOR OUTLINE (.5); REVIEW INCOMING MAIL RE: PLANNING FOR EFFECTIVE DATE (.6).	1.60	1,840.00	015	60848558
01/04/21	Blechman, Eli TEAM CALL (WIP).	0.50	520.00	015	60959790
01/04/21	Luster, Courtney WEEKLY INTERNAL WEIL TEAM UPDATE CALL (.5).	0.50	447.50	015	60840192
01/04/21	Myers, Janiel ATTEND WIP MEETING WITH RESTRUCTURING TEAM (.5).	0.50	447.50	015	61023434
01/04/21	Berdini, Elissabeth REVIEW WIP LIST AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO J. ZHANG (0.2); RESTRUCTURING COMMITTEE TEAM WIP CALL (0.5).	0.70	539.00	015	60969563
01/04/21	Zhang, Jiaheng ATTEND WEEKLY WIP MEETING.	0.50	315.00	015	60841819
01/04/21	Martir, Martha	0.50	537.50	015	61100896

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	INTERNAL TEAM MEETING RE: THE STATUS OF VARIOUS WORKSTREAMS (0.5).				
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora	0.30	345.00	015	60863536
	CALLS (X2) WITH A. CITRON RE: PRE-EFFECTIVE DATE OPEN ITEMS (.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK 015 - General Case Strategy		5.60	\$5,816.50		
(Including Client/Team Calls):					
01/04/21	Berdini, Elissabeth	1.00	770.00	017	60972284
	ANALYZE TAX ISSUES ISSUES RELATED TO SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH EY AND OLD BRIGGS EMPLOYEES RE: SURRENDER OF SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. MARGOLIS RE: TAX ISSUES RELATED TO SPLIT DOLLAR POLICIES (0.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: PREPARE FORMS TO SURRENDER EXEC LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.3).				
01/04/21	Fliman, Ariel	0.10	107.50	017	60847986
	ANALYZE LITIGATION STAY INQUIRY ISSUES.				
01/06/21	Hoehne, Debora	0.10	115.00	017	61125659
	CALL WITH E. BERDINI RE: STATUS OF SURRENDER OF LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES AND CLAIMS PROCEDURES MOTION.				
01/06/21	Berdini, Elissabeth	0.20	154.00	017	60972081
	CALL WITH K. BUONO TO DISCUSS COMPLETION OF FORMS TO SURRENDER EXECUTIVE LIFE INSURANCE POLICIES (0.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. HOEHNE AND S. MARGOLIS RE: SAME (0.1).				
01/06/21	Fliman, Ariel	1.00	1,075.00	017	60870635
	ANALYZE INSURANCE RUNOFF ISSUES IN LIGHT OF EFFECTIVE DATE AND CORRESPOND WITH INSURANCE BROKER.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 017 - Insurance Issues:		2.40	\$2,221.50		
01/04/21	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	460.00	018	60848597

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVIEW LITIGATION ISSUE.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 018 - Non-Bankruptcy Litigation:		0.40	\$460.00		
01/04/21	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH DEBTORS' PROFESSIONALS RE: ESTIMATED FEES AND EXPENSES (FOR PROFESSIONAL FEE ESCROW ACCOUNT).	0.20	208.00	023	60959739
01/04/21	Zhang, Jiaheng FOLLOW UP WITH CBRE RE: FEE ESTIMATES.	0.30	189.00	023	60841793
01/05/21	Zhang, Jiaheng REVIEW BROWN RUDNICK'S DECEMBER MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT (1.2) AND DRAFT EMAIL TO K. BUONO SUMMARIZING THE SAME (.3).	1.50	945.00	023	60862843
01/06/21	Martir, Martha REVIEW KCC INVOICE (0.3); CORRESPOND WITH K. BUONO RE: SAME (0.1).	0.40	430.00	023	60870784
SUBTOTAL TASK 023 - Retention/Fee Applications: Retained Professionals non Weil:		2.40	\$1,772.00		
01/03/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW WEIL NOVEMBER INVOICE FOR PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY.	0.70	1,155.00	024	60834487
01/04/21	Berkovich, Ronit J. REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON WEIL NOVEMBER FEE STATEMENT.	1.10	1,815.00	024	60851663
01/04/21	Blechman, Eli CORRESPOND WITH J. ZHANG AND J. FRIEDMAN RE: FINAL FEE APPLICATION.	0.20	208.00	024	60959738
01/04/21	Zhang, Jiaheng	6.50	4,095.00	024	60841822

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 30180.0005 - Chapter 11

Date	Timekeeper/Narrative	Hours	Amount	Task	Index
	REVISE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION BASED ON R. BERKOVICH'S COMMENTS AND OTHER INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATIONS.				
01/05/21	Hoehne, Debora	0.40	460.00	024	60863414
	REVIEW SECOND INTERIM/FINAL FEE APPLICATION DRAFT.				
01/05/21	Zhang, Jiaheng	1.50	945.00	024	60862879
	REVISE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.				
01/05/21	Peene, Travis J.	1.70	467.50	024	60892829
	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION, AND SERVE WEIL'S FIFTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT (NOV 20).				
01/06/21	Zhang, Jiaheng	8.10	5,103.00	024	60869431
	REVIEW WEIL'S NOVEMBER INVOICE AND UPDATE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION.				
SUBTOTAL TASK 024 - Retention/Fee Applications:		20.20	\$14,248.50		
Weil:					
Total Fees Due		98.60	\$90,269.00		

Briggs & Stratton Corporation - Chapter 11
30180.0005
2021001235

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NAME</u> <u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>DISB TYPE</u>	<u>DISB ID#</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
01/11/21	Lee, Kathleen Anne AIR COURIER/EXPRESS MAIL PAYEE: FEDERAL EXPRESS (10793-03); INVOICE#: 721738176; DATE: 12/18/2020 - FEDEX INVOICE: 721738176 INVOICE DATE:201218TRACKING #: 781249146953 SHIPMENT DATE: 20201211 SENDER: KATHLEEN LEE WEIL GOTSHAL & MANGES, 767 FIFTH AVENUE, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153 SHIP TO: KATHLEEN LEE, WEIL, GOTSHAL & MANGES LLP, 767 5TH AVENUE, ROOM 2729P2, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10153	H071	40588675	16.46
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H071:				<u>\$16.46</u>
01/07/21	Paddock, Alyssa TRANSPORTATION - SUPPORT/OVERTIME PAYEE: ALY PADDOCK (F312); INVOICE#: CREX4412419601071328; DATE: 1/7/2021 - PADDOCK, 12-16, 20, CARS FOR HEARING- LOCAL TAXI, DEC 16, 2020 - CAR HOME FROM OFFICE AFTER HEARING	H164	40586539	36.75
01/07/21	Paddock, Alyssa TRANSPORTATION - SUPPORT/OVERTIME PAYEE: ALY PADDOCK (F312); INVOICE#: CREX4412419601071328; DATE: 1/7/2021 - PADDOCK, 12-16, 20, CARS FOR HEARING- LOCAL TAXI, DEC 16, 2020 - CAR TO OFFICE FOR A HEARING	H164	40586540	42.74
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H164:				<u>\$79.49</u>
01/06/21	Dicker, Howard B. FILING FEES PAYEE: BROADRIDGE ICS (44195-02); INVOICE#: BRHC10018086; DATE: 12/23/2020 - EDGAR FILING SERVICE - HTML CONVERSION & SEC SUBMISSION	H181	40584699	1,990.00
SUBTOTAL DISB TYPE H181:				<u>\$1,990.00</u>
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS				<u><u>\$2,085.95</u></u>