HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

Debtor.

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

In re:

Chapter 11

HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC., Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)

SUMMARY OF FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP AS COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR AND DEBTOR IN POSSESSION

Basic Information	
Name of Applicant:	Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Name of Client:	Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
	Debtor and Debtor in Possession
Petition Date:	June 30, 2024
Retention Date:	June 30, 2024
Date of Order Approving Employment:	September 9, 2024
This Interim Application	
Time Period Covered:	June 1, 2025 to August 31, 2025
Total Hours Billed:	1,876.2
Total Fees Requested:	\$1,986,868.00
Total Expenses Requested:	\$43,730.76
Fees Requested Over Budget:	None
Blended Rate:	\$1,058.99/hour
Rate Increases Not Previously	None
Approved/Disclosed:	
Total Professionals:	13



24324282510150000000000002

Total Professionals Not in Staffing Plan:	7
Total Professionals Billing Less Than 15	4
Hours:	
Historical	
Fees Approved to Date by Interim Order:	\$4,413,725.00
Expenses Approved to Date by Interim Order:	\$75,367.40
Allowed Fees Paid to Date:	\$4,413,725.00
Allowed Expenses Paid to Date:	\$75,367.40
Fees Paid Pursuant to Monthly Statements,	\$0.00
Not Yet Allowed:	
Expenses Paid Pursuant to Monthly	\$0.00
Statements, Not Yet Allowed:	

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002 Telephone: (713) 220-4200

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219 Telephone: (804) 788-8200

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

In re: Chapter 11

HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC., : Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)

:

Debtor.

:

FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP, COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR AND DEBTOR IN POSSESSION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2025

Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP ("<u>Hunton</u>"), counsel for Hopeman Brothers, Inc., as debtor and debtor in possession (the "<u>Debtor</u>"), submits this application (the "<u>Application</u>") for interim allowance of compensation for professional services rendered by Hunton to the Debtor for the period from June 1, 2025 through and including August 31, 2025 (the "<u>Fifth Interim Application Period</u>"), and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred by Hunton during the Fifth Interim Application Period pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "<u>Bankruptcy Code</u>"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "<u>Bankruptcy Rules</u>"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure

for the United States Bankruptcy Court of the Eastern District of Virginia (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), and the Order (I) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals and (II) Granting Related Relief entered on September 9, 2024 [Docket No. 162] (the "Interim Compensation Order"). In support of this Application, Hunton represents as follows:

I. JURISDICTION, VENUE AND PREDICATES FOR RELIEF

- 1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Virginia (the "Court") has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the *Standing Order* of Reference from the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Virginia, dated August 15, 1984. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157, and the Court may enter a final order consistent with Article III of the United States Constitution. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.
- 2. The bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-1.

II. BACKGROUND

- 3. On June 30, 2024 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code in this Court commencing this chapter 11 case.
- 4. The Debtor continues to manage its business as debtor in possession pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. No trustee, examiner, or statutory committee has been appointed in this chapter 11 case.
- 5. On July 22, 2024, the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Virginia (the "<u>U.S. Trustee</u>") appointed the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "<u>Committee</u>") [Docket No. 69].

- 6. On September 9, 2024, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Order, which approved the compensation procedures set forth therein (the "Compensation Procedures").
- 7. On September 9, 2024, the Court entered the *Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP as Counsel for the Debtor Effective as of the Petition Date* [Doc. No. 163], authorizing the Debtor to employ and retain Hunton as its counsel, effective as of the Petition Date.
- 8. Pursuant to the Compensation Procedures, professionals retained in this case are authorized to file monthly fee statements and serve such statements on the Notice Parties (as defined in the Compensation Procedures). Provided that no objection to a monthly fee statement is timely filed, the Debtor is authorized to pay such professional an amount equal to eighty percent (80%) of the fees and one-hundred percent (100%) of the expenses requested in such monthly fee statement.
- 9. Additionally, pursuant to the Compensation Procedures, beginning with the period ending on August 31, 2024, and at three-month intervals thereafter, professionals retained in this case are authorized to file interim fee applications with the Court. The Compensation Procedures provide that the fifth interim fee application should cover the period from June 1, 2025 through and including August 31, 2025.
- 10. The Compensation Procedures also provide that all Retained Professionals (as defined in the Compensation Procedures), to the extent applicable, shall make reasonable efforts to comply with the U.S. Trustee's requests for information and additional disclosures set forth in the *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases* (the "Appendix B Guidelines") in connection with the interim and final fee applications filed in this case.

III. RELIEF REQUESTED

- 11. Hunton submits this Application (a) for interim allowance of reasonable compensation for the actual, reasonable and necessary professional services that it has rendered as counsel for the Debtor in this case for the period from June 1, 2025, through and including August 31, 2025, and (b) for reimbursement of actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in representing the Debtor during that same period. For the period covered by this Application, Hunton seeks fees for services rendered in the amount of \$1,986,868.00. For the same period, Hunton seeks actual, reasonable and necessary expenses totaling \$43,730.76.
- 12. The Application is supported by the following Exhibits, which are attached hereto and patterned on the Appendix B Guidelines:
 - (i) Exhibit A contains a summary schedule of the time expended by all Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals engaged in the representation of the Debtor during the Fifth Interim Application Period.
 - (ii) Exhibit B contains a summary schedule of hours and fees covered by this Application, categorized by project code.
 - (iii) Exhibit C contains a summary schedule of the out-of-pocket expenses incurred by Hunton during the Fifth Interim Application Period.
 - (iv) Exhibit D contains a disclosure of "customary and comparable compensation" charged by Hunton's professionals and paraprofessionals. As requested in the Appendix B Guidelines, Exhibit D provides a summary of the blended hourly rates of the timekeepers (segregated by rank) included in this Application compared to the blended hourly rates for similar non-bankruptcy domestic timekeepers at Hunton.
 - (v) Exhibit E contains the budget and staffing plans for Hunton for this chapter 11 case during the Fifth Interim Application Period.
 - (vi) Exhibit F contains the monthly fee statements properly served by Hunton during the Fifth Interim Application Period (the "Monthly Statement").

IV. BASIS FOR RELIEF REQUESTED

13. During the Fifth Interim Application Period, Hunton provided numerous services to the Debtor, including but not limited to (i) drafting pleadings for the Debtor, including the Debtor's¹ (a) modified amended 524(g) plan of reorganization (the "Plan") [Docket No. 1141] and plan supplements [Docket Nos. 853 and 1143], (b) omnibus objection to motions to adjourn the hearing for the Court to consider confirming the Plan (the "Confirmation Hearing") [Docket No. 905], (c) memorandum of law in support of final approval of the Debtor's disclosure statement and confirmation of the Plan and omnibus reply to Plan objections [Docket No. 1076], (d) supplemental memorandum of law regarding the liquidation analysis, the best interests test under section 1129(a)(7) of the Bankruptcy Code, and the Scarcella Report [Docket No. 1119], (e) declarations in support of confirmation of the Plan [Docket Nos. 1115, 1116, and 1122], (f) proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law regarding confirmation of the Plan and approving adequacy of the disclosure statement, proposed order confirming the Plan, and proposed order recommending entry of the proposed findings and conclusions and confirmation order [Docket No. 1120], (g) motion in limine to exclude the expert testimony of Mr. Marc Scarcella at the Confirmation Hearing (the "Motion in Limine") [Docket No. 1089], and the reply in support of the Motion in Limine [Docket No. 1136], (h) reply in support of the Debtor's objection to Liberty Mutual Insurance Company's ("LMIC") claim [Docket No. 878], (i) objection to LMIC's motion for entry of an order temporarily allowing its claim [Docket No. 921], and (j) motion seeking authority to disburse settlement funds in connection with the Debtor's settlement agreement with the Certain Settling Insurers to pay approved interim fees and expenses (the "Settlement Funds

¹ Certain of the pleadings referenced in ¶ 13(i) were submitted jointly by the Debtor and the Committee as the "Plan Proponents."

<u>Disbursement Motion</u>") [Docket No. 1088]; (ii) working to obtain the entry of the: (a) order authorizing disbursement of funds pertaining to the Debtor's Settlement Funds Disbursement Motion [Docket No. 1135], (b) third order extending the Debtor's exclusivity periods [Docket No. 1129], (c) order granting the Debtor's Motion in Limine [Docket No. 1147], (d) fourth interim order extending the automatic stay to asbestos-related actions against non-Debtor defendants [Docket No. 900], (e) orders disallowing and expunging LMIC's and Zurich's proofs of claim [Docket Nos. 907 and 1007], (f) orders disallowing numerous proofs of claim filed improperly by asbestos claimants [Docket Nos. 1001, 1003, 1007, 1011, 1013, 1015, 1017, and 1036], and (g) other orders necessary for the Debtor to administer this chapter 11 case; (iii) preparing for and participating in depositions, and conducting extensive document review, document production, and drafting responses, each in connection with discovery requests from the Chubb Insurers, LMIC and various other interested parties related to Plan confirmation; (iv) preparing for and participating in each hearing – including the two-day Confirmation Hearing conducted on August 25 and 26, 2025; (v) addressing the Chubb Insurer's appeal of the Court's order appointing the future claimants' representative; (vi) addressing LMIC's appeal of the Court's order disallowing and expunging its proof of claim; (vii) participating in conferences with the Debtor and the Debtor's other professionals regarding items including, but not limited to, administrative, organizational, strategic, and contested issues arising in this case; (viii) communicating regularly with the Committee's professionals regarding items including case strategy and timeline, pending motions of the Debtor's, and various other substantive issues related to the status and administration of this case, including the Plan and corresponding disclosure statement; (ix) communicating with creditors, other parties in interest, and their professionals, as applicable, regarding this case; (x) assisting in the day-to-day administration of this case for the Debtor; and

- (xi) regularly communicating with the Clerk's office, Chambers, and the U.S. Trustee's office regarding various case administration issues.
- 14. In performing the services detailed in this Application, Hunton has endeavored to ensure that its professionals comply with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and any other applicable procedures or orders of the Court.
- 15. Pursuant to the terms of the Interim Compensation Order, Hunton properly filed and served three Monthly Statements during the Fifth Interim Application Period as follows:

Period Covered by	Total Fees	Total Expenses	Date Served	Objection Deadline	Amount of Fees	Amount of
Monthly		Lapenses	and	Deadine	Received	Expenses
Statement			Docket		(80%)	Received
			No.			(100%)
June 1, 2025 –	\$670,881.00	\$8,165.03	8/8/2025	8/22/2025	\$0.00	\$0.00
June 30, 2025			[Docket			
			No. 1091]			
July 1, 2025 –	\$686,051.00	\$25,309.11	9/17/2025	10/1/2025	\$0.00	\$0.00
July 31, 2025			[Docket			
			No. 1201]			
Aug. 1, 2025	\$629,936.00	\$10,256.62	10/13/2025	10/27/2025	\$0.00	\$0.00
– Aug. 31,			[Docket			
2025			No. 1228]			

16. In accordance with the Compensation Procedures, as set forth in the Interim Compensation Order, and as set forth in Local Rule 2016-1, the Monthly Statements included (i) a detailed itemization of the service hours expended by matter and professional and (ii) a summary schedule of hours and fees categorized by project code. The Monthly Statements also included a detailed chronological itemization of the services rendered by each professional and paraprofessional, calculated by tenths of an hour and categorized in accordance with the appropriate project code. As set forth above, a copy of Hunton's Monthly Statements are attached hereto as Exhibit F.

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1234 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 14:15:43 Desc Main Page 10 of 207 Document

17. Hunton has endeavored to represent the Debtor in the most expeditious and

economical manner possible. Tasks have been assigned to attorneys and paralegals at Hunton so

that the work has been performed by those most familiar with the particular matter or task and,

where attorney involvement was required, by the lowest hourly rate professional appropriate for a

particular matter. Moreover, Hunton has endeavored to coordinate with the other professionals

involved in this case so as to minimize any duplication of effort and to minimize attorneys' fees

and expenses to the Debtor. Hunton believes it has been successful in this regard.

No agreement or understanding exists between Hunton and any other person for the 18.

sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with

this case.

V. STATEMENT PURSUANT TO APPENDIX B GUIDELINES

19. The following is provided in response to the questions set forth in ¶ C.5 of the

Appendix B Guidelines:

Question: Did you agree to any variations from, or alternatives to, your standard or customary billing rates, fees or terms for services pertaining to this engagement

that were provided during the application period? If so, please explain.

Response: No.

Question: If the fees sought in this fee application as compared to the fees budgeted for the time period covered by this fee application are higher by 10% or more, did you

discuss the reasons for the variation with the client?

Response: Not applicable.

Question: Have any of the professionals included in this fee application varied their hourly

rate based on the geographic location of the bankruptcy case?

Response: No.

Question: Does this fee application include time or fees related to reviewing the time records or preparing, reviewing, or revising invoices? (This is limited to work involved in preparing and editing billing records that would not be compensable

outside of bankruptcy and does not include reasonable fees for preparing a fee

8

application.). If so, please quantify by hours and fees.

Response: This Application includes approximately \$11,748.00 in fees (13.8 hours) relating to preparing, reviewing, or revising Monthly Statements. These fees are reflected in Task Code 160 time entries. Hunton submits that all such fees are reasonable and necessary for preparing the Monthly Statements.

Question: Does this fee application include time or fees for reviewing time records to redact any privileged or other confidential information? If so, please quantify by hours and fees.

Response: As set forth above, this Application includes approximately \$11,748.00 in fees (13.8 hours) relating to preparing, reviewing, or revising Monthly Statements. In the course of such efforts, Hunton reviewed and edited various entries to avoid publicly disclosing any privileged or confidential information. Hunton submits that such review and edits are a reasonable and necessary part of Hunton's preparation of the Monthly Statements.

Question: If the fee application includes any rate increases since retention: (i) Did your client review and approve those rate increases in advance? (ii) Did your client agree when retaining the law firm to accept all future rate increases? If not, did you inform your client that they need not agree to modified rates or terms in order to have you continue the representation, consistent with ABA Formal Ethics Opinion 11-458?

Response: Yes. As disclosed in the Brown Declaration, the Debtor agreed to retain Hunton in accordance with its standard terms and conditions which, among other things, provide that the billing rates are subject to periodic adjustments. In accordance with Hunton's established billing practices and procedures and, following the Debtor's review and approval, certain of Hunton's billing rates for this engagement were increased effective as of January 1, 2025.

VI. Notice

20. Notice of this Application has been provided in accordance with the terms of the Interim Compensation Order. Hunton submits that no other or further notice need be provided.

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank]

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1234 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 14:15:43 Desc Main Document Page 12 of 207

WHEREFORE, Hunton respectfully requests that this Court enter an Order, substantially in the form attached hereto (i) approving this Application, (ii) providing that Hunton be allowed on an interim basis the sum of \$1,986,868.00, as compensation for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered to the Debtor and the sum of \$43,730.76 for reimbursement of actual and necessary costs and expenses, (iii) authorizing and directing the Debtor to pay Hunton the outstanding amount of such sums, and (iv) for such other relief as the Court deems proper and just.

Dated: October 15, 2025 Richmond, Virginia

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072)

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Riverfront Plaza, East Tower

951 East Byrd Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Facsimile: (804) 788-8218

tpbrown@HuntonAK.com hlong@HuntonAK.com

- and -

Email:

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted pro hac vice)

Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

600 Travis Street, Suite 4200

Houston, TX 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200

Facsimile: (713) 220-4285

Email: josephrovira@HuntonAK.com

crankin@HuntonAK.com

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219 Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

	•	
In re:	:	Chapter 11

HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC., : Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)

:

Debtor.

:

ORDER GRANTING FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP, COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR AND DEBTOR IN POSSESSION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2025

Upon consideration of the Fifth Interim Fee Application (the "Application")¹ of Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP ("Hunton"), counsel for Hopeman Brothers, Inc., as debtor and debtor in possession (the "Debtor"), for the period from June 1, 2025, through and including August 31, 2025 (the "Fifth Interim Application Period"); and the Court having reviewed the Application and the Monthly Statements that were served by Hunton during the Fifth Interim Application Period, and finding that the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334,

Capitalized terms not defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Application.

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1234 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 14:15:43 Desc Main Document Page 14 of 207

and determining that proper and adequate notice has been given and that no other or further notice

is necessary; and after due deliberation thereon; and good and sufficient cause appearing therefore,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that:

1. The Application is GRANTED.

2. Hunton is allowed interim compensation in the amount of \$1,986,868.00 and

reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$43,730.76 for the Fifth Interim Application Period

as requested in the Application.

3. The Debtor is authorized and directed to disburse to Hunton payment in the amount

of the difference between the allowed amounts and the actual monthly payments previously

received by Hunton for fees and expenses incurred during the Fifth Interim Application Period.

4. The Debtor is authorized and empowered to take such actions as may be necessary

and appropriate to implement the terms of this Order.

5. This Court shall retain jurisdiction with respect to all matters relating to the

interpretation or implementation of this Order.

6. This Order shall be effective immediately upon entry.

Dated:	, 2025	
		UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

WE ASK FOR THIS:

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072)

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Riverfront Plaza, East Tower

951 East Byrd Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone: (804) 788-8200 Facsimile: (804) 788-8218

Email: tpbrown@HuntonAK.com

hlong@HuntonAK.com

- and -

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted pro hac vice)

Catherine A. Rankin (admitted pro hac vice)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

600 Travis Street, Suite 4200

Houston, TX 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200 Facsimile: (713) 220-4285

Email: josephrovira@HuntonAK.com

crankin@HuntonAK.com

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

CERTIFICATION OF ENDORSEMENT UNDER LOCAL BANKRUPTCY RULE 9022-1(C)

I hereby certify that the foregoing proposed order has been endorsed by or served upon all necessary parties.

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1234 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 14:15:43 Desc Main Document Page 16 of 207

Exhibit A

PROFESSIONALS RENDERING SERVICES

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

Name of Professional	Position	Department	First Bar Admission Date	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation	Rate Increases Since the Petition Date
T. P. Brown	Partner	1987	Bankruptcy	\$1,485	537.4	\$798,039.00	1
J. W. Harbour	Partner	2001	Bankruptcy	\$1,325	1.4	\$2,002.00	None
J. P. Rovira	Partner	2008	Bankruptcy	\$1,100	194.5	\$213,950.00	1
J. P. Rovira – Travel Rate	Partner	2011	Bankruptcy	\$550	11.0	\$6,050.00	N/A
H. P. Long III	Counsel	2007	Bankruptcy	\$1,025	567	\$581,175.00	1
P. M. Guffy	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy	\$995	15.0	\$14,925.00	1
C. A. Rankin	Associate	2018	Bankruptcy	\$895	52.7	\$47,166.50	1
B. R. Bell	Associate	2021	Bankruptcy	\$795	216.8	\$172,356.00	1
N. S. Monico	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$695	94.4	\$65,608.00	None
K. T. Bailey	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$690	9.5	\$6,555.00	1
R. Rubin	Associate	2025	Bankruptcy	\$695	23.9	\$16,610.50	None
T. L. Canada	Paralegal	N/A	Bankruptcy	\$410	148.7	\$60,967.00	1
D. K. Drake	Paralegal	N/A	Litigation	\$410	1.2	\$492.00	None
N. R. Moosni	Case Clerk	N/A	Litigation	\$360	2.7	\$972.00	None
			•	Total:	1,876.2	\$1,986,868.00	
Blended Rate: \$1,058.99				ended Rate:	\$1	1,058.99	

Exhibit B

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

Project Code	Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
B110	Case Administration	27.8	\$17,796.00
B130	Asset Disposition	3.7	\$5,494.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	0.7	\$855.50
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	63.3	\$43,856.50
B170	Fee / Employment Objections	28.7	\$29,850.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	497.9	\$481,494.50
B195	Non-Working Travel	11.0	\$6,050.00
B210	Business Operations	20.0	\$21,915.50
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	24.4	\$20,270.50
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	1,198.7	\$1,359,285.00
	Total:	1,876.2	\$1,968,868.00

Exhibit C

EXPENSE SUMMARY

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Unit Cost (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Online Research	(Pacer Service Fees from 04/02/2025 to 06/30/2025)		\$150.80
Online Research	Westlaw and Lexis		\$5,320.41
Copying			\$1,795.60
Local Travel			\$154.00
Out of Town Travel			\$1,348.92
Meals			\$144.90
Deposition Transcripts			\$10,667.23
Trial Transcripts			\$3,184.60
Litigation Support Vendors	Cognicion		\$20,964.30
		Total:	\$43,730.76

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1234 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 14:15:43 Desc Main Document Page 22 of 207

Exhibit D

CUSTOMARY AND COMPARABLE COMPENSATION DISCLOSURES

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

	Blended Hou	irly Rate ¹
Category of Timekeeper	Billed (Firm for preceding year, excluding the Bankruptcy, Restructuring and Creditors' Rights group)	Billed (This Application)
All Partners (Equity Partner)	\$1,024.27	\$1,370.47
Counsel	\$858.89	\$1,025.00
Sr. Associate (7+ years since first admission)	\$729.33	\$995.00
Associate (4-6 years since first admission)	\$639.27	\$814.55
Jr. Associate (1-3 years since first admission)	\$589.51	\$694.63
Paralegal	\$375.96	\$410.00
Case Clerk	\$280.21	\$360.00
Aggregated (Blended Rates):	\$797.03	\$1,058.99

In addition, as requested by \P C.3 of the Appendix B Guidelines, the blended hourly rates identified in <u>Exhibit D</u> for non-bankruptcy domestic timekeepers at Hunton includes discounted or alternative engagements, other than pro bono engagements and engagements for clients who are employees or charitable organizations that are billed at materially discounted rates.

Consistent with ¶ C.3 of the Appendix B Guidelines, the blended hourly rates set forth in <u>Exhibit D</u> are calculated by dividing the dollar value of hours billed by the number of hours billed for the relevant timekeepers during the applicable time period. <u>Exhibit D</u> also segregates the timekeepers by rank using the categories set forth in <u>Exhibit A</u> to the Appendix B Guidelines. The data for the "preceding year" is based on information from Hunton's last completed calendar year ending December 31, 2024.

Exhibit E

BUDGET HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

Period	Estimated Fees
June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025	\$1,900,000

STAFFING PLAN HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

(June 1, 2025 – August 31, 2025)

Category of Timekeeper (as maintained by the firm)	Number of Timekeepers Expected to Work on the Matter During the Budgeted Period	Average Hourly Rate
Partners	2	\$1,175.00
Counsel	1	\$930.00
Associates	2	\$697.50
Paralegal	1	\$390.00

Exhibit F

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002 Telephone: (713) 220-4200

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219 Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

In re:	: : Chapter 11
HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC.,	: Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)
Debtor.	: :
	:

ELEVENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF
HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP AS BANKRUPTCY COUNSEL
FOR THE DEBTOR FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES
RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD
FROM JUNE 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2025

Name of Applicant:	Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Name of Client:	Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Debtor and Debtor in Possession
Date of retention order entered:	September 9, 2024, effective as of June 30, 2024 [Docket No. 163]
Time Period Covered:	June 1, 2025 through June 30, 2025
Total Fees Requested:	\$536,704.80 (80% of \$670,881.00)
Total Expenses Requested:	\$8,165.03
Type of Fee Statement:	Monthly ¹

Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement shall be served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order (as defined herein) and objections to payment of the amounts described in this Monthly Fee Statement shall be addressed in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

Pursuant to sections 330, and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedures of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Virginia (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), and the Order (I) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals and (II) Granting Related Relief entered September 9, 2024 [Docket No. 162] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP ("Hunton"), counsel for Hopeman Brothers, Inc., as debtor and debtor in possession (the "Debtor"), hereby submits this monthly fee statement (the "Monthly Fee Statement") for the allowance of compensation for the reasonable and necessary legal services rendered by Hunton for the period from June 1, 2025 through and including June 30, 2025 (the "Fee Period") and reimbursement of the actual and necessary expenses that Hunton incurred during the Fee Period. By this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton seeks allowance of compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$670,881.00 and payment in the amount of \$536,704.80 (which equals 80% of the compensation sought herein). Hunton also seeks allowance and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$8,165.03.

<u>Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred</u>

- 1. In support of this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton has attached the following:
 - Exhibit A is a summary schedule of hours and fees covered by this Monthly Fee Statement, categorized by project code.
 - <u>Exhibit B</u> is a summary schedule of the time expended by all Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals engaged in the representation of the Debtor during the Fee Period.
 - <u>Exhibit C</u> is a summary of the expenses incurred by Hunton during the Fee Period.
 - Exhibit D is a detailed invoice for the hours expended and fees incurred by Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period.

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 08/08/25 Entered 08/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 29 of 807

Representations

2. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred in the Fee Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Monthly Fee Statement due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Hunton reserves the right to make further application to this Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee statements and applications will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, and Interim Compensation Order.

Notice

3. Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been provided to all necessary parties in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, Hunton respectfully requests payment of its reasonable and necessary fees and expenses incurred during the Fee Period in the total amount of \$544,869.83, consisting of (i) \$536,704.80, which is 80% of the fees incurred by the Debtor for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by Hunton during the Fee Period, and (ii) \$8,165.03 for actual and necessary costs and expenses.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

Dated: August 8, 2025 Richmond, Virginia

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072)

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Riverfront Plaza, East Tower

951 East Byrd Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone: (804) 788-8200 Facsimile: (804) 788-8218

Email: tpbrown@HuntonAK.com

hlong@HuntonAK.com

- and -

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

600 Travis Street, Suite 4200

Houston, TX 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200 Facsimile: (713) 220-4285

Email: josephrovira@HuntonAK.com

crankin@HuntonAK.com

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

EXHIBIT A Statement of Fees by Subject Matter during the Fee Period

Matter Code	Matter Description	Hours	Fees Requested
B110	Case Administration	12.4	\$7,651.50
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	3.8	\$3,923.50
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	358.0	\$340,806.00
B210	Business Operations	1.9	\$2,070.00
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	11.1	\$12,523.50
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	262.9	\$303,906.50
	Total	650.1	\$670,881.00

EXHIBIT B

Professionals Rendering Services during the Fee Period

The Hunton attorneys who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee Period include:

Professional	Position	Year Admitted	Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. P. Brown	Partner	1987	Bankruptcy	\$1,485	169.3	\$251,410.50
J. W. Harbour	Partner	2001	Bankruptcy	\$1,430	0.6	\$858.00
J. P. Rovira	Partner	2008	Bankruptcy	\$1,100	29.6	\$32,560.00
H. P. Long III	Counsel	2007	Bankruptcy	\$1,025	225.6	\$231,240.00
P. M. Guffy	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy	\$995	15.0	\$14,925.00
C. A. Rankin	Associate	2018	Bankruptcy	\$895	31.1	\$27,834.50
B. R. Bell	Associate	2021	Bankruptcy	\$795	45.8	\$36,411.00
N. S. Monico	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$695	57.5	\$39,962.50
K. T. Bailey	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$690	9.5	\$6,555.00
R. Rubin	Associate	2025	Bankruptcy	\$695	7.1	\$4,934.50
Totals			591.1	\$646,691.00		

Hunton paraprofessionals who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee

Period include:

Paraprofessional	Position	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. L. Canada	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	\$410	59.0	\$24,190.00
			Totals	59.0	\$24,190.00

EXHIBIT C Summary of Expenses Incurred during the Fee Period

Туре	Expenses
Online Research	\$2,548.18
Local Travel	\$30.00
Trial Transcripts	\$328.70
Litigation Support Vendors	\$5,258.15
T	OTAL EXPENSES: \$8,165.03

EXHIBIT D

Detailed Invoice of Fees and Expenses Incurred During the Fee Period



HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE:

040312.0000007 131826843 07/31/2025

CLIENT NAME:

Hopeman Brothers, Inc.

BILLING ATTORNEY:

TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending June 30, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

 Current Fees:
 \$ 670,881.00

 Current Charges:
 8,165.03

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 679,046.03

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131826843, Date:07/31/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP Routing Number: 021052053

Account Number: 72561654

To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N



HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY-REMITTANCE PAGE

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE: 040312.0000007 131826843 07/31/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending June 30, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

 Current Fees:
 \$ 670,881.00

 Current Charges:
 8,165.03

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 679,046.03

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131826843, Date:07/31/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Routing Number: 021052053 Account Number: 72561654 To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N

HUNTON

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE DETAIL

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE: 040312.0000007 131826843 07/31/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2025:									
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE				
06/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificates of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.40	410.00				
06/03/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service for doc. nos. 749, 751, 765, 768, 769, 783, 786, 787, 788, and AP 20	0.50	205.00				
06/05/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file Affidavit of Publication of the Notice of Combined Hearing for Approval of Disclosure Statement and Confirmation of Plan	0.10	41.00				
06/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificates of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00				
06/09/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service for doc. nos. 798, 799, 800, 801, 802, 803, 804, 805, 806, 807, 808, 809, 810, 811, 812, 813, 814	0.30	123.00				
06/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00				

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 382 off 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothe FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 2
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/10/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service for doc. nos. 839, 849	0.20	82.00
06/11/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Analysis of docket and work on Proposed Agenda for June 18th omnibus hearing	1.70	697.00
06/11/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service of doc. no. 853	0.10	41.00
06/11/2025 HPLONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
06/12/2025 H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze and comment on agenda for June 18 hearing	1.10	1,127.50
06/12/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Continue work on Proposed Agenda for June 18th omnibus hearing	1.20	492.00
06/16/2025 T P BROWN	B110	Review and revise agenda for 6/18 hearing	0.10	148.50
06/16/2025 H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze and work on agenda for June 18 hearing	0.60	615.00
06/16/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Work on Proposed Agenda for June 18th hearing	0.40	164.00
06/17/2025 HPLONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding the same	0.20	205.00
06/17/2025 H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze and finalize agenda for June 18 hearing	0.60	615.00
06/17/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Finalize Proposed Agenda for June 18th Hearing and electronically file same	0.30	123.00
06/18/2025 HPLONG, III	B110	Analyze certificates of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
06/18/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service on doc. nos. 876, 878, 879, 880, and AP doc. no. 23	0.30	123.00
06/23/2025 T L CANADA	B110	Communications with Clerk regarding electronic device permission form for June 24th hearing	0.20	82.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 329 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 3
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/24/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Prepare hearing materials for June 24th hearing	2.60	1,066.00
06/24/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service for doc. nos. 866, 867	0.10	41.00
06/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificates of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.30	307.50
06/26/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service for doc. nos. 886, 900, 905, 907, 910, 921	0.30	123.00
			TOTAL B110	12.40	
06/02/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Communication with UST regarding Blank Rome February 2025 LEDES file	0.10	41.00
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review supplemental filings by FCR's counsel	0.10	148.50
06/05/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with committee counsel re Courington firm notice to be filed	0.10	148.50
06/05/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Revise proposed notice and related conference with T.Long re UST and court calls on same	0.20	297.00
06/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B160	Finalize notice of withdrawal for Courington (.30), and communications with K. Courington regarding the same (.30)	0.60	615.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Email with C.Rankin and emails with T.Long re fee app period	0.10	148.50
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Telephone call with K.Courington and emails with K.Courington and T.Long re withdrawing as counsel.	0.30	445.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with C.Rankin re Kutak fee app hearing and interim period	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 40/40ff2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		•		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 4
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/12/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Emails with T. Brown regarding Kutak First Interim Fee Application (.1); review Kutak First Interim Fee Application and notice of filing same (.5) and emails with P. Barrett regarding same (.1).	0.70	626.50
06/16/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze upcoming filing deadline for debtors' professionals' next interim fee applications and considerations regarding preparing and filing same (.3) and draft email to J. Rovira regarding same (.1).	0.40	358.00
06/17/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze email from UST's office regarding request for Stout's LEDES files and communications with T. Canada and M. McMahon at UST's office regarding same (.4) and draft email summarizing discussion regarding same to M. McMahon (.1).	0.50	447.50
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Communications with C. Rankin and M. McMahon of the UST office regarding LEDES files	0.20	82.00
06/18/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Email T. Brown and T. Long regarding considerations in preparing next fee application (.1); emails with T. Canada, Blank Rome, CKSMM, and Stout regarding timing for next interim fee application (.2).	0.30	268.50
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with C.Rankin re interim fee app	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B160	3.80	
06/01/2025	K T BAILEY	B190	Perform document review related to Liberty discovery requests.	6.00	4,140.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 415 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 5
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/01/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Conduct document review regarding Liberty discovery request (1.8) and address open items and questions regarding same (.3).	2.10	1,879.50
06/01/2025	R RUBIN	B190	Review documents for request for production from Liberty Mutual, marking privilege and areas for redaction	2.30	1,598.50
06/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on second level review of documents responsive to Chubb requests	0.80	820.00
06/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze documents potentially responsive to Liberty's document requests	4.40	4,510.00
06/01/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Document review regarding Chubb production request	0.70	486.50
06/01/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on responses and objections to LMIC discovery requests and related email to T.Long	0.80	1,188.00
06/02/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Chubb and Liberty production	0.50	205.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review motion in AP of LMIC and consider applicable rules and strategy for responding	0.60	891.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conferences with T.Long re discovery responses and objections to LMIC requests	0.40	594.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re document review for Chubb's discovery requests	0.30	445.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on open items list for pending litigation	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 426 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 6
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/02/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Continue to analyze documents for Liberty document review regarding discovery request (6.6) and address open items and questions regarding same (.2) and conference with T. Long regarding status of same (.1).	6.90	6,175.50
06/02/2025	K T BAILEY	B190	Perform document review related to Liberty discovery requests.	3.50	2,415.00
06/02/2025	R RUBIN	B190	Review documents for request for production from Liberty Mutual, marking privilege and areas for redaction	4.80	3,336.00
06/02/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Document review regarding Liberty production request	5.00	3,475.00
06/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on second level review of documents potentially responsive to Chubb discovery	5.60	5,740.00
06/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on responses to LMIC interrogatories	1.30	1,332.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review SCS sample files related to Chubb requests and related emails with L.Smith	0.60	891.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re open items to be addressed in discovery, appeal and LMIC complaint	0.50	742.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Research re abstention motions in EDVA	0.80	1,188.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider extension motion for 3rd interim order extending stay and related strategy	0.50	742.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider counter- designations for Chubb appeal of FCR order	0.20	297.00
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on response to Chubb discovery issues and related email	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 437 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	Brothers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 7
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on stipulations of fact and related emails and call with C.Lascell re same	0.70	1,039.50
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on strategy in response to LMIC complaint and motion	1.80	2,673.00
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on LMIC discovery responses and objections and review related emails with C.Lascell	0.60	891.00
06/03/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Conduct document review regarding Liberty's discovery request (5.1) and address open items regarding same (.3).	5.40	4,833.00
06/03/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on production of documents for Chubb 2004 response	1.50	615.00
06/03/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Chubb and Liberty production	0.50	205.00
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Work on second level review of documents responsive to Liberty's requests	2.30	2,357.50
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Finalize and serve interrogatory responses on Liberty	0.60	615.00
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze issues and strategy related to Liberty adversary proceeding	1.10	1,127.50
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on privilege review for Chubb discovery	3.70	3,792.50
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from Chubb counsel regarding discovery and prepare and send email response to same	0.70	717.50
06/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Research on abstention and motion to dismiss and review related precedents from T.Long	2.20	3,267.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 44/8 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 8
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/04/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on Designation of Appellee of Additional Items to be Included in the Record on Appeal	0.40	164.00
06/04/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze posture of appeal of FCR Order (.4); prepare motion to dismiss the same (3.1)	3.50	2,432.50
06/04/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Chubb and Liberty production	0.80	328.00
06/04/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Analysis of documents marked privileged to redact privileged information for Chubb 2004 production	5.80	2,378.00
06/04/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Second round document review regarding Liberty production request	5.60	3,892.00
06/04/2025	J W HARBOUR	B190	Analysis of issues concerning adversary proceeding and motion to withdraw and communications with counsel	0.20	286.00
06/04/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Continue to conduct document review in response to Liberty's discovery request.	3.40	3,043.00
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Draft counter-designation of record on appeal of FCR order by Chubb insurers	0.30	445.50
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conferences with T.Long re objection to notice improperly filed by LMIC	0.20	297.00
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on motion to extend third interim stay extension order	0.40	594.00
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Call with C.Lascell re stipulations of fact and re 2003 trust account	0.50	742.50
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy re settlement of informal objection	0.20	297.00
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Research re withdrawal of reference issues	1.30	1,930.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 459 off 2007

HUNTON ANDF CLIENT NAME: FILE NUMBER:	REWS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers 040312.0000007	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 9
DATE TI	MEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Review samples from C.Lascell re 2003 trust documents and emails with C.Lascell re same	0.20	297.00
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Draft email to LMIC re service issues and related conference with T.Long	0.10	148.50
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Conference with J.Harbour re service issues for complaint and response strategy	0.20	297.00
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Revise proposed stipulations of fact and email to LMIC counsel re same	0.60	891.00
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Email to committee counsel re service issues	0.10	148.50
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Work on discovery responses to review additional requests to committee and debtor from Chubb	0.60	891.00
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Review revisions to motion to extend stay	0.10	148.50
06/04/2025 T	P BROWN	B190	Work on outline for June 18 hearings	0.70	1,039.50
06/04/2025 H	P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee counsel and counsel to FCR to discuss issues related to discovery served by insurers	0.60	615.00
06/04/2025 H	P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and prepare fourth motion for interim stay order	1.80	1,845.00
06/04/2025 H	P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on strategy in connection with Liberty adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50
06/04/2025 H	P LONG, III	B190	Analyze new interrogatories served by Chubb	0.60	615.00
06/04/2025 H	P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on stipulation of facts to resolve objections to Liberty discovery	0.80	820.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 420 off 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothe FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 10
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/04/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on second level review of documents responsive to Liberty requests	3.40	3,485.00
06/05/2025 N S MONICO	B190	Consider how to handle Liberty declaratory judgment action with T.Brown	0.50	347.50
06/05/2025 N S MONICO	B190	Determine time for making cross designations regarding Chubb appeal of FCR order	0.30	208.50
06/05/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Chubb and Liberty production and prepare Chubb Responsive, Non-privilege documents for Production	3.10	1,271.00
06/05/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Analysis of documents marked privilege to redact privileged information for Chubb 2004 production	4.40	1,804.00
06/05/2025 C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze Travelers' interrogatories and discovery request.	0.80	716.00
06/05/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy re response to motion to withdraw the reference in LMIC AP and related research	2.30	3,415.50
06/05/2025 TPBROWN	B190	Telephone call with Olivia Greenberg for Mark Mintz re settling informal objections	0.20	297.00
06/05/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize responses to Liberty's discovery requests (.80), and prepare and send email to Liberty counsel with discovery response and making production of documents (.40)	1.20	1,230.00
06/05/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Prepare and send email to Chubb counsel with discovery response and making production of documents	0.40	410.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 42/1 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	ΛE:	WS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers 040312.0000007	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 11
DATE	TIME	KEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/05/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on production of documents to Chubb	2.20	2,255.00
06/05/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Complete 2nd level and privilege review of documents responsive to Liberty's requests	4.90	5,022.50
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review discovery requests from Travelers	0.20	297.00
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review responses to LMIC discovery requests and related conferences with T.Long	0.40	594.00
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Emails with LMIC counsel and committee counsel re service issues and withdrawal motion and response date and strategy re same	0.80	1,188.00
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Conferences with N.Monico and emails re same on background and strategy re LMIC complaint and response strategy	0.50	742.50
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Prepare for 6/18 hearing and gather related pleadings and consider responses and filing replies	0.80	1,188.00
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Work on motion to dismiss strategy on LMIC complaint	0.70	1,039.50
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Work on response strategy for motion to withdraw the reference and review related unredacted complaint and motion and revise LMIC claim	1.40	2,079.00
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Telephone call with M.Mueller re service issue on LMIC complaint	0.10	148.50
06/05/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review Chubb counsel's email re discovery status and related conference with T.Long re same	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 482 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 12
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/06/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Research precedents regarding time for filing a motion to dismiss a bankruptcy appeal regarding Chubb appeal of FCR order	0.90	625.50
06/06/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Address privilege redaction issues regarding Liberty/Chubb doc reviews	0.30	208.50
06/06/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Analysis of documents marked privilege to redact privileged information for Chubb 2004 and Liberty productions	6.50	2,665.00
06/06/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Chubb and Liberty production and prepare Chubb Responsive, privileged documents for Production	1.50	615.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with N.Monico and T.Long re additional designations of record on appeal	0.10	148.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with N.Monico re strategy on FCR appeal and related emails with N.Monico	0.30	445.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on debtor discovery requests and related conference with T.Long	0.40	594.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review draft privilege log and related emails with T.Long	0.30	445.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on response to motion to withdraw the reference of LMIC	0.60	891.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on responses to additional discovery requests from LMIC and review related drafts and emails from T.Long	0.70	1,039.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on email response to Chubb discovery disputes	0.20	297.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on strategy for motion to dismiss appeal	0.50	742.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 428 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 13
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review emails to and from T.Long and Chubb on additional document production and privilege log	0.20	297.00
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare and serve discovery requests on Chubb	0.70	717.50
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare and serve discovery requests on Liberty	0.80	820.00
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare and serve discovery requests on Travelers	0.70	717.50
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Travelers' discovery requests	0.60	615.00
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from P. Santelle regarding privileged documents	0.40	410.00
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from L. Davis regarding discovery responses	0.90	922.50
06/06/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze LMIC's motion to temporarily allow claim.	0.70	626.50
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and prepare responses to Liberty's second interrogatories	2.80	2,870.00
06/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on privilege review and privilege log for Chubb production	4.10	4,202.50
06/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on privilege review and privilege log for Chubb production	3.70	3,792.50
06/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on responses and objections to Liberty's second interrogatories (1.20), and communications with C. Lascell, R. Van Epps and K. Brinkman regarding the same (.60)	1.80	1,845.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 524 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 14
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review K.Brinkman's comments on LMIC discovery responses and related emails with T.Long	0.10	148.50
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with R.Van Epps re potential deposition and avoid dates	0.10	148.50
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review LMIC email re discovery issues and conference with T.Long re potential responses and related strategy	0.40	594.00
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re interrogatories and document responses and related suggested revisions	0.30	445.50
06/09/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Liberty production and prepare Liberty Responsive, privileged documents for Production and Chubb privilege log	7.20	2,952.00
06/09/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze Liberty complaint and motion to withdraw reference	0.70	486.50
06/09/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Final quality control review of Liberty production regarding privilege redactions	1.10	764.50
06/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze final documents responsive to Liberty's requests related to its claim to prepare for Liberty production	3.60	3,690.00
06/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on privilege review for Chubb production and supplemental production	2.40	2,460.00
06/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from counsel to Liberty regarding discovery and strategy for response to same	0.70	717.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 525 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 15
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/09/2025	J P ROVIRA	B190	Attention to correspondence relating to discovery issues with insurers and review same.	1.50	1,650.00
06/10/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Final quality control review of Liberty production regarding privilege redactions	1.30	903.50
06/10/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding Liberty privilege log and supplemental Chubb production	2.30	943.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Revise proposed responses to Travelers and LMIC discovery requests	0.40	594.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conferences with T.Long re discovery disputes and proposed strategy	0.40	594.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails and conference with T.Long re Travelers discovery responses and suggested revisions	0.20	297.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Revise proposed response to LMIC email on discovery issues	0.20	297.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on Chubb discovery responsive documents and privilege log	0.30	445.50
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with SCS personnel re review of uploaded sample files	0.10	148.50
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with R.Van Epps and C.Lascell re witness prep and depositions	0.10	148.50
06/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with N. Miller regarding plan discovery served on Committee (.30) and review same (.60)	0.90	922.50
06/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize production of redacted documents to Chubb and privilege log (1.80), and email to counsel to Chubb producing the same (.50)	2.30	2,357.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 526 off 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Broth FILE NUMBER: 040312.000000			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 16
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/10/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize responses and objections to Liberty's second set of interrogatories	1.10	1,127.50
06/10/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and prepare responses and objections to Travelers requests for production	1.60	1,640.00
06/10/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize Liberty Production	2.70	2,767.50
06/10/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare response to counsel to Liberty regarding discovery	1.40	1,435.00
06/11/2025 TPBROWN	B190	Telephone call with K.Courington re LMIC request and related emails with K.Courington and T.Long	0.20	297.00
06/11/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re LMIC and Travelers discovery responses	0.30	445.50
06/11/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize responses and objections to Travelers requests for production and produce the same	1.10	1,127.50
06/11/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Finalize and send email to counsel to Liberty regarding discovery, including making LMIC Production and supplementing Chubb Production with redacted documents and privilege log	1.60	1,640.00
06/11/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to dismiss Chubb adversary proceeding	2.70	2,767.50
06/11/2025 J P ROVIRA	B190	Attention to correspondence relating to discovery requests from insurers (.8); address issues relating to strategy for upcoming confirmation and claim objection hearing (1.0).	1.80	1,980.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 527 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 17
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/11/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare privilege log regarding Liberty document production	3.10	2,154.50
06/11/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Cognicion and T. Long regarding supplemental Liberty productions	1.20	492.00
06/11/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare objection to Liberty motion to withdraw reference	1.90	1,320.50
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review and revise response to LMIC re discovery disputes	0.30	445.50
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on discovery issues re Travelers	0.20	297.00
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review Chubb's requests for FCR	0.10	148.50
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare privilege log regarding Liberty document production	1.60	1,112.00
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze Chubb objection to motion to quash SCS subpoena (.8); consider potential arguments in response (1.0); analyze plan and trust distribution procedures regarding the same (.8)	2.60	1,807.00
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Conduct research regarding various considerations regarding Chubb SCS subpoena	0.90	625.50
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Misc. clean up regarding Liberty document review	0.40	278.00
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare motion to dismiss Liberty Complaint	3.00	2,085.00
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare objection to Liberty motion to withdraw reference	1.60	1,112.00
06/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Consider cross designations regarding Chubb FCR Order appeal	0.40	278.00
06/12/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on Witness and Exhibit List for June 18th hearing	1.70	697.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 528 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 18
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Telephone call with Olivia Greenberg re potential settlement of informal objection to stay extension motion and plan	0.30	445.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re potential settlement of stay extension and plan objections	0.10	148.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with T.Long re confidentiality agreement request from Travelers	0.10	148.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re witnesses and exhibits for 6/18 hearing and contacting witnesses re same	0.30	445.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy re Chubb document subpoena and request for current files	0.40	594.00
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and comment on exhibit and witness list for June 18 hearing	0.90	922.50
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with R. Van Epps and C. Lascell regarding June 18 hearing	0.40	410.00
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to request from counsel to Travelers for a confidentiality agreement, including confirming form of agreement	0.60	615.00
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze issues related to privilege log for LMIC production	0.70	717.50
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to quash Chubb's subpoena on SCS	4.10	4,202.50
06/12/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze Chubb's reply to motion to quash regarding subpoena of SCS.	0.40	358.00
06/13/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Finalize cross designations regarding Chubb FCR order appeal	0.20	139.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 529 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 19
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/13/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare motion to dismiss Liberty declaratory judgment action	3.40	2,363.00
06/13/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare Objection to motion to withdrawal reference regarding Liberty declaratory judgment action	1.90	1,320.50
06/13/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Consider strategy regarding liberty declaratory judgment action	2.40	1,668.00
06/13/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Designation of Appellee Hopeman Brothers, Inc. of Additional Items to be Included in the Record of Appeal	0.40	164.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with N.Monico re designation of additional item for record on Chubb's FCR appeal	0.10	148.50
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with T.Long re counter-designation of record in FCR appeal	0.10	148.50
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with O.Greenberg re proposed resolution of informal objection	0.30	445.50
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with J.Rovira re update on litigation	0.10	148.50
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with N.Monico re motions and objection re LMIC complaint and motion	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re outstanding issues and prep of replies to motions and LMIC claim objection	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review Chubb's response to motion to quash subpoena and consider responses to same	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider response and reply on motion to dismiss Chubb complaint	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and comment on designation of record for FCR appeal	0.80	820.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 560 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	ΛE:	WS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers 040312.0000007	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 20
DATE	TIME	KEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze responses from FCR to insurers' discovery requests	0.90	922.50
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze responses from Committee to insurers' document requests	1.20	1,230.00
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze Liberty's responses to discovery requests	0.60	615.00
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze Traveler's responses to discovery requests	0.50	512.50
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze additional discovery requests from Liberty (.50), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	0.80	820.00
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to dismiss Chubb Adversary proceeding	1.60	1,640.00
06/13/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to quash subpoena on SCS	1.80	1,845.00
06/13/2025	JР	ROVIRA	B190	Review discovery responses received from insurers and address open issues related to discovery.	1.00	1,100.00
06/13/2025	CA	RANKIN	B190	Review Committee's designation of additional items regarding appeal of order appointing FCR.	0.10	89.50
06/14/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review SCS files for potential compromise and strategy on 6/18 hearing	0.40	594.00
06/14/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review committee designation of appellate record	0.10	148.50
06/15/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on responses and objections to Chubb's interrogatories	3.10	3,177.50
06/16/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B190	Review committee's responses to similar discovery requests of insurers	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 53/1 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 21
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with T.Long and K.Courington re stayed case and violation	0.20	297.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on replies to motion to dismiss and motion to quash	2.40	3,564.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on discovery responses to Chubb	0.70	1,039.50
06/16/2025	J P ROVIRA	B190	Prepare for and participate in witness preparation session for C. Lascell.	1.80	1,980.00
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in call to prepare for witness preparation call with C. Lascell and R. Van Epps	1.10	1,127.50
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on respones to Travelers' interrogatories (1.80), and communications with C. Lascell (.30) and K. Brinkman (.70) regarding the same	2.80	2,870.00
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on responses to Chubb interrogatories (2.30), and communications with C. Lascell regarding the same (.60)	2.90	2,972.50
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with K. Courington regarding third interim stay order	0.30	307.50
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to dismiss	1.10	1,127.50
06/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to quash	1.60	1,640.00
06/16/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on revised proposed order for 4th automatic stay motion	0.60	246.00
06/16/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Finalize Liberty privilege log	1.00	695.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review docket entries in FCR appeal	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 532 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	- I	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 22
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with O.Greenberg re proposed settlement of informal objection	0.30	445.50
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on Travelers issues and related responses and conferences with T.Long and review related emails	0.40	594.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re revising responses based on insurance counsel call and related emails	0.30	445.50
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Debtor's Witness and Exhibit List to June 18th Hearing	0.30	123.00
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Reply in Support of Motion to Dismiss in the Chubb adversary proceeding	0.30	123.00
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Reply in Support of Motion to Quash third party subpoena	0.30	123.00
06/17/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Research in support of motion to dismiss Chubb FCR appeal	1.30	903.50
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Prepare hearing materials for June 18th hearing	2.50	1,025.00
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize exhibit and witness list for June 18 hearing	0.70	717.50
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize reply in support of motion to dismiss Chubb adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize reply in support of motion to quash subpoena on SCS	0.80	820.00
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze revisions to confidentiality agreement from counsel to Travelers (.50) and communications with counsel to Travelers (.10) and C. Lascell (.30) regarding the same	0.90	922.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 538 off 2007

•	RTH LLP nan Brothers, Inc. 2.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 23
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/17/2025 HPLONG	, III B190	Work on stipulations of fact for objection to Liberty claim (.70), and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding the same (.60)	1.30	1,332.50
06/17/2025 HPLONG	, III B190	Analyze motion to adjourn confirmation hearing filed by Chubb and strategy to address same	1.20	1,230.00
06/17/2025 H P LONG	, III B190	Prepare for June 18 hearing	1.40	1,435.00
06/17/2025 HPLONG	, III B190	Revise 4th interim stay order to address resolution of comments from Boling and Hoffman firms (.70), and communications with counsel from Jackson Walker regarding the same (.60)	1.30	1,332.50
06/17/2025 TPBROW	/N B190	Review and revise reply on motion to quash and review related documents	1.30	1,930.50
06/17/2025 TPBROW	N B190	Review emails with LMIC re discovery disputes	0.20	297.00
06/17/2025 TPBROW	N B190	Review SCS sample documents and consider arguments on motion to quash	1.60	2,376.00
06/17/2025 TPBROW	/N B190	Prepare for 6/18 hearings and work on related outlines	2.70	4,009.50
06/17/2025 TPBROW	/N B190	Review first amended LMIC complaint, related exhibits and email from LMIC counsel	0.50	742.50
06/17/2025 TPBROW	/N B190	Conferences with T.Long re comments on proposed revisions to fourth interim order to settle informal objection and related emails to T.Long	0.30	445.50
06/17/2025 TPBROW	/N B190	Conference with T.Long re filing LMIC exhibits and reply under seal	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 634 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	1E: Hope	JRTH LLP man Brothers, 12.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 24
DATE	TIMEKEEPE	R	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/17/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Review and revise agenda for 6/18 hearing and review and revise related witness and exhibit lists.	0.30	445.50
06/17/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Conference with T.Long re call with chambers and committee counsel re pretrial conference in Chubb	0.20	297.00
06/17/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Work on resolving informal objection to fourth interim order extending stay	0.40	594.00
06/17/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Conference with T.Long re responses to Chubb discovery emails and disputes	0.20	297.00
06/17/2025	T P BRO\	WN	B190	Emails with P.Barrett re 6/18 hearing	0.10	148.50
06/17/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Review emails with Travelers and related conference with T.Long re confidentiality agreement revisions	0.20	297.00
06/17/2025	C A RANI	ΚIN	B190	Analyze debtor's reply ISO motion to quash subpoena of SCS (.4); review Chubb's motion to adjourn confirmation hearing (.6) and Traveler's joinder regarding same (.2).	1.20	1,074.00
06/18/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Emails with SCS re results of hearing on motion to quash subpoena	0.10	148.50
06/18/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Emails with K.Courington re hearing results	0.20	297.00
06/18/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Meetings with committee counsel re confirmation, motion strategy and motion to dismiss LMIC appeal	0.50	742.50
06/18/2025	T P BROV	WN	B190	Attend hearings on 6/18 on motion to dismiss Chubb A.P.; motion to quash objection to LMIC claim and 4th interim order on stay extension	3.10	4,603.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 35 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE				INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 25
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for hearings on motion to quash and objection to LMIC claims	2.30	3,415.50
06/18/2025	J P ROVIRA	B190	Review amended complaint filed by Liberty Mutual.	0.70	770.00
06/18/2025	J P ROVIRA	B190	Attention to correspondence regarding discovery issues with confirmation discovery (.8); discuss issues relating to open items and strategy for confirmation hearing with T. Brown (1.0); review Motion to Continue and address issues related to same (1.0).	2.80	3,080.00
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from counsel to Chubb regarding discovery	0.80	820.00
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and prepare order approving motion to quash subpoena on Chubb	0.70	717.50
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare order approving motion to dismiss Chubb adversary proceeding for submission to court	0.60	615.00
06/18/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze amended Liberty complaint	0.30	208.50
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and submit Order granting the Motion to Dismiss in the Chubb Adversary Proceeding	0.20	82.00
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Order granting 4th automatic stay	0.20	82.00
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize revised order approving 4th interim stay order to and notice of same	0.60	615.00
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Finalize confidentiality agreement with Travelers (.40), and and prepare and produce confidential production to counsel to Travelers (.70)	1.10	1,127.50
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in June 18 omnibus hearing	4.70	4,817.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 626 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 26
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze amended adversary proceeding filed by Liberty	0.60	615.00
06/18/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze briefing in relation to 6/18 hearing (1.1) and attend 6/18 hearing (1.6).	2.70	2,416.50
06/18/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Draft motion to dismiss Chubb appeal of FCR Order	3.80	2,641.00
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Prepare hearing materials for June 18th hearing	1.60	656.00
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file notice of revised order granting the 4th automatic stay motion	0.80	328.00
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on production to Travelers' production request and update production log regarding same	1.20	492.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from Chubb counsel regarding discovery	0.80	820.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on responses to Liberty discovery requests (2.90), and communications with C. Lascell regarding the same (.40)	3.30	3,382.50
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on responses to Liberty's new discovery requests	0.50	742.50
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on responses to Chubb's meet and confer response and related strategy	0.20	297.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference and emails with T.Long re Chubb discovery dispute and meet and confer issues	0.50	742.50
06/20/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare motion to dismiss FCR appeal (1.8); review and finalize the same (.9)	2.70	1,876.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 637 off 2007

	VS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers, 040312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 27
DATE TIMEK	EEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/20/2025 CAF	RANKIN	B190	Analyze correspondence from and with Chubb counsel regarding discovery (.4); analyze Chubb's motion to adjourn confirmation hearing and joinders of Travelers and Liberty to same (1.2).	1.60	1,432.00
06/20/2025 TPE	BROWN	B190	Review 2019 disclosure from Landry & Swarr	0.10	148.50
06/20/2025 TPE	BROWN	B190	Emails with T.Long re Chubb discovery issues and conferences with T.Long re proposed responses	0.50	742.50
06/20/2025 HPL	_ONG, III	B190	Analyze strategy for reply to Chubb's motion to adjourn confirmation hearing.	1.20	1,230.00
06/20/2025 HPL	LONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to FCR regarding hearing on motion to adjourn	0.40	410.00
06/20/2025 HPL	LONG, III	B190	Finalize and serve response to Liberty discovery requests (1.80), and communications with C. Lascell regarding the same (.40)	2.20	2,255.00
06/20/2025 HPL	_ONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to Chubb regarding issues related to discovery	1.40	1,435.00
06/21/2025 HPL	LONG, III	B190	Communications with C. Lascell and R. Van Epps regarding 30(b)(6) depositions	0.60	615.00
06/23/2025 HPL	_ONG, III	B190	Communications with Committee counsel regarding FTI deposition	0.40	410.00
06/23/2025 HPL	_ONG, III	B190	Multiple communications with counsel to Liberty regarding discovery and analyze related issues	1.60	1,640.00
06/23/2025 HPL	LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from counsel to Chubb regarding 30(b)(6) deposition	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 638 off 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brother FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 28
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/23/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize objection to motion to adjourn (1.30), and communications with committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.70	1,742.50
06/23/2025 N S MONICO	B190	Analyze Roussel claimant E.D. La. lawsuit regarding arguments by Liberty with respect to 2003 settlement	0.60	417.00
06/24/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Prepare documents for discovery response to Liberty and Chubb	0.50	205.00
06/24/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Multiple communications with counsel to Liberty regarding discovery and analyze related issues	2.40	2,460.00
06/24/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Work on order approving motion to quash Chubb's subpoena on SCS	0.80	820.00
06/24/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for and attend hearing on committee motion to quash deposition notice and review LMIC objection	1.00	1,485.00
06/24/2025 TPBROWN	B190	Revise proposed order on order quashing SCS subpoena and review transcript for same	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025 C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze Liberty's objection to Committee's motion to quash deposition notice and notice of appeal.	0.30	268.50
06/25/2025 N S MONICO	B190	Calculate new deadlines in light of service of Amended Liberty Complaint	0.30	208.50
06/25/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Multiple communications with Liberty regarding discovery and analyze related issues	1.80	1,845.00
06/25/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Conference with J.Rovira re litigation strategy in LMIC A.P. and re appeals	0.30	445.50
06/25/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Telephone call with T.Phillips re Resolute settlement and administrative expenses	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 639 off 2007

•	CURTH LLP eman Brothers, Inc. 312.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 29
DATE TIMEKEEP	ER TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/25/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Conference with T.Long re adjournment of LMIC 3018 motion to 7/14 hearing from 7/1	0.10	148.50
06/26/2025 T L CAN	ADA B190	Finalize and submit order regarding Motion to Quash Subpoena to the Court	0.20	82.00
06/26/2025 HPLON	IG, III B190	Analyze and respond to questions from K. Courington regarding 4th interim stay order	0.30	307.50
06/26/2025 HPLON	IG, III B190	Analyze brief in support of motion to dismiss Liberty adversary proceeding filed by Roussel claimants	0.90	922.50
06/26/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review Roussel motion to dismiss and memo in support of motion to dismiss LMIC complaint	0.60	891.00
06/26/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review clerk letter in appeal of LMIC claim denial and review record notice	0.10	148.50
06/26/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review emails with K.Courington re stay relief order	0.10	148.50
06/27/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review notice of hearing on motion to dismiss LMIC A.P. filed by Roussel firm	0.10	148.50
06/27/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review LMIC filing on motion to withdraw the reference in LMIC litigation	0.20	297.00
06/27/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Emails with T.Long re document production and related mediation order provisions	0.20	297.00
06/27/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Conference with T.Long re documents produced and potential reclaim of them	0.40	594.00
06/27/2025 HPLON	IG, III B190	Participate in deposition preparation call with C. Lascell	0.80	820.00
06/27/2025 HPLON	IG, III B190	Communications with Committee counsel regarding production related to FTI (.20) and analyze same (.70)	0.90	922.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 640 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	- I - I - I - I - I - I - I - I - I - I	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 30
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/29/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider potential motion in limine and related strategy	0.30	445.50
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze discovery productions in connection with confirmation	2.10	2,152.50
06/30/2025	J W HARBOUR	B190	Analysis of discovery issues and communications with counsel	0.20	286.00
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with J.Harbour re clawback issue and motion in limine strategy	0.30	445.50
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re motion in limine and review of affected documents	0.40	594.00
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy re motion in limine	0.20	297.00
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review entered version of order quashing SCS subpoena	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B190	358.00	
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with R.Van Epps, C.Lascell and P.Santelle re payment received from Gen Re	0.20	297.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and comment on monthly operating report (.60) and communications with Stout regarding the same (.20)	0.80	820.00
06/23/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Review emails with C.Lascell and T.Long re monthly operating report	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and finalize monthly operating report	0.60	615.00
06/23/2025	T L CANADA	B210	Electronically file May Monthly Operating Report	0.10	41.00
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with C.Lascell re expected settlement wire	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B210	1.90	
06/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B310	Analyze amended claim filed by Liberty (.50), and communications with Verita (.10) and counsel to Liberty (.10) regarding the same	0.70	717.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 647 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 31
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review LMIC notice and motion re temporary allowance of claim	0.30	445.50
06/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B310	Analyze issues related to amended Liberty proof of claim and strategy for objection (.60) and communications with counsel to Committee regarding the same (.30)	0.90	922.50
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Work on LMIC reply to claim objection	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Research re pending claim and review related complaint	0.20	297.00
06/15/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Prepare for hearing on claim objection and consider reply	0.60	891.00
06/16/2025	C A RANKIN	B310	Analyze reply in support of objection to LMIC proof of claim.	0.60	537.00
06/17/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review and revise proposed LMIC stipulation re defense costs	0.30	445.50
06/17/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Conferences with T.Long re final changes to reply for LMIC claim objection	0.20	297.00
06/17/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Draft reply to LMIC claim objection	1.90	2,821.50
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B310	Analyze and finalize reply in support of objection to Liberty's claim (1.10), work on redactions to same for filing under seal (.60), and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding sealed objection (.20)	1.90	1,947.50
06/17/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Prepare Sealed and redacted filing versions of Reply in Support of the Claim Objection to Liberty's Claim No. 10 and electronically file same	1.10	451.00
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review and revise proposed order on LMIC claim objection	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 642 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	1 1 1			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 32
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B310	Prepare order approving objection to Liberty claim for submission to court	0.60	615.00
06/18/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Finalize and submit order regarding Liberty Claim objection	0.20	82.00
06/23/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review draft of objection to LMIC 3018 motion and related email with T.Long	0.30	445.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review LMIC notice of appeal of claim denial	0.10	148.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review objection and joinder on 3018 motion	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Finalize and electronically file Objection to Motion of Liberty Mutual Insurance Company for Entry of an Order Temporarily Allowing Claim No. 19 Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 3018(A)	0.30	123.00
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Review email from SCS re release received on settled claim	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B310	11.10	
06/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation evidence outline	0.70	1,039.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review amended articles of incorporation and bylaws for Reorganized Debtor	0.40	594.00
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review proposed updated claimant release form from committee counsel	0.20	297.00
06/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues and strategy to prepare for confirmation hearing	0.70	717.50
06/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on Reorganized Hopeman Bylaws	1.10	1,127.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider approach to resolve potential objection to plan and to extension motion	0.30	445.50
06/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation hearing outline	1.60	2,376.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 649 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 33
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Continue to analyze and work on strategy for confirmation hearing	0.80	820.00
06/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on list of asbestos insurance policies for plan supplement	1.20	1,230.00
06/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on list of vendors for plan supplement	0.90	922.50
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for FTI call on confirrmation issues and prepare outline of issues and testimony	1.80	2,673.00
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with FTI and committee lawyers re confirmation hearing	0.50	742.50
06/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on plan supplement issues and related conferences with T.Long	0.40	594.00
06/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee counsel to prepare for confirmation hearing	1.10	1,127.50
06/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with D. Cox regarding plan supplement	0.40	410.00
06/05/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee email re insurance policies for plan supplement and related conferences with T.Long	0.30	445.50
06/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize plan supplement (2.10), and multiple communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.80)	2.90	2,972.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation issues and strategy and potential evidence	1.60	2,376.00
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with committee counsel re revisions to plan supplement documents	0.10	148.50
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review changes to proposed plan supplement documents and related notice	0.60	891.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 704 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 34
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review changes to TDP and trust documents	0.50	742.50
06/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re confirmation hearing and outline testimony	2.40	3,564.00
06/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review transcript of confirmation hearing and declarations from prior 524(g) case	1.70	2,524.50
06/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review transcript of precedent confirmation hearing and related declarations	0.80	1,188.00
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft witness outlines and potential declarations for confirmation hearing	4.30	6,385.50
06/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review case precedents and related transcripts and declarations for confirmation hearing	3.70	5,494.50
06/10/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to discovery and strategy for addressing confirmation objections of insurers.	1.00	1,100.00
06/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Verita regarding status of plan voting	0.60	615.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from K.Courington re potential confirmation objection and consider strategy	0.20	297.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re call with FCR's counsel	0.10	148.50
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on declarations for confirmation witnesses	3.30	4,900.50
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee suggested prep outline for cross of FTI witness and emails re same	0.40	594.00
06/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on direct outline for FTI witness for confirmation	1.40	2,079.00
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare witness prep outlines and declarations for confirmation hearing	3.60	5,346.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 745 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 35
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with FCR's counsel and committee counsel	0.40	594.00
06/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for and participate in witness prep for confirmation hearing	1.60	2,376.00
06/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in confirmation hearing prep call with Debtor and Committee professionals	1.40	1,435.00
06/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communcations with Verita (.40) and Committee counsel (.30) regarding voting status and analyze issues related to same (.60)	1.30	1,332.50
06/12/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Electronically file certificate of service for Solicitation Package	0.20	82.00
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on witness outlines for confirmation hearings	2.80	4,158.00
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re votes on plan	0.20	297.00
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re LMIC provisional ballot request	0.10	148.50
06/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps and C.Lascell re witness prep session and update	0.20	297.00
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze request from Liberty for provisional ballot (.50) and communications with Verita regarding the same (.30)	0.80	820.00
06/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with C. Lascell and R. Van Epps regarding witness prep for confirmation hearing	0.40	410.00
06/12/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review Plan Supplement and related documents and address issues relating to strategy and potential objection from insurers.	1.50	1,650.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review voting results and related emails with T.Long re unacceptable ballot and impact on voting	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 7/26 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 36
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails to C.Lascell and other advisors on plan voting results	0.40	594.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email to and from C.Lascell re potential settlement of extension/plan objection	0.20	297.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re outstanding issues and confirmation prep	0.60	891.00
06/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on strategy for confirmation testimony and evidence	0.60	891.00
06/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze ballot summary from Verita and related issues	0.70	717.50
06/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding balloting summary and strategy for confirmation hearing	0.60	615.00
06/13/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address strategy regarding responses to expected objections of insurers to Plan (1.0); discuss same with T. Brown (.8).	1.80	1,980.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for witness prep sessions and revise related outlines	1.70	2,524.50
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with R.Van Epps, C.Lascell and T.Long re plan testimony topics and related issues	1.00	1,485.00
06/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on plan confirmation strategy and testimony needed and consider responses and related research to insurerexpected objections	2.60	3,861.00
06/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze comments to plan from UST and strategy to address same	0.60	615.00
06/17/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with UST, committee and T.Long re UST's proposed revisions to plan and consider responses	0.60	891.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 747 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAN FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 37
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re requests for deposition of C.Tully	0.20	297.00
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with R.Van Epps re confirmation hearing topics and insurance issues	0.50	742.50
06/18/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Consider anticipated plan objections with T.Brown	0.20	139.00
06/18/2025	C A RANKIN	B320	Conference with J. Rovira regarding open items regarding confirmation briefing (.4) and begin considering arguments regarding same (.7).	1.10	984.50
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review motion of Chubb to expedite and motion to adjourn confirmation hearing	0.80	1,188.00
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re expected testimony for confirmation	0.20	297.00
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re hearing results and confirmation preparation	0.60	891.00
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re confirmation briefs and findings	0.30	445.50
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on responses to Travelers discovery and meeting with Travelers counsel	0.30	445.50
06/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on responses to LMIC new discovery	0.40	594.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze precedent related to findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of plan (.80) and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.20	1,230.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 748 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	Brothers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 38
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/19/2025	C A RANKIN	B320	Prepare for and participate in conference with T. Brown and J. Rovira regarding open items for confirmation briefing and confirmation order (.5); initially analyze articles and case law support for same (.7).	1.20	1,074.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze precedent and strategy related to brief in support of plan (1.10) and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.60)	1.70	1,742.50
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze 30(b)(6) notices from insurers and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
06/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Work on resolution of US Trustee's comments concerning plan	0.60	615.00
06/19/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in meeting concerning preparation of open items for upcoming confirmation hearing (1.5); begin review of precedent confirmation orders and briefs related to same (1.3).	2.80	3,080.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on strategy re responses to potential plan objections including insurance neutrality	2.20	3,267.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on plan confirmation evidence and potential testimony	1.40	2,079.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with J.Rovira, B.Bell, C.Rankin and T.Long re findings of fact, brief and related plan confirmation research	0.80	1,188.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and consider topics for potential deposition of Hopeman from Chubb	0.20	297.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email to K.Montgomery re proposed resolution of UST plan concerns	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 749 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	ers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 39
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with Brandon Bell re case precedents for research and locate materials	0.50	742.50
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with P.Guffy re precedent for research and locate materials	0.40	594.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps and K.Brinkman re proposed insurance topics call for plan	0.30	445.50
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email to and from committee counsel re proposed call on plan insurance issues	0.20	297.00
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re UST comments and question on plan	0.10	148.50
06/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review LMIC deposition notice	0.20	297.00
06/19/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Calls and emails with J. Rovira, T. Brown regarding proposed confirmation order (.5); research regarding same (.5).	1.00	995.00
06/19/2025	B R BELL	B320	Discussion regarding preparation of brief in support of confirmation, including research required for same (.8); preliminary review of relevant precedent for same (.1)	0.90	715.50
06/20/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Begin drafting proposed confirmation order.	1.00	995.00
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on evidence for confirmation hearing and related outline and declarations	1.50	2,227.50
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with committee counsel re 30(b)(6) notice of committee	0.20	297.00
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review LMIC joinder re motion to adjourn	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 750 off 2507

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 40
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Chubb email re motion to expedite and related motion to adjourn	0.10	148.50
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on declarations in support of confirmation of plan	2.80	4,158.00
06/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel, K.Brinkman, R.Van Epps and T.Long re plan provisions on treatment of insurers and potential plan clarifications	0.80	1,188.00
06/20/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to discovery concerning plan and attention to correspondence related to same (.8); review precedent briefing and address strategy for responding to anticipated plan objections (1.0).	1.80	1,980.00
06/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze strategy related to 30(b)(6) depositions (.90), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.50)	1.40	1,435.00
06/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues in support of insurance neutrality arguments	1.60	1,640.00
06/20/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Research regarding extension of exclusivity (.9); prepare summary of the same (.4)	1.30	903.50
06/20/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Survey cases regarding solicitation and confirmation issues in comparable 524(g) cases	2.70	1,876.50
06/21/2025	B R BELL	B320	Begin drafting brief in support of confirmation.	4.10	3,259.50
06/21/2025	B R BELL	B320	Analyze and assess relevant authorities regarding 524(g) issues in preparation of reply and brief in support of confirmation.	6.80	5,406.00
06/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re deposition prep dates	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 75/1 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 41
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell and with R.Van Epps re potential deposition dates and topics	0.20	297.00
06/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on objection to Chubb's motion to adjourn confirmation hearing.	3.60	3,690.00
06/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on objection to Chubb's motion to adjourn confirmation hearing.	4.40	4,510.00
06/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review draft objection to motion to adjourn and begin working on revisions	1.20	1,782.00
06/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review prior transcript and precedent re 524(g) plans and schedules	0.40	594.00
06/22/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Continue drafting proposed confirmation order.	6.00	5,970.00
06/22/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continued research of relevant 524(g) cases (2.2); review of relevant briefing in connection with same (1.9); continue drafting brief in support of confirmation (1.8)	5.90	4,690.50
06/22/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continue drafting brief in support of confirmation and review authorities related to same.	3.50	2,782.50
06/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review expedited hearing order on motion to adjourn and to quash	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee motion to quash and consider strategy re same	0.40	594.00
06/23/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Finish drafting proposed confirmation order (.9); emails with J. Rovira regarding same (.2).	1.10	1,094.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 732 off 2007

HUNTON ANDRE\ CLIENT NAME: FILE NUMBER:	WS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers, 040312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 42
DATE TIMEI	KEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/23/2025 BR	BELL	B320	Continued preparation of brief in support of confirmation (1.9); review of issues pertaining to various insurance related considerations for same (2.5); and Section 1129 issues specific to 524(g) context for confirmation brief (1.8).	6.20	4,929.00
06/23/2025 CA	RANKIN	B320	Analyze FCR's response to Chubb's motion to adjourn plan confirmation.	0.10	89.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Review FCR's response to motion to adjourn	0.30	445.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Review emails between Chubb and committee re Tully deposition and related emails with T.Long re same	0.20	297.00
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Review committee joinder in objection to adjournment of confirmation hearing.	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with K.Montgomery re resolution of plan issues	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re response to Chubb's deposition request of debtor	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re proposed response to LMIC discovery issues and related conferences with T.Long	0.50	742.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re deposition of debtor and potential testimony	0.20	297.00
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re deposition date and time for C.Tully deposition	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re deposition prep call	0.10	148.50
06/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B320	Prepare for hearing on motion and joinder to adjourn plan confirmation	2.50	3,712.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 738 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 43
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on response to motions to adjourn confirmation hearing	2.70	4,009.50
06/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on objection to Liberty 3018 motion	1.60	1,640.00
06/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Verita regarding voting certification and analyze related issues	0.70	717.50
06/24/2025	B R BELL	B320	Analyze issues pertaining to requirements under section 524(g) (4.2); continued preparation and revision of brief in support of confirmation (3.1).	7.30	5,803.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with insurer's counsel re adjournment of debtor 30(b)(6) deposition	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email with J.Rovira re findings of fact and preliminary review of same	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re LMIC discovery issues to resolve and clarify	0.40	594.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review LMIC notice of deposition of Conor Tully	0.10	148.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re privilege log production to LMIC and review same	0.30	445.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to adjourn confirmation hearing	3.20	4,752.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email with C.Lascell re document to review for deposition	0.10	148.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re deposition topics and re hearing date	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email to Chubb's counsel re deposition of C.Tully and review notice from Chubb	0.20	297.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with Traveler's counsel re July 1 deposition for plan issues	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 804 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 44
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider potential plan stipulations of fact and research needed	0.50	742.50
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare outline for prep call with C.Lascell	0.80	1,188.00
06/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with C.Lascell re deposition topics and related documents and issues	1.40	2,079.00
06/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to Chubb regarding rescheduling 30(b)(6) deposition	0.60	615.00
06/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition preparation call with C. Lascell	1.40	1,435.00
06/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with C. Lascell and R. Van Epps regarding confirmation hearing	0.40	410.00
06/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize objection to Liberty's 3018 motion (.80), and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding hearing on same (.30)	1.10	1,127.50
06/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to adjourn confirmation hearing.	2.40	2,460.00
06/24/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and monitor hearing on Motion to Continue Confirmation (1.5); review and revise proposed findings of fact for confirmation of Plan (3.3).	4.80	5,280.00
06/25/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review relevant filings by likely objectors to confirmation (4.5); incorporate additions to brief in support of confirmation based on same (2.1).	6.60	5,247.00
06/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re responding to LMIC follow-up on discovery requests	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 85 off 2007

·	RTH LLP man Brothers, Inc. 12.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 45
DATE TIMEKEEPER	R TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/25/2025 TPBROW	VN B320	Conference with T.Long re LMIC request re briefing schedule for confirmation and review related emails with LMIC	0.20	297.00
06/25/2025 C A RANK	(IN B320	Analyze open items regarding confirmation brief and communications with B. Bell regarding same.	0.60	537.00
06/25/2025 JPROVIF	RA B320	Begin review of proposed confirmation order (1.8); discuss issues related to upcoming confirmation hearing and open items with T. Brown (1.0).	2.80	3,080.00
06/25/2025 HPLONG	S, III B320	Analyze and respond to email from counsel to Liberty regarding briefing schedule (.50), and communications with counsel to Committee regarding the same (.20)	0.70	717.50
06/25/2025 HPLONG	6, III B320	Analyze and work on draft findings of fact and conclusions of law (2.10), and communications with committee counsel regarding the same (.60)	2.70	2,767.50
06/25/2025 HPLONG	6, III B320	Prepare for 30(b)(6) deposition of debtor	2.20	2,255.00
06/25/2025 HPLONG	6, III B320	Communications with committee counsel regarding deposition of Tully and 30(b)(6) of committee	0.80	820.00
06/25/2025 TPBROW	VN B320	Conference with J.Rovira re confirmation depositions, hearing preparation and strategy	0.50	742.50
06/25/2025 TPBROW	VN B320	Work on declarations in support of confirmation	1.90	2,821.50
06/25/2025 TPBROW	VN B320	Emails with committee counsel re Tully deposition prep	0.10	148.50
06/25/2025 TPBROW	VN B320	Work on open issues list for confirmation and related depositions and litigation	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 836 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 46
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/26/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue review of confirmation order and related precedent and edit same (1.8); address open issues related to confirmation brief and discuss same with B. Bell (.7).	2.50	2,750.00
06/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition preparation call with C. Tully	2.10	2,152.50
06/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues related to notice of officers and directors for reorganized debtor (.40), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.20)	0.60	615.00
06/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation of plan	2.80	2,870.00
06/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze declarations in support of confirmation of plan	1.60	1,640.00
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on declarations for confirmation hearing witnesses	2.70	4,009.50
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Participate in deposition preparation meeting of Conor Tully with committee counsel	2.60	3,861.00
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re deposition preparation	0.10	148.50
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re findings of fact strategy	0.30	445.50
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long following Tully prep session	0.10	148.50
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email to T.Long re proposed declarations for plan testimony	0.10	148.50
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email with committee counsel re deposition for 6/27	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 837 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 47
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review revised prep outline for C.Tully call	0.20	297.00
06/26/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Call with T. Long regarding proposed confirmation order (.2); review and revise same (1.8).	2.00	1,990.00
06/26/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further additions to brief in support of confirmation (3.9); provide draft of same to restructuring team, including notes on open issues and necessary additional inserts (.6).	4.50	3,577.50
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re FA testimony for confirmation hearing	0.20	297.00
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re additional deposition preparation for 6/30	0.10	148.50
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call and emails with C.Lascell re deposition preparation for debtor 30(b)(6) topics	1.80	2,673.00
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Conor Tully of FTI	6.70	9,949.50
06/27/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law	1.60	1,640.00
06/27/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on confirmation order	0.80	820.00
06/27/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Attend deposition of C. Tully	5.40	5,535.00
06/27/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Begin review of confirmation brief and related issues.	1.00	1,100.00
06/27/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Preparation and research on documents for T. Long and T. Brown for deposition	2.00	820.00
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long and T.Canada re committee discovery responses for plan confirmation	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 8/8 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 48
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re proposed findings and review related revisions and review related emails with J.Rovira	0.50	742.50
06/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Travelers' notice of deposition	0.10	148.50
06/27/2025	P M GUFFY	B320	Review and revise proposed confirmation order (3.7); emails with T. Long regarding same (.2).	3.90	3,880.50
06/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on memorandum of law in support of plan	2.10	2,152.50
06/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare outline of topics to cover during deposition preparation and consider related issues	0.90	1,336.50
06/30/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee and T.Long re deposition notices	0.10	148.50
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition preparation call with C. Lascell	2.40	2,460.00
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding 30(b)(6) depositions	0.60	615.00
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on Lascell Declaration in support of confirmation	1.80	1,845.00
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on Tully Declaration in support of confirmation	1.10	1,127.50
06/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation	2.30	2,357.50
06/30/2025	J W HARBOUR	B320	Analysis of plan confirmation issues including witness issues and communications with counsel	0.20	286.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Page 359 off 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc. FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131826843 07/31/2025 49
DATE TIMEKEEPER TASK DESCRIPTION	ON	HOURS	VALUE
with C.La	on for deposition scell and T.Long are outline for	3.30	4,900.50
committee	email from e counsel and rategy for plan	0.30	445.50
30(b)(6) c	th T.Long re of committee for irmation hearing	0.20	297.00
consider	or depositions and potential testimony nation hearing	1.70	2,524.50
re depone	th LMIC counsel ent for 7/1 n of debtor	0.10	148.50
TOTAL B	320	262.90	
TOTAL H	IOURS	650.10	
TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:			
TIMEKEEPER STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
T P BROWN Partner	169.30	1,485.00	251,410.50
J W HARBOUR Partner	0.60	1,430.00	858.00
J P ROVIRA Partner	29.60 225.60	1,100.00 1,025.00	32,560.00
H P LONG, III Counsel K T BAILEY Associate	9.50	690.00	231,240.00 6,555.00
B R BELL Associate	45.80	795.00	36,411.00
P M GUFFY Associate	15.00	995.00	14,925.00
N S MONICO Associate	57.50	695.00	39,962.50
C A RANKIN Associate	31.10	895.00	27,834.50
R RUBIN Associate	7.10	695.00	4,934.50
T L CANADA Paralegal	59.00	410.00	24,190.00

670,881.00

TOTAL FEES (\$)

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1094 Filed 00/08/25 Entered 00/08/25 14:35:46 Desc Main Document Prage 850 of 2007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP INVOICE: 131826843
CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc. DATE: 07/31/2025
FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007 PAGE: 50

TIME SUM	MARY BY TASK CODE:		
CODE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
B110	Case Administration	12.40	7,651.50
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	3.80	3,923.50
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	358.00	340,806.00
B210	Business Operations	1.90	2,070.00
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	11.10	12,523.50
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	262.90	303,906.50
		650.10	670,881.00

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E106	Online Research	2,548.18
E109	Local Travel	30.00
E116	Trial Transcripts	328.70
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	5,258.15
TOTAL CL	JRRENT EXPENSES (\$)	8,165.03

INVOICE SUMMARY:

 Current Fees:
 \$ 670,881.00

 Current Charges:
 8,165.03

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 679,046.03

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002 Telephone: (713) 220-4200

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219 Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

In re: : Chapter 11

HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC., : Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)

Debtor.

:

TWELFTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP AS BANKRUPTCY COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JULY 31, 2025

Name of Applicant:	Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Name of Client:	Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Debtor and Debtor in Possession
Date of retention order entered:	September 9, 2024, effective as of June 30, 2024 [Docket No. 163]
Time Period Covered:	July 1, 2025 through July 31, 2025
Total Fees Requested:	\$548,840.80 (80% of \$686,051.00)
Total Expenses Requested:	\$25,309.11
Type of Fee Statement:	Monthly ¹

Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement shall be served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order (as defined herein) and objections to payment of the amounts described in this Monthly Fee Statement shall be addressed in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

Pursuant to sections 330, and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedures of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Virginia (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), and the Order (I) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals and (II) Granting Related Relief entered September 9, 2024 [Docket No. 162] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP ("Hunton"), counsel for Hopeman Brothers, Inc., as debtor and debtor in possession (the "Debtor"), hereby submits this monthly fee statement (the "Monthly Fee Statement") for the allowance of compensation for the reasonable and necessary legal services rendered by Hunton for the period from July 1, 2025 through and including July 31, 2025 (the "Fee Period") and reimbursement of the actual and necessary expenses that Hunton incurred during the Fee Period. By this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton seeks allowance of compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$686,051.00 and payment in the amount of \$548,840.80 (which equals 80% of the compensation sought herein). Hunton also seeks allowance and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$25,309.11.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

- 1. In support of this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton has attached the following:
 - Exhibit A is a summary schedule of hours and fees covered by this Monthly Fee Statement, categorized by project code.
 - <u>Exhibit B</u> is a summary schedule of the time expended by all Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals engaged in the representation of the Debtor during the Fee Period.
 - <u>Exhibit C</u> is a summary of the expenses incurred by Hunton during the Fee Period.
 - Exhibit D is a detailed invoice for the hours expended and fees incurred by Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period.

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 39 of 207

Representations

2. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred in the Fee Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Monthly Fee Statement due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Hunton reserves the right to make further application to this Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee statements and applications will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, and Interim Compensation Order.

Notice

3. Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been provided to all necessary parties in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, Hunton respectfully requests payment of its reasonable and necessary fees and expenses incurred during the Fee Period in the total amount of \$574,149.91, consisting of (i) \$548,840.80, which is 80% of the fees incurred by the Debtor for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by Hunton during the Fee Period, and (ii) \$25,309.11 for actual and necessary costs and expenses.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

Dated: September 17, 2025

Richmond, Virginia

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072)

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Riverfront Plaza, East Tower

951 East Byrd Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone: (804) 788-8200 Facsimile: (804) 788-8218

Email: tpbrown@HuntonAK.com

hlong@HuntonAK.com

- and -

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

600 Travis Street, Suite 4200

Houston, TX 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200 Facsimile: (713) 220-4285

Email: josephrovira@HuntonAK.com

crankin@HuntonAK.com

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

EXHIBIT A Statement of Fees by Subject Matter during the Fee Period

Matter Code	Matter Description	Hours	Fees Requested
B110	Case Administration	6.5	\$5,343.00
B130	Asset Disposition	3.7	\$5,494.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	0.5	\$650.50
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	36.7	\$24,469.00
B170	Fee / Employment Objections	13.6	\$13,159.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	79.4	\$73,155.00
B210	Business Operations	9.9	\$10,587.50
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	13.3	\$7,747.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	497.2	\$545,445.50
	Total	660.8	\$686,051.00

EXHIBIT B

Professionals Rendering Services during the Fee Period

The Hunton attorneys who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee Period include:

Professional	Position	Year Admitted	Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. P. Brown	Partner	1987	Bankruptcy	\$1,485	172.2	\$255,717.00
J. W. Harbour	Partner	2001	Bankruptcy	\$1,430	0.8	\$1,144.00
J. P. Rovira	Partner	2008	Bankruptcy	\$1,100	87.2	\$95,920.00
H. P. Long III	Counsel	2007	Bankruptcy	\$1,025	176.1	\$180,502.50
C. A. Rankin	Associate	2018	Bankruptcy	\$895	14.4	\$12,888.00
B. R. Bell	Associate	2021	Bankruptcy	\$795	109.6	\$87,132.00
N. S. Monico	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$695	23.7	\$16,471.50
R. Rubin	Associate	2025	Bankruptcy	\$695	16.8	\$11,676.00
Totals						\$661,451.00

Hunton paraprofessionals who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee

Period include:

Paraprofessional	Position	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. L. Canada	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	\$410	58.8	\$24,108.00
D. K. Drake	Paralegal	Litigation	\$410	1.2	\$492.00
			Totals	60.0	\$24,600.00

EXHIBIT C Summary of Expenses Incurred during the Fee Period

Туре	Expenses
Online Research	\$2,270.48
Copying	\$1,135.10
Deposition Transcripts	\$9,156.43
Litigation Support Vendors	\$12,596.30
Pacer services for the period 04/02/2025 to 06/30/2025	\$150.80
TOTAL EXPENSES:	\$25,309.11

EXHIBIT D

Detailed Invoice of Fees and Expenses Incurred During the Fee Period

HUNTON

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE:

040312.0000007 131827508 09/08/2025

CLIENT NAME:

Hopeman Brothers, Inc.

BILLING ATTORNEY:

TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending July 31, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

 Current Fees:
 \$ 686,051.00

 Current Charges:
 25,309.11

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 711,360.11

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131827508, Date:09/08/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP Routing Number: 021052053

Account Number: 72561654

To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N



HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY-REMITTANCE PAGE

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE:

040312.0000007 131827508 09/08/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc. **BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON**

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending July 31, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

Current Fees: \$ 686,051.00 **Current Charges:** 25,309.11

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 711,360.11

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131827508, Date:09/08/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Routing Number: 021052053 Account Number: 72561654

To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N

HUNTON

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE DETAIL

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE: 040312.0000007 131827508 09/08/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/03/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service of doc. no. 934	0.10	41.00
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Review numerous docket entries on adjournments	0.10	148.50
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze matters scheduled for omnibus hearing on July 17, and communications with chambers regarding the same	0.40	410.00
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service for doc. no. 963 and AP doc. no. 33	0.30	123.00
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file Notice of Adjournment of Combined Hearing	0.10	41.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Prepare and electronically file Notice of Deposition of Marc C. Scarcella and communications with Court Reporter regarding same	0.80	328.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Document Page 982 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 2
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Conference with T.Long re Omni hearing on 7/17/25	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Prepare and electronically file Notice of Cancellation of July 17th hearing	0.20	82.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Communications with chambers regarding July 17 omnibus hearing and matters scheduled for same (.40) and analyze and finalize notice of cancellation (.20)	0.60	615.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Emails with T.Long re sealing orders and re coordination of deposition	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Conference with T.Long re cancellation of omnibus hearing and status of order	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Emails with T.Canada re payment of transcript expenses	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Review docket entries and emails with UST, LMIC and others re sealing orders	0.20	297.00
07/17/2025	N S MONICO	B110	Consider cross designations regarding liberty appeal of claim disallowance order	0.50	347.50
07/17/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Emails and conference with T.Long re UST reporting issues	0.10	148.50
07/17/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically filed Certificate of Service for doc. nos. 972, 975, 976, 977, 978, 979, 980, 981, 982, 983, 984, 985, 986	0.30	123.00
07/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Document Page 993 off 2007

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 3
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/22/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Work on Notice of Hearing and Notice of Motion for Third Exclusivity Motion	0.20	82.00
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
07/23/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service of doc. nos. 1028, 1029, 1030, 1036, 1063	0.30	123.00
07/24/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file Certificate of Service of doc. nos. 990, 991, 992, 993, 994, 996, 997, 998, 1001, 1003, 1005, 1007, 1008, 1010, 1011, 1013, 1015, 1017, 1019, 1021, 1023, 1025	0.30	123.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Review to-do list for additional items and follow- up on outstanding items	0.30	445.50
07/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
07/31/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service of doc. nos. 1076, 1077, 1078, 1079	0.10	41.00
			TOTAL B110	6.50	
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with Resolute counsel re lack of wire of settlement proceeds and related emails with C.Lascell	0.20	297.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Draft letter with wire instructions, draft W-9 and related emails with P.Santelle and C.Lascell	0.80	1,188.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with C.Lascell re Resolute call on settlement proceeds	0.10	148.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with P.Santelle re overage of settlement proceeds	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 100 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 4
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Consider strategy re approvals of return of overage in settlement proceeds	0.30	445.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Draft email to K.Montgomery re overage issue re settlement proceeds from Resolute.	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with P.Santelle re wire of settlement proceeds	0.10	148.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Telephone call with C.Lascell re settlement proceeds and related calls on wires and overage	0.20	297.00
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Telephone call with P.Barrett re overage issue and related proposed call with HII and emails with UST	0.30	445.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with T.Phillips re settlement proceeds expected	0.10	148.50
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Draft emails re Gen Re overage amount and instructions for return with insurance counsel	0.30	445.50
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Email to C.Lascell re UST and HII approvals re overage return	0.10	148.50
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails and call with P.Barrett re overage return issue for UST and HII	0.30	445.50
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with P.Santelle re settlement payments and instructions to return overage	0.20	297.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Conference with T.Long re any requirements to complete settlement after receipt of proceeds	0.10	148.50
07/12/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with C.Lascell re Gen Re overage	0.10	148.50
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with K.Montgomery re receipt of settlement funds	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Pagge 05 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 5
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B130	Emails with C.Lascell re return of overage to Gen Re	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B130	3.70	
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B150	Emails with committee counsel re claimant fact inquiry and consider response to same	0.20	297.00
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B150	Communications with counsel to party in interest regarding Scarcella deposition	0.20	205.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B150	Email from committee counsel re claimant fact inquiry	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B150	0.50	
07/02/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Emails with T. Rader regarding open items for CKSMM interim fee application.	0.20	179.00
07/07/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze and address open items regarding Hunton's May fee statement (1.7); analyze and address open items regarding CKSMM May fee statement (.3) and email T. Rader regarding same (.1); analyze Blank Rome's May fee statement (.2) and email K. Brinkman regarding same and upcoming fee application (.1); analyze Stout's May fee statement (.1) and email Stout team regarding same and upcoming fee application deadline (.1).	2.60	2,327.00
07/08/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze Hunton's May monthly fee statement and circulate same to T. Brown for review and comment.	0.50	447.50
07/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Prepare CNO for Kutak's 1st Interim Fee Application (.4) and communications with P. Barrett regarding same (.1)	0.50	205.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plagge 100 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 6
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Hunton's May monthly fee statement	1.20	492.00
07/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Hunton's 4th Interim Fee Application	2.60	1,066.00
07/09/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Continue work on Hunton's 4th interim fee application	1.60	656.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Telephone call with T.Phillips re motion for approval to pay approved fees	0.10	148.50
07/10/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Begin to revise Hunton's fourth interim fee application.	0.80	716.00
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Communications with C. Rankin regarding Hunton's 4th interim fee application	0.10	41.00
07/11/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Review and revise Hunton fourth interim fee application (1.2) and analyze various considerations regarding drafting same (.8) draft email to T. Brown regarding same (.3); review and make proposed revisions and notes to open issues regarding CKSMM fourth interim fee application (.8); analyze Blank Rome Fourth Interim Fee Application (.6).	3.70	3,311.50
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with K.Courington re outstanding fees	0.10	148.50
07/13/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review fee statement	0.40	594.00
07/13/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Emails with K. Brinkman regarding Blank Rome Fourth Interim Fee Application (.1) and analyze revised draft of application (.2).	0.30	268.50
07/14/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Communications with Stout regarding unpaid fees of professionals for the Debtor, Committee, and Future Representatives	0.30	123.00
07/14/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Blank Rome and CKSMM's 4th interim fee applications	1.70	697.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 03 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 7
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/14/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze Stout Fourth Interim Fee Application (.8) and draft email to Stout team regarding suggested edits regarding same (.2); emails with T. Brown, M. Stevenson and T. Canada regarding edits to Hunton Tenth monthly fee statement and fourth interim fee application (.4); analyze updated Hunton May invoice (.3); analyze upcoming omnibus hearing dates for notice of interim fee applications (.1).	1.80	1,611.00
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review and revise May fee statement and related emails with C.Rankin	0.40	594.00
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review and revise fourth Hunton interim fee application and related email with C.Rankin	0.30	445.50
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review emails with C.Lascell re prior fee payments and related conference with T.Long re motion and exhibit to prepare to release fee payments	0.30	445.50
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Hunton's 4th interim fee application	1.10	451.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Stout's May 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file CKSMM's May 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Blank Rome's May 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Hunton's May 2025 fee statement	0.90	369.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Blank Rome's 4th interim fee application	0.60	246.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 108 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 8
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file CKSMM's 4th interim fee application	0.60	246.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Notice of 4th Interim fee applications and Notice of Hearing	1.00	410.00
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with C.Rankin re filing and serving fee apps and monthly fee statement and review revisions	0.20	297.00
07/15/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Review and revise Notice of filing of fourth interim fee applications of debtor's professionals (.3), review and revise blank rome's fourth interim fee application (.4) and Hunton's fourth interim fee application (.5); communications with T. Canada regarding resolving open items regarding finalizing and filing monthly fee statements and fourth interim fee applications of debtor's professionals (.6); review and analyze open items regarding Kutak May fee statement (.4) and communications with P. Barrett regarding same (.2); review Stout's fourth interim fee application and file same (.5); revise notice of filing of fourth interim fee applications and file same (.3).	3.20	2,864.00
07/16/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze revised May fee statement detail for Kutak and email P. Barrett regarding same.	0.30	268.50
07/21/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Emails with K. Brinkman, M. Cortens, and M. Stevenson (Hunton accounting) regarding June monthly fee statements.	0.20	179.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 09 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 9
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B160	Analyze email from US Trustee confirming agreement with Stout regarding approval of monthly fee statement	0.40	410.00
07/29/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Exhibit 1 to Motion to Approve Disbursement of Funds to Pay Professional Fees	6.30	2,583.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Work on motion to authorize payment of approved fees from DIP sub-account	0.50	742.50
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails wth K.Courington re outstanding fees and related motion	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B160	36.70	
07/13/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Review and revise motion to dismiss FCR appeal by Chubb	0.90	1,336.50
07/14/2025	N S MONICO	B170	Consider revisions to Motion to dismiss Chubb insurers appeal of FCR Order	0.30	208.50
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Conference with N.Monico re motion to dismiss FCR appeal and related comments	0.30	445.50
07/17/2025	N S MONICO	B170	Revise motion to dismiss Chubb appeal of FCR order per T.Brown comments	3.10	2,154.50
07/17/2025	N S MONICO	B170	Analyze Chubb opening brief in FCR Order appeal	0.80	556.00
07/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze brief filed by Chubb in FCR appeal and strategy related to same	1.10	1,127.50
07/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze open items in appeal of order appointing FCR and strategy to address same	0.90	922.50
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Review revised brief and motion to dismiss FCR appeal and provide proposed changes	1.00	1,485.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 120 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 10
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/30/2025	N S MONICO	B170	Revise motion to dismiss FCR appeal per T.Brown comments	1.20	834.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Conference with N.Monico re revisions to motion to dismiss FCR appeal and timing of filing	0.20	297.00
07/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Communications with committee counsel regarding strategy for filings in appeal of FCR approval order (.50) and analyze same (.30)	0.80	820.00
07/30/2025	T L CANADA	B170	Work on Brief in Support of Motion to Dismiss Chubb's Future Claim Representatives Appeal	0.50	205.00
07/31/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Emails with J.Rovira re comments on motion to dismiss the FCR appeal and review proposed changes	0.20	297.00
07/31/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze motion to dismiss appeal of order approving FCR appointment	0.80	820.00
07/31/2025	J P ROVIRA	B170	Review and revise motion to dismiss appeal of FCR Order and attention to correspondence related to same.	1.50	1,650.00
			TOTAL B170	13.60	
07/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze supplemental discovery responses from Travelers	0.40	410.00
07/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and prepare notice to insurers counsel regarding use of protected documents from mediation	1.60	1,640.00
07/01/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with T. Long and Cognicion regarding clawback documents for Chubb and Liberty Productions	0.40	164.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with D.Cox re motion in limine and other issues raised by committee	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 201 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 11
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conferences with N.Monico re motion in limine	0.40	594.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Canada re document redaction issues and related conference with J.Harbour	0.40	594.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conferences with T.Long re clawback strategy and motion in limine	0.40	594.00
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze, finalize and send letter to counsel to insurers regarding use of protected documents from mediation	2.80	2,870.00
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze strategy and timing for filings related to Liberty adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee to discuss issues related to Insurers discovery and depositions	1.20	1,230.00
07/02/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with T. Long and Cognicion regarding clawback documents for Chubb and Liberty Productions	3.60	1,476.00
07/02/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze procedure for responding to and setting hearing on motion to withdraw regarding Liberty AP	0.60	417.00
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze issues related to discovery requests from counsel to Hartford	0.40	410.00
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze response from counsel to Chubb Insurers regarding use of protected documents from mediation and consider response to same	0.80	820.00
07/03/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Revise objection to Liberty Motion to withdraw per T.Brown's comments	1.40	973.00
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in 30(b)(6) of Committee	3.10	3,177.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 108 of 807

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 12
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee counsel to discuss discovery and depositions	0.80	820.00
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze issues related to Hartford's request for information (.80) and communications with Verita (.20) and K. Brinkman regarding the same (.30)	1.30	1,332.50
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze, prepare and send response to counsel to Chubb Insurers regarding use of protected documents from mediation	1.40	1,435.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with P.Barrett re HII's interest in reviewing objection to withdrawal of reference	0.10	148.50
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review committee motion to dismiss LMIC AP-related notice of hearing	0.40	594.00
07/03/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze VAED local rules regarding motions practice regarding Liberty motion to withdraw	0.30	208.50
07/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review and revise objection to motion to withdraw the reference	1.10	1,633.50
07/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review draft of motion to stay A.P. and consider strategy re same	0.40	594.00
07/04/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review draft of motion to dismiss LMIC A.P. and revise same	1.40	2,079.00
07/06/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Revise objection to Liberty Motion to withdraw	1.10	764.50
07/06/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review N.Monico mark-up and email re objection to LMIC motion to withdraw the reference	0.30	445.50
07/07/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Analysis of discovery materials to find responsive email to insurer's inquiry.	1.20	492.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 109 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 13
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/07/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze revised objection to Liberty motion to withdraw (.3); analyze Committee/FCR objections to withdrawal (.7); revise Debtor objection per the same (.9)	1.90	1,320.50
07/07/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Finalize Motion to Dismiss Liberty AP (.8); prepare notice of the same (.3).	1.20	834.00
07/07/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Address filing/service issues regarding objection to Liberty motion to withdraw/motion to dismiss complaint/notice of the same	0.60	417.00
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on motion to dismiss Liberty adversary proceeding	1.90	1,947.50
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on objection to Liberty's motion to withdraw the reference (.90), and communications with counsel to Huntington regarding the same and strategy (.50)	1.40	1,435.00
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to email from counsel to Liberty regarding use of mediation related documents (.60), including analyzing certain documents referenced by Liberty to confirm whether protected (.70)	1.30	1,332.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review committee objection to withdrawal of reference in LMIC A.P.	0.40	594.00
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review FCR's joinder to objection to withdrawal of reference	0.10	148.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review HII joinder to objection to withdraw the reference	0.10	148.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on objection to motion to withdraw the reference in LMIC Adv. Proc.	1.60	2,376.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Paggel 20 of 207

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLF CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brot FILE NUMBER: 040312.00000	hers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 14
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/07/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Work on motion to dismiss or abstain LMIC complaint	1.50	2,227.50
07/07/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Objection to Liberty's Motion to Withdraw and file Motion to Dismiss the Adversary Complaint in the Liberty Adversary Proceeding.	0.60	246.00
07/08/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Work on Witness and Exhibit List for July 14th Hearing	1.10	451.00
07/08/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Work on proposed agenda for July 14th Hearing	1.40	574.00
07/08/2025 DK DRAKE	B190	Assist with completing and finalizing memorandum of law.	1.20	492.00
07/08/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Review Landry & Swarn joinder to objection to withdrawal of reference in LMIC A.P. and motion to dismiss	0.10	148.50
07/08/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Review LMIC designation of record on appeal of claim denial and consider potential response	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on exhibit and witness list for confirmation hearing	0.80	820.00
07/08/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze matters scheduled for hearing on July 17 and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
07/08/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze communications from counsel to insurers regarding exchanging exhibit and witness lists	0.40	410.00
07/09/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Continue work on Proposed Agenda for July 14th Hearing and communications with Clerk regarding same	1.20	492.00
07/10/2025 T L CANADA	B190	Work on hearing materials in anticipation of July 14th hearing	2.30	943.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 25 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 15
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize preliminary exhibit and witness list (.70), serve same on insurers' counsel (.30), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.60)	1.60	1,640.00
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze response from counsel to insurers regarding discovery and briefing schedule and consider response to same	0.80	820.00
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Hartford's preliminary exhibit and witness list	0.30	307.50
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Travelers' preliminary exhibit and witness list	0.40	410.00
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Liberty's preliminary exhibit and witness list	0.60	615.00
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Chubb's preliminary exhibit and witness list	0.80	820.00
07/12/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Email to T.Canada re Veritext reduced invoice for payment	0.10	148.50
07/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to request from counsel to Travelers to endorse order approving motion to seal	0.70	717.50
07/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to request from counsel to Chubb to endorse order approving motion to seal	0.60	615.00
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Email with N.Monico re designation of record in LMIC appeal and time to supplement	0.10	148.50
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to Liberty regarding order approving motion to seal and analyze issues related to same	0.40	410.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Paggel 20 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 16
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Communications with Court reporter regarding deposition of Marc Scarcella	0.50	205.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to question from counsel to Travelers regarding order approving motion to seal	0.30	307.50
07/16/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze Chubb's brief filed in adversary.	0.80	716.00
07/17/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with N.Monico re motion to dismiss appeal strategy	0.10	148.50
07/17/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review additional motion to dismiss LMIC complaint and related notice of hearing	0.30	445.50
07/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze request for scheduling conference regarding Liberty adversary proceeding (.20) and related order, and communications with counsel to parties involved regarding the same (.50)	0.70	717.50
07/17/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Work on Brief in Support of Motion to Dismiss the Chubb District Court Appeal	1.10	451.00
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with N.Monico re additional designation of record for appeal by LMIC	0.10	148.50
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review numerous emails from counsel re LMIC AP pre-trial conference	0.20	297.00
07/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to parties involved in Liberty adversary proceeding regarding scheduling conference	0.30	307.50
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review email from K.Courington re deathbed deposition	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 23 of 207

HUNTON ANDRE CLIENT NAME: FILE NUMBER:	EWS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers, 040312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 17
DATE TIME	EKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/23/2025 B F	RBELL	B190	Review various comments on current confirmation brief (1.1); revise brief to incorporate same (1.4); incorporate additional authority to support certain arguments (.9): discuss strategy to address certain substantive issues (.5); prepare issues list for call with UCC on confirmation brief and open issues (.5); participate in call with UCC regarding primary open issues and views on same (1.2); summarize key issues from same (.4); further revisions, including clean-up, of confirmation brief (.8); summarize and direct additional research on targeted issues for confirmation brief (.3)	7.10	5,644.50
07/23/2025 TP	BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re Rule 26(f) conference with LMIC and counsel to co- defendants	0.10	148.50
07/24/2025 TP	BROWN	B190	Emails with K.Courington re upcoming deposition	0.10	148.50
07/25/2025 H F	PLONG, III	B190	Analyze orders regarding assignment of pending appeals and issues related to same	0.70	717.50
07/25/2025 TP	BROWN	B190	Review reply of LMIC on motion to withdraw the reference	0.40	594.00
07/25/2025 TP	BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re re-assignment of appeals to different D.Ct. judge	0.10	148.50
07/28/2025 N S	S MONICO	B190	Analyze various appeal regarding approaching deadlines (.3); discuss the same with T.Long (.2)	0.50	347.50
07/28/2025 H F	PLONG, III	B190	Analyze open items in Liberty adversary proceeding and strategy to address same	0.70	717.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaged 28 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	·	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 18
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/28/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review docket entries and re-assignment of appeals in D.Ct. cases	0.20	297.00
07/28/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider stay strategy re motion to dismiss/abstain and withdrawal motion	0.20	297.00
07/28/2025	B R BELL	B190	Assess strategic issues regarding recently-disclosed expert witness (.5); analyze relevant authorities in connection with motion on same (1.1).	1.60	1,272.00
07/29/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Consider strategy for preparing Chubb FCR Order appeal reply brief	0.20	139.00
07/29/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze exhibits listed on preliminary exhibit lists and work on objection to same	2.90	2,972.50
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review order from D.Ct. re appeal and transmittal of record notice	0.10	148.50
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review email from N.Monico and preliminary review of revised motion to dismiss appeal	0.40	594.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with N.Monico re filing corporate disclosure statement in D.Ct.	0.10	148.50
07/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on draft objection to exhibits on preliminary lists (1.40), and communications with counsel to Committee regarding the same (.40)	1.80	1,845.00
07/31/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Finalize and send objections to insurers' exhibits identified on preliminary exhibit list (.90), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	1.20	1,230.00
			TOTAL B190	79.40	
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Review C.Lascell timesheet	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Paggel 29 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 19
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails to UST re overage issue and treatment in MOR	0.30	445.50
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with UST re treatment of return of overage in MOR	0.20	297.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with UST re overage and re continuance of confirmation hearing	0.30	445.50
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze issues related to monthly operating report and communications with Stout regarding the same	0.40	410.00
07/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse funds paid in connection with Certain Settling Insurers Settlement	1.70	1,742.50
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse funds from certain settling insurers payment	1.70	1,742.50
07/17/2025	N S MONICO	B210	Consider whether bank statements must be filed with monthly operating reports	0.20	139.00
07/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze email from US Trustee regarding monthly operating reports and confirm issues related to same (.70), and communications with US Trustee (.30) and P. Barrett (.20) regarding the same	1.20	1,230.00
07/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and comment on monthly operating report (.80), and communications with Verita (.70) and C. Lascell (.20) regarding the same	1.70	1,742.50
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Review email from Stout and C.Lascell re monthly operating report	0.10	148.50
07/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse settlement funds and related exhibit	1.10	1,127.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plaggel 30 of 207

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LL CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Bro FILE NUMBER: 040312.00000	thers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 20
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/29/2025 H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse settlement funds and related exhibit	0.80	820.00
07/31/2025 T P BROWN	B210	Review C.Lascell timesheet for June	0.10	148.50
		TOTAL B210	9.90	
07/07/2025 T P BROWN	B310	Review email from committee counsel re comments on claims orders and conference with T.Long	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025 T L CANADA	B310	Prepare CNO and revised Order for the claim objection motions	0.40	164.00
07/08/2025 H P LONG, III	B310	Analyze email from Committee counsel regarding proposed language for orders approving objections to asbestos claims	0.40	410.00
07/09/2025 HPLONG, III	B310	Analyze and comment on form CNO for objections to asbestos claims and redline of proposed order related to same	0.50	512.50
07/09/2025 T L CANADA	B310	Continue work on preparing CNOs and revised Order for the claim objection motions	2.30	943.00
07/10/2025 HPLONG, III	B310	Analyze and address proposed language from Committee counsel to add to orders approving objections to asbestos claims (.70), and communications with Committee counsel regarding same (.40)	1.10	1,127.50
07/10/2025 TPBROWN	B310	Conference with T.Long and review related comments on orders resolving objections to asbestos claims	0.20	297.00
07/11/2025 HPLONG, III	B310	Analyze and comment on CNO for Zurich claim objection and submission of order related to same	0.30	307.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Page 137 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 21
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Prepare and electronically file revised Certificate of No Objection and Revised Orders and redline of Revised Order for the 11 Asbestos Claim Objections	3.80	1,558.00
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Work on Summary of Claim Objections	0.40	164.00
07/11/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Finalize and submit to the Court the Order granting the Claim Objections	1.20	492.00
07/11/2025	N S MONICO	B310	Analyze revised proposed orders regarding objections to proofs of claim based on Asbestos Claims	0.50	347.50
07/14/2025	N S MONICO	B310	Calculate deadline for making cross-designations in Liberty appeal of order disallowing its claim	0.20	139.00
07/14/2025	T P BROWN	B310	Conference with N.Monico re record on appeal of LMIC claim denial	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Analysis of orders granting claim objections for disallowing asbestos claims	0.70	287.00
07/18/2025	N S MONICO	B310	Prepare cross-designations regarding Liberty claim disallowance order appeal (.3); file the same (.2)	0.50	347.50
07/18/2025	T L CANADA	B310	Work on Cross designation on record of Liberty Appeal	0.50	205.00
			TOTAL B310	13.30	
07/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze documents produced in discovery in connection with confirmation	2.20	2,255.00
07/01/2025	J W HARBOUR	B320	Analysis of confirmation and discovery issues and communications with counsel	0.30	429.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 38 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 22
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/01/2025	B R BELL	B320	Incorporate additions to brief in support of confirmation to address recent developments, including order disallowing claims and adjournment of combined hearing (1.8); continued revision of brief in support of confirmation (2.9)	4.70	3,736.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re 30(b)(6) issues	0.10	148.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with J.Harbour and with T.Long re clawback issue and related strategy	0.30	445.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft standing objection re confidential mediation documents	0.30	445.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re plan issues	0.70	1,039.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re deposition results	0.20	297.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone call with C.Lascell after deposition re results and confirmation testimony	0.30	445.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Participate in depositions of Hopeman 30(b)(6)	5.50	8,167.50
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira mid-deposition of C.Lascell	0.20	297.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone call with C.Lascell prior to deposition	0.40	594.00
07/01/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition of corporate representative of Hopeman relating to chapter 11 plan.	4.50	4,950.00
07/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email with committee counsel re clawback strategy	0.20	297.00
07/02/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise draft brief in support of confirmation.	0.90	715.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 39 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		ners, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 23
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/02/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with counsel for Traveler's concerning potential plan objection (1.0); attention to correspondence related to same (.8); address issues relating to brief in support of Plan and strategy for responses (1.5).	3.30	3,630.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel re strategy on confirmation issues and anticipated objections	0.80	1,188.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review case law on prior 524(g) cases identified for brief	1.70	2,524.50
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on potential testimony and arguments to overcome expected objections	1.80	2,673.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re Wellington issues for plan clarifications and Hartford inquiry and conference with T.Long re same	0.30	445.50
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Travelers' supplement to discovery responses	0.10	148.50
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee objection re 30(b)(6) notice and related document production	0.40	594.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise proposed clawback letter and related conferences with T.Long	0.40	594.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira re Hartford call on plan issues and related strategy	0.20	297.00
07/02/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Internal Hunton email re conference room space for witness meetings for confirmation hearing	0.20	297.00
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on confirmation order	1.80	1,845.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 120 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 24
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/02/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on Tully declaration in support of confirmation	1.40	1,435.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re Chubb response to mediation clawback letter and reply	0.40	594.00
07/03/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law and declarations in support of same	2.30	2,357.50
07/03/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Prepare deposition and exhibit materials for T. Brown in anticipation of Confirmation Hearing	1.50	615.00
07/03/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Communications with Veritext regarding corrections to C. Lascell's deposition	0.20	82.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira and T.Long re briefing and evidentiary issues for confirmation and proposed committee call	0.50	742.50
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira and T.Long re Travelers issues with plan	0.40	594.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re clawback issues	0.30	445.50
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Outline potential objections to plan and strategies to respond	2.20	3,267.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone call with committee counsel re Wellington and CIP issues for plan revisions	0.60	891.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition of committee witness	2.90	4,306.50
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira re notice to Hartford of bankruptcy and related issues	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 25 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	ers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 25
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review revised declarations and related emails with T.Long	0.60	891.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Canada re transcript and exhibits for depositions and reporter issues	0.20	297.00
07/03/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continued review of relevant authorities regarding satisfaction of certain 524(g) conditions.	1.80	1,431.00
07/03/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Committee 30(b)(6) witness (2.5); address issues relating to confirmation brief and reply and begin review of same (1.3).	3.80	4,180.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re Hartford doc requests	0.20	297.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re clawback issues	0.10	148.50
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re review of transcript and proposed corrections	0.20	297.00
07/03/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re Wellington and discussion with K.Brinkman and R.Van Epps re same	0.20	297.00
07/04/2025	B R BELL	B320	Analyze relevant authorities regarding satisfaction of certain 524(g) conditions (3.0); further revise brief in support of confirmation based on same (4.0)	7.00	5,565.00
07/04/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Begin review of brief in support of confirmation.	3.00	3,300.00
07/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise proposed motion in limine re confidential mediation documents	0.50	742.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doodgreent PRagel 20 of 007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP INVOICE: 131827508 **CLIENT NAME:** Hopeman Brothers, Inc. DATE: 09/08/2025 FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007 PAGE: 26 DATE **TIMEKEEPER TASK DESCRIPTION HOURS VALUE** 07/05/2025 B R BELL B320 Review comments to draft 8.50 6,757.50 brief in support of confirmation (.8); incorporate same (.7); prepare additional inserts regarding underlying factual background (1.1); review relevant decisions on the so-called ongoing business requirement for purposes of 524(g) (2.0); revise certain confirmation brief arguments based on same (.9); in-depth analysis of Plan and various provisions of related plan supplement documents, including comparison of same to other recently-confirmed 524(g) plans (1.2); analyze post-Truck authorities on insurance-neutrality doctrine (.5): further revise confirmation brief based on same (.8); analyze relevant authorities regarding application of certain 1129 conditions to confirmation of 524(g) plan (.5). 07/05/2025 J P ROVIRA B320 Continue review of brief in 3.50 3.850.00 support of confirmation and attention to correspondence related to same. 07/05/2025 T P BROWN B320 Consider email from 0.20 297.00 J.Rovira re response strategy to Hartford requests 07/05/2025 T P BROWN B320 Review proposal from 0.20 297.00 committee on potential plan revision to address Wellington and consider J.Rovira email re same 07/06/2025 T P BROWN B320 Review emails from 0.20 297.00 J.Rovira and Hartford re potential plan objections 07/06/2025 T P BROWN B320 Review email from B.Bell re 0.40 594.00 current draft of brief and preliminary review of same Analyze Travelers' 07/07/2025 H P LONG, III B320 0.80 820.00 objection to plan

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 123 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 27
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Liberty's objection to plan	0.70	717.50
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Chubb's objection to plan	0.90	922.50
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from counsel to Liberty related to exchanging exhibit and witness lists for confirmation hearing	0.40	410.00
07/07/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Analysis of objections to the Chapter 11 Plan and Amended Disclosure Statement	0.80	328.00
07/07/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on proposed confirmation order	0.70	287.00
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Begin review of objections to plan	3.50	5,197.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re coordination of briefing issues and strategy for hearing	0.10	148.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re confidentiality of mediation documents and related emails	0.20	297.00
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with K.Brinkman re Wellington issues for plan provisions	0.20	297.00
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails from insurers re exhibits and witnesses and emails with J.Rovira and T.Long re same	0.40	594.00
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on confirmation order	1.10	1,127.50
07/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with counsel to Harford to discuss issues related to plan	0.70	717.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re confirmation evidence and related findings and order	0.50	742.50
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review motions to seal objections of insurers	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 128 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 28
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with Travelers' counsel re confidential documents	0.10	148.50
07/07/2025	B R BELL	B320	Coordinate on approach to addressing plan objections in draft confirmation brief (.7); Preliminary review of various plan objections (2.5)	3.20	2,544.00
07/07/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in meeting with counsel for Travelers concerning plan objection (1.0); begin review of objections filed by insurers (2.8).	3.80	4,180.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira, T.Long and B.Bell re preparation of brief and other pleadings responsive to objections	0.50	742.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review updated Chubb answers to discovery first disclosing expert witness	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from LMIC counsel re transcript designations and coordinating exhibits	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with K.Brinkman re Wellington issues for plan and response to objections	0.30	445.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences and emails with J.Rovira re plan objections and related strategy in response	0.50	742.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re meeting over expert and plan schedule	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with insurers' counsel re exhibit lists and bifurcation proposal	0.30	445.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee re proposed bifuraction strategy and related emails with J.Rovira	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Pagge 129 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 29
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel re responses to objections to plan and consider potential revisions	0.70	1,039.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel re potential bifurcation or continuance of confirmation hearing due to late disclosure of expert and report by Chubb insurers	0.80	1,188.00
07/08/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Analyze various objections to plan	0.40	278.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Hartford joinder to objections to plan	0.10	148.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re coordinating review of testimony with witnesses and review emails with T.Long and witnesses re same	0.30	445.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re circulating drafts of brief and other pleadings with committee counsel	0.20	297.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review report of new Chubb expert and consider strategy re same	1.00	1,485.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Begin review and outline of objections to plan confirmation	3.60	5,346.00
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy in light of expert report and additional evidence and arguments	1.30	1,930.50
07/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on list of outstanding issues to address for confirmation and consider related strategy	1.20	1,782.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding findings of fact and conclusions of law and issues and strategy related to same	1.20	1,230.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with C. Lascell and R. Van Epps regarding declarations in support of plan	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Dooument Paggel 20 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	1 1	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 30
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze voting certification (.50) and communications with Verita (.40) and Committee counsel (.30) regarding the same	1.20	1,230.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding US Trustee's comments to trust distribution procedures	0.40	410.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on memorandum in support of confirmation of plan	0.80	820.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Chubb expert report concerning plan confirmation and strategy related to same	1.20	1,230.00
07/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on summary of plan objections and proposed responses to the same	1.80	1,845.00
07/08/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue review of objections filed by various insurers (2.4); meet and discuss objections internally with B. Bell and T. Brown (.8); meet and discuss response to objections with Committee (1.0); address issues relating to strategy for responding to objections and address new expert report and attention to correspondence related to same (2.1).	6.30	6,930.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 127 of 207

HUNTON AND CLIENT NAME FILE NUMBER		Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 31
DATE T	IMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/08/2025 E	B R BELL	B320	Prepare packages of relevant plan objection filings (.8); direct preparation of trial binders using same (.5); confer with counsel on responses to various plan objections (.6); participate in call with Committee regarding same (.7); preliminary review of previously undisclosed expert's report (.4); continued review of plan objections (2.9); begin preparing outline of various objections raised and potential responses to same (1.7); review working draft of objection summary (.3); review correspondence regarding certain indemnity issues pertaining to insurance-adjacent agreements (.2); follow-up correspondence on same (.1).	8.20	6,519.00
07/09/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Telephone call with C.Lascell re continuance dates and related emails with C.Lascell, R.Van Epps, K.Brinkman and R.Mishkin	0.20	297.00
07/09/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review draft of debtor and committee's exhibit and witness list for confirmation hearing	0.20	297.00
07/09/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review insurers' emails re exchanging witness lists and related conference with T.Long	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 128 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	'	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 32
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/09/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Attention to correspondence relating to continuance of hearing and revised dates for confirmation hearing (1.0); participate in multiple calls with insurers relating to same (1.5); participate in calls with Committee relating to same (1.0); continue to review objections to Plan and address strategy for responding to same (3.5).	7.00	7,700.00
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on summary of objections to plan and proposed responses to address same	4.70	4,817.50
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Verita regarding new hearing date and voting certification	0.40	410.00
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on preliminary exhibit and witness list for confirmation hearing, (.70) and communications with committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.10	1,127.50
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with chambers regarding new dates for confirmation hearing following Chubb's expert	0.40	410.00
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with counsel to insurers regarding discovery and briefing schedule following Chubb's expert	0.70	717.50
07/09/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues related to discovery and briefing scheduling and confirmation hearing date following Chubb's expert report	1.40	1,435.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 29 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 33
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/09/2025	B R BELL	B320	Prepare for (.5) and participate in call with objecting insurers regarding witnesses and exhibits for combined hearing (.9); follow-up call with Committee counsel (.7); discuss research necessary for certain responses to plan objections (.7); prepare summary of relevant issues and direct targeted research into same (1.4); review of certain authorities cited in plan objections for purposes of preparing responses to same (2.2)	6.40	5,088.00
07/09/2025	J W HARBOUR	B320	Analysis of plan and scheduling issues and communications with counsel	0.20	286.00
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from P.Barrett re proposed HII changes to plan	0.10	148.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Calls with insurer group and with committee counsel re confirmation continuance, filings schedule and consider related issues	2.20	3,267.00
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with J.Rovira and with T.Long re briefing and exhibit schedules	0.50	742.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long and J.Rovira re chart on objections, responses and brief and consider same	0.50	742.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on declarations and responses to objections to confirmation	0.80	1,188.00
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Complete review of objections to confirmation	1.80	2,673.00
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps, Ross Mishkin and C.Lascell re continuation of confirmation hearing	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 30 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 34
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails and call with committee counsel re potential continuance of confirmation hearing	0.30	445.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re calls with chambers re potential continuance dates or bifurcation and consider strategy re same	0.50	742.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira and T.Long re responses to insurer comments on schedule and related strategy	0.30	445.50
07/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with B.Bell re research issues for confirmation brief and consider same	0.20	297.00
07/10/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Research relevant case law regarding liquidation and court approval of plans for liquidation	2.50	1,737.50
07/10/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Research in support of confirmation brief	1.40	973.00
07/10/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Research 524(g) relevant case law and system treatment	2.00	1,390.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on pre-confirmation schedule and related responses to proposals	0.30	445.50
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with J.Rovira re briefing schedule and related issues for confirmation hearing	0.40	594.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re preliminary disclosures of witnesses and exhibits and related emails with J.Rovira	0.40	594.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review insurers' preliminary witness and exhibit lists	0.60	891.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re review of objection/response chart for confirmation brief	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 135 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 35
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails and conference with J.Rovira and committee counsel re additional responses to dispute over schedule for confirmation filings	0.20	297.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with K.Courington re upcoming LM trials	0.20	297.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with B.Bell re additional research for confirmation issues	0.20	297.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review results of research on confirmation issues from R.Rubin	0.40	594.00
07/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review drafts of chart for objections and responses for debtor's brief in support of confirmation and reply to objections	1.10	1,633.50
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Continue to analyze issues related to discovery and briefing schedule for confirmation hearing	1.10	1,127.50
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to FCR regarding adjournment of confirmation hearing and discovery and briefing schedule	0.30	307.50
07/10/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on summary of objections to plan and proposed responses to same	2.10	2,152.50
07/10/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to revised confirmation schedule and attention to correspondence related to same (1.8); continue review of objections to Plan and preparation of responses to same (3.0); discuss same with B. Bell (1.0).	5.80	6,380.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 30 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 36
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/10/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review proposals regarding further adjournment of combined hearing, including proposed dates and deadlines for filing briefing and other relevant documents in connection with same (.3); review revised summation of plan objections (.2); revise to incorporate various additions (.9); review completed research on 524(g) and 1129 issues (1.8); summarize additional issues and direct research into same (.7);	3.90	3,100.50
07/11/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Research in support of confirmation brief	1.80	1,251.00
07/11/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Research liquidation plan case law, focusing on issues of U.S.C Code 1141(d)(3)(B)	2.00	1,390.00
07/11/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Review Asbestos Trust Agreement, taking relevant note of fiduciary duty provisions and language useful for reply to Chubb objection	1.60	1,112.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft responses on briefing schedule for continued confirmation hearing	0.50	742.50
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira and with insurers' counsel on proposed confirmation briefing schedule	0.20	297.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone calls and emails with D.Foley to finalize preconfirmation briefing schedule	0.40	594.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira and others re arguments in response to insurer objections to plan	0.90	1,336.50
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on responses to objections to plan and related confirmation hearing strategy	1.70	2,524.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 133 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 37
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with K.Courington re confirmation hearing delay and related insurer issues	0.20	297.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with P.Santelle and committee counsel re deposition date of expert for Chubb and consider logistics	0.20	297.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps and review related revisions to preliminary draft of outline	0.40	594.00
07/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re calls with chambers and re notice of adjournment and sealing motions	0.40	594.00
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues related to discovery and briefing schedule in connection with confirmation hearing	0.90	922.50
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and prepare notice of adjournment of confirmation hearing (.60), and communications with chambers concerning the same (.10)	0.70	717.50
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of confirmation of plan	4.10	4,202.50
07/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on summary of plan objections and responses to same (1.70), and communications with counsel to Committee regarding the same (.60)	2.30	2,357.50
07/11/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in meeting to review responses to Plan Objections (2.0); continue review of plan objections and strategy for responding to same (1.5); attention to correspondence relating to schedule for Plan and deadlines related to discovery (1.3).	4.80	5,280.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 133 of 207

	S KURTH LLP lopeman Brothers, 40312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 38
DATE TIMEKE	EPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/11/2025 BRB	ELL	B320	Prepare for (.4) and participate in strategy call regarding plan objections and suggested responses to same (1.1); review completed research into additional 524(g) issues (1.7); conduct additional research into certain issues flagged in same (1.2); begin substantiating proposed responses with supportive authorities (1.9).	6.30	5,008.50
07/12/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re meeting for discussion of testimony and expert report	0.10	148.50
07/12/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Review proposed order and brief re confirmation and related pleadings	0.70	1,039.50
07/13/2025 R RUE	BIN	B320	Research Delaware statutory trust fiduciary duties law	1.90	1,320.50
07/13/2025 R RUE	BIN	B320	Draft research memo synthesizing Trust Agreement fiduciary duties language and relevant applicability of Delaware law	1.10	764.50
07/13/2025 NSM	IONICO	B320	Finalize research in support of confirmation brief	0.80	556.00
07/13/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Consider N.Monico's research re exclusivity issue and consider related strategy	0.20	297.00
07/13/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Review expert report and consider potential responses	2.20	3,267.00
07/14/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re exclusivity motion and related strategy	0.20	297.00
07/14/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Work on strategy re expert rebuttal and deposition	0.60	891.00
07/14/2025 TPBI	ROWN	B320	Telephone call with R.Van Epps, C.Lascell and T.Long on potential testimony and re Chubb's expert report	0.80	1,188.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 139 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLF CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brott FILE NUMBER: 040312.000000	ners, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 39
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/14/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Complete review of Chubb's expert report and outline issues	1.20	1,782.00
07/14/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Email to and from J.Rovira re expert report discussion with committee	0.20	297.00
07/14/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re proposed call with FTI on expert report issues	0.10	148.50
07/14/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re orders to seal objections to plan confirmation	0.10	148.50
07/14/2025 HPLONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy to address Chubb's expert report	1.70	1,742.50
07/14/2025 HPLONG, III	B320	Analyze issues related to exclusivity and prepare motion to extend exclusive periods	2.70	2,767.50
07/14/2025 HPLONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on arguments for brief in support of plan and reply to objections	1.40	1,435.00
07/14/2025 J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to reply and brief in support of confirmation.	1.80	1,980.00
07/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re call on expert report issues and related emails with J.Rovira	0.20	297.00
07/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re UST refusal to endorse sealing orders for plan objections	0.10	148.50
07/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re brief status and related arguments to be addressed	0.50	742.50
07/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review earlier expert reports for comparison against new report on certain issues	1.10	1,633.50
07/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review draft notice of deposition and conference with T.Canada re coordinating court reporter	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:53 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 150 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 40
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re expert issues	0.40	594.00
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re expert deposition date and time and emails with Chubb counsel re same	0.20	297.00
07/15/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on Third Motion to Extend Exclusivity Period	0.20	82.00
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Email with Chubb's counsel re deposition and wire to Gen Re of overage	0.10	148.50
07/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise exclusivity extension motion and related conference with T.Long on strategy	0.50	742.50
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on third motion to extend exclusivity	0.90	922.50
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Scarcella expert report regarding liquidation analysis and strategy to address same	2.70	2,767.50
07/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on arguments in support of reply to plan objections	2.40	2,460.00
07/15/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to response and brief in support of confirmation and attention to correspondence related to same (1.0); review Scarcella report and address issues relating to same (1.3).	2.30	2,530.00
07/16/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in call concerning Scarcella report (1.0); continue to address open issues relating to reply and brief in support of confirmation and attention to correspondence related to same (1.5).	2.50	2,750.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from committee counsel re decision supporting LA approach and begin review of same	0.50	742.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plaggel 37 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 41
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re draft arguments for brief and review emails from B.Bell re same	0.40	594.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with J.Rovira re committee call	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re FTI/committee call	0.10	148.50
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re post-call strategy on expert and plan issues	0.40	594.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee advisors, Stout and Hunton lawyers on expert report and related strategy	1.60	2,376.00
07/16/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for call on expert issues with committee counsel and Stout	0.80	1,188.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee professionals to discuss Scarcella report and strategy related to same	1.80	1,845.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to parties in interest regarding link for Scarcella deposition	0.40	410.00
07/16/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of plan	5.30	5,432.50
07/16/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review relevant precedent regarding certain 524(g) issues (4.7); analyze research summary, including cases cited therein on 1129 issues (1.9); further revise brief in support of confirmation (3.3); confer on strategic issues pertaining to plan objections (.9)	10.80	8,586.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:53 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 98 of 207

HUNTON AND CLIENT NAME FILE NUMBER	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 42
DATE T	IMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/17/2025 E	3 R BELL	B320	Further review of expert report submitted by certain insurers objecting to the Plan (.2); confer on issues regarding same (.3); direct research into prior testimony by expert in advance of scheduled deposition (.6)	1.10	874.50
07/17/2025 J	P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues in advance of Scarcella deposition and attention to correspondence related to same (1.5); discuss issues related to open items in advance of confirmation with T. Brown (.5); review revised brief in support of confirmation (1.5).	3.50	3,850.00
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review proposed revisions to plan and related committee emails	0.20	297.00
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review emails with J.Rovira re expert testimony investigation	0.20	297.00
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review expert reports and draft list of challenge points for deposition and potential rebuttal	3.40	5,049.00
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re expert issues and confirmation strategy	0.30	445.50
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re confirmation brief and reply strategy	0.30	445.50
07/17/2025 H	I P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on confirmation brief	2.60	2,665.00
07/17/2025 F	HP LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy related to addressing Chubb expert report	1.60	1,640.00
07/17/2025 T	P BROWN	B320	Review and revise confirmation brief and consider responses to objections	3.50	5,197.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 159 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 43
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/18/2025	B R BELL	B320	Participate in call regarding research into expert witness's prior testimony (.2); review feedback on latest iteration of confirmation brief (.9); incorporate comments reflected in same (1.7); further revise brief to incorporate further comments and clean-up (1.4); highlight certain issues for Committee counsel and provide updated draft of brief along with inquiries on same (.4); preliminary review initial UCC comments to confirmation brief (.3)	5.10	4,054.50
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re sending draft to committee	0.10	148.50
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re revisions to brief	0.10	148.50
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee counsel edits to brief	0.30	445.50
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira and team re brief and related comments	0.20	297.00
07/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise brief for confirmation	3.10	4,603.50
07/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of plan and reply to objections	1.60	1,640.00
07/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on modifications to plan to address insurers' objections	1.40	1,435.00
07/18/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Prepare outline for expert testimony research chart	0.30	208.50
07/18/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Research past testimony of Chubb expert	0.80	556.00
07/19/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Prepare expert testimony research chart, compiling and summarizing expert Scarella's previous testimony and declarations in various cases	2.30	1,598.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 150 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 44
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review R.Van Epps declaration	0.70	1,039.50
07/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on potential questions for expert deposition	2.20	3,267.00
07/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on expert rebuttal issues	0.80	1,188.00
07/20/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Analyze prior expert testimony given by Scarcella	1.80	1,251.00
07/20/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Complete and prepare expert testimony research chart, compiling and summarizing expert Scarella's previous testimony and declarations in various cases	2.80	1,946.00
07/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on voting certification (1.10), and communications with Verita regarding the same (.30)	1.40	1,435.00
07/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze materials in connection with strategy related to Chubb's expert report	1.80	1,845.00
07/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and address comments from Committee to brief in support of plan and reply to objections	2.90	2,972.50
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re confirmation objections and strategy re responses	0.50	742.50
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Canada re deposition on 7/23	0.10	148.50
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review case law for responses to plan objections	1.80	2,673.00
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re call on expert issues with FTI and Stout	0.20	297.00
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation brief and related responses to plan objections	3.30	4,900.50
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re confirmation brief	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 155 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 45
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from C.Lascell re potential issues for testimony	0.10	148.50
07/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review expert report and related documents to prepare for 7/23 deposition and work on outline for same	4.30	6,385.50
07/21/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review and revise reply and brief in support of confirmation.	4.20	4,620.00
07/21/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review research into recently-disclosed expert's prior testimony (.3); summarize takeaways regarding same in correspondence regarding deposition preparation (.2); review correspondence regarding certain issues raised in plan objections, including potential plan modifications (.7); review confirmation brief inserts (.7); confer on issues with same (.3); revise confirmation brief to incorporate UCC comments (2.9); complete draft argument addressing purported conflicts of issues raised by certain insurers (1.4); refine arguments based on further research (2.5)	9.00	7,155.00
07/21/2025	R RUBIN	B320	Prepare expert testimony excerpts Egnyte folder for B. Bell and J. Rovira	0.30	208.50
07/22/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on Table of Authorities for Memorandum of Law in Support of Motion Approving the Plan	3.80	1,558.00
07/22/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Analysis of M. Scarcella workpapers and materials used for expert report	0.50	205.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 30 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 46
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of plan and reply to objections (3.10), and communications with counsel to Committee regarding the same (.80)	3.90	3,997.50
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Verita regarding voting certification	0.60	615.00
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to parties in interest regarding Scarcella deposition	0.20	205.00
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze issues and strategy related to hearing on exclusivity extension motion	0.40	410.00
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze work papers provided in connection with Scarcella expert report (.70), and communications with counsel to Chubb regarding the same (.20)	0.90	922.50
07/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in Scarcella deposition preparation call with Committee professionals	1.90	1,947.50
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with J.Rovira re expert and plan issues	0.80	1,188.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel and FTI re issues for deposition of Marc Scarcella	1.40	2,079.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re updated draft of confirmation brief	0.20	297.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review case law on issues raised in objections to plan for brief and deposition issues	1.60	2,376.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with Roussel firm re deposition	0.10	148.50
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re deposition prep and conferences with T.Long re same	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 153 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	The state of the s	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 47
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review workpapers from Chubb's counsel for deposition	1.30	1,930.50
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review revised voting certification and related email and conference with T.Long	0.20	297.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails from committee counsel re brief inserts	0.20	297.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review FTI's issues for deposition and consider outline additions	0.40	594.00
07/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for deposition of Marc Scarcella and review documents and reports for same	6.70	9,949.50
07/22/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in call in advance of Scarcella deposition (1.0); continue to review and comment on reply and brief in support of confirmation (4.2)	5.20	5,720.00
07/22/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise brief in support of confirmation (1.2); careful review of additional inserts for confirmation brief, including analysis of authorities cited in same (1.5); in-depth review and revision of inserts (2.2); continued revision of confirmation brief (1.7)	6.60	5,247.00
07/22/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continued review of draft modifications to Plan (.2): review 524(g) plan precedent to assess provisions used to addressed various issues (1.9); draft various proposed modifications to plan based on same (.7)	2.80	2,226.00
07/23/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on deposition preparation materials for M. Scarcella deposition	0.20	82.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 153 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 48
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/23/2025	J W HARBOUR	B320	Analysis of plan confirmation and related issues and communications with counsel	0.30	429.00
07/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in scheduling conference related to Liberty adversary proceeding (.50), and communications with counsel to Huntington (.20) and Committee (.20) regarding the same	0.90	922.50
07/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Work on finalizing voting certification (.50), and communications with Verita (.20) and Committee counsel (.40) regarding the same	1.10	1,127.50
07/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of plan and reply to objections (1.60), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.70)	2.30	2,357.50
07/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Participate in Scarcella deposition and analyze and prepare issues raised in same	2.30	2,357.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for deposition of Marc Scarcella	2.40	3,564.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conduct deposition of Marc Scarcella	3.50	5,197.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone call with D.Cox re deposition issues	0.20	297.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re deposition issues and emails	0.20	297.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re confirmation brief and related committee call and outstanding issues	0.40	594.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider potential rebuttal strategy for liquidation analysis	0.30	445.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation brief and review potential additions and revisions	4.40	6,534.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Doormeent Plage 159 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	· ·	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 49
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Canada re exhibits brief for deposition	0.30	445.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re committee call on open issues and related emails to and from B.Bell	0.20	297.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and comment on certification of vote and related conference with T.Long	0.30	445.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with FTI and committee counsel re potential expert rebuttal report	0.20	297.00
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and consider response to joint brief request of committee counsel	0.10	148.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira re liquidation analysis issues	0.10	148.50
07/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long and with B.Bell re issues to address in confirmation brief	0.50	742.50
07/23/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to review and revise draft reply and brief in support of confirmation (2.0); prepare for and participate in Scarcella deposition (3.5); prepare for and participate in call with Committee concerning comments to reply and brief in support of confirmation (1.7).	7.20	7,920.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 160 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 50
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/24/2025	B R BELL	B320	Prepare for (.3) and participate in call with advisors on status of confirmation brief, including primary open issues and approach to responding to same (1.1); follow-up discussion with committee counsel regarding confirmation brief and outstanding issues in same (.9); review draft language to potentially be included as plan modification and in confirmation order (.2); revise same (.6); review of further comments from counsel and UCC on brief (1.8); revise brief based on same (3.5)	8.40	6,678.00
07/24/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with T. Brown and B. Bell concerning reply and brief in support of confirmation (1.4); prepare for and participate in call with Committee concerning reply and brief (1.0); review changes to brief and attention to correspondence related to same (2.5).	4.90	5,390.00
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel re arguments for brief and other strategic issues	0.90	1,336.50
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with committee counsel re additional comments to brief and potential plan changes	0.30	445.50
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review proposed revisions to brief from committee counsel	0.30	445.50
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review inserts to plan from J.Rovira	0.30	445.50
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with B.Bell re changes to brief and additional comments on arguments	0.40	594.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 167 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 51
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re committee discussion results and proposed revisions to insert in plan	0.30	445.50
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re issues with committee on plan and brief	0.40	594.00
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira and B.Bell re plan issues to discuss with committee	0.90	1,336.50
07/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on brief in support of plan and reply to objections	4.80	4,920.00
07/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding motion to extend exclusive periods	0.50	512.50
07/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding voting certification	0.40	410.00
07/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee counsel to discuss open items related to brief in support of plan and reply to objections	2.10	2,152.50
07/24/2025	N S MONICO	B320	Research disclosure requirements under 1129(a)(5)	1.60	1,112.00
07/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation brief and related reply arguments	6.80	10,098.00
07/25/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on and electronically file the Memorandum of Law in Support of Motion Approving the Plan	3.80	1,558.00
07/25/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Prepare exhibits to and electronically file Voting Certification of Jeffrey Miller	0.60	246.00
07/25/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Finalize and electronically file Notice of and Third Exclusivity Motion	0.30	123.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 168 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 52
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Finalize voting certification (.60), and communications with Verita (.30) and counsel to Committee (.20) regarding the same	1.10	1,127.50
07/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize third motion to extend exclusivity periods	1.30	1,332.50
07/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze summary of issues following Scarcella deposition and strategy related to same	1.40	1,435.00
07/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on finalizing brief in support of confirmation of plan and reply to objections (3.10), and multiple communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.70)	3.80	3,895.00
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review multiple versions of revisions to confirmation brief	1.80	2,673.00
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Final revisions to brief	1.30	1,930.50
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re additional revisions for brief	0.30	445.50
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with FTI and committee counsel re expert rebuttal strategy	0.40	594.00
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review outline of potential rebuttal points on liquidation analysis	0.20	297.00
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re brief comments	0.20	297.00
07/25/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re exclusivity motion	0.10	148.50
07/25/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to finalizing and filing reply and brief in support of confirmation.	2.50	2,750.00
07/25/2025	B R BELL	B320	Finalize confirmation brief.	6.20	4,929.00
07/28/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review open items for upcoming confirmation hearing and address issues related to same.	1.50	1,650.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plage 169 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 53
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy for motion to exclude testimony by Chubb's expert at confirmation hearing	1.60	1,640.00
07/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze open items to prepare for confirmation hearing and strategy to address same (.90), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.30	1,332.50
07/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation of plan	1.80	1,845.00
07/28/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with committee counsel and FTI re expert rebuttal issues and consider strategy	0.20	297.00
07/28/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call from J.Rovira re upcoming deadlines and consider strategy re same	0.10	148.50
07/28/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on witness declarations for confirmation and review case law for confirmation hearing	1.40	2,079.00
07/29/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Continue to analyze open items for confirmation hearing and strategy to address same	1.60	1,640.00
07/29/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on proposed confirmation order and strategy for entry of same	3.10	3,177.50
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft to-do list for confirmation hearing and proposed deadlines for drafts and filing	0.80	1,188.00
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re to-do list items and timing and assignments	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 160 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	hers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 54
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with J.Rovira re assignments and deadlines for pleadings/filings and revised strategy	0.50	742.50
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise draft of 3 declarations for confirmation hearing	2.20	3,267.00
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise proposed objections to objecting insurers' exhibits and related research for same	1.30	1,930.50
07/29/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re objections to exhibits and related conference withT.Long	0.30	445.50
07/29/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to strategy for open items in advance of confirmation hearing (1.3); prepare for and participate in call with internal team regarding same (1.0); follow up discussion with B. Bell regarding same (.5).	2.80	3,080.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re objections to exhibits of objecting insurers and revise same	0.50	742.50
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Canada re transcript of deposition of Scarcella	0.10	148.50
07/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze precedent and strategy for submitting findings of fact and proposed confirmation to district court in connection with 524(g) plan	1.60	1,640.00
07/30/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on confirmation order	3.80	3,895.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re confirmation order and findings strategy	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/13/25 Entered 09/13/25 14:39:55 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 165 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	others, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131827508 09/08/2025 55
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
07/30/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues in advance of and strategy for confirmation hearing and attention to correspondence related to same.	1.50	1,650.00
07/30/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review transcript designations for objections	0.60	891.00
07/31/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation of plan	6.10	6,252.50
07/31/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation hearing issues and strategy	0.60	891.00
07/31/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re motion in limine	0.10	148.50
07/31/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review objections of Travelers and related email to objectors	0.20	297.00
07/31/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re revisions to objections to exhibits from committee counsel	0.10	148.50
			TOTAL B320	497.20	
			TOTAL HOURS	660.80	
TIMEKEEPER SI	JMMARY:				
TIMEKEEPER		STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
T P BROWN	١	Partner	172.20	1,485.00	255,717.00
J W HARBO)UR	Partner	0.80	1,430.00	1,144.00
J P ROVIRA	١	Partner	87.20	1,100.00	95,920.00
H P LONG,	III	Counsel	176.10	1,025.00	180,502.50
B R BELL		Associate	109.60	795.00	87,132.00
N S MONIC	0	Associate	23.70	695.00	16,471.50
C A RANKIN	N	Associate	14.40	895.00	12,888.00
R RUBIN		Associate	16.80	695.00	11,676.00
T L CANAD		Paralegal	58.80	410.00	24,108.00
D K DRAKE		Paralegal	1.20	410.00	492.00
		TOTAL FEES	(\$)		686,051.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1204 Filed 09/15/25 Entered 09/15/25 14:39:53 Desc Main Diponment Plaged 60 of 007

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.

DATE: 09/08/2025

FILE NUMBER:	040312.0000007	PAGE:	56

I IIVIE SUIVIN	MARY BY TASK CODE:		
CODE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
B110	Case Administration	6.50	5,343.00
B130	Asset Disposition	3.70	5,494.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	0.50	650.50
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	36.70	24,469.00
B170	Fee / Employment Objections	13.60	13,159.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	79.40	73,155.00
B210	Business Operations	9.90	10,587.50
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	13.30	7,747.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	497.20	545,445.50
		660.80	686,051.00

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

TIME CHMMADY BY TACK CODE.

CODE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E101	Copying	1,135.10
E106	Online Research	2,270.48
E115	Deposition Transcripts	9,156.43
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	12,596.30
E124	Pacer services for the period 04/02/2025 to 06/30/2025	150.80
TOTAL CU	IRRENT EXPENSES (\$)	25.309.11

INVOICE SUMMARY:

 Current Fees:
 \$ 686,051.00

 Current Charges:
 25,309.11

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 711,360.11

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*) Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) 600 Travis Street, Suite 4200 Houston, Texas 77002 Telephone: (713) 220-4200

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072) Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134) Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, Virginia 23219 Telephone: (804) 788-8200

Counsel for Debtor and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA RICHMOND DIVISION

In re:	: : Chapter 11
HOPEMAN BROTHERS, INC.,	: Case No. 24-32428 (KLP)
Debtor.	: :
	: :

THIRTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP AS BANKRUPTCY COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM AUGUST 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2025

Name of Applicant:	Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Name of Client:	Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Debtor and Debtor in Possession
Date of retention order entered:	September 9, 2024, effective as of June 30, 2024 [Docket No. 163]
Time Period Covered:	August 1, 2025 through August 31, 2025
Total Fees Requested:	\$503,948.80 (80% of \$629,936.00)
Total Expenses Requested:	\$10,256.62
Type of Fee Statement:	Monthly ¹

Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement shall be served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order (as defined herein) and objections to payment of the amounts described in this Monthly Fee Statement shall be addressed in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

Pursuant to sections 330, and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedures of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Virginia (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), and the Order (I) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals and (II) Granting Related Relief entered September 9, 2024 [Docket No. 162] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP ("Hunton"), counsel for Hopeman Brothers, Inc., as debtor and debtor in possession (the "Debtor"), hereby submits this monthly fee statement (the "Monthly Fee Statement") for the allowance of compensation for the reasonable and necessary legal services rendered by Hunton for the period from August 1, 2025 through and including August 31, 2025 (the "Fee Period") and reimbursement of the actual and necessary expenses that Hunton incurred during the Fee Period. By this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton seeks allowance of compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$629,936.00 and payment in the amount of \$503,948.80 (which equals 80% of the compensation sought herein). Hunton also seeks allowance and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$10,256.62.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

- 1. In support of this Monthly Fee Statement, Hunton has attached the following:
 - Exhibit A is a summary schedule of hours and fees covered by this Monthly Fee Statement, categorized by project code.
 - <u>Exhibit B</u> is a summary schedule of the time expended by all Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals engaged in the representation of the Debtor during the Fee Period.
 - <u>Exhibit C</u> is a summary of the expenses incurred by Hunton during the Fee Period.
 - Exhibit D is a detailed invoice for the hours expended and fees incurred by Hunton professionals and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period.

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:48 Desc Main Document Page 455 of 52507

Representations

2. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred in

the Fee Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Monthly Fee Statement due

to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Hunton reserves the right

to make further application to this Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included

herein. Subsequent fee statements and applications will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy

Code, Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, and Interim Compensation Order.

Notice

3. Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has been provided to all necessary parties in

accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, Hunton respectfully requests payment of its reasonable and necessary fees

and expenses incurred during the Fee Period in the total amount of \$514,205.42, consisting of (i)

\$503,948.80, which is 80% of the fees incurred by the Debtor for reasonable and necessary

professional services rendered by Hunton during the Fee Period, and (ii) \$10,256.62 for actual and

necessary costs and expenses.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

3

Dated: October 13, 2025

Richmond, Virginia

/s/ Henry P. (Toby) Long, III

Tyler P. Brown (VSB No. 28072)

Henry P. (Toby) Long, III (VSB No. 75134)

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

Riverfront Plaza, East Tower

951 East Byrd Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone: (804) 788-8200 Facsimile: (804) 788-8218

Email: tpbrown@HuntonAK.com

hlong@HuntonAK.com

- and -

Joseph P. Rovira (admitted *pro hac vice*)

Catherine A. Rankin (admitted *pro hac vice*) **HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP**

600 Travis Street, Suite 4200

Houston, TX 77002

Telephone: (713) 220-4200

Facsimile: (713) 220-4285

Email: josephrovira@HuntonAK.com

crankin@HuntonAK.com

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

EXHIBIT A Statement of Fees by Subject Matter during the Fee Period

Matter Code	Matter Description	Hours	Fees Requested
B110	Case Administration	8.9	\$4,801.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	0.2	\$205.00
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	22.8	\$15,464.00
B170	Fee / Employment Objections	15.1	\$16,691.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption /	60.5	\$67,533.50
D190	rejection motions)		
B195	Non-Working Travel	11.0	\$6,050.00
B210	Business Operations	8.2	\$9,258.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business	438.6	\$509,933.00
D320	Plan)		
	Total	565.3	\$629,936.00

EXHIBIT B

Professionals Rendering Services during the Fee Period

The Hunton attorneys who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee Period include:

Professional	Position	Year Admitted	Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. P. Brown	Partner	1987	Bankruptcy	\$1,485	195.9	\$290,911.50
J. P. Rovira	Partner	2008	Bankruptcy	\$1,100	77.7	\$85,470.00
J. P. Rovira – Travel Rate	Partner	2008	Bankruptcy	\$550	11.0	\$6,050.00
H. P. Long III	Counsel	2007	Bankruptcy	\$1,025	165.3	\$169,432.50
C. A. Rankin	Associate	2018	Bankruptcy	\$895	7.2	\$6,444.00
B. R. Bell	Associate	2021	Bankruptcy	\$795	61.4	\$48,813.00
N. S. Monico	Associate	2023	Bankruptcy	\$695	13.2	\$9,174.00
				Totals	531.7	\$616,295.00

Hunton paraprofessionals who rendered professional services in these cases during the Fee

Period include:

Paraprofessional	Position	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
T. L. Canada	Paralegal	Bankruptcy	\$410	30.9	\$12,669.00
N. R. Moosani	Case Clerk	Litigation	\$360	2.7	\$972.00
			Totals	33.6	\$13,641.00

EXHIBIT C Summary of Expenses Incurred during the Fee Period

Туре	Expenses
Online Research	\$501.75
Copying	\$660.50
Local Travel	\$124.00
Out-of-Town Travel	\$1,348.92
Meals	\$144.90
Deposition Transcripts	\$1,510.80
Trial Transcripts	\$2,855.90
Litigation Support Vendors	\$3,109.85
TOTAL EXPE	NSES: \$10,256.62

EXHIBIT D

Detailed Invoice of Fees and Expenses Incurred During the Fee Period

HUNTON

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE:

040312.0000007 131828276 09/30/2025

CLIENT NAME:

Hopeman Brothers, Inc.

BILLING ATTORNEY:

TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending August 31, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

 Current Fees:
 \$ 629,936.00

 Current Charges:
 10,256.62

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 640,192.62

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131828276, Date:09/30/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP Routing Number: 021052053

Account Number: 72561654

To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N



HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE SUMMARY-REMITTANCE PAGE

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE: 040312.0000007 131828276 09/30/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

Statement for professional services and charges rendered in connection with the referenced matter(s), for the period ending August 31, 2025 per the attached itemization:

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY:

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

 Current Fees:
 \$ 629,936.00

 Current Charges:
 10,256.62

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 640,192.62

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES, PLEASE CALL: 804-788-8555

Information with Payment: File: 040312.0000007, Inv: 131828276, Date:09/30/2025

To Pay by Mail: HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP PO BOX 405759

ATLANTA, GA 30384-5759

To Pay by ACH:

Company Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Routing Number: 021052053 Account Number: 72561654 To Pay by Wire Transfer:

Bank: Bank of America, Richmond, VA Account Name: Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP

Account Number: 334003060563

ABA Transit: 026009593; Swift Code: BOFAUS3N

HUNTON

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP 600 TRAVIS, STE. 4200 HOUSTON, TX 77002

TEL 713 • 220 • 4200

EIN 54-0572269

INVOICE DETAIL

Hopeman Brothers, Inc. Attn: Christopher Lascell 6 Auburn Court

Brookline, MA 02446-6380

FILE NUMBER: INVOICE NUMBER: DATE: 040312.0000007 131828276 09/30/2025

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.
BILLING ATTORNEY: TIMOTHY A DAVIDSON

RE: (Hunton # 040312.0000007) Potential Bankruptcy or Restructuring

FOR PROFESSION	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED	THROUGH AU	IGUST 31, 2025:		
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/07/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Finalize and electronically file Notice of Motions and Notice of Hearing	0.20	82.00
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Emails with T.Canada re transcripts and payment of reporter invoices	0.10	148.50
08/12/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Work on Proposed Agenda for August 21, 2025 Hearing	2.60	1,066.00
08/12/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service of doc. nos. 1088, 1089, 1090	0.20	82.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
08/13/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Continue work on Proposed Agenda for August 21st hearing and communications with Clerk's office regarding same	1.80	738.00
08/14/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file Certificate of Service for Doc. Nos. 1091, 1092, 1093, 1094, 1095	0.20	82.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 162 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 2
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/14/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Continue work on Agenda for August 21st Hearing	0.90	369.00
08/15/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Conference with T.Long re CNOs on extension of stay and fee apps	0.10	148.50
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B110	Review proposed agenda and related conference with T.Long re revisions	0.30	445.50
08/25/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificate of service for doc. nos. 1107, 1108, 1109, 1110, 1111	0.30	123.00
08/25/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Communications with Clerk's office regarding potential extension of hearing and extension of zoom link regarding same	0.20	82.00
08/25/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificate of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
08/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B110	Analyze certificates of service and communications with Verita regarding the same	0.20	205.00
08/26/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service of doc. nos. 1115, 1116, 1117, 1119, 1120, 1122, and AP 63	0.40	164.00
08/27/2025	T L CANADA	B110	Electronically file certificates of service for doc. nos. 1123, 1128, 1129, 1130, 1131, 1135, 1136, 1137, 1139, 1141, 1142, 1143, 1145, 1146, 1147, 1148, 1149	0.60	246.00
			TOTAL B110	8.90	
08/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B150	Analyze request from counsel to plaintiff in state court litigation related to discovery and strategy to respond to same	0.20	205.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 163 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	ИЕ:	WS KURTH LLP Hopeman Brothers, 040312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 3
DATE	TIME	KEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/04/2025	CA	RANKIN	B160	Review and revise June monthly fee statement for CKSMM and email T. Rader regarding same (.4); review Stout June monthly fee statement and email M. Cortens regarding same (.2); review Blank Rome June monthly fee statement and email K. Brinkman regarding same (.3).	0.20 0.90	805.50
08/04/2025	CA	RANKIN	B160	Analyze and address open items regarding Hunton June fee statement.	1.80	1,611.00
08/05/2025	TL	CANADA	B160	Work on Hunton's June fee statement	1.40	574.00
08/05/2025	CA	RANKIN	B160	Analyze revised Hunton June invoice regarding Hunton's June fee statement.	0.20	179.00
08/06/2025	CA	RANKIN	B160	Analyze revised monthly fee statement for CKSMM (.2); analyze draft monthly fee statement for Kutak and email P. Barrett regarding timing of filing same (.3); analyze open items regarding Hunton monthly fee statement (.2) and communications with T. Canada regarding same (.1); emails with K. Brinkman regarding Blank Rome monthly fee statement (.1) and analyze revise Blank Rome monthly fee statement (.2).	1.10	984.50
08/06/2025	ΤP	BROWN	B160	Begin review of monthly fee statement	0.50	742.50
08/06/2025	TL	CANADA	B160	Analysis of Blank Rome, CKSMM, and Stout June monthly fee statements	0.70	287.00
08/07/2025	ΗP	LONG, III	B160	Analyze and respond to question from UST regarding expenses in Hunton's fee application	0.40	410.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 166 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 4
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/07/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze T. Brown edits to Hunton June invoice for monthly fee statement and coordinate revisions to same (.3); analyze open items regarding expenses for Hunton's last-filed interim fee application (.3) and email T. Long regarding same (.1).	0.70	626.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review proposed monthly fee statement of Hunton for June and revise same	0.90	1,336.50
08/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Stout's June 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
08/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Prepare and send June 2025 LEDES files to UST	0.30	123.00
08/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file CKSMM's June 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
08/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Blank Rome's June 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
08/08/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and electronically file Hunton's June 2025 fee statement	0.60	246.00
08/08/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze finalized, compiled versions of Hunton, Stout, CKSMM, and Blank Rome June monthly fee statements and email T. Canada regarding same.	0.40	358.00
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Review fee statements and consider strategy re motion to pay same	0.30	445.50
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with T.Long re UST discussions on Hunton invoice and response	0.10	148.50
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B160	Analyze and respond to questions from US Trustee regarding Hunton's fee application	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 165 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	· ·	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 5
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/13/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Work on Orders granting the 4th interim fee applications of Hunton, Blank Rome, CKSMM, and Stout	1.70	697.00
08/14/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Prepare certificates of no objection to 4th Interim Fee Applications of Blank Rome and CKSMM (.6), and redline notice and certificate of no objection to 4th interim Fee Applications of Hunton and Stout (.8)	1.40	574.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B160	Analyze and comment on certificate of no objections to orders approving Debtor's fee applications	0.30	307.50
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B160	Prepare and send email to US Trustee requesting endorsement on orders approving Debtor's fee applications	0.40	410.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Finalize and submit orders granting 4th interim fee applications for Hunton, Blank Rome, CKSMM, and Stout	0.80	328.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Revise and electronically file CNOs with UST comments approving the 4th interim fee applications of Hunton, Stout, CKSMM, and Blank Rome	1.00	410.00
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Emails with C.Lascell re FTI payment instructions	0.10	148.50
08/22/2025	C A RANKIN	B160	Analyze open items regarding payment of Hunton's fees (.3) and communications with M. Stevenson (Hunton accounting) regarding same (.4).	0.70	626.50
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Email with C.Lascell and NERA re payment instructions	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 168 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 6
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/28/2025	T P BROWN	B160	Email to T.Canada re preparing outstanding approved fee app list for C.Lascell	0.10	148.50
08/29/2025	T L CANADA	B160	Analysis of unpaid fees and expenses that have been approved by interim fee order but not yet paid by to the professionals.	3.50	1,435.00
			TOTAL B160	22.80	
08/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze and work on motion to dismiss appeal of order appointing FCR (1.20), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.60	1,640.00
08/01/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Work on motion to dismiss FCR appeal	2.70	4,009.50
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Email to T.Long and T.Canada re filing motion to dismiss and brief re FCR appeal after final review of table	0.20	297.00
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B170	Review and incorporate proposed revisions to motion for dismiss FCR appeal	0.80	1,188.00
08/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze and work to finalize brief in support of motion to dismiss appeal of order appointing FCR	1.80	1,845.00
08/04/2025	T L CANADA	B170	Finalize and electronically file Motion to Dismiss in the FCR Claim Rep District Court matter and Brief in Support of Motion to Dismiss	0.50	205.00
08/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B170	Analyze email from counsel to Chubb regarding motion to dismiss appeal of order appointing FCR and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
08/08/2025	N S MONICO	B170	Consider amendments to motion to dismiss/brief in support thereof of Chubb FCR Order	0.40	278.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 169 of 207

•	CURTH LLP eman Brothers, Inc. 312.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 7
DATE TIMEKEEP	ER TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/08/2025 TLCAN	ADA B170	Work on and Electronically file Corrected Motion to Dismiss the FCR Complaint and Brief in Support regarding same	1.80	738.00
08/08/2025 HPLON	IG, III B170	Analyze and work on amended motion to dismiss appeal of order appointing FCR (.60), and communications with chambers regarding the same (.10)	0.70	717.50
08/08/2025 TPBRC	WN B170	Emails to and from Chubb counsel re motion to dismiss FCR appeal	0.20	297.00
08/13/2025 TPBRC	WN B170	Work on FCR appeal brief	0.80	1,188.00
08/13/2025 HPLON	IG, III B170	Analyze and comment on brief related to appeal of order appointing FCR	0.80	820.00
08/15/2025 TPBRC	WN B170	Review FCR appellate brief and related conference and call with committee counsel	1.30	1,930.50
08/15/2025 HPLON	IG, III B170	Analyze and comment on brief for appeal of order appointing FCR (.60) and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	0.90	922.50
		TOTAL B170	15.10	
08/05/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review emails from C.Lascell re new complaint and related strategy	0.20	297.00
08/05/2025 HPLON	IG, III B190	Communcations with committee counsel regarding status conference for Liberty adversary proceeding and related strategy	0.40	410.00
08/06/2025 CARAN	IKIN B190	Analyze email from L. Smith (SCS) regarding new lawsuit naming Hopeman as co-defendant and respond to same.	0.10	89.50
08/06/2025 TPBRC	WN B190	Review LMIC email re proposed motion to stay and consider response	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plaggel 18 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		hers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 8
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from counsel to Liberty regarding motion to stay and potentially expedited hearing on same and related strategy (.70), and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding the same (.20)	0.90	922.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with J.West re authentication issues in litigation involving former employee	0.20	297.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review D.Ct. docket re LMIC matter	0.10	148.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy and review law under Rule 5011 re potential motion to stay	0.80	1,188.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Consider strategy re motion to stay and requested LMIC continuance	0.30	445.50
08/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Liberty's motion to stay filed in adversary proceeding	0.40	410.00
08/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare and send email to counsel to Liberty regarding motion to stay (.60), and communications with counsel to Liberty regarding the same (.20)	0.80	820.00
08/07/2025	T L CANADA	B190	Finalize and electronically file Motion for Authority to Disburse Funds	0.70	287.00
08/07/2025	C A RANKIN	B190	Analyze email from L. Smith with new complaint naming debtor as a defendant attached and draft response to L. Smith regarding same.	0.20	179.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review Chubb email re motion to dismiss and consider response and correction needed	0.30	445.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review emails with LMIC counsel re scheduling conference and potential stay motion	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 179 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE				INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 9
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with LMIC and co- counsel re pretrial conference issues	0.10	148.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Email and conferences with T.Long re call to D.Ct. on corrective filings	0.10	148.50
08/08/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to parties regarding stay of discovery in Liberty Mutual adversary proceeding pending decisions on motions to dismiss	0.30	307.50
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze strategy for August 13 status conference on Liberty adversary proceeding (.80), and communications with counsel to party in interest regarding the same (.10)	0.90	922.50
08/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for status conference in Liberty Mutual adversary proceeding, including preparing arguments on recent motion to stay filed by Liberty Mutual	0.90	922.50
08/12/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare objection to motion to stay AP	0.50	347.50
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review email from L.Smith re defense counsel invoices and related notice to be sent	0.10	148.50
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re pre-trial conference results in LMIC AP	0.20	297.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze objection filed by Boling Law Firm and Law Office of Philip C. Hoffman to Liberty's lift stay motion	0.60	615.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for and participate in hearing for Liberty Mutual adversary proceeding	3.80	3,895.00
08/13/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare objection to Liberty motion to stay AP	3.60	2,502.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 20 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 10
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/14/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Prepare objection to Liberty motion to stay AP (.7); finalize the same (.5)	1.20	834.00
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze objections filed by Liberty Mutual to motions to dismiss adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on objection to Liberty's motion to stay adversary proceeding	4.30	4,407.50
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on objection to Liberty's motion to stay adversary proceeding	1.10	1,127.50
08/15/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on response to motion to stay LMIC AP	0.80	1,188.00
08/16/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on objection to motion to stay LMIC action and related emails with T.Long re revisions and related research needed	1.10	1,633.50
08/17/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze case law related to objection to Liberty's motion to stay adversary proceeding and incorporate same into objection	1.10	1,127.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize objection to Liberty's motion to stay adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on final exhibit and witness list (.80), and communications with Committee counsel regarding same (.40)	1.20	1,230.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with insurers' counsel regarding exchanging final exhibit and witness lists and deadline for same	0.40	410.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from counsel to Liberty regarding proposal to resolve objections to preliminary exhibit list	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 23 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Broth FILE NUMBER: 040312.000000			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 11
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/18/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Revise objection to motion to stay	0.50	742.50
08/18/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Consider potential reply strategy on motion to dismiss LMIC Adv. Proc	0.40	594.00
08/18/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for hearings on 8/21 and work on argument outline	1.30	1,930.50
08/18/2025 T P BROWN	B190	Conference with T.Long re hearing strategy for 8/21	0.40	594.00
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and work on reply in support of motion to dismiss Liberty adversary proceeding	2.80	2,870.00
08/19/2025 HPLONG, III	B190	Analyze order from District Court referring Liberty's adversary proceeding to the bankruptcy court to rule on motion to withdraw the reference	0.30	307.50
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize Debtor's final exhibit list (.50), serve same on insurers' counsel (.10), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	0.90	922.50
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Chubb's final exhibit list and related exhibits	0.80	820.00
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Liberty's final exhibit list and related exhibits	0.60	615.00
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Hartford's final exhibit list	0.10	102.50
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Traveler's final exhibit list	0.40	410.00
08/19/2025 H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze joint exhibit list submitted by insurers and request for meet and confer to try to resolve open issues in advance of confirmation hearing and strategy related to same	1.20	1,230.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 22 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 12
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Work on reply in support of motion to dismiss or abstain LMIC complaint	2.30	3,415.50
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review D.Ct. order on motion to withdraw the reference in LMIC action and consider impact	0.30	445.50
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for LMIC hearings on 8/21	1.70	2,524.50
08/19/2025	J P ROVIRA	B190	Address issues relating to witness and exhibit lists for upcoming hearing (1.0); attention to correspondence related to same (.8); review deposition of C. Lascell and prepare cross examination outline related to same (3.7).	5.50	6,050.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Emails with D.Foley re LMIC extension request for appellate brief and related emails with J.Rovira	0.10	148.50
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review LMIC reply on motion to stay	0.50	742.50
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review motions to dismiss and joinders of other defendants	0.80	1,188.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for hearing on LMIC motions for stay, withdrawal and dismissal	1.80	2,673.00
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare for August 21 omnibus hearing	1.40	1,435.00
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Prepare and send email to insurers' counsel summarizing meet and confer and sharing updated exhibit list and exhibit (.60), and communications with counsel to Travelers (.20) and Hartford (.10) regarding the same	0.90	922.50
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and finalize reply in support of motion to dismiss Liberty adversary proceeding	0.70	717.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 23 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 13
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Update exhibit list (.20) and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same and strategy (.40)	0.60	615.00
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze Liberty's reply in support of motion to stay adversary proceeding	0.40	410.00
08/21/2025	N S MONICO	B190	Analyze Liberty declaratory judgment complaint regarding arguments made at hearing 8/21/25	0.10	69.50
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Prepare for hearing on LMIC AP motion	0.80	1,188.00
08/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from counsel to Chubb regarding comments on coverage chart exhibit	0.40	410.00
08/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze email from insurers' counsel regarding consolidated exhibit list and strategy to address same	0.90	922.50
08/27/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review email and new lawsuit from SCS and email to L.Smith re letter on stay violation	0.20	297.00
08/27/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Analyze and respond to questions from counsel to Chubb regarding proposed order on sealing motion	0.40	410.00
08/28/2025	H P LONG, III	B190	Communications with counsel to Chubb regarding deposition designations and analyze same	0.70	717.50
08/30/2025	T P BROWN	B190	Review report and recommendation on motion to withdraw the reference of LMIC	0.20	297.00
			TOTAL B190	60.50	
08/23/2025	J P ROVIRA	B195	Travel to Richmond VA for confirmation hearing. (Billed at 1/2 Rate)	5.50	3,025.00
08/27/2025	J P ROVIRA	B195	Return travel from Richmond to Houston. (Billed at 1/2 Rate)	5.50	3,025.00
			TOTAL B195	11.00	

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 26 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 14
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/01/2025	T L CANADA	B210	Work on Notice of Motion and Notice of Hearing on Motion for Authority to Disburse Funds Paid to the Debtor	0.60	246.00
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with committee counsel re disbursement motion re settlement proceeds	0.10	148.50
08/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse funds	1.10	1,127.50
08/05/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Review comments on disbursement motion and related emails with T.Long	0.20	297.00
08/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and work on motion to disburse funds from certain settling insurers payment	0.80	820.00
08/06/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Review and revise motion authorizing payment of fees from segregated account	1.20	1,782.00
08/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and finalize motion to disburse funds from certain settling insurers settlement	0.70	717.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Correct motion and brief and coordinate filing of same with T.Canada	0.80	1,188.00
08/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Finalize CNO for motion to disburse funds and finalize and submit order approving same for entry	0.40	410.00
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Conference with T.Long re CNO on disbursement motion	0.10	148.50
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and comment on monthly operating report (.60), and communications with D. Ramlijak at Stout regarding the same (.30)	0.90	922.50
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails with C.Lascell re order authorizing payment of fees from settlement proceeds	0.20	297.00
08/21/2025	N S MONICO	B210	File July monthly operating report	0.20	139.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plaggel 25 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 15
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/21/2025	H P LONG, III	B210	Analyze and finalize monthly operating report	0.70	717.50
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B210	Emails and conference with N.Monico re monthly operating report and related conference with T.Long re approach	0.20	297.00
			TOTAL B210	8.20	
08/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails and conferences with J.Rovira re expert rebuttal issues	0.50	742.50
08/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings and conclusions in support of confirmation of plan	4.00	4,100.00
08/01/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy related to Chubb's Scarcella report	0.90	922.50
08/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re expert rebuttal strategy	0.50	742.50
08/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re motion to dismiss for review by committee counsel	0.10	148.50
08/01/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re motion to dismiss, expert and status conference in LMIC AP	0.30	445.50
08/02/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review of transcript of Scarcella Deposition and Report.	2.40	1,908.00
08/03/2025	B R BELL	B320	Begin preparing motion in limine to exclude Chubb Insurers' expert witness.	2.90	2,305.50
08/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy for motion in limine of Scarcella report	0.70	717.50
08/04/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee counsel regarding modifications to plan to address objections (.60), and analyze issues related to same (.80)	1.40	1,435.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plaggel 28 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 16
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/04/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review and revise Motion in Limine (1.3) and attention to correspondence relating to strategy regarding same (.8).	2.10	2,310.00
08/04/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to evidentiary record for confirmation hearing and attention to correspondence related to same.	1.00	1,100.00
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on motion in limine to exclude Scarcella	2.30	3,415.50
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Canada re transcript from deposition of Scarcella	0.10	148.50
08/04/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Fourth Circuit decision in Bestwall and related emails with B.Bell	0.20	297.00
08/04/2025	B R BELL	B320	Complete initial draft of motion in limine to exclude Chubb Insurers' expert witness.	3.00	2,385.00
08/05/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re requested meet and confer re confirmation hearing and related strategy for hearing	0.40	594.00
08/05/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on motion in limine re expert witness for confirmation hearing	3.40	5,049.00
08/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on motion in limine and related strategy	0.60	615.00
08/05/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze request from counsel for insurers for meet and confer regarding confirmation and strategy to respond to same	0.40	410.00
08/05/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to evidentiary support for Confirmation Hearing (1.0); attention to correspondence related to same (.8).	1.80	1,980.00
08/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re transcript and requested citations to motion in limine	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plaggel 29 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 17
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/06/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise motion in limine and related research and consider strategy re same	4.60	6,831.00
08/06/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review transcript of Scarcella deposition (1.4); update draft motion in limine with appropriate quotations from and citations to same (.8); review edits to motion in limine (.7); revise motion in limine based on comments to same (.9)	3.80	3,021.00
08/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation of plan	2.20	2,255.00
08/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with insurers' counsel regarding conference to discuss exhibits for confirmation hearing	0.30	307.50
08/06/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on motion in limine regarding Scarcella report	0.70	717.50
08/06/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to Motion in Limine and attention to correspondence related to same.	1.30	1,430.00
08/07/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize motion in limine for Chubb's expert	0.60	615.00
08/07/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to Motion in Limine to disqualify expert testimony (.5); review and revise declaration of C. Lascell in support of Confirmation (1.5); review and revise declaration of R. Van Epps in support of Confirmation (1.3); address strategy for upcoming confirmation hearing and discuss same with T. Brown (.5).	3.80	4,180.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 128 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 18
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/07/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Finalize and electronically file Motion in Limine to Exclude Expert Testimony of Marc C. Scarcella	0.30	123.00
08/07/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise draft motion in limine (.8); reviewing incremental comments to same (.3); incorporating same and finalizing motion for filing (.9); preparation of supplemental brief regarding liquidation analysis issues (2.0); confer on issues regarding same, including correspondence with co-Plan Proponent counsel (1.1)	5.10	4,054.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review motion in limine and proposed order and provide final comments on same	2.30	3,415.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with B.Bell re sealing motion filed by Chubb and related issues	0.20	297.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re sealing issues in light of lack of order sealing report	0.20	297.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re declaration, LMIC motion, and strategy	0.50	742.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise proposed order on motion in limine and related emails with B.Bell	0.30	445.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re additional revisions to proposed order	0.20	297.00
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review proposed revisions to declarations from J.Rovira and incorporate same	0.50	742.50
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from B.Bell to committee re clarification on contribution issue under plan	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 129 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 19
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/07/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re evidence for confirmation hearing and related witness outlines	0.50	742.50
08/08/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to supplemental brief in support of confirmation (.8); attention to correspondence related to same (5.).	1.30	1,430.00
08/08/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continued preparation of supplemental confirmation brief.	2.50	1,987.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on revisions to declarations	1.30	1,930.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with B.Bell re confirmation orders and revisions expected for same	0.30	445.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re points for supplemental brief on Scarcella and coverage issues	0.50	742.50
08/08/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider strategy re confirmation and expert issues	0.80	1,188.00
08/09/2025	B R BELL	B320	Complete initial draft of supplemental brief in support of confirmation of the plan.	4.10	3,259.50
08/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise confirmation order, order recommending findings and confirmation order to D.Ct. and notice of confirmation and review related plan and trust documents	2.40	3,564.00
08/09/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re proposed confirmation order	0.10	148.50
08/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise supplemental brief on best interests test; emails with B.Bell re same	2.20	3,267.00
08/10/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from B.Bell re confirmation order	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 180 of 267

HUNTON AND CLIENT NAMI FILE NUMBER		, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 20
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review draft of proposed confirmation order and related emails with B.Bell	2.10	3,118.50
08/11/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review and revise declaration of C. Tully in support of confirmation (.8); address issues in advance of Confirmation Hearing and attention to correspondence related to same (.5).	1.30	1,430.00
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with insurers' counsel regarding exhibits for confirmation hearing	1.40	1,435.00
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on confirmation order	1.60	1,640.00
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to Committee regarding strategy for finalizing confirmation order and findings of fact and conclusions of law and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on modifications to plan	1.30	1,332.50
08/11/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on supplemental brief in support of plan	1.80	1,845.00
08/11/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review and revise proposed confirmation order (.7); incorporate proposed modifications to plan in connection with certain objections thereto (1.1);	1.80	1,431.00
08/11/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise supplemental brief in support of confirmation (.5); review further incremental comments to same (.4); incorporate and provide to co-Plan Proponent's counsel (.7)	1.60	1,272.00
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on supplemental brief and related research and arguments	2.40	3,564.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 183 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE				INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 21
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re meet and confer on exhibits with objecting insurers	0.20	297.00
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re arguments for supplemental brief and order argument	0.40	594.00
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re prep for hearing	0.10	148.50
08/11/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira re witness prep sessions planned	0.20	297.00
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Hearing prep call with C.Lascell and J.Rovira and revisions to declaration for same	1.60	2,376.00
08/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings of fact and conclusions of law in support of confirmation (6.10), and communications with C. Lascell regarding the same (.30)	6.40	6,560.00
08/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze comments from Committee counsel on confirmation order	0.70	717.50
08/12/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in confirmation hearing preparation call with C. Lascell	1.10	1,127.50
08/12/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Review and revise supplemental brief in support of confirmation (2.0); attention to correspondence related to same (.5); prepare for and participate in testimony preparation session with C. Lascell (1.3).	3.80	4,180.00
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re updated declaration and prep call	0.10	148.50
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee comments on supplemental brief and revise same	0.80	1,188.00
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on proposed findings and conclusions for confirmation hearing	3.80	5,643.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 182 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 22
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re Troutman email on meet and confer and follow-up items	0.20	297.00
08/12/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review committee comments on confirmation order and consider strategy and responses re same	0.50	742.50
08/13/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to supplemental brief and attention to correspondence related to same (.6); address issues relating to confirmation order and attention to correspondence related to same (.9).	1.50	1,650.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Committee comments to confirmation order (.70), and communications with Committee counsel regarding same and strategy for filing and findings and conclusions and analyze same (.90)	1.60	1,640.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on notice of confirmation order, order recommending confirmation and adoption of findings and conclusions and related strategy	0.80	820.00
08/13/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on order recommending confirmation of plan and adoption of findings and conclusions	0.90	922.50
08/13/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise proposed confirmation order.	0.50	397.50
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on proposed findings and conclusions of law for confirmation hearing	5.30	7,870.50
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re prep for confirmation testimony and open issues	0.20	297.00
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails re supplemental brief revisions and review same	0.50	742.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 183 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 23
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re open items for confirmation and review Kaiser precedent for submissions of orders and proposed findings	0.40	594.00
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences and emails with T.Long and committee re proposed call on open items and plan modifications	0.20	297.00
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Travelers email re proposed treatment of agreement in plan	0.10	148.50
08/13/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review proposed revisions to confirmation order from B.Bell and emails re same	0.30	445.50
08/14/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on Agenda for Confirmation Hearing on August 25, 2025	1.70	697.00
08/14/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on hearing materials for August 21st hearing	1.30	533.00
08/14/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee concerning Plan and Supplemental Brief (1.5); attention to correspondence related to same (1.0); prepare for and participate in call with R. Van Epp to review declaration and potential testimony (1.0)	3.50	3,850.00
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with R. Van Epps to prepare for confirmation hearing	1.10	1,127.50
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in call with Committee counsel to discuss open items to prepare for confirmation hearing	1.30	1,332.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re chambers call on exhibits and related strategy	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 186 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 24
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call and emails from opposing counsel re plan modifications and related conference with T.Long	0.30	445.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re coordinating with P.Barrett re latest plan and order revisions	0.10	148.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review schedule from committee of retained causes of action and related email from committee counsel	0.20	297.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review revisions to supplemental brief on best interests test from committee	0.50	742.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re proposed declarations of witnesses and proposed revisions	0.40	594.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira and B.Bell re revisions to proposed findings and completion of review	0.20	297.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on proposed findings and conclusions for confirmation hearing	3.80	5,643.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review new plan supplement on causes of action retained and related emails with committee	0.30	445.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review confirmation order re outstanding and unresolved issues	0.90	1,336.50
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with committee counsel re confirmation issues and plan modifications	1.00	1,485.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira to prepare for call with committee on confirmation issue	0.40	594.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on outstanding issues for confirmation hearing	1.60	2,376.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 185 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 25
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise proposed declaration and related email with R.Van Epps re revisions	0.40	594.00
08/14/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with R.Van Epps and J.Rovira re confirmation testimony and declaration	1.00	1,485.00
08/14/2025	B R BELL	B320	Participate in call regarding plan modifications with counsel to Committee (.9); Further revise plan to incorporate proposed modifications based on same (.6)	1.50	1,192.50
08/14/2025	B R BELL	B320	Further revise supplemental brief in support of confirmation.	1.40	1,113.00
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze plan exhibit from Committee related to retained causes of action	0.60	615.00
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to Travelers regarding plan modifications and call to address same	0.40	410.00
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with P. Barrett regarding confirmation order and sharing same with counsel to Huntington	0.30	307.50
08/14/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare and send email to insurers' counsel regarding exhibits for confirmation hearing and status of objections to same	0.60	615.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Prepare and electronically file CNO for the Third Exclusivity Motion	0.30	123.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Finalize and submit order granting the 3rd Exclusivity Motion	0.20	82.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Work on hearing materials for August 25th hearing	1.20	492.00
08/15/2025	T L CANADA	B320	Prepare hearing materials for August 21st hearing	1.70	697.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 188 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 26
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/15/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue to address issues relating to supplemental brief and review revisions to same (1.0); attention to correspondence related to same (.5); address issues relating to upcoming confirmation hearing and attention to correspondence related to same (1.3).	2.80	3,080.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on certificate of no objection for order extending exclusivity	0.20	205.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on revisions to trust agreement from Committee counsel	0.80	820.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and comment on revisions to trust distribution procedures from Committee counsel	0.70	717.50
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on findings and conclusions in support of confirmation of plan (4.20), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	4.60	4,715.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from Travelers counsel proposing resolution of objections to exhibits for confirmation hearing	0.60	615.00
08/15/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from Chubb's counsel proposing resolution of objections to exhibits for confirmation hearing	0.40	410.00
08/15/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law (1.1); revise same (2.1);	3.20	2,544.00
08/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with P.Barrett and with J.Rovira re further revisions to findings	0.20	297.00
08/15/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re additional revisions to declaration	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 189 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothe FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007	rs, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 27
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with opposing counsel re exhibit exchange and conference call to resolve objections	0.30	445.50
08/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review emails from P.Barrett re disbursement and order and confirmation order	0.10	148.50
08/15/2025 TPBROWN	B320	Review proposed findings and conclusions and related revisions	2.20	3,267.00
08/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review revised supplemental brief in support of confirmation and revise same	2.40	3,564.00
08/15/2025 TPBROWN	B320	Review revisions to trust agreement and related plan documents from committee	0.40	594.00
08/15/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Work on motion to exclude and related issues and revisions to arguments	1.20	1,782.00
08/15/2025 N S MONICO	B320	Call with B.Bell regarding findings of fact/conclusions of law re confirmation order	0.30	208.50
08/16/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Revise R. Van Epps declaration	0.30	445.50
08/16/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re declaration revisions	0.10	148.50
08/16/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with committee counsel re supplemental brief revisions	0.20	297.00
08/16/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise supplemental brief in support of confirmation	1.40	2,079.00
08/16/2025 BRBELL	B320	Review co-Plan Proponent's counsel's edits to supplemental brief in support of confirmation (.8); revise same (.9)	1.70	1,351.50
08/17/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review proposed revisions to R.Van Epps declaration and related emails with J.Rovira and B.Bell	0.30	445.50
08/17/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re declaration revisions and approval	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plagge 198 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBI		ners, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 28
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise objection to stay motion	0.70	1,039.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise proposed orders for confirmation	1.20	1,782.00
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review and revise exhibit/witness list for confirmation hearing	0.30	445.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review numerous emails with opposing counsel and committee on meet and confers and filing of final exhibit and witness list	0.40	594.00
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Consider reply strategy on motion in limine	0.70	1,039.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re workstreams for confirmation hearing	0.50	742.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re declaration issues and filing Exhibit A to Tully declaration	0.30	445.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel re declaration changes and related email to C.Lascell	0.30	445.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone calls with R.Van Epps re declaration and requested revisions	0.50	742.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise R.Van Epps declaration	0.70	1,039.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise Tully declaration	1.30	1,930.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise supplemental brief in support of confirmation	2.90	4,306.50
08/18/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise proposed findings and conclusions	2.30	3,415.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 199 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 29
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/18/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review further incremental edits to draft supplemental brief (.2); incorporate same (.2); review further comments to draft supplemental brief (.3); incorporate same along with additional clean-up (.6); confirm sign-off on supplemental brief (.2); finalize same (.3); Review of Chubb opposition to motion in limine (.7); participate in workstreams call in advance of confirmation hearing (.8)	3.30	2,623.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze open items and strategy to address same in advance of confirmation hearing	0.90	922.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with J. Miller at Verita regarding confirmation hearing and his appearance at same with respect to voting certification	0.30	307.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze Chubb's response to motion in limine and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize confirmation order for filing	0.70	717.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize findings and conclusions in support of confirmation	1.60	1,640.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize supplemental memorandum in support confirmation	0.90	922.50
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze FCR's memorandum in support of plan	0.40	410.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize Lascell declaration in support of plan	0.80	820.00
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize Van Epps declaration in support of plan	1.10	1,127.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 190 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 30
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/18/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize Tully declaration in support of plan	1.30	1,332.50
08/18/2025	N R MOOSANI	B320	Create table of contents and table of authorities for revised supplemental brief and modified plan	2.70	972.00
08/18/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to finalizing supplemental brief and confirmation order for filing (1.8); attention to correspondence related to same (1.5); prepare for and participate in internal call to address workstreams and strategy for upcoming confirmation hearing (1.0); address issues relating to witness preparation for upcoming confirmation hearing (5).	4.80	5,280.00
08/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze comments on plan and strategy related to same (1.10), and multiple communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.60)	1.70	1,742.50
08/19/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze status of items scheduled for August 21 hearing (.40), update agenda related to same (.60), and communications with chambers regarding the same (.20)	1.20	1,230.00
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re exhibits strategy and circulating list to insurers	0.50	742.50
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re potential plan supplement on disclosure of trustee claims preserved	0.20	297.00
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on reply on motion in limine	3.80	5,643.00
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Clement re confirmation issues	0.10	148.50
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re insert needed for motion in limine	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 193 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE		s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 31
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with committee counsel to coordinate prep session with Conor Tully	0.20	297.00
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re additional witness prep session	0.10	148.50
08/19/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for confirmation hearing and work on outlines for same	0.80	1,188.00
08/19/2025	C A RANKIN	B320	Analyze Debtor's declarations in support of confirmation.	1.10	984.50
08/19/2025	B R BELL	B320	Review reply in support of motion in limine (.3); provide comments to same (.4); prepare argument outline regarding best interests test for confirmation hearing (1.9).	2.60	2,067.00
08/20/2025	B R BELL	B320	Prepare additional argument outline for confirmation hearing.	1.30	1,033.50
08/20/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to reply to motion in limine and attention to correspondence related to same (1.3); review and revise outline of cross examination issues for C. Lacell and attention to correspondence related to same (1.0); prepare for and participate in call with insurers concerning W&E lists and logistics related to same (1.0); review deposition of C. Tully and prepare cross examination issues (2.5).	5.80	6,380.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for confirmation hearing	1.30	1,930.50
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with P.Barrett re plan modifications and related emails with committee counsel	0.20	297.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Telephone call to J.Clement re confirmation	0.10	148.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 192 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 32
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with insurers' counsel re exhibits	0.30	445.50
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review numerous emails re plan modifications with committee and T.Long	0.40	594.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review Chubb email re Rule 11 threat and consider related response strategy	0.40	594.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review numerous docket entries and proposed agenda and related conference with T.Long re strategy	0.40	594.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with C.Lascell re witness outline and prep	0.20	297.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re exhibit conference and confirmation hearing strategy	0.40	594.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft direct witness outlines and consider potential cross issues	2.20	3,267.00
08/20/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft reply on motion in limine	2.80	4,158.00
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze comments from Committee to plan (.70) and conforming comments on trust distribution procedures (.30) and trust agreement (.40), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	1.70	1,742.50
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Continue to analyze exhibits on Chubb's exhibit list and strategy related to same (.80) and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.40)	1.20	1,230.00
08/20/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from counsel to Chubb regarding confirmation brief and strategy to address same	0.70	717.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 193 of 267

•	RTH LLP an Brothers, Inc. 2.0000007		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 33
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/20/2025 HPLONG,	III B320	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer call with insurers' counsel to discuss exhibits and other items to potentially resolve in advance of confirmation hearing	1.10	1,127.50
08/20/2025 HPLONG,	III B320	Update and finalize agenda to address status of items for August 21 hearing (.50), and communications with chambers regarding the same (.20)	0.70	717.50
08/20/2025 H P LONG,	III B320	Analyze and comment on reply in support of motion in limine to exclude Chubb's expert	0.80	820.00
08/20/2025 N S MONIC	O B320	Preparation for 8/21/25 hearing	1.80	1,251.00
08/20/2025 N S MONIC	CO B320	Analyze Chubb Exhibit list (.2); research regarding exhibits 17-19 (.4)	0.60	417.00
08/20/2025 N S MONIC	O B320	Finalize and file reply in support of motion in limine	0.40	278.00
08/20/2025 N S MONIC	CO B320	Revise reply in support of Motion in Limine	1.00	695.00
08/21/2025 H P LONG,	III B320	Prepare for and participate in August 21 omnibus hearing	4.40	4,510.00
08/21/2025 H P LONG,	III B320	Analyze and finalize amended plan (1.40), and communications with committee counsel regarding the same (.50)	1.90	1,947.50
08/21/2025 HPLONG,	III B320	Analyze and finalize second plan supplement (1.10), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.30)	1.40	1,435.00
08/21/2025 T P BROW	N B320	Prepare for hearing on motion in limine	1.20	1,782.00
08/21/2025 H P LONG,	III B320	Communiations with J. Miller at Verita to help him prepare for confirmation	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 196 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 34
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Attend hearings on motion in limine and LMIC AP motion	4.50	6,682.50
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re post-hearing issues and confirmation hearing strategy	0.40	594.00
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Call with C.Lascell re witness prep for confirmation hearing	2.90	4,306.50
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on C.Tully witness prep and related outlines	0.70	1,039.50
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review modifications to plan and related conferences and emails re approvals	0.80	1,188.00
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review draft cross outline for confirmation witness prep	0.80	1,188.00
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on confirmation outline and consider strategy for hearing	1.80	2,673.00
08/21/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from Chubb's counsel re coverage chart exhibit	0.10	148.50
08/21/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Participate in hearing on Motion in Limine and Motion to Dismiss adversary proceeding.	1.80	1,980.00
08/21/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Continue preparation of cross examination outline for C. Tully and review transcript related to same (2.5); address issues relating to finalizing revised Plan and attention to correspondence related to same (.8); prepare for and participate in witness prep session with C. Lascell (2.0).	5.30	5,830.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 195 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Broth FILE NUMBER: 040312.000000			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 35
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/21/2025 B R BELL	B320	Prepare package of updated materials for client, including modified amended plan for sign-off on same (.3); confer with co-Plan Proponent's counsel on status of various revised Plan Supplement documents (.2); attend, remotely, hearing on motion in limine (.8), including advising on potential responses to arguments made at same (.3);	1.60	1,272.00
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review emails re Hartford's proposed modifications to plan	0.10	148.50
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re comfort provisions and review emails re same with committee	0.40	594.00
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with J.Rovira and committee re response to Chubb's Rule 11 letter on statements in brief	0.20	297.00
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Participate in witness prep with C.Tully and committee counsel	2.40	3,564.00
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Work on C.Tully witness outline and cross issues	1.70	2,524.50
08/22/2025 N S MONICO	B320	Preparation for combined hearing 8/25/25	3.10	2,154.50
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Work on argument outlines and review outlines for sections from B.Bell	3.40	5,049.00
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Review transcripts of designated testimony and related emails to witnesses	1.10	1,633.50
08/22/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Email to T.Long re completion of deposition testimony designations	0.20	297.00
08/22/2025 H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and finalize exhibit and witness list for confirmation hearing (.70), and communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.50)	1.20	1,230.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plagge 198 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 36
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze proposed plan modifications from Hartford and strategy related to same	0.60	615.00
08/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze deposition designations by insurers for confirmation hearing and strategy related to same	2.60	2,665.00
08/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze insurers' exhibits for confirmation hearing and strategy related to same	3.10	3,177.50
08/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for confirmation hearing (1.40) and multiple communications with Committee counsel regarding the same (.90)	2.30	2,357.50
08/22/2025	J P ROVIRA	B320	Prepare for and participate in witness preparation call with C. Tully (2.0); address issues relating to potential resolution of Hartford objection and attention to correspondence related to same (1.0); attention to correspondence concerning request to retract statements from Chubb (1.0); continue preparation for upcoming confirmation hearing and review argument outlines related to same (1.8).	5.80	6,380.00
08/22/2025	B R BELL	B320	Continued preparation of argument outlines in advance of confirmation hearing (3.5); participate in witness preparation call (.9)	4.40	3,498.00
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with B.Bell re arguments for confirmation hearing	0.10	148.50
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails with J.Rovira, committee and Hartford re potential resolution of objections	0.20	297.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Discourreent Plagge 199 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•			INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 37
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review email from LMIC counsel and consider related response and related email with J.Rovira	0.30	445.50
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise response to Chubb and related conference with J.Rovira and committee counsel	0.30	445.50
08/22/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for hearing on confirmation of plan and review related documents	1.40	2,079.00
08/22/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze status of items for confirmation hearing and update and finalize agenda	1.10	1,127.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for confirmation hearing	4.10	6,088.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re research on prior cases for 524(g) precedents	0.30	445.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review case law for confirmation hearing	1.60	2,376.00
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review witness outline and email with C.Lascell	1.30	1,930.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review exhibits of all parties and consider potential objections	1.70	2,524.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Work on argument outline	1.50	2,227.50
08/23/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise witness outline for R.Van Epps testimony	0.60	891.00
08/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze exhibits for confirmation hearing and strategy related to same	3.40	3,485.00
08/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Work on outlines of arguments for confirmation hearing	2.60	2,665.00
08/23/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with Committee professionals regarding confirmation hearing preparation	1.10	1,127.50
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with J.Rovira re Hartford plan revisions and response to other insurers on plan proposed revisions	0.30	445.50

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Discourreent Plage 208 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	s, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 38
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Draft and revise argument outlines for confirmation hearing	4.30	6,385.50
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Witness prep meetings for confirmation hearing	5.50	8,167.50
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conferences with T.Long re confirmation hearing prep issues	0.40	594.00
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review insurers' exhibits lists and exhibits and related emails from and to insurers	0.80	1,188.00
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Emails with R.Van Epps re coverage map exhibit and comments	0.20	297.00
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review revisions to statement relating to Chubb mediation and related emails	0.10	148.50
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare summary of plan and trust document modifications	0.40	594.00
08/24/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Prepare for confirmation heaing	1.10	1,633.50
08/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze filed exhibit and witness list from insurers, including comparing to prior lists	0.70	717.50
08/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Continue to analyze insurers' exhibits for confirmation hearing and work on strategy related to same	4.30	4,407.50
08/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Preparation for confirmation hearing with Debtor and committee professionals	3.20	3,280.00
08/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze resolution of Hartford plan objection and modifications to plan to address same	0.40	410.00
08/24/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from Chubb insurers regarding proposal to address comments about plan briefing and strategy to respond to same	0.60	615.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Diportment Plage 209 of 207

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	ЛE: Ho	KURTH LLP opeman Brothers, 0312.0000007	Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 39
DATE	TIMEKEE	PER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/24/2025	J P RO	VIRA	B320	All day preparation for confirmation hearing	7.00	7,700.00
08/25/2025	B R BE	LL	B320	Attendance at portion of opening-day of confirmation hearing.	5.40	4,293.00
08/25/2025	J P RO	VIRA	B320	Prepare for and attend confirmation hearing.	9.50	10,450.00
08/25/2025	HPLO	NG, III	B320	Preparation for second day of confirmation hearing	1.70	1,742.50
08/25/2025	HPLO	NG, III	B320	Prepare for and participate in first day of confirmation hearing	9.60	9,840.00
08/25/2025	T P BR	OWN	B320	Review Hartford withdrawal notice	0.10	148.50
08/25/2025	T P BR	OWN	B320	Review emails from B.Bell re hearing issues	0.20	297.00
08/25/2025	T P BR	OWN	B320	Email from R.Barrett re confirmation hearing	0.10	148.50
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Review email from Traveler's counsel re alternative language for plan	0.20	297.00
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Prepare for argument on confirmation and revise outline for same	2.30	3,415.50
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Meetings with C.Lascell and J.Rovira re proposed strategy, arguments and related issues	1.80	2,673.00
08/25/2025	T P BR	OWN	B320	Review committee email re response to plan comments	0.10	148.50
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Attend confirmation hearing	7.80	11,583.00
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Witness prep meetings and conference with client and J.Rovira	1.20	1,782.00
08/25/2025	TPBR	OWN	B320	Prepare for confirmation hearing	1.20	1,782.00
08/26/2025	JPRO	VIRA	B320	Prepare for and attend second day of confirmation hearing.	7.00	7,700.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 260 of 267

HUNTON AN CLIENT NAM FILE NUMBE	•	, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 40
DATE	TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and respond to email from Chubb counsel confirming deposition designations for confirmation exhibit	0.70	717.50
08/26/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Prepare for and attend second day of confirmation hearing	8.40	8,610.00
08/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Post-argument meeting with C.Lascell re next steps and other issues	0.50	742.50
08/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Attend confirmation hearing on arguments	6.90	10,246.50
08/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Meetings with C.Lascell and R.Van Epps re strategy	0.40	594.00
08/26/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Revise argument outline and prepare for hearing	3.70	5,494.50
08/26/2025	B R BELL	B320	Prepare outline of critical points regarding certain 524(g) requirements in advance of second-day of confirmation hearing (1.1); remote attendance at second-day of confirmation hearing, including preparation of short outlines of responses to arguments made by opposing counsel at same (6.2).	7.30	5,803.50
08/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails re transcripts from confirmation hearing	0.10	148.50
08/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Conference with T.Long re revisions to proposed findings	0.30	445.50
08/27/2025	T P BROWN	B320	Review emails re identification of transcript designations with Chubb and Travelers	0.20	297.00
08/27/2025	H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze email from counsel to Travelers regarding deposition designations to confirm comply with agreement	1.40	1,435.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 263 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH CLIENT NAME: Hopeman E FILE NUMBER: 040312.000	Brothers, Inc.		INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 41
DATE TIMEKEEPER	TASK	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
08/27/2025 H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy for updating findings and conclusions confirming plan, including analyzing transcripts from hearing	1.10	1,127.50
08/28/2025 H P LONG, III	B320	Communications with counsel to Chubb regarding deposition designations	0.30	307.50
08/28/2025 T P BROWN	B320	Emails with T.Long re Travelers transcript designations	0.10	148.50
08/29/2025 H P LONG, III	B320	Analyze and work on strategy for updating findings and conclusions confirming Plan	0.80	820.00
08/29/2025 JPROVIRA	B320	Address issues relating to proposed findings of facts and conclusions of law for confirmation of Plan.	1.00	1,100.00
		TOTAL B320	438.60	
		TOTAL HOURS	565.30	
TIMEKEEPER	STATUS	HOURS	RATE	VALUE
T P BROWN	Partner	195.90	1,485.00	290,911.50
J P ROVIRA	Partner	77.70	1,100.00	85,470.00
J P ROVIRA	Partner	11.00	550.00	6,050.00
H P LONG, III	Counsel	165.30	1,025.00	169,432.50
B R BELL	Associate	61.40	795.00	48,813.00
N S MONICO	Associate	13.20	695.00	9,174.00
C A RANKIN	Associate	7.20	895.00	6,444.00
T L CANADA	Paralegal	30.90	410.00	12,669.00
N R MOOSANI	Case Clerk	2.70	360.00	972.00
	TOTAL FEES	G (\$)		629,936.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:48 Desc Main Diponment Plage 262 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLPINVOICE:131828276CLIENT NAME:Hopeman Brothers, Inc.DATE:09/30/2025FILE NUMBER:040312.0000007PAGE:42

TIME SUMI	MARY BY TASK CODE:		
CODE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	VALUE
B110	Case Administration	8.90	4,801.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	0.20	205.00
B160	Fee / Employment Applications	22.80	15,464.00
B170	Fee / Employment Objections	15.10	16,691.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption / rejection motions)	60.50	67,533.50
B195	Non-Working Travel	11.00	6,050.00
B210	Business Operations	8.20	9,258.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	438.60	509,933.00
		565.30	629,936.00

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:48 Desc Main Diponment Plage 263 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP

CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc.

DATE: 09/30/2025

FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007 PAGE: 43

FOR COST	TS ADVANCED AND EXPENSE	S INCURRED:		
CODE E101	DESCRIPTION Copying	DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT 660.50
2101	Copying	TOTAL E10°	1 COPYING	660.50
E106	Online Research			501.75
	TOTAL E106 ONLINE RESEARCH			501.75
E109	Local Travel	08/13/2025	Vendor: Long, Henry P Invoice#: 7617130608131809 Date: 8/13/2025 Parking - 08/13/25 - Attend status conference re LMIC A.P. (Richmond Bankruptcy Court)	10.00
E109	Local Travel	08/21/2025	Vendor: Brown, Tyler P Invoice#: 7636766008271214 Date: 8/21/2025 Parking - 8/21/25- Attend hearing in Richmond Bankruptcy Court	18.00
E109	Local Travel	08/25/2025	Vendor: Long, Henry P Invoice#: 7638855808271214 Date: 8/25/2025 Parking - 08/25/25 - Parking for hearing - Richmond Bankruptcy Court.	21.00
E109	Local Travel	08/26/2025	Vendor: Brown, Tyler P Invoice#: 7638414908271656 Date: 8/26/2025 Parking - 08/26/25 - Parking for hearing - Richmond Bankruptcy Court.	25.00
E109	Local Travel	08/26/2025	Vendor: Long, Henry P Invoice#: 7643425809021141 Date: 8/26/2025 Parking - 08/26/25 - Attend hearing - Richmond Bankruptcy Court	25.00
E109	Local Travel	08/27/2025	Vendor: Brown, Tyler P Invoice#: 7641465808271656 Date: 8/27/2025 Parking - 08/27/25 - Attend hearing - Richmond Bankruptcy Court	25.00
	TOTAL E109 LOCAL TRAVEL		124.00	
E110	Out-of-Town Travel	08/23/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/23/2025 Taxi - Uber from Home to IAH.	60.01
E110	Out-of-Town Travel	08/23/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/23/2025 Taxi - Uber from Richmond Airport to Hotel.	29.96
E110	Out-of-Town Travel	08/23/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/23/2025 - 8/27/2025 Airfare - Houston, TX - Richmond, VA.	418.97

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1228 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:43 Desc Main Dibonument Plage 266 of 267

HUNTO CLIENT FILE NU		others, Inc.	INVOICE: DATE: PAGE:	131828276 09/30/2025 44
CODE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
E110	Out-of-Town Trave	I 08/27/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/23/2025 - 8/27/2025 Lodging - Omni - Hotel stay (4 nights) in Richmond, VA	731.15
E110	Out-of-Town Trave	l 08/27/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/27/2025 Taxi - Uber from IAH to home.	52.96
E110	Out-of-Town Trave	I 08/27/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/27/2025 Taxi - Uber from Hotel to Richmond Airport.	55.87
		TOTAL E11	0 OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL	1,348.92
E111	Meals	08/23/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date 8/23/25 Hotel - Dinner - Joseph Rovira - Hotel stay in Richmond, VA	57.39
E111	Meals	08/26/2025	Vendor: Rovira, Joseph P Invoice#: 7643587209021141 Date: 8/26/2025 Hotel - Dinner - Joseph Rovira - Hotel stay in Richmond, VA	87.51
		TOTAL E11	1 MEALS	144.90
E115	Deposition Transcripts	08/06/2025	Vendor: Veritext LLC Invoice#: 8532188 Date: 8/6/2025 Deposition transcript of Marc C. Scarcella Deposition on 7/23/2025	1,510.80
		TOTAL E11	TOTAL E115 DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS	
E116	Trial Transcripts	08/26/2025	Vendor: eScribers LLC Invoice#: 1205718 Date: 8/26/2025 Transcript of August 21, 2025 Hearing	173.00
E116	Trial Transcripts	08/27/2025	Vendor: eScribers LLC Invoice#: 1206914 Date: 8/27/2025 Transcript for August 26, 2025 Hearing	1,118.70
E116	Trial Transcripts	08/27/2025	Vendor: eScribers LLC Invoice#: 1206804 Date: 8/27/2025 Transcript of August 25, 2025 Hearing	1,564.20
		TOTAL E11	6 TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS	2,855.90
E118	Litigation Support Vendors	08/20/2025	Vendor: Cognicion LLC Invoice#: 181018496 Date: 8/20/2025 Payment for services rendered July 2025	3,109.85
		TOTAL E11	8 LITIGATION SUPPORT VENDORS	3,109.85
		TOTAL CUP	RRENT EXPENSES (\$)	10,256.62

Case 24-32428-KLP Doc 1238 Filed 10/15/25 Entered 10/15/25 15:05:48 Desc Main Diponment Page 265 of 267

HUNTON ANDREWS KURTH LLP INVOICE: 131828276 CLIENT NAME: Hopeman Brothers, Inc. DATE: 09/30/2025

FILE NUMBER: 040312.0000007 PAGE: 45

INVOICE SUMMARY:

 Current Fees:
 \$ 629,936.00

 Current Charges:
 10,256.62

CURRENT INVOICE AMOUNT DUE: \$ 640,192.62