#### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:

Case No. 23-90611 (MI)

WESCO AIRCRAFT HOLDINGS, INC., et al.,

(Jointly Administered)

Chapter 11

Reorganized Debtors.1

#### COVER SHEET FOR SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF PIPER SANDLER & CO. AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE SIXTH INTERIM FEE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024 AND THE FINAL <u>FEE PERIOD OF JUNE 27, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024</u>

Name of Applicant:	Piper Sandler & Co. (" <u>Piper Sandler</u> ")	
Applicant's Role in Case:	Investment banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the " <u>Committee</u> ")	
Date Order of Employment Signed:	September 6, 2023 (effective as of June 27, 2023) [Docket No. 721]	
Interim Application (X) No. <u>6<sup>th</sup> and Final</u> Final Application (X)	Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application	
	Beginning of Period End of Period	
Time period covered by this Application for which interim compensation has not previously been awarded:	09/01/2024	12/27/2024
Time period(s) covered by prior Applications:	06/27/2023	08/31/2024

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The captioned Reorganized Debtor is Incora Intermediate II LLC, the successor by merger to Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. Its employer identification number is 33-2921953. Its principal office address and service address in this case is 2601 Meacham Blvd., Ste. 400, Fort Worth, TX 76137.



Were the services provided necessary to the administration of or beneficial at the time rendered toward the completion of the case?	
Were the services performed in a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance and nature of the issues addressed?	Yes
Is the requested compensation reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in other non-bankruptcy cases?	Yes
Do expense reimbursements represent actual and necessary expenses incurred?	
Compensation Breakdown for the Fee Period Covered by the Interim and Final Fee Application	
Total fees requested in this Application:	\$6,013,252.68
Reimbursable expenses sought in this Application: \$83	
Total fees and expenses requested in the Application:       \$6,097	
Total amounts awarded in all prior Applications:\$2,556,	

**Plan Status:** On December 27, 2024, the Honorable Marvin Isgur, United States Bankruptcy Judge for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the "Bankruptcy Court"), entered the *Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Order (I) Confirming Further Modified Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. et al. and (II) Granting Related Relief* (later entered with corrections at Dkt. No. 2550) (the "<u>Confirmation Order</u>"), confirming the Further Modified Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. et al. [Dkt. No. 2550, Ex. A] (as supplemented from time to time, the "<u>Plan</u>"). The Effective Date of the Plan occurred on January 31, 2025. *See* Docket No. 2615

**Primary Benefits:** Piper Sandler has served as the investment banker to the Committee. In this capacity, Piper Sandler has provided investment banking services to the Committee, including evaluating business plans, financial projections, historical transactions effectuated by the Debtors, formulating illustrative waterfall and litigation scenarios, preparing an expert report, engaging in negotiations with key parties, reviewing and analyzing proposed plans of reorganization and disclosure statements, among other services.

#### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:

Case No. 23-90611 (MI)

Chapter 11

WESCO AIRCRAFT HOLDINGS, INC., et al.,

(Jointly Administered)

Reorganized Debtors.<sup>2</sup>

#### SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF PIPER SANDLER & CO. AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE SIXTH INTERIM FEE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024 AND THE FINAL FEE PERIOD OF JUNE 27, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024

If you object to the relief requested, you must respond in writing. Unless otherwise directed by the Court, you must file vour response electronically at https://ecf.txsb.uscourts.gov within twenty-one (21) days from the date this application was filed. If you do not have electronic filing privileges, you must file a written response that is actually received by the clerk within twenty-one (21) days from the date this application was filed. Otherwise, the Court may treat the pleading as unopposed and grant the relief requested.

Piper Sandler & Co. ("Piper Sandler"), as investment banker to the Official Committee of

Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") appointed in the above-captioned cases (the "Chapter 11

Cases") of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc., et al., as debtors and debtors-in-possession (collectively,

"Wesco" or the "Debtors"), hereby files its sixth interim and final application (the "Sixth Interim

and Final Fee Application" or "Application") requesting: (i) the allowance (and final approval) of

the Monthly Fees (as defined herein) earned for services rendered by Piper Sandler as investment

banker to the Debtors for the period of September 1, 2024 through December 27, 2024 (the "Sixth

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> The captioned Reorganized Debtor is Incora Intermediate II LLC, the successor by merger to Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. Its employer identification number is 33-2921953. Its principal office address and service address in this case is 2601 Meacham Blvd., Ste. 400, Fort Worth, TX 76137.

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 4 of 152

Interim and Final Period"); (ii) allowance (and final approval) of Piper Sandler's Transaction Fee (as defined herein) earned during the Sixth Interim and Final Period; (iii) payment of the twenty percent (20%) "hold-back" amounts, in connection with previous Monthly Fees; and (iv) final approval of Piper Sandler's Monthly Fees and Transaction Fee applied for and previously approved by the Court in connection with Piper Sandler's prior interim fee applications for investment banking services rendered to the Debtors for the period of June 27, 2023 through August 31, 2024 (together with the Sixth Interim and Final Period, the "Application Period"), pursuant to sections 328, 330, and 331 of the United States Bankruptcy Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Federal Rules"), and Rules 2016-1 and 9013-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the "Local Rules"), and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals [Docket No. 606] (the "Interim Compensation Order"). Piper Sandler seeks final allowance and approval of: (i) \$6,013,252.68, representing the Monthly Fees earned over the course of the Application Period plus the Transaction Fee, net of the Monthly Fee Credit (as defined herein); and (ii) \$83,842.10, representing actual and necessary expenses incurred over the course of the Application Period. These requested amounts include: (i) \$3,539,919.35 of previously unrequested fees earned during the Sixth Interim and Final Period; and (ii) \$1,068.31 of previously unrequested actual and necessary expenses incurred by Piper Sandler during the Sixth Interim and Final Period.

In support of this application (the "<u>Application</u>"), Piper Sandler submits the Declaration of Joseph Denham (the "<u>Denham Declaration</u>") attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> and a proposed order granting the Application attached hereto as <u>Exhibit B</u>. In further support of this Application, Piper Sandler respectfully states as follows:

#### JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the "<u>Court</u>") has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2) and Article III of the United States Constitution.

2. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

3. The statutory predicates for the relief sought herein are sections 328, 330, 331, and 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules, Local Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

#### **BACKGROUND**

4. On June 1, 2023 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), each of the Debtors commenced a voluntary case under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code in this Court. The Chapter 11 Cases are being jointly administered pursuant to rule 1015(b) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure. The Debtors are authorized to operate their businesses and manage their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. The factual background regarding the Debtors, including their business operations, their capital debt structure, and the events leading to the filing of the Chapter 11 Cases is set forth in the *Declaration of Raymond Carney in Support of Chapter 11 Petitions and First Day Motions* [Docket No. 13] (the "<u>First Day Declaration</u>").

6. On June 16, 2023, the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of Texas (the "<u>U.S. Trustee</u>") appointed the Committee pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Committee consists of the following three (3) members: (i) BOKF, N.A.; (ii) Parker

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 6 of 152

Hannifin Corporation; and (iii) Insight2Profit. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these Chapter 11 Cases.

7. On June 26, 2023, the Committee held a meeting and, among other things, selected Piper Sandler as investment banker, subject to Court approval.

8. On July 24, 2023, the Committee filed the Application to Employ Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors [Docket No. 459] (the "<u>Retention Application</u>"), pursuant to which the Committee sought authority to employ and retain Piper Sandler as its investment banker pursuant to the terms of an engagement letter (the "<u>Engagement Letter</u>") dated June 27, 2023. A copy of the Engagement Letter is attached to the Retention Application. On September 7, 2023, the Court entered an order approving the Retention Application [Docket No. 721] (the "<u>Retention Order</u>").

9. The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse Piper Sandler in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules, the Local Rules, and any Orders entered in these cases. The Retention Order also authorizes the compensation of Piper Sandler's fees on account of reasonable and necessary professional services rendered to the Committee and the reimbursement of Piper Sandler's actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses incurred, subject to application to this Court.

10. On July 14, 2023, the Debtors filed the *Debtors' Motion for Entry of an Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* [Docket No. 421] (the "Interim Compensation Motion"), and on August 8, 2023, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Order.

11. The Interim Compensation Order sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses in the Chapter 11 Cases. Specifically, the Interim

4

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 7 of 152

Compensation Order provides that a Retained Professional (as defined in the Interim Compensation Motion) may file and serve an Interim Fee Application (as defined in the Interim Compensation Order) on or before the 45th day following the end of the Interim Fee Period (as defined in the Interim Compensation Order), or as soon as reasonably practicable thereafter. Provided that no objections to the Interim Fee Application are filed on or before the twenty-first (21st) day after service of an Interim Fee Application, the Court may, in its discretion, approve an uncontested Interim Fee Application. If approved, the Debtors are authorized to pay such Retained Professional all allowed fees and expenses that have not previously been paid (including the 20% "holdback" under the monthly fee statement process).

12. On December 27, 2024, the Debtors filed the *Further Modified Second Amended* Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. et al. (the "<u>Plan</u>").

13. On December 27, 2024, the Court entered the *Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Order (I) Confirming Further Modified Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. et al. and (II) Granting Related Relief.* The Debtors' Plan became effective on January 31, 2025 (the "Effective Date").

#### THE PIPER SANDLER ENGAGEMENT AND SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

14. Pursuant to the Engagement Letter, as approved and modified by the Retention Order, the Debtors agreed to pay Piper Sandler as follows in consideration for the investment banking services rendered. The following compensation structure is for summary and illustrative purposes only:

(a) An advisory fee (the "<u>Monthly Fee</u>") of \$175,000 per month in cash. The initial Monthly Fee shall be pro-rated based on the commencement of services as of the first day of Piper Sandler's engagement through to the end of the calendar month. Subject to Bankruptcy Court approval, the initial Monthly Fee shall be earned upon the execution of the Engagement Letter, and thereafter the Monthly Fee shall be earned and payable in advance on the first day of each month.

- (b) A fee (the "<u>Transaction Fee</u>") of \$4,000,000, payable upon the consummation of any Transaction.
- (c) After six (6) full Monthly Fees have been earned (excluding the initial Monthly Fee, if such fee was for less than a full calendar month), 50% of the Monthly Fees thereafter shall be credited against any Transaction Fee (the "<u>Monthly Fee Credit</u>"); provided that the Monthly Fee Credit shall not exceed the Transaction Fee.
- 15. The following narrative provides a brief summary of the services rendered by Piper

Sandler on behalf of the Committee during the Sixth Interim and Final Period. The summary is not intended to be a detailed description of the work performed by Piper Sandler during the Sixth Interim and Final Period. Rather, the following summary attempts to highlight certain of those areas in which services were rendered to the Committee:

- (a) reviewed and analyzed the business plans and financial projections prepared by the Debtors;
- (b) formulated multiple illustrative recovery waterfall analyses and assessed prospective litigation scenarios and recovery outcomes in relation to the latest plan of reorganization;
- (c) along with the counsel to the Committee ("<u>Committee Counsel</u>"), participated in negotiations with various stakeholders;
- (d) attended court hearings and participated in regular meetings with the Committee and Committee advisors;
- (e) reviewed and analyzed various drafts of proposed plans of reorganization of the Debtors in relation to the Committee's negotiated settlement and other matters;
- (f) provided testimony in support of the Committee settlement; and
- (g) rendered other customary financial and investment banking services
- 16. The following narrative provides a brief summary of the services rendered by Piper

Sandler on behalf of the Committee during the Application Period. The summary is not intended to be a detailed description of the work performed by Piper Sandler during the Application Period. Rather, the following summary attempts to highlight certain of those areas in which services were rendered to the Committee:

- (a) reviewed and analyzed the business plans and financial projections prepared by the Debtors;
- (b) evaluated the DIP financing proposal and key considerations, including fees, interest, milestones, covenants, and other issues;
- (c) assisted Committee Counsel, at its request, in analyzing market context and other issues related to historical transactions and financings that might be subject to litigation and/or be subject matters in these Chapter 11 Cases;
- (d) assisted Committee Counsel in valuing the Debtors' businesses and the solvency thereof, including historical valuations at various points in time to the extent relevant to these Chapter 11 Cases and requested by Committee Counsel;
- (e) formulated multiple illustrative waterfall analyses and assessed prospective litigations scenarios;
- (f) prepared and authored an expert report;
- (g) served as deposition witness and provided courtroom testimony regarding the Debtors' solvency at the time of certain historical transactions;
- (h) along with Committee Counsel, participated in negotiations with various stakeholders;
- (i) reviewed and analyzed various drafts of proposed plans of reorganization of the Debtors in relation to the Committee's negotiated settlement and other matters;
- (j) attended court hearings and participated in regular meetings with the Committee and Committee advisors; and
- (k) rendered other customary financial advisory and investment banking services.

#### <u>PIPER SANDLER'S REQUEST FOR ALLOWANCE AND FINAL APPROVAL OF</u> <u>COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES</u>

#### **First Interim Fee Application**

17. During the period of June 27, 2023 through August 31, 2023 (the "First Interim

<u>Period</u>"), Piper Sandler provided investment banking services to the Debtors and earned Monthly Fees for such services in the aggregate amount of \$373,333.33 and incurred actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$48,512.24. On October 18, 2023, Piper Sandler filed the *First Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official* 

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 10 of 152

*Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from June 27, 2023 Through August 31, 2023* [Docket No. 842] (the "<u>First Interim Fee</u> <u>Application</u>") seeking allowance of compensation in the amount \$373,333.33 and reimbursement of actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$48,512.24 earned or incurred during the First Interim Period.

18. On November 11, 2023, the Court entered the Order Granting First Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from June 27, 2023 Through August 31, 2023 [Docket No. 973] approving Piper Sandler's First Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application, Piper Sandler has received payment in the amount of \$373,333.33 for compensation earned, and reimbursement in the amount of \$48,512.24 for out-of-pocket expenses incurred, during the First Interim Period. Piper Sandler requests that the Court grant final approval of the payment of compensation earned and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the First Interim Period and applied for in connection with the First Interim Fee Application.

#### Second Interim Fee Application

19. During the period of September 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023 (the "Second Interim Period"), Piper Sandler provided investment banking services to the Debtors and earned Monthly Fees for such services in the aggregate amount of \$525,000.00 and incurred actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$21,733.15. On January 25, 2024, Piper Sandler filed the Second Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from September 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023 [Docket No. 1306] (the "Second

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 11 of 152

<u>Interim Fee Application</u>") seeking allowance of compensation in the amount \$525,000.00 and reimbursement of actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$21,733.15 earned or incurred during the Second Interim Period.

20. On February 26, 2024, the Court entered the Order Granting Second Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from September 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023 [Docket No. 1472] approving Piper Sandler's Second Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application, Piper Sandler has received payment in the amount of \$525,000.00 for compensation earned, and reimbursement in the amount of \$21,733.15 for out-of-pocket expenses incurred, during the Second Interim Period. Piper Sandler requests that the Court grant final approval of the payment of compensation earned and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the Second Interim Period and applied for in connection with the Second Interim Fee Application.

#### **Third Interim Fee Application**

21. During the period of December 1, 2023 through February 29, 2024 (the "<u>Third</u> <u>Interim Period</u>"), Piper Sandler provided investment banking services to the Debtors and earned Monthly Fees for such services in the aggregate amount of \$525,000.00 and incurred actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$3,117.87. On May 5, 2024, Piper Sandler filed the *Third Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from December 1, 2023 Through February 29, 2024* [Docket No. 1742] (the "<u>Third Interim</u> <u>Fee Application</u>") seeking allowance of compensation in the amount \$525,000.00 and

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 12 of 152

reimbursement of actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$3,117.87 earned or incurred during the Third Interim Period.

22. On June 24, 2024, the Court entered the Order Granting Third Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from December 1, 2023 Through February 29, 2024 [Docket No. 1859] approving Piper Sandler's Third Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application, Piper Sandler has received payment in the amount of \$525,000.00 for compensation earned, and reimbursement in the amount of \$3,117.87 for out-of-pocket expenses incurred, during the Third Interim Period. Piper Sandler requests that the Court grant final approval of the payment of compensation earned and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the Third Interim Period and applied for in connection with the Third Interim Fee Application.

#### **Fourth Interim Fee Application**

23. During the period of March 1, 2024 through May 31, 2024 (the "Fourth Interim Period"), Piper Sandler provided investment banking services to the Debtors and earned Monthly Fees for such services in the aggregate amount of \$525,000.00 and incurred actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$3,273.42. On July 31, 2024, Piper Sandler filed the *Fourth Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from March 1, 2024 Through May 31, 2024* [Docket No. 1953] (the "Fourth Interim Fee Application") seeking allowance of compensation in the amount \$525,000.00 and reimbursement of actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$3,273.42 earned or incurred during the Fourth Interim Period.

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 13 of 152

24. On August 22, 2024, the Court entered the Order Granting Fourth Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from March 1, 2024 Through May 31, 2024 [Docket No. 2022] approving Piper Sandler's Fourth Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application, Piper Sandler has received payment in the amount of \$525,000.00 for compensation earned, and reimbursement in the amount of \$3,273.42 for out-of-pocket expenses incurred, during the Fourth Interim Period. Piper Sandler requests that the Court grant final approval of the payment of compensation earned and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the Fourth Interim Period and applied for in connection with the Fourth Interim Fee Application.

#### **Fifth Interim Fee Application**

25. During the period of June 1, 2024 through August 31, 2024 (the "<u>Fifth Interim</u> <u>Period</u>"), Piper Sandler provided investment banking services to the Debtors and earned Monthly Fees for such services in the aggregate amount of \$525,000.00 and incurred actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$6,137.11. On October 9, 2024, Piper Sandler filed the *Fifth Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from June 1, 2024 Through August 31, 2024* [Docket No. 2223] (the "<u>Fifth Interim Fee Application</u>") seeking allowance of compensation in the amount \$525,000.00 and reimbursement of actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$6,137.11 earned or incurred during the Fifth Interim Period.

26. On October 31, 2024, the Court entered the Order Granting Fifth Interim Fee Application of Piper Sandler & Co. as Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured

11

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 14 of 152

*Creditors for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from June 1, 2024 Through August 31, 2024* [Docket No. 2298] approving Piper Sandler's Fifth Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application, Piper Sandler has received payment in the amount of \$525,000.00 for compensation earned, and reimbursement in the amount of \$6,137.11 for out-of-pocket expenses incurred, during the Fifth Interim Period. Piper Sandler requests that the Court grant final approval of the payment of compensation earned and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the Fifth Interim Period and applied for in connection with the Fifth Interim Fee Application.

#### Piper Sandler's Request for Allowance and Final Approval of the Transaction Fee

27. As set forth in the Engagement Letter, and as approved by the Retention Order, Piper Sandler is entitled to a Transaction Fee in the amount of \$4,000,000, payable upon the consummation of the Debtors' Plan. The Plan was consummated and became effective on the Effective Date, at which time the Debtors emerged from chapter 11 protection. In accordance with the Engagement Letter, Piper Sandler is required to credit 50% of all Monthly Fees after six full Monthly Fees have been earned against the Transaction Fee. Piper Sandler requests the allowance and final approval by the Court of the \$2,862,500.00 net Transaction Fee, which is calculated below. The invoices for fees earned, including actual and necessary expenses incurred by Piper Sandler, during the Sixth Interim and Final Period and the Application Period are attached hereto as **Exhibit C**.

Net Restructuring Fee	\$2,862,500.00
Less: Monthly Credits <sup>3</sup>	(1,137,500.00)
Restructuring Fee	\$4,000,000.00

3

Total Monthly Fee Credit of 1,137,500 = 87,500 credit / month x 13 months credited (inclusive of the January 2025 Monthly Fee, which is outside of the Application Period).

#### <u>Summary of Actual and Necessary Expenses During the Sixth Interim and Final</u> <u>Period</u>

28. During the Sixth Interim and Final Period, Piper Sandler incurred \$1,068.31 in expenses on behalf of the Committee. It is Piper Sandler's policy to charge its clients in all areas of practice for out-of-pocket expenses incurred in connection with the client's case. Expenses charged to clients include, among other things, computer assisted research, market database fees, travel, and "working meals." Piper Sandler charges for expenses in a manner and at rates consistent with charges made generally to its other clients. A detailed summary of Piper Sandler's expenses incurred during the Sixth Interim and Final Period and the Application Period is provided in **Exhibit D**.

#### **CONCLUSION**

29. As described above, the services rendered by Piper Sandler were necessary and beneficial to the Committee. Accordingly, approval of the compensation for professional services and reimbursement of the expenses sought herein is warranted.

30. No previous application for the relief sought herein has been made to this or any other Court. A summary of the compensation earned during the Application Period is outlined on the following page:

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 16 of 152

		Out-of-Pocket	Fees + Out-of-Pocket	Γ	
Application Period	Fees	Expenses	Expenses	Payments Received	Amount Due
First Interim Period					
June 27 - July 31, 2023	\$198,333.33	\$44,879.58	\$243,212.91	(\$243,212.91)	_
August 1 - 31, 2023	175,000.00	3,632.66	178,632.66	(178,632.66)	_
Subtotal	\$373,333.33	\$48,512.24	\$421,845.57	(\$421,845.57)	-
Second Interim Period					
September 1 - 30, 2023	\$175,000.00	\$4,804.67	\$179,804.67	(\$179,804.67)	-
October 1 - 31, 2023	175,000.00	3,972.77	178,972.77	(178,972.77)	-
November 1 - 30, 2023	175,000.00	12,955.71	187,955.71	(187,955.71)	-
Subtotal	\$525,000.00	\$21,733.15	\$546,733.15	(\$546,733.15)	-
Third Interim Period					
December 1 - 31, 2023	\$175,000.00	\$615.15	\$175,615.15	(\$175,615.15)	-
January 1 - 31, 2024	175,000.00	1,003.14	176,003.14	(176,003.14)	-
February 1 - 29, 2024	175,000.00	1,499.58	176,499.58	(176,499.58)	-
Subtotal	\$525,000.00	\$3,117.87	\$528,117.87	(\$528,117.87)	_
Fourth Interim Period					
March 1 - 31, 2024	\$175,000.00	\$1,430.54	\$176,430.54	(\$176,430.54)	-
April 1 - 30, 2024	175,000.00	694.07	175,694.07	(175,694.07)	-
May 1 - 31, 2024	175,000.00	1,148.81	176,148.81	(176,148.81)	-
Subtotal	\$525,000.00	\$3,273.42	\$528,273.42	(\$528,273.42)	-
Fifth Interim Period					
June 1 - 30, 2024	\$175,000.00	\$5,176.77	\$180,176.77	(\$180,176.77)	-
July 1 - 31, 2024	175,000.00	888.01	175,888.01	(175,888.01)	-
August 1 - 31, 2024	175,000.00	72.33	175,072.33	(175,072.33)	-
Subtotal	\$525,000.00	\$6,137.11	\$531,137.11	(\$531,137.11)	-
Sixth Interim and Final Period					
September 1 - 30, 2024	\$175,000.00	\$341.46	\$175,341.46	(\$140,341.46)	\$35,000.00
October 1 - 31, 2024	175,000.00	466.77	175,466.77	(140,466.77)	35,000.00
November 1 - 30, 2024	175,000.00	120.44	175,120.44	(140,120.44)	35,000.00
December 1 - 27, 2024	152,419.35	139.64	152,558.99	-	152,558.99
Restructuring Fee	4,000,000.00	-	-	-	-
Less: Monthly Credits	(1,137,500.00)	-	-	-	-
Net Restructuring Fee	2,862,500.00	-	2,862,500.00	-	2,862,500.00
Subtotal	\$3,539,919.35	\$1,068.31	\$3,540,987.66	(\$420,928.67)	\$3,120,058.99
Total	\$6,013,252.68	\$83,842.10	\$6,097,094.78	(\$2,977,035.79)	\$3,120,058.99

31. The compensation requested for the services rendered by Piper Sandler to the Committee during the Application Period is fully justified and reasonable based upon (a) the complexity of the issues presented, (b) the skill necessary to perform the financial advisory services properly, (c) the preclusion of other employment, (d) the customary fees charged to clients in non-bankruptcy situations for similar services rendered, (e) time constraints required by the

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 17 of 152

exigencies of the case, and (f) the experience, reputation and ability of the professionals rendering services.

32. The amount of compensation sought in this Sixth Interim and Final Fee Application and Piper Sandler's compensation practices are consistent with market practices both in and out of a bankruptcy context. Piper Sandler has never billed its clients based on the number of hours expended by its professionals. Accordingly, Piper Sandler does not have hourly rates for its professionals and Piper Sandler's professionals generally do not maintain detailed time records of the work performed for its clients. Piper Sandler has, however, maintained contemporaneous time records in one-half hour increments. Time records with respect to the 379 hours expended by Piper Sandler professionals in providing investment banking services to the Committee during the Sixth Interim and Final Period are provided in <u>Exhibit E</u>. Time records of the 3,986.5 hours expended by Piper Sandler professionals in providing investment banking services to the Committee during the Application Period are provided in <u>Exhibit F</u>.

33. All services for which Committee requests compensation were performed for and on behalf of the Committee and not on behalf of any other person or stakeholder.

34. No agreement or understanding exists between Piper Sandler and any other entity for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with these proceedings.

#### **REQUESTED RELIEF**

WHEREFORE, Piper Sandler requests that the Court enter an order substantially in the form attached hereto:

(a) allowing (i) Piper Sandler's Monthly Fees in the amount of \$677,419.35, (ii) Piper Sandler's net Transaction Fee in the amount of \$2,862,500.00, and (iii) the reimbursement of Piper Sandler's out-of-pocket expenses in the amount \$1,068.31, in each case earned or incurred during the Sixth Interim and Final Period;

- (b) allowing and granting final approval of (i) Piper Sandler's Monthly Fees in the amount of \$3,150,752.68 (ii) Piper Sandler's net Transaction Fee in the amount of \$2,862,500.00; and (iii) the reimbursement of Piper Sandler's out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$83,842.10, in each case earned or incurred during the Application Period (inclusive of fees earned during the Sixth Interim and Final Period);
- (c) authorizing and directing the Debtors to pay Piper Sandler's allowed and unpaid fees and out-of-pocket expenses earned or incurred during the Application Period as follows:

First Interim Period	\$421,845.57
Second Interim Period	546,733.15
Third Interim Period	528,117.87
Fourth Interim Period	528,273.42
Fifth Interim Period	531,137.11
Sixth Interim and Final Period	678,487.66
Net Restructuring Fee	2,862,500.00
Less: Payments Received	(2,977,035.79)
Total Amount Due	\$3,120,058.99

and

(d) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: March 19, 2025

/s/ Joseph Denham

Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

#### EXHIBIT A

#### **DENHAM DECLARATION**

#### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:

Case No. 23-90611 (MI)

Chapter 11

WESCO AIRCRAFT HOLDINGS, INC., et al.,

(Jointly Administered)

Reorganized Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

#### DECLARATION OF JOSEPH DENHAM IN SUPPORT OF THE SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF PIPER SANDLER & CO. AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024

I, Joseph Denham declare under penalty of perjury:

1. I am a Managing Director of Piper Sandler & Co. ("Piper Sandler"), an

investment bank which maintains an office at 1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10020. I am duly authorized to make and submit this declaration on behalf of Piper Sandler which is currently serving as investment banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "<u>Committee</u>") of Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc., and the affiliated, jointly administered debtors and debtors-in-possession (the "<u>Debtors</u>").

2. I have read the Application filed contemporaneously herewith.<sup>2</sup> To the best of my knowledge, information, and belief, formed after reasonable inquiry, the statements contained in the Application are true and correct. In addition, I believe that the Application is in

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The captioned Reorganized Debtor is Incora Intermediate II LLC, the successor by merger to Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. Its employer identification number is 33-2921953. Its principal office address and service address in this case is 2601 Meacham Blvd., Ste. 400, Fort Worth, TX 76137.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Capitalized terms used but not defined herein shall have the meanings assigned to them in the Application.

#### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 21 of 152

conformity with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, Federal Rules, Local Rules, this Court's orders.

- 3. In connection therewith, I hereby certify that:
  - a. the requested fees and expenses herein are consistent with Piper Sandler's normal and customary billing practices for cases of this size and complexity;
  - b. in providing a reimbursable expense, Piper Sandler does not make a profit on that expense;
  - c. in accordance with Federal Rule 2016(a) and Bankruptcy Code section 504, no agreement or understanding exists between Piper Sandler and any other person for the sharing of compensation to be received in connection with these chapter 11 cases except as authorized pursuant to the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules and the Local Rules; and
  - d. all services for which compensation is sought were professional services on behalf of the Committee and not on behalf of any other person.

Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true

and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Dated: March 19, 2025

By: <u>/s/ Joseph Denham</u>

Investment Banker to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 22 of 152

### EXHIBIT B

#### **PROPOSED ORDER**

#### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:

Case No. 23-90611 (MI)

WESCO AIRCRAFT HOLDINGS, INC., et al.,

(Jointly Administered)

Chapter 11

Reorganized Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

#### ORDER GRANTING THE SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF PIPER SANDLER & CO. AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH DECEMBER 27, 2024

The Court has considered sixth interim and final fee application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses (the "<u>Application</u>") submitted by Piper Sandler & Co. ("<u>Applicant</u>"):

1. The Applicant is allowed compensation and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$3,540,987.66 for the period set forth in the Application.

2. The compensation and reimbursement of expenses allowed in this order and all previous interim allowances of compensation and reimbursement of expenses are approved on a final basis.

3. The Reorganized Debtor is authorized to disburse any unpaid amounts allowed by paragraphs 1 or 2 of this Order.

Dated: , 2025

THE HONORABLE MARVIN ISGUR UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The captioned Reorganized Debtor is Incora Intermediate II LLC, the successor by merger to Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc. Its employer identification number is 33-2921953. Its principal office address and service address in this case is 2601 Meacham Blvd., Ste. 400, Fort Worth, TX 76137.

Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 24 of 152

### EXHIBIT C

#### **MONTHLY INVOICES**

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.	Invoice Date:	9/11/2023
	Invoice Number:	31032-1
James R. Lewis		
BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee		
2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840		
Kansas City, MO 64108		

Description	Amount
Monthly Fee - June 2023 (6/27/23-6/30/23)	\$23,333.33
20% Holdback Amount	(\$4,666.67)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	\$579.41
Market Database Services	\$2,500.00
	Total Amount Due \$21,746.07

#### Michael Genereux

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	9/11/2023
Invoice Number:	31032-2

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - July 2023		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$556.67
Market Database Services		\$2,500.00
Outside Legal Fees		\$38,743.50
	Total Amount Due	\$181,800.17

**Michael Genereux** 

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions	
ACH Instructions	
Check Mailing Instructions	
Bin on Condian & Co	

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	10/6/2023
Invoice Number:	31032-3

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - August 2023		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$1,132.66
Market Database Services	×	\$2,500.00
	Total Amount Due	\$143,632.66

#### **Michael Genereux**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Nire Instructions	
	_
ACH Instructions	

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

### INVOICE

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	11/15/2023
Invoice Number:	31032-5

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description	Amount
Monthly Fee - September 2023	\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount	(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	\$874.67
Market Database Services	\$2,500.00
Legal Expenses	\$1,430.00
Total Amou	nt Due \$144,804.67

#### **Michael Genereux**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions
ACH Instructions
Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	12/6/2023
Invoice Number:	31032-6

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - October 2023		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$1,472.77
Market Database Services	¥	\$2,500.00
	Total Amount Due	\$143,972.77

#### **Michael Genereux**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions	
ACH Instructions	

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

### INVOICE

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	1/11/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-7

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - November 2023		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$1,695.71
Legal Expenses		\$11,260.00
7	Total Amount Due	\$152,955.71

#### **Michael Genereux**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		
Check Mailing Instructions		

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	2/14/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-8

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - December 2023		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$615.15
	Total Amount Due	\$140,615.15

#### **Michael Genereux**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	3/7/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-9

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - January 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	-	\$1,003.14
	Total Amount Due	\$141,003.14

#### **Joseph Denham**

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	4/17/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-10

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description	Amount
Monthly Fee - February 2024	\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount	(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	\$1,499.58
То	tal Amount Due \$141,499.58

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	5/21/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-11

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - March 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	-	\$1,430.54
	Total Amount Due	\$141,430.54

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	5/30/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-12

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - April 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$694.07
	Total Amount Due	\$140,694.07

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	7/1/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-13

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - May 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$1,148.81
	Total Amount Due	\$141,148.81

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	8/13/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-14

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description	Amount
Monthly Fee - June 2024	\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount	(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	\$5,176.77
т	otal Amount Due \$145,176.77

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions	
ACH Instructions	

Check Mailing Instructions

Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	9/13/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-15

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - July 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$888.01
	Total Amount Due	\$140,888.01

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	10/2/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-16

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - August 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$72.33
	Total Amount Due =	\$140,072.33

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions	
ACH Instructions	

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	10/17/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-17

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - September 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$341.46
	Total Amount Due	\$140,341.46

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions
ACH Instructions

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284

Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	12/4/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-18

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - October 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	_	\$466.77
	Total Amount Due	\$140,466.77

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	12/20/2024
Invoice Number:	31032-19

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description		Amount
Monthly Fee - November 2024		\$175,000.00
20% Holdback Amount		(\$35,000.00)
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	-	\$120.44
٦	Total Amount Due	\$140,120.44

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions		
ACH Instructions		

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co.

PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

Wesco Aircraft Holdings, Inc.

Invoice Date:	2/18/2025
Invoice Number:	31032-20

James R. Lewis BOKF, NA, solely in its capacity as chair of the Committee 2405 Grand Blvd., Ste 840 Kansas City, MO 64108

Description	Amount
Monthly Fee - December 2024 (12/1/24-12/27/24)	\$152,419.35
Monthly Fees	\$152,419.35
Transaction Fee	\$4,000,000.00
Less: Monthly Fee Credits	(\$1,137,500.00)
Net Transaction Fee	\$2,862,500.00
Out-of-Pocket Expenses	\$139.64
Total Amount Due	\$3,015,058.99

#### Joseph Denham

Managing Director Investment Banking

Wire Instructions			
ACH Instructions			

Check Mailing Instructions Piper Sandler & Co. PO Box 856284 Minneapolis, MN 55485-6284

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 44 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		19.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 45 of 152

jopkbasif 20Part staturati artingHamil Metage Calilong holeif 20Conductorial Action Communitylong holeif 20Resistant holesConductorialholg holeif 20Conductorial Action CommunityConductorialholg holeif 20ConductorialConductorialholg holeif 20Part staturati artingConductorialholg holeif 20Part staturati artingConductorialhole holeif 2	Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Inscription9.10Residue (and series)Concluster)Lingel Data9.1021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.1021.0PresonationalingConcluster)Lingel Data9.1021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.1021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.1021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data9.021.0Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)Lingel Data1.0Concluster)Concluster)Concluster)<	Joseph Denham	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Jong MongVirgenJalUCC preferrod managementJong DataVirgen10UCC marine and material constructions and material construction	Joseph Denham	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
insplandindindContarial	Joseph Denham	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
spacebase	Joseph Denham	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
langham91301110IndendendandConstrained constrained constrainedlangham92302110MachamataniaConstrained constrained constrainedlangham92302115Charlenska Linken ConstrainedConstrained constrained constrainedlangham192302115Charlenska Linken ConstrainedConstrained constrained constrainedlangham192302115State ConstrainedConstrained constrained constrainedlangham192302115State ConstrainedConstrained constrainedlangham192302115State ConstrainedConstrained constrainedlangham192302115State ConstrainedConstrained constrainedlangham192302115State ConstrainedConstrained constrained constrainedlangham192302115State Constrained constrainedConstrained constrained constrainedlangham192302115State Constrained constrained constrained <t< td=""><td>Joseph Denham</td><td>9/12/2024</td><td>1.0</td><td>UCC meeting</td><td>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</td></t<>	Joseph Denham	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
jeskbolaisolisolKeiseulational animal antimaInternational Constitutional C	Joseph Denham	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
JackbornJosephane<	Joseph Denham	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
janghala§25024§3Organisation standardContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Professional standardContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto professional standardContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto professional standardContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto professional standardContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto State OxferesContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto State OxferesContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto State OxferesContinue disconcursationJanghalas18204§3Otto Continue disconcursationContinue disconcursation<	Joseph Denham	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
jand basis9.5%	Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
handsNameNote of the second statusContinent contamicationAngel Damis102704103Contractionation contamicationAngel Damis107204103Contractionation contamicationAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencConfidencyAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencConfidencyAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencConfidencyAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencContraction ContractionAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencContraction ContractionAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencContraction ContractionAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferencContraction ContractionAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferenceContraction Contraction Contraction ContractionAngel Damis107204103Sun ConferenceContraction Contraction Contractio	Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jangh Dehmi102 000103104 000105Chr. production inclusionConsider and consider Advisor ConstrainedJangh Dehmi104 000104105Sana ConfererCon HeinigJangh Dehmi104 000105106Sana ConfererIarah Maring CultJangh Dehmi1010000105105Deposition intradictionIarah Maring CultJangh Dehmi1010000105Deposition intradictionIarah Maring CultJangh Dehmi1010000105Deposition intradictionIarah Maring CultJangh Dehmi1040000105Deposition intradiction <td< td=""><td>Joseph Denham</td><td>9/25/2024</td><td>0.5</td><td>Piper Sandler internal meeting</td><td>Internal Meetings / Calls</td></td<>	Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Jackbolm(1972)(19(19(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)(1972)Applane(197	Joseph Denham	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Jack Data19720219Sam ConferonConfigurityLong Data1932041010Sam ConferonConfigurityLong Data10102413Sam ConferonInteral Metring/ ChiLong Data10102413Sam ConferonDescriptionLong Data10102413Sam ConferonDescriptionLong Data10102413Sam ConferonConfigurityLong Data10122413Sam ConferonConfigurityLong Data10122413<	Joseph Denham	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Janch John196.1San CanformCan HamingLong Holm10010Figra Banderian LangerianHam Mang Alan Mang AlanLong Holm1001010Ham Mang AlanHam Mang AlanLong Holm10101010Ham Mang AlanLong Holm101010Ham Mang AlanHam Mang AlanLong Holm10101010Ham Mang AlanLong Holm101010Ham Mang AlanHam Mang AlanLong Holm1010Ham Mang AlanHam Mang AlanLong Holm <td< td=""><td>Joseph Denham</td><td>10/3/2024</td><td>0.5</td><td>Piper Sandler internal meeting</td><td>Internal Meetings / Calls</td></td<>	Joseph Denham	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
baybaispaceispacePersonalizationancingincluding/Clilonghabaa10190215PersonalizationancingIncluding/Clilonghabaa10190216Statu ContropIncluding/Clilonghabaa10190215Otter ContropControplonghabaa10170216Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa10170216Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700215Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700216Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700215Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700215Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700215Otter ContropControp Controplonghabaa11700215Otte	Joseph Denham	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Jangh Daha(Jin 1990)J. Per Sadir ineral nearingIncluding CaliJangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Dinard Deham Dictatio preparion)Domard Revis and Decemb TransJangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Dinard Deham Dictatio preparion)Decemb TransJangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Dinard Deham Dictation)Decemb TransJangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)Dinard Deham Dictation)Jangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)Dinard Deham Dictation)Jangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)Dinard Deham Dictation)Dinard Deham Dictation)Jangh Daha(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)(Jin 1990)Di	Joseph Denham	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
NameNumber<	-	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Instyle101520410Status CanforaceConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordinaConstrained Antiones Constrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingInternal Constrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Constrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Constrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Antiones ConstrainedLingh Dawa1017020410CUC nordingConstrained Antiones Constrained Antiones Constr		10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
NameNumber of the second standing of the se	Joseph Denham	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Indep DefaulInformationInformationCommittee and committee Advisors CommutationLoops DefaulInformationInformationInformationInformationLoops DefaulInformation	Joseph Denham	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
bash bahainfer	Joseph Denham	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Norph Dahan10220240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Semantic Advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan10240240.5State ConferenceCommittee and Vessiors CommunicationJoseph Dahan10920240.5UCC professionals standing callInternal Meeting / CallsJoseph Dahan109302040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Semantic Advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11620240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Semantic Advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11620240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Semantic Advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11620240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11720240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan117120240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan117120240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan117120240.5States ConferenceCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11720240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11720240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11720240.5UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Dahan11720240.5UCC meetingCommittee adv	Joseph Denham	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jackbar1042040.5Statu CanéracéCardinariaJosph Daha10242040.5UCC metingComitien d'onsine d'onsin	-	10/17/2024	1.0		Internal Meetings / Calls
Jackph Daha1020.5ICC meetingCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha103020410OPPEr Standler internal meetingInternal Meeting / CallJoseph Daha01302040.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha1042040.5OCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11420240.5OCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11420240.5OCC professionals standing callInternal Meeting / callsJoseph Daha11420240.5OCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11202040.5OCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11202040.5OCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11202040.5OCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha11212040.5OCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph				UCC professionals standing call	
Negh Daha10210Piper Sandlar internal meetingInternal Meeting / CallsJoseph Daha103/020405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha104/02405Status ConferenceConf HeiningJoseph Daha114/02405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha114/02405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405Status ConferenceConferenceJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee and veeting / CallJoseph Daha111/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha112/120405UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Daha112/120405UCC professionals standing call					-
Josph Dela10302240.5UCC professioals standing callCommitte and Committe Advisors CommunicationJosph Dela104/0240.5UCC meetingComitte and Committe Advisors CommunicationJosph Dela11/02040.5Status ConferenceCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/02040.5Pepe Staller internal meetingCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/02040.5Pepe Staller internal meetingCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/12020.5Pepe Staller internal meetingCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/120240.5Status ConferenceCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/120240.5Piper Staller internal meetingCourl HarringsJosph Dela11/120240.5CUC meeting <td< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td><td></td></td<>				-	
Josph Delam103/12040.5UCC metringCommittee and committee advisors CommunicationJosph Delam116/0240.5UCC professional standing callCom Hierang Committee advisors CommunicationJosph Delam11/82040.5UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJosph Delam11/120240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJosph Delam12/120240.5UCC professional standing callCommi	Joseph Denham	10/25/2024	1.0		Internal Meetings / Calls
Josph Deham11/62020.5Status ConferenceCour HearingJoseph Deham11/62020.5UCC professionals standing callCorrentizee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham11/120200.5Fiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counnitiee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counsitiee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counsitiee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham11/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counsitiee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham12/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counsitiee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Deham12/120200.5UCC professional standing callCournitiee and Counsitiee Advisors Communicat	•				
Joseph Denham11/6/2040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/8/2040.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/13/2040.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/14/2040.5OEPiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham11/12/2040.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/12/2040.5UCC moetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/12/2040.5UCC meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/12/2040.5UCC meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/12/2040.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/12/20				-	
Joseph Denham11/8/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham11/1/20/40.5Corr professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/1/3/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/1/20/40.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/20/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/21/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10/20/40.5Pipe Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/10/20/40.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/10/20/4 <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td></t<>					-
Joeph Denham1/1220/40.5Fee application hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/1/320/40.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/1/320/40.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham1/1/320/40.5Status ConferenceConflictee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/1/2/20/40.5Otto ConferenceConflictee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/1/2/20/40.5Otto ConferenceConflictee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/1/2/20/40.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/1/2/20/40.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham1/2/20/40.5Otto ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/20/40.5Otto ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/1/20/40.5Cotto ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/1/20/40.5Cotto ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/1/20/40.5Cotto ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/1/20/40.5Status ConferenceConflictee and Conmittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/2/1/20/40.5Sta					
Jesph Denham11/13/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/14/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham11/15/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/21/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/22/20240.5OUCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph D					
Joseph Denham11/14/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings/CallsJoseph Denham11/15/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/20/2040.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/20/2040.5Status ConferenceCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/2040.5Ot CreatingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/2040.5Ot CreatingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/20/2040.5Ot CreatingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/20/2040.5Ot CreatingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/20/2040.5Ot CreatingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10/2040.5Ot Creating Advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee advisors Communication <td< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td></td<>					-
Insph Denham11/15/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/202040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/202040.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/202040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/202040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/202040.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/202040.5Of Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/202040.5Of Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102040.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102040.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102040.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102040.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102040.5Of Europeesionals standing callCourt Hearings <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>					
Joseph Denham11/20/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/21/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/22/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham11/27/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/27/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Versions CommunicationJoseph Denham12/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10240.5UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/10240.5Meeting with UCC legal advisors cre Denham Declaration prepCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/102440.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/2024<					
Joseph Denham11/20/2040.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham11/21/2040.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham11/22/2040.5UCC professionals standing callCornmittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham11/27/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCornmittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/3/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCornmittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCornmittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/1/20240.5Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt Hearings <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td></t<>					-
New Denham1/21/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/22/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham1/27/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/27/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham1/21/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt Hearin	•				
Joseph Denham1/22/2240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham1/27/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/3/2240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/5/2241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/2240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/22440.5Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/22440.5OtsStatus ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/22440.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/22440.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/22440.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/22440.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/22440.5UCC meetingCourt Heari					C C
Joseph Denham11/27/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/3/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/10/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/11/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/11/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20440.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20440.5Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Oto Trofferseionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham<				-	
Joseph Denham12/3/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/5/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/11/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5				·	
Joseph Denham12/5/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/10/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/11/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5OtsPiper Sandler internal meetingJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/28/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/28/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/28/20241.0Piper Sandler int					
Joseph Denham12/10/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/11/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5OtsFiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/21/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/22/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5 </td <td>•</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>·</td> <td>5</td>	•			·	5
Joseph Denham12/11/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/21/20240.5Oto UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/21/20240.5Oto Priper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/21/20240.5 <td< td=""><td>-</td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td></td<>	-				-
Joseph Denham12/12/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto TransferenceCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto TransferenceCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto TransferenceCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto TransferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Oto TransferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5Oto TransferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5Oto TransferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5Oto TransferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/29/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings					-
Joseph Denham12/13/20241.0Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prepCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Of Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Ot UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Ot UCC meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5Ot Piper Sandler internal meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings					
Joseph Denham12/16/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/16/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings				-	
Joseph Denham12/16/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/18/20240.50.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings					
Joseph Denham12/18/20240.5UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings	-				-
Joseph Denham12/18/20240.5Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham12/19/20240.5UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham12/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham12/27/20240.5Confirmation HearingCourt Hearings				·	5
Joseph Denham     12/19/2024     0.5     UCC meeting     Committee and Committee Advisors Communication       Joseph Denham     12/23/2024     1.0     Piper Sandler internal meeting     Internal Meetings / Calls       Joseph Denham     12/27/2024     0.5     Confirmation Hearing     Court Hearings					
Joseph Denham     12/23/2024     1.0     Piper Sandler internal meeting     Internal Meetings / Calls       Joseph Denham     12/27/2024     0.5     Confirmation Hearing     Court Hearings	•				-
Joseph Denham     12/27/2024     0.5     Confirmation Hearing     Court Hearings				-	Internal Meetings / Calls
Total 38.0	•		0.5	·	-
	Total		38.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/3/2024	3.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/4/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
James Kang	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/2/2024	0.5 0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang James Kang	10/2/2024 10/3/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call Piper Sandler internal meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/31/2024 11/3/2024	0.5 2.0	UCC meeting Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/5/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/13/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 47 of 152

James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/20/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/11/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/11/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		87.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/2/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/3/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/26/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/27/2024	0.5	Confer with UCC legal advisors re: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/22/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/5/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	1.0	Communication with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 49 of 152

Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		78.5		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/2/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/3/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 51 of 152

James Morrell	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		76.5		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Lucas Shapiro	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/3/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/13/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/26/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference UCC professionals standing call	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	0.5		Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/11/2024	2.0 2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Analysis of revised plan draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	11/11/2024 11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Administrative Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	11/13/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro		0.5		Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	11/15/2024 11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference UCC professionals standing call	Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Snapiro	11/20/2024	0.5	Status COILCICICC	Court reatings

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 53 of 152

Lucas Shapiro	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/26/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/9/2024	1.0	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		79.5		

### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE FIRST INTERIM FEE PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	41.5
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	42.5
Mike Genereux	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	49.0
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	142.5
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	133.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	140.5
Joshua Katz	Restructuring Group	Analyst	118.5
Garry Vaynberg	Diversified Industrials	Managing Director	8.0
Randy Yang	Diversified Industrials	Director	8.0
Total Hours			684.0
	Category Descript	on	Hours
	95.5		
	Financial Analysis & Due	Diligence	208.5
	rs Communication	201.0	
	ommunication	14.0	
		56.0	
	Internal Meetings / C	Calls	74.0
	Court Hearings		35.0
	Total Hours		684.0

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 55 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	6/29/2023	1.0	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/5/2023	0.5	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/16/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Bilal Bazzy	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 56 of 152

Bilal Bazzy	8/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		41.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 57 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/5/2023	0.5	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	7/10/2023	0.5	Review of financial analysis around case outcomes	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/13/2023	0.5	Review of Committee-internal discussion materials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	7/16/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joseph Denham	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/11/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: notice of Joinder	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
*			·	

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 58 of 152

Total		42.5		
Joseph Denham	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	8/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 59 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Mike Genereux	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/5/2023	0.5	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	7/10/2023	0.5	Review of financial analysis around case outcomes	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Mike Genereux	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/13/2023	0.5	Review of Committee-internal discussion materials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Mike Genereux	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/16/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	7/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Mike Genereux	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/1/2023	0.5	Internal correspondence re: status update	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/3/2023	0.5	Correspondence with UCC Counsel re: status update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/4/2023	0.5	Internal discussion with J.Kang re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/9/2023	1.0	Correspondence re: Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Miles Commun	0/11/2022	1.0	Internal discovering with TRans and the	Internal Martinez / Calls

Internal discussion with J.Kang re: case matters

Internal Meetings / Calls

Mike Genereux

8/11/2023 1.0

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 60 of 152

Mike Genereux	8/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call re: retention matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/16/2023	0.5	Internal discussion with J.Kang re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/24/2023	1.0	Internal discussion with J.Kang re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/29/2023	0.5	Correspondence with UCC Counsel re: status update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/30/2023	0.5	Discussion with Committee professionals re: historical transactions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		49.0		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 61 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/28/2023	1.0	Review of court filings and first day documents	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	6/28/2023	1.0	Review of preliminary financial analysis re: recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/28/2023	1.0	Review of due diligence documents	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/29/2023	1.0	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
James Kang	6/29/2023	0.5	Review of DIP budget	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/29/2023	1.0	Review of due diligence documents	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/29/2023	0.5	Review of DIP issues list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	6/29/2023	1.5	DIP comps analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtor's advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/30/2023	2.0	Analysis of DIP economics and terms	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	Review of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
James Kang	6/30/2023	1.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: various case scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/30/2023	0.5	Correspondence re: DIP issues list	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/1/2023	0.5	Drafting of Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
James Kang	7/2/2023	0.5	Correspondence re: Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/3/2023	1.0	Review of the draft document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/3/2023	0.5	Call with counsel re: DIP issues list	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/5/2023	1.0	Review of DIP comps analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/5/2023	0.5	Preparation of agenda for management call	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/5/2023	0.5	Review of management presentation deck	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/5/2023	1.0	Review of due diligence documents	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/5/2023	1.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
James Kang	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/6/2023	1.0	DIP comps analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/6/2023	0.5	Review of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/6/2023	0.5	Review of docket	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/7/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/7/2023	2.0	Review of due diligence documents	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/7/2023	0.5	Review of documents related to outstanding litigation	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	7/10/2023	0.5	Review of DIP objections	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/10/2023	1.5	Review of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/10/2023	1.5	Review of financial analysis around case outcomes	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 62 of 152

James Kang	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/11/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/11/2023	0.5	Correspondences re: Debtor advisor retentions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/12/2023	1.5	Review of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/13/2023	1.0	Analysis of recoveries under various capital structure scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/13/2023	1.0	Review of Committee-internal discussion materials	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/14/2023	1.0	Analysis of make-whole	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/14/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/16/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/17/2023	2.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/17/2023	1.5	Preparation of internal discussion materials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/17/2023	0.5	Analysis of make-whole	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/17/2023	0.5	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/17/2023	1.5	Review of relevant industry reports	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/17/2023	0.5	Review of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/18/2023	1.0	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/18/2023	1.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/19/2023	0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/19/2023	2.0	Valuation Analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/20/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/21/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
James Kang	7/24/2023	0.5	Correspondences re: discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/24/2023	0.5	Review of document production and related due diligence	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	7/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Kang	7/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
James Kang	7/27/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/31/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	8/1/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/2/2023	0.5	Review of discovery / diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/2/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Review of debtor's financial projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 63 of 152

James Kang	8/3/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/3/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/4/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/4/2023	0.5	Internal discussion with M.Genereux re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/5/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/7/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debt capital markets analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/8/2023	1.0	Review of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	8/8/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/8/2023	0.5	Correspondence re: Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
James Kang	8/9/2023	1.0	Correspondence re: Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
James Kang	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
-	8/9/2023	1.0		Administrative
James Kang			Piper Sandler retention matters	
James Kang	8/10/2023	0.5	Call with McDermott & counsel re: Piper Sandler retention application	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/10/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/11/2023	0.5	Call with Debtor counsel re: Piper Sandler retention application	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/11/2023	1.0	Workstreams related to Piper Sandler retention application	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	8/11/2023	0.5	Update time logs	Administrative
James Kang	8/11/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/11/2023	0.5	Review of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	8/11/2023	1.0	Internal discussion with M.Genereux re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call re: retention matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/14/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/15/2023	0.5	Preparation of workstreams / deliverables	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/15/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/16/2023	0.5	Internal discussion with M.Genereux re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/17/2023	0.5	Preparation of workstreams / deliverables	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/17/2023	0.5	Review of production / discovery requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
-			Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	-
James Kang	8/17/2023	0.5		Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/18/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/21/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/22/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/23/2023	0.5	Correspondence re: financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/24/2023	1.0	Preparation of Piper Sandler Fee Statement	Administrative
James Kang	8/24/2023	1.0	Internal discussion with M.Genereux re: case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/24/2023	0.5	Update time logs	Administrative

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 64 of 152

James Kang	8/24/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: historical transactions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/24/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	is Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/25/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	is Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/25/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/25/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Committee professionals re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/27/2023	2.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	is Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/28/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	is Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/28/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/29/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/29/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/30/2023	0.5	Discussion with Committee professionals re: historical transactions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/31/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/31/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: case matters	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/31/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		142.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 65 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	6/28/2023	0.5	Review of court filings and first day documents	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	6/28/2023	1.0	Preliminary financial analysis of recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/29/2023	1.0	Preliminary financial analysis of recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	6/29/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: capital structure scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/30/2023	1.5	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/1/2023	3.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/2/2023	2.0	Correspondence re: Piper Sandler EL / retention application	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/4/2023	3.0	Review and analysis of DIP terms in comparable cases	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/5/2023	1.5	Draft and review agenda for call with Debtors' management	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/5/2023	1.0	Financial analysis of recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/6/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/6/2023	1.0	Review of litigation related to adversary proceedings	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/7/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of follow-up to call with management	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/7/2023	2.0	Analysis of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	7/10/2023	3.0	Financial analysis of recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/10/2023	1.5	Analysis of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/12/2023	2.0	Capital structure and transaction analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/13/2023	1.0	Financial analysis of recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: capital structure scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/16/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/16/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: capital structure scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/18/2023	1.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/18/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/18/2023	1.0	Review of Debtors' production and draft of supplemental requests	Document Review and Document Preparation

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 66 of 152

Andrew Zinn	7/18/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/20/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	7/21/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	7/23/2023	1.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/24/2023	1.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	7/26/2023	2.0	Review and analysis of Debtors' production	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/27/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/28/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/31/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	7/31/2023	3.0	Analysis of Debtors' industry peers	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/1/2023	0.5	Review of court documents and materials	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	8/1/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/1/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	8/2/2023	0.5	Preparation of materials for internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/2/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Committee professionals	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/3/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/3/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/4/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/5/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Industry analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/7/2023	1.5	Analysis of precedent transactions in relevant industries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/8/2023	1.0	Analysis of precedent transactions in relevant industries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/8/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/10/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Committee professionals	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/11/2023	2.0	Piper Sandler Retention Matters	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	8/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/15/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 67 of 152

Andrew Zinn	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/17/2023	0.5	Call with Counsel re: Discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/17/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/17/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Committee professionals	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/17/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/18/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/20/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	8/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC meetings	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/24/2023	0.5	Preparation of Piper Sandler Fee Statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	8/24/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/25/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Committee professionals re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/25/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/26/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: historic transactions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/29/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/29/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: historic transactions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/29/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Strategic analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/29/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/30/2023	0.5	Discussion with Committee professionals re: historical transactions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/31/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		133.5		<b>`</b>

Total

133.5

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 68 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/28/2023	0.5	Review of due diligence documents	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	6/29/2023	1.5	DIP comps analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/30/2023	4.0	Analysis of DIP economics and terms	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/2/2023	2.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Morrell	7/3/2023	4.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: Warrants strike price analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
James Morrell	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/6/2023	2.0	DIP comps analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/6/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	7/7/2023	2.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: Recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/7/2023	2.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: Debtors' financials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/10/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: case outcomes	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	7/11/2023	1.0	Analysis of professional fees	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/11/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC advisors call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Morrell	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/13/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	7/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Morrell	7/16/2023	4.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/17/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: industry research & financials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/18/2023	0.5	Parties of interest conflict check	Administrative
James Morrell	7/18/2023	2.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/19/2023	2.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials re recoveries	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/20/2023	2.0	Parties of interest conflict check	Administrative
James Morrell	7/20/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 69 of 152

James Morrell	7/21/2023	2.0	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
James Morrell	7/23/2023	1.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	7/23/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	7/24/2023	2.0	Preparation of document request list	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	7/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
James Morrell	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/27/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	7/28/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/28/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	7/31/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/1/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/1/2023	0.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/2/2023	0.5		
James Morrell		1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
	8/2/2023		UCC professionals standing call	
James Morrell	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/3/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/3/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	8/4/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/5/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Review of debtor's financial projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/13/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/15/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/16/2023	0.5	Call with UCC Counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/16/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/17/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	8/17/2023	0.5	Call with Counsel re: Discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/17/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/17/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/18/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/18/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/19/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/20/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/21/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/22/2023	1.0	Preparation of Piper Sandler Fee Statement	Administrative
James Morrell	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/24/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 70 of 152

James Morrell	8/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/24/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	8/24/2023	1.0	Preparation of Piper Sandler Fee Statement	Administrative
James Morrell	8/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: recent market issuances	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/25/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: recent market issuances / historical transactions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/27/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/28/2023	1.0	Preparation of internal discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/28/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/28/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/29/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/29/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/30/2023	0.5	Call with UCC Counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/30/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	8/30/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/31/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/31/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	8/31/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/31/2023	2.0	Financial Analysis re: High Yield Market Issuance Comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		140.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 71 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joshua Katz	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	6/28/2023	1.0	Review of due diligence documents	Administrative
Joshua Katz	6/28/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	6/29/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, make-whole	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	6/30/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, make-whole	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	6/30/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	6/30/2023	1.0	Call with debtors' advisors (Alvarez & Marsal)	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/1/2023	2.0	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	7/5/2023	0.5	Management question list drafting	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/5/2023	0.5	Call with PSC counsel re retention	Administrative
Joshua Katz	7/5/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/6/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/6/2023	1.0	Analysis of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/7/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion with management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/7/2023	2.0	Preliminary financial analysis re: Debtors' financials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/10/2023	3.0	Final DIP / Second Day Hearing	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	7/10/2023	1.0	Analysis of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/10/2023	0.5	Preparation of internal discussion materials	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	7/11/2023	2.0	Analysis of debtor investment banker fee comps	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/12/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joshua Katz	7/12/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/13/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/14/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, make-whole	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/16/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler retention matters	Administrative
Joshua Katz	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Administrative
Joshua Katz	7/17/2023	2.0	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/17/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/18/2023	2.0	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/18/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	7/19/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/19/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/20/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/21/2023	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv. Hearing on Motion to Compel	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	7/23/2023	1.0	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/24/2023	2.0	Preparation of due diligence requests	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
				-

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 72 of 152

Joshua Katz	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	7/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/26/2023	1.0	Continued Hearing on Langur Maize: Uptier Litigation Stay	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	7/27/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	7/27/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	7/28/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	7/31/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/1/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	8/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/1/2023	0.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/2/2023	1.0	Review of Debtor's production	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/2/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Review of debtor's financial projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz		1.0		
	8/2/2023		UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/3/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/3/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/4/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/5/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/6/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/7/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debt capital markets analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/8/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debt capital markets analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/8/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/8/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/11/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/11/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Industry & debt capital markets analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/11/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	8/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/12/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/12/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/13/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/15/2023	1.0	Call with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/15/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/16/2023		UCC professionals standing call	
		1.0		Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/16/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/17/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	8/17/2023	0.5	Call with UCC Counsel re: Discovery requests	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/17/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/17/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	8/17/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/18/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	8/18/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 73 of 152

Total		118.5		
Joshua Katz	8/26/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	8/25/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/24/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/23/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	8/23/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	8/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 74 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Garry Vaynberg	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Garry Vaynberg	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Garry Vaynberg	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Garry Vaynberg	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Garry Vaynberg	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		8.0		

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of June 27, 2023 to August 31, 2023

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 75 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Randy Yang	6/28/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler / UCC advisors introduction call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Randy Yang	6/29/2023	0.5	Call with UCC counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Randy Yang	6/30/2023	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	7/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	7/11/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal call	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	7/17/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	7/19/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	7/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	8/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	8/2/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Randy Yang	8/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Randy Yang	8/9/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		8.0		

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of June 27, 2023 to August 31, 2023

#### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE SECOND INTERIM FEE PERIOD

Professional	Теат	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	20.0
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	40.5
Mike Genereux	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	74.5
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	219.5
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	210.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	266.5
Joshua Katz	Restructuring Group	Analyst	193.0
Garry Vaynberg	Diversified Industrials	Managing Director	2.0
Randy Yang	Diversified Industrials	Director	2.0
Total Hours			1,028.5
	Category Descript	ion	Hours
	Document Review and Docume	ent Preparation	89.0
	Financial Analysis & Due	Diligence	418.0
	Committee and Committee Advisor	rs Communication	287.5
	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Co	ommunication	11.0
	Creditor and Other Party Con	mmunication	8.0
	37.0		
	Internal Meetings / C	Calls	71.0
	Internal Meetings / C Court Hearings	Calls	71.0 22.0
	e	Calls	

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 77 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	10/18/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' Advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

Total

20.0

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 78 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: claims analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/13/2023	2.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/21/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/10/2023	2.0	UCC advisors meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/11/2023	1.0	Court Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/18/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/19/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/26/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/1/2023	1.0	Meeting with UCC and company management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/3/2023	1.0	Hearing on Discovery Ruling	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	11/4/2023	0.5	Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/7/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement Constructs Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' Advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Meeting re: Standing motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/23/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		40.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 79 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Mike Genereux	9/1/2023	0.5	Advisor discussion re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/5/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: claims analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/11/2023	2.0	Motion to Compel Production Hearing	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	9/13/2023	2.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/13/2023	1.0	Review of discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Mike Genereux	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/19/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/21/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/26/2023	0.5	Review of discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Mike Genereux	9/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	9/27/2023	1.0	Review of discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Mike Genereux	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	9/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/8/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/10/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/10/2023	2.0	UCC advisors meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/11/2023	1.0	Court Hearing	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/12/2023	9.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Mike Genereux	10/13/2023	8.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Mike Genereux	10/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/16/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/18/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/19/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/20/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/22/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/24/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: production materials	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/26/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	10/27/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/28/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	10/30/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/1/2023	1.0	Meeting with UCC and company management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/3/2023	1.0	Hearing on Discovery Ruling	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	11/4/2023	0.5	Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/7/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement Constructs Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/9/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: November business plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 80 of 152

Mike Genereux	11/10/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Discussion of workstreams	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/17/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Recoveries analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Mike Genereux	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' Advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/18/2023	1.0	UCC advisors call re: Standing Motion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Meeting re: Standing motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/24/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Mike Genereux	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/26/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Mike Genereux	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/27/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/28/2023	0.5	Discussion with PJT	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
70. ( )				

Total

74.5

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 81 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	9/1/2023	0.5	Advisor discussion re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/1/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/4/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/5/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/5/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/5/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/6/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Committee professionals re: case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/6/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/6/2023	2.0	Review of financial analysis re: Recovery Analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/7/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/7/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/7/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	9/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: claims analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/8/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/11/2023	2.0	Motion to Compel Production Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	9/11/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/12/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/12/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/12/2023	1.0	Call with McDermott & counsel re: Piper Sandler fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/12/2023	1.0	Review of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	9/12/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/13/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/13/2023	2.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' historical financial condition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/15/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/16/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' historical financial condition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/17/2023	2.0	Review of discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/18/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/19/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/20/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Committee professionals re: case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/20/2023	1.5	UCC professionals meeting and preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/21/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/22/2023	1.0	Meeting with Counsel re: ABL analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/22/2023	2.0	Review of ABL materials and credit agreement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/22/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: financial analysis of Debtor entities	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/24/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/25/2023	1.0	Review of discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/25/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/26/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/26/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
		2.0		· · ·····

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 82 of 152

James Kang	9/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/27/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	9/27/2023	1.0	Review of discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/28/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/28/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/29/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	9/30/2023	3.0	Review of document production	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/2/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtor's advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/3/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal correspondence re: call with Debtor's advisors	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/6/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Kang	10/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/8/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/8/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/9/2023	1.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	10/9/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	10/9/2023	0.5	Review of interim monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	10/9/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/10/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
	10/10/2023	2.0		*
James Kang	10/10/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang			Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/10/2023	2.0	UCC advisors meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/10/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/10/2023	0.5	Review of interim fee application	Administrative
		1.0	Court Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/11/2023			
James Kang	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/17/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/18/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Administrative
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Administrative Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Administrative Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Internal discussion	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: settlement proposal	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/23/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Due Diligence</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/23/2023 10/23/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 2.0 2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: settlement proposal Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/24/2023 10/25/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 2.0 2.0 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC Professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Ginernial Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 2.0 2.0 1.0 1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Diper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Correspondence with Counsel re: financial analysis Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Course count counsel re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Council analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023	1.0         2.0         9.0         8.0         0.5         1.0         1.0         0.5         1.0         1.0         0.5         0.5         1.0         0.5         0.0         1.0         1.0         1.0         1.0         1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Cicc professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Gommittee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
James Kang James Kang	10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/19/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/23/2023 10/23/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/26/2023	1.0 2.0 9.0 8.0 0.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Review of deposition notes / transcript Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion Review of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Review of interim fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim fee application Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal discussion Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. CuC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Other</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Document Review and Document Preparation</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Mee</li></ul>

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 83 of 152

James Kang	10/29/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/30/2023	2.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/30/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/30/2023	0.5	Internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/31/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/1/2023	1.0	Meeting with UCC and company management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/3/2023	1.0	Hearing on Discovery Ruling	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/4/2023	0.5	Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/6/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/7/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/9/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: November business plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/9/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Invoices	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/10/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Discussion of workstreams	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/10/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/11/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/12/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/13/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/14/2023	1.0	Discussion with counsel re: Recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/15/2023	1.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/16/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/16/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/17/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Recoveries analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' Advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/17/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Call with Evercore	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/17/2023	1.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/18/2023	1.0	UCC advisors call re: Standing Motion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/18/2023	5.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/19/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/20/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/21/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Meeting re: Standing Motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/24/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/24/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: 1L term sheet analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/24/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/25/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/26/2023	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
-			Discussion with Evercore	
James Kang	11/26/2023	0.5		Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	11/26/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 84 of 152

Total		219.5		
James Kang	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/28/2023	0.5	Discussion with PJT	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2023	1.0	Review of third monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	11/27/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Counterproposal analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/27/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 85 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	9/1/2023	0.5	Advisor discussion re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/1/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/4/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/5/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/5/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/6/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' projections	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/6/2023	2.5	Financial analysis re: Recovery Analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/7/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/7/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/7/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	9/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: claims analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/11/2023	2.0	Motion to Compel Production Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	9/11/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/12/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/13/2023	2.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' historical financial condition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/15/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/16/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' historical financial condition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/17/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' historical financial condition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/18/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/19/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/20/2023	1.5	UCC professionals meeting and preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/21/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/22/2023	1.0	Meeting with Counsel re: ABL analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/22/2023	2.0	Review of ABL materials and credit agreement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: financial analysis of Debtor entities	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/24/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/26/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: litigation scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/26/2023	1.5	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/28/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/28/2023	2.0	Preparation of deposition questions	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/29/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	9/30/2023	3.0	Review of document production	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/2/2023	2.5	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/4/2023	2.0	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 86 of 152

Andrew Zinn	10/6/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/7/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/8/2023	2.0	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/8/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/9/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/9/2023	1.5	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2023	2.0	UCC advisors meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/11/2023	1.0	Court Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/12/2023	9.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Andrew Zinn	10/11/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/13/2023	8.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Andrew Zinn	10/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/14/2023	1.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/16/2023	1.0	Review of fee application	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/16/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/18/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/19/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/19/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/20/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/22/2023	2.0	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/23/2023	3.0	Document review and preparation of deposition questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2023	1.5	Correspondence with legal advisors re: case analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: term sheets & proposals	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/26/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/27/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/28/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/29/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/30/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/31/2023	1.5	Analysis & correspondence re: settlement proposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/1/2023	1.0	Meeting with UCC and company management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/3/2023	1.0	Hearing on Discovery Ruling	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/4/2023	0.5	Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/7/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: November business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: November business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Discussion re: November business plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: November business plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Invoices	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/9/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/10/2023	2.0	Review of Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/10/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Discussion of workstreams	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/10/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
				· •

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 87 of 152

Andrew Zinn	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/14/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel re: Recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/15/2023	2.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/16/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/17/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Recoveries analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/17/2023	1.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/18/2023	1.0	UCC advisors call re: Standing Motion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/18/2023	5.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/19/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/20/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/21/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler Internal Meeting re: Standing motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/24/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/24/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: 1L term sheet analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/24/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		210.5		<b>`</b>

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 88 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	9/1/2023	0.5	Advisor discussion re: production	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/1/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/1/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/2/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Capital market analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/4/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/4/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/5/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/5/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/5/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/6/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/6/2023	1.0	Preparation of discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/7/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/7/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/7/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	9/7/2023	1.0	Financial Analysis re: recoveries analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/7/2023	1.0	Advisor discussion re: financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/8/2023	2.0	Preparation of first interim fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/8/2023	2.0	Advisor discussion re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/9/2023	1.0	Preparation of first interim fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/10/2023	1.0	Preparation of first interim fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/11/2023	2.0	Motion to Compel Production Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	9/11/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/12/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: first interim fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/12/2023	0.5	Review of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/12/2023	1.0	Parties in interest / conflict checks	Administrative
James Morrell	9/12/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/12/2023	1.0	Review of financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/13/2023	2.0	Meeting of professionals	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/14/2023	0.5	Internal correspondence re: Parties in interest / conflict checks	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/14/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/14/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/15/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/16/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/17/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/18/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/19/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/20/2023	2.0	Financial Analysis re: recoveries analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/21/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/21/2023	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/22/2023	2.0	Financial Analysis re: recoveries analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 89 of 152

James Morrell	9/22/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/22/2023	1.0	Meeting with Counsel re: ABL analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/22/2023	2.0	Review of ABL materials and credit agreement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/24/2023	2.0	Financial Analysis re: recoveries analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/25/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: recoveries analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/26/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/26/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/26/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/27/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	9/28/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	9/29/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/2/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/4/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	10/4/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/5/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/5/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/6/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee application	Administrative
James Morrell	10/6/2023	2.0		
James Morrell			Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
	10/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/7/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/8/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/9/2023	3.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/9/2023	2.0	Drafting of Carlyle Deposition Questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/9/2023	1.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
James Morrell	10/9/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/9/2023	2.0 1.0	Due diligence materials / production review Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement	Document Review and Document Preparation Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023			-
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023	1.0 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 2.0 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/12/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/15/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/15/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/15/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/15/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript Preparation of interim fee application	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript Preparation of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/12/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/15/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/17/2023 10/17/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript Preparation of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/14/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/18/2023 10/18/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Reparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript Preparation of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell	10/9/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/10/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/11/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/13/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/16/2023 10/18/2023 10/18/2023 10/18/2023	1.0 2.0 1.0 2.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 9.0 2.0 8.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 0 1.0 0.5 1.0 0 0.5 0 0.5 1.0 0 0.5 0 0.5 1.0 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 1.0 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 0 0.5 0.5	Internal discussion re: interim monthly fee statement Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition UCC advisors meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application Court Hearing UCC professionals standing call Preparation of interim monthly fee statement Carlyle Deposition Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Carlyle Deposition Internal discussion re: depositions Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Preparation of interim fee application Due diligence materials / production review Correspondence with Counsel re: depositions Review of deposition notes / transcript Preparation of interim fee application UCC professionals standing call Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim monthly fee application Correspondence with Counsel re: filing interim monthly fee application	Internal Meetings / Calls Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Other Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Document Review and Document Preparation Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 90 of 152

James Morrell	10/21/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/22/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/23/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/23/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/23/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: recovery and case scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/24/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/26/2023	1.0	Drafting of Deposition Questions	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/26/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/26/2023	0.5	Correspondence with advisors re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/27/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/28/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/29/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/30/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/31/2023	1.0	Kobre & Kim Discovery Dispute Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/31/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: settlement proposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/1/2023	1.0	Meeting with UCC and company management	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/1/2023	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/2/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/7/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/7/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/8/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/8/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: November business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: November business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal discussion re: November business plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/9/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: November business plan	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Morrell	11/9/2023	0.5	*	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
			Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement	
James Morrell	11/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/10/2023	2.0	Review of Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/10/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/10/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Discussion of workstreams	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery Scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/13/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery Scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/14/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/14/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel re: Recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/15/2023	3.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/16/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/17/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Recoveries analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Morrell	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with debtors' advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/17/2023	3.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/18/2023	1.0	UCC advisors call re: Standing Motion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/18/2023	5.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/19/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/20/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/21/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Standing motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/24/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 91 of 152

Tatal		266 5		
James Morrell	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/28/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/27/2023	2.0	Preparation of third monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/27/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Counterproposal analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/26/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Morrell	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/26/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Counterproposal analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Counterproposal analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/24/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/24/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: 1L term sheet analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls

Total

266.5

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joshua Katz	9/4/2023	1.0	Internal document review	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	9/4/2023	1.0	Preparation for internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	9/4/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Capital market analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	9/5/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	9/5/2023	1.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
oshua Katz	9/5/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/6/2023	1.5	Preparation of discussion materials & financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/7/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/7/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/8/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: claims analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/8/2023	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
oshua Katz	9/9/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/10/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/11/2023	2.0	Motion to Compel Production Hearing	Court Hearings
oshua Katz	9/11/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/12/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/12/2023	1.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
oshua Katz	9/13/2023	2.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/14/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/15/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/15/2023	1.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
oshua Katz	9/16/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/17/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/18/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/18/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/19/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/19/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
			· •	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/20/2023	1.5	UCC professionals meeting and preparation	
oshua Katz	9/21/2023 9/21/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz		0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/21/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/21/2023	3.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
oshua Katz	9/22/2023	1.0	Meeting with Counsel re: ABL analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/22/2023	0.5	Review of ABL materials and credit agreement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/22/2023	0.5	UCC professionals meeting re: financial analysis of Debtor entities	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/23/2023	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
oshua Katz	9/24/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/24/2023	1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
oshua Katz	9/25/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/25/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/26/2023	1.0	UCC professionals meeting re: preparation of deposition questions	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/26/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
oshua Katz	9/26/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
oshua Katz	9/26/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
oshua Katz	9/27/2023	1.0	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 93 of 152

Joshua Katz	9/29/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	9/29/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	9/30/2023	0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/1/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/3/2023	0.5	Call with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Capital market analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/7/2023	2.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/4/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/4/2023	3.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	10/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: financial analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/5/2023	2.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	10/7/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/8/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/9/2023	3.0		Document Review and Document Preparation
			Due diligence materials / production review	
Joshua Katz	10/9/2023	1.5	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Joshua Katz	10/9/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/10/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Counsel re: Carlyle deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/10/2023	2.0	UCC advisors meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/10/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/10/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/11/2023	1.0	Court Hearing	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	10/11/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Interim fee application	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/11/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	10/12/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/12/2023	9.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Joshua Katz	10/12/2023	1.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/13/2023	8.0	Carlyle Deposition	Other
Joshua Katz	10/13/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: depositions	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/14/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/14/2023	0.5	Internal discussion re: workstreams / deliverables	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	10/16/2023	2.0	Review of deposition notes / transcript	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	10/16/2023	2.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Joshua Katz				
	10/16/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
	10/16/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	10/17/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023	2.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/22/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/26/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/26/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/22/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/22/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Meeting with UCC and company management	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Meeting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Meeting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Administrative Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 11/2/2023 11/3/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UcC professionals standing call UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal Piper Sandler internal meeting	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> </ul>
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023 11/2/2023 11/2/2023 11/2/2023 11/4/2023	2.0 1.0 0.5 2.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Meeting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal Piper Sandler internal meeting UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 11/2/2023 11/4/2023 11/7/2023 11/7/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call DCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Gueting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal Piper Sandler internal meeting UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion Piper Sandler internal meeting	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/22/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/29/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 11/2/2023 11/4/2023 11/7/2023 11/7/2023 11/7/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Meeting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal Piper Sandler internal meeting UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: November business plan	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	10/17/2023 10/18/2023 10/19/2023 10/20/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/28/2023 10/29/2023 10/30/2023 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 11/2/2023 11/4/2023 11/7/2023 11/7/2023	2.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.5 0.5 1.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 1.0 1.0 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5 0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call DCC Meeting Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. UCC professionals standing call UCC Meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc. Update time records Gueting with UCC and company management UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Hearing on Discovery Ruling Internal catch-up re: Counterproposal Piper Sandler internal meeting UCC advisors meeting re: Settlement constructs discussion Piper Sandler internal meeting	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Administrative</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 94 of 152

Joshua Katz	11/9/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal discussion re: November business plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/9/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/9/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: November business plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/9/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Invoices	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/9/2023	0.5	Update to fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	11/10/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/10/2023	2.0	Review of Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/10/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Discussion of workstreams	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/11/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/13/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	11/14/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	11/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/14/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel re: Recovery scenarios	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/15/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/15/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/15/2023	1.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/16/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/16/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recovery scenarios	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/16/2023	0.5	Discussion with counsel	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/17/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Recoveries analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joshua Katz	11/17/2023	1.0	Meeting with Debtors' advisors re: Business plan overview	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/20/2023	2.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/21/2023	4.0	Review of Standing Motion draft	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/22/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/22/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Standing motion review	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/24/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joshua Katz	11/24/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/24/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: 1L term sheet analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/24/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	11/25/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: Counterproposal discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/26/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/26/2023	1.0	Plan settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/26/2023	0.5	Discussion with Evercore	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joshua Katz	11/27/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	11/27/2023	0.5	UCC advisors meeting re: UCC counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/27/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel re: Counterproposal	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/27/2023	2.0	Preparation of third monthly fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	11/29/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	11/30/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		193.0		

Total

193.0

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 95 of 152

Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Garry Vaynberg	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Garry Vaynberg	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		2.0		

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 96 of 152

Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of September 1, 2023 to November 30, 2023

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Randy Yang	9/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Randy Yang	9/25/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		2.0		

#### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE THIRD INTERIM FEE PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	34.0
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	48.0
Mike Genereux	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	30.5
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	172.5
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	178.0
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	201.0
Joshua Katz	Restructuring Group	Analyst	157.0
Total Hours			821.0
	Category Descript	ion	Hours
	12.5		
	426.5		
		Diligence	720.5
	Committee and Committee Advisor	e	183.0
	•	rs Communication	
	Committee and Committee Advisor	rs Communication	183.0
	Committee and Committee Advisor Creditor and Other Party Con	rs Communication mmunication	183.0 6.0
	Committee and Committee Advisor Creditor and Other Party Con Administrative	rs Communication mmunication	183.0 6.0 26.5

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 98 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	1/18/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	1/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	1/26/2024	1.0	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Bilal Bazzy	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	1/30/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	1/30/2024	0.5	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Bilal Bazzy	1/31/2024	1.0	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Bilal Bazzy	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/5/2024	1.0	Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Bilal Bazzy	2/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	2/8/2024	1.0	PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/9/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	2/13/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	2/14/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	2/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	2/19/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls

Total

34.0

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/12/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/15/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/28/2023	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/3/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/4/2024	1.0	Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	1/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	1/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	1/26/2024	1.0	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	1/29/2024	1.0	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	1/30/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	1/31/2024	2.0	Review of materials re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/5/2024	1.0	Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joseph Denham	2/6/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	2/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	2/8/2024	1.0	PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/9/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	2/12/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/13/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	2/14/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	2/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	2/19/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	2/21/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
		48.0		

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 100 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Mike Genereux	12/1/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/5/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/6/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/7/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffen	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	12/12/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/15/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/18/2023	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	12/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/3/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Rule Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/4/2024	1.0	Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	1/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/18/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	1/18/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Case Matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	1/19/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Case Matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
Mike Genereux	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Mike Genereux	1/23/2024	1.0	Stipulation Status Conference	Court Hearings
Mike Genereux	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

Total

30.5

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 101 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Junx 50, Junx 50, Junx 50, Junx 50,Junx 50, Junx 50, <br< th=""><th>Professional</th><th>Date</th><th>Hours</th><th>Description</th><th>Category</th></br<>	Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Jame Ku19202019Pipe Audio internal meetingInternal Audio 2 (A)Jame Kug12302010Granical analysis code tocheshie analysisAnnel Audio 2 (A)Jame Kug12402010Genereporties with brokene col Unahysis of exter frage of AdA BaleEmail Analysis A Doe Dilgene:Jame Kug12402010Genereporties with brokene col Unahysis of exter frage of AdA BaleEmail Analysis A Doe Dilgene:Jame Kug12502010Genereporties with brokene col Unahysis of exter frage of AdA BaleCommittee ad Committee Advisona CommunicationJame Kug12502010Genereporties with brokene col Cal Advisona CommunicationEmail Monitys CallsJame Kug12602010Generies Advisona Committee Advisona CommunicationEmail Monitys A Doe Dilgene:Jame Kug12602010Fersinale internal motingCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug12702010Fersinale internal motingCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug12702010Fersinale internal Advison Advisona CommittationCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug12702010Fersinale internale Columation Fersina Advisona CommittationCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug127020010Fersinale internale Columation FersionCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug127020010Fersinale internale Columation FersionCommittee Advisona CommittationJame Kug127020010Fersinale internale internale Columation FersionCommittee Advisona Committation </td <td>James Kang</td> <td>12/1/2023</td> <td>0.5</td> <td>Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion</td> <td>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</td>	James Kang	12/1/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jams Kay1230231.0Fancai analysis : Act stabilis of expert sport of Mak BacFancial Analysis : Abe DilgenceJams Kay1240231.0Creanedance: eCli Canaja in and valie look dataComine and Comine Advisor Commanism inJams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with values of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with values of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with acoustic : Analysis of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with acoustic : Analysis of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with acoustic : Analysis of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1240201.0Creanepadere with acoustic : Analysis of expert sport of Mak BacEvent Macing Cali.Jams Kay1270201.0Poter Macing Cali.Contineer ad Counties Advisors CommaniantsJams Kay1270201.0Poter Macing Cali.Counties ad Counties Advisors CommaniantsJams Kay1270201.0Poter Sub Cali.Counties ad Counties Advisors CommaniantsJams Kay1270201.0Poter Sub Cali.Counties ad Counties Advisors CommaniantsJams Kay1270201.0Poter Sub Cali.Counties ad Counties Advisors CountiantsJams Kay1270201.0Counties ad Counties Advisors CountiantsCounties ad Counties Advisors CountiantsJams Kay1270200 <t< td=""><td>James Kang</td><td>12/1/2023</td><td>0.5</td><td>Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement</td><td>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</td></t<>	James Kang	12/1/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Janes Kee124/2034.9Financial analysis C. Analysis of expertperf of Mak RadiFinancial Analysis A. De DingeneJanes Kee124/2031.0Correspondence with prevince re. GLC analysis and vache Ved MatlCommittee and Committee Analysis of expert perf of Mak RadiJanes Kee124/2031.0Correspondence with prevince re. GLC analysis and vache Ved MatlCommittee and Committee Analysis of expert perf of Mak RadiJanes Kee124/2031.0Correspondence with prevince re. GLC analysis and vache Part perf of Mak RadiCommittee and Committee Analysis of Analysis A. De Dinke Analysis A. De Dinkee Anal	James Kang	12/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Jank Ya124/20312Conceptables with Province CUC analysis and worke led attailConsume and Committee Advices CommunicationJank Kag124/202312Generational reality of any perty perty of Mark BaleConsume and Committee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag125/20313Generational reality of any perty perty Mark BaleConsume and Committee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag125/20314Generational reality of any perty perty Mark BaleConsume and Committee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag126/20313Generational reality of any perty perty Mark BaleConsume and Committee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag126/20314Obdocy Motion for early of mode Advices Constrained Statistical Committee Advices CommunicationCommittee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20313Obdocy Motion for early of mode Advices Constrained Statistical Committee Advices CommunicationCommittee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20313Obdocy Motion for early of mode Advices Committee Advices CommunicationCommittee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20313Obdocy Motion for early of mode Advices Committee Advices CommunicationCommittee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20314Obdocy Motion for Education Florid Staffand Contant exportAnimative Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20315Advices Advices Committee Advices CommunicationCommittee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag127/20316Advices Advices Committee Advices Committee Advices CommunicationJanes Kag<	James Kang	12/3/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: debt schedule analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kag124/202316.5Poper Sandler internal meeting ex: Analysis of expert report of Mark RuleInternal Meeting / CallsJames Kag124/202312.9Correspondence with counsile ix: Analysis of expert report OMAR RuleCommitte and Committe Advisore CommanicationJames Kag125/202312.9Correspondence with counsile ix: Analysis of expert reportCommitte and Committe Advisore CommanicationJames Kag126/202312.9Correspondence with counsile ix: Analysis of Experiment meetingCommitte and Noneshis A De DisposeJames Kag126/202312.9Debtors: Mactine Reversion and Venterment analysisCommittee and Committee Advisore CommanicationJames Kag126/202312.9Debtors: Mactine Reversion and Venterment analysisCommittee and Committee Advisore CommanicationJames Kag127/202312.9Debtors: Mactine Reversion and Venterment analysisCommittee and Committee Advisore CommanicationJames Kag127/202312.9Debtors: Mactine advisories: Colls Selferin's DebtariasCommittee and Committee Advisore CommanicationJames Kag121/202313.9Correspondence Selferin Traditation ProfessionalCommittee advisore: Colls SelferinJames Kag121/202315.9Correspondence Selferin TraditationCommittee Advisore: Committee Advisore: Comm	James Kang	12/4/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Janes Kang19420319.1Correspondence with council re Analysis of expert report of Mak RuleCommittee and Committee Advisors CommitteeJanes Kang125/0206.5FOR Saullei internal meetingInternal Meeting / ClailJanes Kang126/0202.9Fibre Saullei internal meetingInternal Meeting / ClailJanes Kang126/0202.9Fibre Saullei internal meetingInternal Meeting / ClailJanes Kang126/0202.9Fibre Saullei internal meetingCommittee and Meetings / ClailJanes Kang127/0201.0Otto Correlosions standing andCommittee and Committee Advisors CommitteeJanes Kang127/0201.0Otto Fibre Saullei internal meeting in the Desis Safefin DelanationCommittee and Committee Advisors CommitteeJanes Kang121/0203.5Fibre Saullei internal meeting in the Desis Safefin DelanationInternal Advisors Committee Advisors CommitteeJanes Kang121/0203.5Fibre Saullei internal meeting in the Desis Safefin DelanationInternal Advisors Committee Advisors CommitteeJanes Kang121/0203.5Fibre Saullei internal meeting in the Desis Safefin DelanationInternal Advisors Committee Advisors Committ	James Kang	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jame Kag12 Sr2030.5Pipe Sandie infernationed per Sandie infernatione poet roportInternal Meetings / CaliJames Kag12 Sr2032.0UCC advisors discussion er. Platinum expet roportCommitte add Committe Advisors CommitancianJames Kag12 Gr2032.0Finacial analysis re. Reversion and etitement analysisFinacial Analysis & Dav DilageneeJames Kag12 Gr2031.0UCC professional standing allCommitte add Committe Advisors Committe addJames Kag12 70231.0UCC startistic field in Startistic Advisors Committe addCommitte add Committe Advisors Committe addJames Kag12 702030.5Finacial analysis re. Reversion add off field in Startistic Advisors Committe addCommitte add Committe Advisors Committe addJames Kag12 702030.5Finacial analysis re. Reversion add off field in Startistic Advisors Committe addCommitte addJames Kag12 702030.5Advisors discussionCommitte addCommitte addJames Kag12 102030.5Advisors discussion re. Devisors off add field related programAdmisistraticJames Kag12 102031.0Committe add Committee Advisors CommunicationCommittee addJames Kag12 102031.0Finacial analysis re. Reversion add off field in devisorsAdmisistraticJames Kag12 102031.0Finacial analysis re. Reversion add refifies add ref	James Kang	12/4/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Internal Meetings / Calls
Inters Kang1.921.9UCC alvison discussion: Plantame very reportCommittee and committee davison Committee	James Kang	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jank Ag195295Piper Sanller intermitations' recoveries and settlement analysisInternal Maxings / CallsJanes Kag126/202310Uccorpolisional stational settlement analysisCommittee and issuites Advisors CommunicationJanes Kag127/202310Deboer' Motion for early of an Orich Approving Claim Objection and Settlement ProceeduresCommittee and issuites Advisors CommunicationJanes Kag127/202310Octomatice and issuites Advisors CommunicationFinancial analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/202310Octomatice and issuites Advisors CommunicationFinancial analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Octomatice and issuites Advisors CommunicationFinancial analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Octomatice and issuites Advisors CommunicationCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJanes Kag127/102310Octomatice and issuitesCommittee and vessions CommunicationJanes Kag127/102310Octomatice Advisors CommunicationFinancial Analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Octomatice Advisors CommunicationFinancial Analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Financial analysis recoveris and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Financial analysis recoveris and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis At De DilaysesJanes Kag127/102310Financial analysis recoveris and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis At De Dilayses <tr<< td=""><td>James Kang</td><td>12/5/2023</td><td>0.5</td><td>Piper Sandler internal meeting</td><td>Internal Meetings / Calls</td></tr<<>	James Kang	12/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Jams Kag12620332.0Financial analysis re. Recorders and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis A. Dae DiligneeJams Kag12620231.0Debters' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJams Kag12720231.0Debters' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Standing	James Kang	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang126202310CCC professionals standing cullCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang1270202310Debters' Motion for entry of an Oct Approving Claim Objection and Settlement ProceduresCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang1270202305Fibancial analysis re: Review of aft of Boris Steffers DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Dae DiliganceJames Kang1210202305Fibancial analysis re: Review of aft of Boris Steffers DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Dae DiliganceJames Kang1210202305Advisors discussion of Steffer Aft rebuttle reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1211202305Advisors discussion of Steffer Aft rebuttle reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1211202305Advisors discussion of Steffer Aft rebuttle reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1211202305Fibancial analysis re: Revore rise and steffers the attentCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1211202305Fibancial analysis re: Revore rise and steffers DeclarationFinancial Analysis & De DiliganceJames Kang1211202310Fibancial analysis re: Revore rise and steffers DeclarationFinancial Analysis & De DiliganceJames Kang1211202310Fibancial analysis re: Revore rise and steffers DeclarationFibancial Analysis & De DiliganceJames Kang1211202310Fibancial analysis re: Revore stand steffers DeclarationFibancial Analysis & De DiliganceJames Kang12112023	James Kang	12/6/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Jans Kag1.9Debon' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Chain Objection and Settlement ProceedumsCent HarringJans Kag127/20231.9Committee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag127/20230.5Financial analysis: re: Review of dnf of Boris Steffer's DecharationFinancial Analysis & De DiliganceJans Kag121/20230.5Piper Sandler interval meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffer's DecharationInterval Analysis & De DiliganceJans Kag121/20230.5Order Steffer's Declaration of Steffer And Revital reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/20230.5Advisors discussions of Steffer And Revital reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/20230.5Advisors discussions of Steffer And Revital reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/20230.5Advisors discussions of Steffer And Revital reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/20230.5Financial analysis re: Review of dnf of Boris Steffer's DeclarationHernal Analysis & Due DilganceJans Kag121/40230.5Financial analysis re: Review of dnf of Boris Steffer's DeclarationCommittee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/40230.5Financial analysis re: Review of dnf of Boris Steffer's DeclarationCommittee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/40230.5Financial analysis re: Review of dnf of Boris Steffer's DeclarationCommittee Advisors CommunicationJans Kag121/40230.5Financia	James Kang	12/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang1.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang127/00230.5Advisors discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang127/00230.5Fiper Sandle internal meeting: Peaker and the Stefferh DeclarationInstead Manabysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang121/102030.5Option to interco offer and the obtained Points StefferhInstead Manabysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang121/102030.5Advisors discussion of Stefferh and rebuttal reportCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang121/102030.5Advisors discussion of Stefferh and rebuttal reportCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang121/102030.5Advisors discussion result neeroodsAdministrativeJames Kang121/102030.5Option Stefferh and rebuttal reportCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang121/102030.5Option Stefferh StefferhDeclarationJames Kang121/102030.5Financial analysis re: Recoverise and settement analysisCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang121/102030.5Financial analysis re: Recoverise and settement analysisCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang121/102030.5Financial analysis re: Recoverise and settement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang121/102030.5Financial analysis re: Recoverise and settement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang121/182030.5Financial analysis re: Recover	James Kang	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Janes Kang127/20230.5Advisors discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommitationJanes Kang129/20230.5Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Bor's Steffers DeclarationFinancial Analysis A Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/20230.5Piper Stadler interal meeting: re: Declaration of Bor's StefferInternal Meeting-CallsJanes Kang121/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Sicassion of Steffer draft rebutul reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJanes Kang121/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Sicassion of Steffer draft rebutul reportAdministrativeJanes Kang121/20230.5Review of fers statementAdministrativeJanes Kang121/20230.5Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationInternal Accumitee Advisors CommunicationJanes Kang121/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilgenceJanes Kang121/2023<	James Kang	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
James Karg1.29/20233.0Financial analysis re. Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis 4. Due DiligenceJames Karg12/10/20230.5Piper Sandler internal meeting re. Declaration of Boris Steffer'sInternal Meetings / CallsJames Karg12/12/20230.5Advisoris discussion of Steffer draft protubat reportsCommittee and Committee Advisoris CommunicationJames Karg12/13/20230.5Advisoris discussion of Steffer draft protubat reportsAdministrativeJames Karg12/13/20230.5Review of free statementAdministrativeJames Karg12/14/20230.5Financial analysis re. Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis A Due DiligenceJames Karg12/14/20231.0Financial analysis re. Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis A Due DiligenceJames Karg12/14/20231.0Financial analysis re. Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis A Due DiligenceJames Karg12/14/20231.0Financial analysis re. Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis A Due DiligenceJames Karg12/14/20231.0Advisoris discussion re. Steffered Telectural metricgCommittee advisoris CommunicationJames Karg12/18/20231.0Review ad preparation of fiser aduetement analysisFinancial Analysis A Due DiligenceJames Karg12/18/20231.0Review ad preparation of internal discussionGorimittee advisoris CommunicationJames Karg12/18/20231.0	James Kang	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jams Kang12/10/2030.5Fiper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris SteffenInternal Meeting / CallsJams Kang12/11/2030.5Advisors discussion re: Becaussion of Steffen draft rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/11/2030.5Advisors discussion re: Steffen draft rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/11/20230.5Review of fe statementAdministrativeJams Kang12/11/20230.5Fiper Sandler internal meeting:Committee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/14/2030.5Fiper Sandler internal meeting:Committee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/14/2031.0Granacial analysis: re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJams Kang12/14/2031.0Financial analysis: re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationCommittee advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/14/2031.0Financial analysis: re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationCommittee advisors CommunicationJams Kang12/15/2030.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJams Kang12/18/2031.0Review and preparation of internal meetingFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJams Kang12/18/2031.0Review and preparation of internal meetingInternal Analysis & Due DiligenceJams Kang12/18/2030.5Gramspatiene analysisCommittee advisors CommunicationJams Kang<	James Kang	12/7/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/11/20230.5Chydate to time recordsAdministrativeJames Kang12/11/20230.5Advisors discussion or Ebiscusion of Steffen drult reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/13/20230.5Chydroson of Steffen drult rebutul reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/13/20230.5Piper Standier internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/14/20230.5Piper Standier internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/14/20230.6Financial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/14/20230.6Financial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/15/20230.5Frinancial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/15/20230.5Frinancial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Frinancial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Financial analysis re: Recoveries and stetlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Correspondere with Province re: CUC analysis and vendor level detallCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/18/20230.5Correspondere with Province re	James Kang	12/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang[21/22/23]0.5Advisors discussion re Discussion of Steffen drift rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/32/23]1.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/32/23]0.5Review of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang[21/12/23]0.5Teper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meeting/ CallsJames Kang[21/12/23]1.0UCC MeetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/12/23]1.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang[21/12/23]1.0Advisors discussion re: Bule rebuttal reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/12/23]1.0Advisors discussion re: Bule rebuttal reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/12/23]1.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang[21/18/23]1.0Review and preparation of internal discussionCourt HerringJames Kang[21/18/23]1.0Review and preparation of internal discussionCourt HerringJames Kang[21/18/23]1.0Review and preparation of internal discussionCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/18/23]1.0Review and preparation of internal discussionCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21/18/23]1.0Correspondence with Povince re: GUC analysis and vendor level detai	James Kang	12/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffen	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang1/21/3/2031/0LCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang1/21/3/2030.5Review of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang1/21/3/2030.5Fiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang1/21/4/2031.0LCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang1/21/4/2031.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang1/21/5/2031.0Advisors discussion: Exler elutral reportCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1/21/5/2030.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang1/21/8/2031.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang1/21/8/2033.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang1/21/8/2033.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang1/21/8/2033.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang1/21/8/2031.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1/21/8/2031.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang1/21/8/2031.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC anal	James Kang	12/11/2023	0.5	Update to time records	Administrative
James Kang[21]320230.5Review of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang[21]420230.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meeting / CallsJames Kang[21]420231.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21]420232.0Financial analysis re: Revover is and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang[21]420231.0Gramstanalysis re: Review of drift of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang[21]520231.0Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttle portCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21]520231.0Review and preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang[21]820231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang[21]820231.0Review and preparation of internal meetingCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21]820231.0Review and preparation of internal meetingInternal Meeting / CallsJames Kang[21920330.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21920331.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[21920331.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang[22020331.	James Kang	12/12/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
NormInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/14/20231.0COC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/14/20232.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/14/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of afral of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/15/20231.0Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/15/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Status ConferenceCommittee advisors AdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussionGomittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailGomittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailGomittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Coc Guession re: Settlement discussionGomittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspon	James Kang	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/14/20231.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/14/20232.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/15/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffer's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/15/20231.0Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/15/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/18/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Corre	James Kang	12/13/2023	0.5	Review of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang12/14/20232.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/15/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/15/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Offereparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Offereparation of internal discussionGommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with covince re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20231.0CUC discussion re: Se	James Kang	12/13/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang12/14/20231.0Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's DeclarationFinancial Analysis & Due DilegeneeJames Kang12/15/20231.0Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal reportCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/18/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DilegeneeJames Kang12/18/20230.5Orrespondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/2031.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/2031.0Correspondence with counse	James Kang	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Karg1/2/15/2031.0Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal reportCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/15/2030.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Karg1/2/18/2031.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Karg1/2/18/2033.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Karg1/2/18/2030.5Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Karg1/2/19/2030.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/19/2030.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/20/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionFinancial analysis & Due DiligenceJames Karg1/2/20/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionGommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/20/2031.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/20/2031.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Karg1/2/2/2031.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisGommittee advisors CommunicationJames Karg1/2/2/2031.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and s	James Kang	12/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang12/15/20230.5Preparation of fee statementAdministrativeJames Kang12/18/20231.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang12/18/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC Difersionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang <t< td=""><td>James Kang</td><td>12/14/2023</td><td>1.0</td><td>Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration</td><td>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</td></t<>	James Kang	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang12/18/20231.0Katus ConferenceCourt HearingsJames Kang12/18/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/19/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	James Kang	12/15/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/18/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/19/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & D	James Kang	12/15/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang12/18/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/18/20230.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/19/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Com	James Kang	12/18/2023	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang12/18/20230.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJames Kang12/19/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors Commun	James Kang	12/18/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang12/19/20230.5Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Commitee Advisors CommunicationJame	James Kang	12/18/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang12/19/20230.5Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detailCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors	James Kang	12/18/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang12/20/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement discussionCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/20/20233.0Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/20/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with coursel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/19/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/20/2031.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/2031.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/2031.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/2031.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/2031.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/2031.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/2031.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/21/20231.0UCC MeetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/20/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang12/21/20231.0Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysisFinancial Analysis & Due DiligenceJames Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/21/20231.0Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysisCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang12/22/20231.0UCC discussion re: Settlement updateCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJames Kang12/27/20231.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/21/2023	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang     12/27/2023     1.0     UCC professionals standing call     Committee and Committee Advisors Communication	James Kang	12/21/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
	James Kang	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang 12/28/2023 1.0 UCC Meeting Committee Advisors Communication	-				Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
	James Kang	12/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang 12/28/2023 1.0 Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis Financial Analysis & Due Diligence	-				, 0
James Kang 1/2/2024 2.0 Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Financial Analysis & Due Diligence					
James Kang1/3/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / Calls	-				-
James Kang 1/3/2024 1.0 UCC professionals standing call Committee Advisors Communication	-				Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang 1/3/2024 1.0 Financial analysis re: Rule Report Financial Analysis & Due Diligence	-				
James Kang 1/4/2024 1.0 UCC meeting Committee Advisors Communication	-			-	
James Kang 1/4/2024 1.0 UCC advisors discussion re: Rule Deposition Committee Advisors Communication				-	
James Kang 1/4/2024 1.0 Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation Court Hearings	-				-
James Kang 1/5/2024 2.0 Financial analysis re: Expert Report Financial Analysis & Due Diligence	-				
James Kang 1/8/2024 0.5 Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal Meetings / Calls					
James Kang1/9/20240.5Update of time recordsAdministrative	-				
James Kang1/9/20240.5Review of fee statementAdministrative	James Kang	1/9/2024			Administrative
James Kang 1/10/2024 1.0 UCC professionals standing call Committee Advisors Communication					
James Kang 1/11/2024 1.0 Disclosure Statement Hearing Court Hearings	James Kang	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 102 of 152

James Kang	1/12/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/13/2024	0.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/15/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/16/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/17/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Fee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/17/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/17/2024	0.5	Review of fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	1/17/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/18/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/18/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Case matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/18/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
James Kang	1/19/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Case Matters	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/19/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/20/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/20/2024	0.5	Correspondence with Province: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/20/2024	0.5	Correspondence with Counsel: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/21/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/22/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/22/2024	1.0	Preparation of fee application	Administrative
James Kang	1/23/2024	1.0	Stipulation Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	1/23/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/23/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
James Kang	1/23/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	1/24/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	1/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/26/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/27/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/28/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/29/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/30/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	1/29/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/3/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/5/2024	1.0	Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	2/5/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/6/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/6/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/6/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	2/7/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/8/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/8/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/8/2024	1.0	PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/9/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/9/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/10/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 103 of 152

James Kang	2/12/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/13/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/14/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/14/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/14/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/14/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	2/15/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	2/16/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/19/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/19/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Expert Report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	2/19/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/20/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/21/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	2/28/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	2/29/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		172.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 104 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	12/1/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/1/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/3/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: debt schedule analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/4/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/4/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/4/2023	0.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	12/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/6/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/7/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffen	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/12/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/13/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/13/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/14/2023	0.5	Update to time records	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/15/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/15/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2023	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/19/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/20/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/20/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/21/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	12/21/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/28/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/2/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: First Amended Disclosure Statement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/2/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/3/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/3/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Rule Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/3/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Rule Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/4/2024	1.0	Update of time records	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	1/4/2024	1.0	Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	1/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/9/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 105 of 152

Andrew Zinn	1/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	1/12/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/12/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Disclosure Statement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/15/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/16/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/17/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/17/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/17/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/18/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/18/2024	1.0	Correspondence with coursel re: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/18/2024	1.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	1/18/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/19/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/22/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/23/2024	1.0	Stipulation Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	1/24/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	1/26/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/26/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/29/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/30/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	1/30/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/31/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	2/1/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	2/1/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Expert Report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	2/2/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Workplan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	2/2/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024		Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	,
Andrew Zinn				Creditor and Other Party Communication
- maren Emm	2/5/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024	2.0 3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Court Hearings Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Ext capital structure	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Dirial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Ext Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis UCC professionals standing call	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5 1.0 1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Diper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Ext capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/15/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Diper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Sinancial analysis re: Exit capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/15/2024 2/16/2024 2/19/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 4.0 3.0 3.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Sinancial analysis re: Extre Report Sinancial analysis re: Extre Report Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	2/5/2024 2/6/2024 2/7/2024 2/8/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/9/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/12/2024 2/13/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/14/2024 2/15/2024 2/16/2024 2/19/2024	2.0 3.0 1.0 1.0 1.0 0.5 3.0 1.0 4.0 1.0 3.0 0.5 3.5 1.5 1.0 1.0 4.0 3.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report Diper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing Trial Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Trial Financial analysis re: Expert Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Sinancial analysis re: Extre Report Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting Financial analysis re: Expert Report Financial analysis re: Expert Report	<ul> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Internal Meetings / Calls</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Court Hearings</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> <li>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</li> <li>Financial Analysis &amp; Due Diligence</li> </ul>

### Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 106 of 152

Andrew Zinn	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	2/28/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	2/29/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		178.0		``

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 107 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	12/1/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/1/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/3/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: debt schedule analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/4/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/4/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/4/2023	0.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	12/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/6/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/6/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/7/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/9/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffen	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/11/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/12/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/13/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/13/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/14/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/14/2023	1.0	Update to time records	Administrative
James Morrell	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/15/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/15/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/18/2023	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/18/2023	3.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/18/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/19/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/20/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/20/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/21/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	12/21/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell	12/28/2023 12/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	
		1.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell James Morrell	12/29/2023	1.0 3.0	Update to time records	Administrative
James Morrell	1/2/2024 1/3/2024	3.0 0.5	Financial analysis re: First amended Disclosure Statement Piper Sandler internal meeting	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	1/3/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/3/2024	2.0	CCC professionals standing call Financial analysis re: Rule Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/3/2024	1.0		Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC meeting UCC advisors discussion re: Rule deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/4/2024	1.0	Dect advisors discussion re: Kule deposition Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Court Hearings
James Morrell	1/4/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Sumos montell	1.0/2024	0.2	r per outerer interna meeting	manager

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 108 of 152

James Morrell	1/9/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/11/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
James Morrell	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	1/12/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/12/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Disclosure Statement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/15/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/16/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/16/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/17/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/17/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/18/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	1/18/2024	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/18/2024	1.5	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
James Morrell	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
James Morrell	1/18/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/19/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/22/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/23/2024	1.0	Stipulation Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	1/24/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	1/26/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	1/26/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/29/2024	1.5	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	1/29/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/30/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/31/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/1/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/2/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/3/2024	5.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/4/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/5/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/5/2024	1.0	Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Morrell	2/5/2024	3.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	2/5/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/6/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/6/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
James Morrell	2/6/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/7/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/7/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	2/8/2024	1.0	PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/8/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/9/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/9/2024	4.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	2/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/12/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/12/2024	1.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	2/12/2024	3.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/12/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/13/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/14/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	2/14/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
		2.0		

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 109 of 152

James Morrell	2/14/2024	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	2/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	2/19/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/20/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/21/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/22/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/23/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/23/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	2/28/2024	5.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	2/29/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		201.0		

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 110 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of December 1, 2023 to February 29, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joshua Katz	12/1/2023	0.5	Discussion with Province re: Rebuttal Discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/1/2023	0.5	Correspondence with McDermott re: Fee statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/2/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/3/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: debt schedule analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	12/4/2023	4.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/4/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/4/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Analysis of expert report of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/4/2023	0.5	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	12/5/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/5/2023	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Platinum expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/6/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/6/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	12/6/2023	1.0	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/6/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/6/2023	1.0	Debtors' Motion for entry of an Order Approving Claim Objection and Settlement Procedures	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	12/7/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/7/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/8/2023	0.5	Update to time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/10/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Declaration of Boris Steffen	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/11/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/12/2023	1.0	Advisors discussion re: Discussion of Steffen draft rebuttal report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/13/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/13/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/13/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/14/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	12/14/2023 12/14/2023	1.0	Update to time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/14/2023	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of draft of Boris Steffen's Declaration Advisors discussion re: Rule rebuttal report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/15/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/18/2023	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	12/18/2023	2.0	Financial analysis re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	12/18/2023	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	12/19/2023	0.5	Advisors discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/19/2023	0.5	Correspondence with Province re: GUC analysis and vendor level detail	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/20/2023	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	12/20/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/21/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/21/2023	1.0	Correspondence with counsel re: Recoveries and settlement analysis	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/22/2023	1.0	UCC discussion re: Settlement update	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/27/2023	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	12/28/2023	1.0	UCC Meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: First Amended Disclosure Statement	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/3/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/3/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rule Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/4/2024	1.0	UCC advisors discussion re: Rule Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/4/2024	1.0	Debtors' Motion to Approve Settlement Stipulation	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	1/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/9/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/10/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/11/2024	1.0	Disclosure Statement Hearing	Court Hearings

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 111 of 152

Joshua Katz	1/15/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/16/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/17/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/17/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/17/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/18/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/18/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Work Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/18/2024	1.0	Hearing on Langur Maize Standing Motion	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	1/19/2024	1.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/19/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/20/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/20/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/22/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/22/2024	1.0	Internal discussion re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/22/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/22/2024	1.0	Preparation of fee application	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/23/2024	1.0	Stipulation Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	1/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/23/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	1/24/2024	0.5	Internal discussion re: Work Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/24/2024	0.5	Update of time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	1/25/2024	1.0	2022 Uptier Exchange Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	1/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/26/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/27/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal discussion	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/28/2024	0.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/29/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/29/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/30/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	1/30/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	1/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	2/1/2024	1.0	Hearing	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/1/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/2/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/5/2024	1.0	Discussion with Kobre & Kim re: Expert Report	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joshua Katz	2/5/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/6/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/6/2024	3.5	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	2/7/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of internal discussion materials + financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/7/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/8/2024	1.0	PIMCO / Silver Point Interest Limitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/8/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/9/2024	1.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	2/9/2024 2/12/2024	4.0 1.0	Due diligence materials / production review	Document Review and Document Preparation
			Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/12/2024	3.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/13/2024	1.0	Trial Diago Constanting and Example and Depart	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/14/2024	0.5	Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/14/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	2/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	2/15/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/16/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/19/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/20/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 112 of 152

Joshua Katz	2/21/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/22/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/27/2024	1.0	Uptier Litigation Stay Adv Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	2/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	2/28/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	2/28/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Expert Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		157.0		

### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE FOURTH INTERIM FEE PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	25.0
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	102.0
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	169.0
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	159.0
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	174.0
Joshua Katz	Restructuring Group	Analyst	121.0
Total Hours			750.0
	Hours		
	31.5		
	305.0		
	98.0		
	mmunication	9.5	
	Administrative		13.0
	80.5		
	84.0		
	Other		128.5
	Total Hours		750.0

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 114 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	3/13/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal Expert Report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	4/17/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	4/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	4/25/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	5/1/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	5/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
Total		25.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/11/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/13/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	3/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	3/25/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	3/26/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	3/29/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	4/4/2024	0.5	Discussion with lender financial advisors re: Exit Capital Structure	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joseph Denham	4/4/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	4/10/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Exit capital structure	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/10/2024	2.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Warrant Proposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/14/2024	2.0	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joseph Denham	4/16/2024	0.5	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Joseph Denham	4/17/2024	3.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	4/22/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	4/23/2024	3.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	4/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/24/2024	1.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/25/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/25/2024	1.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	4/25/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	4/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	4/26/2024	8.0	Deposition	Other
Joseph Denham	4/30/2024	10.0	Testimony preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	5/1/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	5/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	5/3/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	5/3/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Joseph Denham	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	5/5/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	5/6/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	5/8/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	5/8/2024	4.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Joseph Denham	5/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	5/9/2024	2.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	5/10/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Joseph Denham	5/13/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joseph Denham	5/14/2024	3.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	5/14/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Joseph Denham	5/15/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 116 of 152

Joseph Denham	5/15/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Joseph Denham	5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	5/23/2024	0.5	Confer with Committee counsel re: Testimony of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		102.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	3/1/2024	2.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	3/3/2024	3.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/5/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/8/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/11/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/13/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Settlement analysis	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/13/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/13/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	3/14/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/18/2024	2.5	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/19/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/21/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	3/21/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/22/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/22/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/24/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/25/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	3/28/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/29/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	3/30/2024 3/31/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang		2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report Correspondence with counsel re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang James Kang	4/2/2024 4/3/2024	0.5	Correspondence with counsel re: Exit capital structure	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	4/3/2024	0.5	Discussion with Evercore re: Counterproposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	4/4/2024	0.5	Discussion with lender financial advisors re: Exit Capital Structure	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	4/4/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	4/10/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Exit capital structure	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	4/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/10/2024	2.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	4/10/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Warrant proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/11/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/12/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Warrant proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Warrant Proposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/12/2024	4.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Warrant proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/14/2024	2.0	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	4/15/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Warrant proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/16/2024	0.5	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	4/17/2024	3.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Kang	4/24/2024	3.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 118 of 152

James Kang	4/24/2024	1.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/25/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/25/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	4/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	4/26/2024	8.0	Deposition	Other
James Kang	4/30/2024	10.0	Testimony preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	5/1/2024	5.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/1/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	5/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	5/2/2024	4.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/3/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/3/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	5/5/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/6/2024	3.5	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	5/6/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/7/2024	1.0	Review of interim fee application	Administrative
James Kang	5/7/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/8/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/8/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	5/9/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/9/2024	2.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/10/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/13/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/13/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	5/14/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Kang	5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
James Kang	5/23/2024	0.5	Confer with Committee counsel re: Testimony of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	5/24/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	5/31/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		169.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	3/2/2024	2.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/5/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/7/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/8/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/11/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/13/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Settlement analysis	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/13/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	3/18/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/19/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	3/21/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/22/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/24/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/25/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/27/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	3/28/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/29/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	3/31/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/1/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal Report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/4/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	4/4/2024	0.5	Discussion with lender financial advisors re: Exit Capital Structure	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	4/9/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Exit Capital Structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/10/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	4/10/2024	2.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/11/2024	6.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Warrant Proposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	4/12/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/14/2024	2.0	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/15/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Exit Capital Structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	4/16/2024	0.5	Correspondence with lender advisors re: Warrant Proposal	Creditor and Other Party Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/17/2024	3.0	Trial	Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	4/23/2024	1.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/24/2024 4/24/2024	1.0 1.5	UCC professionals standing call Meeting with LICC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/24/2024	1.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Expert Report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper sandier internal meeting re: Expert Report UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/25/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn Andrew Zinn	4/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
- maren Zhini	1.20.2027	0.0	The second method meeting to be position	

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 120 of 152

Andrew Zinn	4/26/2024	8.0	Deposition	Other
Andrew Zinn	4/30/2024	10.0	Testimony preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	5/1/2024	6.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/1/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	5/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	5/3/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	5/3/2024	4.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	5/5/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	5/6/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	5/6/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	5/7/2024	1.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	5/8/2024	6.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/9/2024	0.5	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/9/2024	2.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	5/13/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	5/14/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/14/2024	1.0	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	5/14/2024	3.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	5/15/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
Andrew Zinn	5/15/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	5/21/2024	0.5	Review of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	5/23/2024	0.5	Confer with Committee counsel re: Testimony of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	5/24/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	5/31/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		159.0		·

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	3/1/2024	2.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	3/2/2024	4.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	3/3/2024	5.0	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/5/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/8/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/9/2024	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	3/11/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/13/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Settlement analysis	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/13/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	3/14/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/19/2024	3.5	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/20/2024	1.0	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	3/21/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/21/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/22/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/25/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/26/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	3/29/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/30/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	3/31/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/1/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell James Morrell	4/2/2024	3.0 2.0	Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/3/2024 4/4/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/4/2024	1.0	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	4/4/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	4/4/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Exit capital structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/8/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/9/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/10/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Exit capital structure	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	4/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/10/2024	2.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	4/11/2024	5.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Warrant Proposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/12/2024	5.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/13/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Exit Capital Structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/15/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Exit Capital Structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/17/2024	3.0	Trial	Court Hearings
James Morrell	4/23/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 122 of 152

James Morrell	4/25/2024	3.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	4/25/2024	1.5		Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
			Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	
James Morrell	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/25/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/25/2024	2.0	Deposition preparation	Other
James Morrell	4/26/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	4/26/2024	8.0	Deposition	Other
James Morrell	4/30/2024	10.0	Testimony preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	5/1/2024	4.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Morrell	5/1/2024	2.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	5/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	5/2/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	5/3/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	5/3/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Morrell	5/3/2024	1.0	Update time records	Administrative
James Morrell	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	5/5/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	5/6/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	5/6/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	5/6/2024	4.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Morrell	5/6/2024	2.0	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
James Morrell	5/7/2024	2.0	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	5/8/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	5/8/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Morrell	5/9/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other
James Morrell	5/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	5/9/2024	2.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	5/12/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
James Morrell	5/20/2024	1.0	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	5/23/2024	0.5	Confer with Committee counsel re: Testimony of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell		• •		THE LEAD DW
	5/24/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joshua Katz	3/3/2024	1.5	Document production and review	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua Katz	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/4/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/5/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	3/6/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/7/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/7/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Settlement analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/21/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	3/21/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/21/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	3/22/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/22/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	3/24/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/25/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/26/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Rebuttal expert report	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	3/26/2024	0.5	UCC advisors discussion re: Rebuttal expert report	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/27/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/27/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	3/27/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/28/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	3/28/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/29/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	3/31/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Rebuttal expert report	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/4/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	4/5/2024	2.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	4/10/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	4/10/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Exit capital structure	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	4/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	4/10/2024	2.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Deposition	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	4/11/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Warrant Proposal	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	4/12/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/13/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Warrant Proposal	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/15/2024	4.0	Financial analysis re: Exit Capital Structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/17/2024	3.0	Trial	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	4/22/2024	3.0	Deposition preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	4/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz Joshua Katz	4/25/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	4/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	4/25/2024 4/26/2024	2.0 0.5	Deposition preparation Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Deposition	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	4/26/2024	8.0	Deposition	Other
Joshua Katz	4/20/2024	10.0		
Joshua Katz	5/1/2024	4.0	Testimony preparation Internal Testimony preparation	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence Other
Joshua Katz	5/1/2024	2.0		
Joshua Katz	5/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	5/3/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	5/3/2024	0.5	Update time records	Administrative
Joshua Katz	5/4/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	5/5/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	5/6/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	5/6/2024	0.5	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
				·r

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 124 of 152

Total		121.0		
Joshua	Katz 5/24/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Preparation for Testimony of Mark Rule	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua	Katz 5/23/2024	0.5	Confer with Committee counsel re: Testimony of Mark Rule	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua	Katz 5/20/2024	1.0	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Joshua	Katz 5/16/2024	3.5	Testimony of Joseph Denham	Court Hearings
Joshua	Katz 5/10/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Review of Rule's financial model	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua	Katz 5/9/2024	2.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua	Katz 5/9/2024	2.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Court Hearings
Joshua	Katz 5/9/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting re: Testimony preparation	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua	Katz 5/8/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Testimony preparation	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua	Katz 5/7/2024	1.0	Review and preparation of documents for production	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joshua	Katz 5/6/2024	1.5	Preparation of interim fee application	Administrative
Joshua	Katz 5/6/2024	3.0	Internal Testimony preparation	Other

### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE FIFTH INTERIM FEE PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	22.5
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	30.5
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	71.0
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	69.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	69.0
Joshua Katz	Restructuring Group	Analyst	14.0
Lucas Shapiro	Restructuring Group	Analyst	47.5
Total Hours			324.0
	Category Descript	ion	Hours
	134.0		
	65.0		
	3.5		
	1.0		
	10.5		
	Internal Meetings / C	Calls	54.0
	Court Hearings		56.0
	Total Hours		324.0

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 126 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	6/5/2024	3.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	6/6/2024	3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/10/2024	2.5	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Bilal Bazzy	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		22.5		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 127 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of June 1, 2024 to August 31, 2024

Jesph Denham645/2043.0Testimony of Mark RuleCourt HearingsJosph Denham646/2043.0Testimony of Boris. J SteffenCourt HearingsJosph Denham647/2041.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham641/20241.0Dift CortextingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham642/2041.0Dift Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham626/2041.0Dift CortextingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham626/2041.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham626/2041.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham71/10241.0Diftee Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham71/12041.0Diftee Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham71/12041.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham71/12041.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors Communication </th <th>Professional</th> <th>Date</th> <th>Hours</th> <th>Description</th> <th>Category</th>	Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham67/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meeting / CallsJoseph Denham6/13/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham6/26/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham6/26/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham6/26/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham7/10/20242.5Adversary proceeding hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisons CommunicationJoseph D	Joseph Denham	6/5/2024	3.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
Desph Denham6/13/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham6/14/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham6/26/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham6/21/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham6/21/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC profesionals standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC profesionals standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/12/20241.0UCC profesionals standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/12/20241.0UCC profesional standing callCommittee adVisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/12/20241.0UCC meetin	Joseph Denham	6/6/2024	3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
No.No.No.No.10.5 expl. Denham6/4/20241.0UCC prefessionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham6/2/20241.0UCC prefessionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham6/2/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham6/2/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearings10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / Calls10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearings10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / Calls10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / Calls10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC prefessionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearing10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearing10.5 expl. Denham7/1/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearing10.5 expl. Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCourt Hearing10.5 expl. Denham8/1/	Joseph Denham	6/7/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
A. B. DenhamG2/20241.0U.C. professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham6/21/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/10/20242.5Adversary proceeding hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0DCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0Dice professional standing callCommittee advisors C	Joseph Denham	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham6/210241.0Fue Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham6/26/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/10/0242.5Adversary proceeding hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham7/11/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/32/0241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/32/0241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/32/0241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0UCC meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/0241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/0241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Den	Joseph Denham	6/14/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham626/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/10/20242.5Adversary proceeding hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/12/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/19/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/0241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/14/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/0241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors Communication <t< td=""><td>Joseph Denham</td><td>6/26/2024</td><td>1.0</td><td>UCC professionals standing call</td><td>Committee and Committee Advisors Communication</td></t<>	Joseph Denham	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham7/10/20242.5Adversary proceeding hearingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/12/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and visors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommit	Joseph Denham	6/21/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham7/11/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/11/20241.0C.C meetingCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/11/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/19/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/120241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/120241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/120241.0Ots Batus ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/2041.0UCC professional standing callCourt Hearings / CallsJoseph Denham8/14/2041.0UCC professional standing callCourt Hearings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/2041.0UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/2041.0UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/2041.0UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/2041.0UCC me	Joseph Denham	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Jeseph Denham7/11/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/12/20240.5Fiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/19/20241.0Fiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/23/20241.0OPiper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meeting<	Joseph Denham	7/10/2024	2.5	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham7/12/20240.5Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/19/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/22/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/22/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/120241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/120241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/120241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee ad Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20240.5UCC	Joseph Denham	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham7/19/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee	Joseph Denham	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham7/23/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/2/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham<	Joseph Denham	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham7/24/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/2/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21	Joseph Denham	7/19/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham7/31/20241.0UCC professionals standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/2/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0DCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/12/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham8/1/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/2/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham8/2/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Differ Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham8/13/20241.0Status ConferenceCourt HearingsJoseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham8/13/20241.0Piper Sandler internal meetingInternal Meetings / CallsJoseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham8/14/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham8/15/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/21/20240.5UCC professional standing callCommittee and Committee Advisors CommunicationJoseph Denham8/22/20241.0UCC meetingCommittee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/13/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham     8/21/2024     0.5     UCC professional standing call     Committee and Committee Advisors Communication       Joseph Denham     8/22/2024     1.0     UCC meeting     Committee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham     8/22/2024     1.0     UCC meeting     Committee and Committee Advisors Communication	Joseph Denham	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
	Joseph Denham	8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Josenh Denham 8/23/2024 1.0 Piner Sandler internal meeting Internal Meetings / Calls	Joseph Denham	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
······································	Joseph Denham	8/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham 8/27/2024 1.0 Piper Sandler internal meeting Internal Meetings / Calls	Joseph Denham	8/27/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls

Total

30.5

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 128 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	6/5/2024	3.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
James Kang	6/6/2024	3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
James Kang	6/7/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/14/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	6/18/2024	0.5	Preparation of materials for transaction tax analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/18/2024	3.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/21/2024	3.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	6/21/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/10/2024	2.5	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	7/10/2024	3.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/11/2024	3.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/12/2024	3.0	Review and preparation of financial analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/15/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/18/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/19/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/31/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	7/31/2024	1.0	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	7/31/2024	1.0	Communication with creditor advisors	Creditor and Other Party Communication
James Kang	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/7/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' cash position	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	8/13/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/14/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/15/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/19/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/20/2024	0.5	13th Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
James Kang	8/20/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/21/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/22/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/26/2024	1.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/27/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	8/28/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	8/28/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	8/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		71.0		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 129 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	6/5/2024	3.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	6/6/2024	3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	6/14/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	6/17/2024	2.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/18/2024	1.5	Preparation of materials for transaction tax analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/18/2024	3.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/21/2024	2.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	6/21/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/10/2024	2.5	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	7/10/2024	5.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/11/2024	5.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/15/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/17/2024	0.5	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/18/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/19/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	7/22/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/7/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' cash position	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	8/13/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/14/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/19/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/20/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/21/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/22/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/26/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/27/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	8/28/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	8/28/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	8/29/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		69.5		

James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell	6/5/2024 6/6/2024 6/6/2024	3.0 2.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
James Morrell James Morrell James Morrell		2.0		
James Morrell James Morrell	6/6/2024		Preparation of fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell		3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
	6/7/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
	6/10/2024	1.0	Preparation of hours	Administrative
James Morrell	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/14/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	6/18/2024	1.0	Preparation of materials for transaction tax analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	6/18/2024	1.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	6/21/2024	2.0	Review of warrant structure	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	6/21/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/10/2024	2.0	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	7/10/2024	3.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/11/2024	4.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/15/2024	1.5	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/16/2024	2.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/17/2024	0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/18/2024	1.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/19/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/21/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	7/22/2024	1.0	Interim Fee Application	Administrative
James Morrell	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/7/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' cash position	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	8/13/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/14/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting 13th Monthly Eas Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell James Morrell	8/19/2024 8/19/2024	1.0 0.5	13th Monthly Fee Statement Communication with Debtor advisors	Administrative Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Morrell		2.5	Communication with Debtor advisors Financial analysis re: revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/20/2024 8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/21/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/22/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Analysis of August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/23/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/25/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/26/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/27/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	8/28/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	8/28/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	8/29/2024	1.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		69.0	· · · ·	

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 131 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joshua Katz	6/5/2024	3.0	Testimony of Mark Rule	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	6/6/2024	3.0	Testimony of Boris. J Steffen	Court Hearings
Joshua Katz	6/7/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	6/13/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	6/14/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	6/18/2024	2.0	Preparation of materials for transaction tax analysis	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Joshua Katz	6/21/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joshua Katz	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joshua Katz	6/26/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Total		14.0		

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 132 of 152

#### Piper Sandler Summary of Hours for the Period of June 1, 2024 to August 31, 2024

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Lucas Shapiro	7/8/2024	1.0	Interim Fee Application	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	7/9/2024	0.5	Interim Fee Application	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	7/10/2024	2.0	Adversary proceeding hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	7/11/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	7/11/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	7/12/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	7/15/2024	3.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	7/16/2024	4.0	Analysis of adversary proceeding ruling	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	7/17/2024	0.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	7/18/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	7/19/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	7/22/2024	1.0	Interim Fee Application	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	7/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	7/24/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	7/28/2024	1.5	Interim Fee Application	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	7/31/2024	1.0	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/1/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	8/7/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' cash position	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/13/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	8/13/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	8/14/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/14/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/15/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/15/2024	1.0	13th Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	8/19/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Revised Plan of Reorganization	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/21/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/21/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/22/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/22/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: August Business Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	8/23/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/26/2024	1.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/27/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	8/28/2024	0.5	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	8/28/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	8/29/2024	1.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Total		47.5		

Total

47.5

### SUMMARY OF TOTAL HOURS DURING THE SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	19.5
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	38.0
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	87.0
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	78.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	76.5
Lucas Shapiro	Restructuring Group	Analyst	79.5
Total Hours			379.0
	Category Descript	ion	Hours
	35.0		
	127.0		
	Committee and Committee Adviso	rs Communication	87.0
	Debtor and Debtor Advisors C	ommunication	3.5
	Administrative		12.0
	Internal Meetings / G	Calls	62.5
	Court Hearings		52.0
	Total Hours		379.0

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 134 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Bilal Bazzy	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Bilal Bazzy	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Bilal Bazzy	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		19.5		

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 135 of 152

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Joseph Denham	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Joseph Denham	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	10/24/2024	0.5 1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	10/25/2024		Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham Joseph Denham	10/30/2024 10/31/2024	0.5 0.5	UCC professionals standing call UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Count real mgs Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Joseph Denham	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Joseph Denham	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Joseph Denham	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		38.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Kang	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/3/2024	3.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/4/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
James Kang	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/2/2024	0.5 0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang James Kang	10/2/2024 10/3/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call Piper Sandler internal meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang James Kang	10/31/2024 11/3/2024	0.5 2.0	UCC meeting Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/5/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Kang	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/13/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 137 of 152

James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	11/20/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/20/2024	2.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/26/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Kang	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	11/27/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Kang	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/11/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/11/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Kang	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Kang	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Kang	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		87.0		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Andrew Zinn	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/2/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/3/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	9/25/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/26/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	9/27/2024	0.5	Confer with UCC legal advisors re: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	10/22/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/5/2024	0.5	Communication with Debtor advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/11/2024	1.0	Communication with Debtors' advisors	Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Andrew Zinn	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 139 of 152

Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/26/2024	0.5	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	11/27/2024	1.0	Communication with UCC legal advisors	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Andrew Zinn	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Andrew Zinn	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Andrew Zinn	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Andrew Zinn	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		78.5		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
James Morrell	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/2/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/3/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
James Morrell	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/2/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/7/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/24/2024	0.5 0.5	Status Conference UCC meeting	Court Hearings
James Morrell James Morrell	10/24/2024 10/25/2024	1.0		Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/29/2024	2.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Internal Meetings / Calls Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	10/29/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/6/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/11/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
James Morrell	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence

# Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 141 of 152

James Morrell	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
James Morrell	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/9/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
James Morrell	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
James Morrell	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
James Morrell	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
James Morrell	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		76.5		

Professional	Date	Hours	Description	Category
Lucas Shapiro	9/2/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/2/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/3/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/4/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/4/2024	2.0	Financial analysis: Appellate Adjustment Mechanism	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/5/2024	1.0	Resolicitation Hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	9/11/2024	1.0	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/12/2024	1.0	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/13/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	9/16/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/16/2024	0.5	Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	9/23/2024	1.0	Interference Claim Hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	9/24/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Committee Statement	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	0.5	UCC professional standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	9/25/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/26/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	9/27/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/2/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	10/2/2024 10/3/2024	0.5 0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/7/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	10/8/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/9/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/10/2024	1.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/10/2024	3.0	Internal Denham Declaration preparation	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	10/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/16/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/17/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	10/23/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/23/2024	3.0	Financial analysis: Demonstrative plan comparison	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/24/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	10/24/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/25/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	10/29/2024	2.5	Financial analysis: Illustrative Proposed Plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	10/30/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	10/31/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	1.0	Review of amended fee applications	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	11/6/2024 11/6/2024	0.5 0.5	Status Conference UCC professionals standing call	Court Hearings Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/8/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro Lucas Shapiro	11/8/2024	3.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/3/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/11/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	2.0	Analysis of revised plan draft	Document Review and Document Preparation
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	0.5	Fee application hearing	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	11/12/2024	0.5	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	11/13/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/14/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	11/15/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	11/20/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/20/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings

## Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 143 of 152

Lucas Shapiro	11/20/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Illustrative rights offering	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/21/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	11/22/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	11/26/2024	2.0	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/26/2024	1.5	Financial analysis re: Debtors' financials, case scenarios, etc.	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/27/2024	1.5	Review of business plan	Financial Analysis & Due Diligence
Lucas Shapiro	11/27/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/3/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/5/2024	1.0	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/9/2024	1.0	Preparation of monthly fee statement	Administrative
Lucas Shapiro	12/10/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/11/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/12/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/13/2024	1.0	Meeting with UCC legal advisors re: Denham Declaration prep	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/16/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/16/2024	0.5	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/18/2024	0.5	UCC professionals standing call	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/18/2024	0.5	Status Conference	Court Hearings
Lucas Shapiro	12/19/2024	0.5	UCC meeting	Committee and Committee Advisors Communication
Lucas Shapiro	12/23/2024	1.0	Piper Sandler internal meeting	Internal Meetings / Calls
Lucas Shapiro	12/27/2024	0.5	Confirmation Hearing	Court Hearings
Total		79.5		

Case 23-90611 Document 2738 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 144 of 152

# <u>EXHIBIT D</u>

**OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES** 

ATTEICATIONTERIOD							
	June 27, 2023	July 1, 2023	August 1, 2023	Total			
Expense Description	June 30, 2023	July 31, 2023	August 31, 2023	Period			
Miscellaneous Services	-	-	-	-			
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	234.13	284.25	722.03	1,240.41			
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	345.28	272.42	410.63	1,028.33			
Legal Counsel Fees	-	38,743.50	-	38,743.50			
Market Database Services	2,500.00	2,500.00	2,500.00	7,500.00			
Total	\$3,079.41	\$41,800.17	\$3,632.66	\$48,512.24			

### SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

## SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE SECOND INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

	September 1 2023	October 1, 2023	November 1, 2023	Total
Expense Description	September 30, 2023	October 31, 2023	November 30, 2023	Period
Miscellaneous Services	-	-	\$10.00	\$10.00
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	534.42	1,065.52	1,009.74	2,609.68
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	340.25	407.25	675.97	1,423.47
Legal Counsel Fees	1,430.00	-	11,260.00	12,690.00
Market Database Services	2,500.00	2,500.00	-	5,000.00
Total	\$4,804.67	\$3,972.77	\$12,955.71	\$21,733.15

## SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

	December 1, 2023	January 1, 2024	February 1, 2024	Total
Expense Description	December 31, 2023	January 31, 2024	February 29, 2024	Period
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	471.75	844.73	1,007.41	2,323.89
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	143.40	158.41	492.17	793.98
Total	\$615.15	\$1,003.14	\$1,499.58	\$3,117.87

## SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

	March 1, 2024	April 1, 2024	May 1, 2024	Total
Expense Description	March 31, 2024	April 30, 2024	May 31, 2024	Period
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	523.85	616.33	740.56	1,880.74
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	906.69	77.74	408.25	1,392.68
Total	\$1,430.54	\$694.07	\$1,148.81	\$3,273.42

## SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

	June 1, 2024 July 1, 2024		August 1, 2024	Total	
Expense Description	June 30, 2024	July 31, 2024	August 31, 2024	Period	
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	757.78	658.17	72.33	1,488.28	
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	2,633.08	229.84	-	2,862.92	
Miscellaneous	1,785.91	-	-	1,785.91	
Total	\$5,176.77	\$888.01	\$72.33	\$6,137.11	

## SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES DURING THE SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION PERIOD

	September 1, 2024	October 1, 2024	November 1, 2024	December 1, 2024	Total
Expense Description	September 31, 2024	October 31, 2024	November 30, 2024	December 27, 2024	Period
Meals (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	757.78	658.17	72.33	62.42	1,488.28
Transportation (Overtime / Late-night / Off-site)	2,633.08	229.84	-	77.22	2,862.92
Miscellaneous	1,785.91	-	-	-	1,785.91
Total	\$5,176.77	\$888.01	\$72.33	\$139.64	\$6,137.11

### EXHIBIT E

### TOTAL HOURS EXPENDED DURING THE SIXTH INTERIM AND FINAL PERIOD

Professional	Team	Title	Hours
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	19.5
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	Managing Director	38.0
James Kang	Restructuring Group	Vice President	87.0
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	Associate	78.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	Associate	76.5
Lucas Shapiro	Restructuring Group	Analyst	79.5
<b>Total Hours</b>			379.0
	Hours		
	Document Review and Docume	ent Preparation	35.0
	127.0		
Committee and Committee Advisors Communication			87.0
Debtor and Debtor Advisors Communication			3.5
Administrative			12.0
Internal Meetings / Calls			62.5
Court Hearings			52.0
Total Hours			379.0

### EXHIBIT F

### TOTAL HOURS EXPENDED DURING THE APPLICATION PERIOD

Professional	Team	<u> </u>	Second	Third	Fourth	Fifth	Sixth & Final
Bilal Bazzy	Restructuring Group	41.5	20.0	34.0	25.0	13.5	19.5
Joseph Denham	Restructuring Group	42.5	40.5	48.0	102.0	18.5	38.0
Mike Genereux	Restructuring Group	49.0	74.5	30.5	_	_	_
James Kang	Restructuring Group	142.5	219.5	172.5	169.0	71.0	87.0
Andrew Zinn	Restructuring Group	133.5	210.5	178.0	159.0	50.0	78.5
James Morrell	Restructuring Group	140.5	266.5	201.0	174.0	69.5	76.5
Josh Katz	Restructuring Group	118.5	193.0	157.0	121.0	14.0	-
Lucas Shapiro	Restructuring Group	_	_	_	_	47.5	79.5
Gary Vaynberg	Diversified Industrials	8.0	2.0	-	-	_	-
Randy Yang	Diversified Industrials	8.0	2.0	_	_	_	
Total Hours		684.0	1,028.5	821.0	750.0	284.0	379.0

### Summary of Hours Expended By Professional By Interim Period