IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

Debtors.	Objection Deadline: 8/6/25 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) Hearing Date: 8/29/25 at 10:00 a.m. (ET) (Only if objections are filed)
) (Jointly Administered)
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
In re:)) Chapter 11

NOTICE OF FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JUNE 17, 2024, THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 1, 2025

FTI Consulting, Inc., has filed its First and Final Fee Application of FTI Consulting, Inc. For Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period from June 17, 2024 through and Including June 1, 2025 (the "Application") on July 16, 2025. Pursuant to the Second Amended and Restated General Order No. 24-2018, the Court may consider this matter without further notice or a hearing if no party in interest files a response or objection within twenty-one (21) days from the date of service of this notice. If you object to the relief requested in this pleading, you must timely file your objection with the Bankruptcy Clerk at Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court, Suite 1340, 75 Ted Turner Drive, SW, Atlanta, Georgia 30303, and serve a copy on the movant and any other appropriate persons by the objection deadline. The response or objection must explain your position and be actually received by the Bankruptcy Clerk within the required time.

A hearing on the pleading has been scheduled for August 29, 2025. The Court will hold a hearing on the Application on August 29, 2025 in Courtroom 1202, United States Courthouse, 75 Ted Turner Drive, SW, Atlanta, Georgia 30303, which may be attended in person or via the Court's Virtual Hearing Room. You may join the Virtual Hearing Room through the "Dial-in and Virtual Bankruptcy Hearing Information" link at the top of the homepage of the Court's website, www.ganb.uscourts.gov, or the link on the judge's webpage, which can also be found on the Court's website. Please also review the "Hearing Information"

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.



tab on the judge's webpage for further information about the hearing. You should be prepared to appear at the hearing via video, but you may leave your camera in the off position until the Court instructs otherwise. Unrepresented persons who do not have video capability may use the telephone dial-in information on the judge's webpage.

If an objection or response is timely filed and served, the hearing will proceed as scheduled. If you do not file a response or objection within the time permitted, the Court may grant the relief requested without further notice and without holding the scheduled hearing provided that an order approving the relief requested is entered at least one business day prior to the scheduled hearing. If no objection is timely filed, but no order is entered granting the relief requested at least one business day prior to the scheduled hearing, the hearing will be held as scheduled.

Your rights may be affected. You should read these papers carefully and discuss them with your attorney, if you have one in this bankruptcy case. If you do not have an attorney, you may wish to consult one.

This 16th day of July 2025.

FTI CONSULTING, INC.

By: <u>/s/ Clifford Zucker</u>
Clifford Zucker
Senior Managing Director

1166 Avenue of the Americas, Floor 15 New York, NY 10036 T: (212) 841-9355 E: cliff.zucker@fticonsulting.com

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:)) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al.,) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.	 (Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: 8/6/25 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) Hearing Date: 8/29/25 at 10:00 a.m. (ET) (Only if objections are filed)

SUMMARY OF FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JUNE 17, 2024, THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 1, 2025

Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	June 17, 2024 through June 1, 2025
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$1,661,668.55
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$8,455.34
This is a:	Final Fee Application

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONALS

The advisors who rendered professional services in this Chapter 11 case beginning June 17, 2024, through June 1, 2025 (the "Fee Period") are:

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	105.2	\$146,228.00
James Wrynn	Senior Managing Director	1,390	1.1	1,529.00
Steven Joffe	Senior Managing Director	1,390	6.3	8,757.00
Steven Hazel	Senior Managing Director	1,315	23.3	30,639.50
Zahara Kassam	Managing Director	1,075	68.8	73,960.00
John Gleba	Managing Director	1,075	5.0	5,375.00
William Flaharty	Managing Director	1,075	38.9	41,817.50
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	191.8	198,513.00
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	466.1	482,413.50
Charles Foster	Managing Director	1,035	25.7	26,599.50
Andrew Whitman	Senior Director	980	11.2	10,976.00
Matthew McManus	Senior Director	980	2.7	2,646.00
Linda Butterfield	Senior Director	970	79.4	77,018.00
Juliana Guzman Cardenas	Director	930	4.2	3,906.00
Jason Fauss	Director	900	1.3	1,170.00
Courtney Klein	Director	885	1.5	1,327.50
Jill Weston	Director	865	53.8	46,537.00
Mark Field	Director	815	1.0	815.00
Abigail Buhrman	Senior Consultant	730	46.8	34,164.00
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	495.5	361,715.00
Tammy Horio	Senior Consultant	675	4.8	3,240.00
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	86.5	57,522.50
Rahil Kapur	Senior Consultant	665	112.3	74,679.50
Ismail Shaik	Senior Consultant	595	16.5	9,817.50
Robinson Tran	Consultant	500	4.7	2,350.00
Sangya Tiwari	Consultant	500	18.9	9,450.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	455.7	225,571.50
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	17.7	5,752.50
SUBTOTAL			2,346.7	\$1,944,490.00
Less: 50% discount for non-v	working travel time			(14,133.50)
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(288,687.95)
Est, Additional Fees to Prepa	re Final Fee Application ²			20,000.00
GRAND TOTAL			2,346.7	\$1,661,668.55

 2 The \$20,000 reflects an estimate of additional time anticipated to be incurred post-emergence in connection with preparation of this Application.

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	68.0	\$53,133.00
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	269.5	211,755.00
3	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)	26.9	24,003.50
4	Trade Vendor Issues	0.6	621.00
5	Real Estate Issues	392.8	317,097.50
6	Asset Sales	55.6	53,049.50
8	Valuation and Related Matters	116.5	101,479.00
9	Analysis of Employee Compensation Programs	0.5	517.50
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	18.2	20,769.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	38.9	33,350.50
12	Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs	90.4	61,383.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	62.2	59,655.00
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	209.5	155,388.00
15	Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions	0.6	834.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	213.9	193,957.00
17	Wind Down Monitoring	0.3	310.50
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	198.4	170,247.00
19	Case Management	39.2	32,677.50
20	General Meeting with Debtor & Debtors' Professionals	6.0	5,955.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	87.5	91,181.00
23	Firm Retention	17.7	14,857.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	168.7	96,643.00
25	Travel Time	30.7	28,267.00
26	Insurance	148.8	138,696.00
27	Mediation	73.4	69,976.50
28	Investigation	11.9	8,687.00
	SUBTOTAL	2,346.7	\$1,944,490.00
	Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time		(14,133.50)
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(288,687.95)
	Est. Additional Fees to Prepare Final Fee Application ²		20,000.00
	GRAND TOTAL	2,346.7	1,661,668.55

³ The \$20,000 reflects an estimate of additional time anticipated to be incurred post-emergence in connection with preparation of this Application.

ITEMIZED EXPENSES

Expense Type	Amount
Lodging	\$2,716.75
Research	2,201.18
Airfare	1,843.42
Transportation	758.64
Working Meals	573.95
Other	361.40
Total	\$8,455.34

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al.,) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.	 (Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: 8/6/25 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) Hearing Date: 8/29/25 at 10:00 a.m. (ET) (Only if objections are filed)

FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC.
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD
FROM JUNE 17, 2024, THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 1, 2025

The consulting firm of FTI Consulting, Inc. ("Applicant"), financial advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee"), hereby submits this First and Final Fee Application (the "Application") pursuant to Sections 330 and 331 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), and Procedure J of the Complex Case Procedures of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Georgia (the "Complex Case Procedures"), for allowance of compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses for the period from June 17, 2024 through June 1, 2025 (the "Application Period"). The grounds supporting this Application are as follows:

JURISDICTION AND BASIS FOR RELIEF

1. This Court has subject-matter jurisdiction to hear and determine this Application under 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding under 28 U.S.C. § 157(b), and this Court has constitutional authority to hear and decide this Application. Venue is proper in this

Court under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

The legal predicates for the relief requested herein are Bankruptcy Code Sections
 and 331, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Complex Case Procedure J.

BACKGROUND

- 3. On June 2, 2024 (the "**Petition Date**"), the Debtors filed with this Court their voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of title 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. Pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Debtors are continuing to operate their businesses and manage their properties and assets as debtors in possession.
- 4. On June 13, 2024, the Office of the United States Trustee (the "U.S. Trustee") appointed the Committee pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code [Dkt. No. 112]. No trustees or examiners have been appointed in these Cases. The Committee consists of the following eight members⁴:
 - (a) Healthcare Services Group, Inc.;
 - (b) Omnicare, Inc.;
 - (c) Twin Med, LLC;
 - (d) ShiftMed, LLC;
 - (e) CBD Services USA, LLC;
 - (f) Amidon Nurse Staffing;
 - (g) Healthcare Negligence Settlement Recovery Corp.; and
 - (h) Theodore Horrobin.
- 5. On June 14, 2024, the Committee selected Troutman Pepper Hamilton Sanders LLP as its counsel. On July 17, 2024, the Committee applied [Dkt. No. 256] (the "FTI Retention")

⁴ The Estate of Nancy Walsh resigned from the Committee on August 30, 2024.

Application") to the Court for an order authorizing the Committee to retain and employ the Applicant as its financial advisor, effective as of June 17, 2024. On July 18, 2024 the Court entered an order [Dkt. No. 259] (the "**Retention Order**") authorizing such retention, subject to a 21-day objection period. No objections were filed, and thus the Retention Order became final.

6. The Complex Case Procedures provide that a retained professional may serve a statement (the "Fee Application") at the end of each month or months for which compensation is sought on (a) counsel for the debtor; (b) counsel for the prepetition secured lender; (c) counsel for any post-petition lender; (d) counsel to all official committees; (e) the U.S. Trustee; and (f) any other party the Court designates (collectively, the "Professional Fee Notice Parties"). See Complex Case Procedure J(2)(a). Each Fee Application shall contain a list of individuals and their respective titles who provided services during the statement period, their respective billing rates, the aggregate hours spent by each individual, contemporaneously maintained time entries for each individual in increments of tenths of an hour, and a reasonably detailed breakdown of disbursements incurred. See id. at J(2)(b). In the event a Professional Fee Notice Party has an objection to the compensation or reimbursement sought in a particular Fee Application, it shall, within ten (10) days after service of the Fee Application, serve upon the professional whose statement is objected to and the other Professional Fee Notice Parties a written "Notice of Objection to Fee Application," setting forth the nature of the objection and the amount of fees or expenses at issue. See id. at J(2)(c). Provided that there are no objections to the Fee Application served within ten days after service of a Fee Application, the Debtor is authorized to pay such retained professional hundred percent (100%) of the fees and one-hundred percent (100%) of the expenses requested in such Fee Application. See id. at J(2)(d). If counsel for the Debtor receives an objection to such Fee Application, the Debtor shall withhold payment of that portion of the Fee

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 10 of 204

Application to which the objection is directed and shall, after the expiration of the ten-day period, be authorized to promptly pay the remainder of the fees and expenses set forth in the Fee Application. *See* id. at J(2)(e). If an objection is filed to the Fee Application and the parties reach a consensual resolution, the objecting party (or the Debtor, with the consent of the objecting party) shall serve written notice on the Professional Fee Notice Parties that the objection is withdrawn, shall describe the terms of the resolution, and the Debtor shall be authorized to pay that portion of the Fee Application at issue that is no longer subject to an objection. *See* id. at J(2)(f). Any objection that is not resolved by the parties shall be preserved and presented to the Court at the next interim or final fee application hearing. *See* id. at J(2)(g).

7. The Applicant's fee statements to date, along with amounts outstanding, are detailed below and in the following paragraphs.

			Requested		Paid	
Notice Date	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Date Paid	Amount Paid	Total Outstanding
9/20/2024	6/17/2024- 6/30/2024	\$148,731.15	\$15.99	10/9/2024	\$148,747.14	\$0.00
9/30/2024	7/1/2024— 7/31/2024	356,803.40	348.40	10/21/2024	357,151.80	0.00
10/17/2024	8/1/2024— 8/31/2024	455,079.30	998.04	11/19/2024	456,077.34	0.00
10/24/2024	9/1/2024— 9/30/2024	259,863.95	5,411.77	12/30/2024	265,275.72	0.00
12/9/2024	10/1/2024- 10/31/2024	207,101.35	31.22	12/30/2024	207,132.57	0.00
12/19/2024	11/1/2024- 11/30/2024	158,189.55	1,649.92	12/30/2024	159,839.47	0.00
2/5/2025	12/1/2024— 1/31/2025	34,593.10	0.00	2/24/2025	34,593.10	0.00
4/7/2025	2/1/2025- 3/31/2025	5,117.50	0.00	4/18/2025	5,117.50	0.00
N/A	4/1/2025- 6/1/2025 ⁵	16,189.25	0.00	N/A	0.00	16,189.25
Final Fee Application Preparation	Post- Effective Date	20,000.00	0.00	N/A	0.00	20,000.00
Total		\$1,661,668.55	\$8,455.34		\$1,633,934.64	\$36,189.25

8. On September 20, 2024, Applicant served its First Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From June

⁵ FTI's time detail for the period of April 1, 2025 through and including June 1, 2025 has not been previously served to the Professional Notice Parties and is included herein as part of this Application in Exhibit I.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 12 of 204

17, 2024 Through and Including June 30, 2024 (the "First Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$148,731.15 in compensation for the period from June 17, 2024 to June 30, 2024 (the "First Fee Period"), and \$15.99 in reimbursable expenses for the First Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the First Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.

- 9. On September 30, 2024, Applicant served its Second Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From July 1, 2024 Through and Including July 31, 2024 (the "Second Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$356,803.40 in compensation for the period from July 1, 2024 to July 31, 2024 (the "Second Fee Period"), and \$348.40 in reimbursable expenses for the Second Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Second Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.
- On October 17, 2024, Applicant served its *Third Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From August 1, 2024 Through and Including August 31, 2024* (the "**Third Fee Statement**") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$455,079.30 in compensation for the period from August 1, 2024 to August 31, 2024 (the "**Third Fee Period**"), and \$998.04 in reimbursable expenses for the Third Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Third Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.
- 11. On October 24, 2024, Applicant served its Fourth Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 13 of 204

Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From September 1, 2024 Through and Including September 30, 2024 (the "Fourth Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$259,863.95 in compensation for the period from September 1, 2024 to September 30, 2024 (the "Fourth Fee Period"), and \$5,411.77 in reimbursable expenses for the Fourth Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Fourth Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.

- 12. On December 9, 2024, Applicant served its Fifth Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From October 1, 2024 Through and Including October 31, 2024 (the "Fifth Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$207,101.35 in compensation for the period from October 1, 2024 to October 31, 2024 (the "Fifth Fee Period"), and \$31.22 in reimbursable expenses for the Fifth Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Fifth Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.
- On December 19, 2024, Applicant served its Sixth Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From November 1, 2024 Through and Including November 30, 2024 (the "Sixth Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$158,189.55 in compensation for the period from November 1, 2024 to November 30, 2024 (the "Sixth Fee Period"), and \$1,649.92 in reimbursable expenses for the Sixth Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Sixth Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 14 of 204

- On February 5, 2025, Applicant served its Seventh Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From December 1, 2024 Through and Including January 31, 2025 (the "Seventh Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$34,593.10 in compensation for the period from December 1, 2024 to January 31, 2025 (the "Seventh Fee Period"), and \$0.00 in reimbursable expenses for the Seventh Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Seventh Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full.
- 15. On April 7, 2025, Applicant served its Eighth Monthly Fee Statement of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From February 1, 2025 Through and Including March 31, 2025 (the "Eighth Fee Statement") upon the Professional Fee Notice Parties, seeking \$5,117.50 in compensation for the period from February 1, 2025 to March 31, 2025 (the "Eighth Fee Period"), and \$0.00 in reimbursable expenses for the Eighth Fee Period. No objections were received or filed to the Eighth Fee Statement, and accordingly, the Debtors paid same in full. Applicant served no further fee statement during the pendency of this case.
- 16. Included with this final fee application is time incurred during April and May of 2025, as well as an estimate related to the time incurred subsequent to the Effective Date to prepare this final fee application. For the period from April 1, 2025 to June 1, 2025 (the "Ninth Fee Period"), the Applicant seeks \$16,189.25 in compensation and \$0.00 in reimbursable expenses for the Ninth Fee Period. The Applicant estimates an additional \$20,000.00 in fees for the time incurred subsequent to the Effective Date to prepare this Application.

17. On December 5, 2024, the Court confirmed the *Debtors' Second Amended Combined Disclosure Statement and Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Reorganization* (the "**Plan**"), and on June 1, 2025, the Plan became effective. Pursuant to the terms of the Plan, all final fee applications of retained professionals are due within forty-five (45) days of the Effective Date of the Plan (July 16, 2025).

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES REQUESTED

- 18. Pursuant to Bankruptcy Code Section 331, Applicant is seeking final allowance and compensation in the amount of \$1,661,668.55 for professional services rendered by Applicant to the Committee during the Application Period, which includes (i) \$1,625,479.30 incurred during the First through Eighth Fee Periods, (ii) \$16,189.25 for professional services rendered by Applicant during the Ninth Fee Period, and (iii) \$20,000.00 for estimated professional services rendered to prepare this Application after the Effective Date of the Plan. This amount is derived solely from the applicable hourly billing rates of Applicant's personnel who rendered such services to the Committee. In addition, Applicant is seeking final allowance and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the Application Period in the amount of \$8,455.34.
- 19. Applicant maintains computerized records of the time spent by all Applicant's professionals in connection with its representation of the Committee. Applicant's itemized time records for professionals performing services for the Committee and itemized and necessary expenses incurred during the First Fee Period are attached to the First Fee Statement, which is attached hereto at Exhibit A. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Second Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit B. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Third Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit C. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Fourth Fee Period are attached hereto as

Exhibit D. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Fifth Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit E. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Sixth Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit F. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Seventh Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit G. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Eighth Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit H. Applicant's itemized time records and expenses incurred during the Ninth Fee Period are attached hereto as Exhibit I. These time records materially comply with the requirements set forth in Complex Case Procedure J in that each time entry contains (a) a separate time allotment, a description of the type of activity, and the subject matter of the activity; (b) all time is billed in increments of one-tenth of an hour; and (c) professionals who rendered services related to each category are identified, along with the number of hours for each individual and the total compensation sought for each category. To the extent the monthly fee statements and this Application do not comply with the Complex Case Procedures in all respects or any other applicable rules or guidelines, Applicant submits that any deviation is immaterial and the Application should be approved notwithstanding such deviation.

20. Professionals of Applicant have expended a total of 2,346.7 hours in connection with this matter during the Application Period. The amount of time spent by each of the professionals providing services to the Committee for the First Fee Period is set forth in Exhibit A, for the Second Fee Period in Exhibit B, for the Third Fee Period in Exhibit C, for the Fourth Fee Period in Exhibit D, for the Fifth Fee Period in Exhibit E, for the Sixth Fee Period in Exhibit E, for the Seventh Fee Period in Exhibit G, for the Eighth Fee Period in Exhibit H, and for the Ninth Fee Period in Exhibit I. As discussed in the FTI Retention Application, the rates reflected therein are FTI's normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable

value of the services rendered by Applicant for the Application Period as financial advisor for the Committee in these Cases is \$1,661,668.55. The reasonable value of expenses incurred by Applicant during the Application Period is \$8,455.34.

- 21. The foregoing professional services performed by Applicant were necessary and appropriate to the administration of this Case. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, issues, or tasks involved.
- 22. The following paragraphs are intended to highlight key services rendered by FTI during the Application Period and are not meant to be a detailed description of all of the work performed.

Code 2 - Cash & Liquidity Analysis (269.5 hours)

23. During the Application Period, FTI reviewed and analyzed: (i) the Debtors' weekly cash flow budgets and assumptions, (ii) variances between the cash flow forecasts and actual performance, and (iii) the Debtors' covenant compliance. FTI continued to review and analyze the filed 13-week DIP budget, subsequently updated DIP budgets and the key changes, as well as the impact of DIP funding on the Debtors' liquidity on a weekly and monthly basis. FTI participated in weekly calls with the Debtors' financial advisors to discuss the budget and actual results and prepared weekly liquidity reports for the Committee to keep it apprised of the latest liquidity position. Given the limited cash availability in these cases, the Committee's monitoring of this process was essential to avoid value leakage.

Code 5 – Real Estate Issues (392.8 hours)

24. During the Application Period, FTI reviewed and analyzed real estate issues in connection with understanding and assessing leases as part of its investigations workstream. FTI

identified and requested relevant documents for review, conducted various financial and market analyses, reviewed historical financials and transactions, and analyzed the Debtors' properties, including divested facilities. The dozens of facilities divested by the Debtors required intensive diligence to assess the consideration provided by the transferors in exchange for the facilities, as well as the transitions of leases and related issues.

Code 8 - Valuation and Related Matters (116.5 hours)

25. During the Application Period, FTI performed various analyses to evaluate the Debtors' facilities, including real estate appraisal, comparable public company analysis, and divested facility transaction valuation schedules. Time in this task code also included the diligence of financial statements and the preparation of valuation reports as it related to divested facilities. The valuation of these facilities was a key part of the discussions about the Plan, and the analysis shared with the Committee and its counsel influenced the Committee's eventual negotiating position in mediation.

Code 12 – Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs (90.4 hours)

26. During the Application Period, FTI reviewed, analyzed, and prepared a summary presentation evaluating the Debtors' Statements of Financial Affairs ("SOFAs") and Schedules of Assets and Liabilities ("SOALs") in order to identify key information for the Committee, including the various assets and liabilities at individual Debtor entities, payments to insiders within a year before the Petition Date, payments to third parties and related parties within 90 days prior to the Petition Date, and various intercompany payments. FTI prepared diligence questions on the SOFAs and SOALs and participated in discussions with the Debtors' advisors to understand the nature of certain asset and liability balances. FTI presented the key SOFA/SOAL information to the Committee.

Code 14 – Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise (209.5 hours)

27. During the Application Period, FTI analyzed the Debtors' claims register and General Unsecured Claims pool, including the specific review of personal injury claims, workers' compensation claims, trade claims, and other claims asserted against Debtor entities. In addition, FTI analyzed unsecured claim recovery and related settlement analyses for certain facilities, including the bifurcation of claims at operating and divested facilities. FTI worked to reconcile claims and prepare appropriate schedules related to the claims pool, which involved diligence work on claims and analyzing claims coverage. Additionally, the personal injury claims against the Debtors required thorough diligence to assess matters such as the availability of insurance to cover these claims, the extent to which the estates would be prejudiced by allowing claimants to lift the automatic stay, and the pool of claims against each individual Debtor facility.

Code 16 – POR & DS Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation (213.9 hours)

During the Application Period, FTI, on behalf of the Committee and together with the Committee's other professionals, assessed and negotiated the terms of potential settlement proposals with the Debtors and other parties-in-interest. FTI also spent time analyzing the Debtors' terms and conditions of the proposed restructuring and assessed the potential impact on recoveries to unsecured creditors through the preparation of sensitivity analyses that were shared with the Committee. In connection with the assessment, FTI prepared various analyses, including waterfall scenarios and claims analysis. As Plan negotiations evolved, it was critical for FTI to monitor case developments and update the waterfall recovery analysis to inform the Committee of expected case outcomes.

Code 18 – Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters (198.4 hours)

29. During the Application Period, FTI analyzed potential causes of actions and claims with respect to relations and affiliations between entities, the Debtors' historical transactions, including items related to real estate, debt, insider transactions, and other matters. FTI coordinated extensively with other Committee professionals to develop document requests, conducted review of documents produced as part of discovery, analyzed various financial and transaction documents, and developed relevant market and financial analyses. Time in this code also includes coordination with the Debtors' professionals to facilitate discovery and production of documents responsive to 2004 requests. FTI participated in weekly calls and working sessions with counsel to coordinate workstreams, share updates, and discuss strategy.

Code 21 – General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel (87.5 hours)

30. During the Application Period, FTI conducted weekly meetings with the Committee to provide operational updates regarding liquidity, the sale process, recovery analysis, and other important case workstreams. FTI also met with Committee counsel on an ad hoc basis for coordination on legal updates and other matters that concerned the Committee.

Code 24 – Preparation of Fee Application (168.7 hours)

31. During the Application Period, FTI consolidated all time performed by the team during the respective months to prepare monthly and final fee statements. This involved reviewing time entries, categorizing task codes, and preparing all necessary exhibits for the monthly fee statements.

Code 26 – Insurance (148.8 hours)

32. During the Application Period, FTI reviewed various insurance policies and coverages held by the Debtors with a particular focus on understanding the personal injury and workers' compensation policies as well as potential associated liabilities. FTI also conducted

detailed review of historical financial statements and supporting documentation such as insurance analysis, proofs of claim, and insurance policy agreements. This analysis was leveraged to make determinations about claimants who requested that the stay be lifted to allow pursuit of their claim against available insurance, and ensure that other claimants would not be prejudiced if these were permitted.

Code 27 – Mediation (73.4 hours)

33. During the Application Period, FTI participated in mediation and negotiations with key stakeholders in connection with Plan negotiations. As part of the mediation, FTI prepared various analyses, reviewed proposals and counter-proposals, and participated in calls with the Committee advisors and members to discuss key issues, strategy and recovery implications. FTI also reviewed and analyzed various support materials and analyses provided by the Debtors' advisors. FTI assisted in the preparation of a confidential mediation memorandum that was shared with the Mediator to provide context on the Committee's negotiating stance and its assessment of the value being provided to various parties under the Plan.

BASIS FOR RELIEF

34. This application for fees and expenses is submitted under the standards set forth in Grant v. George Schumann Tire & Battery Company, 908 F.2d 874 (11th Cir. 1990) and Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express, Inc., 488 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974). The twelve factors listed in Johnson, and quoted in Grant, affecting the fee application award include, inter alia: the time and labor required; the novelty and difficulty of the questions presented; the skills requisite to performing the services properly; the preclusion of other employment by the professional due to acceptance of this case; the customary fee charged by such professional; whether the fee is fixed or contingent; time limitations imposed by the client or other circumstances; the amount

involved and the results obtained; the experience, reputation and ability of the professional; the "undesirability" of the case; the nature and length of the professional relationship with the client; and awards in similar cases.

- 35. In accordance with its practices in non-bankruptcy matters, Applicant has calculated its compensation requested in this Application by applying its standard hourly rates. Applicant's calculation is based upon hourly rates that are well within the range of rates that are charged by comparable firms in similar bankruptcy cases. Accordingly, Applicant's rates should be determined to be reasonable under Bankruptcy Code Section 330.
- 36. Applicant's fees during the Application Period are also reasonable under the prevailing legal standard and should be allowed. The amount of these fees is not unusual given the complexity, size and the amount of work required to represent the Committee's interest in obtaining approval of a consensual plan in the Debtors' Chapter 11 Case. Applicant's fees are commensurate with fees that other professionals of comparable experience and expertise have charged and been awarded in similar Chapter 11 cases. Accordingly, Applicant's fees are reasonable pursuant to Bankruptcy Code Section 330.
- 37. Bankruptcy Code Section 330(a)(1)(B) permits reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses. Applicant's expenses incurred on behalf of the Committee during the Application Period are set forth in this Application and constitute only those necessary expenses that were incurred for the benefit of the Committee. Applicant has properly requested reimbursement of only actual, necessary and appropriate legal expenses.
- 38. Applicant submits that the fees and expenses incurred during the Application Period meet the standards set forth above and should be approved.

NO PRIOR REQUEST

39. No previous request for the relief sought herein has been made to this Court or any other court.

CONCLUSION

40. For the reasons set forth above, Applicant requests (a) allowance on a final basis of compensation in the amount of \$1,661,668.55 for professional services rendered to the Committee during the Application Period; (b) allowance on a final basis of reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Application Period in the amount of \$8,455.34; (c) payment to Applicant with respect thereto the following amounts: (i) \$16,189.25, which is the amount of fees incurred during the Ninth Fee Period, and (ii) \$20,000.00 for the estimated amount of fees incurred to prepare the Application; and (d) such other or further relief as this Court deems just or appropriate.

This 16th day of July 2025.

FTI CONSULTING, INC.

By: <u>/s/ Clifford Zucker</u>
Clifford Zucker
Senior Managing Director

1166 Avenue of the Americas, Floor 15 New York, NY 10036 T: (212) 841-9355 E: cliff.zucker@fticonsulting.com

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee

of Unsecured Creditors

EXHIBIT A

First Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB) (Jointly Administered)
Debtors.) Objection Deadline: September 30, 2024

SUMMARY OF FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JUNE 17, 2024 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2024

Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	June 17, 2024 through June 30, 2024
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$148,731.15
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$15.99
This is a(n): X monthly interim	_ final application.

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 204

EXHIBIT A LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 17, 2024 TO JUNE 30, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	14.3	\$19,877.00
Zahara Kassam	Managing Director	1,075	23.8	25,585.00
John Gleba	Managing Director	1,075	0.3	322.50
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	23.6	24,426.00
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	61.0	63,135.00
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	40.2	29,346.00
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	9.7	6,450.50
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	19.1	9,454.50
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	1.3	422.50
SUBTOTAL			193.3	\$179,019.00
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(30,287.85)
GRAND TOTAL			193.3	\$148,731.15

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 17, 2024 TO JUNE 30, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	26.2	\$17,958.50
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	41.3	35,790.50
3	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)	6.9	6,937.50
4	Trade Vendor Issues	0.6	621.00
5	Real Estate Issues	33.6	34,738.50
6	Asset Sales	13.6	14,381.50
9	Analysis of Employee Compensation Programs	0.5	517.50
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	1.7	1,866.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	3.0	2,587.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	24.0	24,539.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	9.6	9,376.50
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	4.8	5,426.00
19	Case Management	14.0	12,235.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	7.5	7,696.00
23	Firm Retention	4.1	2,802.00
26	Insurance	1.9	1,546.50
	SUBTOTAL	193.3	\$179,019.00
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(30,287.85)
	GRAND TOTAL	193.3	\$148,731.15

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 28 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Perform initial review of data room diligence files, including financial and operational items.
1	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review data room index prepared by FTI team.
1	6/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Prepare index file of virtual dataroom.
1	6/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review latest uploads to dataroom to evaluate responsiveness to requests.
1	6/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare index of files in data room.
1	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Provide comments on data room diligence priority listings.
1	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review daily update data room filings.
1	6/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Investigate responsiveness of certain dataroom documents to diligence requests.
1	6/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Prepare analysis re: key dataroom files and documents for review.
1	6/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Index files from data room.
1	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review daily docket and data room update.
1	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Download files from data room.
1	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review daily update on docket filings and diligence documents.
1	6/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.9	Prepare initial dataroom indexing file.
1	6/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Update data room file index.
1	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review daily docket and data room update.
1	6/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Analyze 2023 audit re: disclosures related to certain transactions.
1	6/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review facility level P&L information.
1	6/25/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Prepare analysis of Debtors' financial statements to evaluate calculations provided.
1	6/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare updated dataroom index.
1	6/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Download files from data room.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 29 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	6/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Continue to prepare updated dataroom index.
1	6/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Prioritize files in data room index.
1	6/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update data room file index.
1	6/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Compose daily update of docket entries and data room uploads to circulate to FTI team.
1	6/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Continue to categorize data room files.
1	6/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Review analysis re: dataroom index.
1	6/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Download files from data room.
1 Total			26.2	
2	6/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.9	Attend call with Ankura re: key case issues and budget.
2	6/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review cash management motion.
2	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review DIP budget in preparation for call with Ankura.
2	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Participate in call with Ankura re: DIP budget and other case issues.
2	6/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in call with Ankura re: DIP budget and other case issues.
2	6/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with Ankura to discuss DIP budget.
2	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman to discuss upcoming Committee meeting and DIP Budget.
2	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review DIP budget assumptions in preparation for call with Ankura.
2	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with Ankura re: DIP budget assumptions and walkthrough.
2	6/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in call with Ankura re: DIP budget assumptions and walkthrough.
2	6/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Review DIP budget and supporting schedules.
2	6/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Troutman to discuss upcoming Committee meeting and DIP Budget.
2	6/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Ankura to discuss DIP budget assumptions.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in meeting with the FTI team re: DIP budget slide structure.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Provide comments on UCC presentation re: DIP Budget.
2	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: next steps on cash management motion.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 30 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare outline of cash flow and DIP presentation.
2	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Prepare slides re: DIP budget and second-day motions for UCC.
2	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with Ankura re: cash management issues.
2	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in meeting with the FTI team re: DIP budget slide structure.
2	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Prepare slides for UCC presentation re: initial DIP budget.
2	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare summary of initial DIP budget.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review cash management schematic in preparation for call with Ankura.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with Ankura re: cash management issues.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review administrative services agreement in connection with liquidity.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Prepare cash management summary for Troutman.
2	6/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Ankura to discuss cash management.
2	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: next steps on cash management motion.
2	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review cost report settlement information and diligence responses from Ankura.
2	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Respond to requests from Troutman re: DIP budget and divested facilities.
2	6/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Update DIP budget analysis.
2	6/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update presentation on initial DIP budget.
2	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: DIP slides.
2	6/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Analyze Debtors' cash flow for UCC presentation materials.
2	6/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Provide comments on initial DIP budget slides for UCC.
2	6/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: DIP slides.
2	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review DIP and sale process update slides for UCC presentation.
2	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Participate in call with FTI team re: UCC presentation comments.
2	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Finalize draft of UCC update presentation re: cash and other issues for distribution to Troutman.
2	6/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments on financial report to the Committee.
2	6/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Attend call with FTI team on UCC presentation re: DIP budget and other items.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 31 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	6/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Participate in call with team to finalize UCC presentation.
2	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review updated DIP reporting for the week ending 6/28.
2	6/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Update DIP and sale process slide deck for UCC presentation.
2	6/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss DIP motion slides for UCC.
2	6/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Assess DIP reporting package provided by the Debtors.
2	6/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review update to UCC on liquidity and sale process.
2	6/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Prepare presentation to UCC on DIP and asset sales.
2	6/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Address comments in UCC presentation deck.
2	6/27/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.3	Prepare cash flow slides for UCC presentation.
2	6/27/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Prepare budget to actual variance analysis for the recent cash flow results.
2	6/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.0	Prepare analysis re: revised DIP budget and budget-to-actual report.
2	6/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Prepare outline of reporting for UCC regarding DIP Ibudget.
2 Total			41.3	
3	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Evaluate DIP fees and interest based on similar cases.
3	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review ABL borrowing base support.
3	6/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Research borrowing base for ABL and related documentation.
3	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Analyze borrowing base cushion and Accounts Receivable reserve.
3	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review DIP financing objection.
3	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review draft DIP financing objection.
3	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review final version of DIP objection.
3	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review ABL calculation for divested facilities.
3	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Troutman to discuss DIP.
3	6/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Attend call with Troutman to discuss DIP.
3	6/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze DIP order.
3 Total			6.9	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 32 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
4	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review listing of resident care vendors.
4	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review payments to a certain vendor of the Debtors.
4 Total			0.6	
5	6/19/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in introductory call with the FTI team regarding real estate lease analysis.
5	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in introductory call with FTI team regarding real estate lease analysis.
5	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Review facility transfer documentation to note significant transfers.
5	6/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Review first day declaration re: real estate issues.
5	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: lease review.
5	6/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: lease review.
5	6/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.0	Review leases and abstracts prepared by the FTI team.
5	6/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Develop working plan for real estate workstreams.
5	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Search transfer agreement documents to identify key transactions.
5	6/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.3	Review valuation reports of real estate and underlying financial detail.
5	6/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team on valuation reports of real estate.
5	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Coordinate with the FTI team on real estate workstreams.
5	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Update summary on divested facilities and cash management for Troutman.
5	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare summary of requests related to lease analysis.
5	6/21/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss progress on real estate workstreams.
5	6/21/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Coordinate with the FTI team on real estate workstreams.
5	6/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: divested facilities.
5	6/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review sale consideration information re: divested facilities.
5	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: lease analysis workstream.
5	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review historical real estate master leasing information.
5	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss market lease analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 33 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team to review valuation of facilities.
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.6	Review valuation methodology and underlying assumptions by facility.
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.9	Review data room forecasts and historic financials by facility.
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	2.1	Review leases and amendments for divested facility transfer terms and conditions.
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Analyze real estate directory by facility.
5	6/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: lease analysis workstreams.
5	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: real estate workstreams.
5	6/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.1	Correspond with FTI team re: real estate directory workstreams.
5	6/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Review real estate valuation methodology and underlying assumptions.
5	6/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.3	Review leases and lease amendments.
5	6/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Review data room forecasts and historic financials by facility.
5	6/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Review real estate valuation.
5	6/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss real estate workstreams.
5	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review lease directory and coverage ratio analysis with the FTI team.
5	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.1	Discuss lease directory and real estate workstream timing with the FTI team.
5	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	
5	6/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.1	Discuss lease directory and real estate workstream timing with the FTI team.
5	6/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Review lease directory and coverage ratio analysis.
5	6/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	2.2	Review lease terminations and transfers.
5	6/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Review lease directory and coverage ratio analysis with the FTI team.
5	6/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.1	Correspond with FTI team about real estate workstreams and timing of deliverables.
5	6/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Review data room for facility-level information.
5	6/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	2.1	Review security agreements associated with master leases.
5	6/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Correspond with FTI team about historical lease coverage ratios.
5	6/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.2	Communicate with the FTI team regarding real estate workstreams.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	6/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Review initial analysis of divested facilities.
5	6/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Search data room for certain lease documents.
5	6/28/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Continue to review initial analysis of divested facilities.
5	6/28/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Review data room index and data request list for real estate items.
5 Total			33.6	
6	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review industry report on SNFs in connection with sale process.
6	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with Stout, Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Troutman to discuss sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review sale process teaser.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review sale process update in preparation for call with Stout.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review UCC limited objection to bid procedures.
6	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Participate in call with Stout on sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Analyze sale process teaser.
6	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review buyer list involved in sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Attend call with Stout, Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss sale
6	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	process. Participate in call with Troutman to discuss sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with interested party in sale process.
6	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review valuation reports posted to the data room.
6	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review trading and transaction comps.
6	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review bidding procedures timeline and summary.
6	6/25/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Prepare slides for weekly UCC presentation re: sale process.
6	6/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with potential party interested in the Debtors' assets.
6	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review valuation report.
6	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review financial projections prepared in connection with sale process.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 35 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
6	6/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review sale process summary report.
6	6/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Review draft of confidential information memorandum.
6	6/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Attend call with Stout and Ankura on buyer outreach.
6	6/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Attend call with Stout and Ankura to discuss sale process.
6	6/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.2	Attend call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	6/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with interested party to discuss sale process.
6 Total			13.6	
9	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review sign on bonus payments for employees.
9 Total			0.5	
10	6/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review tax motion.
10	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review bed tax issues.
10	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review bed taxes by facility.
10 Total			1.7	
11	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review agenda for 6/27 hearing.
11	6/27/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.4	Attend hearing and prepare notes summary for FTI team.
11	6/27/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.4	Attend court hearing for DIP and first day hearing.
11 Total			3.0	
13	6/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: key case issues and first-day motions.
13	6/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review first day declaration.
13	6/17/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Review first day declaration.
13	6/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: key case issues and first-day motions.
13	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss first day motions.
13	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.9	Review first day motions for UCC protections and issues.
13	6/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Participate in call with Counsel re: first day motions.
13	6/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss first day motions.

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
13	6/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.6	Analyze first day motions for UCC issues.
13	6/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review work plan re: first day motions.
13	6/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments on first day motion issues list.
13	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss first day motions, DIP, and upcoming hearing.
13	6/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Prepare first day motion issues list for FTI team.
13	6/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.2	Attend call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss first day motions, DIP, and upcoming hearing.
13	6/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Take notes on DIP budget and first day motions.
13	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman to discuss first day motions.
13	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review omnibus response to first day motions.
13	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss first day motions.
13	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review objection to first day motions.
13	6/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review changes to UCC response to first day motions.
13	6/22/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review revised first day objection motion and DIP budget.
13	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with Counsel on objections.
13	6/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Provide comments to UCC response to first day motions.
13	6/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review final version of first day objections.
13	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss first day motions.
13	6/25/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Participate in call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman on DIP financing and other motions.
13	6/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss first day motions.
13	6/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Prepare slides on investment banker fee structure.
13	6/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.8	Analyze investment banker retention information.
13	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review investment banker retention application.
13	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review DIP lenders' joinder on reply to Committee's first day objections.
13	6/27/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.4	Process comments to UCC slides on investment banker fee structure.
13 Total			24.0	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 37 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	6/21/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review illustrative hurdle analysis.
16	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review illustrative hurdle analysis.
16	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Prepare preliminary waterfall analysis.
16	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: preliminary hurdle analysis and case updates.
16	6/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: preliminary hurdle analysis and case updates.
16	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.4	Update illustrative hurdle analysis.
16	6/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with FTI team to discuss waterfall update for UCC presentation.
16	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss waterfall and update to Committee.
16	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: preliminary waterfall slides.
16	6/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: waterfall and valuation.
16	6/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Prepare analysis re: preliminary waterfall.
16	6/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: preliminary waterfall slides.
16 Total			9.6	
18	6/21/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Review public company filings for Omega.
18	6/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review Omega and other master lease lien information.
18	6/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Attend call with Counsel on investigation work plan.
18	6/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review investigation questions.
18	6/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: investigation workstream.
18	6/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review investigation work streams.
18	6/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Attend call with Troutman to discuss investigation and other work streams.
18 Total			4.8	
19	6/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Prepare initial document request list.
19	6/17/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Provide comments on initial document request
19	6/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review document request list.
19	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in meeting with FTI team re: key case issues and diligence next steps.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 38 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
19	6/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Attend call with FTI team on document production and work plan.	
19	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Discuss case background and admin updates with FTI team.	
19	6/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.5	Prepare team workplan and staffing for engagement.	
19	6/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in meeting with the FTI team re: key case issues and diligence next steps.	
19	6/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7		
19	6/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Discuss case background and admin updates with the FTI team.	
19	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Prepare diligence tracker regarding case requests and responsive documents.	
19	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review administrative matters re: billing.	
19	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review information request list for various diligence requests.	
19	6/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Continue to prepare diligence tracker re: case requests.	
19	6/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update diligence request list.	
19	6/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review responsiveness of additional documents provided to UCC diligence requests.	
19	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review latest diligence request list.	
19	6/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Update diligence tracker for information received.	
19	6/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	0.4 Update diligence tracker for additional requests.	
19 Total			14.0		
21	6/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with UCC re: case issues and workplan.	
21	6/17/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Participate in call with Committee on work plan and case issues.	
21	6/17/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Participate in call with Counsel on case issues.	
21	6/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Participate in call with Committee to prioritize work streams.	
21	6/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in UCC call re: DIP, bid procedures, and first day motions.	
21	6/20/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Participate in UCC call re: liquidity and case updates.	
21	6/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Attend UCC call re: first-day motion status and other case issues.	
21	6/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Participate in call with Committee to discuss DIP, bid procedures, and first day motions.	
21	6/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Participate in Committee call re: liquidity and legal updates.	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 39 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
21	6/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Attend UCC call re: second-day motions and case updates.	
21	6/27/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Participate in call with Committee to discuss DIP and first day hearing.	
21	6/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Attend call with UCC to discuss DIP budget.	
21 Total			7.5		
23	6/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Participate in call with the FTI team re: FTI retention.	
23	6/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with the FTI team re: FTI retention.	
23	6/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review parties in interest listing for conflict check.	
23	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review parties in interest listing in connection with FTI retention.	
23	6/24/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	1.3	Prepare list of parties in interest in connection with the conflict check for the retention declaration.	
23	6/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Prepare retention application.	
23 Total			4.1		
26	6/19/2024	John Gleba	0.3	Prepare preliminary document request list with the FTI team re: insurance matters.	
26	6/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review insurance policy listing.	
26	6/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review insurance diligence.	
26	6/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Review insurance policies.	
26 Total			1.9		
Grand Tota	1		193.3		

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 40 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 17, 2024 TO JUNE 30, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Transportation	\$15.99
Total	\$15.99

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 41 of 204

EXHIBIT E LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL FOR THE PERIOD JUNE 17, 2024 TO JUNE 30, 2024

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
06/26/24	4 Zahara Kassam	Transportation	Taxi from office to home after working late on the case.	\$15.99

EXHIBIT B

Second Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:)	Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1)	Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.))))	(Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: October 10, 2024

SUMMARY OF SECOND MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JULY 31, 2024

Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought ² :	July 1, 2024 through July 31, 2024
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$356,803.40
Amount of expense reimbursement	

sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:

\$348.40

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

² This Second Monthly Fee Statement includes two entries for time incurred in June 2024, but which were not processed in FTI's billing system as of the date of the First Monthly Fee Statement. FTI reserves the right to supplement future Monthly Fee Statements for a similar purpose if needed.

Case 24-55507-pmb	DOC 1138	Filed 07/16/	25 Entered (07/16/25 15:43:4	/ Desc Main
•	Do	cument P	age 44 of 204		

This is a(n):	X monthly	interim	final
application.			

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 45 of 204

EXHIBIT A LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2024 TO JULY 31, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	27.9	\$38,781.00
Steven Hazel	Senior Managing Director	1,315	1.8	2,367.00
Zahara Kassam	Managing Director	1,075	34.3	36,872.50
John Gleba	Managing Director	1,075	1.8	1,935.00
William Flaharty	Managing Director	1,075	2.8	3,010.00
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	39.6	40,986.00
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	72.7	75,244.50
Charles Foster	Managing Director	1,035	15.6	16,146.00
Linda Butterfield	Senior Director	970	22.2	21,534.00
Juliana Guzman Cardenas	Director	930	3.7	3,441.00
Abigail Buhrman	Senior Consultant	730	19.2	14,016.00
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	61.9	45,187.00
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	54.3	36,109.50
Rahil Kapur	Senior Consultant	665	48.5	32,252.50
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	103.3	51,133.50
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	4.7	1,527.50
SUBTOTAL			514.3	\$420,543.00
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(63,739.60)
GRAND TOTAL			514.3	\$356,803.40

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 46 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2024 TO JULY 31, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees	
1	Current Operating Results & Events	16.5	\$12,451.00	
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	76.5	65,195.50	
3	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)	12.1	10,012.50	
5	Real Estate Issues	185.0	142,724.50	
6	Asset Sales	19.3	17,393.50	
8	Valuation and Related Matters	1.8	2,367.00	
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	0.3	417.00	
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	7.4	6,741.00	
12	Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs	26.2	15,978.50	
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	14.5	13,880.00	
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	0.6	621.00	
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	14.3	12,776.00	
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	77.2	61,675.50	
19	Case Management	15.6	12,673.00	
20	General Meeting with Debtor & Debtors' Professionals	2.0	2,425.00	
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	22.6	24,137.00	
23	Firm Retention	13.6	12,055.00	
24	Preparation of Fee Application	3.4	1,105.00	
26	Insurance	5.4	5,915.00	
	SUBTOTAL	514.3	\$420,543.00	
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(63,739.60)	
	GRAND TOTAL	514.3	\$356,803.40	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 47 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	7/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review organizational charts.
1	7/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare daily update of docket filings and data room uploads to circulate to the team.
1	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review cost report uploads to dataroom.
1	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review data room index file.
1	7/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Update dataroom index and associated categories.
1	7/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Compose daily update of docket entries and dataroom uploads to circulate to the team.
1	7/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Review docket filings and note important dates.
1	7/10/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze May 2024 financials by operating facilities and divested facilities.
1	7/15/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review Debtor entity mapping and related activity.
1	7/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Update dataroom index for incremental functionality.
1	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Correspond with Troutman re: A/R balances.
1	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review latest data room document index list prior to distribution to FTI team.
1	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Update dataroom index file for latest uploads.
1	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Finalize dataroom index summaries.
1	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Continue to update dataroom index file for latest uploads.
1	7/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Update data room index and prioritize work streams associated with new files received.
1	7/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Continue to update data room index and prioritize work streams associated with new files received.
1	7/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review data room index prior to distribution to Troutman.
1	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review May and June financials uploaded to Stout data room.
1	7/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review June 2024 financial statements.
1	7/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review May 2024 financial statements.
1	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: daily docket and dataroom updates.
1 Total			16.5	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 48 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Review cash management and intercompany procedures.
2	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze DIP budget reporting package.
2	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Provide comments to DIP budget reporting.
2	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.1	Attend call with Counsel on cash flow activity and cash management procedures.
2	7/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Debtors on budget, cash management, taxes, and insurance.
2	7/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Attend call with Counsel to discuss cash flow activity and upcoming hearing.
2	7/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Debtors on budget and cash management issues.
2	7/3/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with Counsel on cash flow activity.
2	7/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.4	Review intercompany activity tracking and cash management.
2	7/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.2	Attend call with Debtors on cash flow projections.
2	7/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.2	Participate in call with MWE, Ankura, and Troutman on cash management.
2	7/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.4	Analyze cash management agreement.
2	7/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on cash flow and liquidity slides for UCC report.
2	7/7/2024	Andrew Sveen	2.3	Evaluate budget for the most recent reporting period to prepare slides for UCC.
2	7/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Revise budget slides in update deck to the Committee.
2	7/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Provide comments on proposed edits to cash management order.
2	7/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Revise proposed edit of cash management order.
2	7/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments on financial report to Committee.
2	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Ankura re: DIP budget as of 7/5.
2	7/8/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Assess deliverables related to DIP reporting.
2	7/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review cash management order.
2	7/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Participate in call with UCC chair on budget detail.
2	7/11/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.2	Review presentation on sale process, liquidity, and litigation.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 49 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	7/11/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Summarize results of UCC meeting for cash management and other motions.
2	7/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review updated DIP budget and actuals.
2	7/11/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Review updates on sale process and DIP.
2	7/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Review comparison of DIP reporting for the week ending 7/12.
2	7/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare summary bullets on DIP reporting comparison.
2	7/12/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Summarize most recent budget forecast.
2	7/12/2024	Andrew Sveen	2.3	Prepare presentation on cash flow results to provide update to UCC.
2	7/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review analysis of revised DIP budget to original DIP budget.
2	7/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Update DIP Budget reporting for line-item variances.
2	7/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare comparison between updated DIP budgets.
2	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Draft DIP analysis summary for Troutman.
2	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Research DIP budget questions from Troutman team.
2	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review bed tax questions and issues re: liquidity.
2	7/15/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.7	Prepare cash flow analysis and sale process update materials for UCC deck.
2	7/15/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.7	Prepare slides for UCC on case updates related to cash flow and sale process.
2	7/15/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review DIP budget comparison.
2	7/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review DIP budget and variance form original budget.
2	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: DIP budget and payment of taxes.
2	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review latest DIP budget.
2	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare list of questions re: budget-to-actual reporting.
2	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Provide comments on cash flow slides for the UCC presentation.
2	7/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare list of questions re: DIP Budget vs actual performance.
2	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review budget to actual questions in preparation for upcoming call with Ankura.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 50 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	7/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Analyze cash flow activity.
2	7/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Analyze liquidity update from Ankura.
2	7/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Prepare presentation for weekly Committee call on revised budget comparison.
2	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review liquidity and sale update presentation for UCC meeting.
2	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals.
2	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Attend cash flow call with Ankura re: budget-to-actual reporting.
2	7/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Attend call with Ankura to discuss DIP Budget vs Actuals.
2	7/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review completed draft of UCC presentation materials on cash flow, sale process, and other matters.
2	7/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review update to Committee on liquidity and sale process.
2	7/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: liquidity update.
2	7/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss update to Committee on liquidity.
2	7/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Finalize review of draft UCC presentation for 7/18 meeting re: liquidity and other matters.
2	7/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Provide comments on cash flow report to Committee.
2	7/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Update cash flow deck for UCC.
2	7/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review cash flow budget to actuals.
2	7/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Review summary of updated liquidity, budget, and real estate transfers.
2	7/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Finalize UCC presentation re: cash flow update, leases, and investigation.
2	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Finalize UCC presentation for the weekly meeting re: liquidity and other matters.
2	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Provide comments on budget to actuals for week-ending 7/12.
2	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review latest budget-to-actual reporting to assess key variances.
2	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update DIP budget summary for actual performance.
2	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Update DIP Budget variances for actual vs. budgeted performance.
2	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for week ending 7/12.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 51 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget variances.
2	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Participate in call with Ankura on DIP budget versus actual performance.
2	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Update cash flow slides for weekly Committee call.
2	7/23/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.6	Revise cash flow slides for UCC update report.
2	7/23/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Prepare cash flow slides for UCC update report.
2	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Provide comments on cash flow slides for UCC.
2	7/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review liquidity update for the Committee.
2	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Provide comments to cash flow slides for UCC presentation.
2	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on UCC case update report.
2	7/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review cash flow report for the Committee.
2	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Prepare summary on investigation, DIP, real estate and other issues in advance of committee call.
2	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review budget forecast and compare to actual results.
2	7/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Summarize recent budget, sale process updates, and ongoing lease review investigations.
2	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Finalize case update presentation for UCC meeting re: liquidity and other issues.
2	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review DIP reporting package for week ending 7/19.
2	7/29/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Analyze budget to actuals results to create UCC slides.
2	7/29/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze DIP budget reporting package.
2	7/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Supplement questions list on budget-to-actual reporting.
2	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Prepare list of questions re: updated budget.
2	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.3	Update DIP budget summary for actual performance and prepare slides for presentation to the UCC.
2	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review budget to actuals and liquidity update presentation for 8/1 UCC meeting.
2	7/31/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Revise cash flow update for UCC.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 52 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	7/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Provide comments on draft cash flow update slides for UCC.
2 Total			76.5	
3	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review divested facility ABL analysis.
3	7/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review A/R aging for divested facilities re: ABL borrowing base.
3	7/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Summarize output of financial reports.
3	7/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review updated financial analysis with latest data.
3	7/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Provide comments on financial analysis.
3	7/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review A/R aging re: ABL borrowing base for divested and operating facilities re: ABL borrowing base.
3	7/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Continue to prepare A/R aging report re: ABL borrowing base based on criteria of non-operating, operating, or divested facilities.
3	7/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare A/R aging report re: ABL borrowing base based on criteria of non-operating, operating, or divested facilities.
3	7/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: A/R aging analysis and ABL borrowing base.
3	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: A/R aging analysis request and ABL borrowing base.
3	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review Debtor entity mapping for A/R analysis.
3	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Provide comments on A/R aging analysis and ABL borrowing base.
3	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Analyze historical A/R collection rates by payor type re: ABL borrowing base.
3	7/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze historical A/R aging activity re: ABL borrowing base.
3	7/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Continue to analyze historical A/R aging activity re: ABL borrowing base.
3	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review MidCap ABL balance summary.
3 Total			12.1	
5	7/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: lease review update and work plan.
5	7/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: real estate matters.
5	7/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss lease issues.
5	7/1/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Participate in internal call to discuss lease workstreams.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 53 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/1/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.1	Review summary of OTA review.
5	7/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Conduct review of the Debtors' operating lease transfer agreements.
5	7/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Analyze the Debtors' lease agreements for transfer information.
5	7/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Analyze financial statements for lease transfer data.
5	7/2/2024	Andrew Sveen	2.2	Continue to conduct review of the Debtors' operating lease transfer agreements.
5	7/2/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Evaluate financial statements for lease transfer data.
5	7/2/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Prepare analysis related to the Debtors' lease transfers pre-petition.
5	7/3/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Analyze financial statements for lease transfer data.
5	7/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Revise facility transactions tracker.
5	7/3/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.8	Perform review of the Debtors' operating lease transfer agreements.
5	7/5/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Review Debtors' filings to understand certain transfers of facilities.
5	7/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Research historical transactions of facilities and properties.
5	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Research question from Troutman re: leasing.
5	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review preliminary lease amendment analysis prepared by Troutman.
5	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Provide comments on list of lease transfers per certain public filings.
5	7/8/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.2	Prepare presentation of real estate matters for UCC call.
5	7/8/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Revise lease transfers analysis for review.
5	7/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Address comments to facility transfer and transactions tracker.
5	7/9/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.7	Update lease timeline tracker and corresponding requests.
5	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: real estate coverage ratios and analysis.
5	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with Troutman re: real estate diligence status.
5	7/9/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: OTA analysis.
5	7/9/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: real estate diligence.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 54 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/9/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.9	Review real estate analyses completed by the FTI team.
5	7/9/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team in advance of conversation with Counsel re: real estate diligence.
5	7/9/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.4	Revise lease transfers analysis for certain of the Debtors' leases.
5	7/10/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.4	Incorporate updates to the lease timeline tracker and request list.
5	7/10/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.9	Review leases and amendments for rent deferral, rent forgiveness and related divestment-related information.
5	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate analysis.
5	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: request list and real estate due diligence.
5	7/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss real estate due diligence.
5	7/10/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Participate in call with the FTI team regarding real estate issues to discuss with Counsel.
5	7/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Categorize facilities by their respective status as a divested or operating entity.
5	7/11/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Review divested facility transfer agreements.
5	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review leasing timeline and other real estate diligence documents.
5	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review transactions analysis for historical consideration received.
5	7/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review summary of lease transactions and timelines.
5	7/11/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.9	Update the lease timeline tracker and request list.
5	7/11/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.8	Continue to update the lease timeline tracker and request list.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.2	Reconcile facility mapping file.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Review document request lists re: real estate issues.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Review real estate updates from the FTI team.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.6	Prepare summary of leases and amendments.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Prepare package of real estate documents to share with Counsel.
5	7/11/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate workstreams.
5	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team regarding lease review.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 55 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Search dataroom for certain lease-related documentation.
5	7/12/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: lease timeline.
5	7/12/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Review lease amendment timeline summary and update data requests.
5	7/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman re: real estate diligence status.
5	7/12/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with Counsel to discuss real estate workstreams.
5	7/14/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.3	Prepare addendums for the master lease analysis.
5	7/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.6	Prepare real estate slides for UCC presentation and circulate to FTI team.
5	7/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Review additions to data room to circulate to the team.
5	7/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate analysis next steps.
5	7/16/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.7	Review lease and provide updates to the team.
5	7/16/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Revise real estate slides for UCC presentation.
5	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman re: real estate diligence status.
5	7/16/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with Counsel to discuss real estate workstreams and deliverables.
5	7/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review master lease slides and related projections for UCC presentation.
5	7/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Provide comments on leasing slides in UCC presentation materials.
5	7/17/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Reconcile latest facility financials to previous financials provided.
5	7/17/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.9	Create database of divested facility information for Counsel.
5	7/17/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.2	Draft report for the Committee meeting regarding lease coverage.
5	7/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with Troutman re: leasing in preparation for UCC call.
5	7/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with Troutman to discuss lease issues.
5	7/17/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Prepare summary on divested facilities for Counsel.
5	7/17/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.9	Participate in call with Counsel to discuss real estate workstreams and deliverables.
5	7/18/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.5	Analyze rent over various years for divested facilities.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 56 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/18/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Create database of divested facility information for Counsel.
5	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate workstreams and information requests.
5	7/18/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team regarding real estate work streams, deliverables and staffing.
5	7/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI real estate team re: searches for certain lease details.
5	7/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Participate in call with team to review lease analysis.
5	7/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Review leases and operating agreements for transferred facilities.
5	7/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.7	Review data room for operating facility activity.
5	7/18/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.1	Prepare real estate updates for UCC call.
5	7/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Review transfer agreements for transferred facility contact information.
5	7/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Review transfer agreements for divested facilities.
5	7/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Respond to Counsel's questions regarding master lease.
5	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Prepare analysis re: divested facilities and related transfer information.
5	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Review leases for divested facility information.
5	7/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.9	Update divested facility OTA tracker.
5	7/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.3	Summarize divested facility analysis.
5	7/22/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Review analysis of divested facilities.
5	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: leasing and other case issues.
5	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Attend call with team re: divested facility leases.
5	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Circulate notes to team re: leasing and case updates.
5	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Correspond with Troutman on Debtor mapping and divested facility assets.
5	7/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Review leases for divested facility information.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 57 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Update lease slides for weekly Committee call.
5	7/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Continue work on divested facility analysis.
5	7/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.0	Manage document synthesis process re: OTA support.
5	7/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate analysis and due diligence.
5	7/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Attend call with FTI team to discuss document request and real estate issues.
5	7/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss lease review.
5	7/24/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss various real estate deliverables.
5	7/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Prepare analysis of the Debtors' lease information.
5	7/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Prepare summary of real estate and lease issues re: certain Debtors' properties for internal circulation.
5	7/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Continue to supplement lease information tracker.
5	7/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review comparable case methodology of asset purchase price allocation re: lease analysis.
5	7/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review OTA tracker in connection with Troutman request.
5	7/25/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.3	Review leases and operating transfer agreements.
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate team scheduling.
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team: upcoming UCC meeting.
5	7/25/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.8	Review data room and circulate significant real estate files to the team.
5	7/25/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Update financial ratio tracker for facilities.
5	7/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	2.7	Reconcile analysis of divested facilities to send to Counsel.
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: transferred facility analysis.
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: facility transfers.
5	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate issues.
5	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with FTI team to discuss real estate and lease analysis.
5	7/25/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.4	Prepare analysis of Debtors' leases for certain facilities.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 58 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	1.3	Review materials for UCC re: real estate transfers.
5	7/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss next steps re: real estate workstreams.
5	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate workstream and next steps.
5	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.8	Attend FTI team call re: real estate analysis.
5	7/26/2024	Charles Foster	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: transfer of facilities.
5	7/26/2024	Charles Foster	2.0	Provide comments on case documentation re: transfer of facilities.
5	7/26/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/26/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.6	Examine OTA tracker for discrepancies.
5	7/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.9	Reconcile analysis of divested facilities to send to Counsel for draft 2004 motion.
5	7/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.2	Correspond with Counsel to review new transferee database.
5	7/29/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Research Debtors' financial statements for certain facility history.
5	7/29/2024	Charles Foster	2.5	Review real estate documents for divested facilities.
5	7/29/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: Rule 2004 Examinations.
5	7/29/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/29/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.5	Compare divested facility tracker against master leases.
5	7/29/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Review OTA tracker for related entities and transferee addresses.
5	7/29/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.9	Incorporate updates to the divested facility tracker.
5	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: real estate diligence.
5	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman on lease coverage ratio analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: leasing documents overview.
5	7/30/2024	Charles Foster	2.0	Review real estate documents.
5	7/30/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate workstream and deliverables.
5	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Review files in data room for responsiveness to Rule 2004 Motion requests.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 59 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Review Rule 2004 Motion.
5	7/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.6	Review dataroom for responsiveness to 2004 Motion requests.
5	7/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Continue to review dataroom for 2004 Motion related documents.
5	7/30/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Follow up with FTI team with regard to divested facility and personal injury analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Review divested facility analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: real estate workstreams.
5	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: facility divestment issues.
5	7/30/2024	Charles Foster	0.8	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate workstream and next steps.
5	7/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Analyze financial ratios for divested facilities.
5	7/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review divested facility ratio analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Participate in call with team to discuss divested facilities.
5	7/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Prepare for Rule 2004 dataroom call with the FTI team.
5	7/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.6	Analyze data on certain facilities for divested entities.
5	7/30/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Analyze data re: certain facilities of the Debtors.
5	7/30/2024	Charles Foster	0.5	Attend call with FTI team call re: divested facility analysis.
5	7/30/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.8	Conduct research to identify the former LaVie facilities.
5	7/30/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.7	Continue to conduct research to identify the former LaVie facilities.
5	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: cash flow by entity.
5	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.6	Review dataroom updates and docket filings for relevant real estate files.
5	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate case update.
5	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.4	Prepare real estate updates for FTI team.
5	7/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Compile financial information by facility.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 60 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	7/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Prepare analysis re: facility profitability.
5	7/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Update financials and OTA information for divested facilities.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: financial coverage analysis for divested facilities.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.3	Prepare financial coverage analysis.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: valuation report.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.9	Reconcile facility financials from various sources in data room.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.7	Incorporate historical financials of divested facilities to facility tracker.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate workstreams and deliverables.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate workstream status update.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: leases with a certain landlord.
5	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate workstreams and case next steps.
5	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	0.5	Correspond with FTI team re: real estate case updates.
5	7/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team re: real estate workstreams.
5	7/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Participate in call with team to discuss divested facilities.
5	7/31/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate updates and next steps.
5	7/31/2024	Andrew Sveen	2.6	Conduct review of facility transfer information for consistency with newly provided information.
5	7/31/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.5	Analyze Rule 2004 examination.
5	7/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Review Rule 2004 Motion.
5 Total			185.0	
6	7/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.9	Prepare slides for UCC presentation on sale process and updated budget.
6	7/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review buyer and plan sponsor outreach activity.
6	7/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review sale process update from Stout.
6	7/7/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.4	Prepare sale process slides for UCC update deck.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 61 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
6	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review sale process update for Committee meeting.
6	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review IOI process letter provided by Stout.
6	7/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.2	Review process letter for sale process.
6	7/11/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Prepare summary of sale process and liquidity.
6	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review final CIM in advance of call with UCC.
6	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Participate in call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review sale process and liquidity presentation for UCC meeting.
6	7/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review final version of confidential offering memorandum.
6	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Draft agenda for sale process update call.
6	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	7/15/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with Stout on sale outreach efforts.
6	7/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Stout and Ankura re: sale process updates.
6	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review sale process update for week ending 7/12.
6	7/15/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Analyze outreach parties and tracker for sale process.
6	7/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review summary of sale process for LaVie.
6	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review sale process update summary.
6	7/22/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Assess updates to the sale process from Debtors.
6	7/22/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review buyer outreach status update.
6	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review team notes from sale process update call.
6	7/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with Stout re: sale process updates.
6	7/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review sale process update document from Stout.
6	7/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.8	Review sale process updates.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 62 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
6	7/25/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Review updates to sale process information and status.
6	7/29/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Assess the sale process updates from the Debtors.
6	7/29/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Analyze buyer outreach report.
6	7/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review update on sale process from Stout.
6	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare for call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	7/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review sale process update as of 7/28.
6	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare summary for Troutman re: sale process.
6	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Debtors' advisors re: sale process and DIP.
6	7/31/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with interested sale process party for the Debtors.
6	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare summary of case status to share with the FTI team.
6 Total			19.3	
8	6/12/2024	Steven Hazel	0.3	Assess key considerations related to facility valuation analysis.
8	6/17/2024	Steven Hazel	0.8	Continue to assess key considerations related to facility valuation analysis.
8	7/8/2024	Steven Hazel	0.2	Review available data regarding valuation issues.
8	7/12/2024	Steven Hazel	0.5	Analyze data regarding facility valuation.
8 Total			1.8	
10	7/10/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review the bed tax summary analysis.
10 Total			0.3	
11	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend hearing on first day motions.
11	7/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend court hearing for first day motions.
11	7/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.7	Attend court hearing re: automatic stay on Healthcare Settlement motion.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 63 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
11	7/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Attend court hearing re: automatic stay.
11	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.5	Attend hearing re: Rule 2004 examination.
11	7/31/2024	Charles Foster	1.5	Attend hearing Rule 2004 examination.
11 Total			7.4	
12	7/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review global notes to the SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review statements and schedules.
12	7/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.7	Review SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Continue to review the SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.1	Analyze schedule of assets and liabilities.
12	7/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.2	Analyze statement of financial affairs.
12	7/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review support for SOALs provided by Ankura.
12	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Perform detailed analysis of the SOALs.
12	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Continue to analyze the SOALs.
12	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Perform analysis of the SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with FTI team re: SOFAs and SOALs presentation.
12	7/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with the FTI team re: SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to create summary of SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Prepare summary of the SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Update summary of SOFAs and SOALs.
12	7/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Continue to update summaries of the SOFAs and SOALs.
12 Total			26.2	
13	7/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review Debtors' complaint against Healthcare Negligence Settlement Recovery.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 64 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
13	7/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.2	Attend call with Counsel to discuss first day motions.
13	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team re: first day motions and other analysis for Committee call.
13	7/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.2	Attend call with Troutman to discuss first day motions and upcoming hearing.
13	7/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Troutman and Committee Chair to discuss first day motions.
13	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend supplemental call with Troutman in preparation for upcoming Committee call.
13	7/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Read and summarize first day motions.
13	7/8/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Review first day motions.
13	7/9/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with Troutman, Ankura, and MWE regarding various first day orders.
13	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman, Ankura, and MWE re: first day orders.
13	7/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Troutman, MWE, and Ankura to discuss first day motions up for hearing.
13	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review redlines of first day orders.
13	7/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review marked up versions of first day orders agreed to by Committee and Debtors.
13	7/10/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Review first day motions.
13	7/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review first-day motions to determine payment thresholds of certain costs.
13	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with Troutman on request list and other case issues.
13	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Analyze OCP motion and associated caps.
13	7/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review OCP motion and budget.
13	7/24/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Analyze Healthcare Negligence Recovery Corp's complaint for information and leads.
13 Total			14.5	
14	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review personal injury settlements listing.
14 Total			0.6	
16	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review preliminary waterfall analysis in preparation for Committee call.
16	7/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with the FTI team re: preliminary waterfall.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 65 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	7/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Analyze draft plan and disclosure statement.
16	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with FTI Team re: preliminary waterfall.
16	7/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Establish parameters for updated waterfall analysis.
16	7/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review preliminary waterfall.
16	7/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Update waterfall to evaluate additional scenarios.
16	7/23/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review draft waterfall analysis by landlord.
16	7/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with FTI team to discuss waterfall analysis.
16	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Provide comments on updated waterfall analysis.
16	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: waterfall analysis.
16	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend additional call with FTI team re: waterfall analysis.
16	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in additional call with the FTI team re: illustrative preliminary waterfall.
16	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Finalize draft of UCC slides re: waterfall, cash, and other items.
16	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team re: illustrative preliminary waterfall.
16	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Revise waterfall slides for UCC.
16	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Edit preliminary waterfall based on comments from team.
16	7/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review filed Plan to assess certain key terms.
16 Total			14.3	
18	7/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.7	Prepare for meetings with FTI team re: investigations.
18	7/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Review Omega's public filings for sale of asset information.
18	7/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Review Omega's public filings for sale of asset information.
18	7/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Continue to review Omega's public filings for sale of asset information.
18	7/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Continue to review Omega's public filings for sale of asset information.
18	7/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to review Omega's public filings for sale of asset information.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 66 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: investigation workstream.
18	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: preliminary investigation results and next steps.
18	7/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss investigation issues.
18	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review diligence documents for payment information in connection with certain transactions.
18	7/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Prepare search criteria for documents re: external transfers in dataroom.
18	7/19/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.6	Summarize investigative research workflow and project background to FTI team.
18	7/21/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Conduct litigation research for certain law associates.
18	7/21/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Summarize findings re: litigation research for a certain law associate.
18	7/21/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Conduct public records research to identify relevant jurisdictions for a certain law associate.
18	7/21/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Conduct public records research to identify law license and corporate affiliations for a certain law associate.
18	7/22/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Conduct social media research of a certain law associate.
18	7/22/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Correspond with certain investigators re: civil litigation and criminal records of a certain law associate.
18	7/22/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Research bar registration of a certain law associate.
18	7/22/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Conduct public records research to identify litigation naming re: a certain law associate.
18	7/22/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.6	Conduct research into the ownership and activities of a certain entity.
18	7/22/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.6	Continue to conduct research into the ownership and activities of a certain entity.
18	7/22/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.1	Conduct research into the upstream ownership of a certain entity.
18	7/23/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review investigation workplan.
18	7/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Research divested facility A/R and lien questions in response to Troutman request.
18	7/23/2024	Juliana Guzman Cai	2.6	Conduct social media searches on a certain law associate.
18	7/23/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Conduct public records research to identify business affiliations for a certain law associate.
18	7/23/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.1	Conduct research into the beneficial owners of a certain entity.
18	7/24/2024	Juliana Guzman Caı	1.1	Continue to perform social media searches on a certain law associate.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 67 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	7/24/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.3	Conduct public records research of a certain law firm to identify litigation.
18	7/24/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.6	Draft summary of research findings to date.
18	7/24/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.5	Conduct research into additional funds advised by a certain entity.
18	7/24/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.6	Summarize research findings to FTI team.
18	7/25/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: investigation.
18	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review related parties investigation analysis.
18	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review draft of 2004 motion provided by Troutman.
18	7/25/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Summarize findings on a certain law firm to circulate to FTI team.
18	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review draft 2004 motion.
18	7/25/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.2	Conduct research to identify divested facilities.
18	7/26/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.9	Conduct research to identify divested facilities.
18	7/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman on perfection analysis.
18	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Summarize findings on perfection analysis for Troutman.
18	7/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team on request re: 2004 motion.
18	7/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare dataroom summary for Counsel re: discovery requests.
18	7/29/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.5	Conduct research into the clients advised by a certain entity.
18	7/29/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.8	Create chart of the upstream ownership of a certain entity.
18	7/30/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss responses to real estate investigations questions from Counsel.
18	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review 2004 motion responses and information request references.
18	7/30/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.7	Research certain loans to the Company using financial data.
18	7/30/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.3	Prepare research on potential payments to insiders.
18	7/30/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Conduct investigative strategy to research certain entities.
18	7/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Continue to prepare dataroom summary for Counsel re: discovery requests.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 68 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	7/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.2	Summarize initial available documentation from discovery requests.
18	7/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review 2004 examination responses for hearing.
18	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: investigation focus and next steps.
18	7/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team on Debtor ownership and related parties analysis.
18	7/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Finalize dataroom summary for Counsel.
18	7/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss ownership of Debtors and related parties.
18	7/30/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.5	Conduct research to identify owners of the former LaVie facilities.
18	7/30/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.2	Conduct public records research into a certain entity.
18	7/31/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Assess results of July 31 hearing for case impacts and potential avoidance actions.
18	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review schedule of payments to related parties.
18	7/31/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.6	Continue to supplement research on potential payments to insiders.
18	7/31/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Conduct research on prior settlements over time and compare results from various data sources.
18	7/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Conduct public records research on a certain vendor.
18	7/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Send public records requests for Medicaid Cost Reports of a certain entity.
18	7/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.5	Conduct public records research to identify owners of certain facilities.
18	7/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Conduct public records research on a certain executive.
18	7/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with the FTI team re: ABL balance and insider payments.
18	7/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Participate in call with team to discuss insider payments.
18	7/31/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.9	Conduct research into a certain entity and its affiliates.
18 Total			77.2	
19	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Update diligence tracker for incremental lease requests.
19	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: immediate workstreams and status of UCC slides.
19	7/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss workstreams.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 69 of 204

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
19	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: upcoming Committee presentation.
19	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Assess case issues and outstanding items.
19	7/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss upcoming Committee meeting.
19	7/9/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.9	Review due diligence request tracker prior to re-submission to Debtors.
19	7/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Update information request list.
19	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review changes to diligence request list.
19	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team on request list priorities.
19	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Update diligence requests based on review of leases and amendments.
19	7/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Update information request list based on feedback from FTI team.
19	7/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: division of workstreams.
19	7/16/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.4	Participate in call with Debtors' financial advisors regarding diligence
19	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	requests. Review dataroom analysis to assess responsive documents.
19	7/20/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.8	Revise due diligence request list following call with Debtors.
19	7/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review latest document request list.
19	7/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Update diligence tracker for latest requests and responses.
19	7/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Update diligence tracker for latest requests and responses.
19	7/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review diligence responses from Ankura re: historical P&L information.
19	7/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Review responsiveness of dataroom files to request list.
19	7/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.3	Download files from data room and coordinate responsiveness to request list.
19 Total			15.6	1154.
20	7/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Debtors re: document requests and lease activity.
20	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with Debtors and UCC professionals re: information requests.
20 Total			2.0	•

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 70 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	7/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Participate in call with Committee to discuss first day motions.
21	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with Committee re: first day motions and DIP budget.
21	7/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Committee to discuss case updates and first day motions.
21	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Attend UCC call re: investigation and other case updates.
21	7/11/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.2	Present on real estate issues in UCC call.
21	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Participate in call with UCC re: liquidity, sale process, and litigation.
21	7/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Attend UCC call re: investigation, sale process, and other case updates.
21	7/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.2	Attend call with Committee to discuss liquidity, sale process, and litigation.
21	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with Troutman re: information requests and next steps.
21	7/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with Counsel on case issues and litigation.
21	7/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.4	Participate in UCC call re: sale process, liquidity, and other case updates.
21	7/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.4	Attend call with Committee on liquidity, sale process, and investigation.
21	7/18/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.4	Present on real estate issues in UCC call.
21	7/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Attend weekly UCC meeting re: liquidity, sale process, and litigation.
21	7/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Participate in call with Counsel to prepare for Committee call.
21	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with Troutman to prepare for upcoming Committee call.
21	7/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Participate in UCC call re: leasing, liquidity, and other case updates.
21	7/25/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.3	Attend Committee call on liquidity, investigation, and real estate updates.
21	7/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Attend call with Troutman re: UCC call agenda and case updates.
21	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.3	Attend Committee call to discuss liquidity, sale process, and investigation.
21	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Counsel to discuss upcoming Committee call.
21	7/25/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.3	Attend weekly UCC meeting to share real estate updates.
21 Total			22.6	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 71 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
23	7/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Review names and results for conflict check.
23	7/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Draft retention pleadings for LaVie.
23	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review exhibits for FTI retention application.
23	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Provide comments on FTI retention application.
23	7/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: conflict check.
23	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Continue to prepare FTI retention papers.
23	7/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Finalize drafts of FTI retention papers.
23	7/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review results of conflict check.
23	7/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Perform follow-up review of FTI retention application disclosures.
23	7/9/2024	Marili Hellmund-M	1.3	Incorporate updates to the conflict check and prepare the declaration exhibits.
23	7/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Update retention papers for comments.
23	7/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review retention papers and disclosures.
23	7/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Finalize draft of FTI retention documents.
23	7/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review comments from Troutman on FTI retention papers.
23	7/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Update retention papers for comments from Counsel.
23	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review correspondence from Counsel re: professional retention protocol
23	7/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review final draft of FTI retention papers.
23	7/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Finalize draft of retention papers.
23	7/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review final version of retention papers.
23	7/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review retention orders from other cases for discussion with Debtors.
23	7/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review retention documents and provide documentation to MWE.
23 Total			13.6	
24	7/10/2024	Marili Hellmund-M	0.7	Prepare the June fee application to ensure compliance with bankruptcy guidelines.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 72 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	7/11/2024	Marili Hellmund-M	0.9	Incorporate updates to the June fee application exhibits.
24	7/12/2024	Marili Hellmund-M	1.8	Incorporate revisions to the June fee application.
24 Total			3.4	
26	7/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review insurance issues.
26	7/1/2024	John Gleba	1.8	Review insurance documents in dataroom.
26	7/1/2024	William Flaharty	1.2	Review insurance policy and coverages and develop due-diligence data request for follow up insurance analysis.
26	7/8/2024	William Flaharty	1.6	Review existing coverages and analyze outstanding insurance data requests.
26	7/9/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze insurance loss runs.
26 Total			5.4	
Grand Tota	1		514.3	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 73 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2024 TO JULY 31, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Other	\$348.40
Total	\$348.40

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 74 of 204

EXHIBIT E LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2024 TO JULY 31, 2024

Date Professi	onal	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
07/23/24 Abigail	Buhrman	Other	Delaware corporate record expenses paid to Cogency Global Inc.	\$348.40

EXHIBIT C

Third Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., Debtors.	Case No. 24-55507-PMB (Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: October 28, 2024
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR UNSECURED CREDIT	STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF FORS FOR THE PERIOD I AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2024
Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	August 1, 2024 through August 31, 2024
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$455,079.30
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$998.04
This is a(n): application.	X monthly interim final

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

EXHIBIT A LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	27.5	\$38,225.00
Steven Joffe	Senior Managing Director	1,390	6.3	8,757.00
Steven Hazel	Senior Managing Director	1,315	13.2	17,358.00
Zahara Kassam	Managing Director	1,075	7.5	8,062.50
William Flaharty	Managing Director	1,075	3.0	3,225.00
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	35.7	36,949.50
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	110.7	114,574.50
Charles Foster	Managing Director	1,035	7.2	7,452.00
Matthew McManus	Senior Director	980	2.7	2,646.00
Linda Butterfield	Senior Director	970	57.2	55,484.00
Juliana Guzman Cardenas	Director	930	0.5	465.00
Courtney Klein	Director	885	1.5	1,327.50
Jill Weston	Director	865	29.3	25,344.50
Mark Field	Director	815	1.0	815.00
Abigail Buhrman	Senior Consultant	730	15.5	11,315.00
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	115.0	83,950.00
Tammy Horio	Senior Consultant	675	4.8	3,240.00
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	11.6	7,714.00
Rahil Kapur	Senior Consultant	665	60.1	39,966.50
Ismail Shaik	Senior Consultant	595	8.2	4,879.00
Robinson Tran	Consultant	500	4.7	2,350.00
Sangya Tiwari	Consultant	500	10.1	5,050.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	109.9	54,400.50
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	3.7	1,202.50
SUBTOTAL			646.9	\$534,753.00
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(79,673.70)
GRAND TOTAL			646.9	\$455,079.30

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 78 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	8.8	\$8,382.50
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	52.2	39,122.00
3	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other)	7.9	7,053.50
5	Real Estate Issues	161.2	127,005.50
6	Asset Sales	19.2	18,651.00
8	Valuation and Related Matters	58.6	52,146.50
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	9.3	11,862.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	7.6	5,166.00
12	Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs	64.2	45,404.50
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	2.9	2,696.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	25.7	15,844.50
15	Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions	0.6	834.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	34.8	30,707.50
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	115.7	102,482.00
19	Case Management	3.0	2,004.00
20	General Meeting with Debtor & Debtors' Professionals	4.0	3,530.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	24.5	26,724.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	23.4	12,152.50
26	Insurance	3.5	3,742.50
27	Mediation	19.8	19,241.50
	SUBTOTAL	646.9	\$534,753.00
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(79,673.70)
	GRAND TOTAL	646.9	\$455,079.30

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 79 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	8/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review June monthly operating report information.
1	8/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review June monthly operating report.
1	8/5/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.4	Evaluate the latest financial results from the Company.
1	8/6/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.4	Prepare analysis of the Debtors' financial statements to understand facility transfer information.
1	8/7/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Prepare financial analysis of various facilities.
1	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Review analysis of Debtors' balance sheet trends.
1	8/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Analyze equity holdings.
1	8/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review correspondence related to management services agreement.
1	8/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze amendments to contracts of a certain entity.
1	8/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review management contract of a certain entity.
1	8/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review management presentation.
1	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare daily summary of docket and data room updates to distribute to the FTI team.
1	8/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review amended June 2024 monthly operating reports.
1	8/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review July 2024 monthly operating reports.
1	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review amended monthly operating reports.
1 Total			8.8	
2	8/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Provide comments on cash flow report to Committee.
2	8/1/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: cash flow slides for UCC.
2	8/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Prepare updates on cash flow results and the sale process.
2	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: cash flow slides for UCC.
2	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review updates to cash flow slides prior to UCC meeting.
2	8/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review cash flow budget to actuals.
2	8/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare summary of budget for for weekly UCC call to circulate to team.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 80 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOR	AUGUST 1	, 2024 TO	AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	8/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review budget to actuals for period ending 7/26.
2	8/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Draft questions for Ankura re: 7/26 budget to actuals and extended forecast.
2	8/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Update exhibits for UCC weekly presentation re: updated DIP budget.
2	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Review cash flow slides for UCC.
2	8/7/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.6	Prepare UCC deck on cash flow updates.
2	8/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review cash flow budget to actual results.
2	8/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.5	Participate in call with Counsel on financial report detail for Committee.
2	8/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Update DIP Budget summaries and variances for latest provided performance.
2	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review budget to actuals for period ending 8/2.
2	8/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Provide comments on cash flow update slides for UCC.
2	8/14/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review financial report for the Committee re: cash flow.
2	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review UCC presentation on budget to actuals and sale process update.
2	8/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review liquidity update for Committee.
2	8/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Prepare budget updates for UCC call.
2	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review updated DIP budget as of 8/15.
2	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review latest budget materials from Ankura.
2	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Attend DIP budget update call with Ankura team.
2	8/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review updated DIP budget.
2	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Attend call with Ankura to discuss updated budget.
2	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Prepare slides for Committee call on updated DIP budget.
2	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.2	Prepare summaries of updated DIP budget.
2	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.2	Continue to prepare analysis re: updated DIP budget.
2	8/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Provide comments on cash flow slides for UCC.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 81 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE	PERIOD .	AUGUST 1.	2024 TO	AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	8/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Prepare slides for Committee call on updated DIP budget.
2	8/21/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Provide comments to financial report to the Committee.
2	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Provide additional comments on cash flow slides for UCC.
2	8/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review updated presentation to Committee on liquidity and sale process.
2	8/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Address comments to UCC slide deck re: cash flow.
2	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review DIP budget slides in preparation for UCC meeting.
2	8/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Prepare cash flow slides for weekly UCC call.
2	8/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Address comments to DIP budget slides for UCC meeting.
2	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals for period ending 8/16.
2	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Ankura to discuss liquidity and budget vs. actuals.
2	8/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Attend call with Ankura re: cash flow.
2	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review latest DIP reporting package.
2	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Attend call with Ankura re: budget variances.
2	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Provide edits to notes from cash flow call with Ankura.
2	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare analysis regarding extended cash flow forecast.
2	8/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with Ankura to discuss liquidity and budget to actuals.
2	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Circulate notes on DIP budget to actuals to the FTI Team.
2	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Review updated budget to actuals report.
2	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Prepare cash update slides for UCC deck.
2	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Prepare sensitivity analysis to determine projected ending cash roll- forward.
2	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review FTI budget roll forward analysis.
2	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Prepare analysis regarding cash forecast roll-forward.
2	8/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Provide comments to financial report to UCC.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 82 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Revise UCC cash flow deck for comments.
2	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with FTI team re: cash forecast roll-forward sensitivity analysis.
2	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in call with FTI team re: cash forecast roll-forward.
2	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare sensitivity analysis re: cash flow forecast roll-forward.
2	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Prepare materials for UCC re: cash flow forecast.
2	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Revise UCC slides regarding cash flow.
2	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss cash bridge sensitivity.
2	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Review cash bridge sensitivity analysis.
2	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review fee accrual methodology for certain professionals.
2	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget and sale process slides in preparation for UCC call.
2	8/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review updated presentation to committee on liquidity.
2	8/29/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review weekly update report for the UCC.
2	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals for period ending 8/23.
2	8/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review revised DIP budget for period ending 8/23.
2	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review professional fee information in latest DIP budget.
2	8/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review budget to actual reporting for period ending 8/23.
2	8/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Analyze professional fee schedule in latest DIP budget.
2 Total			52.2	
3	8/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review analysis related to Omega term loan.
3	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review Omega term loan in connection with request from Troutman.
3	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare loan diligence questions for Troutman.
3	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on balance sheet analysis.
3	8/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review diligence support re: promissory note.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 83 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
3	8/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review promissory note.
3	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss DIP and other issues.
3	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: DIP and other issues.
3	8/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Research diligence question from Troutman on Omega loan.
3	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review July accounts receivable aging schedule re: ABL borrowing base.
3	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review accounts receivable aging re: ABL borrowing base.
3	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Prepare monthly accounts receivable aging summary re: ABL borrowing base.
3 Total			7.9	
5	8/1/2024	Charles Foster	0.1	Correspond with FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Continue to compile financial information by facility.
5	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Supplement financial tracker by facility with additional data.
5	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Prepare reconciliations regarding ownership of divested facilities.
5	8/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review updates to divested facility and operations transfer agreement tracker.
5	8/1/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.6	Prepare spreadsheet for divested facility analysis.
5	8/1/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility tracker status.
5	8/1/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.3	Update divested facility tracker.
5	8/1/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Update divested facility transferee information summary for Counsel.
5	8/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.4	Continue to analyze financial data for certain divested facilities.
5	8/1/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Prepare analysis of facility transfers data to understand historical leases transfers.
5	8/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Address comments to divested facility analysis.
5	8/1/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.9	Review real estate updates for UCC presentation.
5	8/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Review operating transfer agreements for divested facility information.
5	8/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review divested facility summary information from OTAs.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 84 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/2/2024	Charles Foster	0.5	Review master data schedule of divested facilities.
5	8/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Review real estate transfer agreements to identify additional data points.
5	8/2/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility tracker status.
5	8/2/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.6	Update divested facility transferee information summary for Counsel.
5	8/2/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.4	Update divested facility tracker for comments.
5	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review latest Omega earnings release and transcript for discussion of industry real estate trends.
5	8/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss divested facilities.
5	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate analysis and updates for UCC Counsel.
5	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Update divested facility transferee analysis.
5	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare summary of divested facility transferee analysis for Troutman.
5	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review coverage ratio analysis provided by FTI team.
5	8/5/2024	Charles Foster	0.7	Analyze divested facility tracker updates.
5	8/5/2024	Charles Foster	0.6	Provide comments on divested facility summary.
5	8/5/2024	Charles Foster	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility case updates.
5	8/5/2024	Charles Foster	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with FTI team re: real estate updates and near-term deliverables.
5	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Summarize operations transfer agreements for divested facility analysis.
5	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Prepare analysis re: financial performance of facilities to assess leases.
5	8/5/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.2	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/5/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Update financial information for a certain landlord.
5	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with FTI team to coordinate workstreams on divested facility analysis.
5	8/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss divested facilities.
5	8/5/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.7	Participate in call to discuss divested facility analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 85 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review OTA consideration summary analysis.
5	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Correspond with Troutman on real estate leasing questions.
5	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Provide comments on divested facility analysis.
5	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Prepare draft summary cover page for divested facility analysis.
5	8/6/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review transferred leases and payment detail.
5	8/6/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Provide update to Counsel regarding updates on transferee addresses and operating transfer agreement review.
5	8/6/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.9	Update the divested facility tracker.
5	8/6/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.9	Review leases to answer real estate questions.
5	8/6/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Review divested facility analysis and submit request to Counsel for additional documentation.
5	8/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with FTI team to discuss analysis of divested facilities.
5	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/7/2024	Charles Foster	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: update on the divested facility analysis.
5	8/7/2024	Charles Foster	1.1	Attend call with FTI Team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Participate in call with FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/7/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Participate in call with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/7/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.5	Update divested facility tracker.
5	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility status updates.
5	8/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Address comments to divested facility analysis.
5	8/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review support for divested facility analysis.
5	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review key takeaways from divested facility summary.
5	8/8/2024	Charles Foster	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate analysis.
5	8/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Assess next steps re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.8	Summarize key takeaways from divested facility analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 86 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/8/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Correspond with Counsel re: real estate status updates.
5	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: real estate valuation.
5	8/9/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Attend call with FTI team on lease value consideration.
5	8/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with FTI team to discuss case updates.
5	8/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review diligence response re: transition fee payments.
5	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Correspond with FTI team on facility analysis and requests from Troutman.
5	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review divested facility summary analysis file.
5	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare follow-up diligence questions for Ankura on transition fee.
5	8/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Attend call with Counsel to discuss real estate issues.
5	8/12/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Update facility summary file with new information received.
5	8/12/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.6	Incorporate additional updates to facility tracker.
5	8/12/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Review data room for certain leases and cooperation agreements.
5	8/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review summary of real estate divested facility.
5	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with Troutman re: real estate issues.
5	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team on Omega master lease.
5	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review diligence analysis for a certain lease.
5	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review owner address and title information in connection with transfer analysis.
5	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team on divested facility analysis.
5	8/13/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Analyze lease payments for a certain facility.
5	8/13/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.4	Update divested facility tracker with new available information.
5	8/13/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Review data room for lease related documents.
5	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review property assessment data from Troutman.
5	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review transaction term sheet and disclosure re: audited financials.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 87 of 204

EXHIBIT C

		FOR THE P		GUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024
Task Categor	Date	Professional	Hours	Activi
- 5	9/14/2024	A dam Calternan	ΛΩ	Provide comments on undeted facility

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Provide comments on updated facility analysis summary.
5	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team on real estate analysis highlights.
5	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Draft summary update for Troutman re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Resolve comments on divested facility summary.
5	8/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review analysis of divested facilities.
5	8/14/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Update divested facility summary with additional information.
5	8/14/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.8	Continue to update divested facility tracker.
5	8/14/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.7	Update divested facility tracker with additional information.
5	8/14/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Prepare summary analysis of divested facility tracker.
5	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: divested facility valuation and other investigation items.
5	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare summary of follow-up points for FTI team post-call with Troutman.
5	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: facility valuations.
5	8/15/2024	Charles Foster	0.1	Correspond with the FTI team re: real estate updates for upcoming hearing.
5	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Provide comments on tracker of divested facilities.
5	8/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Correspond with FTI Team re: facility tracker.
5	8/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.6	Continue to provide updates to divested facility tracker.
5	8/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Update divested facility tracker.
5	8/15/2024	Charles Foster	1.0	Review real estate analysis re: divested facilities.
5	8/15/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Prepare summary of real estate findings.
5	8/15/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.1	Review summary of real estate findings.
5	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team on Omega earnings transcript.
5	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility summary.
5	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with FTI team re: valuation of divested facilities and next steps.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 88 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Circulate key valuation documents to FTI team.
5	8/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Finalize draft of divested facility tracker.
5	8/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Review public filings regarding consideration in connection with lease transfers.
5	8/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility summary.
5	8/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review Omega earnings call transcript based on management representations.
5	8/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Call with FTI team to discuss real estate issues.
5	8/16/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility summary.
5	8/16/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.4	Continue to update divested facility tracker.
5	8/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Read Omega filings for consideration paid during facility transfers.
5	8/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Participate in call with team to discuss divested facility analysis and settlements.
5	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Review Omega filings for consideration paid during transfers.
5	8/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Analyze financial data points of divested facilities.
5	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team re: valuation of divested facilities.
5	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review lease payments and termination agreement documents.
5	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review divested facility lease agreements.
5	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Revise summary of divested facility tracker and takeaways.
5	8/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team to discuss valuation and real estate issues.
5	8/19/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.1	Review cooperation agreements to establish a timeline of events and seek relevant documents.
5	8/20/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Review summary analysis of divested facilities.
5	8/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Reconcile divested facility transfer information against relevant exhibits.
5	8/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review additional information on real estate diligence analysis.
5	8/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review summary on divested facility analysis to Counsel.
5	8/20/2024	Charles Foster	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: updated divested facility summary.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 89 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Finalize draft email to Troutman re: divested facilities.
5	8/20/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.4	Review additional cooperation agreements.
5	8/20/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Draft email to Counsel re: cooperation agreements.
5	8/20/2024	Rahil Kapur	2.3	Reconcile divested facility tracker to exhibits in public filings.
5	8/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Read public filings of Omega to summarize transactions.
5	8/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team re: divested facility analysis.
5	8/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman on outstanding real estate diligence.
5	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team re: divested facility tracker.
5	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Research certain transferees of divested facilities.
5	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Prepare diagram to illustrate certain characteristics of past facilities.
5	8/21/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Review additional sublease documents.
5	8/21/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.7	Review cooperation agreements.
5	8/21/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Update divested facility summary for FTI team and Troutman.
5	8/21/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.9	Review subleasing agreements for divested facilities.
5	8/21/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.2	Participate in call with Counsel regarding summary of divested facilities.
5	8/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Summarize transactions and consideration for facilities.
5	8/21/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Prepare analysis for certain historical lease transfers.
5	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team on sublease diligence.
5	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Prepare sublease diligence questions for Troutman.
5	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Address questions from Troutman re: divested facilities.
5	8/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.7	Review bids for Omega facilities.
5	8/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Review additional lease comparables.
5	8/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Review potential lease comparables for divested facilities.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 90 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/22/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Review historical litigation documents.
5	8/22/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Revise analysis for certain lease transfers historically.
5	8/22/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.1	Analyze real estate transactions file.
5	8/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Provide comments on analysis of market trends in lease transfers.
5	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: next steps on real estate issues.
5	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Prepare analysis regarding real estate transfer history.
5	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: next steps on real estate issues.
5	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.3	Address comments to transactions summary.
5	8/26/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.2	Search for requested operation transfer agreement for Counsel.
5	8/26/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.5	Attend call with FTI Team re: real estate updates.
5	8/26/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Attend call with FTI Team re: real estate strategy update.
5	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Update the real estate transaction summary file.
5	8/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Continue to prepare sensitivity analysis.
5	8/27/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Review valuation reports and circulate to the team.
5	8/27/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Review engagement updates in regards to real estate.
5	8/27/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Prepare financial analyses for certain lease transfers.
5	8/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review divested facility analysis.
5	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: historical divestiture valuation questions.
5	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review variances in divested facility profitability tracker.
5	8/28/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Review real estate valuation report.
5	8/28/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: real estate valuation.
5	8/28/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Review real estate valuation analysis.
5	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with FTI team re: rent comps analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 91 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	8/29/2024	Mark Field	1.0	Perform due diligence on fair market rent for skilled nursing facilities.
5	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Assess considerations related to real estate comparable analysis.
5	8/29/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.2	Review lease comparables.
5	8/29/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.1	Analyze operation transfer agreements.
5	8/29/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.3	Analyze financial analysis of divested facilities.
5	8/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: divested facility tracker.
5	8/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.7	Review real estate statement in preparation for mediation.
5	8/30/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Address comments to real estate statement before mediation.
5 Total			161.2	
6	8/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review summary of sale process update from Stout.
6	8/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review marketing update from Stout.
6	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Provide summary of sale process update to Troutman.
6	8/6/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review indications of interest.
6	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	8/7/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Attend call on sale process overview updates.
6	8/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with Stout on sale process update and indication of interest analysis.
6	8/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review sale process update from Stout.
6	8/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Analyze buyer outreach update.
6	8/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review sale process update from Stout.
6	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review sale data room re: causes of action.
6	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review sale process update from Stout.
6	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 92 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
6	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare summary of sale process for Troutman.
6	8/14/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Analyze sale update report.
6	8/14/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Attend call with Stout to discuss sale process update.
6	8/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with Stout re: sale process updates.
6	8/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Update sale process slides for weekly UCC call.
6	8/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Participate in call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review latest sale process update.
6	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review indications of interest received.
6	8/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Review most recent sale process update.
6	8/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with Stout on sale process update.
6	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Attend sale process update call with Stout team.
6	8/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review indication of interest received for assets.
6	8/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	8/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Provide comments on liquidity and sale process update deck.
6	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare sale process update for UCC.
6	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review Omega lease payments for certain facilities included in IOI.
6	8/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Prepare notes on sale process update.
6	8/22/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Prepare sale process summary for weekly UCC call.
6	8/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.4	Evaluate the latest results of sale process from the Company.
6	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with Stout to discuss sale process updates.
6	8/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.4	Prepare slide on sale process for certain facilities.
6	8/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Attend call with Stout on sale update.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 93 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
6	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Attend sale process update call with Stout.
6	8/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Participate in call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Prepare slides for UCC re: sale process.
6	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with Stout re: sale process follow-up questions.
6	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review amended IOI provided by Stout.
6	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Update sale process slides for UCC.
6 Total			19.2	
8	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss valuation of facilities.
8	8/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss valuation issues.
8	8/16/2024	Steven Hazel	1.0	Review internal documents related to valuation.
8	8/17/2024	Steven Hazel	0.5	Analyze available data in response to valuation issues.
8	8/19/2024	Steven Hazel	1.3	Analyze data related to valuation.
8	8/21/2024	Steven Hazel	2.0	Research documents in regards to valuation.
8	8/22/2024	Jill Weston	1.1	Review valuation documents for internal circulation.
8	8/22/2024	Steven Hazel	0.3	Conduct cooperation agreement analysis.
8	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Provide support documentation to valuation team.
8	8/23/2024	Jill Weston	1.2	Review first day declaration in connection with valuation issues.
8	8/26/2024	Steven Hazel	1.0	Prepare valuation calculations.
8	8/26/2024	Jill Weston	1.4	Prepare divested facility valuation analysis.
8	8/26/2024	Jill Weston	0.5	Prepare summary of case findings.
8	8/27/2024	Steven Hazel	2.2	Analyze divested facility valuation assumptions.
8	8/27/2024	Tammy Horio	2.2	Research comparable public companies.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 94 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE	PERIOD AU	GUST 1,	2024 TO	AUGUST 3	1, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
8	8/27/2024	Tammy Horio	2.2	Continue to research comparable public companies.
8	8/27/2024	Jill Weston	2.4	Analyze comparable public companies.
8	8/27/2024	Jill Weston	0.6	Review comparable public company analysis.
8	8/28/2024	Steven Hazel	1.9	Appraise real estate for valuation purposes.
8	8/28/2024	Tammy Horio	0.5	Perform merged and acquired transaction research.
8	8/28/2024	Jill Weston	0.9	Review comparable public company analysis.
8	8/28/2024	Jill Weston	2.3	Review financial data related to valuation.
8	8/28/2024	Jill Weston	1.1	Prepare summary for team re: comparable public company analysis.
8	8/28/2024	Sangya Tiwari	1.8	Perform public company analysis.
8	8/28/2024	Sangya Tiwari	2.6	Continue to perform public company research.
8	8/28/2024	Sangya Tiwari	1.0	Prepare summary for the FTI team re: company research findings.
8	8/28/2024	Jill Weston	2.5	Conduct industry research.
8	8/29/2024	Jill Weston	2.9	Continue to analyze comparable public companies.
8	8/29/2024	Sangya Tiwari	2.9	Analyze public companies for valuation purposes.
8	8/29/2024	Sangya Tiwari	0.1	Continue to perform public company research.
8	8/29/2024	Jill Weston	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: merged and acquired transaction analysis.
8	8/29/2024	Jill Weston	2.8	Continue to research public companies within the industry.
8	8/30/2024	Jill Weston	2.3	Review divested facility analysis.
8	8/30/2024	Jill Weston	2.1	Research S&P Capital IQ for facility analysis.
8	8/30/2024	Jill Weston	2.4	Perform industry research for divested facility analysis.
8	8/30/2024	Steven Hazel	2.5	Prepare valuation memo for mediation.
8	8/30/2024	Sangya Tiwari	0.3	Correspond with FTI Team re: research findings.
8	8/30/2024	Sangya Tiwari	1.4	Perform research for valuation analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 95 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
8	8/31/2024	Steven Hazel	0.5	Analyze financials for capital leases.
8	8/31/2024	Jill Weston	2.4	Perform quality check of financial analysis.
8 Total			58.6	
10	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Prepare materials for FTI team re: preliminary tax issues and case background.
10	8/8/2024	Steven Joffe	2.0	Review tax documents.
10	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: tax issues.
10	8/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss tax issues.
10	8/9/2024	Steven Joffe	2.0	Perform review of tax returns.
10	8/9/2024	Steven Joffe	2.3	Review tax return documents.
10	8/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Analyze tax returns.
10 Total			9.3	
11	8/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Circulate notes on 341 Meeting of Creditors to team.
11	8/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Attend 341 Meeting of Creditors virtually.
11	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.6	Attend a portion of the 341 Meeting of Creditors.
11	8/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Continue to attend 341 Meeting of Creditors virtually.
11 Total			7.6	
12	8/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Prepare schedules for SOFA and SOAL presentation.
12	8/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare schedules for SOFA and SOAL presentation deck.
12	8/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to compile schedules for SOFA and SOAL presentation deck.
12	8/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Continue to update SOFA and SOALs presentation deck.
12	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Provide comments on SOFA and SOAL slides for UCC.
12	8/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.9	Review excel backup for SOFA and SOAL UCC materials.
12	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Draft email to Ankura re: related party questions.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 96 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
12	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Provide comments on related party payment analysis.
12	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Draft email to Troutman on related party payments.
12	8/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Provide comments on SOFA and SOAL report.
12	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.8	Assess revisions to SOFA and SOAL slides for UCC.
12	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Finalize draft of SOFA and SOAL materials for UCC.
12	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Continue to review SOFA and SOAL slides for UCC.
12	8/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to address comments in SOFA and SOAL presentation deck.
12	8/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Continue to address comments in SOFA and SOAL presentation deck.
12	8/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Address comments in SOFA and SOAL presentation deck.
12	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: SOFA & SOAL materials.
12	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Continue review of SOFA and SOAL UCC report.
12	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with FTI team re: insider payments and other SOFA highlights.
12	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Update initial SOFAs and SOAL questions for Ankura prior to distribution.
12	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: SOFA and SOAL presentation for UCC meeting.
12	8/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Provide comments to final report to UCC on SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Analyze comments on slides for UCC regarding SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare responses to questions re: SOFA and SOAL materials.
12	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.9	Prepare diligence question list re: SOFAs and SOALs for Ankura.
12	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: SOFA and SOAL materials.
12	8/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review update to committee for SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Participate in call with team to discuss SOFA and SOAL analysis.
12	8/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to process comments to SOFA and SOAL presentation.
12	8/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Process comments to SOFA and SOAL presentation.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 97 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
12	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Participate in call with the FTI team re: SOFA and SOAL materials and divested facility analysis.
12	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with Troutman re: SOFAs and SOALs in preparation for UCC call.
12	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Finalize SOFA and SOAL presentation.
12	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare summary of payments to owners.
12	8/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with the FTI team re: SOFA and SOAL materials and divested facility analysis.
12	8/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Research entities listed in 90-day payment SOFA.
12	8/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Participate in call with Troutman to discuss SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Perform quality check on SOFA and SOAL summaries.
12	8/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare detail of service payments within the 90-day payment statement.
12	8/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Prepare slides summarizing SOFAs, SOALs, and the updated DIP Budget.
12	8/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review contract support diligence documents.
12	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review SOFA and SOAL diligence responses from Ankura.
12	8/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review correspondence from Ankura related to SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with FTI Team about SOFAs and SOALs.
12	8/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Attend call with Ankura re: DIP budget and SOFA/SOAL detail.
12	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: SOFA and SOAL diligence.
12	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare for call with Ankura re: SOFA and SOAL diligence questions.
12	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with Ankura re: SOFAs and SOALs and budget to actuals for period ending 8/2.
12	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Update follow-up points from SOFA and SOAL diligence call.
12	8/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: SOFA and SOAL diligence.
12	8/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in call with Ankura re: SOFAs and SOALs and other diligence questions.
12	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with Troutman on related party transferee information.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 98 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
12	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review filed SOFAs and detail re: certain 90-day payments.
12	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review SOFA and SOAL diligence response from Ankura.
12	8/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review responses related to SOFA and SOAL follow up questions.
12 Total			64.2	
13	8/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review order re: 2004 examination.
13	8/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review order on 2004 examinations.
13	8/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Summarize motion to dismiss cases of certain Debtor entities.
13	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Review Recovery Corp's objection to plan and motion to dismiss.
13 Total			2.9	
14	8/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Update divested facility analysis re: litigation settlement claims.
14	8/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Continue work on settlement analysis re: certain divested facilities.
14	8/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Prepare outline of analysis for certain divested facility settlements.
14	8/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Research history of certain settlements for divested facilities.
14	8/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Continue to prepare detail on liability settlement schedule.
14	8/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare detail on liability settlement schedule.
14	8/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Continue to prepare detail on liability settlement schedule.
14	8/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to prepare liability settlement schedule.
14	8/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review payment data for certain divested facility settlements.
14	8/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: divested facility settlement detail.
14	8/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Revise liability settlement summaries in response to comments.
14	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Prepare analysis re: payment data for divested facility settlements.
14	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: payment data for divested facility settlements.
14	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Finalize draft of payment summary for divested facility settlements.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 99 of 204

EXHIBIT C LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Assess considerations related to claims analysis by Debtor.
14	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Continue to prepare schedule of Debtor claims.
14	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.9	Complete analysis related to claims by Debtor.
14	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: claims by Debtor.
14	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Summarize key takeaways from analysis of claims by Debtor.
14	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: claims by Debtor.
14 Total			25.7	
15	8/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze intercompany activity related to potential claims.
15 Total			0.6	
16	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Plan term sheet received from Debtors.
16	8/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review draft term sheets.
16	8/23/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with Debtors re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Assess next steps re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Attend call with Ankura and MWE re: preliminary waterfall analysis.
16	8/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze Debtors' draft waterfall analysis.
16	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review waterfall presentation provided by Ankura.
16	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review supporting excel schedules for waterfall analysis.
16	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Review initial waterfall analysis from Debtors.
16	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Summarize key considerations regarding waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.9	Analyze waterfall analysis deliverable for Counsel.
16	8/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review waterfall analysis support and sensitivity.
16	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review waterfall analysis summary in preparation for call with FTI team.
16	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Analyze waterfall analysis and assumptions.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 100 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE	PERIOD AU	GUST 1,	2024 TO	AUGUST 3	1, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Participate in call with the FTI team re: waterfall considerations and other case issues.
16	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with Counsel re: plan term sheet and cash flow.
16	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Analyze various Subcon factors.
16	8/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Analyze draft of Debtors' plan term sheet.
16	8/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Assess alternative plan structure.
16	8/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Attend call with Counsel to discuss plan term sheet.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare summary of Debtors' waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: Plan term sheet & cash flow.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Prepare questions list for Ankura re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Participate in call with the FTI team re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Participate in call with the FTI team re: waterfall considerations and other case issues.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Evaluate considerations related to substantive consolidation under the Plan.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Prepare slides for UCC summarizing Plan term sheet.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Prepare slides for UCC regarding latest waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Finalize summary of considerations related to substantive consolidation.
16	8/27/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Participate in call with FTI team re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare questions list re: waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Prepare summary slides of waterfall analysis.
16	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Troutman re: plan term sheet and other key issues.
16	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Finalize draft of Subcon analysis for distribution to Troutman.
16	8/28/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Prepare schedule of the Debtors' claims.
16	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Provide comments on UCC report on waterfall, liquidity, and sale process.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 101 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024					
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
16	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: plan term sheets slides for UCC call.	
16	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3		
16	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: plan term sheet slides.	
16 Total			34.8		
18	8/1/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.5	Conduct research to identify ownership and corporate structure for a certain entity.	
18	8/1/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Research IP and domain name of a certain entity.	
18	8/1/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.8	Research public records to identify owners of a certain facility.	
18	8/1/2024	Matthew McManus	0.5	Review investigative findings across research sources.	
18	8/2/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Research public records to identify owners of a certain facility.	
18	8/2/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Correspond with a certain entity to clarify nursing home data ownership information.	
18	8/2/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Research owners of certain nursing home facilities.	
18	8/2/2024	Matthew McManus	0.7	Continue to review investigative findings across research sources.	
18	8/2/2024	Robinson Tran	2.5	Compile domain information and system records.	
18	8/5/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Perform public records research to identify investments and owners of a certain entity.	
18	8/5/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Conduct public records research to develop information on a certain executive.	
18	8/5/2024	Matthew McManus	0.7	Review output report of domain research for circulation to team.	
18	8/6/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.5	Investigate certain payments to related parties by the Debtors.	
18	8/6/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Conduct public records research to identify corporate affiliations to LaVi entities.	
18	8/6/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.5		
18	8/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Assist with service issues for certain discovery requests.	
18	8/6/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.2	Conduct research into certain entities for potential connections to Debtors.	
18	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Prepare workplan for investigation team.	

1.8 Conduct research to identify ownership of a certain entity.

18

8/7/2024

Linda Butterfield

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 102 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	AUGUST	1, 2024 TO	AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	8/7/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Research corporate records to identify beneficial owners of certain entities.
18	8/7/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.7	Research potential connections between a certain entity and investor.
18	8/7/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.7	Continue to research potential connections between a certain entity and investor.
18	8/7/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.8	Analyze potential corporate connections.
18	8/7/2024	Courtney Klein	0.4	Conduct investigation of relevant domains and IPs to identify similarities.
18	8/7/2024	Matthew McManus	0.8	Investigate IP address and domains.
18	8/8/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Research corporate records for relationship mapping of certain entities.
18	8/8/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Conduct corporate records research and relationship mapping of certain entities.
18	8/8/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.2	Review corporate records for a certain entity.
18	8/8/2024	Courtney Klein	1.1	Analyze domain research report.
18	8/8/2024	Robinson Tran	2.2	Draft memorandum re: details on domain name and IP address investigation.
18	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review tax return of a certain investor.
18	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review summary of K-1s for ownership information.
18	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Analyze investigation findings from FTI team.
18	8/9/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.5	Summarize investigative findings to date.
18	8/9/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Conduct media research and litigation research for information pertaining to a certain executive.
18	8/9/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.3	Conduct public records research of certain facilities.
18	8/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Compile summary of investors based on tax returns.
18	8/9/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.3	Research potential connections between a certain entitiy and its affiliates.
18	8/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with Troutman re: property records, tax returns, and summary investigation results.
18	8/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Analyze high priority research requests for investigation team.
18	8/12/2024	Juliana Guzman Cardenas	0.5	Research a certain employee to identify social media and points of contact.
18	8/12/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Conduct investigative research of a certain employee.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 103 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task				
Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	8/12/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.8	Research public records to identify investor connections.
18	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with Troutman re: operations transfers and GLPL analysis.
18	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Draft email to FTI team re: follow-up questions from GLPL call with Troutman.
18	8/13/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Conduct investigative research of a certain investor's involvement in healthcare contracts.
18	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: related party affiliate diligence.
18	8/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review draft investigation presentation.
18	8/14/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.5	Conduct corporate records research to identify parent company and investor information for a certain entity.
18	8/14/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.0	Finalize domain name research for certain entities.
18	8/14/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Conduct public records research of certain entity relationships.
18	8/15/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.8	Finalize summary of findings on relationships between certain entities.
18	8/15/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Update information pertaining to a certain entity.
18	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with FTI team re: related party affiliates and real estate diligence.
18	8/16/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.8	Conduct corporate research into certain entities related to a certain investor.
18	8/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss ownership analysis.
18	8/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Debtors' management presentation on informal investigation meeting.
18	8/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review real estate and affiliate loan research.
18	8/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Provide comments on related party affiliate investigation summary.
18	8/19/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Conduct public records research into certain relationships between investors.
18	8/19/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Revise corporate affiliations findings.
18	8/19/2024	Linda Butterfield	0.8	Review investigative strategy related to corporate connections.
18	8/19/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Prepare chart of affiliations.
18	8/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review analysis for UCC on equity owners of LaVie.
18	8/19/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.1	Draft chart visualizing the connections between a certain investor and the Debtors.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 104 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
18	8/19/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.1	Continue to prepare chart visualizing the connections between a certain investor and the Debtors.	
18	8/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss equity owner analysis.	
18	8/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss equity owner analysis.	
18	8/20/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.4	Address comments to corporate relationship diagram.	
18	8/21/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.2	Summarize research findings re: corporate relationships for the Committee.	
18	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with FTI team re: investigation questions.	
18	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: secured debt diligence questions in advance of UCC meeting.	
18	8/22/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.8	Finalize findings on a certain investor to date.	
18	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in call with FTI team re: investigation diligence.	
18	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team re: budget, investigation, lease & other workstreams.	
18	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Provide comments on draft complaint.	
18	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review diligence question from Counsel on payments on account of loans.	
18	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review draft complaint regarding certain liens.	
18	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare financial analysis in support of complaint.	
18	8/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review draft complaint.	
18	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with the FTI team re: budget, investigation, lease & other workstreams.	
18	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team re: financial analysis in support of complaint.	
18	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: diligence questions in connection with complaint.	
18	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Provide comments on preliminary solvency analysis.	
18	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Update financial analysis in support of complaint based on comments from FTI team.	
18	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: financial analysis in support of complaint.	
18	8/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Summarize key takeaways from financial analysis in support of complaint.	
10	0.000.000				

18

8/28/2024

Linda Butterfield

2.0 Conduct public records research of various entities to identify ownership.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 105 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
18	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: analysis of certain entities.
18	8/29/2024	Ismail Shaik	2.8	Research merged and acquired companies.
18	8/29/2024	Ismail Shaik	2.5	Review datasets for merged and acquired companies.
18	8/29/2024	Ismail Shaik	2.9	Prepare schedule of merged and acquired companies.
18	8/29/2024	Linda Butterfield	1.5	Analyze public filings to identify certain subsidiaries.
18	8/29/2024	Linda Butterfield	2.0	Conduct public records investigative research of certain facilities.
18	8/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss analysis of certain entities.
18 Total			115.7	
19	8/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Assess matters relating to dataroom management.
19	8/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Prepare updates to administrative timeline calendar.
19	8/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Update important dates calendar for circulation to FTI team.
19	8/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with Ankura and Stout re: call updates.
19	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Update team calendar for new case timelines and circulate to team.
19	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: case workstreams.
19	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: next steps from UCC presentation.
19 Total			3.0	
20	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.0	Participate in call with Debtors' management re: corporate history and profitability.
20	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.0	Participate in call with Debtors' management re: corporate history and profitability.
20 Total			4.0	
21	8/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with Counsel on hearing, diligence efforts, and operations.
21	8/1/2024	Charles Foster	0.9	Attend call with Committee re: liquidity, sale process, and 2004 issues.
21	8/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.9	Attend weekly Committee call on financial and legal update.
21	8/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with Committee to discuss liquidity, sale process, and 2004 issues.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 106 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	8/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Counsel to discuss upcoming committee call and workstreams.
21	8/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Troutman on divested facilities, liquidity, and other case issues.
21	8/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with Troutman to discuss divested facilities, sale process, liquidity, and term sheet.
21	8/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Troutman to discuss divested facilities, sale process, and liquidity.
21	8/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Committee to discuss SOFAs and SOALs.
21	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with UCC re: SOFAs and SOALs, liquidity, investigation and other case issues.
21	8/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review notes from UCC meeting re: follow-up points.
21	8/8/2024	Charles Foster	1.0	Participate in call with UCC re: liquidity, investigation, and sales process.
21	8/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend Committee call re: liquidity and investigations.
21	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare for call with UCC re: investigation, sale process, and liquidity.
21	8/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with UCC re: case update, SOFAs and SOALs, and investigation.
21	8/15/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Participate in UCC meeting re: sale process, liquidity, investigation and case updates.
21	8/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in call with UCC re: case update, SOFA and SOAL diligence, and investigation.
21	8/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with committee to discuss sale process and liquidity.
21	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare for call with UCC re: liquidity, investigation, and sale process.
21	8/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with Committee to discuss liquidity, sale process, and negotiations with Debtors.
21	8/22/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Committee to discuss negotiations with the Debtors, liquidity, and investigations.
21	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Attend UCC call re: cash flow, sale process, and other matters.
21	8/22/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with committee to discuss sale process, liquidity, and negotiations with Debtors.
21	8/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Participate in UCC call re: upcoming mediation, Plan, and other issues.
21	8/29/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.2	Attend Committee call on waterfall and liquidity.
21	8/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Attend UCC call re: upcoming mediation, Plan, and other issues.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 107 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	8/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.2	Attend call with Committee to discuss mediation, term sheet and hurdle analysis.
21 Total			24.5	
24	8/14/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	0.9	Incorporate updates to the June fee application exhibits.
24	8/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Attend call with the FTI team re: June fee application updates.
24	8/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend call with team to discuss June fee application.
24	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Continue to prepare June fee application.
24	8/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Prepare June fee application exhibits.
24	8/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review June fee application.
24	8/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Continue to prepare fee application for June.
24	8/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Continue to work on June fee application exhibits.
24	8/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Review updates to the June fee application.
24	8/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: fee application exhibits.
24	8/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.6	Prepare fee application exhibits.
24	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Incorporate updates to the June fee application.
24	8/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in meeting with the FTI team re: June fee application comments.
24	8/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Address comments to June fee application exhibits.
24	8/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Address comments on fee application exhibits.
24	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Finalize draft of June fee application.
24	8/28/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	2.8	Prepare the July fee application to ensure compliance with bankruptcy guidelines.
24	8/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Prepare outline for July fee application.
24 Total			23.4	
26	8/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Correspond with FTI team re: insurance diligence documents received
26	8/9/2024	William Flaharty	1.4	and related workstreams. Review received insurance policies for key considerations.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 108 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE	PERIOD	AUGUST 1	, 2024 TO	AUGUST 31.	2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	8/12/2024	William Flaharty	1.6	Review insurance coverage documents for renewals and D&O coverage reporting.
26 Total			3.5	- corporate.
27	8/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Attend call with FTI team on mediation timeline and preparation.
27	8/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss tasks leading up to mediation.
27	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI Team to discuss mediation deliverables.
27	8/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Participate in call with Troutman to discuss mediation issues and memo.
27	8/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Participate in call with FTI Team to discuss mediation deliverables.
27	8/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Attend call with Troutman to discuss mediation issues and memo.
27	8/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with Troutman and FTI team re: mediation.
27	8/27/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review analysis of draft complaint.
27	8/27/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Troutman to discuss mediation.
27	8/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare instructions for FTI team in connection with mediation request from Troutman.
27	8/29/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Review mediation statement.
27	8/29/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Review mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Review draft mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Jill Weston	0.2	Correspond with Counsel re: mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Attend call with FTI team re: mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: next steps on mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on schedule of Debtor claims for mediation.
27	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Review draft mediation memo provided by Troutman.
27	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: valuation issues in connection with mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Participate in call with FTI team re: mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: next steps on mediation memo.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 109 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
27	8/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Attend call with FTI team re: mediation memo.
27	8/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review mediation statement.
27	8/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Review mediation memo to provide additional comments.
27	8/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Populate certain financial information in mediation memo.
27	8/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with FTI team on mediation memo.
27 Total			19.8	
Grand Tota	1		646.9	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 110 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Working Meals	\$36.41
Research	\$961.63
Total	\$998.04

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 111 of 204

EXHIBIT E LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2024 TO AUGUST 31, 2024

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
08/26/24	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while working late in the office on the LaVie case.	\$36.41
Working	Meals Total			\$36.41
07/31/24	Abigail Buhrman	Research	Subscription in relation to research for investigative diligence.	\$500.00
08/08/24	Abigail Buhrman	Research	Retrieval of corporate records in connection with investigative diligence.	\$461.63
Research	Total			\$961.63
Grand T	otal			\$998.04

EXHIBIT D

Fourth Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11		
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB		
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)) Objection Deadline: November 4, 2024)		
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICE EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISO UNSECURED CREDI	EE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. IS RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF IR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ITORS FOR THE PERIOD ITHE AND INCLUDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2024		
Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.		
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors		
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024		
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024		
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	September 1, 2024 through September 30, 2024		
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$259,863.95		
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$5,411.77		
This is a(n): application.	_X_ monthly interim final		

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 114 of 204

EXHIBIT A

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees			
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	15.8	\$21,962.00			
Steven Hazel	Senior Managing Director	1,315	7.1	9,336.50			
Zahara Kassam	Managing Director	1,075	3.2	3,440.00			
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	38.7	40,054.50			
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	94.9	98,221.50			
Charles Foster	Managing Director	1,035	2.9	3,001.50			
Jason Fauss	Senior Director	900	1.3	1,170.00			
Jill Weston	Director	865	23.4	20,241.00			
Abigail Buhrman	Senior Consultant	730	0.2	146.00			
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	85.5	62,415.00			
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	9.9	6,583.50			
Rahil Kapur	Senior Consultant	665	3.7	2,460.50			
Ismail Shaik	Senior Consultant	595	8.3	4,938.50			
Sangya Tiwari	Consultant	500	8.8	4,400.00			
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	71.8	35,541.00			
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	2.6	845.00			
SUBTOTAL			378.1	\$314,756.50			
Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time (9,993.5							
Less: Voluntary Reduction (44,899.05							
GRAND TOTAL 378.1 \$259,863.95							

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 115 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	19.5	14,793.00
5	Real Estate Issues	13.0	12,629.00
6	Asset Sales	3.5	2,623.50
8	Valuation and Related Matters	54.4	44,955.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	5.4	4,239.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	0.3	310.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	63.0	48,399.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	72.6	67,042.50
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	0.7	663.50
19	Case Management	1.0	495.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	16.6	16,948.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	51.8	30,936.50
25	Travel Time	22.7	19,987.00
27	Mediation	53.6	50,735.00
	SUBTOTAL	378.1	\$314,756.50
	Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time		(9,993.50)
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(44,899.05)
	GRAND TOTAL	378.1	\$259,863.95

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 116 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in budget variance call with Ankura.
2	9/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals.
2	9/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.2	Update DIP budget summary for weekly Committee presentation.
2	9/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Attend call with Ankura to discuss liquidity.
2	9/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Provide comments to cash flow report for Committee.
2	9/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Prepare talking points for UCC meeting re: cash flow.
2	9/4/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review update to Committee on liquidity and sale process.
2	9/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Prepare DIP budget summary and accompanying cash flow update slides for UCC presentation.
2	9/10/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments to cash flow report for Committee.
2	9/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review cash flow update to Committee on budget to actual performance.
2	9/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare cash flow variance analysis.
2	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review cash flow budget to actuals for period ending 8/30 in preparation for UCC meeting.
2	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review incurred fees in order to forecast liquidity.
2	9/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Update DIP budget and prepare cash flow presentation.
2	9/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Revise estimated fees incurred to date for liquidity forecasting.
2	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals cash flow variance for period ending 9/6.
2	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for period ending 9/6.
2	9/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with Ankura to discuss budget to actuals.
2	9/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze cash flow report to Committee.
2	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals variance reporting for period ending 9/13.
2	9/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review liquidity update to Committee.
2	9/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review budget to actuals variance reporting.
2	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Participate in call with Ankura re: claims and budget to actuals for period ending $9/13$.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 117 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	9/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Update weekly cash flow budget and prepare accompanying presentation.
2	9/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Attend weekly cash flow update call with Ankura.
2	9/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Attend call with Ankura to discuss cash flow variances.
2	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Ankura re: cash flow analysis and claim bifurcation.
2	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review UCC liquidity presentation for week ending 9/13.
2	9/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review budget to actual variance reporting.
2	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals for period ending 9/20.
2	9/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Update DIP budget and accompanying presentation for cash flow reporting.
2 Total			19.5	
5	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review history of a certain real estate transfer document.
5	9/3/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Review operation transfer agreements and draft response to counsel.
5	9/3/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.2	Review divested facility tracker.
5	9/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review summary of consideration for divested facility transactions.
5	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in call with MWE and Ankura re: divested facilities and associated consideration.
5	9/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend call with Debtors on divestitures.
5	9/5/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.0	Review divested facility tracker.
5	9/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Ankura, MWE, and Troutman to discuss divestitures.
5	9/6/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.3	Provide timeline information on certain payments in connection with real estate.
5	9/12/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.5	Review audited financial statements in relation to real estate consideration.
5	9/12/2024	Rahil Kapur	0.6	Review real estate valuation work.
5	9/13/2024	Charles Foster	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate case updates.
5	9/13/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.6	Prepary summary of real estate case updates.
5	9/13/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate case status.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 118 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
5	9/13/2024	Zahara Kassam	0.7	Review mediation documents as it relates to real estate issues.
5	9/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: real estate case status.
5	9/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Analyze consideration provided in various transactions for divested facilities.
5	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review divested facility analysis in connection with Troutman questions.
5	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review transaction consideration analysis in connection with Troutman request.
5	9/19/2024	Rahil Kapur	1.0	Review operation transfer agreements related to questions from Troutman.
5	9/19/2024	Zahara Kassam	1.1	Analyze operation transfer agreements.
5 Total			13.0	
6	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in sale process call with Stout.
6	9/3/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.3	Attend sale process call with Stout.
6	9/3/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Participate in call with Stout on sale update.
6	9/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Participate in call with Stout to discuss sale process.
6	9/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Prepare updates for UCC re: sale process.
6	9/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Stout re: sale process update.
6	9/6/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with Stout on sale process.
6 Total			3.5	
8	9/1/2024	Steven Hazel	2.1	Prepare valuation schedules in relation to divested facility transactions.
8	9/1/2024	Steven Hazel	1.9	Continue to review valuation schedules in relation to divested facility transactions.
8	9/1/2024	Jill Weston	1.2	Perform diligence on financial statements.
8	9/1/2024	Jill Weston	1.9	Perform public company research on comparable companies re: valuation reports.
8	9/1/2024	Jill Weston	2.3	Investigate history of transactions in connection with valuation.
8	9/1/2024	Jill Weston	1.8	Conduct research on divested facilities for valuation reports.
8	9/1/2024	Jill Weston	2.8	Prepare comparable public company analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 119 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	SEPTEMBER	1, 2024 TO	SEPTEMBER	30, 2024
----------------	-----------	------------	-----------	----------

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
8	9/2/2024	Ismail Shaik	1.9	Perform quality control on schedules related to revenue of divested facilities re: valuation.
8	9/2/2024	Ismail Shaik	1.6	Continue to conduct quality control on schedules related to financials of divested facilities.
8	9/2/2024	Jill Weston	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team re: divested facility quality control.
8	9/2/2024	Jill Weston	2.7	Perform guideline public company research and quality control.
8	9/2/2024	Jill Weston	2.5	Incorporate updates to transaction analysis re: valuation reports.
8	9/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: divested facility analysis investigations.
8	9/2/2024	Sangya Tiwari	1.8	Review mediation documents re: valuation report.
8	9/2/2024	Sangya Tiwari	2.9	Continue to review and perform quality control of the mediation documents re: valuation report.
8	9/2/2024	Sangya Tiwari	1.5	Continue to perform quality control of the mediation documents re: valuation of transfers.
8	9/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review valuation of operating facilities for mediation.
8	9/3/2024	Steven Hazel	2.0	Assess key considerations related to valuation analysis.
8	9/3/2024	Jason Fauss	1.3	Prepare draft valuation analysis of divested locations.
8	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with the FTI team re: valuation for mediation memo.
8	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review valuation report from valuation team for mediation memo.
8	9/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss valuation issues.
8	9/3/2024	Ismail Shaik	2.7	Perform quality control on divested facilities re: valuation.
8	9/3/2024	Ismail Shaik	2.1	Continue to perform quality control on divested facilities for valuation reports.
8	9/3/2024	Jill Weston	2.3	Review divested facility analysis in connection with valuation reports.
8	9/3/2024	Jill Weston	2.7	Review and update the mediation memo for valuation matters.
8	9/3/2024	Jill Weston	0.4	Correspond with the FTI team re: findings on divested facilities.
8	9/3/2024	Sangya Tiwari	2.6	Perform thorough review of the valuation support documents.
8	9/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review divested facility valuation analysis from FTI team in connection with mediation.
8	9/5/2024	Steven Hazel	0.4	Update valuation analysis schedules.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 120 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	SEPTEMBER	1, 2024 TO	SEPTEMBER	30.	2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
8	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Correspond with Troutman and FTI team re: supplemental materials for mediator regarding valuation.
8	9/6/2024	Steven Hazel	0.7	Prepare valuation methodology memo.
8	9/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Provide comments on materials to supplement mediation memo re: claim valuation.
8	9/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare supplemental materials for mediator re: claim valuation.
8	9/6/2024	Jill Weston	2.5	Incorporate updates to the mediation memo re: valuation.
8	9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Finalize mediation memo supplement to send to Counsel.
8	9/12/2024	Charles Foster	0.7	Review valuation updates related to divested facilities.
8 Total			54.4	
11	9/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend status conference hearing.
11	9/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.5	Attend Disclosure Statement hearing.
11	9/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	2.5	Attend court hearing on Plan and Disclosure Statement.
11 Total			5.4	
13	9/6/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review Debtors' objection to a motion to dismiss bankruptcy cases.
13 Total			0.3	
14	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Review claims asserted against certain Debtor entities.
14	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review UCC request for additional claims information.
14	9/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Prepare summary of estimated general unsecured claim recovery.
14	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Evaluate considerations re: trade claims.
14	9/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Analyze revised claims pool.
14	9/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Review claims register.
14	9/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Assess latest unsecured claims base.
14	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Ankura re: claims pool.
14	9/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Participate in call with Ankura to discuss claims analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 121 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2024

Task	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
Category 14	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman		Analyze unsecured claims pool to reconcile between operating and divested facilities.
14	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with Ankura to discuss claims analysis.
14	9/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Correspond with Troutman re: claims analysis questions.
14	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: next steps on claims analysis.
14	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review claims analysis in connection with request by Ankura.
14	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: claims.
14	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review updated claims register provided by Ankura.
14	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Conduct initial review of claims register.
14	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review claims register to assess Plan issues.
14	9/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Participate in call with the FTI team to discuss claims.
14	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team regarding claim allocation.
14	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Prepare analysis re: claim bifurcation.
14	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Debtors' advisors re: claims allocation.
14	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with the Debtors regarding claims allocation.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Analyze claims based on claims register.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Analyze claims summary for next steps on claims review.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: claims analysis and contract review.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review parent claims analysis.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review executory contracts listing for potential claims against pare
14	9/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.9	entity. Prepare analysis of filed claims for Debtor entity designations.
14	9/24/2024	Andrew Sveen	2.5	Investigate filed claims.
14	9/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare analysis re: claim bifurcation.

0.5 Evaluate next steps for claims register analysis.

Maxwell Dawson

14

9/24/2024

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 122 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	9/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review requests from Troutman re: claims bifurcation.
14	9/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: claims issues.
14	9/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare responses to Troutman questions on claims information.
14	9/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Provide comments on analysis of selected claim forms.
14	9/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review summary of claims against the parent entity.
14	9/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Review proofs of claim for allocation purposes.
14	9/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Attend call with the FTI team re: proofs of claim.
14	9/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to review proofs of claim for allocation purposes.
14	9/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to review proofs of claim for allocation purposes.
14	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Prepare schedule of personal injury claims in advance of call with UCC and Debtors' professionals.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review response to Troutman re: claims analysis observations and key takeaways.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman, FTI, and Committee member re: claims.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team re: claims analysis.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review proofs of claim in connection with trade claim review.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review proofs of claim in connection with personal injury claims review.
14	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in additional call with the FTI team re: claims analysis comments.
14	9/25/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.2	Prepare analysis of filed claims to determine allocation by facility.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Evaluate considerations related to certain litigation claims against the Debtors.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Prepare analysis re: classification of certain claims in Plan.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in additional call with FTI team re: claim analysis and questions from Troutman.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Prepare responses to claim analysis and questions from Troutman.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: claim analysis and questions from Troutman.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review claims analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 123 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Provide comments on claims analysis.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Attend call with Troutman and Committee members re: claims.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Prepare analysis re: impact of certain claim classifications in Plan.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review claim analysis and questions from Troutman.
14	9/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Review filed claims to assess key variances from schedules.
14	9/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review summary of proofs of claims.
14	9/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Revise claim allocation summary.
14	9/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: proofs of claim.
14	9/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Prepare mapping file of all personal injury claims.
14	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review claims analysis questions.
14	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Analyze general unsecured claim recoveries under various claims scenarios.
14	9/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Further analyze claims bifurcation issues.
14	9/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Troutman re: Plan and claim considerations.
14	9/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Continue to analyze claims bifurcation issues.
14	9/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Attend call with Troutman to discuss allocation of proceeds and claims by operating facility.
14	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with Troutman to discuss claim considerations.
14	9/26/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.1	Review claims bifurcation.
14	9/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Review allocation of claims.
14 Total			63.0	
16	9/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Analyze precedent case and summarize recoveries.
16	9/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Prepare notes from precedent case to summarize recoveries.
16	9/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Analyze Disclosure Statement objections.
16	9/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Review proposed Plan settlement in related case.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 124 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2024

Task	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
Category 16	9/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Finalize summary on precedent case recoveries.
16	9/4/2024	Olivia Mandella		Correspond with team re: summary on precedent case recoveries.
16	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review waterfall support provided by Ankura.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with the FTI team re: Plan settlement analysis.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review claims information in connection with settlement analysis.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.8	Provide comments on claims settlement analysis.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Troutman re: updates to the mediation settlement scenarios.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review administrative claims information in connection with settlement scenarios.
16	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Prepare revised waterfall analysis based on additional potential considerations.
16	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Revise waterfall analysis based on inputs from discussions with Troutman.
16	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Troutman re: revised waterfall analysis.
16	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare additional waterfall materials for upcoming mediation.
16	9/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review potential waterfall and recovery to unsecured creditors.
16	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review top unsecured claims allocation in connection with settlement.
16	9/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with team on waterfall scenarios for mediation.
16	9/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review correspondence with Committee re: special meeting and settlement proposal.
16	9/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.4	Analyze Committee member settlement analysis.
16	9/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Plan settlement analysis.
16	9/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review chapter 7 waterfall analysis provided by independent director.
16	9/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Compare waterfall analysis from various parties.
16	9/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review letter and waterfall from independent director.
16	9/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review letter and waterfall from independent director.
16	9/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Analyze updated waterfall analysis from the Debtors.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 125 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	SEPTEMBER 1.	2024 TO	SEPTEMBER 30,	2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare questions related to waterfall analysis.
16	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman and FTI re: waterfall and chapter 7 analysis.
16	9/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Troutman and FTI to discuss waterfall and chapter 7 analysis.
16	9/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review updated waterfall from Debtors advisors.
16	9/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team re: status conference and settlement offer.
16	9/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: status conference, settlement offer, and other case issues.
16	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.7	Review amended joint Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review potential objections to amended Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare comments on Disclosure Statement.
16	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Reconcile claims information in Disclosure Statement.
16	9/18/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Review amended Disclosure Statement and Plan.
16	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman and FTI re: settlement offer.
16	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.7	Provide comments on waterfall recovery analysis.
16	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Troutman and FTI re: recovery analysis.
16	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with Troutman re: latest Plan settlement proposal.
16	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Prepare analysis re: waterfall and settlement mechanics.
16	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in internal call to discuss Disclosure Statement and claims.
16	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Troutman re: latest Plan settlement proposal.
16	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Revise analysis re: waterfall mechanics.
16	9/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Review redline of second amended Plan.
16	9/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence with Committee re: status of settlement negotiations.
16	9/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review updated settlement proposal.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 126 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	9/20/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review objections to Disclosure Statement.
16	9/20/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Continue to review objections to Disclosure Statement.
16	9/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review correspondence on settlement offers and votes from Committee members.
16	9/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Provide comments on updated draft of Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review recovery support.
16	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review revised Plan draft.
16	9/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review objections to Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Analyze Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with UCC and Debtors' professionals re: claims analysis and Plan.
16	9/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Counsel re: comments on Plan.
16	9/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Attend call with Troutman, MWE, Ankura and independent director to discuss Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	9/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.3	Review claims in connection with Troutman's questions on Plan.
16	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review updated divested facility accounts receivable aging in connection with settlement consideration analysis.
16	9/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review revised filed Plan.
16	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.9	Analyze trade claims in connection with Plan settlement.
16	9/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Prepare analysis re: recoveries under certain claim structures.
16	9/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Prepare comparison of financial projections in the confidential information memorandum to the revised Plan.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Review updated liquidation analysis in second amended Plan.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review comparison of financial projections related to the Plan.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review redline of second amended Plan.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review updated waterfall analysis claims buildup.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Analyze claims buildup in updated waterfall.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 127 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	9/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review second amended Plan.
16	9/27/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review revised Disclosure Statement.
16	9/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review current media reports on amended Plan.
16	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.4	Analyze recovery projections related to Disclosure Statement.
16	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review recovery projections related to Disclosure Statement.
16	9/30/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Attend call with team on waterfall updates.
16	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Prepare summary of waterfall analysis updates for FTI team.
16	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team re: waterfall analysis updates.
16	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman on comments to latest combined Plan and Disclosure Statement draft.
16	9/30/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Analyze recoveries related to Disclosure Statement hearing.
16	9/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Review recovery analysis provided by Ankura.
16 Total			72.6	
18	9/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Correspond with Troutman on deliverables related to investigation work.
18	9/3/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.2	Update chart on a certain executive with additional information.
18 Total			0.7	
19	9/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Update team calendar for case deadlines.
19	9/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Update important case timelines calendar and circulate to team.
19 Total			1.0	
21	9/5/2024	Andrew Sveen	0.9	Attend UCC call re: sales process and mediation.
21	9/5/2024	Charles Foster	0.9	Attend UCC call to discuss mediation and case updates.
21	9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in UCC call re: sale process, mediation, and other case updates.
21	9/5/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Participate in call with Committee on mediation.
21	9/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Attend Committee call to discuss mediation and financial updates.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 128 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	SEPTEMBER	1, 2024 TO	SEPTEMBER 30.	2024
		-,		

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	9/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Prepare notes from weekly Committee call re: mediation.
21	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with Committee re: mediation status and next steps.
21	9/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Participate in Committee call to discuss mediation.
21	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Participate in call with Committee re: settlement offer.
21	9/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Participate in call with Committee to discuss settlement offers and mediation.
21	9/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Attend call with Committee to discuss settlement offers.
21	9/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Prepare for Committee call re: waterfall analysis.
21	9/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare for call with UCC re: settlement offer.
21	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Participate in call with UCC re: settlement offer.
21	9/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.9	Attend Committee call to discuss settlements.
21	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Attend UCC call re: Plan settlement proposal.
21	9/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with Committee to discuss mediator's proposal.
21	9/26/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Attend UCC call regarding Plan considerations and claims.
21	9/26/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend call with Committee to discuss Plan and Disclosure Statement.
21	9/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Participate in call with UCC re: Plan and settlement.
21	9/26/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Attend Committee call on Plan and settlement update.
21 Total			16.6	
24	9/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare the July fee application exhibits.
24	9/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.7	Continue to prepare July fee application exhibits.
24	9/5/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.6	Incorporate updates to the July fee application exhibits.
24	9/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.2	Continue to prepare July fee application exhibits.
24	9/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Prepare July fee application exhibits.
24	9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review the June fee application.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 129 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	9/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to prepare July fee application exhibits.
24	9/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Continue to prepare July fee application exhibits.
24	9/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.8	Prepare introduction pages for monthly fee application.
24	9/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Provide comments on June fee application.
24	9/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Review July fee application.
24	9/13/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare the July fee applications.
24	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with Ankura re: payment of fee statement.
24	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review guidance on fee application submission in jurisdiction.
24	9/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: fee statements.
24	9/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Review July fee application.
24	9/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Continue to review July fee application.
24	9/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review June 2024 fee statement.
24	9/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Process edits to July fee application.
24	9/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Prepare rate increase notice.
24	9/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Continue to process edits to July fee application.
24	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Review updated draft of July fee application.
24	9/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Finalize draft of July fee application.
24	9/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Finalize July fee application comments.
24	9/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Finalize July fee application exhibits.
24	9/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.8	Provide comments on July fee statement.
24	9/20/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Continue to review July fee statement.
24	9/20/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	0.8	Finalize the June fee application.
24	9/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: June fee application and payment.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 130 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	9/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend call with the FTI team re: fee application.
24	9/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with FTI team re: July fee application.
24	9/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.7	Incorporate updates to the July fee application exhibits.
24	9/23/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.7	Further incorporate updates to the July fee application.
24	9/24/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Review July fee application.
24	9/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Process edits to July fee application.
24	9/25/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	1.1	Prepare the August fee application.
24	9/25/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	0.7	Update the July fee application.
24	9/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Update fee application with comments from the team.
24	9/27/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review revisions to July fee application.
24	9/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Finalize July fee application.
24	9/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review updated July fee application.
24	9/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Prepare August fee application exhibits.
24 Total			51.8	
25	9/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	6.2	Travel from New York to Atlanta for mediation.
25	9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	5.5	Travel to Atlanta for mediation.
25	9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	5.0	Travel from Atlanta to New York after attending mediation.
25	9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	6.0	Travel to New York after mediation in Atlanta.
25 Total			22.7	
27	9/1/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review FTI comments on mediation memo.
27	9/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Prepare edits to mediation statement.
27	9/2/2024	Adam Saltzman		Prepare updates to mediation memo based on discussion with FTI team.
27	9/2/2024	Narendra Ganti		Review updated mediation statement.
27	9/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare updates to mediation memo based on discussion with FTI team.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 131 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
27	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review final draft of mediation memo.
27	9/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Finalize calculations in mediation memo.
27	9/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with Troutman and FTI team on mediation memo comments.
27	9/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review finalized mediation memo.
27	9/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.1	Review various versions of mediation statement.
27	9/6/2024	Clifford Zucker	1.0	Review confidential mediation memorandum.
27	9/6/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review updated language related to valuation approach in mediation statement.
27	9/6/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review correspondence related to mediation.
27	9/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Conduct administrative matters related to travel to mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review mediation memo supplement.
27	9/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	4.5	Participate in Plan mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare notes and documents for mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare for upcoming mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Prepare supporting documents needed for mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Review mediation support material in preparation for mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	4.5	Attend mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Charles Foster	1.0	Review notes from mediation.
27	9/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	3.0	Attend mediation with Debtors, Committee, and DIP Lender (partial).
27	9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman re: mediation.
27	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: mediation settlement scenarios.
27	9/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss mediation.
27	9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Determine next steps following mediation.
27	9/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	8.0	Participate in Plan mediation.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 132 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
27	9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	3.5	Attend mediation.
27	9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	4.5	Continue to attend mediation.
27	9/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	4.0	Attend mediation (partial).
27	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Debrief with FTI team on mediation next steps.
27	9/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze sensitivity analysis for mediation.
27	9/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss mediation.
27	9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in internal call to debrief Plan mediation and discuss next steps.
27	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: mediation debrief and next steps.
27	9/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Update mediation scenario analysis in preparation for UCC meeting.
27	9/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss mediation.
27	9/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Prepare summary of mediation points to discuss with team.
27	9/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review correspondence related to mediation.
27	9/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with FTI team to discuss counter proposal from mediator.
27	9/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review settlement offer from mediator.
27	9/19/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review proposal from mediator.
27	9/19/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Review case updates in relation to mediation.
27	9/20/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review updated offer from mediator regarding settlement.
27 Total			53.6	
rand Tota	l		378.1	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 133 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Airfare	\$1,139.45
Lodging	\$2,206.42
Research	\$1,239.55
Transportation	\$509.80
Working Meals	\$316.55
Total	\$5,411.77

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 134 of 204

EXHIBIT E

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
9/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Airfare	Flight to and from Atlanta for mediation.	\$516.21
9/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	Airfare	Flight to and from Atlanta for mediation.	\$613.24
9/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	Airfare	Travel Agent Fees to coordinate trip to mediation in Atlanta.	\$10.00
Airfare Tota	al			\$1,139.45
9/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	Lodging	Hotel in Atlanta while traveling for mediation.	\$888.24
9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Lodging	Hotel in Atlanta while traveling for mediation.	\$1,318.18
Lodging To	tal			\$2,206.42
7/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	Research	Retrieval of electronic records in connection with investigation work.	\$29.60
8/1/2024	Juliana Guzman Cardenas	Research	Retrieval of electronic records in connection with investigative diligence.	\$48.45
8/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	Research	Retrieval of electronic records in connection with investigative diligence.	\$87.20
8/31/2024	Linda Butterfield	Research	Retrieval of electronic records in connection with investigative diligence.	\$1,000.00
9/1/2024	Linda Butterfield	Research	Retrieval of electronic records in connection with investigative diligence.	\$74.30
Research To	otal			\$1,239.55
9/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	Transportation	Taxi to airport to travel to Atlanta for mediation.	\$135.73
9/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	Transportation	Taxi from Atlanta airport to hotel for mediation.	\$33.57
9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Transportation	Taxi from home to JFK airport for mediation.	\$15.90
9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Transportation	Taxi from Atlanta airport to hotel for mediation.	\$43.53
9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	Transportation	Taxi from mediation to the Atlanta airport.	\$53.18
9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	Transportation	Taxi from LGA airport to home from mediation.	\$179.02
9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Transportation	Taxi from hotel to Atlanta airport after mediation.	\$35.92

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 135 of 204

EXHIBIT E

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Transportation	Taxi from JFK airport to home after mediation.	\$12.95
Fransportat	ion Total			\$509.80
9/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$25.00
9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$11.63
9/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$10.56
9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Breakfast for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting	\$4.21
9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Breakfast for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting	\$11.89
9/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$100.00
9/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$22.73
9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Breakfast for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting	\$11.89
9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Breakfast for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting	\$4.21
9/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Lunch for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$25.00
9/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Lunch for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$14.15
9/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$17.25
9/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$36.16
9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Lunch for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$7.89
9/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Lunch for self while traveling to Atlanta to attend LaVie mediation meeting.	\$13.98
Working M	eals Total			\$316.55

EXHIBIT E

Fifth Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
D.1.) (Jointly Administered)
Debtors.	Objection Deadline: December 19, 2024
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICE EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISO UNSECURED CREDI	E STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. IS RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF REFORE THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF STORS FOR THE PERIOD HE AND INCLUDING OCTOBER 31, 2024
Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	October 1, 2024 through October 31, 2024
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$207,101.35
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$31.22
This is a(n): application.	X monthly interim final

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 138 of 204

EXHIBIT A

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	7.6	\$10,564.00
James Wrynn	Senior Managing Director	1,390	1.1	1,529.00
William Flaharty	Managing Director	1,075	23.7	25,477.50
John Gleba	Managing Director	1,075	2.9	3,117.50
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	23.3	24,115.50
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	67.3	69,655.50
Andrew Whitman	Senior Director	980	8.7	8,526.00
Jill Weston	Director	865	0.6	519.00
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	82.3	60,079.00
Andrew Sveen	Senior Consultant	665	1.0	665.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	75.3	37,273.50
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	2.2	715.00
SUBTOTAL			296.0	\$242,236.50
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(35,135.15)
GRAND TOTAL			296.0	\$207,101.35

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 139 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	6.1	\$5,264.50
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	48.1	33,924.50
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	3.6	3,726.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	11.7	10,534.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	73.6	55,998.50
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	22.3	20,982.50
19	Case Management	1.9	1,807.50
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	6.7	6,862.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	44.0	26,763.00
26	Insurance	78.0	76,373.00
	SUBTOTAL	296.0	\$242,236.50
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(35,135.15)
	GRAND TOTAL	296.0	\$207,101.35

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 140 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD	OCTOBER 1	l, 2024 TO	OCTOBER 31, 20	24

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
1	10/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze August 2024 monthly operating reports.	
1	10/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review July fee application of Debtors' Counsel.	
1	10/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of recent docket filings and dataroom uploads for FTI team.	
1	10/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of docket filings and dataroom uploads to distribute to FTI team.	
1	10/10/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Analyze revised cash flow budget.	
1	10/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Categorize files in data room index.	
1	10/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review data re: formation of operating facilities.	
1	10/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare daily summary of docket and dataroom updates for the FTI team.	
1	10/16/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review patient care ombudsman report.	
1	10/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review Virginia patient care ombudsman report.	
1	10/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare daily update of recent dataroom uploads and docket updates.	
1	10/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of docket filings and dataroom uploads to circulate to team.	
1	10/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3		
1	10/31/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review additional patient care ombudsman report.	
1	10/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of docket filings and dataroom uploads to distribute to team.	
1 Total			6.1		
2	10/1/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for period ending 9/20.	
2	10/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss professional fee forecast in connection with liquidity.	
2	10/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: liquidity issues and professional fee accruals.	
2	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for period ending 9/20.	
2	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Address comments in cash flow deck.	
2	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend call with the FTI team re: professional fee forecast and related liquidity impacts.	
2	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare forecast of professional fee estimates for liquidity purposes.	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 141 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review and comment on professional fees projection.
2	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: fee projection and liquidity impacts.
2	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review liquidity projection in connection with fee estimates.
2	10/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Correspond with FTI team re: professional fee estimate and liquidity.
2	10/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Provide comments on professional fee estimate re: liquidity.
2	10/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: professional fee estimate and liquidity.
2	10/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Address comments to fee estimate.
2	10/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: fee estimate.
2	10/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: updated fee projection and liquidity implications.
2	10/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review cash flow reporting package.
2	10/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: professional fee estimate and liquidity.
2	10/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss professional fees and liquidity.
2	10/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: fee estimates and liquidity.
2	10/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare cash flow presentation for new proposed budget.
2	10/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Update cash flow summaries with new proposed budget from Debtors.
2	10/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.3	Prepare roll forward sensitivity forecast for new proposed budget.
2	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review updated cash flow budget.
2	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Continue to review extended DIP budget forecast.
2	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review budget to actuals for period ending 9/27.
2	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review cash flow forecast sensitivity analysis.
2	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: cash forecast sensitivity analysis.
2	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Review cash forecast analysis.
2	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: cash forecasting.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 142 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024				
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Prepare questions list for Ankura re: latest budget.
2	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Provide comments on summary of latest DIP budget for UCC.
2	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Update estimate of certain expense roll-forwards.
2	10/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Update cash flow slides for UCC deck.
2	10/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: cash flow forecast sensitivity analysis.
2	10/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Address comments to DIP Budget forecast sensitivity analysis.
2	10/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.3	Prepare exhibit of cash bridge for updated DIP budget.
2	10/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review updated UCC fee estimate re: liquidity.
2	10/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget to actuals and extended
2	10/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	liquidity forecast. Attend call with FTI team re: fee projection and run rates.
2	10/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: fee run rates.
2	10/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Prepare analysis re: fee and liquidity projections.
2	10/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Ankura re: DIP budget and variances.
2	10/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Review cash flow slides for delivery to UCC.
2	10/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with Ankura to discuss budget to actuals.
2	10/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Update commentary in DIP budget forecast slides for UCC presentation
2	10/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Attend call with Ankura re: updated DIP budget forecast.
2	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Provide comments on UCC update presentation re: DIP budget and
2	10/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	liquidity. Review comments on UCC slides re: cash flow.
2	10/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review liquidity update to Committee.
2	10/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Address comments to cash flow slides.
2	10/9/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments to cash flow report for the Committee.
2	10/9/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Provide comments to cash flow report for the Committee.

0.4 Analyze weekly cash flow reporting package.

2

10/10/2024

Clifford Zucker

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 143 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare for UCC call re: DIP budget and liquidity forecast.
2	10/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Provide comments on liquidity analysis.
2	10/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Continue to review liquidity analysis.
2	10/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Prepare talking points for UCC presentation re: cash flow.
2	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence with DIP lender's Counsel re: DIP budget.
2	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Analyze budget vs. actuals for professional fees in connection with DIP lender correspondence.
2	10/11/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Update cash flow budget and accompanying slides.
2	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget to actuals for period ending 10/4.
2	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for period ending 10/4.
2	10/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Attend call with Ankura re: budget variances and DIP status.
2	10/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend weekly cash flow budget call with Ankura.
2	10/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Update cash flow budget for most recent variance reporting.
2	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Analyze issues with variances in liquidity reporting.
2	10/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review budget to actual update for period ending 10/11.
2	10/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for the period ending 10/11.
2	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget variances and other workstreams.
2	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Provide comments on cash flow reporting for UCC.
2	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review materials re: cash flow.
2	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with Ankura re: budget variances & follow-ups.
2	10/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Update cash flow for reconciled budget.
2	10/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with Ankura re: cash flow variances for the period ending 10/11.
2	10/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare summary of cash flow reporting variances to share with Ankura.
2	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review budget to actuals for period ending 10/18.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 144 of 204

EXHIBIT C

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024	FOR THE PERIC	D OCTOBER 1	, 2024 TO OC T	ΓOBER 31, 2024
--	---------------	-------------	-----------------------	----------------

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
2	10/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Update weekly cash flow reporting and accompanying slides.	
2	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Ankura re: budget to actuals for period ending 10/18.	
2	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Ankura re: cash flow and emergence issues.	
2	10/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend call with Ankura to discuss cash flow and case timeline.	
2	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review cash flow presentation for 10/31 UCC meeting.	
2	10/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review budget-to-actual reporting to develop talking points for UCC.	
2 Total			48.1		
11	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review notice of agenda for 10/8 hearing.	
11	10/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Attend hearing re: Recovery Corp motion.	
11	10/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.6	Attend 10/8 hearing on Recovery Corp motion.	
11	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review agenda for hearing on Recovery Corp's motion to compel.	
11 Total			3.6		
13	10/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review Debtors' motion to object to lift stay for insurance.	
13	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review Debtors' objection to Recovery Corp's Challenge to DIP.	
13	10/3/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review motions related to Recovery Corp.	
13	10/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review Recovery Corp's combined response in opposition to Debtors' motion to strike.	
13	10/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Review key workstreams based on public filings.	
13	10/4/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review Recovery Corp's response to the Debtors.	
13	10/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review Debtors' reply in support of motion to strike Recovery Corp's	
13	10/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Discovery motion. Review Debtors' reply to Recovery Corp.	
13	10/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Prepare summary of Recovery Corp's motion.	
13	10/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review Recovery Corp's response to Debtors' objections.	
13	10/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review correspondence related to Iezzoni lift stay.	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 145 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
13	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review reply of personal injury claimant in support of lifting of stay.
13	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review correspondence with MWE re: insurance lift stay motion.
13	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review lift stay motion and insurance coverage analysis.
13	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman and MWE re: lift stay motion.
13	10/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review daily update re: Recovery Corp's docket filings.
13	10/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review Florida claimants motion re: relief from automatic stay.
13	10/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review GUC trust agreement.
13	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review Debtors' objection to reconsideration motion.
13	10/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review Recovery Corp's motion to compel.
13	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review automatic stay relief motions and related filings.
13	10/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review objections to lift stay motions.
13	10/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review notice re: updated list of assumed executory contracts.
13 Total			11.7	
14	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review latest liquidation and claims buildup provided by Ankura.
14	10/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Review updates from UCC re: claims issues.
14	10/2/2024	Andrew Sveen	1.0	Review claims register and related analysis.
14	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review issues related to personal injury claims.
14	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review claims information provided by MWE re: personal injury
14	10/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	claimants. Categorize certain claims-related documentation in dataroom.
14	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: claims review.
14	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review workstreams related to claims analysis.

1.1 Analyze personal injury claim data for preparation of master schedule.

14

10/10/2024

Adam Saltzman

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 146 of 204

EXHIBIT C

				·
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	10/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review correspondence regarding medical malpractice claims and coverage.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: personal injury claimant review.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with Troutman re: claims and coverage information.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review claims analysis in connection with Iezzoni lift stay.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review GLPL loss run information in connection with claims review.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Correspond with FTI team on review of personal injury claims.
14	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review GLPL questions from FTI team.
14	10/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.9	Continue to cross-reference insurance files to claims register.
14	10/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Cross-reference insurance files to claims register.
14	10/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review medical malpractice claims issues.
14	10/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.1	Attend call with the FTI team re: facility jurisdiction in connection with claims review.
14	10/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Research jurisdiction of formation of facilities.
14	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.1	Participate in call with the FTI team re: facility jurisdictions of formation for claims review.
14	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review listing of OpCo facility information in connection with claims review.
14	10/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	
14	10/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare summary of claims issues to distribute to FTI team.
14	10/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review documents provided re: personal injury claims.
14	10/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: claims review and analysis.
14	10/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Continue to consolidate claims tracker.
14	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with Troutman re: claims analysis.
14	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review stratification of claims analysis.
14	10/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Continue to prepare summary information re: stratification of claims analysis.
14	10/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Prepare summary information re: claims analysis tracker.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 147 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	10/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Continue to prepare summary of claims.
14	10/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Analyze policies related to GLPL claims.
14	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Update claims analysis tracker based on additional data received.
14	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review unliquidated claims procedures.
14	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review claims walkdown.
14	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review updates to claims analysis.
14	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.7	Update analysis re: insured claims.
14	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.9	Prepare supplemental analysis re: insurance claims.
14	10/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review litigation claims workstreams.
14	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Update claims data summary for comments from team.
14	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Update claims data summary for further information.
14	10/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review of personal injury claims issues.
14	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Prepare walkdown of insured claim stratification.
14	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Analyze variances in insured claim summary schedules.
14	10/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review questions list for Ankura re: claims.
14	10/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare questions list for Ankura re: claims documentation and other issues.
14	10/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Reconcile claims to a filed schedule of holdings.
14	10/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review updates to claims walkdown.
14	10/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review a listing of claims categorized by Plaintiff.
14	10/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review summary of claims analysis for Troutman.
14	10/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Prepare summary of insured claim file.
14	10/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Prepare correspondence to FTI team re: insured claims.
14	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review claims analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 148 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024	4 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024
--------------------------------	-----------------------

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Continue to review claims analysis in preparation for call with Troutman
14	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review response from Ankura re: GLPL policies and personal injury claims.
14	10/25/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review summary related to medical malpractice claims for Debtors.
14	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review additional requests for Ankura in connection with claims diligence.
14	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review responses from Ankura re: claim questions.
14	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review latest claims tracker updates.
14	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Update insured claims summary for additional stratifications.
14	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with FTI and Troutman re: insured claims.
14	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: diligence questions on claims analysis.
14	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Finalize diligence questions for Ankura.
14	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: diligence questions on claims.
14	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Prepare analysis regarding insured claims.
14	10/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review medical malpractice claims summary.
14	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare for call with Troutman re: claims.
14	10/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Outline additional diligence items on claims.
14	10/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Prepare analysis re: insured claims.
14	10/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Analyze claims data based on facility categorization.
14	10/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Analyze claims data for demographic information.
14	10/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Review claims tracker and related analysis.
14	10/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Review updates to claims tracker.
14	10/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Continue to read various proofs of claim for relevant claim information.
14	10/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Read various proofs of claim for relevant claim information.
14 Total			73.6	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 149 of 204

EXHIBIT C

				<u> </u>
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	10/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review updated Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	10/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review order approving DS and Plan.
16	10/1/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review updated Plan and DS.
16	10/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review updated waterfall comparison prepared by Ankura.
16	10/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Provide comments to draft trust agreement.
16	10/8/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Provide comments to unliquidated claim resolution procedures.
16	10/11/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend call with a certain creditor to discuss Plan and claims.
16	10/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Participate in call with a certain creditor to discuss Plan.
16	10/16/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Review objections to confirmation by various personal injury claimants.
16	10/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review GUC Trust agreement.
16	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: confirmation declaration.
16	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare initial questions list for Troutman re: UCC declaration.
16	10/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with FTI team on confirmation declaration.
16	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare Confirmation diligence request list for Ankura.
16	10/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss confirmation declaration.
16	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: declaration preparation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with MWE, Troutman, and Ankura re: Plan process and preparation for confirmation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with FTI team re: debrief on declaration and Plan confirmation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare workstream allocation re: confirmation preparation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with the FTI team re: declaration and witness preparation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review Plan supplement.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review language in Plan re: investigation and mediation in preparation for confirmation.
16	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 150 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024
--

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	10/29/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review supplement to Plan.
16	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with MWE, Troutman, Ankura re: Plan support declaration.
16	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in call with FTI team re: Plan declaration and next steps.
16	10/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with FTI team to discuss Plan confirmation.
16	10/29/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review supplemental Plan and DS filed by Debtors.
16	10/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Attend debrief meeting with the FTI team re: Plan confirmation.
16	10/29/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Attend call with MWE, Troutman, and Ankura re: Plan process.
16	10/30/2024	Jill Weston	0.6	Review internal communications re: valuation in connection with Plan declaration.
16	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review mediation memo and other support in preparation for call with FTI team on UCC declaration.
16	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: confirmation.
16	10/30/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with FTI team to discuss confirmation.
16	10/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.9	Download key docket filings in relation to preparation for confirmation.
16	10/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review issues related to confirmation.
16	10/31/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Review key documents related to confirmation hearing.
16 Total			22.3	
19	10/1/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare plan of workstreams for next steps in the case.
19	10/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend meeting with the FTI team re: near-term workstreams, UCC call, and insurance update.
19	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in meeting with FTI team re: near-term workstreams, UCC call, and insurance update.
19	10/28/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Review correspondence from Counsel in connection with upcoming Committee call.
19	10/30/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Correspond with the FTI team re: case updates.
19	10/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Prepare for call with UCC re: confirmation, GUC trustee, and other issues.
19 Total			1.9	
21	10/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in UCC call to discuss Plan issues and status.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 151 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	10/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with Committee to discuss Plan and DS.
21	10/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with Committee re: Plan, confirmation, and case next steps.
21	10/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Attend Committee call to discuss Plan issues.
21	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Participate in call with UCC re: lift stay motions, confirmation, and other case issues.
21	10/10/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend Committee call to discuss confirmation and other motions.
21	10/10/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Attend UCC call re: case updates and confirmation.
21	10/10/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Attend and take notes on UCC call to discuss confirmation.
21	10/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Committee to discuss Plan and DS.
21	10/17/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Attend Committee call re: Plan updates.
21	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in UCC call re: Plan update, liquidity, and other issues.
21	10/31/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Committee to discuss confirmation hearing and GUC Trustee.
21	10/31/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with UCC re: confirmation, GUC Trustee, and other issues.
21	10/31/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Attend Committee call to discuss GUC Trustee and confirmation.
21	10/31/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Attend UCC call re: confirmation and case updates.
21 Total			6.7	
24	10/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with Counsel re: June fee application.
24	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Continue to prepare August fee application.
24	10/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Incorporate updates to the August fee application.
24	10/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.6	Revise the August fee application exhibits.
24	10/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare August fee application exhibits.
24	10/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update the August fee application exhibits.
24	10/3/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Continue to prepare August fee application exhibits.
24	10/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Provide comments on August fee application.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 152 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	10/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Provide comments on August fee statement.
24	10/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Review updates to August fee application.
24	10/8/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Address comments to August fee application.
24	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.2	Review August fee statement.
24	10/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Review updated draft of August fee application.
24	10/9/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Address comments to August fee application.
24	10/10/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review August fee application.
24	10/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Correspond with Counsel re: payment of the July fee application.
24	10/15/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	0.4	Prepare the September fee application.
24	10/16/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	1.8	Incorporate updates to the September fee application.
24	10/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with FTI team re: variances in August fee application.
24	10/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Incorporate updates to the August fee application exhibits.
24	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Finalize August fee application.
24	10/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare September fee application exhibits.
24	10/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Continue to prepare September fee application exhibits.
24	10/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare September fee application exhibits.
24	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Provide comments on September fee app.
24	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with Counsel re: July fee application.
24	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Review revisions to September fee application.
24	10/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.2	Process comments to September fee application.
24	10/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.8	Continue to prepare September fee application exhibits.
24	10/21/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Finalize first draft of September fee application exhibits.
24	10/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.1	Review September fee statement.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 153 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD	OCTOBER 1	. 2024 TO OCTOBER	31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Provide comments to September fee application.
24	10/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Process comments to September fee application.
24	10/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review September 2024 fee application.
24	10/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Correspond with Counsel re: September fee application.
24	10/24/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.1	Finalize September fee application.
24	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Coordinate payment of fee applications.
24 Total			44.0	
26	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review insurance policy information provided by MWE.
26	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Attend call with FTI and Troutman team re: insurance coverage and automatic stay issue.
26	10/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review historical actuarial reports.
26	10/9/2024	John Gleba	1.8	Analyze insurance policies related to litigated claims.
26	10/9/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.3	Participate in call with FTI and Troutman to discuss insurance coverage and medical malpractice claims.
26	10/9/2024	William Flaharty	1.8	Review historical insurance policies regarding specific aggregate erosion.
26	10/10/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with FTI team re: loss run information and insurance diligence.
26	10/10/2024	Andrew Whitman	1.1	Attend call with FTI team regarding personal injury claims and insurance policy information.
26	10/10/2024	John Gleba	1.1	Attend call with the FTI team to discuss insurance issues related to litigated claims.
26	10/10/2024	William Flaharty	2.4	Review policy listings and loss runs in identification of specific entity claims.
26	10/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review loss run and insurance claim information.
26	10/11/2024	Andrew Whitman	1.2	Prepare summary of personal injury claims and related insurance policy information.
26	10/11/2024	William Flaharty	2.4	Analyze losses and reconcile to policies to determine coverage issues.
26	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with the FTI team re: insurance coverage and claims.
26	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend call with Troutman re: insurance issues in relation to Iezzoni.
26	10/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: loss run and insurance information.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 154 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	10/14/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.9	Analyze insurance coverage regarding personal injury claims.
26	10/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance issues and next steps.
26	10/14/2024	William Flaharty	2.2	Continue to review GLPL policy limits for excluded claims.
26	10/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with Troutman re: a certain insurance matter.
26	10/15/2024	Andrew Whitman	2.1	Prepare for call with Troutman re: insurance coverage issue regarding personal injury claims.
26	10/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review most recent documents shared re: insurance.
26	10/15/2024	William Flaharty	2.1	Review Iezzoni claim and related coverage considerations.
26	10/16/2024	William Flaharty	1.7	Analyze a potential population of claims against the estate re: insurance coverage.
26	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review insurance policy GLPL dates for divested facilities.
26	10/16/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review correspondence with Troutman re: deductible and self insurance limits.
26	10/16/2024	Andrew Whitman	2.5	Review insurance coverage regarding personal injury claims.
26	10/17/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance tracker.
26	10/17/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.3	Analyze insurance coverage regarding personal injury claims.
26	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance tracker.
26	10/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in meeting with FTI team re: insurance data.
26	10/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with FTI team to discuss insurance tracker for personal injury claims.
26	10/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Attend call with FTI team to discuss insurance data.
26	10/17/2024	William Flaharty	1.0	Review model projections and assumptions of potential claims for professional liability.
26	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman re: insurance analysis and filed personal injury claims.
26	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with FTI team re: next steps on insurance and claims analysis.
26	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: insurance questions.
26	10/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend follow-up call with Troutman insurance coverage and claims.
26	10/18/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.2	Prepare for call with Troutman regarding insurance coverage.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 155 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Participate in call with FTI team re: follow-ups from Troutman call on insurance.
26	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with Troutman re: insurance coverage and filed claims.
26	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss insurance matters.
26	10/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in second call with Troutman re: insurance coverage and filed claims.
26	10/18/2024	William Flaharty	2.7	Review data to size potential exposure from claimants against professional liability policy coverages.
26	10/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.3	Attend call with the FTI team to review litigation claims and insurance analysis.
26	10/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance and litigation claims.
26	10/21/2024	William Flaharty	1.4	Research risk retention group flow of funds.
26	10/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with the FTI team to review updated litigation claims and insurance analysis.
26	10/22/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.1	Review correspondence regarding personal injury claims and associated insurance.
26	10/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claim analysis.
26	10/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Attend call with the FTI team to review updated insured claims walkdown.
26	10/23/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Attend call with FTI team re: insurance and claims analysis.
26	10/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claim walkdown.
26	10/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Match loss run information to insurance data.
26	10/23/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claim walkdown.
26	10/23/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Attend call with FTI team to discuss insured claims analysis.
26	10/23/2024	William Flaharty	1.0	Review model of insurance claims for responsiveness to insurance issues.
26	10/24/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend meeting with FTI team re: insurance coverage and policy analysis.
26	10/24/2024	James Wrynn	0.8	Attend meeting with FTI team re: insurance coverage and policy analysis.
26	10/24/2024	James Wrynn	0.3	Review GLPL reimbursement policy.
26	10/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Participate in meeting with FTI team re: insurance issues.
26	10/24/2024	William Flaharty	0.8	Continue to research risk retention structure.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 156 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	10/24/2024	William Flaharty	0.8	Attend meeting with FTI team re: insurance issues.
26	10/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with Troutman re: insured claims and related analysis.
26	10/25/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Troutman team re: insured claims.
26	10/25/2024	William Flaharty	0.7	Participate in call with Troutman regarding analysis of claims and insurance.
26	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with the FTI team re: insured claims analysis.
26	10/28/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Attend call with Troutman re: updated insurance and claims diligence.
26	10/28/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.2	Respond to email correspondence regarding personal injury claims and related insurance.
26	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Troutman re: insured claim summary.
26	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claim summary next steps.
26	10/28/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review settlement agreements in connection with insurance policies.
26	10/28/2024	William Flaharty	1.6	Investigate risk retention groups for Florida locations.
26	10/29/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.0	Attend meeting with the FTI team re: insurance and claims analysis.
26	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: insurance coverage.
26	10/29/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Participate in meeting with FTI team re: insured claims.
26	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: claims and insurance.
26	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with the FTI team re: next steps on claims and insurance analysis.
26	10/30/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review correspondence with FTI team re: insurance policy analysis and related questions.
26	10/30/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.1	Review correspondence regarding personal injury claims and associated insurance.
26	10/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman re: insured claims tracker.
26	10/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claims next steps.
26	10/30/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Review insurance policies to evaluate characteristics.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 157 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity	
26	10/30/2024	William Flaharty	1.1	Review deductible reimbursement coverage policies.	
26 Total			78.0		
Grand Total	l		296.0		

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 158 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Working Meals	\$31.22
Total	\$31.22

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 159 of 204

EXHIBIT E LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL FOR THE PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 31, 2024

Date Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
10/16/24 Maxwell Dawson	Working Meals	Dinner for self while working late in the office on LaVie case.	\$31.22
Working Meals Total			\$31.22
Grand Total			\$31.22

EXHIBIT F

Sixth Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)) Objection Deadline: December 29, 2024
)

SUMMARY OF SIXTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.

Authorized to provide professional

services to: Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

Petition Date: June 2, 2024

Date of Retention: July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024

Period for which compensation

and reimbursement are sought: November 1, 2024 through November 30, 2024

Amount of compensation sought as

actual, reasonable, and necessary: \$158,189.55²

Amount of expense reimbursement

sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary: \$1,649.92

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

² Total fees include time from previous fee periods that were not yet recorded in FTI's billing system as of the date of the corresponding fee applications.

Case 24-55507-pmb	DOC 1138	Filed 07/17	6/25	Entered U	//T0/25 T	5:43:47	Desc Main
•	Doo	ument F	Page 1	.62 of 204			

This is a(n): ____ monthly ___ interim ___ final application.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 163 of 204

EXHIBIT A

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	7.6	\$10,564.00
Steven Hazel	Senior Managing Director	1,315	1.2	1,578.00
William Flaharty	Managing Director	1,075	9.4	10,105.00
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	23.5	24,322.50
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	51.4	53,199.00
Andrew Whitman	Senior Director	980	2.5	2,450.00
Jill Weston	Director	865	0.5	432.50
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	79.7	58,181.00
Abigail Buhrman	Senior Consultant	730	11.9	8,687.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	36.2	17,919.00
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	2.4	780.00
SUBTOTAL			226.3	\$188,218.00
Less: 50% discount for non-			(4,140.00)	
Less: Voluntary Reduction				(25,888.45)
GRAND TOTAL			226.3	\$158,189.55

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 164 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	5.6	\$4,773.50
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	14.1	10,649.00
8	Valuation and Related Matters	1.7	2,010.50
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	5.4	5,131.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	9.8	9,711.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	7.0	5,831.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	37.9	27,803.50
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	45.3	41,170.50
19	Case Management	0.4	414.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	7.2	7,005.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	15.2	7,968.50
25	Travel Time	8.0	8,280.00
26	Insurance	56.8	48,783.00
28	Investigation	11.9	8,687.00
	SUBTOTAL	226.3	\$188,218.00
	Less: 50% discount for non-working travel time		(4,140.00)
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(25,888.45)
	GRAND TOTAL	226.3	\$158,189.55

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 165 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	11/1/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.7	Review September 2024 monthly operating reports.
1	11/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review patient care ombudsman report.
1	11/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of docket filings and dataroom uploads to distribute to FTI team.
1	11/6/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Prepare daily update of docket filings and dataroom uploads to distribute to FTI team.
1	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Q3 YTD KeepCo financials.
1	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review monthly financials for KeepCo facilities.
1	11/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Review analysis re: Q3 performance of facilities.
1	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Provide comments on slides re: recent financial performance of facilities.
1	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Prepare summary comparison of financial performance for active facilities.
1	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review updated YTD financial analysis.
1	11/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: follow-ups for Ankura on financial reporting.
1	11/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Update financial summary for newly provided rent calculations.
1	11/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review correspondence with Ankura re: YTD financial performance.
1	11/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review YTD financial performance.
1 Total			5.6	
2	11/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Update weekly cash flow budget reporting.
2	11/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Continue to update DIP budget reporting and accompanying slides.
2	11/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare October fee estimate summary in relation to liquidity.
2	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget-to-actuals for period ending 10/25.
2	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Attend call with Ankura re: budget-to-actuals for period ending 10/25.
2	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review internal budget-to-actuals report for October.
2	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget-to-actuals and case updates.
2	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review October fee estimate re: liquidity.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 166 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	11/4/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend call with Ankura to discuss budget-to-actual cash flow reporting.
2	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review cash flow presentation for 11/7 UCC meeting.
2	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Analyze DIP budget for variances.
2	11/6/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Analyze revised DIP budget.
2	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Review filed DIP budget.
2	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget-to-actuals report for the period ending $11/1$.
2	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget-to-actuals for period ending 11/1.
2	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Participate in call with Ankura re: budget-to-actual and case updates.
2	11/11/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.2	Attend call with Ankura to discuss budget-to-actuals for period ending 11/1.
2	11/12/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Update DIP Budget analysis and accompanying presentation slides.
2	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review UCC report re: liquidity and Q3 results.
2	11/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review analysis re: liquidity reporting.
2	11/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update weekly cash flow reporting and accompanying presentation.
2	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review November fee estimate re: liquidity.
2	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review budget-to-actuals report for the period ending 11/8.
2	11/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare questions list for Ankura re: cash flow reporting.
2	11/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare fee estimate for November re: liquidity.
2	11/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review budget-to-actual cash flow performance.
2	11/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Finalize materials for UCC re: financial reporting and cash flow.
2	11/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Analyze variances in liquidity from latest reporting.
2	11/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare budget-to-actuals summary and accompanying slide deck.
2	11/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare questions related to professional fees in DIP budget.
2	11/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review professional fee budget.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 167 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	11/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review fee estimates in relation to liquidity.
2	11/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Prepare FTI forecast through February re: liquidity.
2 Total			14.1	
8	11/7/2024	Steven Hazel	1.2	Analyze valuation issues in relation to requests from Counsel.
8	11/7/2024	Jill Weston	0.5	Correspond with Counsel regarding valuation issues.
8 Total			1.7	
10	11/13/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review IRS materials regarding ERC claim.
10	11/13/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review correspondence related to ERC issues.
10	11/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review letter from IRS regarding ERC claim.
10	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review IRS letter re: ERC claim.
10	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review ERC claims analysis.
10	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Analyze the potential impact of ERC claims on GUC recovery.
10	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence with Troutman re: ERC claims classification.
10	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Prepare analysis re: ERC issues.
10	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.8	Prepare analysis re: recovery impact of ERC issues.
10 Total			5.4	
11	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	3.2	Attend confirmation hearing.
11	11/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	3.2	Attend court hearing on confirmation.
11	11/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.8	Prepare for court hearing on confirmation.
11	11/22/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Attend court hearing on confirmation.
11	11/22/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Attend third-party releases hearing.
11 Total			9.8	
13	11/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Prepare analysis related to automatic stay relief motions.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 168 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
13	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: lift stay motion update.
13	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: lift stay motion and insurance coverage analysis.
13	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: lift stay motion.
13	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss lift stay motion and insurance coverage.
13	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Summarize considerations related to automatic stay relief motion.
13	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Correspond with Troutman and FTI team re: motion for relief from automatic stay.
13	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review Almonte lift stay motion.
13	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review Iezzoni stipulation re: stay relief.
13	11/13/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review a certain stipulation re: stay relief.
13 Total			7.0	
14	11/3/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review analysis of workers' comp claims.
14	11/3/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with Troutman re: workers' comp issues.
14	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review claims analysis in preparation for call with Troutman.
14	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: workers' comp issues.
14	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Correspond with Troutman re: insured claims.
14	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review response from Ankura re: claims and settlement data.
14	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review correspondence re: claims requests.
14	11/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review claims diligence responses provided by Ankura.
14	11/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review additional claims diligence responses provided by Ankura.
14	11/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.4	Continue to prepare analysis re: insured claims.
14	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with Troutman re: unliquidated claims procedures.
14	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.9	Integrate responses from Ankura into working claim and insurance file.
14	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with Troutman re: unliquidated claims and related procedures.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 169 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: responses on claims from Ankura.
14	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review information requests from creditors re: claims.
14	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Continue to review information requests from creditors re: claims.
14	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: claims follow-ups.
14	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review claims coverage analysis.
14	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review correspondence with Troutman re: Iezzoni claim.
14	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review updated claims analysis walk-down.
14	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Continue to analyze insured claims.
14	11/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: insured claims analysis.
14	11/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claims and other case issues.
14	11/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review claims analysis regarding a Virginia claim.
14	11/18/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with claims agent re: updated claims register.
14	11/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Prepare analysis re: certain insured claims.
14	11/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Prepare additional analysis re: insured claims.
14	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review updated claims analysis for Virginia claims.
14	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Attend call with FTI team re: insurance claims and analysis.
14	11/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Prepare analysis re: certain litigation claims.
14	11/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Finalize summary of certain insured claims.
14	11/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Participate in call with FTI team re: insured claim summaries.
14	11/20/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Analyze most recent provided claims register to assess additional claims.
14	11/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team re: claims analysis.
14	11/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team re: claims register.
14	11/22/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare outline of materials re: claims register analysis.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 170 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
14	11/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Analyze new claims register provided by the Debtors.
14	11/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Finalize summary of claims based on new claims register.
14	11/25/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Synthesize claims data based on new register provided by the Debtors.
14	11/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review claims register analysis.
14	11/26/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: claims register analysis.
14	11/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team re: claims register analysis.
14	11/26/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.1	Revise claims analysis in response to comments from team.
14	11/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.5	Continue to analyze claims register and prepare stratifications of claims.
14 Total			37.9	
16	11/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Compile key documents for confirmation.
16	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review UST's objection to the Plan.
16	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review IRS' objection to the Plan.
16	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman re: next steps in preparation for confirmation.
16	11/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review objections to Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Continue to compile key documents in advance of confirmation.
16	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review responses from Ankura on confirmation diligence requests.
16	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review objections to confirmation.
16	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman re: confirmation preparation.
16	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review media coverage on Plan objections.
16	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	2.9	Attend deposition of James Decker in relation to confirmation.
16	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.6	Provide comments on initial draft of Ganti Declaration for confirmation.
16	11/6/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review first amended Plan supplement.
16	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Review draft declaration in support of Plan.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 171 of 204

EXHIBIT C

				,
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	11/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review Ganti declaration for confirmation hearing.
16	11/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review amended Plan in preparation for confirmation.
16	11/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss confirmation hearing and Plan declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review amended Plan supplement.
16	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Provide additional comments to Ganti Declaration in preparation for confirmation.
16	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review questions related to Ganti Declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman and FTI team re: Plan declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review files related to Plan confirmation and declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review correspondence from Counsel and Committee re: Plan objections.
16	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review issues related to Plan disclosures and mediation.
16	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with Troutman re: Plan declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Provide comments on Plan declaration.
16	11/7/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Review files related to Plan confirmation and declaration.
16	11/8/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review results of vote for Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review Chubb objection to Plan.
16	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Provide comments on Chubb objection summary for Troutman.
16	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Determine next steps regarding Ganti declaration for confirmation.
16	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review Plan balloting report.
16	11/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review Plan balloting report.
16	11/9/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Troutman comments to Ganti Declaration for confirmation.
16	11/11/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Attend call with FTI team to discuss confirmation hearing.
16	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: confirmation hearing.
16	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Finalize draft of Ganti Declaration for confirmation.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 172 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Compile documents re: declaration in support of Plan.
16	11/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Review Jones, Krakovsky, and Decker declarations in preparation for confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Troutman to discuss confirmation hearing.
16	11/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with FTI team to discuss confirmation witness preparation.
16	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review Jones Declaration in support of Plan confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review Decker Declaration in support of Plan confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Correspond with Troutman and FTI team re: confirmation issues.
16	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with Troutman re: confirmation hearing preparation.
16	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: confirmation witness preparation.
16	11/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review Jones declaration re: confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.4	Review memorandum at law for confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Review various declarations re: confirmation.
16	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in witness preparation call for confirmation hearing with Troutman.
16	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in witness preparation call for confirmation hearing with FTI team.
16	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Summarize declarations filed in support of Plan.
16	11/13/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Review amended Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	11/13/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review documents related to Plan confirmation.
16	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review modified amended Plan language re: sale structure, insurance, and claims for any impact to GUCs.
16	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review Debtors' confirmation brief.
16	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review amended Plan.
16	11/13/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	11/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Evaluate revisions to Plan prior to confirmation hearing.
16	11/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: confirmation issues.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 173 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.6	Prepare summary documents for Plan confirmation.
16	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Finalize summary points for Plan confirmation.
16	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.8	Assist in summarizing documents for confirmation hearing.
16	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.3	Analyze declarations related to confirmation hearing.
16	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Prepare summary of unsecured recoveries ahead of call with Committee.
16	11/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	1.0	Attend meeting with Troutman, HSG, and HSG Counsel to discuss confirmation issues.
16	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Evaluate key open items in advance of confirmation hearing.
16	11/22/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Analyze results from confirmation hearing ruling.
16 Total			45.3	
19	11/27/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review FTI fee accrual to date.
19 Total			0.4	
21	11/7/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.9	Participate in call with UCC to discuss Plan confirmation.
21	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Participate in call with UCC re: Plan confirmation issues and developments.
21	11/7/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.9	Participate in Committee call re: Plan updates and confirmation hearing.
21	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Participate in Committee call re: Plan updates and case status.
21	11/14/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Attend call with Committee to discuss confirmation hearing.
21	11/14/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend Committee meeting to discuss confirmation.
21	11/14/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in UCC call re: confirmation.
21	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Attend call with Committee to discuss upcoming confirmation hearing.
21	11/21/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Attend call with Committee to discuss confirmation.
21	11/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend Committee call re: confirmation update.
21	11/21/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend Committee call re: confirmation update.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 174 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBE	ER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024
------------------------	---------------------------------

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
21	11/21/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in UCC call re: confirmation and other case updates.
21 Total			7.2	
24	11/11/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	2.4	Prepare the September fee application.
24	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Analyze issues related to October fee application.
24	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare October fee application.
24	11/14/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Continue to prepare October fee application.
24	11/15/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Continue to prepare October fee application exhibits.
24	11/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare October fee application exhibits.
24	11/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.4	Continue to prepare October fee application exhibits.
24	11/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with Ankura, Troutman, and FTI team re: fee applications.
24	11/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Begin review of October fee application.
24	11/20/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Revise October fee application in response to comments.
24	11/21/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Provide comments on October fee application.
24	11/25/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Finalize comments on October fee statement.
24	11/27/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.0	Process comments to October fee application.
24 Total			15.2	
25	11/13/2024	Narendra Ganti	4.0	Travel time from DC to Atlanta for confirmation hearing.
25	11/15/2024	Narendra Ganti	4.0	Travel time from Atlanta to DC.
25 Total			8.0	
26	10/28/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Update insured claims summary for additional stratifications.
26	11/1/2024	William Flaharty	1.0	Review insurance losses and policy considerations regarding erosion of limits.
26	11/1/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.7	Prepare analysis re: insured claims and insurance tower issues.
26	11/1/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.2	Correspond with FTI team re: personal injury claims and related insurance policies.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 175 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	11/1/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Process comments to insurance tracker.
26	11/4/2024	William Flaharty	0.5	Review insurance expense cost issues related to Iezzoni claim.
26	11/4/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with FTI team re: insurance coverage analysis.
26	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.9	Prepare analysis re: insurance coverage and claim availability.
26	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance coverage analysis.
26	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Prepare for call with FTI team re: insurance.
26	11/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review insurance issues and policies related to personal injury claims.
26	11/4/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.6	Review correspondence regarding personal injury claims and the associated insurance policies.
26	11/5/2024	William Flaharty	0.5	Review claim reserve issues re: insurance coverage.
26	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review questions related to insurance from FTI team.
26	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review insurance issues related to Synergy.
26	11/5/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Review insurance follow-up questions.
26	11/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Provide comments on insurance diligence list.
26	11/5/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Correspond with FTI, Troutman, and Ankura re: insurance diligence.
26	11/5/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.4	Review correspondence regarding personal injury claims and the associated insurance policies.
26	11/6/2024	William Flaharty	1.2	Review risk retention policies and limits.
26	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Attend call with FTI team re: next steps on insurance coverage analysis.
26	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review insurance coverage matching against certain claims related to operating facilities.
26	11/6/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Review insurance coverage analysis.
26	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Participate in call with FTI team re: insurance coverage.
26	11/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.8	Analyze insurance policy coverage.
26	11/6/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.1	Respond to email correspondence regarding personal injury claims and the associated insurance policies.
26	11/7/2024	William Flaharty	1.4	Review risk retention issues and other insurance complications.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 176 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	11/7/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review FTI insurance expert responses to LaVie insurance policy limits.
26	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Analyze policy details for a certain insured claim.
26	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Prepare analysis re: insurance coverage and claim availability.
26	11/7/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Prepare analysis re: insurance coverage and claim availability.
26	11/7/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.1	Respond to email correspondence regarding personal injury claims and the associated insurance policies.
26	11/8/2024	William Flaharty	0.5	Review issues regarding exhaustion of limits against various related parties under the insurance policies.
26	11/8/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Prepare questions related to insurance coverage analysis.
26	11/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Prepare supplemental analysis re: insurance coverage on certain claims.
26	11/8/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Continue to analyze policy details for a certain insured claim.
26	11/8/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.3	Continue to review insurance policies for personal injury claims.
26	11/11/2024	William Flaharty	1.3	Review insurance policy structures for retained loss corridor exhaustion and treatment of defense expenses.
26	11/11/2024	William Flaharty	0.7	Participate in call with Synergy re: insurance policy coverage.
26	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Analyze insurance issues related to Synergy.
26	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Provide comments on questions for insurance call.
26	11/11/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.7	Review insurance policies for various claims.
26	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.3	Prepare analysis re: insurance coverage and claim applicability.
26	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Correspond with FTI team and Troutman re: D&O insurance.
26	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Participate in call with Synergy re: insurance policies and coverage.
26	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Summarize follow-up items and takeaways from Synergy call on insurance.
26	11/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Prepare for call with Synergy re: insurance policies and coverage.
26	11/11/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.6	Review personal injury claims and application of insurance policies regarding the same.
26	11/12/2024	William Flaharty	0.7	Analyze limits erosion issues and claim expenses re: insurance.
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Prepare questions related to insurance coverage and Iezzoni claim.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 177 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence re: insurance policy terminology and claim information.
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Attend call with Troutman, MWE, and Ankura re: insurance issues related to confirmation.
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review GLPL insurance policies in response to insurance questions from advisors' meeting.
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Summarize insurance questions and issues for FTI team.
26	11/12/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Correspond with FTI team re: insurance diligence questions.
26	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Compile list of key insurance policies.
26	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Participate in call with MWE, Troutman, and Ankura re: insurance issues.
26	11/12/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.0	Review insurance policy details.
26	11/12/2024	Andrew Whitman	0.2	Review insurance policies for personal injury claims.
26	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review responses to insurance diligence questions.
26	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Prepare summary of insurance updates for FTI team.
26	11/13/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Review correspondence with Troutman re: D&O and GLPL insurance diligence responses.
26	11/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.4	Prepare summaries regarding certain insurance policy information.
26	11/15/2024	William Flaharty	1.6	Review language related to exhaustion of limits requirements.
26	11/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence with Synergy re: insurance policies.
26	11/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	1.1	Review GLPL policy language in connection with response from Synergy.
26	11/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.2	Continue to review GLPL policy language.
26	11/15/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Draft email to Troutman re: insurance policy analysis.
26	11/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Analyze insurance policy coverage applicability.
26	11/15/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Analyze issues related to insurance coverage and policies.
26	11/19/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on updated insurance analysis.
26	11/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.3	Update loss run information with supplemental data.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 178 of 204

EXHIBIT C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
26	11/24/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.5	Complete analysis of insurance coverage by policy and facility.
26 Total			56.8	
28	8/12/2024	Abigail Buhrman	1.3	Research potential connections between investors and certain entities.
28	8/13/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.9	Prepare draft of research findings related to certain entities.
28	8/13/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.1	Continue to prepare draft of research findings related to certain entities.
28	8/14/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.8	Finalize draft of research findings related to corporate connections.
28	8/16/2024	Abigail Buhrman	2.1	Prepare summary chart of identified connections between Debtors and certain affiliates.
28	8/16/2024	Abigail Buhrman	0.7	Prepare summary points of research findings re: corporate connections to discuss with FTI team.
28 Total			11.9	
Grand Tota	l		226.3	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 179 of 204

EXHIBIT D LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Expense Type	Amount
Airfare	\$703.97
Lodging	\$510.33
Other	\$13.00
Transportation	\$232.85
Working Meals	\$189.77
Total	\$1,649.92

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 180 of 204

EXHIBIT E

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL

FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
11/12/24	Narendra Ganti	Airfare	Flight to and from Atlanta for confirmation hearing.	\$697.97
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Airfare	Travel Agent Fees to coordinate trip for confirmation hearing.	\$6.00
Airfare T	otal			\$703.97
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Lodging	Hotel in Atlanta while traveling for confirmation hearing.	\$510.33
Lodging 7	Γotal			\$510.33
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Other	Internet fee while traveling to Atlanta for confirmation hearing.	\$13.00
Other To	tal			\$13.00
11/13/24	Narendra Ganti	Transportation	Taxi to airport to travel to Atlanta to attend confirmation hearing.	\$40.20
11/13/24	Narendra Ganti	Transportation	Taxi from Atlanta airport to hotel for confirmation hearing.	\$50.40
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Transportation	Parking fee while traveling to Atlanta for confirmation hearing.	\$87.00
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Transportation	Taxi from hotel to Atlanta airport to go home from confirmation hearing.	\$55.25
Transpor	tation Total			\$232.85
11/13/24	Narendra Ganti	Working Meals	Dinner for self while traveling to Atlanta for confirmation hearing.	\$35.24
11/14/24	Narendra Ganti	Working Meals	Breakfast for F. Lawall, D. Kovsky-Apap (Troutman), P. Nenstiel, R. Lapowksy (UCC) and self prior to confirmation hearing.	\$135.35

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 181 of 204

EXHIBIT E

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 EXPENSE DETAIL

FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2024 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2024

Date	Professional	Expense Type	Expense Detail	Amount
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Working Meals	Breakfast for self while traveling to Atlanta for confirmation hearing.	\$9.39
11/15/24	Narendra Ganti	Working Meals	Lunch while traveling home from Atlanta from confirmation hearing.	\$9.79
Working	Meals Total			\$189.77
Grand To	otal			\$1,649.92

EXHIBIT G

Seventh Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:)	Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1)	Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.))))	(Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: February 18, 2025
)	

SUMMARY OF SEVENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM DECEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JANUARY 31, 2025

Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	December 1, 2024 through January 31, 2025
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$34,593.10 ²
Amount of expense reimbursement	

\$0.00

sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

² Total fees include time from previous fee periods that were not yet recorded in FTI's billing system as of the date of the corresponding fee applications.

Case 24-55507-pmb	DOC 1138	Filed 07/1	16/25	Entered U	//16/25 15:	43:47	Desc Main
•	Do	cument	Page 1	.84 of 204			

This is a(n):	X monthly	interim	final
application.			

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 185 of 204

EXHIBIT A

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2024 TO JANUARY 31, 2025

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	3.0	\$4,170.00
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	5.3	5,485.50
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	1.5	1,552.50
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	22.7	16,571.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant 49		24.4	12,078.00
Marili Hellmund-Mora	Manager	325	0.8	260.00
SUBTOTAL			57.7	\$40,117.00
Less: Voluntary Reduction	on			(5,523.90)
GRAND TOTAL			57.7	\$34,593.10

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 186 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2024 TO JANUARY 31, 2025

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	1.1	\$992.00
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	14.8	9,635.00
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	1.0	798.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	0.6	438.00
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	4.2	3,066.00

Code	Task Description	Hours	Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	1.1	\$992.00
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	14.8	9,635.00
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	1.0	798.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	0.6	438.00
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	4.2	3,066.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	13.9	10,479.00
19	Case Management	2.2	2,246.00
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	2.4	1,808.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	14.3	8,319.00
26	Insurance	3.2	2,336.00
	SUBTOTAL	57.7	\$40,117.00
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(5,523.90)
	GRAND TOTAL	57.7	\$34,593.10

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 187 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

	FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2024 TO JANUARY 31, 2025					
Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity		
1	12/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review October 2024 monthly operating reports.		
1	12/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update case timeline for important dates and deadlines.		
1 Total			1.1			

Category	Dute	1101033101141	110413	1 territy
1	12/2/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review October 2024 monthly operating reports.
1	12/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update case timeline for important dates and deadlines.
1 Total			1.1	
2	12/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Review updates to fee estimate assumptions and liquidity impacts.
2	12/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Attend call with FTI team re: impact of fee estimates on liquidity.
2	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Assess considerations related to fee estimates and liquidity.
2	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Participate in call with FTI team re: fee estimates and liquidity.
2	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare analysis re: fee estimates and liquidity.
2	12/2/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Update budget and accompanying presentation for weekly cash flow reporting.
2	12/12/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review weekly cash flow reporting re: budget to actuals.
2	12/13/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Analyze revised DIP budget re: liquidity.
2	12/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Analyze updated DIP budget re: liquidity.
2	12/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Provide comments on slides re: liquidity update.
2	12/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.7	Prepare questions list related to proposed DIP budget.
2	12/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Revise cash flow deck for comments from team.
2	12/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Continue to prepare summary of proposed DIP budget and related variances.
2	12/16/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare summary of proposed DIP budget and related variances.
2	12/17/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review liquidity update materials for the Committee.
2	12/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with FTI team re: cash reporting and budget.
2	12/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Provide comments on questions list for Ankura re: DIP budget.
2	12/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Update cash flow deck for comments from team.
2	12/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Correspond with team and Debtors' advisors re: proposed budget.
2	12/19/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review weekly cash flow reporting re: budget to actuals.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 188 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE	PERIOD	DECEMBER	1, 2024 TO	JANUARY 31	l. 2025

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	1/9/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Review DIP reporting package re: cash flow.
2 Total			14.8	
10	12/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Summarize key points from IRS status conference hearing.
10	1/2/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Attend call with Committee to discuss IRS issues.
10	1/28/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.1	Review IRS claim issues.
10	1/31/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Assess IRS claim issues.
10 Total			1.0	
11	12/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.6	Attend court hearing re: IRS status conference.
11 Total			0.6	
14	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Review correspondence from FTI team re: claims register analysis.
14	12/9/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Provide comments on filed claim analysis.
14	12/16/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.4	Evaluate claim data to assess recovery impact.
14 Total			4.2	
16	12/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review amended Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	12/4/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.6	Continue to review amended Plan and Disclosure Statement.
16	12/4/2024	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Review updated confirmation materials to confirm changes.
16	12/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Review confirmation order.
16	12/5/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Review memorandum regarding opt out of releases.
16	12/6/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review latest Plan filings and revised confirmation order.
16	1/27/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review IRS settlement analysis on ERC funds.
16	1/28/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss IRS settlement and ERC issues.
16	1/28/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.6	Review update to Committee on IRS settlement issues.
16	1/28/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Attend call with Troutman to discuss IRS issues.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 189 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2024 TO JANUARY 31, 2025

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	1/28/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review materials re: proposed IRS settlement.
16	1/28/2025	Maxwell Dawson	1.6	Prepare slides re: IRS settlement.
16	1/28/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Prepare settlement analysis re: IRS claims.
16	1/28/2025	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare various scenarios related to IRS claim issue and recoveries.
16	1/28/2025	Olivia Mandella	2.1	Continue to prepare various scenarios related to IRS claim issue and potential recoveries.
16	1/29/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Prepare talking points for UCC meeting on waterfall.
16 Total			13.9	
19	12/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with Troutman and FTI team re: go-forward workstreams and fee estimates for UCC professionals.
19	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with Troutman re: upcoming tasks for UCC professionals.
19	12/2/2024	Adam Saltzman	0.4	Attend call with FTI team re: go-forward workstreams and next steps.
19	12/2/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Participate in call with FTI team re: case updates and workstreams.
19	12/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with Counsel on Plan confirmation and related admin costs.
19	12/24/2024	Clifford Zucker	0.3	Attend call with lender and counsel on admin costs and updated timeline.
19 Total			2.2	
21	1/29/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Attend Committee meeting re: Plan status and IRS settlement issues.
21	1/29/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.8	Participate in call with Committee to discuss IRS and ERC issues.
21	1/29/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Attend Committee call re: IRS settlements and ERC issues.
21 Total			2.4	
24	12/2/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review October 2024 fee application.
24	12/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Correspond with FTI team re: fee applications.
24	12/17/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Prepare November fee application.
24	12/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.6	Revise November fee application for comments from team.
24	12/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Prepare November fee application exhibits.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 190 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD	DECEMBER 1, 2	2024 TO JANUARY	31, 2025

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	12/17/2024	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to prepare November fee application exhibits.
24	12/18/2024	Narendra Ganti	0.7	Review November 2024 fee application.
24	12/18/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Review revised version of November fee application.
24	12/18/2024	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Finalize November fee application and circulate to team for review.
24	12/19/2024	Marili Hellmund- Mora	0.8	Finalize November fee application.
24	12/19/2024	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Coordinate fee application for November.
24	12/19/2024	Olivia Mandella	1.2	Update November fee application exhibits for late entries.
24	1/6/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.1	Review December fee accruals.
24	1/6/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Prepare reporting re: cumulative fees.
24	1/7/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.7	Provide comments on December fee exhibits.
24	1/7/2025	Olivia Mandella	2.4	Prepare December fee exhibits.
24 Total			14.3	
26	10/11/2024	Maxwell Dawson	2.1	Prepare analysis regarding insurance coverage against personal injury claims.
26	1/8/2025	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Review case filings for information regarding insurance proceeds.
26 Total			3.2	
rand Tota	<u> </u>		57.7	

EXHIBIT H

Eighth Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:)	Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1)	Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.))))	(Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: April 17, 2025

SUMMARY OF EIGHTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING MARCH 31, 2025

FTI Consulting, Inc.

1 thin of the production	111 00000000000000000000000000000000000
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	February 1, 2025 through March 31, 2025
Amount of compensation sought as	

 $$5,117.50^2$

Amount of expense reimbursement

actual, reasonable, and necessary:

Name of Applicant:

sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary: \$0.00

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

² Total fees include time from previous fee periods that were not yet recorded in FTI's billing system as of the date of the corresponding fee applications.

Case 24-55507-pmb	Doc 1138	Filed 07	/16/25	Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47	Desc Main
	Doo	cument	Page	193 of 204	

This is $a(n)$:	_X	monthly	interim	final
application.				

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 194 of 204

EXHIBIT A

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2025 TO MARCH 31, 2025

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Clifford Zucker	Senior Managing Director	\$1,390	1.5	\$2,085.00
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	0.8	828.00
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	0.9	931.50
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	1.9	1,387.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	2.4	1,188.00
SUBTOTAL			7.5	\$6,419.50
Less: Voluntary Reduct	tion			(1,302.00)
GRAND TOTAL			7.5	\$5,117.50

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 195 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK

FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2025 TO MARCH 31, 2025

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	1.3	1,325.00
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	0.5	695.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	1.5	742.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	0.3	310.50
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	0.8	1,112.00
17	Wind Down Monitoring	0.3	310.50
19	Case Management	1.1	803.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	1.7	1,121.00
	SUBTOTAL	7.5	\$6,419.50
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(1,302.00)
	GRAND TOTAL	7.5	\$5,117.50

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 196 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES

FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2025 TO MARCH 31, 2025

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
2	1/29/2025	Clifford Zucker	0.2	Review weekly cash flow reporting re: budget to actuals.
2	2/3/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Review DIP budget to assess cash flow availability.
2	3/20/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review cash flow reporting re: budget to actuals for period ending 3/14/25.
2	2/3/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review cash flow and liquidity in preparation for settlement hearing.
2 Total			1.3	
10	2/3/2025	Clifford Zucker	0.5	Analyze objection to Debtors' 9019 Motion with IRS.
10 Total			0.5	
11	2/4/2025	Olivia Mandella	1.5	Attend hearing re: IRS claim issue.
11 Total			1.5	
14	3/17/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team re: claims diligence files.
14 Total			0.3	
16	1/29/2025	Clifford Zucker	0.8	Review update to Committee re: waterfall.
16 Total			0.8	
17	3/20/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI Team re: GUC trust.
17 Total			0.3	
19	3/17/2025	Maxwell Dawson	1.1	Aggregate documents regarding claims and insurance.
19 Total			1.1	
24	2/4/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.3	Review combined fee application for December and January.
24	2/4/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review combined December and January fee application.
24	2/4/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare December and January fee application exhibits.
24 Total			1.7	
rand Tota	l		7.5	

EXHIBIT I

Ninth Fee Statement

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF GEORGIA ATLANTA DIVISION

In re:) Chapter 11
LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, et al., 1) Case No. 24-55507-PMB
Debtors.) (Jointly Administered)))
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICE EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISO UNSECURED CREDI	E STATEMENT OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. S RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF R FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ITORS FOR THE PERIOD GH AND INCLUDING JUNE 1, 2025
Name of Applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Petition Date:	June 2, 2024
Date of Retention:	July 18, 2024, effective as of June 17, 2024
Period for which compensation and reimbursement are sought:	April 1, 2025 through June 1, 2025
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$16,189.25
Amount of expense reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$0.00
This is a(n): application.	X monthly interim final

¹ The last four digits of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's federal tax identification number are 5592. There are 282 Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, which are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only. A complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers are not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://www.kccllc.net/LaVie. The location of LaVie Care Centers, LLC's corporate headquarters and the Debtors' service address is 1040 Crown Pointe Parkway, Suite 600, Atlanta, GA 30338.

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 199 of 204

EXHIBIT A LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL

FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2025 TO JUNE 1, 2025

Professional	Position	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Narendra Ganti	Managing Director	1,035	1.3	1,345.50
Adam Saltzman	Managing Director	1,035	5.7	5,899.50
Maxwell Dawson	Senior Consultant	730	6.3	4,599.00
Olivia Mandella	Consultant	495	13.3	6,583.50
SUBTOTAL			26.6	\$18,427.50
Less: Voluntary Reduc	tion			(2,238.25)
GRAND TOTAL			26.6	\$16,189.25

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 200 of 204

EXHIBIT B

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2025 TO JUNE 1, 2025

Task Code	Task Description	Total Hours	Total Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	3.7	\$3,311.00
2	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	1.7	1,320.50
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	1.8	1,863.00
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	4.2	3,345.00
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	0.3	310.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	14.9	8,277.50
	SUBTOTAL	26.6	\$18,427.50
	Less: Voluntary Reduction		(2,238.25)
	GRAND TOTAL	26.6	\$16,189.25

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 201 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2025 TO JUNE 1, 2025

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	4/7/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.8	Attend call with FTI team re: organizational structure documents.
1	4/7/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Correspond with FTI team on organizational charts in data room.
1	4/7/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.9	Review organizational charts in data room.
1	4/7/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Participate in call with FTI team re: organizational structure documents
1	4/7/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.9	Search dataroom for documents related to organizational structure.
1 Total			3.7	
2	4/15/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.2	Analyze liquidity for final fee estimate.
2	4/15/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Prepare final fee estimate to assess liquidity impact.
2	5/15/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review budget to actual reporting to assess liquidity.
2	5/15/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.3	Prepare final fee estimate to analyze impact to liquidity.
2	5/22/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.4	Review budget to actual cash flow reporting.
2 Total			1.7	
13	4/8/2025	Adam Saltzman	1.2	Review Harts Harbor operations transfer agreement and transfer motion
13	4/8/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.6	Provide comments on Harts Harbor transfer motion for Counsel.
13 Total			1.8	
14	4/30/2025	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Compile materials related to claims pool.
14	5/13/2025	Narendra Ganti	0.5	Review correspondence related to medical malpractice claims and
14	5/13/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Review a certain insurance claim.
14	5/13/2025	Maxwell Dawson	1.2	Analyze a certain insurance claim.
14	5/14/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review correspondence on insurance claim.
14	5/30/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Review claims objection filed by Debtors.
14 Total			4.2	

Case 24-55507-pmb Doc 1138 Filed 07/16/25 Entered 07/16/25 15:43:47 Desc Main Document Page 202 of 204

EXHIBIT C

LAVIE CARE CENTERS, LLC, ET AL. - CASE NO. 24-55507 DETAIL OF TIME ENTRIES FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2025 TO JUNE 1, 2025

Task Category	Date Profess		Hours	Activity				
16	5/22/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review analysis re: insurance diligence documents.				
16 Total			0.3					
24	4/2/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.5	Review February and March combined fee application.				
24	4/2/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Prepare exhibits for February and March fee application.				
24	4/3/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.3	Review February and March monthly fee statement.				
24	4/22/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.4	Research case precedent re: final fee application.				
24	4/22/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.3	Correspond with FTI team and Counsel re: final fee application.				
24	4/23/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.9	Continue to prepare final fee application.				
24	4/23/2025	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Prepare final fee application.				
24	4/24/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.8	Edit document for final fee application.				
24	4/24/2025	Olivia Mandella	2.9	Continue to edit final fee application.				
24	4/28/2025	Maxwell Dawson	0.8	Provide comments on final fee application.				
24	4/29/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Distribute final fee application draft to FTI team for review.				
24	4/30/2025	Adam Saltzman	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team re: review of final fee application.				
24	4/30/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.5	Participate in call with FTI team to discuss final fee application.				
24	5/9/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.6	Prepare draft of final fee application.				
24	5/15/2025	Olivia Mandella	0.4	Review final fee estimate for final fee application.				
24	5/20/2025	Olivia Mandella	1.8	Continue to prepare draft of final fee application.				
24 Total			14.9					
Frand Tota	1		26.6					

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on July 16, 2025, the foregoing First and Final Fee Application of FTI Consulting, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Financial Advisor for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period From June 17, 2024, through and including June 1, 2025 and the Notice of Deadline to Object and Hearing regarding same were filed using the Bankruptcy Court's CM/ECF system which automatically sends a notice of this document and an accompanying link to this document to all parties who have appeared in this case under the Bankruptcy Court's Electronic Case Filing program.

This 16th day of July 2025.

/s/ Pierce E. Rigney

Pierce E. Rigney (GA ID No. 656946)

Professional Fee Notice Parties Service List

Description	CreditorName	CreditorNoticeName	Address1	Address2	City	State	Zip	Email	Method o Service
ounsel to the Debtors' Proposed DIP			1900 N Pearl St, Suite		<u> </u>				Email & 1s
enders (TIX 33433 LLC)	DLA Piper LLP (US)	Attn James Muenker	2200		Dallas	TX	75201	james.muenker@us.dlapiper.com	Class Ma
ounsel to the Debtors' Proposed DIP	` ` ′		1251 Avenue of the					ĺ	Email & 1s
enders (TIX 33433 LLC)	DLA Piper LLP (US)	Attn Kira Mineroff	Americas		New York	NY	10020	kira.mineroff@dlapiper.com	Class Ma
Counsel to the Debtors' Proposed DIP	(Email & 1
	DLA Piper LLP (US)	Joseph A. Roselius	444 W. Lake St., Suite 900		Chicago	- Iu	60606-0089	joseph.roselius@us.dlapiper.com	Class Ma
Counsel to the Debtors' Proposed DIP			1201 West Peachtree			+			Email & 1
	DLA Piper LLP (US)	Emily Marshall	Street NW		Atlanta	GA	30309	emily.marshall@us.dlapiper.com	Class Ma
() , (7 111411141				0.000
Counsel to the Prepetition Omega									
ecured Parties, Omega Landlords,									
	Ferguson Braswell Fraser		2500 Dallas Parkway,						Email & 1
	Kubasta PC	Attn Leighton Aiken	Suite 600		Plano	TX	75093	laiken@fbfk.law	Class Ma
erider, EEC & Of It Mezz Lerider, EEC)	Rubasta F C	Attil Leighton Aiken	Suite 000		Fiano	17	7 3033	laikei (@ibik.iaw	Ciass ivi
ounsel to the Prepetition Omega									
ecured Parties, Omega Landlords,	1	I							
	1	Atta Bohart I I amana Jina	The New York Times					Pl amana@gaadwinlaw.com	Empil 9
nd Proposed DIP Lenders (OHI DIP	Conduin Prosts 11 B	Attn Robert J Lemons, Liza		600 Fighth Assessed	New Yest	NIV	10018	RLemons@goodwinlaw.com;	Email & 1
ender, LLC & OHI Mezz Lender, LLC)	Goodwin Proctor LLP	L. Burton	Building,	620 Eighth Avenue	INEW YORK	NY	10018	lburton@goodwinlaw.com	Class Ma
ounsel for the Debtors and Debtors-in-	M-D	Bi-IM Oi	1180 Peachtree Street NE,				00000		Email & 1
ossession	McDermott Will & Emery, LLP	Daniel M Simon	Suite 3350		Atlanta	GA	30309	dmsimon@mwe.com	Class Ma
counsel for the Debtors and Debtors-in-	l		444 West Lake Street,			l.,			Email &
ossession	McDermott Will & Emery, LLP	Emily C Keil	Suite 4000		Chicago	IL	60606	ekeil@mwe.com	Class Ma
ounsel for the Debtors and Debtors-in-		Jake Jumbeck, Catherine	444 West Lake Street,					jjumbeck@mwe.com;	Email & 1
ossession	McDermott Will & Emery, LLP	Lee	Suite 4000		Chicago	IL	60606	clee@mwe.com	Class Ma
office of the United States Trustee for the Northern District of Georgia	Office of the United States Trustee	Jonathan S. Adams, R. Jeneane Treace	362 Richard B Russell Bldg	75 Ted Turner Drive, SW	Atlanta	GA	30303	USTP.Region21@usdoj.gov; Jonathan.S.Adams@usdoj.gov; jeneane.treace@usdoj.gov	Email & Class M
ounsel to the Debtors' Prepetition ABL	Parker Hudson Rainer &	Matthew M. Weiss, Anna K.	303 Peachtree Street NE					mweiss@phrd.com;	Email &
ender (MidCap Funding IV Trust)	Dobbs LLP	MacFarlane	Suite 3600		Atlanta	GA	30308	amacfarlane@phrd.com	Class Ma
arran (massapranang re reast)		Thurst arrange			7 137477144		-	аттабата барти атабит	0.000
Counsel to the Debtors' Prepetition ABL									Email &
ender (MidCap Funding IV Trust)	Proskauer Rose LLP	Attn Charles A Dale	One International Place		Boston	MA	02110	cdale@proskauer.com	Class M
chaci (Mideap Fahaing IV Trast)	TOSKAGE NOSC EEI	Atti Granes A Bale	One international ridge		DOSIDIT	IVIA	02110	Coale@proskader.com	Old33 IVI
Counsel to the Debtors' Prepetition ABL	1	I							Email &
ender (MidCap Funding IV Trust)	Proskauer Rose LLP	Dylan Marker	Eleven Times Square		New York	NY	10036-8299	dmarker@proskauer.com	Class M
onder (middap i driding iv Trust)	TOURGUET TOUGH ELL	Dylan Marker	Lieven nines oquare		INOW TOIK		10000-0299	dillarkol@pioakadel.com	Ciass IVI
Counsel to the Prepetition Omega		I							
ecured Parties, Omega Landlords,		I							
	Scroggins & Williamson & Ray,	I	4401 Northside Parkway.						Email &
ender, LLC & OHI Mezz Lender, LLC)		Attn Matthew W Levin	Suite 230		Atlanta	GA	30327	mlovin@swlawfirm.com	Class M
ender, LLG & OHI Mezz Lender, LLG)	F.U.	Aun waunew w Levin	Suite 230		Auanta	GA	30321	mlevin@swlawfirm.com	Class M
Council to the Debteral Properties ADI	1	I	222 North LeCalle Street						Empil 9
ounsel to the Debtors' Prepetition ABL	Vaddar Drina DC	Atta Kathara I Staves	222 North LaSalle Street,		Chinaga	- Lu	60604	katawana@waddamsiaa aan	Email &
ender (MidCap Funding IV Trust)	Vedder Price PC	Attn Kathryn L Stevens	Suite 2600	-	Chicago	II.	60601	kstevens@vedderprice.com	Class M
aVie Care Centers, LLC	c/o Ankura Consulting Group,	Aug M Basinesis Issues	405 Lauda atau Acce	4045 51	Name Varia	ND2	40047	 :	Email &
	ILLC	Attn M. Benjamin Jones	485 Lexington Ave.	10th Floor	New York	NY	10017	ben.jones@ankura.com	Class M