

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:  RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	§ § § § § § §	Chapter 11  Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)  (Jointly Administered)
--	---------------------------------	---

**COMPLEX CASE FEE APPLICATION COVERSHEET (HOURLY)**

<b>Name of Applicant:</b>	Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP	
<b>Applicant's Role in Case:</b>	Bankruptcy Counsel	
<b>Docket No. of Employment Order(s):</b>	260	
<b>Interim Application ( ) Final Application (x)</b>	Indicate whether this is an interim or final Application. If interim, indicate the number (1 <sup>st</sup> , 2 <sup>nd</sup> , 3 <sup>rd</sup> , etc.)	
	<b>Beginning Date</b>	<b>End Date</b>
<b>Time period covered by this Application for which interim compensation has not previously been awarded:</b>	September 1, 2025	January 14, 2026
<b>Were the services provided necessary to the administration of or beneficial at the time rendered toward the completion of the case? (Y)</b>		
<b>Were the services performed in a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance and nature of the issues addressed? (Y)</b>		
<b>Is the requested compensation reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in other non-bankruptcy cases? (Y)</b>		
<b>Do expense reimbursements represent actual and necessary expenses incurred? (Y)</b>		
<b>Compensation Breakdown for Time Period Covered by this Application</b>		

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.



<b>Total professional fees requested in this Application:</b>	\$1,830,427.50 <sup>2</sup>
<b>Total professional hours covered by this Application:</b>	1,126.9
<b>Average hourly rate for professionals:</b>	\$1,624.30
<b>Total paraprofessional fees requested in this Application:</b>	\$135,271.00
<b>Total paraprofessional hours covered by this Application:</b>	207.7
<b>Average hourly rate for paraprofessionals:</b>	\$651.28
<b>Total fees requested in this Application:</b>	\$1,965,698.50
<b>Total expense reimbursements requested in this Application:</b>	\$45,341.42
<b>Total fees and expenses requested in this Application:</b>	\$2,011,039.92
<b>Total fees and expenses awarded in all prior Applications:</b>	\$12,445,280.35
<b>Plan Status:</b> The Order Approving the Disclosure Statement for, and Confirming, Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation for Rhodium Encore LLC and its Affiliated Debtors Pursuant to Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code was entered on December 19, 2025 (Docket No. 2170) and the Plan became effective on January 14, 2026 (the "Effective Date") (Docket No. 2247).	
<b>Primary Benefits:</b> Successful confirmation of Plan of Liquidation, successful claim objection against Midas Green eliminating \$40 million in claims, supervision of ongoing winding down activities, continued negotiations over the Plan.	

---

<sup>2</sup> Travel billed at 50%.

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:  RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	§ § § § § § §	Chapter 11  Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)  (Jointly Administered)
--	---------------------------------	---

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S FIFTH AND FINAL  
APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND  
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH JANUARY 14, 2026**

**If you object to the relief requested, you must respond in writing. Unless otherwise directed by the Court, you must file your response electronically at <https://ecf.txsb.uscourts.gov/> within twenty-one from the date this motion was filed. If you do not have electronic filing privileges, you must file a written objection that is actually received by the clerk within twenty-one days from the date this motion was filed. Otherwise, the Court may treat the pleading as unopposed and grant the relief requested.**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) files its Fifth and Final Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period September 1, 2025, through January 14, 2026 (the “Application”), for allowance of compensation for professionals services provided in the amount of \$1,965,698.50 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$45,341.42 that Quinn Emanuel incurred from September 1, 2025, through January 14, 2026 (the “Application Period”), as counsel to Rhodium Encore, LLC

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

and its debtor-affiliates (collectively, “Rhodium” or the “Debtors”) in the above-captioned cases and respectfully represents as follows:

**JURISDICTION**

1. Quinn Emanuel submits this Application pursuant to §§ 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedures (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), rule 2016-1 of the Bankruptcy Local Rules (the “Local Rules”), and consistent with the Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases Effective as of November 1, 2013 (the “US Trustee Guidelines”).

2. The Court has jurisdiction over these cases pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334. This is a core proceeding under 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). This Court is the proper venue pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

**RELIEF REQUESTED**

3. Quinn Emanuel requests that the Court enter an order allowing Quinn Emanuel’s final compensation for professional services rendered during the Application Period in the amount of \$1,965,698.50 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred by Quinn Emanuel in the amount of \$45,341.42.

**BACKGROUND**

4. On August 24, 2024, Rhodium Encore LLC, Jordan HPC LLC, Rhodium JV LLC, Rhodium 2.0 LLC, Rhodium 10MW LLC, and Rhodium 30MW LLC each filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. On August 29, 2024, additional affiliates of the Initial Debtors filed, in this Court, voluntary petitions for chapter 11 relief: Rhodium Technologies LLC, Rhodium Enterprises Inc., Rhodium Renewables LLC, Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC, Rhodium Industries LLC, Rhodium

Shared Services LLC, Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC, Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC, Rhodium Encore Sub LLC, Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC, Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC, Air HPC LLC, and Jordan HPC Sub LLC.

6. The Debtors' cases are jointly administered as *In re Rhodium Encore, LLC, et al.*, Case No. 24-90448 (ARP).

7. On November 22, 2024, the United States Trustee (the "Trustee") filed a Notice of Appointment of Committee of Unsecured Creditors. *See* Docket No. 488. No trustee, examiner, or other official committee has been appointed in these chapter 11 cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases").

8. A detailed description of the facts and circumstances regarding the Debtors' business and capital structure and the circumstances leading to the commencement of these Chapter 11 Cases is set forth in the Declaration of David M. Dunn in Support of Chapter 11 Petitions and First Day Relief (the "First Day Declaration") (Docket No. 35).

9. On September 22, 2024, the Debtors filed the Application of Debtors for Authority to Retain and Employ Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP as Attorneys Effective as of the Petition Date (the "Retention Application") (Docket No. 168). On October 14, 2024, the Court entered the order granting the Retention Application (the "Retention Order") (Docket No. 260).

10. On September 22, 2024, the Debtors filed the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the "Interim Compensation Motion") (Docket No. 174) and on October 14, 2024, the Court entered the order granting the Interim Compensation Motion (the "Interim Compensation Order") (Docket No. 264).

11. On May 22, 2025, the Debtors filed their Joint Chapter 11 Plan (Docket No. 1174) and on May 23, 2025, the Debtors filed their Disclosure Statement (Docket No. 1179). On June

10, 2025, the Debtors filed a Notice of Filing Plan Support Agreement (Docket No. 1257). On June 18, 2025, the Debtors filed their Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1297) and their Amended Disclosure Statement (Docket No. 1298). On October 7, 2025, the Debtors filed a Notice of Filing Plan Support Agreement (Docket No. 1747), the Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1750), and the Disclosure Statement for Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1751). On October 16, 2025, the Debtors filed a Notice of Filing of Liquidation Analysis Related to the Disclosure Statement for the Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1813). On October 19, 2025, the Debtors filed their First Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1821) and the Disclosure Statement for First Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation (Docket No. 1822). A hearing on the Amended Disclosure Statement was held on October 20, 2025, and the Order (A) Conditionally Approving the Adequacy of the Disclosure Statement; (B) Approving the Solicitation Procedures and Solicitation Packages; (C) Scheduling a Combined Hearing; (D) Establishing Procedures for Objecting to the Plan and Final Approval of the Disclosure Statement; (E) Approving the Form, Manner, and Sufficiency of Notice of the Combined Hearing; and (F) Granting Related Relief (Docket No. 1834) was entered by the Court on October 21, 2025 (Docket No. 1834). On November 19, 2025, the Notice of Filing Plan Supplement for First Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation was filed (Docket No. 2001). The confirmation hearing began on December 3, 2025, and on December 19, 2025, the Court entered the Order Approving the Disclosure Statement for, and Confirming, Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation for Rhodium Encore LLC and its Affiliated Debtors Pursuant to Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code (the “Confirmation Order”) (Docket No. 2170). On January 14, 2026, the Debtors filed their

Notice of (I) Effective Date of Debtors' Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Reorganization and (II) Bar Dates for Certain Claims (Docket No. 2247).

**TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF EMPLOYMENT AND COMPENSATION**

12. The terms and conditions of Quinn Emanuel's employment by the Debtors and compensation to be paid to Quinn Emanuel are outlined in the Retention Application. *See* Docket No. 168. As set forth in the Retention Application, Quinn Emanuel's customary fees and expenses incurred in connection with this representation are to be paid by the Debtors' estates.

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED TO THE DEBTORS**

13. The following is a summary by task code of the professional services Quinn Emanuel performed:

a. Matter No. i – Asset Analysis: Hours: 6.4; Fees: \$10,927.00. This matter includes reviewing and working with the Client to resolve the Debtors' claim against 3-Way Logistics.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	3.0	\$5,835.00
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	3.0	\$4,830.00
Barbara J Howell	\$655.00	.4	\$262.00
Total		6.4	\$10,927.00

b. Matter No. ii – Asset Disposition: Hours: 29.5; Fees: \$46,042.50. This matter includes preparing for and discussions regarding the Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement; preparing and discussions regarding the notice of the sale of de minimis assets; and discussions regarding Rhodium's tax allocation.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	20.4	\$39,678.00
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	.4	\$666.00
Barbara J. Howell	\$655.00	8.7	\$5,698.50
Total		29.5	\$46,042.50

c. Matter No. v – Business Operations: Hours: 2.1; Fees: \$3,706.50. This category includes reviewing documents related to intercompany transactions and participating in a discussion with the IRS regarding the form of tax return.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	1.5	\$2,917.50
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	.6	\$789.00
Total		2.1	\$3,706.50

d. Matter No. vi – Case Administration: Hours: 126.6; Fees: \$172,848.50. This category includes task coordination meetings, meetings with the financial advisors, and meetings with the Client to discuss the status of the cases and ongoing tasks; preparing agendas for scheduled hearings; preparing witness and exhibit lists and pleading notebooks for various hearings; filing monthly operating reports; assisting with hearing participation and preparation; and updating the files for attorneys' review.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$2,230.00	.2	\$446.00
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	25.9	\$50,375.50
Razmig Izakelian	\$1,665.00	12.2	\$20,313.00
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	3.7	\$6,160.50
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	16.5	\$26,565.00
Ben Roth	\$1,610.00	16.0	\$25,760.00
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	7.0	\$9,205.00
Nqulelwa Maseti	\$1,165.00	8.1	\$9,436.50
Emily Moore	\$710.00	3.8	\$2,698.00
Barbara J Howell	\$655.00	31.00	\$20,305.00
Barbara J Howell	\$720.00	2.2	\$1,584.00
Total		126.6	\$172,848.50

e. Matter No. vii – Claims Administration and Objections: Hours: 374.8; Fees: \$536,870.50. This category includes drafting the Rule 11 motion; drafting claim objections; prosecuting the Midas Green claim objection at a contested hearing; and appellate matters relating to claim objections.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	67.5	\$131,287.50
Patty Tomasco	\$2,230.00	.2	\$446.00
Razmig Izakelian	\$1,665.00	4.0	\$6,660.00
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	17.3	\$28,804.50
Grace Pusavat	\$1,665.00	1.5	\$2,497.50
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	89.9	\$144,739.00
Ben Roth	\$1,610.00	10.9	\$17,549.00
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	105.0	\$138,075.00
Nqulelwa Maseti	\$1,165.00	27.5	\$32,037.50
Emily Moore	\$710.00	24.9	\$17,679.00
Barbara J Howell	\$655.00	26.1	\$17,095.50
Total		374.8	\$536,870.50

f. Matter No. viii – Corporate Governance and Board Matters: Hours: 13.4; Fees: \$25,904.00. This category includes attending and participating in Rhodium’s board meetings and addressing corporate governance matters.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	9.2	\$17,894.00
Patty Tomasco	\$2,230.00	1.8	\$4,014.00
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	2.4	\$3,996.00
Total		13.4	\$25,904.00

g. Matter No. ix – Employee Benefits and Pensions: Hours: 33.3; Fees: \$56,923.00. This category includes meetings with the Debtors regarding severance payments and related employee matters, reviewing the employee severance agreements and the executive agreements, and addressing numerous informal inquiries by creditors and equity holders regarding the employee benefit claims.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	5.3	\$10,308.50
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	27.9	\$46,453.50
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	.1	\$161.00
Total		33.3	\$56,923.00

h. Matter No. x – Employment and Fee Applications: Hours: 74.2; Fees: \$65,789.00. This category includes discussions with professionals regarding the amended

retention pleadings of Lehotsky Keller Cohn; drafting monthly fee statements on behalf of Quinn Emanuel; drafting the fourth interim fee application on behalf of Quinn Emanuel; finalizing and filing monthly fee statements on behalf of the Debtors' professionals; and drafting the Keller Williams retention application.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	8.8	\$17,116.00
Razmig Izakelian	\$1,665.00	1.5	\$2,497.50
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	4.3	\$6,923.00
Barbara J Howell	\$655.00	59.6	\$39,252.50
Total		74.2	\$65,789.00

i. Matter No. xii – Litigation: Hours: 35.8; Fees: \$54,279.00. This category includes research into substantial contributions; the continued litigation of Lehotsky Keller Cohn's attorneys' fees; and plan confirmation discovery issues.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	21.1	\$29,175.00
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	.6	\$966.00
Ben Roth	\$1,610.00	1.4	\$2,254.00
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	4.1	\$5,391.50
Emily Moore	\$710.00	3.1	\$2,201.0
Barbara J. Howell	\$655.00	2.4	\$1,572.00
Barbara J. Howell	\$720.00	.4	\$288.00
Raul Vasquez	\$210.00	2.7	\$567.00
Total		35.8	\$54,279.00

j. Matter No. xiii – Non-working Travel: Hours: 19.4; Fees: \$15,958.00<sup>2</sup>.

This category includes travel to and from Houston for hearings.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	3.0	\$5,835.00
Razmig Izakelian	\$1,665.00	6.5	\$10,822.50
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	6.4	\$10,656.00
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	3.5	\$4,602.50
Total		19.4	\$31,916.00

<sup>2</sup> Non-working travel billed at 50% of \$31,916.00.

k. Matter No. xiv – Plan and Disclosure Statement: Hours: 614.1; Fees: \$966,725.50. This category includes revising the disclosure statement; revising the plan of liquidation; revising the solicitation documents; attending meetings with the Debtors and various counsel to discuss confirmation; drafting the plan support agreement; participating in plan discovery; attending the disclosure statement hearing, drafting the confirmation brief; and preparing for and attending the confirmation hearing.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	173.8	\$338,041.00
Patty Tomasco	\$2,230.00	5.7	\$12,711.00
Razmig Izakelian	\$1,665.00	87.1	\$145,021.50
Lindsay M. Weber	\$1,665.00	82.4	\$137,196.00
Alain Jaquet	\$1,610.00	115.8	\$186,438.00
Ben Roth	\$1,610.00	20.4	\$32,844.00
Cameron Kelly	\$1,560.00	2.5	\$3,900.00
Rachel Harrington	\$1,315.00	41.1	\$54,046.50
Emily Moore	\$710.00	11.1	\$7,881.00
Barbara J Howell	\$655.00	73.5	\$48,142.50
Barbara J Howell	\$720.00	.7	\$504.00
Total		614.1	\$966,725.50

l. Matter No. xvi – Tax: Hours: 5.0; Fees: \$9,725.00. This category includes discussions regarding the tax allocation project.

PROFESSIONAL	BILLING RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Patty Tomasco	\$1,945.00	5.0	\$9,725.00
Total		5.0	\$9,725.00

### **COMPENSATION REQUESTED**

14. In this Application, Quinn Emanuel seeks approval of \$1,965,698.50 in fees and \$45,341.42 in expenses incurred from September 1, 2025, through January 14, 2026. Attached as Exhibit A is the Certification of Patricia B. Tomasco in Support of Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP’s Fifth and Final Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period September 1, 2025, through January 14, 2026 (the “Tomasco

Declaration”). Pursuant to the US Trustee Guidelines, Exhibit B is a table reflecting customary and comparable compensation disclosures with the Application. Exhibit C is a table summarizing the timekeepers included in this Application. Exhibit D addresses the budget and Exhibit E is a table with a summary of compensation requested by task category. The blended rate for Quinn Emanuel timekeepers in this Application is \$1,472.87.

15. During the Application Period, Quinn Emanuel filed its (a) Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement for the Period September 1, 2025, through September 30, 2025 (the “Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement”) (Docket No. 1890); (b) Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement for the Period October 1, 2025, through October 31, 2025 (the “Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement”) (Docket No. 1993); (c) Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement for the Period November 1, 2025, through November 30, 2025 (the “Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement”) (Docket No. 2165); (d) Sixteenth Monthly Fee Statement for the Period December 1, 2025, through December 31, 2025 (the “Sixteenth Monthly Fee Statement”) (Docket No. 2279) and (e) Seventeenth Monthly Fee Statement for the Period January 1, 2026, through January 14, 2026 (the “Seventeenth Monthly Fee Statement”) (Docket No. 2295) (collectively, the “Monthly Fee Statements”).

16. This Application meets the standards of § 331 and applicable case law for compensation for services rendered on behalf of the Debtors’ estates and for the administration of the Chapter 11 Cases. In *Barron & Newburger, P.C. v. Tex. Skyline, Ltd. (In re Woerner)*, 783 F.3d 266 (5th Cir. 2015), the Fifth Circuit reorganized the contours of the requirements for allowance of compensation under § 330. In *Woerner*, the Fifth Circuit held that a court would allow compensation for services rendered by an attorney that are “reasonably likely to benefit” the estate, and that reasonableness should be assessed “at the time at which the service was rendered.” *Id.* at 273–74. The compensation requested in the Application meets the requirements for

compensation the Fifth Circuit identified in *Woerner*, and therefor satisfies the requirements for compensation under § 331 and should be approved.

17. Quinn Emanuel provided necessary and beneficial services to the Debtors in a myriad ways. *See* the attached Monthly Fee Statements for a detailed description of the services provided during the Application Period. These efforts were consistent with the *Johnson*<sup>3</sup> factors adopted by the Fifth Circuit in *In re First Colonial Corp.*, 544 F.2d 1291, 1299 (5th Cir. 1977), as follows:

**a. The Time and Labor Required**

18. As further illustrated by the Summary Cover Sheet, the amount of time spent by Quinn Emanuel professionals and paraprofessionals on this case for the Application Period was 1,334.6 hours. The amount of time was reasonable and necessary given the fast pace of this bankruptcy case.

**b. The Novelty and Difficulty of the Questions Presented by the Case**

19. This case has presented difficult questions of fact and law relevant to both bankruptcy and applicable nonbankruptcy law including issues of first impression regarding the treatment of holders of SAFE instruments, the competing interests of equity holders with novel investment rights, as well as novel solvent debtor issues due to the success of asset sales and litigation against third parties.

**c. The Skill Requisite to Perform the Legal Services Properly**

20. Quinn Emanuel possesses the skill required to properly perform the legal services involved, in particular bankruptcy law expertise and cryptocurrency case experience, as well as experience before this Court and knowledge of its Local Rules.

---

<sup>3</sup> *See generally Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express, Inc.*, 488 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974).

**d. The Preclusion of Other Employment by the Attorneys due to Acceptance of this Case**

21. These cases presented numerous exigencies that precluded Quinn Emanuel attorneys from employment on other cases due to the size and complexity of these Chapter 11 Cases.

**e. The Customary Fee for Similar Work in the Community**

22. The fees charged by Quinn Emanuel are comparable to fees charged by other professionals in similar cases in this jurisdiction. Quinn Emanuel sets its fees consistent with available market data for similarly sized and situated firms given the years of experience of each attorney. In addition, Quinn Emanuel employs associates and paralegals in these Chapter 11 Cases in lieu of a single attorney, resulting in a blended rate of \$1,472.87 per hour. Quinn Emanuel's blended rate is comparable to hourly rates charged by practitioners in cases of this size. Quinn Emanuel's total fees compare very favorably due to its efficient staffing, avoidance of duplication of work, and the focus on critical tasks.

**f. Whether the Fees are Fixed or Contingent**

23. Quinn Emanuel's attorneys in these Chapter 11 Cases do not charge either fixed or contingent fees.

**g. Time Pressure Imposed by the Client or Circumstances**

24. The circumstances of the bankruptcy case imposed time pressures due to the Debtors' need to continue operating their business as a going concern and the need to confirm a plan and emerge from chapter 11.

**h. The Amount Involved and Results Obtained as a Result of the Attorney Services**

25. During this fee application period, the Quinn Emanuel worked to reach a consensual plan based on ongoing settlement discussions with impacted stakeholders, facilitated

the early payment of creditors to reduce interest costs, prosecuted critical claim objections including the objection to the SAFE proofs of claim to ascertain the parties' relative rights to forge a path to a confirmable plan, prosecuted the claim objection against Midas Green to eliminate a \$40 million plus claim against the estate and supervised the orderly winddown of the Debtors' operations and facilities.

**i. The Experience, Reputation, and Ability of the Attorneys**

26. The Quinn Emanuel attorneys representing the Debtors have decades of experience, including representing chapter 11 debtors and committees and in the cryptocurrency industry in general. The Quinn Emanuel attorneys bring extensive experience in bankruptcy law to these Chapter 11 Cases and have substantial experience practicing before this Court, as well as familiarity with applicable Fifth Circuit authority necessary to represent the Debtors.

**j. The Undesirability of the Cases**

27. Every bankruptcy case carries some risks due to the uncertainty of payment stemming from the relatively unknown value of a debtor's principal assets and the debtor's ability to pay administrative fees and costs. These Chapter 11 Cases presented no additional undesirable elements.

**k. The Nature and Length of the Professional Relationship with the Client**

28. As stated in the Retention Application, the Debtors retained Quinn Emanuel in March 2024 in connection with the preparation for the chapter 11 filings of certain entities.

**l. Awards in Similar Cases**

29. The fees requested in this Application are in line with fee awards approved in similar cases by counsel with similar experience.

**CONCLUSION**

The services provided by Quinn Emanuel are necessary to the administration of the Debtors' estates and were beneficial at the time the services were rendered. Further, Quinn Emanuel performed the services within a reasonable amount of time, commensurate with the complexity, importance, nature of the problems, issues, and tasks facing the Debtors. Finally, the compensation sought is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases under title 11 of this district.

Quinn Emanuel requests that the Court determine that the nature, extent, and value of these services were appropriate under the circumstances at the time the services were rendered. Quinn Emanuel requests that this Court enter an order (a) granting this Application for professional services rendered during the Application Period in the amount of \$1,965,698.50 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred by Quinn Emanuel during the Application Period in the amount of \$45,341.42, (b) granting the final approval of the fees and expenses requested in (i) Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP's First Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period August 24, 2024, through November 30, 2024, (ii) Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP's Second Interim Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period December 1, 2024, through February 28, 2025, (iii) Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP's Third Interim Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period March 1, 2025, through May 31, 2025, and (iv) Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP's Fourth Interim Application for Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period June 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025, (c) authorizing the Debtors to pay the fees and expenses as requested, and (d) grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Respectfully submitted this 27th day of February, 2026.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)

Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)

Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)

Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)

700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900

Houston, Texas 77002

Telephone: 713-221-7000

Facsimile: 713-221-7100

Email: pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com

Email: cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com

Email: alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com

Email: rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)

Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)

Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor

Los Angeles, California 90017

Telephone: 213-443-3000

Facsimile: 213-443-3100

Email: ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com

Email: razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com

Email: benroth@quinnemanuel.com

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE**

I, Patricia B. Tomasco, hereby certify that on the 27th day of February, 2026, a copy of the foregoing Application was served via the Electronic Case Filing System for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas.

*/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco* \_\_\_\_\_

Patricia B. Tomasco

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	Chapter 11
	§	
RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>	§	Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)
	§	
Debtors.	§	
	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	

**CERTIFICATION OF PATRICIA B. TOMASCO IN SUPPORT OF  
QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S FIFTH AND FINAL  
APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND  
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH JANUARY 14, 2026**

I, Patricia B. Tomasco, hereby certify that:

1. I am a Partner of the law firm Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”). Quinn Emanuel maintains offices at, among other places, 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002.

2. This certification (the “Certification”) is made in connection with Quinn Emanuel’s fee application dated February 27, 2026 (the “Application”), for compensation and reimbursement of expenses for the period commencing September 1, 2025, through January 14, 2026 (the “Application Period”). I have reviewed the Application and hereby certify that, to the best of my

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

knowledge, information, and belief, the Application complies with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, Local Rules, and Fee Guidelines.<sup>2</sup>

3. Quinn Emanuel discussed its rates and fees with the Debtors at the outset of these cases and has continued to discuss fees with the Debtors throughout these cases. Attorneys and paraprofessionals assigned to this matter were necessary to assist in the Debtors' bankruptcy filing, the preservation of the Debtors' assets, and other matters described in the Application. A budget and staffing plan was not prepared, but Quinn Emanuel continues to work with the Debtors to ensure efficient and cost-effective representation.

4. In accordance with the Fee Guidelines, I, on behalf of Quinn Emanuel, respond to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief to the questions identified therein as follows:

a. Did you agree to any variations from, or alternatives to, your standard or customary billing rates, or terms for services pertaining to this engagement that were provided during the application period? If so, please explain.

**Response:** No.

b. If the fees sought in this fee application as compared to the fees budgeted for the time period covered by this fee application are higher than 10% or more, did you discuss the reasons for the variation with the Client?

**Response:** A budget was not prepared.

c. Have any of the professionals included in this fee application varied their hourly rate based on the geographic location of the bankruptcy case?

**Response:** No.

d. Does the fee application include time or fees related to reviewing or revising time records or preparing, reviewing, or revising invoices? (This is limited to work involved in preparing and editing billing records that would not be compensable outside of bankruptcy and does not include reasonable fees for preparing a fee application.) If so, please quantify by hours and fees.

---

<sup>2</sup> Capitalized terms used herein but not defined shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Application.

**Response:** No

e. Does this fee application include time or fees for reviewing time records to redact any privileged or other confidential information? If so, please quantify by hours and fees.

**Response:** No

f. If the fee application includes any rate increases since retention:

i. Did your client review and approve those rate increases in advance?

ii. Did your client agree when retaining the law firm to accept all future rate increases? If not, did you inform your client that they need not agree to modify rates or terms in order to have you continue the representation consistent with ABA Formal Ethics Opinion 11-458?

**Response:** The rates for Patty Tomasco and Barbara J Howell increased on January 1, 2026, through January 14, 2026. The client was aware of the annual rate increase.

Dated: February 27, 2026  
Houston, Texas

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco  
Patricia B. Tomasco

**EXHIBIT B**  
**CUSTOMARY AND COMPARABLE COMPENSATION DISCLOSURES WITH FEE APPLICATIONS**

CATEGORY OF TIMEKEEPER (using categories already maintained by the firm)	BLENDED HOURLY RATE	
	BILLED OR COLLECTED Firm or offices for the preceding year	BILLED In this fee application
Partner	\$1,831.35	\$1,943.11
Of Counsel	\$1,597.53	N/A
Associate (includes contract attorneys and law clerks)	\$1,313.50	\$1,479.25
Paraprofessional	\$597.03	\$651.28
All Timekeepers Aggregate	\$1,468.82	\$1,472.87

Case Name: *In re Rhodium Encore LLC, et al.*

Case Number: 24-90448 (ARP)

Applicant's Name: Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP

Date of Application: February 27, 2026

Interim or Final: Final

**EXHIBIT C**  
**SUMMARY OF TIMEKEEPERS INCLUDED IN THIS FEE APPLICATION**

NAME	TITLE	SECTION	YEAR ADMITTED	FEES BILLED <sup>1</sup>	HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE BILLED
Patty Tomasco	Partner	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	1988	\$670,052.50	344.5	\$1,945.00
Patty Tomasco	Partner	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	1988	\$17,617.00	7.9	\$2,230.00
Razmig Izakelian	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2013	\$185,314.50	111.3	\$1,665.00
Lindsay M. Weber	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2008	\$233,932.50	140.5	\$1,665.00
Grace Pusavat	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2015	\$2,497.50	1.5	\$1,665.00
Ben Roth	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2019	\$78,407.00	48.7	\$1,610.00
Alain Jaquet	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2016	\$370,622.00	230.2	\$1,610.00
Cameron Kelly	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2020	\$3,900.00	2.5	\$1,560.00
Rachel Harrington	Associate	Bankruptcy and Reorganization	2024	\$212,109.50	161.3	\$1,315.00
Nqulelwa Maseti	Associate	Intellectual Property	2025	\$41,474.00	35.6	\$1,165.00
Emily Moore	Law Clerk			\$30,459.00	42.9	\$710.00
Barbara J Howell	Paralegal	Bankruptcy/ Reorganization		\$129,952.00	198.4	\$655.00
Barbara J Howell	Paralegal	Bankruptcy/ Reorganization		\$4,752.00	6.6	\$4,752.00
Raul Vasquez	Litigation Support			\$567.00	2.7	\$210.00
<b>Total</b>				\$1,981,656.50	1,334.6	

Case Name: *In re Rhodium Encore LLC, et al.*

Case Number: 24-90448 (ARP)

Applicant's Name: Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP

Date of Application: February 27, 2026

Interim or Final: Final

---

<sup>1</sup> Travel billed at 100%.

**EXHIBIT D  
BUDGET**

A budget was not prepared in this case. Quinn Emanuel continues to work with the Debtors to ensure efficient and cost-effective service to the Debtors' estates.

Case Name: *In re Rhodium Encore LLC, et al.*

Case Number: 24-90448 (ARP)

Applicant's Name: Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP

Date of Application: February 27, 2026

Interim or Final: Final

**EXHIBIT E**  
**SUMMARY OF COMPENSATION REQUESTED BY PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>PROJECT CATEGORY</b>	<b>HOURS BUDGETED</b>	<b>FEEES BUDGETED</b>	<b>HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>FEEES SOUGHT</b>
i-Asset Analysis	N/A	N/A	6.4	\$10,927.00
ii-Asset Disposition	N/A	N/A	29.5	\$46,042.50
v-Business Operations	N/A	N/A	2.1	\$3,706.50
vi-Case Administration	N/A	N/A	126.6	\$172,848.50
vii-Claims Administration and Objections	N/A	N/A	374.8	\$536,870.50
viii-Corporate Governance and Board Matters	N/A	N/A	13.4	\$25,904.00
ix-Employee Benefits and Pensions	N/A	N/A	33.3	\$56,923.00
x-Employment and Fee Applications	N/A	N/A	74.2	\$65,789.00
xii-Litigation	N/A	N/A	35.8	\$54,279.00
xiii-Non-Working Travel <sup>2</sup>	N/A	N/A	19.4	\$15,958.00
xiv-Plan and Disclosure Statement	N/A	N/A	614.1	\$966,725.50
xvi-Tax	N/A	N/A	5.0	\$9,725.00
<b>Total</b>			1,334.6	\$1,965,698.50

Case Name: *In re Rhodium Encore LLC, et al.*

Case Number: 24-90448 (ARP)

Applicant's Name: Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP

Date of Application: February 27, 2026

Interim or Final: Final

---

<sup>2</sup> Travel billed at 50% of \$31,916.00.

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:  RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	§ § § § § § §	Chapter 11  Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)  (Jointly Administered)
--	---------------------------------	---

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S  
THIRTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2025**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) submits, pursuant to the Order Granting the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (ECF No. 264) entered on October 14, 2024, this monthly fee statement for the payment of interim compensation rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the period September 1, 2025, through September 30, 2025 (the “Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement”).

Quinn Emanuel seeks payment of interim compensation in the total amount of \$446,608.20 (80% of the services rendered), plus \$13,999.93 (100% of the interim expenses incurred). Summaries of the fees and expenses are in Exhibits A, B, and C. An invoice reflecting detailed time entries is attached hereto as Exhibit D.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party objecting to the payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses shall serve within 14 days after service of the Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement a written notice, via email, upon Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties (as listed below) (the “Written Notice”). The Written Notice shall specifically identify the objectionable fees and expenses, including the amount at issue and the basis for the objection. If the parties are unable to reach a resolution of the objection within 14 calendar days, the objecting party shall file its objection (the “Objection”) with this Court within 3 business days and serve such Objection on Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties. *See* Interim Compensation Order, ¶ 1(a)(c).

The Fee Notice Parties as defined in the Interim Compensation Order are:

- i. Rhodium Enterprises, Inc., Attn: Charles Topping ([chucktopping@rhdm.com](mailto:chucktopping@rhdm.com)) and Morgan Soule ([morgansoule@rhdm.com](mailto:morgansoule@rhdm.com)), 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, Texas 77005;
- ii. Debtors’ Bankruptcy Counsel, c/o Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco ([pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)); Razmig Izakelian ([razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)), and Alain Jaquet ([alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)), 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002;
- iii. Debtors’ Financial Advisor, c/o Province, Attn: Mark Robinson ([mrobinson@provincefirm.com](mailto:mrobinson@provincefirm.com)); David Dunn ([ddunn@provincefirm.com](mailto:ddunn@provincefirm.com)); Kirsten Lee ([klee@province.com](mailto:klee@province.com)); and Andrew Popescu ([apopescu@provincefirm.com](mailto:apopescu@provincefirm.com)), 2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340, Henderson, Nevada 89074;
- iv. Galaxy Digital, LLC, in its capacity as DIP Agent, c/o Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, Ryan C. Wooten ([rwooten@orrick.com](mailto:rwooten@orrick.com)), 609 Main, 40<sup>th</sup> Floor, Houston, Texas 77002, and Robert Trust ([rtrust@orrick.com](mailto:rtrust@orrick.com)), Mark Franke ([mfranke@orrick.com](mailto:mfranke@orrick.com)) and Brandon Batzel ([bbatzel@orrick.com](mailto:bbatzel@orrick.com)), 51 West 52<sup>nd</sup> Street, New York, New York 10019;
- v. Counsel for the Committee of Unsecured Creditors, c/o McDermott Will & Emery LLP, 2501 North Harwood St., Suite 1900, Dallas, Texas 75201, Attn: Charles R. Gibbs ([crgibbs@mwe.com](mailto:crgibbs@mwe.com)); and

- vi. United States Trustee, Ha Minh Nguyen ([ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov](mailto:ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov)), 515 Rusk, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002.

If no objection is timely served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay Quinn Emanuel an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses listed herein, or if an objection is timely served, such percentage of fees and expenses that are not subject to an objection, as stated in the Interim Compensation Order.

Respectfully submitted this 29th day of October, 2025.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)

Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)

Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)

Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)

700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900

Houston, Texas 77002

Telephone: 713-221-7000

Facsimile: 713-221-7100

Email: [pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)

Email: [cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com)

Email: [alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)

Email: [rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com)

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)

Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)

Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor

Los Angeles, California 90017

Telephone: 213-443-3000

Facsimile: 213-443-3100

Email: [ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com)

Email: [razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)

Email: [benroth@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:benroth@quinnemanuel.com)

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A****Summary of Legal Fees for the Fee Period**

Matter Number	Matter Description	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Requested	Total Fees With 20% Discount
I	Asset Analysis/Recovery	5.3	\$9,370.50	\$7,496.40
ii	Asset Disposition	6.0	\$11,558.00	\$9,246.40
v	Business Operations	1.4	\$2,345.00	\$1,876.00
vi	Case Administration	38.5	\$56,479.50	\$45,183.60
vii	Claims Administration and Objections	205.7	\$287,204.00	\$229,763.20
viii	Corporate Governance and Board Matters	4.6	\$8,947.00	\$7,157.60
ix	Employee Benefits and Pensions	20.6	\$35,441.50	\$28,353.20
x	Employment and Fee Applications	7.9	\$6,206.50	\$4,965.20
xi	Financing/Cash Collateral	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xii	Litigation	5.9	\$9,825.50	\$7,860.40
xiii	Non-working Travel <sup>2</sup>	3.5	\$2,301.25	\$1,841.00
xiv	Plan and Disclosure Statement	69.0	\$118,856.50	\$95,085.20
xv	Relief from the Stay	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xvi	Tax	5.0	\$9,725.00	\$7,780.00
	Total	373.4	\$558,260.25	\$446,608.20

<sup>2</sup> Non-working travel is billed at 50%--\$4,602.50/2=\$2,301.25.

**EXHIBIT B****Summary of Hours Billed by Quinn Emanuel Attorneys and Paraprofessionals<sup>3</sup>**

Professional	Position With The Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Patricia B. Tomasco	Partner	1988	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,945.00	83.4	\$162,213.00
Eric D. Winston	Partner	1999	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,990.00	0.0	\$0.00
Daniel Holzman	Counsel	1999	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,775.00	0.0	\$0.00
Razmig Izakelian	Associate	2013	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	7.8	\$12,987.00
Lindsay Weber	Associate	2008	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	63.9	\$106,393.50
Ben Roth	Associate	2019	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	13.9	\$22,379.00
Alain Jaquet	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	41.8	\$67,298.00
Rachel Harrington	Associate	2024	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,315.00	102.1	\$134,261.50
Nqulwla Maseti	Associate	2025	Intellectual Property Litigation	\$1,165.00	30.2	\$35,183.00
Barbara J. Howell	Paralegal		Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$655.00	30.3	\$19,846.50
<b>Total</b>					<b>373.4</b>	<b>\$560,561.50</b>

---

<sup>3</sup> Travel reflected at 100%.

**EXHIBIT C****Summary of Expenses for the Fee Period**

Expense	Amount
Meals during travel	\$30.74
Express mail	\$44.42
Filing Fees	\$298.00
Hearing Transcripts	\$155.15
Document Reproduction (\$.10 per copy)	\$584.10
Color Document Reproduction (\$.25 per copy)	\$10.25
Travel	\$205.04
Hotel	\$979.46
Velobind	\$21.21
Air Travel	\$553.48
Local meals	\$187.35
Document Services	\$5,112.55
Tabs	\$33.75
RelOne Repository Hosting	\$1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting	\$4,305.29
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$13,999.93</b>

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017

October 23, 2025

Cameron Blackmon  
Rhodium Enterprises, Inc.  
4146 W US Highway 79  
Rockdale, TX 76567

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000198906  
Responsible Attorney: Patty Tomasco

Rhodium- restructure of company

For Professional Services through September 30, 2025 in connection with a potential restructuring of this crypto mining company.

Fees	\$560,561.50
50% Non-Working Travel Discount	<u>-\$2,301.25</u>
Net Billed Fees	\$558,260.25
Expenses	<u>\$13,999.93</u>
Net Amount	\$572,260.18
Total Due This Invoice	\$572,260.18
Balance Due from Previous Statement(s)	\$2,445,484.14
Total Balance Due	<u>\$3,017,744.32</u>

**Confidential – May include attorney-client privileged and work-product information**

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 2

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

**Statement Detail****i Asset Analysis and Recover**

09/05/25	PT	Correspond with A. Jaquet regarding claims against 3 Way for cargo damage and evidence preservation (.2); coordinate with C. Topping regarding call with insurance adjusters and 3 Way regarding same (.2).	0.40	778.00
09/09/25	PT	Call with 3-Way Logistics representatives regarding resolution of claims for faulty transportation with C. Topping, M. Soule, J. Estes, A. Jaquet (.6); follow up review of underlying documents and contracts to ascertain rights and waivers (.9); review cases on need for signed document for damages limitation to apply (.6).	2.10	4,084.50
09/09/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum for P. Tomasco regarding the claim against Three Way, including by reviewing and analyzing Debtors' materials regarding same (1.2); prepare for and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, C. Toppings et al. regarding same (.5); research case law regarding the same and correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (.8).	2.50	4,025.00
09/25/25	AJ4	Correspond with M. Soule regarding Rhodium's claim against Three Way (0.1); review prior correspondence in connection with the same (0.2).	0.30	483.00
		SUBTOTAL	5.30	9,370.50

**ii Asset Disposition**

09/04/25	PT	Review status of negotiations with Whinstone (.3) and follow up	0.40	778.00
----------	----	---	------	--------

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 3

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

		correspondence with S. Lockhart to set up a call on allocation tasks(.1).		
09/10/25	PT	Correspond with M. Robinson, T. Schmeltz regarding Whinstone position and analysis (.3).	0.30	583.50
09/16/25	PT	Coordinate with K. Hays, M. Robinson and C. Wheeler regarding the status of equipment valuation and strategy for resolving allocation (.3); correspond with P. Mandarino regarding response to allocation issues (.1); correspond with C. Topping regarding the same (.2).	0.60	1,167.00
09/17/25	PT	Review sale approval orders and de minimis sales regarding incidental costs of equipment storage and comment on proposal for laydown yard lease termination (.9).	0.90	1,750.50
09/18/25	PT	Email summary of analysis of sale orders and suggest revisions to the termination agreement to link to orders with explanatory email to C. Topping and M. Soule (1.1).	1.10	2,139.50
09/24/25	PT	Correspondence regarding valuation of equipment and additional review (.3).	0.30	583.50
09/25/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call regarding purchase price allocation with Alex Peloubet, Trace Schmeltz, Chris Wheeler, Kevin Hays, Greg Miodic, Chase Blackmon, Ashley Jonson (.9); correspondence with T. Schmeltz regarding prior correspondence with Whinstone regarding purchase price allocation (.3); follow up with K. Hays regarding comparison of asset lists and efficient methodologies for bridging gap on equipment values (.3); review and analyze exahash statistics from Riot public reports (.5).	2.00	3,890.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 4

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/25/25	LMW	Emails with counsel re: Whinstone transactions and allocations (.4).	0.40	666.00
		SUBTOTAL	6.00	11,558.00

**ix Employee Benefits and Pensions**

09/02/25	PT	Correspondence with S. Schultz regarding Rhodium employee claims and employment agreements and correspond with L. Weber regarding same (.3).	0.30	583.50
09/02/25	PT	Correspondence with S. Schultz regarding contingent severance obligation (.2); review severance agreements and correspondence regarding same with C. Topping and L. Weber (.6); review prior research in preparation for call (.4).	1.20	2,334.00
09/02/25	LMW	Review of the employee executive agreements (1.4); emails to S. Schulz re: same (.2).	1.60	2,664.00
09/03/25	LMW	Review terms of contingent benefit agreements (3.3); emails to A. Cataao re: same (.2); emails to S. Schultz re: CSBAs (.3).	3.80	6,327.00
09/04/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a conference call with A. Cataao, C. Topping, L. Weber, C. Blackmon regarding status of contingent severance agreements and employee benefits provisions of plan (.9); prepare for and participate in update conference call with S. Schultz, L. Weber and M. Hurley regarding employee severance claims exhibit to plan (.8).	1.70	3,306.50
09/04/25	LMW	Call with S. Schultz re: severance schedule (.5); review terms of same (1.2).	1.70	2,830.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 5

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/05/25	LMW	Review and revise summary chart re: employee payments (2.8); emails to A. Catatao re: same (.2); emails to S. Schultz re: severance (.3).	3.30	5,494.50
09/05/25	PT	Coordinate with L. Weber regarding the information requests from the Akin team regarding employee severance claims (.2).	0.20	389.00
09/08/25	LMW	Emails with A. Catatao re: severance (.4); emails to S. Schultz re: same (.8); review of treatment for executive treatment and post-petition agreements (2.4).	3.60	5,994.00
09/10/25	LMW	Follow-up emails re: severance benefits (.6).	0.60	999.00
09/24/25	AJ4	Correspond with A. Popescu regarding employee severance questions (0.1).	0.10	161.00
09/24/25	PT	Correspondence with A. Catatao and L. Weber regarding employee severance issues (.1); correspondence with S. Kitei regarding employee severance claims (.4) and correspond with L. Weber regarding response (.2).	0.70	1,361.50
09/29/25	LMW	Call with A. Catatao re: severance (.4); emails to the Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.3).	0.70	1,165.50
09/30/25	LMW	Call with S. Kitei re: severance payments (.3); review of the severance schedule re: same (.5); call to C. Topping re: severance payments (.1); emails to Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.2).	1.10	1,831.50
		<b>SUBTOTAL</b>	<b>20.60</b>	<b>35,441.50</b>

**v Business Operations**

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 6

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/03/25	RH9	Review documents related to intercompany transactions (.6).	0.60	789.00
09/22/25	PT	Coordinate the routing of the return of the expert witness retainer to the company (.1).	0.10	194.50
09/25/25	PT	Conference with purported IRS agent regarding form of tax return and follow up with K. Hays regarding inquiry (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
		SUBTOTAL	1.40	2,345.00

**vi Case Administration**

09/01/25	AJ4	Attend a telephone conference with P. Tomasco, B. Roth et al. regarding case status and next steps (.6).	0.60	966.00
09/01/25	BR4	Call (partial) with Quinn Emanuel and Province team regarding case updates (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/02/25	RH9	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team to discuss next steps (.6).	0.60	789.00
09/02/25	BR4	Call with R. Harrington regarding SAFE decision (.2); emails regarding the Committee's motion (.1).	0.30	483.00
09/02/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.3) and download recently filed pleadings for attorneys' review (.5); forward to the Client (.1).	0.90	589.50
09/02/25	LMW	Call with Quinn Emanuel team re: case updates (.6).	0.60	999.00
09/02/25	PT	Prepare an agenda for (.3) and participate in a team call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, R. Izakelian, R. Harrington, A. Jaquet regarding planning and strategy (.6).	0.90	1,750.50
09/02/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case strategy and assignments (0.6).	0.60	999.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 7

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/03/25	LMW	Emails to B. Howell re: S drive access (.2).	0.20	333.00
09/04/25	PT	Prepare for (.3) and participate in a call with R. Izakelian, B. Roth, L. Maseti, L. Weber, A. Popescu, M. Robinson, R. Harrington regarding projects and strategy (.4).	0.70	1,361.50
09/04/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.4).	0.40	666.00
09/04/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case updates (.4).	0.40	644.00
09/04/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.4).	0.40	466.00
09/05/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/05/25	PT	Planning and strategy meeting with R. Izakelian, R. Harrington, A. Jaquet, L. Weber (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/05/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.5).	0.50	582.50
09/08/25	RH9	Participate in the team meeting to discuss case strategy and next steps (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/08/25	BR4	Prepare for (.2) and call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (.5); emails regarding same (.1).	0.80	1,288.00
09/08/25	BH2	Prepare a pleading notebook for P. Tomasco for the September 8th hearing (.5).	0.50	327.50
09/08/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.5).	0.50	582.50
09/08/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, G. Pusavat et al. regarding case status and next steps (.5).	0.50	805.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 8

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/08/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/08/25	PT	Conference with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, B. Roth, A. Jaquet, L. Maseti regarding projects and strategy (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/08/25	BH2	Review ECF filings received over the last few days (.5) and update files for the attorneys' review (.3); forward documents to the Client (.2).	1.00	655.00
09/09/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case updates (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/09/25	PT	Participate in coordination call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, R. Izakelian, R. Harrington (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/09/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/09/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.5).	0.50	582.50
09/09/25	RH9	Prepare for (.2) and participate in the conference with the Quinn Emanuel team to discuss next steps (.5).	0.70	920.50
09/10/25	PT	Coordination and planning call with R. Izakelian, G. Pusavat, L. Maseti, A. Jaquet, L. Weber (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/10/25	BR4	Prepare for (.2) and participate in a call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (.5).	0.70	1,127.00
09/10/25	RH9	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team to discuss next steps (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/10/25	LMW	Call with Quinn Emanuel team re: case updates (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/10/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 9

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/10/25	NM7	Prepare for (.2) and attend the team conference meeting (.5).	0.70	815.50
09/11/25	PT	Participate in a conference call with M. Robinson, A. Propescu, A. Jaquet, R. Harrington (.5); follow up with B. Howell regarding misfiled sealed document and retrieval of same (.2).	0.70	1,361.50
09/11/25	RH9	Prepare for (.2) and attend the conference call with the Quinn Emanuel team and Province to discuss case strategy (.5).	0.70	920.50
09/11/25	RI	Prepare for (.5) and attend conference call with Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	1.00	1,665.00
09/12/25	PT	Participate in the coordination call with R. Izakelian, B. Roth, R. Harrington, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/12/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates and plan structure (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/12/25	RH9	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team and Province to discuss case strategy (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/13/25	BR4	Review filings and emails regarding plan (0.4).	0.40	644.00
09/15/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in the coordination call with Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth, Lindsay Weber, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian (.5).	0.60	1,167.00
09/15/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (.7).	0.70	1,127.00
09/15/25	RH9	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team to discuss case strategy (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/15/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 10

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/16/25	RH9	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team to discuss case strategy (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/16/25	BR4	Prepare for (.7) and participate in the call with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case updates (.5).	1.20	1,932.00
09/16/25	PT	Participate in the coordination and strategy call with Michael Robinson, Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/16/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/18/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, A. Popescu, et al. regarding case status and next steps (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/18/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case updates (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/18/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/19/25	BH2	Finalize the Certificates of No Objections as requested by A. Jaquet (.4); and file same (.5).	0.90	589.50
09/19/25	PT	Participate in the call with Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth, Daniel Holzman, Eric Winston, Grace Pusavat, Laura Santos-Bishop, Lelwa Maseti, Lindsay Weber, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/19/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (partial attendance) (.2).	0.20	322.00
09/19/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (attend partial meeting) (.2).	0.20	233.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 11

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/19/25	BH2	Review the Pacer docket (.4) and update files to current status (.5).	0.90	589.50
09/22/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/22/25	PT	Participate in the strategy call with Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth, Lindsay Weber, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
09/22/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.5).	0.50	582.50
09/22/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (.5); call with R. Izakelian regarding research (.3).	0.80	1,288.00
09/22/25	BH2	File the 19 separate Monthly Operating Reports (1.3).	1.30	851.50
09/23/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, G. Pusavat et al. regarding case status and next steps (.4).	0.40	644.00
09/23/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in planning call with Michael Robinson, Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth, Lelwa Maseti, Lindsay Weber, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian (.4).	0.50	972.50
09/25/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and attend strategy and planning call with Michael Robinson, Lindsay Weber, Rachel Harrington, Razmig Izakelian, Alain Jaquet, Ben Roth (.4).	0.50	972.50
09/30/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.3) and forward recently filed documents to the Client (.2).	0.50	327.50
SUBTOTAL			38.50	56,479.50

**vii Claims Administration and Objections**

09/01/25	RH9	Draft Rule 11 motion (5.6).	5.60	7,364.00
----------	-----	-----------------------------	------	----------

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 12

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/02/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum regarding the status of the first omnibus claim objection based on satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (.2); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding the same (.1).	0.30	483.00
09/02/25	PT	Correspondence with S. Schultz regarding an update on the Midas Green claim objection (.2); review and revise motion for sanctions and correspond with R. Harrington regarding client review (.6); review and comment on second omnibus 510(b) claim objection and coordinate the certificate of no objection for the first omnibus claim objection (.3).	1.10	2,139.50
09/02/25	PT	Review and revise the second omnibus claim objection to equity-type claims (.7); correspondence with C. Topping and M. Soule regarding same (.2); follow up with R. Harrington regarding analysis of penny warrants issue for incorporation (.2).	1.10	2,139.50
09/02/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (.6); review SAFE AHG's limited response to the Debtors' omnibus objection to certain claims (.4); research case law re lack of standing of SAFE AHG to object to Debtors' omnibus objection to certain claims (3.0).	4.00	4,660.00
09/02/25	RH9	Draft Rule 11 motion (4.0); incorporate comments and revisions (1.1).	5.10	6,706.50
09/03/25	RH9	Call with E. Brannen to discuss Topping declaration (.2).	0.20	263.00
09/03/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (2.8); correspond with P. Tomasco, A.	3.00	4,830.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 13

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

		Popescu and F. Sabzevari regarding the same (.2).		
09/04/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a conference call with S. Schultz, M. Hurley, E. Brannen, R. Harrington regarding the Midas Green claim objection (.5); correspond with E. Brannen regarding revisions to the motion for sanctions and timing of hearing (.2); coordinate with A. Jaquet to enter stipulations regarding claim withdrawals (.3); review and coordinate the response to Midas' motion to withdraw the reference and lateness analysis (.9); draft of second omnibus 510(b) objection (.2); conference with M. Robinson regarding same (.2).	2.30	4,473.50
09/04/25	BH2	Finalize (.9) and file the Motion for Sanctions (.3).	1.20	786.00
09/04/25	RH9	Attend meeting to discuss Midas' claims (.2); draft response to motion to withdraw reference (2.0).	2.20	2,893.00
09/04/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft stipulation regarding withdrawal of claims (.5); correspond and confer with G. Graham and P. Tomasco regarding the same (.6).	1.10	1,771.00
09/04/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds, including by reviewing related Debtors' documents (2.8); correspond with L. Maseti and R. Harrington regarding the same (.2); correspond and confer with F. Sabzevari regarding the same (.3).	3.30	5,313.00
09/05/25	BH2	Finalize (.7) and file the proposed Stipulation between Rhodium and several claimants (.3).	1.00	655.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 14

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/05/25	RH9	Draft the response to Midas' motion to withdraw the reference (2.9).	2.90	3,813.50
09/05/25	RH9	Insert missing information into the omnibus claim objection (.8).	0.80	1,052.00
09/05/25	PT	Coordinate with E. Brannen regarding the sanctions motion and fee declarations (.5); review the proposed stipulation with G. Graham to withdraw claims (.2).	0.70	1,361.50
09/05/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (6.5).	6.50	10,465.00
09/05/25	NM7	Review the second group of claim objections and perform citation check and research case law re same (2.9); research case law re warrants and lack of consideration (1.6).	4.50	5,242.50
09/05/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft stipulation regarding the withdrawal of claims (.5); correspond and confer with G. Graham and P. Tomasco regarding the same (1.5).	2.00	3,220.00
09/08/25	AJ4	Prepare a draft certificate of no objection regarding omnibus claim objections relating to satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (1.0); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (.1).	1.10	1,771.00
09/08/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of the second omnibus claim objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (7.6); correspond with L. Maseti regarding same (.1).	7.70	12,397.00
09/08/25	PT	Correspondence with S. Schultz regarding motion for sanctions in Midas Green claims objection (.2); research and update negotiation team regarding jurisdictional nature of notice of appeal (.6); coordinate	1.00	1,945.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 15

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

		calculation of the Midas related fees (.2).		
09/08/25	BH2	Review previous fee statements and calculate the fees incurred by Quinn Emanuel re the Midas Green Technologies claim litigation (1.1).	1.10	720.50
09/08/25	NM7	Review the second group of claim objections and perform citation check and research case law re same (1.7).	1.70	1,980.50
09/09/25	BH2	Revise the chart to add the time narrative reflecting how much time was spent on the Midas Green litigation (1.3).	1.30	851.50
09/09/25	AJ4	Research case law regarding contract formation and enforcement in connection with the second omnibus claim objection based on satisfied claims and other grounds (.8); correspond with L. Maseti regarding same (.1).	0.90	1,449.00
09/09/25	RH9	Draft notice of appeal (1.8).	1.80	2,367.00
09/09/25	NM7	Research case law re warrants, lack of consideration, and lack of intent to be bound (6.3).	6.30	7,339.50
09/10/25	RH9	Communications with the team regarding Rule 11 declaration (.5).	0.50	657.50
09/10/25	RH9	Call with E. Brannen to discuss strategy for Midas hearing (.3).	0.30	394.50
09/10/25	RH9	Legal research in support of the Midas claim objection (1.7).	1.70	2,235.50
09/11/25	PT	Review and revise the notice of appeal (.2); review and revise the proposed submission on fees subject to sanction motion (.4); review and comment on the potential claims by Temple Green and counterclaims (.5).	1.10	2,139.50
09/11/25	RH9	Legal research into certain claims (3.6).	3.60	4,734.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 16

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/11/25	RH9	Revisions to the appeal notice (.4).	0.40	526.00
09/12/25	PT	Correspondence with J. Norr regarding claims (.2).	0.20	389.00
09/12/25	RH9	Call with E. Brannen to discuss strategy for the Midas hearing (.3); incorporate revisions to the Topping declaration for Midas claims (.8); double check calculations in the Midas claims review and finalize declaration (.3).	1.40	1,841.00
09/12/25	NM7	Review and finalize the notice of appeal (.7).	0.70	815.50
09/12/25	BH2	Finalize (1.1) and file the Topping Declaration re Motion for Sanctions against Midas Green (.4); forward copies to the Client (.2).	1.70	1,113.50
09/13/25	PT	Conference with J. Norr regarding claims (.2).	0.20	389.00
09/13/25	BH2	Finalize (.6) and file the Notice of Appeal (.3); distribute same to the Client (.1).	1.00	655.00
09/14/25	RH9	Legal research into potential claims (1.0); draft communications (2.1).	3.10	4,076.50
09/15/25	RH9	Legal research regarding contingent claims (.4).	0.40	526.00
09/16/25	RH9	Draft response to the Midas withdrawal motion (5.5).	5.50	7,232.50
09/17/25	RH9	Draft opposition to Midas withdrawal motion (1.5); incorporate comments and revisions (2.0).	3.50	4,602.50
09/17/25	PT	Review and extensive revisions to the objection to Midas Green's motion to withdraw the reference (1.3); review and comment on J. Thomas' email regarding exhibits (.2); follow up with R. Harrington regarding hearing logistics and planning (.2).	1.70	3,306.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 17

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/17/25	RH9	Create exhibit list for September 23 hearing (1.3).	1.30	1,709.50
09/18/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of the second omnibus claim objection based on satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (2.1); correspond with F. Sabzevani regarding claim status, including by reviewing and analyzing relating materials (.3); review and revise draft certificate of no objection and related order (1.2); correspond and confer with P. Tomasco in connection with the same (.2).	3.60	5,796.00
09/18/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call with Rachel Harrington and Elizabeth Brannen regarding hearing logistics and strategy (.9); comment on the updated draft opposition to motion to withdraw reference (.1); review and analyze correspondence with Temple Green regarding claims and invoices (.6); conference with C. Topping regarding the history with Temple Green and additional bases to object to claims (.2); correspondence regarding drafting a claim objection to Temple Green claims and identifying counterclaims with Stris team (1.1); review and audit claims register with need for additional claim objections (.7); follow up emails with E. Brannen regarding exhibit list and expert reports (.2); final revisions and coordinate filing of the opposition to motion to withdraw reference (.7).	4.50	8,752.50
09/18/25	RH9	Draft and finalize the exhibit list for the Midas claim objection hearing (1.4).	1.40	1,841.00
09/18/25	RH9	Meeting with P. Tomasco and E. Brannen to discuss the Midas hearing	5.40	7,101.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 18

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

		preparations (.7); revisions to the motion to withdraw the opposition brief (2.5); gather exhibits for the hearing and revise the exhibit list (2.2).		
09/18/25	NM7	Review the draft opposition to Midas Green's motion for mandatory withdrawal (1.0).	1.00	1,165.00
09/19/25	BH2	Finalize (2.1) and file the sealed exhibits for the September 23rd hearing (.9); draft the motion to seal (.4) and proposed order (.3); file the motion to seal and proposed order (.3); distribute the sealed exhibits and exhibit list to opposing counsel (.6).	4.60	3,013.00
09/19/25	BR4	Research on claims (.6).	0.60	966.00
09/19/25	PT	Review and comment on the response to motion for sanctions and analysis of reply points (.7); review Temple Green claims and proofs of claim and correspondence with Quinn Emanuel team regarding drafting issues (.9); review status of the exhibit list for the hearing and service of the exhibits (.5); attention to certificate of no objection for second omnibus equity claims objection and coordinate drafting and editing of same (.8); review and comment on the motion to seal exhibits for Midas Green hearing (.2).	3.10	6,029.50
09/19/25	BH2	Email communications with R. Harrington regarding the sealed exhibits (.4); several email communications with L. Garcia regarding preparing the exhibit notebooks for the September 23rd hearing (.5).	0.90	589.50
09/19/25	RH9	Draft reply to the rule 11 motion for sanctions (1.9).	1.90	2,498.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 19

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/19/25	RH9	Revisions to the exhibit list for the Midas hearing (.8); arrange hearing logistics (.5); create presentation for hearing (3.8).	5.10	6,706.50
09/20/25	PT	Review and comment on the settlement offer from Midas Green with R. Harrington and E. Brannen (.2); review pleadings for the hearing (.5); comment to K. Halpern regarding the effect of Midas Green not filing a witness and exhibit list (.2).	0.90	1,750.50
09/21/25	NM7	Research case law re sanctions pursuant to the Patent Act for exceptional cases, sanctions for incorrect factual information in pleadings, and sanctions for bad conduct in other proceedings (2.3).	2.30	2,679.50
09/21/25	RH9	Draft rule 11 reply (6.5).	6.50	8,547.50
09/22/25	PT	Communicate with K. Halpern and E. Brannen regarding appellate standard for exclusion of evidence after brief online research (.7); review and edit reply to response on sanctions and brief research regarding Fifth Circuit law regarding same; emails with R. Harrington and L. Maseti regarding Fifth Circuit cases and various redline comparisons (1.4); review status of the Powerpoint, witness outlines, reply briefs and preparation for hearing and initial edits to the Powerpoint presentation (2.1).	4.20	8,169.00
09/22/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft presentation regarding Midas' claims (4.6); correspond and confer with P. Tomasco regarding same (.2); correspond and confer with R. Harrington in connection with the same (.2).	5.00	8,050.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 20

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/22/25	NM7	Review the motion for sanctions against Midas Green (1.4); research case law re substantially similar sanctions motions (0.7); review draft reply in support of motion for sanctions against Midas Green and research case law re same (1.5); prepare PowerPoint presentation slide deck for Midas Green claim hearing (2.8).	6.40	7,456.00
09/22/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket for documents scheduled for hearing on September 23rd, 2024 (.8) and prepare pleading notebooks for P. Tomasco, R. Harrington, and E. Brannen (.8).	1.60	1,048.00
09/22/25	RH9	Legal research into Rule 11 claims (3.5); create Midas hearing presentation (6.5).	10.00	13,150.00
09/22/25	RH9	Draft Midas rule 11 reply (3.3).	3.30	4,339.50
09/23/25	BH2	Assist with pre-hearing tasks for attorneys (1.8).	1.80	1,179.00
09/23/25	AJ4	Correspond with A. Popescu and F. Sabzevari regarding R. Hutchens' call regarding claim (0.1).	0.10	161.00
09/23/25	PT	Meeting with E. Brannen and R. Harrington regarding hearing preparation (1.1); review and revise (multiple) the hearing Powerpoint (1.4); prepare for (.6) and attend the continued hearing on the claim objection of Midas Green and Midas Green's motion and motion for sanctions (4.0); follow up conference with E. Brannen and C. Topping regarding continued hearing (.5).	7.60	14,782.00
09/23/25	RH9	Revisions to the Midas hearing presentation (1.5); handle final preparations (1.0) and attend the Midas hearing (4.0).	6.50	8,547.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 21

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/24/25	AJ4	Correspond with A. Popescu regarding NYDIG's claim status (.1).	0.10	161.00
09/24/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and attend the continued hearing on the objection to Midas Green claims (3.2).	3.40	6,613.00
09/24/25	BH2	File the slides from the September 23rd hearing with the Court (.4).	0.40	262.00
09/24/25	RH9	Assist in preparations for the Midas hearing (.3); attend the Midas hearing (3.2).	3.50	4,602.50
09/26/25	RH9	Revise the rule 11 motions (.9).	0.90	1,183.50
09/29/25	BH2	Finalize (.3) and file the Notice of Designation of Record (.3).	0.60	393.00
09/29/25	AJ4	Correspond with R. Harrington regarding the appeal designation regarding the SAFE claim objection (.2).	0.20	322.00
09/29/25	RH9	Draft designation notice and statement of issues for SAFE appeal (4.5).	4.50	5,917.50
09/29/25	RI	Review and revise the statement of issues and appeal designations (1.3).	1.30	2,164.50
09/29/25	PT	Coordinate drafting statement of issues on appeal and record designation (.3); review and suggest revisions to statement (.2).	0.50	972.50
09/29/25	RH9	Revise the sanctions motion (1.9).	1.90	2,498.50
		SUBTOTAL	205.70	287,204.00

**viii Corporate Governance and board Matters**

09/03/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in board meeting with Blackmons, D. Eaton, S Wells, R. Szkoda, J. Norr, M. Robinson, D. Dunn (1.5).	1.50	2,917.50
09/11/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in preparation call with D. Eaton, S.	1.60	3,112.00





**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 24

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

Popescu regarding background facts  
(.3).

SUBTOTAL 5.90 9,825.50

**xiii Non-working Travel**

09/24/25 RH9 Flight back from Midas hearing (3.5). 3.50 4,602.50

SUBTOTAL 3.50 4,602.50

**xiv Plan and Disclosure Statement**09/01/25 AJ4 Research 11 U.S.C. 726 application  
regarding contingent claims (2.0). 2.00 3,220.0009/02/25 LMW Emails with the Quinn Emanuel team  
re: updates to amended plan (.6). 0.60 999.0009/02/25 PT Prepare for and participate in  
conference call with S. Schultz, M.  
Hurley, D. Eaton, S. Wells, T.  
Schmeltz regarding plan negotiations  
(.7); participate in follow up call with  
T. Schmeltz, D. Eaton, S. Wells  
regarding plan formulation and  
strategy (.6); extensive review of  
warrant intercompany debt and  
correspondence/calls with M.  
Robinson regarding prior research  
(1.7). 3.00 5,835.0009/03/25 PT Prepare for and participate in  
conference call with M. Hurley, D.  
Proman, S. Schultz, C. Wheeler, M.  
Robinson regarding tax effects of  
plan structures (.9); conference call  
with B. Funk, T. Fleming, M. Fox  
regarding plan structures and  
waterfall analysis (.8); review prior  
research on Black Scholes  
intercompany claim and correspond  
with M. Robinson regarding same  
(.3); conference with M. Robinson 2.20 4,279.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 25

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

		regarding resolution of various plan issues (.2).		
09/04/25	LMW	Emails with Quinn Emanuel team re: tax allocation issues (.4).	0.40	666.00
09/05/25	PT	Plan status call with M. Fox, B. Funk, T. Schmeltz and C. Potter (.8).	0.80	1,556.00
09/08/25	PT	Correspondence with T. Schmeltz and M. Robinson regarding negotiation update (.2); plan negotiation update call with T. Schmeltz, B. Funk, M. Fox, C. Potter (.6); preparation call with T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson, C. Topping, D. Eaton, S. Wells (.8); prepare for and attend status conference on confirmation schedule (.9); follow up conference with M. Robinson (.6).	3.10	6,029.50
09/09/25	PT	Plan negotiation update call with T. Schmeltz, C. Topping, K. Matsoukas (.9).	0.90	1,750.50
09/11/25	LMW	Call with Quinn Emanuel team re: revised plan and disclosure statement (.6); emails to B. Roth re: same (1.4); call with B. Roth re: plan revisions (.4); review and revise same (2.9); prepare the update to the disclosure statement (1.2).	6.50	10,822.50
09/11/25	PT	Emails regarding plan structure (.4).	0.40	778.00
09/11/25	BR4	Emails regarding plan structure (.4).	0.40	644.00
09/12/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in conference call with C. Wheeler, C. Blackmon, R. Staff, S. Thomas, A. Popescu, M. Robinson regarding tax waterfall and projections for revised plan terms (1.1).	1.10	2,139.50
09/12/25	BR4	Emails regarding plan structure (.2); review plan (.6).	0.80	1,288.00
09/12/25	RI	Review filings and emails regarding the plan (.4).	0.50	832.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

October 23, 2025

Page 26

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

09/12/25	LMW	Review and revise the amended plan and disclosure statement (4.7).	4.70	7,825.50
09/13/25	LMW	Review and revise the plan and disclosure statement (5.2); emails to B. Roth re: same (.4).	5.60	9,324.00
09/14/25	BR4	Review and revise the Plan (3.0).	3.00	4,830.00
09/14/25	LMW	Review and revise the plan (8.2); emails to the Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.4); emails to B. Roth re: updates on appeals and claim objections (.3); emails to P. Tomasco re: Transcend party treatment (.3).	9.20	15,318.00
09/15/25	PT	Correspondence regarding the plan terms for interest on unsecured claims with T. Schmeltz (.2); review cases on interest on unsecured claims and correspond with R. Izakelian regarding same (.4); review and revise the updated plan draft (.9); correspond with T. Schmeltz, D. Dunn, D. Eaton, M. Robinson regarding the updated draft plan (.5); telephone conference with M. Robinson (.5).	2.50	4,862.50
09/15/25	BR4	Call with L. Weber regarding the plan (0.2); review the plan and emails regarding same (.5).	0.50	805.00
09/15/25	LMW	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team re: amended plan (.7); review and revise same (4.4).	5.10	8,491.50
09/16/25	RI	Conference with P. Tomasco and L. Weber regarding the plan (.5).	0.50	832.50
09/16/25	PT	Coordinate plan updates based on current negotiations and analysis of required changes (1.1); correspond with C. Topping regarding plan exhibits (.2).	1.30	2,528.50
09/16/25	LMW	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team re: plan amendments (.5); legal	2.20	3,663.00



# quinn emanuel trial lawyers

October 23, 2025  
Page 28

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

participate in conference call with K. Hays and C. Wheeler regarding tax allocation valuation issues and coordination (.8).

09/11/25	PT	Conference call with C. Wheeler and K. Hays regarding tax allocation (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
SUBTOTAL			5.00	9,725.00

### Fee Summary

Attorneys	Init.	Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Patty Tomasco	PT	Partner	83.40	1,945.00	162,213.00
Razmig Izakelian	RI	Associate	7.80	1,665.00	12,987.00
Lindsay M. Weber	LMW	Associate	63.90	1,665.00	106,393.50
Alain Jaquet	AJ4	Associate	41.80	1,610.00	67,298.00
Ben Roth	BR4	Associate	13.90	1,610.00	22,379.00
Rachel Harrington	RH9	Associate	102.10	1,315.00	134,261.50
Nqulelwa Maseti	NM7	Associate	30.20	1,165.00	35,183.00
Case Assistants	Init.	Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
Barbara J Howell	BH2	Paralegal	30.30	655.00	19,846.50

### Expense Summary

Description	Amount
Meals during travel	30.74
Express mail	44.42
Filing fee(s)	298.00
Hearing transcript(s)	155.15
Online Research	0.00
Document Reproduction	584.10
Travel	205.04
Color Document Reproduction	10.25
Word processing	0.00
Hotel	979.46

# quinn emanuel trial lawyers

October 23, 2025

Page 29

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000198906

Description	Amount
Velobind	21.21
Air travel	553.48
Local meals	187.35
Document Services	5,112.55
Tabs	33.75
 <b><u>Litigation Support Costs</u></b>	
RelOne User Fee	0.00
RelOne Repository Hosting (Per GB)	1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting (Per GB)	4,305.29
Total Expenses	\$13,999.93

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:  RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	§ § § § § § §	Chapter 11  Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)  (Jointly Administered)
--	---------------------------------	---

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S  
FOURTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD  
OCTOBER 1, 2025, THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2025**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) submits, pursuant to the Order Granting the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (ECF No. 264) entered on October 14, 2024, this monthly fee statement for the payment of interim compensation rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the period October 1, 2025, through October 31, 2025 (the “Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement”).

Quinn Emanuel seeks payment of interim compensation in the total amount of \$418,897.20 (80% of the services rendered), plus \$9,185.30 (100% of the interim expenses incurred). Summaries of the fees and expenses are in Exhibits A, B, and C. An invoice reflecting detailed time entries is attached hereto as Exhibit D.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party objecting to the payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses shall serve within 14 days after service of the Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement a written notice, via email, upon Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties (as listed below) (the “Written Notice”). The Written Notice shall specifically identify the objectionable fees and expenses, including the amount at issue and the basis for the objection. If the parties are unable to reach a resolution of the objection within 14 calendar days, the objecting party shall file its objection (the “Objection”) with this Court within 3 business days and serve such Objection on Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties. *See* Interim Compensation Order, ¶ 1(a)(c).

The Fee Notice Parties as defined in the Interim Compensation Order are:

- i. Rhodium Enterprises, Inc., Attn: Charles Topping ([chucktopping@rhdm.com](mailto:chucktopping@rhdm.com)) and Morgan Soule ([morgansoule@rhdm.com](mailto:morgansoule@rhdm.com)), 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, Texas 77005;
- ii. Debtors’ Bankruptcy Counsel, c/o Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco ([pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)); Razmig Izakelian ([razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)), and Alain Jaquet ([alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)), 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002;
- iii. Debtors’ Financial Advisor, c/o Province, Attn: Mark Robinson ([mrobinson@provincefirm.com](mailto:mrobinson@provincefirm.com)); David Dunn ([ddunn@provincefirm.com](mailto:ddunn@provincefirm.com)); Kirsten Lee ([klee@province.com](mailto:klee@province.com)); and Andrew Popescu ([apopescu@provincefirm.com](mailto:apopescu@provincefirm.com)), 2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340, Henderson, Nevada 89074;
- iv. Galaxy Digital, LLC, in its capacity as DIP Agent, c/o Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, Ryan C. Wooten ([rwooten@orrick.com](mailto:rwooten@orrick.com)), 609 Main, 40<sup>th</sup> Floor, Houston, Texas 77002, and Robert Trust ([rtrust@orrick.com](mailto:rtrust@orrick.com)), Mark Franke ([mfranke@orrick.com](mailto:mfranke@orrick.com)) and Brandon Batzel ([bbatzel@orrick.com](mailto:bbatzel@orrick.com)), 51 West 52<sup>nd</sup> Street, New York, New York 10019;
- v. Counsel for the Committee of Unsecured Creditors, c/o McDermott Will & Emery LLP, 2501 North Harwood St., Suite 1900, Dallas, Texas 75201, Attn: Charles R. Gibbs ([crgibbs@mwe.com](mailto:crgibbs@mwe.com)); and

- vi. United States Trustee, Ha Minh Nguyen ([ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov](mailto:ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov)), 515 Rusk, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002.

If no objection is timely served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay Quinn Emanuel an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses listed herein, or if an objection is timely served, such percentage of fees and expenses that are not subject to an objection, as stated in the Interim Compensation Order.

Respectfully submitted this 14th day of November, 2025.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)  
Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)  
Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)  
Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)  
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900  
Houston, Texas 77002  
Telephone: 713-221-7000  
Facsimile: 713-221-7100  
Email: [pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com)

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)  
Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)  
Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)  
865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017  
Telephone: 213-443-3000  
Facsimile: 213-443-3100  
Email: [ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [benroth@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:benroth@quinnemanuel.com)

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A****Summary of Legal Fees for the Fee Period**

Matter Number	Matter Description	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Requested	Total Fees With 20% Discount
i	Asset Analysis/Recovery	.3	\$583.50	\$466.80
ii	Asset Disposition	11.0	\$15,848.00	\$12,678.40
v	Business Operations	.1	\$194.50	\$155.60
vi	Case Administration	47.1	\$65,389.50	\$52,311.60
vii	Claims Administration and Objections	74.6	\$104,891.0	\$83,912.80
viii	Corporate Governance and Board Matters	4.2	\$7,497.00	\$5,997.60
ix	Employee Benefits and Pensions	11.5	\$19,147.50	\$15,318.00
x	Employment and Fee Applications	18.2	\$19,507.00	\$15,605.60
xi	Financing/Cash Collateral	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xii	Litigation	11.1	\$21,388.50	\$17,110.80
xiii	Non-working Travel <sup>2</sup>	9.4	\$8,245.50	\$6,596.40
xiv	Plan and Disclosure Statement	171.7	\$260,929.50	\$208,743.60
xv	Relief from the Stay	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xvi	Tax	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Total	359.2	\$523,621.50	\$418,897.20

<sup>2</sup> Non-working travel is billed at 50%--\$16,491.00/2=\$8,245.50.

**EXHIBIT B****Summary of Hours Billed by Quinn Emanuel Attorneys and Paraprofessionals<sup>3</sup>**

Professional	Position With The Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Patricia B. Tomasco	Partner	1988	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,945.00	91.7	\$178,356.50
Razmig Izakelian	Associate	2013	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	22.4	\$37,296.00
Lindsay Weber	Associate	2008	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	76.6	\$127,539.00
Ben Roth	Associate	2019	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	18.9	\$30,429.00
Alain Jaquet	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	52.5	\$84,525.00
Rachel Harrington	Associate	2024	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,315.00	7.9	\$10,388.50
Nqulelwa Maseti	Associate	2025	Intellectual Property Litigation	\$1,165.00	5.4	\$6,291.00
Emily Moore	Law Clerk			\$710.00	11.6	\$8,236.00
Barbara J. Howell	Paralegal		Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$655.00	70.7	\$46,308.50
Total					359.2	\$531,867.00

---

<sup>3</sup> Travel reflected at 100%.

**EXHIBIT C****Summary of Expenses for the Fee Period**

Expense	Amount
Express mail	\$44.61
Filing Fees	\$136.00
Hearing Transcripts	\$321.90
Document Reproduction (\$.10 per copy)	\$4.40
Hotel	\$1,646.52
Courier	\$15.68
Velobind	\$3.03
Local Business Travel	\$92.41
Out-of-town Travel	\$250.53
Air Travel	\$611.96
Document Services	\$270.08
Tabs	\$3.75
RelOne Repository Hosting	\$1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting	\$4,305.29
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$9,185.30</b>

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017

November 13, 2025

Cameron Blackmon  
Rhodium Enterprises, Inc.  
4146 W US Highway 79  
Rockdale, TX 76567

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000199491  
Responsible Attorney: Patty Tomasco

Rhodium- restructure of company

For Professional Services through October 31, 2025 in connection with a potential restructuring of this crypto mining company.

Fees	\$531,867.00
50% Non-Working Travel Discount	<u>-\$8,245.50</u>
Net Billed Fees	\$523,621.50
Expenses	<u>\$9,185.30</u>
Net Amount	\$532,806.80
Total Due This Invoice	\$532,806.80
Balance Due from Previous Statement(s)	\$3,017,744.32
Total Balance Due	<u>\$3,550,551.12</u>

**Confidential – May include attorney-client privileged and work-product information**

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 2

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

**Statement Detail****i Asset Analysis and Recover**

10/02/25	PT	Coordinate finalization of 3 Way counteroffer with A. Jaquet (.3).	0.30	583.50
		SUBTOTAL	0.30	583.50

**ii Asset Disposition**

10/08/25	PT	Correspondence with M. Moore regarding physical property valuation data (.2); attend call with S. Lockhart re Rhodium Tax Allocation update (.8).	1.00	1,945.00
10/15/25	BH2	Revise the Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement and proposed order (2.1).	2.10	1,375.50
10/15/25	PT	Review and comment on tax allocation motion (.2).	0.20	389.00
10/16/25	PT	Update email regarding status of tax allocation with Whinstone (.3).	0.30	583.50
10/17/25	PT	Participate in purchase price allocation call with P. Lohse, T. Schmeltz, C. Wheeler, M. Robinson, A. Popescu, and K. Hays (.6); coordinate conforming revisions to purchase price allocation motion (.2).	0.80	1,556.00
10/17/25	BH2	Revise the Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement pursuant to Ms. Tomasco's request (.8).	0.80	524.00
10/19/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call to discuss allocation for tax purposes with P. Lohse, T. Schmeltz; S. Wells, D. Eaton, C. Topping, M. Robinson (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
10/20/25	PT	Review and revise motion to enforce the purchase and sale agreement (.6)	0.70	1,361.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 3

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

		and circulate to the special committee for comment (.1).		
10/28/25	PT	Review and extensive revision to motion to enforce the purchase and sale agreement to correspond with defined terms in agreement and order (1.1); correspond with P. Lohse regarding same (.1); second set of revisions and redlines to circulate to plan parties with comments (.8); coordinate finalization and filing of motion to enforce purchase and sale agreement (.4).	2.40	4,668.00
10/28/25	BH2	Finalize the Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement with Whinstone (1.1) and file same (.3).	1.40	917.00
10/29/25	PT	Review de minimis sale order and coordinate draft report of equipment auction (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
		SUBTOTAL	11.00	15,848.00

**ix Employee Benefits and Pensions**

10/01/25	LMW	Emails with counsel re: severance agreements (.6).	0.60	999.00
10/08/25	LMW	Emails to the Quinn Emanuel team re: severance payments (.5).	0.50	832.50
10/20/25	LMW	Call with A. Chiarello re: severance agreement (.4); review of filed claim re: same (.7).	1.10	1,831.50
10/21/25	LMW	Review proposal re: C. Zoeren severance (.4); emails to Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.2); review and revise severance schedule (.7); call with A. Catatao re: same (.9); emails to the Quinn Emanuel team re: updated schedule (.2).	2.40	3,996.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 4

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/22/25	LMW	Emails to P. Tomasco re: severance payments (.3); emails to S. Schultz re: same (.3).	0.60	999.00
10/23/25	LMW	Emails to S. Schultz re: employee compensation (.4); review and revise schedule re: same (.6).	1.00	1,665.00
10/24/25	LMW	Review and revise the severance schedule (.4); emails to the Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.2).	0.60	999.00
10/27/25	LMW	Emails with SAFE Group re: severance payments (.6); call with SAFE Group re: same (.5); update confirmation brief (3.6).	4.70	7,825.50
		SUBTOTAL	11.50	19,147.50

**v Business Operations**

10/23/25	PT	Respond to Ft. Stockton inquiry and coordinate with C. Blackmon (.1).	0.10	194.50
		SUBTOTAL	0.10	194.50

**vi Case Administration**

10/01/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in the daily call with A. Jacquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington and R. Izakelian (.4); correspond with C. Topping regarding court scheduling issues (.1).	0.60	1,167.00
10/01/25	NM7	Prepare for (.1) and participate in the Team conference meeting (0.4).	0.50	582.50
10/01/25	LMW	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team re: case updates (.4).	0.40	666.00
10/01/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.3) and update files to current status (.3).	0.60	393.00
10/02/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (0.5).	0.50	582.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 5

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/02/25	PT	Prepare for (.5) and attend status and scheduling conference on all pending matters with M. Soule, C. Topping, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, G. Pusavat, E. Winston, D. Holzman, L. Santos-Bishop, L. Maseti, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian (.5).	1.00	1,945.00
10/02/25	PT	Participate in the daily call with M. Robinson, Andrew Popescu, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, D. Holzman, E. Winston, G. Pusavat, L. Santos-Bishop, L. Maseti, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/02/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/02/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, M. Robinson et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/03/25	BH2	Review the Pacer docket for new filings (.5) and update files to the current status, including calendaring deadlines and hearing dates (.5).	1.00	655.00
10/06/25	AJ4	Attend a telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/06/25	NM7	Prepare for (.3) and attend the Team conference call (0.5).	0.80	932.00
10/06/25	LMW	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team re: case status (.5).	0.50	832.50
10/06/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/06/25	PT	Participate in call with A. Jaquet, B. Roth, G. Pusavat, E. Winston, D. Holzman, L. Santos-Bishop, L. Maseti, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 6

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/06/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.4) and download recently filed documents for attorneys' review (.3).	0.70	458.50
10/07/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/07/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/07/25	PT	Participate in the daily team call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian (.50).	0.50	972.50
10/07/25	LMW	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team re: case updates (.5).	0.50	832.50
10/08/25	NM7	Team conference call (0.5).	0.50	582.50
10/08/25	PT	Participate in a call with A. Jacquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian regarding strategy (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/08/25	BH2	Review Rhodium Pacer docket (.3) and update the files to the current status (.3).	0.60	393.00
10/09/25	BH2	Review (.5) and file numerous amended schedules in the Rhodium bankruptcy case (.9).	1.40	917.00
10/10/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/10/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/10/25	PT	Participate in the coordination and strategy call A. Jacquet, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/13/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/13/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (0.5).	0.50	582.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 7

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/13/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference call with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/13/25	LMW	Call with Quinn Emanuel team re: case updates (.5).	0.50	832.50
10/13/25	PT	Participate in a strategy call with A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (5).	0.50	972.50
10/13/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/14/25	RI	Conference call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/14/25	PT	Participate in the planning call with Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jacquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/14/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/14/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket and download recently filed pleadings (.4) and forward to the attorneys and the Client for review (.3).	0.70	458.50
10/15/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (0.4).	0.40	466.00
10/15/25	AJ4	Attend part of the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/15/25	BH2	Compare the hearing transcripts on file with the Court with the hearing transcripts in the Quinn Emanuel files (.5) and complete Transcript Order Forms to obtain missing transcripts (.6); file the Transcript Order Forms with the Court (.4).	1.50	982.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 8

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/16/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel and Province teams regarding case updates (0.6).	0.60	966.00
10/16/25	PT	Participate in coordination call with Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
10/20/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference call with P. Tomasco, R. Harrington et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/20/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in the planning and strategy call with A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (.5).	0.60	1,167.00
10/20/25	BR4	Prepare for (0.2) and conference call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates and disclosure statement hearing (0.5); call with R. Izakelian regarding research (0.2).	0.90	1,449.00
10/21/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel, Province and Barnes & Thornburg teams regarding case updates (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/21/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, A. Popescu et al. In connection with case status and next steps (0.4).	0.50	805.00
10/21/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and participate in the planning and strategy call with Barnes and Thornburg attorneys, Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington and R. Izakelian (.4).	0.60	1,167.00
10/21/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.5) and update files to current status for attorneys' review (.5).	1.00	655.00
10/22/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.3).	0.30	483.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 9

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/22/25	PT	Strategy call with A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Izakelian (.3).	0.30	583.50
10/22/25	BH2	File the 19 monthly operating reports (one for each company) (.9); download the file-stamped operating reports for attorneys' review (.5).	1.40	917.00
10/23/25	BR4	Prepare for (.2) and attend the call with Quinn Emanuel Province and Barnes & Thornburg teams regarding case updates (0.5); emails regarding same (0.3).	1.00	1,610.00
10/23/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in the strategy call with Barnes & Thornburg team, Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, and R. Izakelian (.5).	0.60	1,167.00
10/23/25	LMW	Call with QE team re: case updates (.5).	0.50	832.50
10/23/25	RI	Prepare for (.3) and attend the conference call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.80	1,332.00
10/23/25	BH2	Email communications with P. Lohse regarding hearing transcripts in Rhodium (.2); review Pacer docket for the status of the hearing transcripts of the October hearings (.2).	0.40	262.00
10/24/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/24/25	PT	Participate in the coordination call A. Jaquet, L. Weber, and R. Izakelian; L. Maseti (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/24/25	BH2	Receive numerous hearing transcripts in Rhodium and forward same to the Client, attorneys at Barnes & Thornburg, and Quinn Emanuel attorneys (.4).	0.40	262.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 10

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/24/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/24/25	BH2	Review the Pacer docket (.2) and download recently filed documents (.3); calendar deadlines (.2).	0.70	458.50
10/27/25	PT	Planning call with B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/27/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (0.5).	0.50	582.50
10/27/25	RI	Conference call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.50	832.50
10/27/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/28/25	NM7	Prepare for (.2) and participate in the Team conference meeting (0.5).	0.70	815.50
10/28/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in a call with Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, and the Barnes & Thornburg team to coordinate projects and confirmation preparation (.5).	0.60	1,167.00
10/28/25	RI	Prepare for (.3) and attend conference call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.5).	0.80	1,332.00
10/28/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, M. Robinson et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/29/25	BR4	Emails regarding case scheduling (0.1).	0.10	161.00
10/29/25	PT	Address invoice issues with K. Lee regarding housekeeping for Twins facility and review sale orders (.2).	0.20	389.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 11

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/29/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.8) and update files for attorneys' review (.8); calendar hearing dates and deadlines (.4).	2.00	1,310.00
10/30/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel, Province and Barnes & Thornburg teams regarding case updates (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/30/25	PT	Participate in planning call with Michael Robinson, the Barnes & Thornburg team, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (.4).	0.40	778.00
10/31/25	BR4	Prepare for (.2) and attend call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.4).	0.60	966.00
10/31/25	EM	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian, and A. Jaquet in connection with case management and strategy (.4).	0.40	284.00
10/31/25	PT	Participate in an internal planning call with A. Jaquet, B. Roth, L. Weber, R. Harrington, and R. Izakelian (.4).	0.40	778.00
10/31/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, E. Moore, and L. Maseti in connection with case status and next steps (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/31/25	NM7	Team conference meeting (0.4).	0.40	466.00
		SUBTOTAL	47.10	65,389.50

**vii Claims Administration and Objections**

10/01/25	PT	Review status of Temple Green claim objection and adversary complaint and examine facts and issues related to same (1.9).	1.90	3,695.50
10/02/25	AJ4	Correspond with C. Toppings and M. Robinson regarding the second omnibus claim objection (0.2).	0.20	322.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 12

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/03/25	RH9	Implement comments to claim objection (.6).	0.60	789.00
10/03/25	PT	Review and coordinate the response to the special committee's comments to the second omnibus claim objection (.4).	0.40	778.00
10/05/25	RH9	Draft the post-trial brief for the Midas claim objection (2.5).	2.50	3,287.50
10/06/25	AJ4	Review and revise the memorandum regarding the claims and related objections (1.2); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.3).	1.50	2,415.00
10/06/25	RH9	Draft the post-trial brief for the Midas claim objection (2.3).	2.30	3,024.50
10/06/25	PT	Correspondence with R. Harrington regarding the Midas Green filing (.2); correspondence with A. Jaquet regarding Temple Green claim objection (.3); coordinate with V. O'Connell regarding the status of the claim objection (.2); correspondence with C. Topping regarding the objection to Temple Green's claim (.3); review and edit post-hearing brief and coordinate with R. Harrington and E. Brannen (.9).	1.90	3,695.50
10/07/25	AJ4	Correspond with G. Pusavat regarding the objection to Temple Green's claim (0.3).	0.30	483.00
10/07/25	AJ4	Correspond with R. Izakelian regarding the second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (0.2).	0.20	322.00
10/07/25	LMW	Emails with the Quinn Emanuel team re: Fairbairn claim objection (.4).	0.40	666.00
10/07/25	PT	Review and edit the post-hearing submission regarding Midas Green claim objection (.9).	0.90	1,750.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 13

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/08/25	BR4	Emails regarding claim objections (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/08/25	GSP	Review Proof of claim (0.5); prepare arguments for objections re same (1.0).	1.50	2,497.50
10/08/25	AJ4	Correspond with P. Tomasco and R. Izakelian regarding the finalization of the second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other non-substantive claims (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/08/25	PT	Review, analyze and comment on the Barnes & Thornburg/Akin Gump changes to the Transcend claim objection (1.2); review and revise the revised motions for sanctions against Midas Green (.3); correspondence with C. Topping regarding revisions to Transcend claim objections (.2); correspond with C. Underwood regarding the filing deadlines for filing the objections to claim and limitation on the revisions (.7); review and revise the post-hearing brief on the Midas claims and coordinate filing of same (.9); multiple correspondence with T. Schmeltz regarding proposed changes to objection to claims and need for preservation (1.1).	4.40	8,558.00
10/08/25	BH2	Finalize (.9) and file the Motion for Sanctions against Midas Green (.3); work with attorneys to finalize the post-hearing brief in support of the objection to claims filed by Midas Green (1.2) and file same (.3).	2.70	1,768.50
10/09/25	NM7	Review the second group claim objection (0.6).	0.60	699.00
10/09/25	RH9	Proof and finalize the claim objection (.8).	0.80	1,052.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 14

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/09/25	AJ4	Finalize (9.0) and coordinate the filing of the second omnibus objection regarding satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (.3).	9.30	14,973.00
10/09/25	PT	Participate in a discussion regarding the claim objection with A. Jaquet, T. Schmeltz, E. Eaton, S. Wells, C. Underwood, C. Blackmon, M. Robinson, R. Izakelian, R. Harrington, C. Topping, M. Soule (.9); participate in secondary discussion re Claim Objection with C. Topping, A. Jaquet, M. Soule, C. Blackmon (.4); follow up conference with T. Schmeltz regarding additional edits to statute of limitations and dictate additional edits to claim objection (.5); coordinate finalization, filing and service of second omnibus claim objection (.3).	2.10	4,084.50
10/09/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to finalize (4.4) and file the omnibus claim objection (.4).	4.80	3,144.00
10/14/25	RH9	Revise sanctions motion (1.5); draft order (.2).	1.70	2,235.50
10/14/25	PT	Review, revise, and coordinate filing of revised motions for sanctions against Temple Green (.3).	0.30	583.50
10/27/25	BR4	Research and emails regarding claim objection (1.3).	1.30	2,093.00
10/28/25	BR4	Call with Moore regarding claim objection research (0.2).	0.20	322.00
10/28/25	EM	Prepare memorandum re: breach of contract claims under the Temple Lease (1.4).	1.40	994.00
10/28/25	LMW	Prepare for and attend Cohn deposition (9.6).	9.60	15,984.00



**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 16

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/01/25	PT	Review and revise the fee application and twelfth monthly statement (.9).	0.90	1,750.50
10/01/25	BH2	Email communications with P. Tomasco regarding fee applications and monthly fee statements (.4).	0.40	262.00
10/02/25	PT	Coordinate updated retention agreement with K. Williams with C. Topping and M. Soule (.2).	0.20	389.00
10/02/25	PT	Prepare for and attend the hearing on Lehotsky Keller Cohn's fee application (1.).	1.00	1,945.00
10/07/25	PT	Review the application to retain a real estate broker to sell and manage Twins facility and related communications (.40).	0.40	778.00
10/10/25	BH2	Begin to prepare the September monthly fee statement (5.5).	5.50	3,602.50
10/14/25	PT	Review the Keller Williams retention application (.4).	0.40	778.00
10/15/25	PT	Incorporate C. Topping's comments to the retention of Keller Williams and coordinate filing of same (.4).	0.40	778.00
10/16/25	BH2	Revise the Application to Retain Keller Williams to incorporate P. Tomasco's comments (.7) and forward to P. Tomasco for her review (.1).	0.80	524.00
10/20/25	PT	Coordinate finalization of Keller Williams retention pleadings (.1).	0.10	194.50
10/20/25	BH2	Finalize the Application to Retain Keller Williams Realty and the proposed order to incorporate the comments of P. Tomasco (.7); file same (.3).	1.00	655.00
10/21/25	PT	Detailed response to inquiry from S. Schultz regarding selection of real estate broker (.4).	0.40	778.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 17

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/27/25	PT	Coordinate fee applications and requests with B. Howell (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
10/27/25	BH2	Review Transcend's Objection to Quinn Emanuel's Third Interim Fee Application (.4).	0.40	262.00
10/28/25	BH2	Draft a Notice of Hearing re Quinn Emanuel's Third Interim Fee Application (.6) and file same (.3).	0.90	589.50
10/29/25	AJ4	Attend depositions of D. Eaton and C. Toppings in relation to Lehotsky Keller Cohn's fee dispute (2.0).	2.00	3,220.00
10/29/25	BH2	Draft Quinn Emanuel's Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement (1.5) and file same (.3); revise the Monthly Fee Statement of Stris & Maher (.2); and file the Monthly Statement and Stris's quarterly fee application (.3).	2.30	1,506.50
10/30/25	BH2	File Barnes & Thornburg's Monthly Fee Statement (.3); serve Quinn Emanuel's monthly fee statement to the parties listed on the Interim Compensation Order (.2).	0.50	327.50
		SUBTOTAL	18.20	19,507.00

**xii Litigation**

10/06/25	PT	Review special committee filing and outline of issues needing correction (.2).	0.20	389.00
10/13/25	PT	Review the cross notice of deposition by Lehotsky Keller Cohn (.2); coordinate draft motion to quash with A. Jaquet (.1); review and extensive revisions to the motion to quash (1.2); telephone conference with T. Schmeltz regarding the deposition notice (.2); finalize and coordinate the filing of the motion to quash deposition cross notice (.6);	2.40	4,668.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 18

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

		review and comment on the proposed clean-up bid for Twins site (.1).		
10/25/25	PT	Prepare for and attend deposition preparation for C. Topping and C. Wheeler (1.4).	1.40	2,723.00
10/27/25	PT	Coordinate deposition coverage and issues with L. Weber in Lehotsky Cohn Keller dispute (.2); correspond with T. Schmeltz regarding discovery clawbacks (.5); correspond with P. Lohse regarding privileged communications (.3).	1.00	1,945.00
10/29/25	AJ4	Research 11 U.S.C. 502(d) and correspond with P. Tomasco in connection with the same (0.6).	0.60	966.00
10/30/25	PT	Initial deposition preparation with Michael Robinson, A. Popescu, L. Weber (4.9).	4.90	9,530.50
10/30/25	PT	Attend hearing on Emergency Motion of Special Committee Entry of Protective Order and Special Committee Emergency Motion to Seal and update P. Mandarino regarding status of testimony (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
		SUBTOTAL	11.10	21,388.50

**xiii Non-working Travel**

10/15/25	LMW	Travel to Houston for the disclosure statement hearing (2.8).	2.80	4,662.00
10/16/25	LMW	Travel from Houston to New York for the hearing on the disclosure statement (3.1).	3.60	5,994.00
10/31/25	PT	Travel to Houston (3.0).	3.00	5,835.00
		SUBTOTAL	9.40	16,491.00

**xiv Plan and Disclosure Statement**

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 19

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/01/25	LMW	Prepare updates to the disclosure motion (1.3).	1.30	2,164.50
10/01/25	PT	Compile data for email to S. Lockhart and M. Moore and draft email explaining data and relevance to tax allocation process (.9); coordinate with associate team to draft discovery related to potential dispute (.1); follow up email with S. Lockhart and M. Moore (.2).	1.20	2,334.00
10/02/25	LMW	Emails with R. Izakelian re: updates to plan and disclosure statement (.3); review and revise motion re: approval of same (1.8).	2.10	3,496.50
10/02/25	BH2	Calendar deadlines and hearing dates announced during the October 2nd hearing re approval of the disclosure statement and confirmation (.4).	0.40	262.00
10/02/25	BR4	Emails regarding plan updates and case status (0.5).	0.50	805.00
10/03/25	LMW	Review and revise the plan and disclosure statement based on recent communications with settling parties (3.2).	3.20	5,328.00
10/03/25	PT	Update C. Topping and T. Schmeltz regarding negotiations with Riot regarding tax allocation (.1).	0.10	194.50
10/06/25	AJ4	Correspond with B. Roth regarding the plan and the plan support agreement (0.2); review related documents (0.2).	0.40	644.00
10/06/25	LMW	Review and revise the disclosure statement motion for approval (3.1); calls with R. Izakelian and B. Roth re: same (.7).	3.80	6,327.00
10/06/25	BR4	Review and revise the solicitation procedures motion and materials (6.0); emails regarding same (0.1).	6.10	9,821.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 20

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/06/25	PT	Review and analyze the plan support agreement and analysis of potential issues (1.6).	1.60	3,112.00
10/06/25	RI	Review and revise the disclosure statement and motion to approve the disclosure statement (2.7).	2.70	4,495.50
10/07/25	LMW	Review the updated plan and disclosure statement terms (1.2).	1.20	1,998.00
10/07/25	PT	Participate in a conference call with C. Underwood, K. Kansa, T. Schmeltz, D. Eaton, S. Wells, M. Robinson, D. Dunn, S. Schultz, M. Hurley to discuss the plan and disclosure statement (.8); review and analyze the plan term sheet and plan with comments on same to drafting team (1.1); multiple emails regarding plan support agreement tasks, updating schedules and other implementation items needed and coordination of same (2.1); inquiries regarding status of plan and disclosure statement (.2); coordinate finalization and filing of plan, disclosure statement and solicitation motion and multiple reviews and edits to same (2.9).	7.10	13,809.50
10/07/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to finalize the amended plan, disclosure statement, and emergency motion (6.8); file the amended plan, disclosure statement, and emergency motion (.6).	7.40	4,847.00
10/08/25	BR4	Emails regarding the plan and disclosure statement (1.2); review same (0.2).	1.40	2,254.00
10/08/25	PT	Review and analyze Transcend's proposed discovery related to the joint plan of liquidation (.3); correspondence regarding dates for depositions (.2); review and comment	0.90	1,750.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 21

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

		on proposal to amend schedules regarding SAFE claims (.4).		
10/09/25	PT	Prepare for and attend discovery conference with J. Echols, C. Potter, J. Iacuone, G. McAllister, J. Shepherd, A. Richardson, J. Okifor, M. Hurley, R. Shannon, T. Schmeltz, C. Underwood, S. Schultz, R. Mates, S. Lemmon, K. Lee, M. Fox, T. Fleming, C. Kunz, J. Brookner, A. Carson, B. Funk, C. Gibbs (.9); follow up conference with E. Winston regarding proposed deposition (.2); review and comment on proposed confirmation discovery plan (.2); review proposed schedule revisions and comment to A. Popescu regarding same (.6).	1.90	3,695.50
10/11/25	PT	Conference with T. Schmeltz regarding plan discovery (.1); conference with D. Eaton regarding plan discovery (.3); correspondence with C. Potter regarding deposition scheduling (.2).	0.60	1,167.00
10/13/25	LMW	Legal research re: depositions involving privilege (3.3); emails to A. Jaquet re: same (.3).	3.60	5,994.00
10/13/25	AJ4	Prepare motion to quash regarding notices of deposition of P. Tomasco (5.5); correspond with P. Tomasco and R. Izakelian regarding the same (0.2).	5.70	9,177.00
10/13/25	BH2	Finalize (.4) and file the Emergency Motion to Quash the Notice of Deposition of Patricia B. Tomasco (.3).	0.70	458.50
10/14/25	PT	Coordinate drafting and filing of the witness list and revisions to same for conditional approval hearing (.4); review and analysis of the objection to the conditional disclosure statement (.4); review and revise the	5.60	10,892.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 22

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

		disclosure statement to address additional information needs and circulate to drafting team (2.2); coordinate additional meet and confer with C. Potter and other plan proponents (.2); review and revise the objection to the motion to compel and email explaining changes (.9); coordinate additional changes to the disclosure statement and additions to reflect new information (.4); review and additional corrections to the updated disclosure statement and circulate to plan proponents (.8); telephone conference with M. Robinson regarding additional delay requests (.3).		
10/14/25	PT	Participate in a discovery call with C. Potter, N. Allard, R. Mates, M. Hurley, T. Schmeltz, R.J. Shannon, S. Schultz, C. Underwood (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/14/25	PT	Participate in hearing strategy call with S. Schultz, T. Schmeltz, K. Matsoukas, M. Hurley and follow up email summarizing allocation of arguments (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
10/14/25	LMW	Review and revise the disclosure statement for amended plan (3.7); emails to Quinn Emanuel team re: same (.2); prepare schedule re: LTIP claims (.6).	4.50	7,492.50
10/14/25	BH2	Draft a Notice of Hearing for the Emergency Motion to Quash the Deposition of Patricia Tomasco (.5) and file same (.3); draft a witness and exhibit list for the October 15th hearing (.4) and file same (.3); work with attorneys to prepare for the October 15th hearing (5.0).	6.50	4,257.50
10/15/25	LMW	Attend hearing on the plan discovery (.5); review and revise same (2.6).	3.10	5,161.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 23

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/15/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.5); conference with Quinn Emanuel, Akin, and Barnes & Thornburg teams regarding the plan (0.5); conference with Quinn Emanuel, Akin, and Barnes teams and C. Potter regarding the plan (0.4).	1.40	2,331.00
10/15/25	PT	Update correspondence with the company regarding the status of negotiations with Whinstone and the proposed plan regarding same (.5).	0.50	972.50
10/15/25	BH2	Attend the 4:30 p.M. Hearing regarding discovery matters, deadlines, and confirmation deadlines (.5).	0.50	327.50
10/15/25	PT	Discovery conference with S. Lemmon and C. Potter (.6); multiple revisions and redlines of plan and disclosure statement and circulate updated documents; (.4); prepare for (.6) and attend hearing on emergency motions (plan discovery) (.5); follow up revisions to the disclosure statement order and solicitation materials and circulate updated documents to plan support parties (.8); correspondence with T. Laws regarding reset confirmation hearing (.1); review and comment on additions to liquidation analysis to show severance figures (.3).	3.30	6,418.50
10/15/25	PT	Participate in plan discovery and coordination call with T. Schmeltz, S. Schultz, R. Izakelian, K. Kansa, and C. Underwood (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
10/15/25	PT	Participate in call to finalize discovery plan with J. Echols, C. Potter, N. Allard, R. Mates, M. Hurley, T. Schmeltz, R.J. Shannon, S.	0.60	1,167.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 24

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

		Schultz, C. Underwood, S. Lemmon, K. Lee, E. Winston (.6).		
10/16/25	BR4	Respond to emails regarding the plan (0.6).	0.60	966.00
10/16/25	PT	Participate in planning and strategy call with C. Underwood, D. Dunn, K. Matsoukas, T. Schmeltz, K. Kansa, M. Robinson, C. Topping, S. Wells, D. Eaton (.5); locate word version of Conn's plan to use for release language and correspond regarding release language (.3).	0.80	1,556.00
10/16/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.8); review and revise the disclosure statement and liquidation analysis (1.4).	2.20	3,663.00
10/17/25	LMW	Review and revise the edits to the plan and disclosure statement (4.1); emails to Barnes & Thornburg re: same (.3).	4.40	7,326.00
10/17/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.2); call with L. Weber regarding same (0.2).	0.40	644.00
10/19/25	RI	Review and revise the disclosure statement and plan (1.8).	1.80	2,997.00
10/19/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to finalize and file the revised plan and disclosure statement (2.).	2.00	1,310.00
10/20/25	PT	Participate in call re hearing preparation with K. Kansa, T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson, and S. Schultz (.3); prepare for continued hearing on disclosure statement and review updated redlines compared to filed objections (1.6); prosecute hearing on approval of disclosure statement (.5); coordinate notices of redlines (.6).	3.00	5,835.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 25

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/20/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.7); conference with Quinn Emanuel, Barnes & Thornburg, and Akin teams regarding the plan (0.3); review and revise the solicitation materials (4.3).	5.30	8,824.50
10/20/25	BR4	Attend the virtual disclosure statement hearing (0.4).	0.40	644.00
10/20/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to revise the proposed order approving the disclosure statement (filed twice) and the amended disclosure statement (11.1); file all documents (.6).	11.70	7,663.50
10/21/25	PT	Correspond with A. Popescu regarding nonvoting status for claim pending objection (.2); review status of solicitation package mail-out tasks. (.4).	0.60	1,167.00
10/21/25	BR4	Draft disclosure exhibits (0.8).	0.80	1,288.00
10/21/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to prepare the solicitation package to send to Veritas (2.6).	2.60	1,703.00
10/21/25	RI	Conference with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.5); review and revise the plan and disclosure statement (3.4).	3.90	6,493.50
10/22/25	PT	Review the final solicitation version of the plan and disclosure statement and correspondence regarding additional changes (1.4).	1.40	2,723.00
10/22/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to prepare the solicitation versions of the plan and disclosure statement for service (2.1).	2.10	1,375.50
10/23/25	PT	Correspondence regarding various solicitation package inquiries (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
10/24/25	PT	Review prior confirmation testimony in preparation for witness preparation tasks (.8).	0.80	1,556.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 26

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/27/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a call regarding plan exhibits with S. Schultz, L. Weber (.4); outline topics for witness preparation and research outlines and transcripts (2.4).	2.80	5,446.00
10/27/25	AJ4	Prepare outline for preparation of M. Robinson' deposition in connection with plan confirmation (7.4).	7.40	11,914.00
10/28/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft outline for the preparation of M. Robison in connection with plan confirmation (7.8).	7.80	12,558.00
10/28/25	PT	Review and analysis of proposed 30(b)(6) topics and division between the special committee and the Debtor (.5); correspondence with the Barnes & Thornburg team regarding same (.3); correspond with A. Jaquet and L. Weber regarding witness preparation outlines and meetings (.2).	1.00	1,945.00
10/29/25	AJ4	Research application of privilege in connection with discovery (1.1); correspond with P. Tomasco in connection with the same (0.1).	1.20	1,932.00
10/29/25	LMW	Attend 30(b)(6) deposition (6.5); emails to A. Jaquet re: same (.2); emails to Quinn Emanuel team re: privilege designations (.6).	7.30	12,154.50
10/29/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a call regarding the Plan severance exhibit with S. Schultz, L. Weber (.4); draft proposed email to C. Potter and circulate to Barnes team (.6); review plan materials in preparation for discovery responses (2.6); review draft preparation outline and correspond with M. Robinson and A. Popescu regarding same (.7); finalize email to C. Potter regarding 30(b)(6) topics (.2).	4.50	8,752.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 27

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

10/29/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft outline for the deposition preparation of M. Robinson (5.9); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.2).	6.10	9,821.00
10/30/25	AJ4	Prepare for and attend the preparation of M. Robinson in connection with Debtors' 30(b)(6) deposition (2.7).	2.70	4,347.00
10/31/25	LMW	Review of emails re: plan updates (.3); emails to E. Moore re: confirmation brief (.5); review and revise same (1.3).	2.10	3,496.50
10/31/25	PT	Correspondence with C. Potter and plan support parties regarding discovery (.2); review requests for production and coordinate analysis and completion of same (.5).	0.70	1,361.50
10/31/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum regarding requests from Transcend Group (0.8); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding the same (0.1).	0.90	1,449.00
SUBTOTAL			171.70	260,929.50

**Fee Summary**

<b>Attorneys</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Patty Tomasco	PT	Partner	91.70	1,945.00	178,356.50
Razmig Izakelian	RI	Associate	22.40	1,665.00	37,296.00
Lindsay M. Weber	LMW	Associate	76.60	1,665.00	127,539.00
Grace Pusavat	GSP	Associate	1.50	1,665.00	2,497.50
Ben Roth	BR4	Associate	18.90	1,610.00	30,429.00
Alain Jaquet	AJ4	Associate	52.50	1,610.00	84,525.00
Rachel Harrington	RH9	Associate	7.90	1,315.00	10,388.50
Nqulelwa Maseti	NM7	Associate	5.40	1,165.00	6,291.00
Emily Moore	EM	Law Clerk	11.60	710.00	8,236.00
<b>Case Assistants</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Barbara J Howell	BH2	Paralegal	70.70	655.00	46,308.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

November 13, 2025

Page 28

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000199491

**Expense Summary**

Description	Amount
Express mail	44.61
Filing fee(s)	136.00
Hearing transcript(s)	321.90
Online Research (based on standard Westlaw or Lexis, without any applicable discount)	0.00
Local business travel	92.41
Document Reproduction 0.10	4.40
Word processing	0.00
Hotel	1,646.52
Courier	15.68
Velobind	3.03
Out-of-Town Travel	250.53
Air travel	611.96
PACER Services	0.00
Document Services	270.08
Tabs	3.75
<b><u>Litigation Support Costs</u></b>	
RelOne User Fee	0.00
RelOne Repository Hosting (Per GB)	1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting (Per GB)	4,305.29
<b>Total Expenses</b>	<b>\$9,185.30</b>

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	Chapter 11
	§	
RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>	§	Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)
	§	
Debtors.	§	
	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S  
FIFTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD  
NOVEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2025**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) submits, pursuant to the Order Granting the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (Docket No. 264) entered on October 14, 2024, this monthly fee statement for the payment of interim compensation rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the period November 1, 2025, through November 30, 2025 (the “Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement”).

Quinn Emanuel seeks payment of interim compensation in the total amount of \$466,888.00 (80% of the services rendered), plus \$8,329.22 (100% of the interim expenses incurred). Summaries of the fees and expenses are in Exhibits A, B, and C. An invoice reflecting detailed time entries is attached hereto as Exhibit D.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party objecting to the payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses shall serve within 14 days after service of the Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement a written notice, via email, upon Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties (as listed below) (the “Written Notice”). The Written Notice shall specifically identify the objectionable fees and expenses, including the amount at issue and the basis for the objection. If the parties are unable to reach a resolution of the objection within 14 calendar days, the objecting party shall file its objection (the “Objection”) with this Court within 3 business days and serve such Objection on Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties. *See* Interim Compensation Order, ¶ 1(a)(c).

The Fee Notice Parties as defined in the Interim Compensation Order are:

- i. Rhodium Enterprises, Inc., Attn: Charles Topping ([chucktopping@rhdm.com](mailto:chucktopping@rhdm.com)) and Morgan Soule ([morgansoule@rhdm.com](mailto:morgansoule@rhdm.com)), 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, Texas 77005;
- ii. Debtors’ Bankruptcy Counsel, c/o Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco ([pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)); Razmig Izakelian ([razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)), and Alain Jaquet ([alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)), 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002;
- iii. Debtors’ Financial Advisor, c/o Province, Attn: Mark Robinson ([mrobinson@provincefirm.com](mailto:mrobinson@provincefirm.com)); David Dunn ([ddunn@provincefirm.com](mailto:ddunn@provincefirm.com)); Kirsten Lee ([klee@province.com](mailto:klee@province.com)); and Andrew Popescu ([apopescu@provincefirm.com](mailto:apopescu@provincefirm.com)), 2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340, Henderson, Nevada 89074;
- iv. Galaxy Digital, LLC, in its capacity as DIP Agent, c/o Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, Ryan C. Wooten ([rwooten@orrick.com](mailto:rwooten@orrick.com)), 609 Main, 40<sup>th</sup> Floor, Houston, Texas 77002, and Robert Trust ([rtrust@orrick.com](mailto:rtrust@orrick.com)), Mark Franke ([mfranke@orrick.com](mailto:mfranke@orrick.com)) and Brandon Batzel ([bbatzel@orrick.com](mailto:bbatzel@orrick.com)), 51 West 52<sup>nd</sup> Street, New York, New York 10019;
- v. Counsel for the Committee of Unsecured Creditors, c/o McDermott Will & Emery LLP, 2501 North Harwood St., Suite 1900, Dallas, Texas 75201, Attn: Charles R. Gibbs ([crgibbs@mwe.com](mailto:crgibbs@mwe.com)); and

- vi. United States Trustee, Ha Minh Nguyen ([ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov](mailto:ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov)), 515 Rusk, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002.

If no objection is timely served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay Quinn Emanuel an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses listed herein, or if an objection is timely served, such percentage of fees and expenses that are not subject to an objection, as stated in the Interim Compensation Order.

Respectfully submitted this 18th day of December, 2025.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)  
Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)  
Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)  
Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)  
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900  
Houston, Texas 77002  
Telephone: 713-221-7000  
Facsimile: 713-221-7100  
Email: [pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com)

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)  
Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)  
Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)  
865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017  
Telephone: 213-443-3000  
Facsimile: 213-443-3100  
Email: [ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [benroth@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:benroth@quinnemanuel.com)

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A****Summary of Legal Fees for the Fee Period**

Matter Number	Matter Description	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Requested	Total Fees With 20% Discount
i	Asset Analysis/Recovery	.8	\$973.00	\$778.40
ii	Asset Disposition	6.4	\$9,094.00	\$7,275.20
v	Business Operations	.6	\$1,167.00	\$933.60
vi	Case Administration	30.7	\$41,968.50	\$33,574.80
vii	Claims Administration and Objections	90.7	\$139,844.00	\$111,875.20
viii	Corporate Governance and Board Matters	1.5	\$2,917.50	\$2,334.00
ix	Employee Benefits and Pensions	1.2	\$2,334.00	\$1,867.20
x	Employment and Fee Applications	29.8	\$19,648.00	\$15,718.40
xi	Financing/Cash Collateral	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xii	Litigation	16.0	\$21,205.00	\$16,964.00
xiii	Non-working Travel	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xiv	Plan and Disclosure Statement	207.7	\$344,459.00	\$275,567.20
xv	Relief from the Stay	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xvi	Tax	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Total	385.4	\$583,610.00	\$466,888.00

**EXHIBIT B****Summary of Hours Billed by Quinn Emanuel Attorneys and Paraprofessionals<sup>2</sup>**

Professional	Position With The Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Patricia B. Tomasco	Partner	1988	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,945.00	123.1	\$239,429.50
Razmig Izakelian	Associate	2013	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	41.3	\$68,764.50
Ben Roth	Associate	2019	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	11.3	\$18,193.00
Alain Jaquet	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	99.8	\$160,678.00
Rachel Harrington	Associate	2024	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,315.00	36.8	\$48,392.00
Emily Moore	Law Clerk			\$710.00	26.8	\$19,028.00
Barbara J. Howell	Paralegal		Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$655.00	43.6	\$28,558.00
Raul Vasquez	Litigation Support			\$210.00	2.7	\$567.00
<b>Total</b>					<b>385.4</b>	<b>\$583,610.00</b>

---

<sup>2</sup> Travel reflected at 100%.

**EXHIBIT C****Summary of Expenses for the Fee Period**

Expense	Amount
Express mail	\$161.27
Hearing Transcripts	\$27.55
Document Reproduction (\$.10 per copy)	\$16.50
Courier	\$37.18
Out-of-town Travel	\$147.95
Air Travel	\$1,652.93
Local Meals	\$500.41
RelOne Repository Hosting	\$1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting	\$4,306.29
Total	\$8,329.22

# quinn emanuel trial lawyers

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017

December 16, 2025

Cameron Blackmon  
Rhodium Enterprises, Inc.  
4146 W US Highway 79  
Rockdale, TX 76567

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000201437  
Responsible Attorney: Patty Tomasco

Rhodium- restructure of company

For Professional Services through November 30, 2025 in connection with a potential restructuring of this crypto mining company.

Fees	\$583,610.00
Expenses	<u>\$8,329.22</u>
Net Amount	\$591,939.22
Total Due This Invoice	\$591,939.22
Balance Due from Previous Statement(s)	\$1,154,989.60
Total Balance Due	<u><u>\$1,746,928.82</u></u>

**Confidential – May include attorney-client privileged and work-product information**



**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 3

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		Barnes & Thornburg team to review C. Wheeler declaration (.2).		
11/25/25	PT	Prepare for (.8) and attend the hearing on Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement with Whinstone (.3).	1.10	2,139.50
11/25/25	BH2	Review and revise the Declaration of Chris Wheeler (.4).	0.40	262.00
		SUBTOTAL	6.40	9,094.00

**ix Employee Benefits and Pensions**

11/02/25	PT	Correspondence with UHC regarding continuation of health care plan (.2) and follow up with C. Topping and A. Catatao regarding wind down of health care plan (.2).	0.40	778.00
11/06/25	PT	Correspondence with C. Topping regarding status of employee benefits contract and timing of termination of same (.3).	0.30	583.50
11/07/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and participate in call to discuss benefits termination strategy and planning with C. Topping, L. Weber, A. Catatao (.3).	0.50	972.50
		SUBTOTAL	1.20	2,334.00

**v Business Operations**

11/06/25	PT	Review and comment on fee application (.2); review status of fee requests (.4).	0.60	1,167.00
		SUBTOTAL	0.60	1,167.00

**vi Case Administration**

11/01/25	EM	Prepare for (.7) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R.	1.00	710.00
----------	----	--	------	--------

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 4

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		Izakelian, and A. Jaquet in connection with case management and strategy (.3).		
11/02/25	AJ4	Review recent docket filings (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/03/25	EM	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian, L. Weber, B. Roth, and A. Jaquet in connection with case management and strategy (.4).	0.50	355.00
11/03/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates (0.4).	0.40	644.00
11/03/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in a call with L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, E. Moore to review project status and strategy (.4).	0.50	972.50
11/03/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.4) and download filed pleadings prior to the 2:00 pm hearing for attorneys' review (.6).	1.00	655.00
11/03/25	RI	Prepare for (.1) and conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.4).	0.50	832.50
11/04/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.5) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, T. Schmeltz, et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.3).	0.80	1,288.00
11/04/25	PT	Participate in a planning call with the Quinn Emanuel team (.3).	0.30	583.50
11/05/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in project coordination call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.4).	0.50	972.50
11/06/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, T. Schmeltz, and M. Hurley regarding case status and next steps (0.4).	0.50	805.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 5

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/06/25	EM	Prepare requests for production in connection with case strategy (.8).	0.80	568.00
11/06/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, A. Jaquet, E. Moore to discuss projects and strategy (.4).	0.50	972.50
11/06/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel, Akin Gump, Province, and Barnes & Thornburg teams regarding case updates (0.4); emails regarding same (0.2).	0.60	966.00
11/06/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, A. Popescu et al. Regarding case status and next steps (.4).	0.50	805.00
11/07/25	EM	Video conference with P. Tomasack, L. Maseti, R. Harrington, A. Jaquet in connection with case management and strategy (.4).	0.40	284.00
11/07/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.4) and update files to the current status (.6).	1.00	655.00
11/07/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Harrington et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.4).	0.40	644.00
11/07/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.2) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, M. Robinson regarding case status and strategy (0.3).	0.50	805.00
11/07/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in planning call with L. Weber, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.4).	0.50	972.50
11/10/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, T. Schmeltz, et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.3).	0.40	644.00
11/10/25	PT	Prepare for(.2) and participate in planning and coordination call with R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, B. Roth (.3).	0.50	972.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 6

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/11/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, M. Hurley, et al. Regarding case strategy and next steps (0.3); prepare memorandum in connection with the same (0.1).	0.50	805.00
11/11/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with T. Schmeltz, P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.4).	0.40	644.00
11/12/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.2) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.3).	0.50	805.00
11/12/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and participate in planning call with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, B. Roth (.3).	0.50	972.50
11/12/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.7) and update files to the current status, calendaring deadlines and hearing dates (.7).	1.40	917.00
11/12/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding case strategy and assignments (0.3).	0.30	499.50
11/13/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.7) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, L. Weber et al. Regarding case status and next steps (.5).	1.20	1,932.00
11/13/25	PT	Participate in a coordination call with L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
11/13/25	EM	Prepare for (.2) and attend video conference with P. Tomasco, A. Jaquet, L. Weber, R. Izakelian and C. Topping in connection with case strategy (.5).	0.70	497.00
11/14/25	AJ4	Confer with P. Tomasco regarding case status and next steps (0.3).	0.30	483.00
11/18/25	PT	Coordination call with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 7

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/18/25	PT	Coordinate finalization of 3 Way settlement (.3).	0.30	583.50
11/19/25	RH9	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team to discuss confirmation planning and next steps (.5).	0.50	657.50
11/19/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.5).	0.50	805.00
11/19/25	PT	Coordination call with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
11/20/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.2) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and next steps (0.3).	0.50	805.00
11/20/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and participate in team call to discuss work streams and strategy with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.3).	0.50	972.50
11/21/25	AJ4	Prepare for (.2) and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and ongoing tasks (0.3).	0.50	805.00
11/21/25	PT	Prepare for (.2) and participate in team call to discuss work streams and strategy with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.3).	0.50	972.50
11/21/25	BH2	File the 19th Monthly Operating Reports on behalf of the Debtors (1.1); forward file-stamped copies to the Client (.3).	1.40	917.00
11/24/25	AJ4	Attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and strategy (0.5).	0.50	805.00
11/24/25	PT	Participate in team call to discuss work streams and strategy with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
11/24/25	BH2	Review Pacer docket (.2) and update	0.50	327.50



**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 9

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		proposed outline drafting formal responses to document requests and 30(b)(6) topics (.3); correspond with Province team regarding document retrieval tasks and proposal for responding and document retrieval (.6); update Quinn Emanuel team on research regarding privilege (.2); update Barnes team regarding prior document production and minimizing duplication (.2); further follow up regarding SAFE correspondence to respond to document requests (.2); participate in Quinn Emanuel call regarding the request for production of documents responses and document gathering tasks (.3); prepare for and participate in conference call with Transcend counsel and plan proponent counsel regarding discovery plan to respond to Transcend document and discovery requests (.9); revise document pull chart and share with Barnes team (.2).		
11/01/25	AJ4	Prepare for and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian and E. Moore regarding Transcend Group's document requests (1.0); prepare for and attend telephone conference with C. Potter, T. Schmeltz, P. Tomasco et al. Regarding Transcend Group's 30(b)(6) deposition and document requests (0.7).	1.70	2,737.00
11/01/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding Transcend discovery (1.0); conference with counsel for the Transcend group, Special Committee, and SAFE AHG regarding discovery (0.5).	1.50	2,497.50
11/02/25	BR4	Research on claims questions (1.4);	2.00	3,220.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 10

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		review and revise draft on same (0.6).		
11/03/25	EM	Review and revise memorandum re: breach of contract claims under the Temple lease (3.8).	3.80	2,698.00
11/03/25	BR4	Research on claim objections and waiver of defenses (1.8); call with E. Moore regarding same (0.4); emails regarding same (0.3).	2.50	4,025.00
11/03/25	PT	Review and comment on proposed objections to 30(b)(6) topics (.3); correspondence with E. Mortensen regarding treatment of SAFE claims under plan (.1); correspond with D. Eaton regarding preparation outline and relevant documents (.3).	0.70	1,361.50
11/03/25	PT	Follow up on 3 Way demand negotiation (.1).	0.10	194.50
11/03/25	PT	Correspondence with E. Brannen and C. Topping regarding settlement overture from Midas Green counsel (.2).	0.20	389.00
11/04/25	EM	Prepare a memorandum re: breach of contract claim (2.2).	2.20	1,562.00
11/04/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call with SAFE committee regarding topics for Debtors, Special Committee, and Imperium corporate representative depositions (.9); coordinate a draft of the objection to 30(b)(6) topics with R. Izakelian (.2); coordinate meet and confer with C. Potter (.1); review and revise objections to 30(b)(6) topics (.4).	1.60	3,112.00
11/04/25	BR4	Review and revise claim objection research (1.7).	1.70	2,737.00
11/04/25	AJ4	Review and revise draft outline for M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) deposition preparation (2.0); prepare for and attend telephone conference with P.	2.50	4,025.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 11

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		Tomasco, M. Hurley et al. Regarding 30(b)(6) deposition preparation (0.5).		
11/04/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel, Barnes and Province teams regarding discovery (0.5); prepare objections to Rule 30(b)(6) notice (0.7).	1.20	1,998.00
11/04/25	PT	Correspond with E. Brannen regarding bankruptcy appellate procedure (.2); correspond with C. Potter regarding request for extension of deadline to respond to claim objection and coordinate with teams (.5); review and analysis of opposition briefs to sanctions motion and correspond with E. Brannen regarding same (.9).	1.60	3,112.00
11/05/25	AJ4	Attend 30(b)(6) deposition preparation of D. Eaton and M. Robinson (1.10); review and revise preparation outline regarding M. Robinson (0.8), confer with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.2); correspond with R. Izakelian regarding same (0.1).	2.10	3,381.00
11/05/25	AJ4	Review and revise requests for production in relation to the second omnibus objection to satisfied claims and other substantive grounds (1.2); correspond with E. Moore regarding same (0.2).	1.40	2,254.00
11/05/25	AJ4	Correspond with C. Toppings regarding claims against Three Way (0.1); correspond with B. Ay et al. Regarding potential settlement (0.2); confer with A. Popescu regarding same (0.2).	0.50	805.00
11/05/25	EM	Review and revise memorandum re: breach of contract claims (1.0).	1.00	710.00
11/05/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in strategy call with the Special	2.70	5,251.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 12

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		Committee the Imperium Corporate representatives, S. Schultz, M. Hurley, T. Schmeltz, C. Underwood (.9); review and revise objection to 30(b)(6) topics with T. Schmeltz (.4); meet and confer with C. Potter, T. Schmeltz, M. Hurley and others regarding 30(b)(6) topics (.9); comment on preparation outlines for Robinson and Eaton with added documents (.3); finalize and transmit objections to 30(b)(6) topics to C. Potter (.2).		
11/05/25	BR4	Emails regarding upcoming depositions, claim objections, and case updates (0.6); call with E. Moore regarding research; (0.4); emails regarding same (0.2).	1.20	1,932.00
11/05/25	PT	Review and revise proposed requests for production of documents to Transcend parties regarding claim objection (.5); review and comment on counteroffer from 3 Way Logistics (.1); review and comment on offsetting invoices from 3 Way Logistics and correspondence with A. Popescu regarding same and comment on impossibility of deliveries to Rockdale after closure (.4).	1.00	1,945.00
11/06/25	AJ4	Correspond with R. Harrington and F. Sabzevari regarding Transcend's document requests (0.4); attend telephone conference with F. Sabzevari regarding same (0.2); correspond with E. Moore regarding finalization of the discovery requests to Transcend (0.2); confer with A. Popescu regarding Transcend's document requests (0.1); review and revise final version of discovery requests to Transcend (0.2);	1.60	2,576.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 13

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		correspond with C. Potter regarding requests for production (0.2); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding extension to Transcend (0.1); correspond with R. Izakelian regarding search terms for document search (0.2).		
11/06/25	AJ4	Review and revise the preparation outline for M. Robinson 30(b)(6) deposition (4.3).	4.30	6,923.00
11/06/25	AJ4	Correspond with C. Toppings regarding Three Way's settlement offer (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/06/25	PT	Correspondence with M. Robinson regarding deposition scheduling (.2).	0.20	389.00
11/06/25	PT	Correspondence regarding discovery to Transcend parties regarding claim objection (.2); review and finalize discovery to Transcend parties (.5).	0.70	1,361.50
11/06/25	RH9	Gather documents related to omnibus objection (2.1); search produced discovery documents (.5); draft discovery requests for omnibus claim objection (.8).	3.40	4,471.00
11/07/25	AJ4	Review and revise the outline in relation to M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) preparation (3.4).	3.40	5,474.00
11/07/25	PT	Correspondence with L. Lim regarding claim payment (.2).	0.20	389.00
11/09/25	AJ4	Review correspondence from A. Popescu and P. Tomasco regarding M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) preparation (0.1).	0.10	161.00
11/10/25	AJ4	Correspond with R. Harrington regarding Transcend's requests for production (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/10/25	AJ4	Correspond with M. Soule et al. Regarding Three Way proposed settlement (0.1).	0.10	161.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 14

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/10/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in witness preparation with M. Robinson to review potential questions for deposition and testimony with follow up emails regarding potential fact issues (2.3).	2.30	4,473.50
11/10/25	AJ4	Prepare and attend preparation for M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) deposition (4.5); correspond with K. Matsoukas regarding preparation of D. Eaton (0.2); review memorandum regarding M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) preparation (0.3).	5.00	8,050.00
11/11/25	AJ4	Correspond with K. Matsoukas regarding preparation of D. Eaton (0.2); confer with P. Tomasco regarding deposition outline for Transcend Group (0.2); correspond with F. Sabzevari regarding document productions to Transcend (0.3); correspond with R. Harrington in connection with the same (0.4); correspond with R. Izakelian in connection with the same (0.1); prepare memorandum regarding M. Robinson's 30(b)(6) deposition (0.7); correspond and confer with P. Tomasco regarding Proof entities' proofs of claim (0.3); review and analyze documents in connection with Transcend's requests for production (2.0); correspond with Quinn Emanuel staff in connection with related document review (0.2).	4.40	7,084.00
11/11/25	AJ4	Prepare for and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, C. Toppings et al. Regarding settlement with Three Way (0.4); prepare settlement offer (0.3); correspond with P. Tomasco in connection with the same (0.1).	0.80	1,288.00
11/11/25	PT	Coordinate the document production	0.20	389.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 15

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		planning for response to Transcend discovery (.2).		
11/11/25	PT	Prepare for (.1) and participate in call with C. Underwood regarding Proof Capital refiled claims and plans to address (.3).	0.40	778.00
11/11/25	PT	Prepare for (.3) and participate in call with Alex Peloubet, M. Soule, C. Topping, M. Robinson, A. Popescu regarding Three Way settlement proposal, miner issues and other asset disposition matters (.3).	0.60	1,167.00
11/12/25	AJ4	Correspond and confer with R. Vasquez regarding preparation of document production in connection with Transcend's request for productions (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/12/25	AJ4	Prepare outline for 30(b)(6) deposition of Transcend, including by reviewing prior docket filings, email correspondence and other related documents (7.2).	7.20	11,592.00
11/12/25	EM	Prepare motion for claim disallowance (.5).	0.50	355.00
11/13/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum regarding the certificate of no objection relating to the second omnibus objection (0.3); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.1).	0.40	644.00
11/13/25	AJ4	Correspond with P. Tomasco regarding settlement with Three Way (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/13/25	AJ4	Review and revise draft outline for the 30(b)(6) deposition of the Fairbairn Group, including by reviewing proofs of claims and other materials (4.9).	4.90	7,889.00
11/13/25	PT	Coordinate response to Three Way settlement offer (.1).	0.10	194.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 16

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/13/25	EM	Prepare motion for adversarial claim for breach of contract and claim disallowance (6.2).	6.20	4,402.00
11/13/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in Debtor pre-call with A. Popescu, T. Schmeltz, D. Dunn, M. Robinson, K. Kansa (.4); prepare for and participate in call re cash reconciliation file with A. Popescu, M. Hurley, T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson, S. Schultz (.7); correspondence with Quinn Emanuel Team regarding M. Hurley privilege statement (.2); coordinate deadline suspension given settlement negotiations and evaluate issues (.3); correspond with C. Potter regarding rescheduling of depositions and omnibus claim objection scheduling issues with multiple parties with potential continuances (1.1); correspondence with M. Robinson regarding deal points for Transcend Group settlement and markup of term sheet (.8); correspondence with QE team regarding work flow issues in light of settlement terms (.4).	3.90	7,585.50
11/14/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call re Midas claim objection with C. Topping, C. Blackmon, S. Morgan, E. Brannen, M. Robinson (.5); correspondence with M. Robinson regarding Bell/Milam taxes (.2); correspondence with L. Weber regarding severance exhibit and C. VanZoeren negotiations (.1).	0.80	1,556.00
11/18/25	AJ4	Review settlement with Three Way (0.2); correspond with C. Toppings and M. Bonino regarding same (0.1).	0.30	483.00
11/18/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft stipulation regarding Transcend Group; (0.4); prepare memorandum in connection with the same (0.4);	1.10	1,771.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 17

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

correspond and confer with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.2); review related correspondence between P. Tomasco and T. Schmeltz (0.1).

SUBTOTAL	90.70	139,844.00
----------	-------	------------

**viii Corporate Governance and board Matters**

11/12/25	PT	Prepare for and attend Rhodium Board meeting (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
11/19/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in Rhodium Board meeting (.8).	0.80	1,556.00
		SUBTOTAL	1.50	2,917.50

**x Employment and Fee Applications**

11/04/25	BH2	Finalize (.5) and file Province's Fourth Interim Fee Application (.3); finalize Province's monthly fee statement (.2) and file same (.2).	1.20	786.00
11/04/25	BH2	Finalize (.4) and file Barnes & Thornburg's Fourth Interim Fee Statement (.3).	0.70	458.50
11/05/25	PT	Review the status of the Keller Williams retention application (.1).	0.10	194.50
11/06/25	BH2	Review the motions to withdraw filed by Transcend Group regarding Quinn Emanuel's monthly fee statement and its Third Interim Fee Application (.3) and draft a certificate of no objection to Quinn Emanuel's Third Interim Fee Application (.3); file same (.3); email communications with T. Laws regarding the November 12th hearing and the fact that the Transcend's objection had been withdrawn (.2).	1.10	720.50
11/12/25	BH2	Begin to prepare the October monthly	4.40	2,882.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 18

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		fee statement (4.4).		
11/12/25	BH2	Draft a certificate of no objection for the Keller Williams Retention Application (.3) and file the same (.3).	0.60	393.00
11/14/25	BH2	Continue to work on the Fourth Interim Fee Application (5.1); prepare the Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement (2.1) and file same (.3).	7.50	4,912.50
11/18/25	BH2	Serve Quinn Emanuel's October monthly fee statement to the parties listed in the Interim Compensation Order (.3) and forward the LEDES data to the United States Trustee (.3).	0.60	393.00
11/19/25	BH2	Continue to prepare Quinn Emanuel's Fourth Interim Fee Application (2.1).	2.10	1,375.50
11/20/25	BH2	File Barnes & Thornburg's monthly fee statement (.3).	0.30	196.50
11/20/25	BH2	Continue to prepare the Fourth Interim Fee Application (3.6).	3.60	2,358.00
11/21/25	BH2	Finish draft of the Fourth Interim Fee Application (6.9) and forward same to P. Tomasco for review (.1).	7.00	4,585.00
11/21/25	BH2	File the Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement on behalf of Province (.3).	0.30	196.50
11/25/25	BH2	Email exchange with V. O'Connell re Stris's Fourth Interim Fee Application (.3).	0.30	196.50
		SUBTOTAL	29.80	19,648.00

**xii Litigation**

11/02/25	EM	Review and revise discovery request in connection with legal strategy (.4).	0.40	284.00
11/03/25	PT	Attend hearing on fee application of Lehotsky Keller Cohn and hearing on motion to compel discovery request	6.30	12,253.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 19

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		to SAFE AHG (6.3).		
11/04/25	EM	Review and revise the request for production in connection with case strategy (.5); prepare for a conference with P. Tomasco, A. Jaquet, R. Izakelian re: disclosures (1).	1.50	1,065.00
11/04/25	PT	Review status of document review for privileged materials to be clawed back from Lehotsky Keller Cohn production with P. Lohse (.4).	0.40	778.00
11/05/25	PT	Conference with J. Wolfshohl regarding Lehotsky Keller Cohn fee application (.4).	0.40	778.00
11/05/25	EM	Review and revise requests for production (1.2).	1.20	852.00
11/07/25	BR4	Calls and emails with R. Harrington regarding production details (0.8).	0.80	1,288.00
11/11/25	RH9	Review documents for production (1.8).	1.80	2,367.00
11/12/25	RV2	Prepare documents in the proper format to facilitate attorney review per request from A. Jaquet.	2.70	567.00
11/21/25	PT	Correspond with J. Wolfshohl regarding escrow amount (.5).	0.50	972.50
		SUBTOTAL	16.00	21,205.00

**xiv Plan and Disclosure Statement**

11/02/25	PT	Prepare for (.3) and participate in conference call with Province, special committee and Barnes teams regarding discovery responses and confirmation strategy (1.0).	1.30	2,528.50
11/04/25	PT	Prepare an agenda for confirmation coordination call with Barnes team (.5); prepare for and participate in confirmation planning call with Barnes and QE teams (.6); correspond	2.50	4,862.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 20

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		with A. Carson and R. Izakelian regarding plan release language (.5); review and analyze plan releases (.9).		
11/05/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in joint preparation session with T. Schmeltz and the Special Committee to map preparation and strategy for confirmation (1.1); correspondence regarding potential plan objections with M. Hurley (.3).	1.40	2,723.00
11/06/25	RH9	Conference with estate stakeholders regarding coordination of plan confirmation (.5).	0.50	657.50
11/06/25	PT	Prepare for (.4) and participate in confirmation coordination call with M. Hurley, T. Schmeltz, C. Underwood, K. Matsoukas, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, E. Moore (.4); follow up call with R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet regarding plan discovery tasks and strategy (.4); conference with C. Potter regarding plan objection (.2); follow up with T. Schmeltz regarding same (.1).	1.50	2,917.50
11/06/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel, Barnes & Thornburg, and Akin Gump teams regarding plan (0.4); conference with Quinn Emanuel, Province, and Barnes teams regarding discovery (0.4); conference with A. Popescu regarding plan discovery (0.5).	1.30	2,164.50
11/07/25	RH9	Add case law to the confirmation brief and address comments (5.5).	5.50	7,232.50
11/07/25	AJ4	Research gatekeeping injunctions and exculpations (0.5).	0.50	805.00
11/07/25	PT	Review examples of confirmation briefs to cull issues for expansion in confirmation briefing (.9); prepare for and participate in confirmation	5.00	9,725.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 21

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		planning call with M. Robinson, K. Matsoukas, R. Izakelian (.7); review and revise the confirmation memorandum (2.3); forward summaries of recent 5th Circuit cases on plan provisions for incorporation into brief (.3); task list email to Barnes & Thornburg and Quinn Emanuel teams to address plan supplement and discovery responses (.8).		
11/09/25	RH9	Add case law to the confirmation brief and address comments (3.0).	3.00	3,945.00
11/10/25	RH9	Add caselaw to the confirmation brief and address comments (6.5).	6.50	8,547.50
11/10/25	RH9	Call with estate stakeholders regarding coordination of confirmation (.5).	0.50	657.50
11/10/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call with special committee to plan for plan confirmation with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, C. Topping, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.8); review and revise proposed confirmation brief (.8); conference with D. Azman regarding proposed treatment of Proof Capital claims (.3).	1.90	3,695.50
11/11/25	RH9	Conference with estate stakeholders regarding coordination of confirmation (.3).	0.30	394.50
11/11/25	RH9	Implement comments and proof confirmation brief (2.5).	2.50	3,287.50
11/11/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel, Barnes & Thornburg, and Akin Gump teams regarding plan (0.3); conference with Quinn Emanuel and Barnes team regarding plan (0.3); conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding plan (0.5).	1.10	1,831.50
11/11/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in plan coordination call with M. Hurley, T.	6.70	13,031.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 22

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		<p>Schmeltz, C. Underwood, K. Matsoukas (.5); prepare for and participate in call to discuss confirmation hearing preparation tasks with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, C. Topping, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.4); prepare for and participate in follow up call with special committee and counsel regarding plan settlement discussions and proposal to limit fees (.8); follow up conference with SAFE AHG counsel and special committee counsel regarding settlement proposals (.4); follow up research regarding confirmation requirements (.6); conference with M. Robinson regarding waterfall effects and settlement terms (.3); extensive revisions to confirmation brief to update and conform to district with additional research (3.4); email to do lists to plan proponent counsel (.3).</p>		
11/12/25	PT	<p>Prepare for and participate in call with T. Schmeltz, Special Committee, Province teams regarding negotiations with Transcend (.4); prepare for and participate in call re Transcend deal with S. Wells, M. Robinson, D. Eaton, and T. Schmeltz (.6); review and revise proposed stipulation with Transcend/SAFE and forward to the Special Committee (.4).</p>	1.40	2,723.00
11/12/25	RI	<p>Review and revise the confirmation brief (2.1).</p>	2.10	3,496.50
11/12/25	PT	<p>Prepare for and participate in strategy call with K. Kansa (.3); prepare for and participate in strategy call with A. Popescu, M. Robinson (.8); prepare for and participate in call with S. Schultz, T. Schmeltz, M. Hurley (.5); prepare for</p>	4.50	8,752.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 23

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		and participate in follow up waterfall call with M. Hurley, S. Schultz, T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson (.8); prepare for and participate in call regarding plan settlement update with K. Kansa, T. Schmeltz (.4); conferences with M. Robinson regarding waterfall math and effects (.5); multiple review and revisions to confirmation brief (1.2).		
11/13/25	PT	Review and substantial revisions to confirmation brief (1.3); coordinate with Barnes & Thornburg team regarding additional revisions (.2); attention to confirmation deadline calendars (.1).	1.60	3,112.00
11/13/25	BR4	Emails regarding plan supplement (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/13/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding plan (0.5).	0.50	832.50
11/14/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call regarding potential Transcend settlement with T. Schmeltz, D. Eaton, S. Wells, M. Robinson, D. Dunn, K. Kansa (.9); follow up conference with M. Robinson regarding same (.3).	1.20	2,334.00
11/14/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in Debtors confirmation planning call with M. Robinson, A. Popescu, C. Topping, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.9).	0.90	1,750.50
11/14/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call regarding executory contracts schedule and plan supplement with L. Weber (.5).	0.50	972.50
11/16/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in confirmation planning call with L. Weber, R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.5).	0.50	972.50
11/17/25	AJ4	Review correspondence from P.	0.20	322.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 24

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		Tomasco and K. Kansa regarding plan confirmation (0.2).		
11/17/25	PT	Participate in call regarding plan support agreement with L. Weber, M. Robinson, A. Popescu, K. Lee, C. Topping, M. Soule (.3); coordinate drafting plan supplement components with L. Weber and R. Izakelian (.2); update professional fee budgets with Stris and Province (.1); follow up with Barnes & Thornburg team regarding additions to confirmation brief (.1); multiple drafting, review and revisions to plan supplement documents and correspond with R. Izakelian and S. Schultz regarding same (3.7).	4.40	8,558.00
11/17/25	RH9	Draft executive contracts list incorporating edits from the company (2.8); draft plan administrator agreement (1.9).	4.70	6,180.50
11/17/25	RI	Conference with C. Topping, M. Soule, and Quinn Emanuel team regarding plan supplement (0.6); prepare plan supplement and exhibits (5.2).	5.80	9,657.00
11/18/25	RH9	Implement comments to the list of assumed contracts and create an exhibit for the plan supplement (3.2).	3.20	4,208.00
11/18/25	PT	Multiple revisions to plan supplement documents (2.9); coordinate additional changes with R. Izakelian regarding same (.2); review and respond to balloting inquiries from DLT (.1); review and respond to S. Schultz questions regarding assumed contracts list and coordinate with C. Topping regarding same (.9); review and suggest revisions to Transcend stipulation (.3); review and comment	10.50	20,422.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 25

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

on proposed documentation of Transcend stipulation under claim objection resolution and emails with D. Eaton and S. Wells regarding same (.5); summarize economic effect of dilutive warrants and overall impact on plan distributions (.8); coordinate with A. Jaquet regarding correct listing of Transcend parties from claim objection data (.2); retrieve examples of assumed contracts lists from liquidating plans to use as comparisons for negotiations with SAFE AHG (.5); additional changes to Transcend stipulation to reflect various holdings of different parties according to company books (1.1); follow up on additional changes to plan support agreement exhibit A (.2); telephone conference with C. Topping regarding same (.2); additional revisions to plan administrator agreement (.2); extensive revisions to confirmation brief draft and coordinate redline version of same (1.2); review status of plan declarations and coordinate drafting of declarations in support of plan (.1); detailed explanation of retained causes of action with respect to defenses to indemnification claims to K. Zaharis and follow on research to further respond to inquiry from S. Schultz (1.1).

11/18/25	AJ4	Confer and correspond with P. Tomasco regarding M. Robinson and D. Eaton draft declarations in connection with the same (0.3); confer with A. Popescu regarding same (0.2); review related materials (0.5).	1.00	1,610.00
11/18/25	RI	Prepare plan supplement and exhibits (7.2).	7.20	11,988.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 26

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/19/25	AJ4	Prepare a draft of M. Robinson's declaration on the liquidation analysis (4.0).	4.00	6,440.00
11/19/25	PT	Respond to inquiry from counsel for Ethos regarding claims and balloting under plan (.5); correspondence with R. Izakelian and S. Schultz regarding finalizing plan supplement (.2); respond to plan inquiry from L. Lim (.1); respond to multiple emails from S. Schultz regarding plan supplement documents and multiple revisions to plan supplement documents (1.7); respond to R. Szkoda inquiry regarding SAFE claim (.2); correspondence with T. Laws and S. Schultz regarding plan supplement (.2); coordinate notice of late filing plan supplement (.1); review and revise notice of late plan supplement (.2); circulate late notice to plan parties (.2); coordinate with plan parties to finalize plan supplement and coordinate service of plan supplement (.6).	4.00	7,780.00
11/19/25	BH2	Draft a Notice of Extended Deadline to file the Plan Supplement (.7) and file same (.3); work with attorneys to finalize and file the Plan Supplement (1.5).	2.50	1,637.50
11/19/25	RH9	Implement comments to plan supplement (1.0); finalize plan supplement (.6).	0.60	789.00
11/19/25	RI	Review and revise the plan supplement exhibits (1.0).	1.00	1,665.00
11/20/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of the M. Robinson declaration in support of the Plan (2.0); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding the same (0.1); correspond with A. Popescu regarding the same (0.2); review and	7.90	12,719.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**December 16, 2025  
Page 27Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		analyze settlement stipulation (1.2); prepare draft of D. Eaton's declaration(3.8); review memorandum on late filed claim and related materials and correspond with F. Sabzevari and A. Popescu regarding the same and plan (0.6).		
11/20/25	PT	Prepare and participate in call regarding Three Way settlement, Plan Administration Agreement, Wind-Down Budget with S. Schultz, R. Izakelian, M. Robinson (.5); review and revise the plan administrator agreement and coordinate redline of same (1.1); correspondence with M. Robinson regarding the plan administrator issues (.2); review and revise the Robinson declaration (.5); coordinate review by Province team (.1); review Transcend stipulation (.3).	2.70	5,251.50
11/21/25	PT	Coordinate preparation of exhibit list for confirmation hearing with B. Howell and S. Schultz (.1); coordinate ballot and voting inquiries with C. Topping and Verita team (.3); correspondence with A. Chiarello regarding claim amount (.2); coordinate with Verita and B. Funk to get ballots to Transcend group (.1); review VanZoeren proof of claim and correspond with C. Topping and S. Schultz regarding same (.2).	0.90	1,750.50
11/21/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of M. Robinson's declaration in support of plan confirmation, including by implementing A. Popescu's comments (2.8); correspond and confer with A. Popescu regarding same (0.1); review and revise the draft of D. Eaton's declaration in support of the plan (4.5).	7.40	11,914.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 28

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

11/22/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of D. Eaton's declaration (2.5).	2.50	4,025.00
11/23/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of D. Eaton's declaration (2.0).	2.00	3,220.00
11/24/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in strategy call with P. Lohse, D. Eaton, S. Wells, C. Topping, M. Robinson, D. Dunn, T. Schmeltz, K. Kansa (1.1); correspond with S. Schultz regarding plan supplement components (.4); correspond with M. Robinson regarding missing elements for plan supplement (.3); correspond with plan proponents to coordinate missing items from plan supplement and issues with same (.7); review and revise the Eaton declaration (.9); forward draft to D. Eaton, K. Kansa for revision and completion (.2); correspond with plan support parties regarding timing of exhibits and declarations and internal deadlines for same (.3); correspond with K. Yang regarding fee issues and need to focus on plan confirmation (.5); further correspondence with S. Schultz regarding blown deadlines (.2); review status of plan supplement and declarations and review and revisions to plan documents (2.1).	6.70	13,031.50
11/24/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of D. Eaton's declaration (3.3); correspond with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.1).	3.40	5,474.00
11/24/25	AJ4	Prepare for and attend telephone conference with T. Schmeltz, P. Tomasco et al. Regarding case status and confirmation preparation (0.5).	0.50	805.00
11/24/25	RI	Prepare for (.3) and participate in a conference call with the Quinn Emanuel and Barnes & Thornburg	0.80	1,332.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 29

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		teams regarding the plan (0.5).		
11/25/25	RH9	Revisions to the response to plan objection (2.3).	2.30	3,024.50
11/25/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in Confirmation strategy call with M. Hurley, S. Schultz (.4); correspondence with C. Potter (.1); review confirmation brief draft and areas for completion (.8); correspondence with B. Funk regarding criticism of professionals (.2); correspondence regarding and review of Robinson declaration (.2); review and substantial revisions to reply to Lehotsky Keller Cohn's confirmation objection (1.6); coordinate changing cites to 5th Circuit and correspondence with R. Harrington regarding same (.2); online research for 5th Circuit cases on prudential standing by administrative claimants (.6); review and revise the Eaton declaration and correspondence with R. Izakelian regarding revisions (1.1); review and revise the confirmation brief and circulate (1.4); review effect of Transcend settlement on voting and disclosure issues and brief online research regarding same (.9).	7.50	14,587.50
11/25/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of D. Eaton's declaration (5.7).	5.70	9,177.00
11/25/25	RI	Review and revise the confirmation brief (5.3).	5.30	8,824.50
11/26/25	BR4	Call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding confirmation planning (0.4); research regarding same (1.0).	1.40	2,254.00
11/26/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft of M. Robinson's declaration (0.3); correspond with A. Popescu regarding the same (0.1); review and	5.20	8,372.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 30

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		revise draft of D. Eaton's declaration, including by analyzing related confirmation brief (4.8).		
11/26/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in coordination call with K. Kansa, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, L. Weber, S. Schultz, B. Funk, T. Schmeltz regarding confirmation hearing preparation and additional portions of plan supplement and plan supplement amendments (.9); follow up attention to voting tabulation issues with Transcend claims and research regarding same (.9); review and comment on Akin Gump's changes to confirmation brief (.7); further comment to Verita regarding voting reports (.2); review and comment on the Plan Administrator agreement (.1); finalize confirmation brief draft and circulate to plan parties (1.4); call with the Barnes & Thornburg team to discuss classification of Transcend claims in light of stipulation (.5); correspond with R. Izakelian regarding classification issues (.2); follow up with Verita regarding resolution of classification issue (.1); additional follow up with Verita to finalize ballot summary and coordinate finalization and filing same (.5); additional comments on the Plan Administrator agreement (.3).	5.80	11,281.00
11/26/25	BH2	Work with attorneys to finalize and file the notice of tabulation of votes and the Second Plan Supplement (1.7).	1.70	1,113.50
11/26/25	RI	Review and revise the confirmation brief (3.2); conference with Quinn Emanuel, Barnes & Thornburg, and Akin Gump teams regarding plan	5.90	9,823.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 31

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		documents (0.3); review and revise the plan supplement and voting report (2.4).		
11/28/25	AJ4	Attend the telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian et al. Regarding plan confirmation (0.5); review and revise the exhibit list (0.4); correspond with A. Popescu regarding M. Robinson's declaration (0.2); review and revise D. Eaton's declaration and correspond with D. Eaton and K. Pansa regarding the same (0.4).	1.50	2,415.00
11/28/25	EM	Video conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, and L. Weber in connection with plan confirmation (.4); begin to prepare the exhibit list for the confirmation hearing (4.6).	5.00	3,550.00
11/28/25	RI	Conference with Quinn Emanuel team regarding the plan (0.5); review and revise the plan and exhibit list (2.1).	2.60	4,329.00
11/29/25	AJ4	Review and revise the drafts of D. Eaton's declaration and confirmation brief (3.5); prepare for and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco and R. Izakelian regarding same (0.4); correspond with S. Schultz regarding M. Robinson's declaration (0.2).	4.10	6,601.00
11/29/25	AJ4	Review and revise the exhibit list for the confirmation hearing (0.2).	0.20	322.00
11/29/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in plan preparation call with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, E. Moore (.5); review updated confirmation order and revise (.4); review status of the exhibit list (.3); review and revise mediation privilege stipulation and respond to M. Hurley (.6); review and revise the exhibit and witness list (.6);	3.60	7,002.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 32

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

		create task list and assignments list for plan proponents and deadlines for completion and correspondence with plan proponents regarding completion (1.2).		
11/29/25	EM	Conference with P. Tomasco re: confirmation (.4); conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, R. Harrington re: confirmation (.5).	0.90	639.00
11/30/25	AJ4	Review and revise D. Eaton's declaration (1.2); review and revise M. Robinson's declaration (0.2); review the brief memorandum (0.2); correspond and confer with R. Izakelian regarding same (0.2); prepare for and attend telephone conference with P. Tomasco, R. Izakelian et al. Regarding confirmation brief and related documents (0.4).	2.20	3,542.00
11/30/25	RI	Review and revise confirmation brief, order, and declarations (4.2).	4.20	6,993.00
11/30/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in call with R. Izakelian, K. Kansa, S. Schultz, T. Schmeltz regarding Monday filing deadlines and witness and exhibit list issues (.7); multiple review and revisions to exhibit list and declarations and correspondence with plan (1.2); review and comment on the motion to seal (.2); prepare for and participate in call with R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, E. Moore, R. Harrington, L. Weber regarding confirmation hearing preparation and tasks (.5).	2.60	5,057.00
11/30/25	EM	Video conference with P. Tomasco, A. Jaquet, R. Izakelian, and R. Harrington re: confirmation (.5).	0.50	355.00
11/30/25	EM	Prepare exhibits for hearing (.2).	0.20	142.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025

Page 33

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

SUBTOTAL	207.70	344,459.00
----------	--------	------------

**Fee Summary**

<b>Attorneys</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Patty Tomasco	PT	Partner	123.10	1,945.00	239,429.50
Razmig Izakelian	RI	Associate	41.30	1,665.00	68,764.50
Alain Jaquet	AJ4	Associate	99.80	1,610.00	160,678.00
Ben Roth	BR4	Associate	11.30	1,610.00	18,193.00
Rachel Harrington	RH9	Associate	36.80	1,315.00	48,392.00
Emily Moore	EM	Law Clerk	26.80	710.00	19,028.00
<b>Case Assistants</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Barbara J Howell	BH2	Paralegal	43.60	655.00	28,558.00
<b>Litigation Support/Document Management Services</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Raul Vasquez	RV2	Litigation Support	2.70	210.00	567.00

**Expense Summary**

Description	Amount
Express mail	161.27
Hearing transcript(s)	27.55
Online Research	0.00
Document Reproduction	0.10 16.50
Word processing	0.00
Courier	37.18
Out-of-Town Travel	147.95
Air travel	1,652.93
Local meals	500.41
PACER Services	0.00

**Litigation Support Costs**

(Charges based on market not cost)

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

December 16, 2025  
Page 34

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000201437

Description	Amount
RelOne User Fee	0.00
RelOne Processing	0.00
RelOne Repository Hosting (Per GB)	1,479.14
RelOne Active Hosting (Per GB)	4,306.29
Total Expenses	\$8,329.22

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	Chapter 11
	§	
RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>	§	Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)
	§	
Debtors.	§	
	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S  
SIXTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD  
DECEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2025**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) submits, pursuant to the Order Granting the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (Docket No. 264) entered on October 14, 2024, this monthly fee statement for the payment of interim compensation rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the period December 1, 2025, through December 31, 2025 (the “Sixteenth Monthly Fee Statement”).

Quinn Emanuel seeks payment of interim compensation in the total amount of \$222,270.20 (80% of the services rendered), plus \$13,826.97 (100% of the interim expenses incurred). Summaries of the fees and expenses are in Exhibits A, B, and C. An invoice reflecting detailed time entries is attached hereto as Exhibit D.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party objecting to the payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses shall serve within 14 days after service of the Sixteenth Monthly Fee Statement a written notice, via email, upon Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties (as listed below) (the “Written Notice”). The Written Notice shall specifically identify the objectionable fees and expenses, including the amount at issue and the basis for the objection. If the parties are unable to reach a resolution of the objection within 14 calendar days, the objecting party shall file its objection (the “Objection”) with this Court within 3 business days and serve such Objection on Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties. *See* Interim Compensation Order, ¶ 1(a)(c).

The Fee Notice Parties as defined in the Interim Compensation Order are:

- i. Rhodium Enterprises, Inc., Attn: Charles Topping ([chucktopping@rhdm.com](mailto:chucktopping@rhdm.com)) and Morgan Soule ([morgansoule@rhdm.com](mailto:morgansoule@rhdm.com)), 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, Texas 77005;
- ii. Debtors’ Bankruptcy Counsel, c/o Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco ([pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)); Razmig Izakelian ([razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)), and Alain Jaquet ([alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)), 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002;
- iii. Debtors’ Financial Advisor, c/o Province, Attn: Mark Robinson ([mrobinson@provincefirm.com](mailto:mrobinson@provincefirm.com)); David Dunn ([ddunn@provincefirm.com](mailto:ddunn@provincefirm.com)); Kirsten Lee ([klee@province.com](mailto:klee@province.com)); and Andrew Popescu ([apopescu@provincefirm.com](mailto:apopescu@provincefirm.com)), 2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340, Henderson, Nevada 89074;
- iv. Galaxy Digital, LLC, in its capacity as DIP Agent, c/o Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, Ryan C. Wooten ([rwooten@orrick.com](mailto:rwooten@orrick.com)), 609 Main, 40<sup>th</sup> Floor, Houston, Texas 77002, and Robert Trust ([rtrust@orrick.com](mailto:rtrust@orrick.com)), Mark Franke ([mfranke@orrick.com](mailto:mfranke@orrick.com)) and Brandon Batzel ([bbatzel@orrick.com](mailto:bbatzel@orrick.com)), 51 West 52<sup>nd</sup> Street, New York, New York 10019;
- v. Counsel for the Committee of Unsecured Creditors, c/o McDermott Will & Emery LLP, 2501 North Harwood St., Suite 1900, Dallas, Texas 75201, Attn: Charles R. Gibbs ([crgibbs@mwe.com](mailto:crgibbs@mwe.com)); and

- vi. United States Trustee, Ha Minh Nguyen ([ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov](mailto:ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov)), 515 Rusk, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002.

If no objection is timely served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay Quinn Emanuel an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses listed herein, or if an objection is timely served, such percentage of fees and expenses that are not subject to an objection, as stated in the Interim Compensation Order.

Respectfully submitted this 28th day of January, 2026.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)  
Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)  
Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)  
Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)  
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900  
Houston, Texas 77002  
Telephone: 713-221-7000  
Facsimile: 713-221-7100  
Email: [pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com)

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)  
Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)  
Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)  
865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017  
Telephone: 213-443-3000  
Facsimile: 213-443-3100  
Email: [ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [benroth@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:benroth@quinnemanuel.com)

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A****Summary of Legal Fees for the Fee Period**

Matter Number	Matter Description	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Requested	Total Fees With 20% Discount
i	Asset Analysis/Recovery	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
ii	Asset Disposition	6.1	\$9,542.50	\$7,634.00
iv	Avoidance Actions	.4	\$262.00	\$209.60
v	Business Operations	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
vi	Case Administration	7.5	\$6,719.00	\$5,375.20
vii	Claims Administration and Objections	3.6	\$4,485.50	\$3,588.40
viii	Corporate Governance and Board Matters	1.3	\$2,528.50	\$2,022.80
ix	Employee Benefits and Pensions	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
x	Employment and Fee Applications	15.0	\$18,051.50	\$14,441.20
xi	Financing/Cash Collateral	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xii	Litigation	2.4	\$1,572.00	\$1,257.60
xiii	Non-working Travel <sup>2</sup>	6.5	\$5,411.25	\$4,329.00
xiv	Plan and Disclosure Statement	159.3	\$229,265.50	\$183,412.40
xv	Relief from the Stay	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
xvi	Tax	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
	<b>Total</b>	<b>202.1</b>	<b>\$277,837.75</b>	<b>\$222,270.20</b>

<sup>2</sup> Pursuant to the U.S. Trustee Guidelines, Quinn Emanuel bills its non-working travel at 50%. In December, Quinn Emanuel billed 6.5 hours of non-working travel for a total of \$10,822.50. 50% of \$10,822.50 is \$5,411.25.

**EXHIBIT B****Summary of Hours Billed by Quinn Emanuel Attorneys and Paraprofessionals<sup>3</sup>**

Professional	Position With The Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Patricia B. Tomasco	Partner	1988	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,945.00	46.3	\$90,053.50
Razmig Izakelian	Associate	2013	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,665.00	39.8	\$66,267.00
Ben Roth	Associate	2019	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	4.6	\$7,406.00
Alain Jaquet	Associate	2016	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,610.00	36.1	\$58,121.00
Cameron Kelly	Associate	2020	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,560.00	2.5	\$3,900.00
Rachel Harrington	Associate	2024	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$1,315.00	14.5	\$19,067.50
Emily Moore	Law Clerk			\$710.00	4.5	\$3,195.00
Barbara J. Howell	Paralegal		Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$655.00	53.8	\$35,239.00
<b>Total</b>					<b>202.1</b>	<b>\$283,249.00</b>

---

<sup>3</sup> Non-Working Travel is reflected at 100%.

**EXHIBIT C****Summary of Expenses for the Fee Period**

Expense	Amount
Meals during Travel	\$41.34
Hearing Transcripts	\$348.95
Document Reproduction (\$.10 per copy)	\$701.50
Travel	\$198.92
Document Reproduction – color (\$.25 per copy)	\$1,859.75
Hotel	\$165.19
Velobind	\$84.84
Out-of-town Travel	\$170.14
Air Travel	\$1,372.95
Tabs	\$280.50
Local Meals	\$350.73
RelOne Active Hosting	\$8,252.16
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$13,826.97</b>

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017

January 15, 2026

Cameron Blackmon  
Rhodium Enterprises, Inc.  
4146 W US Highway 79  
Rockdale, TX 76567

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000203054  
Responsible Attorney: Patty Tomasco

Rhodium- restructure of company

For Professional Services through December 31, 2025 in connection with a potential restructuring of this crypto mining company.

Fees	\$283,249.00
Travel Adjustment (50%)	<u>-\$5,411.25</u>
Net Billed Fees	\$277,837.75
Expenses	<u>\$13,826.97</u>
Net Amount	\$291,664.72
Total Due This Invoice	\$291,664.72
Balance Due from Previous Statement(s)	\$1,318,846.32
Total Balance Due	<u>\$1,610,511.04</u>

**Confidential – May include attorney-client privileged and work-product information**

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 2

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

**Statement Detail****ii Asset Disposition**

12/02/25	BH2	Finalize (.3) and file the Declaration of Chris Wheeler for Motion to Enforce PSA with Whinstone (.3).	0.60	393.00
12/09/25	PT	Review and revise the proposed order granting the motion to enforce sale order (.6); correspond with C. Topping regarding same (.4); review and begin revising declaration of C. Wheeler (.3).	1.30	2,528.50
12/10/25	PT	Revise amended declaration of C. Wheeler regarding history of negotiations with Whinstone and circulate to C. Topping and C. Wheeler (1.2); prepare and participate in call re motion to enforce terms of revised proposed order with C. Topping, T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson, D. Dunn, C. Wheeler to review declaration and terms of revised proposed order (.6); finalize and circulate C. Wheeler amended declaration (.4).	2.20	4,279.00
12/11/25	BH2	Finalize the Amended Declaration of Chris Wheeler (.3) and file same (.3); draft a Notice of Proposed Order for the Motion to Enforce the Purchase and Sale Agreement (.4) and file same (.2).	1.20	786.00
12/11/25	PT	Finalize Wheeler amended declaration (.7) and coordinate uploading of the revised proposed order (.1).	0.80	1,556.00
		SUBTOTAL	6.10	9,542.50

**iv Avoidance Action Analysis**





**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 5

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

12/03/25	AJ4	Correspond and confer with R. Harrington in relation to fee dispute and privilege issues (0.3).	0.30	483.00
12/03/25	BH2	File the Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement from Stris & Maher (.3).	0.30	196.50
12/04/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum on FRE 502 in connection with the fee dispute (1.7) and confer and correspond with P. Tomasco and R. Harrington regarding the same (.3).	2.00	3,220.00
12/08/25	BH2	Begin to prepare the November monthly fee statement (3.0).	3.00	1,965.00
12/08/25	PT	Prepare and participate in Eaton preparation with P. Lohse, T. Schmeltz, D. Eaton, C. Topping, M. Robinson (.9); correspond with T. Laws regarding rescheduling issues for continued hearing on objection to Lehotsky Keller Cohn fee application and coordinate with M. Hurley regarding same. (.6); coordinate with the Barnes & Thornburg team regarding local rules regarding remote testimony and general orders affecting issue (.4).	1.90	3,695.50
12/11/25	RI	Attend the hearing on the fee application objection (1.0).	1.00	1,665.00
12/11/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in continued hearing on objection to fee application of Lehotsky Keller Cohn (1.1).	1.10	2,139.50
12/15/25	PT	Review and comment on Lehotsky Keller & Cohn and Wheeler declaration and correspond with C. Topping regarding same (.5).	0.50	972.50
12/15/25	RI	Review and analyze the Lehotsky Keller & Cohn briefing (0.5).	0.50	832.50
12/17/25	BH2	Continue to prepare the November monthly fee statement (2.3).	2.30	1,506.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 6

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

12/18/25	BH2	Finalize the Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement of Quinn Emanuel (.4) and file same (.3); forward file-stamped copy and LEDES data to the parties on the Interim Compensation Order (.2).	0.90	589.50
12/29/25	BH2	Finalize (.1) and file the November Monthly Fee Statement for Province (.3).	0.40	262.00
12/30/25	BH2	Finalize (.1) and file Barnes & Thornburg's November Monthly Fee Statement (.3); forward a file-stamped copy, along with the LEDES data to the U.S. Trustee (.1).	0.50	327.50
		SUBTOTAL	15.00	18,051.50

**xii Litigation**

12/09/25	BH2	Assist R. Harrington with preparations of the Additional Designation of Record (2.1) and file same (.3).	2.40	1,572.00
		SUBTOTAL	2.40	1,572.00

**xiii Non-working Travel**

12/03/25	RI	Travel back from confirmation hearing (6.5).	6.50	10,822.50
		SUBTOTAL	6.50	10,822.50

**xiv Plan and Disclosure Statement**

12/01/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft filings relating to the confirmation hearing (confirmation brief, D. Eaton's declaration, plan supplement, exhibit list, and agenda) (8.6).	8.60	13,846.00
12/01/25	PT	Coordinate filing of the exhibit list and exhibits and multiple reviews of	9.80	19,061.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 7

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

exhibits and list (2.1); prepare for and participate in confirmation planning call with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, E. Moore (.5); prepare and participate in call regarding motion to seal issues with R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet (.3); coordinate preparation of agenda and review multiple drafts of agenda (1.2); review and comment on Robinson declaration and Eaton declaration and multiple review and revisions of same (1.2); review and suggest response to Lehotsky Keller Cohn confirmation objection and background research (.8); direct resolution of VanZoeren objection (.2); review and comment on Hurley declaration (.2); continue review and comment on confirmation brief (1.6); telephone conference with C. Topping regarding additional healthcare policy and coordinate adding additional contract to assumed list (.5); review and revise amended plan supplement and communications regarding same (.8); continue preparation for the confirmation hearing (.4).

12/01/25	BH2	Revise the Witness and Exhibit List for December 3rd hearing (6.0) and file the sealed and unsealed versions (3.9); download sealed exhibits (.6) and forward to attorneys and opposing counsel (.2); finalize (.6) and file the proposed confirmation order (.3); finalize (.4) and file the Motion to Seal (.3).	12.30	8,056.50
12/01/25	RH9	Conference with team to discuss preparations for the confirmation hearing (.5).	0.50	657.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 8

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

12/01/25	RH9	Draft confirmation hearing script (7.4).	7.40	9,731.00
12/01/25	RH9	Implement edits and comments to the proposed confirmation order (1.4).	1.40	1,841.00
12/01/25	EM	Conference with P. Tomasco, B. Roth, R. Harrington, A. Jaquet re: plan confirmation (.4); draft the agenda for the plan confirmation hearing (4.1).	4.50	3,195.00
12/01/25	BR4	Call (partial) with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding case updates and confirmation planning (0.4); call with the Quinn Emanuel team regarding the confirmation hearing (0.5).	0.90	1,449.00
12/01/25	RI	Review and revise the confirmation brief, legal research regarding same (5.7).	5.70	9,490.50
12/02/25	AJ4	Review and revise the draft plan supplement and exhibits and the proposed confirmation order. (12.5).	12.50	20,125.00
12/02/25	RI	Correspondence with plan proponents regarding plan, conference with ELG Digital Horizons (1.5); review and revise the plan supplement (5.8); review and analyze plan and exhibits (1.5), prepare for confirmation hearing (2.0).	10.80	17,982.00
12/02/25	RH9	Conference with team to discuss preparations for the confirmation hearing (.5).	0.50	657.50
12/02/25	RH9	Revise the confirmation hearing script (.7).	0.70	920.50
12/02/25	PT	Prepare and participate in call regarding severance exhibit with L. Weber, R. Izakelian, T. Schmeltz, K. Kansa, M. Hurley, K. Zaharis, A. Schultz (.4); witness preparation with M. Robinson (1.6); review and revise	7.10	13,809.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 9

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

		proposed hearing agenda and suggest additions (.9); coordinate hearing preparation with B. Howell (.2); prepare for and meet with T. Schmeltz, S. Schultz and D. Eaton regarding hearing preparation (1.1); review and revise the proposed confirmation order to resolve plan objections (.5); review and comment on the confirmation script and additions to same (.8); review and revise the plan administrator agreement (.3); correspondence regarding revised plan supplement and filing of revised proposed confirmation order (.9); review retained cause of action changes and suggest changes to S. Schultz (.4).		
12/02/25	BR4	Call with Quinn Emanuel team regarding confirmation (0.7).	0.70	1,127.00
12/02/25	BH2	Revise and file the Agenda (1.1); revise the Amended Agenda and file same (.6); finalize and file the Amended Plan Supplement (.9); finalize and file the Amended Exhibit List (1.3); assist attorneys with confirmation trial preparation (9.7).	13.60	8,908.00
12/03/25	AJ4	Coordinate filing the plan supplement and revised plan supplement with B. Howell (0.7); prepare for and attend hearing (6.5).	7.20	11,592.00
12/03/25	RI	Prepare for confirmation (3.0); attend confirmation hearing (6.0).	9.00	14,985.00
12/03/25	PT	Multiple conferences to prepare for confirmation hearing (3.3); prepare and attend Confirmation hearing and follow on Lehotsky Keller Cohn dispute to protect for privilege (5.1).	8.40	16,338.00
12/03/25	BH2	Draft a Notice of Redline (.4) and file same (.3); file numerous documents on behalf of the Debtors as requested	1.30	851.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 10

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

		by the Court during the confirmation hearing (.6).		
12/03/25	BH2	Continue to prepare for the confirmation hearing (1.9); attend the morning session of the confirmation hearing (2.5); assist attorneys during the afternoon session with obtaining documents and delivery to court (.9).	5.30	3,471.50
12/03/25	BR4	Attend confirmation hearing (partial) (2.3).	2.30	3,703.00
12/04/25	RH9	Legal research into privilege issues (1.0).	1.00	1,315.00
12/04/25	BH2	Review the Courtroom Minutes from December 3, 2025, confirmation hearing (.1) and email R. Izakelian and P. Tomasco regarding the Exhibit List (.1); prepare an amended Exhibit List adding the Docket numbers as requested by the Court (.9); file same (.3).	1.40	917.00
12/04/25	PT	Prepare and participate in conference with R. Harrington, R. Izakelian, A. Jaquet, B. Roth, regarding privilege research requested by Court (.5); follow up review of at-issue waiver (.7); coordinate preparation of amended exhibit list with E. Moore and B. Howell (.4); follow up with S. Schultz regarding admitted exhibits and transcript for continued confirmation hearing (.2).	1.80	3,501.00
12/05/25	AJ4	Prepare a memorandum regarding the confirmation hearing (1.5).	1.50	2,415.00
12/07/25	CK5	Call with P. Tomasco, Akin team, and Barnes & Thornberg team re confirmation scheduling (0.5).	0.50	780.00
12/07/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a strategy call with S. Schultz, M. Hurley, and C. Kelly regarding rescheduling a hearing on	1.20	2,334.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 11

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

		confirmation and next steps (.9); correspond with C. Kelly regarding scheduling issues (.3).		
12/08/25	CK5	Attention to confirmation scheduling, including calls with Chambers and P. Tomasco (0.5).	0.50	780.00
12/08/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a call regarding scheduling a continued confirmation hearing with M. Hurley, C. Potter, D. Eaton (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
12/10/25	PT	Prepare and participate in a call regarding Eaton preparation with P. Lohse, T. Schmeltz, D. Eaton, M. Robinson, M. Hurley, S. Schultz, B. Funk, C. Potter (.3).	0.30	583.50
12/11/25	CK5	Attend continued confirmation hearing (1.5).	1.50	2,340.00
12/11/25	PT	Correspondence with plan support parties regarding confirmation hearing strategy and recommendations (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
12/12/25	PT	Conference with D. Eaton regarding confirmation issues and planning (.7).	0.70	1,361.50
12/17/25	PT	Correspond with R. Izakelian regarding strategy for continued confirmation hearing (.3); follow up correspondence regarding results of hearing (.2); call with R. Izakelian regarding hearing. (.3).	0.80	1,556.00
12/17/25	RI	Attend confirmation hearing (3.0); review and revise the proposed confirmation order and order on motion to enforce PSA (1.2).	4.20	6,993.00
12/17/25	BH2	Draft the Notice of Effective Date (.9).	0.90	589.50
12/19/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in a call to discuss revisions to the Confirmation Order with S. Schultz and strategy for streamlining issues (.6).	0.60	1,167.00

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

January 15, 2026

Page 12

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

12/19/25	PT	Correspondence with C. Topping regarding implementation of the plan, the effective date, and employment terminations issues associated therewith (1.4).	1.40	2,723.00
12/19/25	BH2	Finalize (.3) and file the proposed Confirmation Order (.3).	0.60	393.00
12/19/25	RI	Review and revise the proposed confirmation order (.5), review and revise the motion for administrative claims bar date (.4), review and revise the notice of effective date (.4).	1.30	2,164.50
12/19/25	AJ4	Review and revise the bar date motion for administrative claims and notice of effective date (3.2); correspond with P. Tomasco, B. Howell, and R. Izakelian in connection with the same (0.3).	3.50	5,635.00
12/23/25	PT	Prepare for hearing (1.0); attend hearing on motion setting bar date for filing proofs of administrative expense claims (.4); coordinate uploading of revised order and redline (.5).	1.90	3,695.50
12/28/25	PT	Correspondence with the Akin team regarding the effective date planning and lack of communication regarding same (.2); correspond with C. Topping regarding same (.1).	0.30	583.50
12/29/25	PT	Prepare for and participate in the Rhodium Plan Effectiveness Checkpoint Call with C. Topping, T. Schmeltz, M. Robinson, A. Popescu, K. Hays, Chase Blackmon, Cameron Blackmon, M. Soule (.6).	0.60	1,167.00
12/30/25	PT	Prepare and participate in Plan Effectiveness Touchpoint Call with C. Topping, K. Kansa, R. Izakelian, M. Robinson, A. Popescu, Chase	0.70	1,361.50

**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**January 15, 2026  
Page 13Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

		Blackmon, Cameron Blackmon, K. Hays, M. Soule (.7).		
12/31/25	PT	Prepare and participate in Plan Effectiveness Touchpoint Call with C. Topping, K. Kansa, R. Izakelian, M. Robinson, A. Popescu, Chase Blackmon, Cameron Blackmon, K. Hays, M. Soule (.4).	0.40	778.00
SUBTOTAL			159.30	229,265.50

**Fee Summary**

<b>Attorneys</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Patty Tomasco	PT	Partner	46.30	1,945.00	90,053.50
Razmig Izakelian	RI	Associate	39.80	1,665.00	66,267.00
Alain Jaquet	AJ4	Associate	36.10	1,610.00	58,121.00
Ben Roth	BR4	Associate	4.60	1,610.00	7,406.00
Cameron Kelly	CK5	Associate	2.50	1,560.00	3,900.00
Rachel Harrington	RH9	Associate	14.50	1,315.00	19,067.50
Emily Moore	EM	Law Clerk	4.50	710.00	3,195.00
<b>Case Assistants</b>	<b>Init.</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Barbara J Howell	BH2	Paralegal	53.80	655.00	35,239.00

**Expense Summary**

<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Meals during travel	41.34
Hearing transcript(s)	348.95
Document Reproduction	0.10
Travel	198.92
Color Document Reproduction	0.25
Word processing	0.00
Hotel	165.19
Velobind	84.84
Out-of-Town Travel	170.14

# quinn emanuel trial lawyers

January 15, 2026  
Page 14

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000203054

Description	Amount
Air travel	1,372.95
Local meals	350.73
Tabs	280.50

## Litigation Support Costs

Database Archiving per GB	0.00
RelOne Active Hosting (Per GB)	8,252.16
Total Expenses	\$13,826.97

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	Chapter 11
	§	
RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>	§	Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)
	§	
Debtors.	§	
	§	
	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	

**QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART & SULLIVAN, LLP’S  
SEVENTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR THE PERIOD  
JANUARY 1, 2026, THROUGH JANUARY 14, 2026**

Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) submits, pursuant to the Order Granting the Motion of the Debtors to Establish Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (Docket No. 264) entered on October 14, 2024, this monthly fee statement for the payment of interim compensation rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the period January 1, 2026, through January 14, 2026 (the “Seventeenth Monthly Fee Statement”).

Quinn Emanuel seeks payment of interim compensation in the total amount of \$17,895.20 (80% of the services rendered), plus \$0.00 (100% of the interim expenses incurred). Summaries of the fees and expenses are in Exhibits A, B, and C. An invoice reflecting detailed time entries is attached hereto as Exhibit D.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any party objecting to the payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses shall serve within 14 days after service of the Seventeenth Monthly Fee Statement a written notice, via email, upon Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties (as listed below) (the “Written Notice”). The Written Notice shall specifically identify the objectionable fees and expenses, including the amount at issue and the basis for the objection. If the parties are unable to reach a resolution of the objection within 14 calendar days, the objecting party shall file its objection (the “Objection”) with this Court within 3 business days and serve such Objection on Quinn Emanuel and each of the other Fee Notice Parties. *See* Interim Compensation Order, ¶ 1(a)(c).

The Fee Notice Parties as defined in the Interim Compensation Order are:

- i. Rhodium Enterprises, Inc., Attn: Charles Topping ([chucktopping@rhdm.com](mailto:chucktopping@rhdm.com)) and Morgan Soule ([morgansoule@rhdm.com](mailto:morgansoule@rhdm.com)), 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, Texas 77005;
- ii. Debtors’ Bankruptcy Counsel, c/o Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco ([pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)); Razmig Izakelian ([razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)), and Alain Jaquet ([alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)), 700 Louisiana, Suite 3900, Houston, Texas 77002;
- iii. Debtors’ Financial Advisor, c/o Province, Attn: Mark Robinson ([mrobinson@provincefirm.com](mailto:mrobinson@provincefirm.com)); David Dunn ([ddunn@provincefirm.com](mailto:ddunn@provincefirm.com)); Kirsten Lee ([klee@province.com](mailto:klee@province.com)); and Andrew Popescu ([apopescu@provincefirm.com](mailto:apopescu@provincefirm.com)), 2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340, Henderson, Nevada 89074;
- iv. Galaxy Digital, LLC, in its capacity as DIP Agent, c/o Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP, Ryan C. Wooten ([rwooten@orrick.com](mailto:rwooten@orrick.com)), 609 Main, 40<sup>th</sup> Floor, Houston, Texas 77002, and Robert Trust ([rtrust@orrick.com](mailto:rtrust@orrick.com)), Mark Franke ([mfranke@orrick.com](mailto:mfranke@orrick.com)) and Brandon Batzel ([bbatzel@orrick.com](mailto:bbatzel@orrick.com)), 51 West 52<sup>nd</sup> Street, New York, New York 10019;
- v. Counsel for the Committee of Unsecured Creditors, c/o McDermott Will & Emery LLP, 2501 North Harwood St., Suite 1900, Dallas, Texas 75201, Attn: Charles R. Gibbs ([crgibbs@mwe.com](mailto:crgibbs@mwe.com)); and

- vi. United States Trustee, Ha Minh Nguyen ([ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov](mailto:ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov)), 515 Rusk, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002.

If no objection is timely served pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay Quinn Emanuel an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses listed herein, or if an objection is timely served, such percentage of fees and expenses that are not subject to an objection, as stated in the Interim Compensation Order.

Respectfully submitted this 11th day of February, 2026.

QUINN EMANUEL URQUHART &  
SULLIVAN, LLP

/s/ Patricia B. Tomasco

Patricia B. Tomasco (SBN 01797600)  
Cameron Kelly (SBN 24120936)  
Alain Jaquet (*pro hac vice*)  
Rachel Harrington (*pro hac vice*)  
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 3900  
Houston, Texas 77002  
Telephone: 713-221-7000  
Facsimile: 713-221-7100  
Email: [pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:pattytomasco@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:cameronkelly@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:alainjaquet@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:rachelharrington@quinnemanuel.com)

- and -

Eric Winston (*pro hac vice*)  
Razmig Izakelian (*pro hac vice*)  
Ben Roth (*pro hac vice*)  
865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017  
Telephone: 213-443-3000  
Facsimile: 213-443-3100  
Email: [ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:ericwinston@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:razmigizakelian@quinnemanuel.com)  
Email: [benroth@quinnemanuel.com](mailto:benroth@quinnemanuel.com)

*Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A****Summary of Legal Fees for the Fee Period**

Matter Number	Matter Description	Total Hours Billed	Total Fees Requested	Total Fees With 20% Discount
vi	Case Administration	2.4	\$2,030.00	\$1,624.00
vii	Claims Administration and Objections	.2	\$446.00	\$356.80
viii	Corporate Governance and Board Matters	1.8	\$4,014.00	\$3,211.20
x	Employment and Fee Applications	3.3	\$2,376.00	\$1,900.80
xii	Litigation	.4	\$288.00	\$230.40
xiv	Plan and Disclosure Statement	6.4	\$13,215.00	\$10,572.00
	Total	14.5	\$22,369.00	\$17,895.20

**EXHIBIT B****Summary of Hours Billed by Quinn Emanuel Attorneys and Paraprofessionals**

Professional	Position With The Applicant	Year Admitted	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Patricia B. Tomasco	Partner	1988	Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$2,230.00	7.9	\$17,617.00
Barbara J. Howell	Paralegal		Bankruptcy & Restructuring	\$720.00	6.6	\$4,752.00
Total					14.5	\$22,369.00

**EXHIBIT C**

**Summary of Expenses for the Fee Period**

Expense	Amount
Total	\$0.00

# quinn emanuel trial lawyers

865 S. Figueroa Street, 10th Floor  
Los Angeles, California 90017

February 05, 2026

Cameron Blackmon  
Rhodium Enterprises, Inc.  
4146 W US Highway 79  
Rockdale, TX 76567

Matter #: 12875-00001  
Invoice Number: 101-0000204236  
Responsible Attorney: Patty Tomasco

Rhodium- restructure of company

For Professional Services through January 14, 2026 in connection with a potential restructuring of this crypto mining company.

Fees	\$22,369.00
Expenses	<u>\$0.00</u>
Total Due This Invoice	\$22,369.00
Balance Due from Previous Statement(s)	\$1,135,293.82
Total Balance Due	<u><u>\$1,157,662.82</u></u>

**Confidential – May include attorney-client privileged and work-product information**



**quinn emanuel trial lawyers**

February 05, 2026

Page 3

Matter #: 12875-00001

Invoice Number: 101-0000204236

		application (.3).		
01/14/26	BH2	Begin to prepare the December monthly fee statement (2.1).	2.10	1,512.00
		SUBTOTAL	3.30	2,376.00

**xii Litigation**

01/13/26	BH2	Review the Notices of Filing of an Appeal (.2) and calendar deadlines (.2).	0.40	288.00
		SUBTOTAL	0.40	288.00

**xiv Plan and Disclosure Statement**

01/06/26	PT	Emails regarding effective date issues with C. Topping and T. Schmeltz and plan administrator transition issues; emails with S. Schultz regarding same (1.1).	1.10	2,453.00
01/07/26	PT	Correspondence with C. Topping regarding effective date transition issues and employee contracts and privilege issues (.4); follow up correspondence regarding ongoing duties and responsibilities prior to effective date (.3).	0.70	1,561.00
01/09/26	PT	Telephone conference with C. Topping regarding plan effective date issues (.4); prepare (.2) and participate in call with M. Hurley, S. Schultz regarding issues regarding payment of LKC fee award and effective date issues (.3); correspondence with C. Topping regarding effective date issues (.3).	1.20	2,676.00
01/10/26	PT	Correspondence with C. Topping regarding effective date issues (.6).	0.60	1,338.00
01/12/26	PT	Prepare and participate in plan effective date call with M. Hurley, S.	0.40	892.00



**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS  
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	Chapter 11
	§	
RHODIUM ENCORE LLC, <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>	§	Case No. 24-90448 (ARP)
	§	
Debtors.	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	
	§	

**ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**

(Relates to Docket No. \_\_\_\_\_)

The Court, having considered the Fifth and Final Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed by Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (the “*Applicant*”), orders:

1. The Applicant is allowed compensation and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$2,011,039.92 for the period set forth in the application.
2. The compensation and reimbursement of expenses allowed in this order and all previous interim allowances of compensation and reimbursement of expenses are approved on a final basis.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their corporate identification numbers are as follows: Rhodium Encore LLC (3974), Jordan HPC LLC (3683), Rhodium JV LLC (5323), Rhodium 2.0 LLC (1013), Rhodium 10MW LLC (4142), Rhodium 30MW LLC (0263), Rhodium Enterprises, Inc. (6290), Rhodium Technologies LLC (3973), Rhodium Renewables LLC (0748), Air HPC LLC (0387), Rhodium Shared Services LLC (5868), Rhodium Ready Ventures LLC (8618), Rhodium Industries LLC (4771), Rhodium Encore Sub LLC (1064), Jordan HPC Sub LLC (0463), Rhodium 2.0 Sub LLC (5319), Rhodium 10MW Sub LLC (3827), Rhodium 30MW Sub LLC (4386), and Rhodium Renewables Sub LLC (9511). The mailing and service address of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is 2617 Bissonnet Street, Suite 234, Houston, TX 77005.

3. The Debtors are authorized to disburse any unpaid amounts allowed by paragraphs 1 and 2 of this Order.

Signed:

---

Alfredo R. Perez  
United States Bankruptcy Judge