#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

### SUMMARY OF THE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 5, 2024

Name of Applicant:	Greenhill & Co., LLC				
Applicant's Role in Case:	Investment Banker to the Debtors				
Date of Retention:	September 19, 2023, effect	ive as of July 27, 2023			
Second Int	terim Period				
	<b>Beginning of Period</b>	End of Period			
Time period covered by the Second Interim Fee					
Period	December 1, 2023	April 5, 2024			
Summary of Total Fees	and Expenses Requested:				
Amount of Compensation sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$9,539,583.33				
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$151.87				
Final Compe	ensation Period				
	Beginning of Period	End of Period			
Time period covered by the Final Fee Period	July 27, 2023	April 5, 2024			
Summary of Total Fees	and Expenses Requested:				
Amount of Compensation sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$10,239,583.33				
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$1,798.67				

This is a(n) monthly <u>X</u> interim <u>X</u> final application.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.



## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 2 of 197

		Requ	ested		Outstanding		
Date Filed [Docket Number]	Period Covered	Fees Expenses		Fees	Expenses	Amount Paid	Fees and Expenses
		F	irst Interim Peri	od			
1/15/24 [No. 661]	7/27/23 - 11/30/23	\$700,000.00	\$1,646.80 <sup>2</sup>	\$630,000.00	\$1,646.80	\$631,646.80	\$70,000.00
		Monthly Fee Sta	tements in Secon	d Interim Period	1		
1/31/24 [No. 711]	12/1/23 - 12/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$0.00	\$140,000.00	\$0.00	\$140,000.00	\$35,000.00
3/1/24 [No. 777]	1/1/24 - 1/31/24	\$9,175,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,340,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,340,127.32	\$1,835,000.00
3/29/24 [No. 844]	2/1/24 - 2/29/24	\$87,500.00	\$0.00	\$70,000.00	\$0.00	\$70,000.00	\$17,500.00
4/30/24 [No. 884]	3/1/24 - 4/5/24	\$102,083.33	\$24.55	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$102,107.88
Subtotal: Second Int	erim Period	\$9,539,583.33	\$151.87	\$7,550,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,550,127.32	\$1,989,607.88
Total: Final Compen	sation Period	\$10,239,583.33	\$1,798.67	\$8,180,000.00	\$1,774.12	\$8,181,774.12	\$2,059,607.88

## **Previously Filed Fee Statements**

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Reflects \$2,373.17 of expenses, net of \$726.37 of voluntary crediting as a result of discussions with the U.S. trustee, per the Omnibus Order Approving the First Interim Fee Application of Professionals for Allowance and Payment of Interim Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred [Docket No. 737].

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 3 of 197

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employees During the Interim and Final Compensation Periods (July 27, 2023 Through April 5, 2024)

Name of Professional	Position	First Interim Period	Second Interim Period	Total Hours
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	60.50	16.00	76.50
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	141.00	20.50	161.50
Will Whiffen	Managing Director	115.50	19.00	134.50
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	122.50	32.50	155.00
Eli Becker	Vice President	55.00	24.00	79.00
Noah Bronstein	Vice President	48.50	27.50	76.00
Linda Wang	Analyst	235.50	120.50	356.00
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	65.00	19.50	84.50
Total	•	843.50	279.50	1,123.00

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 4 of 197

Summary of Hours of Service by Category					
<b>During the Interim and Final Compensation Periods</b>					
(July 27, 2023 Through April 5, 2024)					

Project Category	First Interim Period	Second Interim Period	Total Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	290.75	95.50	386.25
General Administrative	37.50	1.00	38.50
General Presentation Preparation	78.00	3.00	81.00
Financial Analysis / Modeling	156.75	127.00	283.75
Financial Due Diligence	13.00	0.00	13.00
Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	9.50	2.00	11.50
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	119.50	18.00	137.50
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	21.00	21.50	42.50
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	117.50	11.50	129.00
Total	843.50	279.50	1,123.00

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 5 of 197

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category (July 27, 2023 Through April 5, 2024)

First Interim Period

	Advisor / Management		General	Financial		Board - Calls /	Court Hearings /		Stakeholder	
Professional	Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	Presentation Preparation	Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Meeting / Discussions	Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	34.00	-	-	-	-	1.50	12.00	-	13.00	60.50
Chandiramani	59.75	2.50	8.00	1.00	2.00	5.00	31.50	4.00	27.25	141.00
Whiffen	41.00	-	23.00	13.50	11.00	2.00	10.50	-	14.50	115.50
McCarthy	53.00	3.00	12.50	3.00	-	1.00	22.50	-	27.50	122.50
Becker	26.50	4.00	5.00	-	-	-	9.50	-	10.00	55.00
Bronstein	14.00	1.00	-	22.50	-	-	7.00	0.50	3.50	48.50
Wang	38.00	14.00	21.50	116.75	-	-	18.50	16.50	10.25	235.50
Dayananda	24.50	13.00	8.00	-	-	-	8.00	-	11.50	65.00
Total	290.75	37.50	78.00	156.75	13.00	9.50	119.50	21.00	117.50	843.50

#### Second Interim Period

Einal Com

	Advisor /									
	Management	<u> </u>	General	Financial		Board - Calls /	Court Hearings /		Stakeholder	
Professional	Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	Presentation Preparation	Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Meeting / Discussions	Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	12.00	-	-	-	-	-	2.00	-	2.00	16.00
Chandiramani	14.00	-	-	-	-	1.00	3.50	-	2.00	20.50
Whiffen	12.50	-	-	4.00	-	-	1.00	-	1.50	19.00
McCarthy	14.00	-	-	11.00	-	1.00	5.50	-	1.00	32.50
Becker	12.50	-	-	9.00	-	-	1.50	-	1.00	24.00
Bronstein	12.00	-	0.50	10.00	-	-	2.50	1.50	1.00	27.50
Wang	14.00	0.50	2.50	79.50	-	-	2.00	20.00	2.00	120.50
Dayananda	4.50	0.50	-	13.50	-	-	-	-	1.00	19.50
Total	95.50	1.00	3.00	127.00	-	2.00	18.00	21.50	11.50	279.50

Final Compensi	sation Period									
Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	46.00	-	-	-	-	1.50	14.00	-	15.00	76.50
Chandiramani	73.75	2.50	8.00	1.00	2.00	6.00	35.00	4.00	29.25	161.50
Whiffen	53.50	-	23.00	17.50	11.00	2.00	11.50	-	16.00	134.50
McCarthy	67.00	3.00	12.50	14.00	-	2.00	28.00	-	28.50	155.00
Becker	39.00	4.00	5.00	9.00	-	-	11.00	-	11.00	79.00
Bronstein	26.00	1.00	0.50	32.50	-	-	9.50	2.00	4.50	76.00
Wang	52.00	14.50	24.00	196.25	-	-	20.50	36.50	12.25	356.00
Dayananda	29.00	13.50	8.00	13.50	-	-	8.00	-	12.50	84.50
Total	386.25	38.50	81.00	283.75	13.00	11.50	137.50	42.50	129.00	1,123.00

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 6 of 197

## Summary of Expenses During the Final Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through April 5, 2024)

Expense Category	Jul 23	Aug 23	Sep 23	Oct 23	Nov 23	Mar 24	Total
Taxi	\$52.84	\$611.03	\$-	\$277.28	\$88.97	\$-	\$1,030.12
Taxi - OT	-	471.19	-	4.16	-	-	475.35
Mobile/Cellular Phone	-	248.25	32.55	203.44	170.16	-	654.40
Meals - Overtime	-	221.82	25.93	82.87	-	24.55	355.17
Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	-	10.00	-	-	-	-	10.00
Crediting	-	-	-	-	-	-	(726.37)
Total	\$52.84	\$1,562.29	\$58.48	\$567.75	\$259.13	\$24.55	\$1,798.67

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 7 of 197

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

### SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 5, 2024

Pursuant to sections 105, 327(a), 328(a), 330(a) and 363 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "<u>Bankruptcy Code</u>"), Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 2014, and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the Southern District of New York (the "<u>Local Rules</u>"), the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [Docket No. 240] (the "<u>Interim Compensation Order</u>"), and the *Order Authorizing Employment and Retention of Greenhill & Co., LLC as the Debtors' Financial Advisor and Investment Banker, Effective as of July 27, 2023* [Docket No. 235] (the "<u>Retention Order</u>"), Greenhill & Co., LLC ("<u>Greenhill</u>") hereby files this application (this "<u>Second Interim and Final</u> <u>Fee Application</u>") seeking (i) interim allowance of compensation for professional services performed by Greenhill during the period commencing December 1, 2023, through and including

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 8 of 197

April 5, 2024 (the "<u>Second Interim Period</u>") in the amount of \$9,539,583.33, and for reimbursement of its actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$151.87; and (ii) final allowance of compensation for professional services performed by Greenhill during the period commencing on July 27, 2023, through and including April 5, 2024 (the "<u>Final Compensation Period</u>") in the amount of \$10,239,583.33 and reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$1,798.67. This Second Interim and Final Fee Application has been prepared in accordance with *General Order M-447*, *the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York* (June 17, 2013) pursuant to Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-1(a) (the "Local Guidelines.

In support of this Second Interim and Final Fee Application, Greenhill respectfully represents as follows:

#### JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (this "<u>Court</u>") has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other legal bases for the relief requested herein are sections 327(a), 328(a), 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-1.

#### **BACKGROUND**

3. On July 27, 2023 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the Debtors commenced with the Court voluntary cases (the "<u>Chapter 11 Cases</u>") under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. Throughout

2

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 9 of 197

the Chapter 11 Cases, the Debtors operated their businesses and managed their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

4. Greenhill was retained effective as of the Petition Date pursuant to the Retention Order. The Retention Order authorized Greenhill to be compensated pursuant to its engagement letter, a copy of which is attached to Greenhill's retention application [Docket No. 111] as <u>Exhibit</u> <u>C</u> (the "<u>Engagement Letter</u>") and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.

5. On March 18, 2024, the Debtors filed the Second Modified Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al. [Docket No. 802]. On March 22, 2024, the Court entered the Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Order Approving the Second Modified Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al. [Docket No. 838].

6. On April 5, 2024, the effective date occurred with respect to all Debtors except for the A330 MSN 1432 Limited and A330 MSN 1579 Limited Debtors.

#### **RELIEF REQUESTED**

7. By this Second Interim and Final Fee Application, Greenhill seeks entry of an order (i) approving compensation of \$9,539,583.33 for professional services provided to the Debtors and reimbursement of \$151.87 in actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Second Interim Period; (ii) approving compensation of \$10,239,583.33 for professional services provided to the Debtors and reimbursement of \$1,798.67 in actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period; and (iii) directing payment of all such allowed compensation and actual and necessary expenses less any amount previously paid for such compensation, equivalent to \$2,059,607.88.

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 10 of 197

8. Pursuant to the terms of the Engagement Letter, Greenhill earned \$10,239,583.33 in compensation, consisting of the Change of Control M&A Fee (\$9,000,000.00) and Monthly Advisory Fees (\$175,000.00 per month) for the months of August 2023 through April 2024. The Monthly Advisory Fee for April 2024 was pro-rated for April 1 through April 5, and the Monthly Advisory Fees from February, March, and April 2024 reflected 50% crediting. In addition, Greenhill incurred actual and necessary expenses associated with providing professional services to the Debtors during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$1,798.67.

		Requ	ested		Approved			
Date Filed [Docket Number]	Period Covered	Fees Expenses		Fees	Expenses	Amount Paid	Fees and Expenses	
		F	irst Interim Perio	od				
1/15/24 [No. 661]	7/27/23 - 11/30/23	\$700,000.00	\$1,646.80 <sup>2</sup>	\$630,000.00	\$1,646.80	\$631,646.80	\$70,000.00	
Monthly Fee Statements in Se				d Interim Period	1			
1/31/24 [No. 711]	12/1/23 - 12/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$0.00	\$140,000.00	\$0.00	\$140,000.00	\$35,000.00	
3/1/24 [No. 777]	1/1/24 - 1/31/24	\$9,175,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,340,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,340,127.32	\$1,835,000.00	
3/29/24 [No. 844]	2/1/24 - 2/29/24	\$87,500.00	\$0.00	\$70,000.00	\$0.00	\$70,000.00	\$17,500.00	
4/30/24 [No. 884]	3/1/24 - 4/5/24	\$102,083.33	\$24.55	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$102,107.88	
Subtotal: Second Inte	erim Period	\$9,539,583.33	\$151.87	\$7,550,000.00	\$127.32	\$7,550,127.32	\$1,989,607.88	
Total: Final Compen	sation Period	\$10,239,583.33	\$1,798.67	\$8,180,000.00	\$1,774.12	\$8,181,774.12	\$2,059,607.88	

9. All services for which Greenhill requests compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors and were not duplicative in nature with the Debtors' other advisors.

10. Greenhill does not bill its clients based on the number of hours expended by its professionals. Accordingly, Greenhill does not have hourly rates for its professionals, and Greenhill's professionals generally do not maintain time records for the work performed for its clients. Consistent with the terms of the Retention Order, however, Greenhill has maintained a

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Reflects \$2,373.17 of expenses, net of \$726.37 of voluntary crediting as a result of discussions with the U.S. trustee, per the Omnibus Order Approving the First Interim Fee Application of Professionals for Allowance and Payment of Interim Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and for Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred [Docket No. 737].

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 11 of 197

daily time log detailing the activities and services performed by Greenhill on behalf of the Debtors, in half hour increments, during the Final Compensation Period, attached hereto in **Exhibit B**.

### **SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED**<sup>3</sup>

11. In accordance with (i) the Retention Order, (ii) the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules and the Local Rules, (iii) the Interim Compensation Order; and (iv) the U.S. Trustee Guidelines (collectively, the "<u>Guidelines</u>") and its internal timekeeping procedures, Greenhill has established the following categorization of matters in order to provide a meaningful summary of services rendered on behalf of the Debtors and their estates in connection with these Chapter 11 Cases:

Matter number	Matter description
1	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls
2	General Administrative
3	General Presentation Preparation
4	Financial Analysis / Modeling
5	Financial Due Diligence
6	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions
7	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation
8	Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice
9	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items

12. Consistent with the Guidelines, the following summaries highlight certain key areas

in which Greenhill provided essential services to the Debtors during the applicable periods.

### A. Advisor / Management Meetings / Internal Calls (Matter #1)

# Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 95.50

**Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 386.25** 

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> This summary is not intended to be a detailed description of the work Greenhill has performed during the Final Compensation Period but rather is a guideline offered to the Court and other interested parties with respect to the services performed by Greenhill.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 12 of 197

13. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals corresponding (and preparation thereof) with the management team, the Debtors' other advisors, and among the Greenhill team itself, on matters related to the restructuring process, the sale process, the Chapter 11 Cases, ongoing strategy, and/or other related topics.

#### **B.** General Administrative (Matter #2)

## Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 1.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 38.50

14. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals performing general administrative tasks, including, but not limited to, team coordination, issuing invoices, and responding to correspondence from the Debtors' other advisors.

## C. General Presentation Preparation (Matter #3)

## Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 3.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 81.00

15. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals preparing various presentations and marketing materials for internal purposes, potential investors, the Board of Directors, creditors, and various other stakeholders on a range of topics including, but not limited to, the sale process, stakeholder negotiations and settlements, and other related topics.

#### D. Financial Analysis / Modeling (Matter #4)

Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 127.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 283.75

16. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals performing financial analyses and preparing various schedules and files for internal (*e.g.*, management, the Board of Directors) and external consumption (*e.g.*, potential investors, stakeholders). Greenhill performed numerous financial analyses, including, but not limited to, review of the Debtors' capital structure,

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 13 of 197

settlement returns analysis, stakeholder recovery analyses, sale process scenario and purchase price analyses, and other specific analyses as required.

#### E. Financial Due Diligence (Matter #5)

## Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 0.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 13.00

17. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill facilitating due diligence requests for internal (*e.g.*, management, the Board of Directors, the Special Committee) and external consumption (*e.g.*, potential investors, stakeholders, the Court). This category also involves time spent coordinating phone meetings with the Debtors' management to conduct internal diligence.

### F. Board - Calls / Meetings / Discussions (Matter #6)

## Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 2.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 11.50

18. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating in calls and meetings with the Debtors' Board of Directors and time spent preparing for those calls and meetings.

### G. Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation (Matter #7)

## Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 18.00 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 137.50

19. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating in and listening to Court hearings in its capacity as investment banker to the Debtors, including time spent engaged in research, performing requisite analyses, and reviewing or preparing relevant documents in preparation for such Court proceedings and related matters (including, but not limited to, the *Declaration of Vinod Chandiramani in Support of Debtors' Motion for Entry of an Order Authorizing Allowance and Payment of the Purchaser Protections in Support of the Plan and Consummation of the Azorra Aircraft Sale* [Docket No. 41] and *Declaration of Michael Masterson* 

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 14 of 197

in Support of the Debtors' Motion for Entry of Orders (I) (A) Conditionally Scheduling a Sale Hearing and (B) Approving the Form and Manner of Notice Thereof; (II) (A) Authorizing the Private Sale of the Target Assets Free and Clear of All Encumbrances Pursuant to the Purchase Agreement and (B) Granting Related Relief [Docket No. 49]).

#### H. Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice (Matter #8)

Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 21.50 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 42.50

20. This category includes time spent by Greenhill professionals recording hours as well as preparing and reviewing fee statements, fee applications and / or related analyses.

# I. Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items (Matter #9) Total hours during the Second Interim Period: 11.50 Total hours during the Final Compensation Period: 129.00

21. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating in calls or engaging in other correspondence with the Debtors' stakeholders, including lenders, potential buyers, potential investors, and other stakeholders and their professionals. Topics for such discussions were typically focused on sale process updates, settlement framework conversations, and recovery/waterfall analyses.

#### ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

22. Senior-level professionals with extensive experience in investment banking services have directed Greenhill's team. Greenhill's general staffing policy is to assign senior bankers, experienced junior bankers, and financial analysts to each assignment. The senior bankers in these Chapter 11 Cases, Michael Masterson and Vinod Chandiramani, have overall responsibility for the cases. They are primarily responsible for developing strategy with respect

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 15 of 197

to the cases, directing negotiations, and interfacing with the other senior professionals involved with the cases. Greenhill team members coordinate their actions so as to not duplicate efforts.

23. The amount of fees and expenses sought in this Second Interim and Final Fee Application and Greenhill's billing processes are consistent with market practices for investment banking firms both in and out of a bankruptcy context. Greenhill's policy for all engagements, in or out of bankruptcy, is to dedicate the appropriate number of professionals to the assignment to complete the work as efficiently as possible.

24. Greenhill believes that the time entries set forth in the exhibits attached hereto are in compliance with the Retention Order. Furthermore, Greenhill is entitled to reimbursement of reasonable and documented out-of-pocket expenses incurred in connection with the providing of services pursuant to the Retention Order during the Final Compensation Period.

25. Greenhill has made every appropriate effort to minimize its expenses in these Chapter 11 Cases. All of the fees and expenses for which allowance and payment are requested in this Second Interim and Final Fee Application are reasonable and necessary and were incurred in connection with services rendered during the Final Compensation Period.

26. Although every effort has been made to include all expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period, some expenses might not be included in this Second Interim and Final Fee Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing. Greenhill reserves the right to seek payment of such expenses not included herein.

27. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Greenhill respectfully submits that the amount requested by Greenhill is fair and reasonable given (i) the complexity of the Chapter 11 Cases, (ii) the time expended, (iii) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (iv) the value of such services, and (v) the costs of comparable services in other

9

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 16 of 197

chapter 11 cases. Moreover, Greenhill has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-1(a) and believes that this Application complies with the Local Rules.

#### **BASIS FOR RELIEF**

28. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." The Retention Order approved Greenhill's compensation and expense reimbursement pursuant to section 328 of the Bankruptcy Code, subject to the terms of the Retention Order. Accordingly, compensation is sought subject to the standard of review set forth in section 328 of the Bankruptcy Code and the terms of the Retention Order and not the standard of review set forth in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.

29. The services summarized by this Application and rendered by Greenhill to the Debtors during the Final Compensation Period were substantial, highly professional, and instrumental to the Debtors and their estates. The requested compensation for the foregoing services is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, issues, and tasks involved. The professional services were performed expediently and efficiently, and the compensation requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the Debtors, their estates, and all parties in interest. Accordingly, Greenhill respectfully submits that the compensation and reimbursement requested in this Application is reasonable in light of the nature and value of such services and should be approved.

### [Remainder of page intentionally left blank.]

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 17 of 197

WHEREFORE, Greenhill requests entry of an order (i) approving an allowance of \$9,539,583.33 as compensation for professional services to the Debtors during the Second Interim Period and reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Second Interim Period in the amount of \$151.87, together in the aggregate \$9,539,735.20; (ii) approving an allowance of \$10,239,583.33 as compensation for professional services to the Debtors during the Final Compensation Period and reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period in the amount of \$1,798.67, together in the aggregate \$10,241,382.00; (iii) authorizing and directing the Debtors to pay Greenhill the outstanding balance of \$2,059,607.88; and (iv) granting such other relief as this Court deems proper.

Dated: May 15, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 18 of 197

## EXHIBIT A

**Certification Regarding Compliance with Local Guidelines** 

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 19 of 197

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

### CERTIFICATION OF VINOD CHANDIRAMANI IN SUPPORT OF THE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 5, 2024

I, Vinod Chandiramani, certify as follows:

1. I am a Managing Director of North American Financing Advisory & Restructuring

at Greenhill & Co., LLC ("Greenhill").

2. This certification is made in respect of Greenhill's compliance with *General Order* 

M-447, Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of

New York Bankruptcy Cases pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a) (as updated June 17, 2013) (the

"Local Guidelines") in connection with Greenhill's fee application (this "Second Interim and

Final Fee Application") seeking allowance of compensation for professional services performed

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 20 of 197

by Greenhill during the period commencing on July 27, 2023, through and including April 5, 2024

#### (the "Final Compensation Period").

- 3. In respect of Section B.1 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that:
  - a. I have read the Second Interim and Final Fee Application;
  - b. to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees sought fall within the Local Guidelines; and
  - c. the fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices customarily employed by Greenhill and generally accepted by Greenhill' clients.

4. I certify that Greenhill has provided the information required by the Local Guidelines in the Application and that the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, the Debtors, and counsel for the Debtors are each being provided with a copy of this Application.

Dated: May 15, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 21 of 197

## EXHIBIT B

**Time Records of Greenhill Professionals** 

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 22 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	
7/27/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
/31/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Creditor call
		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
8/1/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/2/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	M, Th Advisor Call
3/7/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/8/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/9/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
3/10/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
3/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
3/14/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	M, Th Advisor Call
3/15/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
3/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
3/17/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
3/21/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
3/22/2023	Masterson	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.50	Board Precall, Meeting
3/24/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
3/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Remarketing Process - Investor Outreach Preparation
3/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
3/29/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Remarketing Process - call w ith Potential Buyer
3/30/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
3/30/2023	Masterson		0.50	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
3/30/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.00	Court Preparation
8/31/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
3/31/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Stakeholder call
3/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/5/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
9/5/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Masterson		1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
9/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
9/12/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/14/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
9/19/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/22/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
9/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
0/2/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/4/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
0/5/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
0/9/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/10/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
0/12/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
	Masterson	5 5	0.50	
0/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/19/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/23/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with Milbank
0/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
0/26/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/30/2023	Masterson		0.50	Advisor call
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
0/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
1/1/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.50	Participation Agreement Hearing
1/2/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/6/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status conference
1/8/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Buyer call
11/9/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Buyer call
1/13/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 23 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	
1/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
1/21/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/4/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
12/4/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
2/12/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/12/2023				Advisor call
	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	
2/19/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/21/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/21/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Plan administrator hearing
1/4/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/16/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/23/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/30/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/6/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/0/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/12/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor strategy call
3/14/2024	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
4/2/2024	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	3.50	Board Meetings
		, in the second s		•
7/27/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	0.50	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor Call
7/29/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation Review
7/30/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Noteholder Diligence Requests
7/31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
7/31/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Advisor / noteholder call
7/31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor strategy call
8/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Discuss diligence request
8/1/2023	Chandiramani		2.00	Declaration review
		Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		
8/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Prospective Investor discussion
8/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Working Group discussion
8/3/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Advisor call
8/3/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Discuss drafting questions
8/3/2023	Chandiramani	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor law yer call
8/6/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
8/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
8/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	General update discussion
8/8/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Liquidation analysis discussion
8/8/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
8/9/2023	Chandiramani	Financial Due Diligence	2.00	Strategy w ork
3/10/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
3/10/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
8/11/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Participation agreement discussion
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
3/12/2023				

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 24 of 197

			1	-
Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
8/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/14/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Update call
8/15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Advisor call - Strategy
8/16/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder counsel call
8/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call - Strategy
8/17/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call - Strategy
8/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discuss diligence request
8/19/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
8/20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Participation agreement discussion
8/20/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/21/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/22/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
8/22/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Board Meeting materials review
8/22/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board meeting
8/22/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Retention app review
8/24/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/24/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor Call
8/24/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
8/24/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder strategy call
8/25/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Bidding procedures discussion
8/25/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Retention app review
8/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/29/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor Call
8/29/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	Declaration review
8/30/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	4.00	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	Declaration review
8/31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Preparing for hearing
8/31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.00	Omnibus Hearing
8/31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/4/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/5/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Recovery analysis catch up
9/6/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Discussions / Comments related to retention order
9/11/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Revised potential retention order
9/11/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/11/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third party situation catch up
9/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor call
9/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor call
9/18/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	1.00	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/19/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	1.00	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/21/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor call
9/22/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
9/25/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor call
9/26/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
9/29/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/29/2023	Chandiramani	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Review August monthly fee statement
10/1/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	0.50	Review of third party contact list
10/1/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review teaser for participation assets proposal outreach
10/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Diligence re: Participation Assets

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 25 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
10/1/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
10/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Chandiramani	, i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i	0.50	
		Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		Fee App review / comments
10/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
10/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Review Declaration Draft
10/4/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Review of declaration / comments
10/5/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
10/6/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
10/9/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Review of Participation Asset term sheets / related recovery analysis
0/10/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
0/10/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
0/10/2023		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis
	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Participation assets w aterfall analysis review
0/11/2023		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/12/2023		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
		•		
	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Review of draft declaration materials
0/16/2023		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
0/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor internal strategy call
0/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/18/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
0/18/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review ing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor internal strategy call
0/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/23/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Hearing prep
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Preparation for court hearing
0/25/2023		Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Omnibus hearing
0/25/2023		General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review ing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/26/2023		General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Review ing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
0/27/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Discussing discovery
0/30/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/30/2023	Chandiramani	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.00	Review ing September Fee Statement
0/31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Deposition preparation
11/1/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.50	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal meeting on precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discovery discussion
1/6/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status conference
1/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor Call
11/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
11/9/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Review of waterfall analysis
1/10/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Recovery analysis discussion
1/10/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of recovery analysis calculations
1/13/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/16/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call on recovery update
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.75	Internal call to prepare for stakeholder meeting
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.75	Stakeholder meeting
1/30/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2023		Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Review ing October Fee Statement
12/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
12/4/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
2/12/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 26 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
12/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Plan administrator hearing
12/26/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/27/2024	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board meeting
12/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/4/2024	Chandiramani			
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/12/2024	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Interim Fee App Review
1/16/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/17/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Participation Assets discussion
1/17/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Participation Assets follow up discussion
1/23/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/30/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/6/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/8/2024	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Interim Fee App review / comments
2/13/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/28/2024	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Monthly Fee App Review
3/4/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Noteholder recovery analysis discussion
3/5/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/12/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/14/2024	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
4/2/2024	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Whiffen	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board Meeting
	Whiffen	, ,		-
7/27/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00 2.00	Review financial analyses
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor Call
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Review financial analyses
7/29/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Prepare financial analyses
7/30/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	2.00	Prepare and review diligence materials
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor call
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Management calls
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Review financial analyses
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Advisor call
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal review
8/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/7/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
8/10/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/10/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
8/12/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/13/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/14/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder counsel call
8/14/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	2.00	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
	Whiffen	•	0.50	
8/15/2022	v vi ili i el i	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		Stakeholder counsel call Advisor call
8/15/2023	\//biffon			
8/17/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
8/17/2023 8/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/17/2023				

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 27 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
8/20/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	2.50	Diligence assistance
8/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discuss diligence request
8/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/21/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor calls
8/22/2023	Whitten	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board Meeting
8/22/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/23/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	4.00	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/24/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/24/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	4.00	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/25/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/25/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.00	Investor Outreach
8/27/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	2.00	VDR calls with management
8/28/2028	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Prepare internal materials for filings
8/29/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Investor outreach coordination
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Call with potential bidder
8/31/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/1/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.50	VDR coordination
9/2/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.50	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor and management calls
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.00	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Potential investor call
9/6/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
9/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Potential investor calls
9/8/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.00	VDR coordination
9/11/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/11/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Potential investor calls
9/11/2023		÷	0.50	
	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
9/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
9/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
9/25/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/26/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Court hearing
9/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
10/5/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
10/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
10/23/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
10/25/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
10/26/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
11/1/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
11/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/10/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses
11/13/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Management call
11/16/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/4/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Whiffen			
1/10//1/.5	vviiiten	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 28 of 197

Date F	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
12/12/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/18/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review financial analyses
2/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/21/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Court hearing
2/26/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
	Whiffen		0.50	
1/2/2024		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
1/9/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/6/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/13/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/12/2024	Whiffen		0.50	Advisor call
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
3/13/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
8/14/2024	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
3/14/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/14/2024	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/25/2024	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
3/26/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/28/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
8/28/2024	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
4/2/2024	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
/28/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	First Day Hearing
/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
/28/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor Call
		•		
7/29/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation
7/30/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Noteholder Diligence Requests
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Advisor / noteholder call
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor strategy call
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Declaration review
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Prospective Investor discussion
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update call
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Working Group discussion
8/3/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
			0.50	
8/3/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		Discuss filings / drafting
8/3/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/6/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
8/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
8/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	General update discussion
8/8/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Liquidation analysis discussion
8/8/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
8/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
/10/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
/11/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Participation agreement discussion
/12/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
s/12/2023 s/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
8/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
3/14/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Update call
1400000	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder counsel call
	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
		A shuis an / Management Marship of / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/17/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
3/17/2023 3/18/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
B/16/2023 B/17/2023 B/18/2023 B/19/2023 B/19/2023				Internal strategy call
3/17/2023 3/18/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 29 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	
3/20/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Noteholder Diligence Requests
3/21/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
3/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
3/22/2023	McCarthy	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board Meeting
3/22/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Board Meeting materials drafting / edits
3/22/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Retention app review
3/24/2023	McCarthy		1.00	
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor / management w orking group call
3/24/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
3/24/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
3/25/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Bidding Procedures discussion
3/25/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Retention app review
3/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
3/29/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Declaration review
8/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor / management w orking group call
8/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal catch up
8/30/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Declaration review
8/31/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
8/31/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Section 341 meetings of creditors
3/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
9/4/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
				Recovery analysis catch up
9/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	
9/6/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Discussions / Comments related to retention order
9/10/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	0.50	Coordination of VDR
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Revised potential retention order
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third party situation catch up
9/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/15/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/16/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/18/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	1.00	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
9/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Recovery analysis catch up
9/19/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	1.00	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/20/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/21/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Recovery analysis catch up
9/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
9/25/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
		0 0		
9/26/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call
9/28/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
9/29/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third party calls on status of Participation Agreement
9/29/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	Review of Monthly Fee App (August)
10/1/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	0.50	Review of third party contact list
10/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
10/2/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/2/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Outreach to third-parties related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
		-		
0/3/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion re: Participation Assets
0/3/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Fee App review / comments
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court Hearing
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Review of declaration / comments
10/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
10/5/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Review of declaration / comments
	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal advisor strategy call
0/0/2023				
0/6/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Manadement Meetind / Internal Calls	0.50	
0/9/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50 0.50	Internal strategy call Internal advisor strategy call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 30 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	-
0/10/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court Hearing
0/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
0/10/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis
0/10/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
0/11/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
0/12/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/12/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Review of draft declaration materials
0/12/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
0/16/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
0/16/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
0/16/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/18/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
0/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/19/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
		•		
0/19/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
0/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Hearing prep
0/25/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
0/26/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/26/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	2.00	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
0/27/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
0/27/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
0/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
0/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Hearing / deposition prep
1/1/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Hearing
1/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
		· ·		
1/2/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Discovery prep
1/3/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Waterfall analysis catch up
1/6/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Hearing
1/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/9/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Review of waterfall analysis
1/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Recovery analysis discussion
1/10/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review of recovery analysis calculations
1/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Waterfall / aircraft novation update
1/13/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Review of recovery analysis calculations
1/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Recovery analysis review / discussion
		· ·		
12/4/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Discussion re: certain aircraft / contracts
12/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Follow up discussion re: certain aircraft / contracts
2/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
12/7/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Novation schedule / recovery presentation / bridge
12/8/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Novation schedule / recovery presentation / bridge
2/11/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Recovery analysis
2/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/14/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Recovery analysis review / adjustments
2/15/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / sale proceeds calculations
2/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/21/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/21/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
2/26/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
2/27/2023	McCarthy	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.00	Board Update
2/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/2/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/4/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/4/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/8/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/9/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
/11/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Interim Fee App Review
/12/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Interim Fee App Review
		· · ·		
/16/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
11/1/1/1/1/1	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Participation Assets discussion
	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Participation Assets follow up discussion
/17/2024		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call
/17/2024 /23/2024	McCarthy			
/17/2024 /23/2024	McCarthy McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/17/2024 1/23/2024 1/25/2024			0.50 1.00	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations Interim Fee App discussions / review
1/17/2024 1/17/2024 1/23/2024 1/25/2024 1/27/2024 1/27/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling		

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 31 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
2/6/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
2/6/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/8/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Interim Fee App review / comments
2/12/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/13/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
2/20/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
2/23/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
	•	, ,		
2/26/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Monthly Fee App Review
2/27/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
2/28/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Monthly Fee App Review & related calculations
3/4/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Noteholder recovery analysis discussion
3/5/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
3/6/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy discussion
3/7/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
3/12/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
3/12/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of recovery analysis
3/13/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy discussion
3/13/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of illustrative novation timing analysis
3/14/2024	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	PIMCO discussion re: novation status
3/18/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
3/19/2024	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
3/28/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
4/2/2024	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal update discussion
4/4/2024	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review of novation/closing calculations
7/27/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/1/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Becker		1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
8/10/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/11/2023	Becker	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/25/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.00	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	Becker	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Call with potential bidders
8/31/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
		<b>.</b> .		
9/4/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/6/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/6/2023	Becker	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Marketing materials for sale process
9/8/2023	Becker	General Administrative	3.00	Dataroom management
9/10/2023	Becker	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Call with potential bidders
9/12/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/23/2023	Becker	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
10/9/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/10/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/12/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
			2.00	
0/16/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/12/2023 0/16/2023 0/19/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/16/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50 0.50 0.50	Advisor call Advisor call Management call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 32 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
10/26/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
11/7/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/13/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
		· ·		Advisor call
11/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	
11/30/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/12/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/22/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/22/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Plan Administration Agreement Hearing
12/26/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/2/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/6/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/13/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/7/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/10/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/11/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor strategy call
3/13/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/18/2024	Becker	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received
10/4/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Aviator Rule 2004 Motion Hearing
10/4/2023	Bronstein	General Administrative	1.00	Preparing VDR for potential participation assets investors
10/4/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/6/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/8/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
10/10/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/10/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Advisor call
10/11/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/12/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/15/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/16/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/17/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
0/18/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
0/19/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
0/19/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
		-		
10/24/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/24/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
0 10 5 15 5 5	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Omnibus Hearing
	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/25/2023			0.50	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/25/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.00	······································
10/25/2023 10/26/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/25/2023 10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/26/2023 10/27/2023	Bronstein			
10/25/2023 10/26/2023 10/26/2023	Bronstein Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 33 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	
0/31/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court Hearing preparation
11/1/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.50	Court Hearing
11/2/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	Advisor call
11/2/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/3/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Discovery review
11/6/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
11/7/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/8/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Waterfall and cash flow analysis related to upcoming closing
11/9/2023		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.50	
	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
11/9/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/10/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Call with Management
1/13/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/14/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/15/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/13/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/17/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/17/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/20/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modelling recoveries
				•
1/21/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/21/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modelling recoveries
11/22/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/22/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modelling recoveries
11/24/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modelling recoveries
1/28/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/28/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modelling recoveries
1/28/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Noteholder Call
1/29/2023	Bronstein	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Review ing October monthly fee statement
1/30/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/4/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modelling recoveries
				•
12/5/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modelling recoveries
12/5/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/8/2023	Bronstein	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Preparation of Board materials
12/12/2023	Bronstein	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Review ing November monthly fee statement
12/12/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
12/18/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modelling recoveries
12/19/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modelling recoveries
12/19/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
2/22/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
2/22/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Plan Administration Agreement Hearing
12/26/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
				Modelling recoveries
2/26/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	5
2/28/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/2/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/1/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and swap breakage calculation
2/5/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and swap breakage calculation
2/5/2024	Bronstein	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/6/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/8/2024	Bronstein	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Reviewing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/0/2024 2/12/2024		Financial Analysis / Modeling		
	Bronstein	, ,	0.50	Conducting Change of Control analysis
2/13/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/6/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/12/2024	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor strategy call
3/14/2024	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Confirmation Hearing

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 34 of 197

Other         Performance         Catagery (Imma)         Neuror         Description           242024         Bronsim         Artisizer (Immagermal Medry (Imma)         0.50         Arkiters (Imma)         0.50         Arkiters (Imma)           242024         Bronsim         Franzial Ansiger (Modify (Imma)         0.50         Arkiters (Imma)         0.50         Arkiters (Imma)         0.50 <t< th=""><th>iiouis (</th><th>, or Red by</th><th>Greeninii riviessionais ivi ene</th><th></th><th>•••••<b>P</b>•••••••</th></t<>	iiouis (	, or Red by	Greeninii riviessionais ivi ene		••••• <b>P</b> •••••••
444026         Beonsimi Francis Analysis / Mediang recovery model and/or deck           77272023         Wang Arbitrier / Management Meeling / Harma Cale         100         M. Th. Advisor call and/or deck           77272023         Wang Arbitrier / Management Meeling / Harma Cale         250         Advisor call           77272023         Wang Arbitrier / Management Meeling / Harma Cale         250         Advisor call           77272023         Wang Arbitrier / Management Meeling / Harma Cale         250         Advisor call           77272023         Wang Arbitrier / Management Meeling / Harma Cale         100         M. Th. Advisor Call           77272023         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         M. Th. Advisor Call           7727203         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         M. Th. Advisor Call           7727203         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         M. Th. Advisor Call           7727203         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         Machagement Meeling / Harma Cale         100           7727203         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         Hardwise Call         100           7727203         Wang General Presentation Preparation         100         Hardwise Call         100           7727203         Wang General Presentation Prepar	Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
7/272223     Weng     Financial Analysis / Modering     6.00     Usahing recovery model and/or desk       7/282233     Weng     Active or / Management Meeting / Finanal Colt     200     First Dey Hearing       7/282233     Weng     Court Hearings / Finanal Colt     200     First Dey Hearing       7/282233     Weng     Court Hearings / Finanal Colt     200     Active or / Management Meeting / Internal Colt     200       7/282233     Weng     Court Hearings / Finanal Colt     200     Active or / Management Meeting / Internal Colt     200       7/20233     Weng     Court Hearings / Finanal Colt     200     Credit or call       7/20233     Weng     General Meeting / Finanal Colt     200     Credit or call       7/20233     Weng     General Meeting / Finanal Colt     200     Credit or call       8/20233     Weng     Active or / Management Meeting / Internal Colt     200     Credit or call       8/20233     Weng     Financial Analysis / Medering     120     M. Th Active or Call proparation       8/20233     Weng     Financial Analysis / Medering     120     M. Th Active or Call proparation       8/20233     Weng     Financial Analysis / Medering     120     M. Th Active or Call proparation       8/20233     Weng     Financial Analysis / Medering     120     M. Th A		Bronstein			
7/27/2023     Wing     Achiers / Ming / Properation     100     M. Th Akhiers (all       7/28/2023     Wing     Achier / Management Meeting / Internal Call     0.50     Achiers call       7/28/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Achiers call       7/28/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Achiers call       7/28/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Statusholder call preparation       8/2023     Wing     Statusholder call / Meesing / Head Managemet     0.50     Statusholder call preparation       8/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Statusholder call preparation       8/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Statusholder call       8/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Statusholder call       8/2023     Wing     Francial Analysis / Northing     0.50     Updating recovery model and/or dack       8/2023     Wing     General Presentation Preparation     1.50     Preparation       8/2023     Wing     General Presentation Preparation     1.50     Preparation       8/2023     Wing     General Presentation Preparation     1.50     Preparation       8/20232     Wing     General Presentation Preparation			, ,		
7/28/2023         Weig         Court Hamings / Financial Analysis / Modeling         200         First Day Haming           7/28/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         450         Updating recovery model and/or deck           7/28/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Mothan y Analysis / Modeling           7/28/2023         Weig         Statustodic Calls / Meelings / Falsing haming         100         M. Th Advaca Call           7/28/2023         Weig         Statustodic Calls / Meelings / Falsing haming         100         Mathan y Advaca Call           8/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2023         Weig         Financial Analysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2023         Weig         Ginancia Manajysis / Modeling         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck		-			
7282023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     0.50     Advisor / Management Meeting / Pasiade Isers       7700203     Wing     Financial Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       7700203     Wing     Charter Meeting / Fiscal Calls     100     Ord/or call       7701203     Wing     Charter Meeting / Fiscal Calls     100     Ord/or call       7701203     Wing     Charter Meeting / Fiscal Calls     100     Ord/or call       7701203     Wing     Charter Meeting / Fiscal Calls     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       7701203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck       770203     Wing     Fiscal Analysia / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or deck		•			
77880222     Wing     Finncial Analysis / Modeling     4.50     Updating recovery model and/or denk       77810223     Wing     Advior / Masagement Mosting / Internal Calls     100     M. Th Advisor Call       77810223     Wing     State-fielded Calls / Metting / Hesterd Hest     100     M. Th Advisor Call       77810223     Wing     State-fielded Calls / Metting / Hesterd Hest     100     M. Th Advisor Call       77810232     Wing     State-fielded Calls / Metting / Hesterd Hest     100     M. Th Advisor Call       77810232     Wing     Finncial Analysis / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       7820232     Wing     Finncial Analysis / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       8420232     Wing     Finncial Analysis / Modeling     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       8420233     Wing     General Pasentation Paperation     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       8420233     Wing     General Pasentation Paperation     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       8420233     Wing     General Pasentation Paperation     100     Updating recovery model and/or denk       8470233     Wing     General Pasentation Paperation     100     Paperat Internal Internitis for bid procedures fing       84702324     Wing     General Pasentatio					, ,
7400220         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Updating recovery model analon deck           7710220         Wing         Advect / Monagement Meeting / Finatical Emo         1.00         Creditor call           7710220         Wing         General Plesentation Pepraton         0.00         Stakeholder call preparaton           7810220         Wing         General Analysis / Modeling         0.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           7812223         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           7812232         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8820232         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8820232         Wing         General Plesentation Pepraton         1.00         M. Th Advecr Call           8820232         Wing         General Plesentation Pepraton         1.00         Prepared Internal matriatis for bit grocedures fing           8820232         Wing         General Plesentation Pepraton         1.00         Prepared Internal matriatis for bit grocedures fing           8820232         Wing         General Plesentation Pepraton         1.00         Prepared Internal matrinin fort		•			
7312023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     100     N.Th. Advisor Call       7312023     Wing     General Posentation Poparation     0.50     Stakholder call preparation       7312023     Wing     Stakeholder Call / Meeting / Related term     0.50     Stakholder call preparation       7312023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     0.50     Stakholder call preparation       7312023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     0.50     Mith Advisor / Advisor / Management Meeting       7312023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     0.50     Mith Advisor / Management Meeting       7312023     Wing     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     0.50     Mith Advisor / Management Meeting       7312023     Wing     General Posentation Poparation     1.50     Popared Internal material for bid procedures filing       7312023     Wing     General Posentation Poparation     1.50     Popared Internal material for bid procedures filing       7312023     Wing     General Posentation Poparation     1.50     Popared Internal material for bid procedures filing       7312023     Wing     General Posentation Poparation     1.50     Popared Internal material for bid procedures filing       7312023     Wing     General Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call     1.					
7/21/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Pegnation     1.00     Credio: cal progradion       8/1/2023     Wing     Stakeholder Cals / Meelings / Reliefed tem     0.50     Stakeholder cal progradion       8/1/2023     Wing     Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call     1.50     Stakeholder cal and and and Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call       8/2/2023     Wing     Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call     1.50     M. Th Achior Call       8/2/2023     Wing     Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call     1.50     M. Th Achior Call       8/2/2023     Wing     Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call     1.50     M. Th Achior Call       8/2/2023     Wing     Achior / Management Meeling / Internal Call     1.50     M. Th Achior Call       8/2/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Peparation     1.50     Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing       8/2/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Peparation     1.50     Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing       8/2/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Peparation     1.50     Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing       8/2/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Peparation     1.50     Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing       8/2/2023     Wing     General Pesentation Peparation     1.50     Wind Machi					
81/12/23         Wing         General Presentation Preparation         0.50         Stakeholder call preparation           81/22/23         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         500         Updating recovery model and/or dock           82/2023         Wing         Advicer / Management Meering / Internal Call         100         Updating recovery model and/or dock           82/2023         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         000         Updating recovery model and/or dock           82/2023         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         000         Updating recovery model and/or dock           82/2023         Wing         Financial Analysis / Modeling         000         Updating recovery model and/or dock           82/2023         Wing         General Presentation Preparation         100         Min Advicer Cal           82/2023         Wing         General Presentation Preparation         100         Prepared Internal Instatistis for thid procedures filing           82/2023         Wing         General Presentation Preparation         100         Prepared Internal Instatistis for thid procedures filing           82/2023         Wing         General Advisor / Management Meering / Internal Call         100         Min Advicer Cal           82/2023         Wing         General Advisor / Management Meering / Internal Call		-			
8/1/2023         Wang         Exakeholder Call / Meetings / Related barn         0.50         Stakeholder call           8/2/2023         Wang         Advicer / Managerment Meeting / Internal Call         150         Mt. Advisor / Call           8/2/2023         Wang         Advisor / Managerment Meeting / Internal Call         150         Mt. Th. Advisor / Call           8/2/2023         Wang         Francial Analysis / Modeling         300         Updating recovery model and/or dock           8/2/2023         Wang         Francial Analysis / Modeling         200         Updating recovery model and/or dock           8/2/2023         Wang         Francial Analysis / Modeling         200         Updating recovery model and/or dock           8/2/2023         Wang         General Paseration Paparation         100         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures fing           8/1/2023         Wang         General Paseration Paparation         100         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures fing           8/1/2023         Wang         General Paseration Paparation         100         Papared internal materials for bid procedures fing           8/1/2023         Wang         General Paseration Paparation         100         Papared internal materials for bid procedures fing           8/1/2023         Wang         General Administrative <td< td=""><td></td><td>•</td><td></td><td></td><td></td></td<>		•			
82/3222         Wing         Francial Analysis / Medieing         500         Ipatiang recovery model and/or deck           83/3223         Wing         Francial Analysis / Medieing         400         Updating recovery model and/or deck           83/3223         Wing         Francial Analysis / Medieing         100         ITA Advisor Call           83/7203         Wing         Francial Analysis / Medieing         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           83/7203         Wing         Francial Analysis / Medieing         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           83/7203         Wing         Grancial Analysis / Medieing         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           84/7203         Wing         Grancial Analysis / Medieing         100         Updating recovery model and/or deck           81/7203         Wing         Grancial Analysis / Medieing         100         N Th Advisor Call         Papared Internal metaints for bid procedures filing           81/1203         Wang         Advisor / Menagement Meeting / Internal Call         100         N Th Advisor Call           81/12032         Wang         Grancial Analysis / Medieing         100         N Th Advisor Call           81/12032         Wang         Grancial Analysis / Medieing         1000         Hoparad concels for tredenin anepl			· ·		
82/3223         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         150         MTh Advisor Cal           82/3223         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         300         Updating recovery model and/or deck           82/3223         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         200         Updating recovery model and/or deck           82/3223         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         200         Updating recovery model and/or deck           88/3223         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         150         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           88/3223         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         100         Repared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           81/12203         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         100         Repared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           81/12203         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         100         Repared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           81/12203         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         100         Repared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           81/12203         Wang         General Resentation Reparation         100         Repared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           81/12203         Wang         General Adminintr		•			
82/3202WangFhancial Analysis / Modeling4.00Updating recovery model and/or deck87/7202WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Hernal Cala100In Th Advisor Cal87/7202WangFhancial Analysis / Modeling500Updating recovery model and/or deck87/7202WangGeneral Presentation Peparaton100In Th Advisor Cal87/7202WangGeneral Presentation Peparaton100Prepared Internal materials for bit procedures fling87/7202WangGeneral Presentation Peparaton100Prepared Internal materials for bit procedures fling87/72023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cala100Prepared Internal materials for bit procedures fling87/72023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cala100Prepared Internal materials for bit procedures fling87/72023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cala100Nith Advisor Cal87/72023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cala100Nith Advisor Cal87/72023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cala100Nith Advisor Cal87/72023WangGeneral Administrative250Internal complanes deckels for referition application87/72023WangGeneral Administrative250Internal complanes deckels for referition application87/72023WangGeneral Administrative250Internal complanes deckels for referition application87/72023WangGeneral Administrative150Out					
B4/2022         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         300         Updathing recovery model and/or deck           B7/2023         Wang         Fhancial Analysis / Modeling         200         Updathing recovery model and/or deck           B8/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.50         Peparad Internal materials for bid procedures filing           B8/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         N.Th Advisor Cal           B7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           B7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Reparation         1.00         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           B7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Reparation         1.00         Rtractad Internal materials for bid procedures filing           B7/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Cal         1.00         Rtractad Indivis / Internal Call           B7/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call         1.00         Mth Advisor Call           B7/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Call         1.00         Mth Advisor Call           B7/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / I		•	Financial Analysis / Modeling		
8/7/2023         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         2.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/7/2023         Wang         Ceneral Presentation Preparation         1.50         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/7/2023         Wang         Ceneral Presentation Preparation         1.00         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/7/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         1.00         M. Th Advisor Call           8/7/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/2/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/2/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/2/2023         Wan	8/4/2023	-		3.00	
B8/2023         Wang         Francial Analysis / Modeling         5.00         bpdating recovery model and/or deck           B9/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         1.00         Pepared hieran functiants for bid procedures filing           B/102023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         1.00         Pepared hieran functiants for bid procedures filing           B/112023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Pepared hieran functiants for bid procedures filing           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Pepared hieran functiants for bid procedures filing           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Pepared hieran functiants for bid procedures filing           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Markaires Call           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Markaires Call           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Markaires Call           B/12023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / hieran Calls         0.00         Markaires Call           B/12023         Wang <td< td=""><td>8/7/2023</td><td>Wang</td><td>Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls</td><td>1.00</td><td>M, Th Advisor Call</td></td<>	8/7/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
B9/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         15.0         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/10/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         100         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/10/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         100         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/11/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         100         Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/14/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         100         Pepared Internal Materials for bid procedures filing           8/14/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         100         M. Th Advisor Call           8/14/2023         Wang         General Administrative         100         M. Th Advisor Call         100         M. Th Advisor Call           8/22/2023         Wang         General Administrative         500         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/22/2023         Wang         General Administrative         510         Hardia compliance checks for retention application           8/22/2023         Wang         Fore Statements/ Monthly trovice         100         Advisor Call         100         Advisor Call	8/7/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/10/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         1.00         Nat Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla           8/11/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         0.00         Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/11/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         0.00         Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/12/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         0.00         Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/14/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         0.00         Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing           8/14/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calla         0.00         Markvisor Call           8/14/2023         Wang         General Administrative         2.50         Internal compliance chocks for retention application           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         2.50         Internal compliance chocks for retention application           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.50         Reparend for harding           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.50         Reparend for harding <tr< td=""><td>8/8/2023</td><td>Wang</td><td>Financial Analysis / Modeling</td><td>5.00</td><td>Updating recovery model and/or deck</td></tr<>	8/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.00	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/10/2023     Wang     General Presentation Preparation     1.00     Prepared internal materials for bid procedures fling       8/11/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     Prepared internal materials for bid procedures fling       8/11/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     Nepared internal materials for bid procedures fling       8/14/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/14/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     NTh Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.00     Nth Advisor Call       8/21/2023     Wang     General / Administrative     2.50     Internal compliance checks for retention appl	8/9/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       1.00       Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing         8/11/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       1.00       Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing         8/14/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       2.00       Prepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing         8/14/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/12/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/2/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/2/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/2/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/2/2023       Wang       Fencila Internals / Moeting       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/2/2023       Wang       Fencila Internals / Moeting       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/2/2023       Wang       Fencila Internals / Moeting       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/2/202	8/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/11/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Parafopation agreement discussion         8/14/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       International Meeting / Internal Calls         8/14/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       International Meeting / Internal Calls         8/14/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Inth Advisor Call         8/21/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       5.00       Internat compliance checks for retention application         8/22/2023       Wang       General Administrative       2.50       Internat compliance checks for retention application         8/22/2023       Wang       General Administrative       2.50       Internat compliance checks for retention application         8/22/2023       Wang       General Administrative       2.50       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.50       Ntm Advisor Call         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.50       Review ing lucitation analysis         8/21/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.50       Review ing lucitation analysis	8/10/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/12/203       Wang       General Pesentation Preparation       1.00       Pepared Instruit materials for bid procedures filing         8/14/203       Wang       General Resentation Preparation       2.00       Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing         8/14/203       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/21/203       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/22/203       Wang       General Administrative       2.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/22/203       Wang       General Administrative       2.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/22/203       Wang       Fencie Internal Campliance checks for retention application       2.80         8/22/203       Wang       Fencie Internal Calls       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/22/203       Wang       Fencie Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor Call         8/22/203       Wang       Gourt Hearings / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor Call         8/22/203       Wang       Gourt Hearings / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor Call         8/22/203       Wang       Gourt Hearings / Preparation       1.50       P			•		
8/14/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M. Th Advisor Call         8/14/2023       Wang       General Resentation Reparation       200       Pepared Internal materials for bid procedures filing         8/21/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/21/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/24/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/24/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor call         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor call         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/21/2023       Wang       Financi		•	5 5		
8/14/2023         Wang         General Pesentation Peparation         2.00         Pepared Internal materials for but procedures filing           8/21/2023         Wang         Financial Anaysis / Modeling         4.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/22/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/22/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         NTh Advisor Call           8/22/2023         Wang         Financial Anaysis / Modeling         1.00         NTh Advisor Call           8/29/2023         Wang         Financial Anaysis / Modeling         1.00         NTh Advisor Call           8/30/2023         Wang         Caurt Hearings / Filings / Peparation         1.50         Perparing for hearing           8/31/2023         Wang         Financial Anaysis / Modeling         1.00         NTh Advisor Call           8/31/2023         Wang         Financial Anaysis / Modeling         1.00         NTh Advisor Call           8/31/2023		-	· ·		
8/21/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Neeting / Internal Calls       1.00       N. Th. Advisor Call         8/21/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/24/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/24/2023       Wang       General Administrative       5.00       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/25/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       M. Th. Advisor Call         8/229/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       M. Th. Advisor Call         8/229/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls         8/239/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       General Administrative       1.00       Advisor Call		•			
8/21/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       4.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/24/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/24/2023       Wang       General Administrative       2.50       Internal compliance checks for retention application         8/24/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.50       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/22/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.50       Vpdating recovery model and/or deck         8/22/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation       1.50       Pervisin ing fundation analysis         8/30/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation       1.50       Pervisin ing fundation and/or deck         8/31/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         9/7/2023       Wang       Gourt Hearings / Flings / Peparation       1.00       M.Th. Advisor Call         9/7/2023       Wang       Go			· ·		
8/22/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         5.00         Updating recovery model and/or dock.           8/24/203         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Intrnal compliance checks for retention application           8/24/203         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/22/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         M. Th Advisor Call           8/22/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Ath Sor Call           8/22/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Advisor Call           8/22/203         Wang         Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation         1.50         Preparing for hearing           8/30/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Ath Advisor Call           8/31/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         W.Th Advisor Call           9/4/203         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Updating recovery model and/or deck           9/7/203         Wang         General Administrative         1.00         Advisor Call           9/7/2023         Wang         Court Hearing					
8/24/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management / Mening / Inicinal Calls         1.00         M. Th. Advisor Call           8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal compliance checks for retention application           8/28/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management / Mening / Internal Calls         1.00         M. Th. Advisor Call           8/28/2023         Wang         Fene Statements / Monthly Invoice         1.00         Preparing hours           8/28/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation         1.50         Preparing for hearing           8/29/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation         1.50         Court hearing analysis           8/30/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation         1.50         Court hearing analysis           8/31/2023         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         M. Th. Advisor Call           9/4/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.00         Advisor analysis           9/3/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.00         Advisor analysis           9/3/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.00         Advisor analysis           9/3/2023         Wang <td< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></td<>					
8/24/2023         Wang         General Administrative         5.00         Internal complance checks for retention application           8/25/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls         1.00         M. Th Advisor Call           8/25/2023         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         2.50         Updating recovery model and/or deck           8/26/2023         Wang         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls         1.00         Advisor and avail and		-			
8/25/023WangGeneral Administrative2.50Internal compliance ohceks for retention application8/28/023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00N Th Advisor Call8/28/023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing Incovery model and/or deck8/28/023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call8/29/023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation1.50Preparing for nearing8/30/023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation1.50Roview Ing Inguidation analysis8/31/023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/4/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangGourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/1/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Matis research9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Matis research9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting /					
8/28/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       100       M. Th Advisor Call         8/28/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.50       Updating recovery model and/or deck         8/29/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor call         8/20/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Preparation       1.50       Pearing for hearing         8/30/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Preparation       1.50       Advisor Call         8/31/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor Call         9/4/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Updating recovery model and/or deck         9/5/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor call         9/7/2023       Wang       General Administrative       1.00       Datatom management         9/7/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Preparation       3.00       Docket research         9/12/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Flings / Preparation       3.50       Docket research         9/12/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.00       Advisor					
8/28/2023WangFinancia Analysis / Modeling2.50Updating recovery model and/or deck8/29/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call8/30/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financia I Analysis / Modeling1.50Preparing for hearing8/30/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financia I Analysis / Modeling1.50Review ing liquidation analysis8/31/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financia I Analysis / Modeling1.50Court hearing8/31/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangFinancia I Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangGeneral Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangGeneral Analysis / Modeling1.00Dotating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangGeneral Administrative1.00Dotating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/1/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Mth Advisor Call9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Mth Advisor Call9/1/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Mth Advisor Call9/1/2023WangAdv		-			
B229(2023         Wang         Fee Statements/Meeting / Internal Calls         1.00         Peparing hours           8/29/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         1.00         Advisor call           8/30/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         1.00         Review ing Ignication analysis           8/31/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         1.00         N. Th Advisor Call           8/31/2023         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         M. Th Advisor Call           9/4/2023         Wang         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.00         Advisor I Management Meeting / Internal Calls         1.00         Advisor Call           9/6/2023         Wang         General Administrative         1.00         Advisor all         Advisor I Management Meeting / Internal Calls           9/7/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         3.00         Dodating recovery model and/or deck           9/7/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         3.00         Dodating recovery model and/or deck           9/7/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation         3.00         Docket research           9/7/2023         Wang         Court Hearings / Flings / Peparation<		•			
8/29/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call8/30/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation1.50Preview ing liquidation analysis8/31/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation1.50Review ing liquidation analysis8/31/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M Th Advisor Call9/4/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related terms0.50Call with AFC advisors9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings1.00Advisor Call </td <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>					
8/30/2023WangCourt Hearings / Finings / Preparation1.50Preparing for hearing8/30/2023WangCourt Hearings / Finings / Finings / Preparation1.50Review ing liquidation analysis8/31/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/5/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling3.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Nodeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Filetad Items0.50Coell with AFIC Advisor S9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9		-			
8/30/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Review ing liquidation analysis8/31/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Unt hadving / Caurt Hearings / Filings / Preparation9/4/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangGeneral Administrative1.00Advisor call9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor Call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Mth Advisor Call9/11/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Mth					
8/31/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/4/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/6/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financial Analysis / Modeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financial Analysis / Modeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financial / Preparation3.00Docket research9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Financial / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Ad	8/30/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Review ing liquidation analysis
9/4/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/5/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangCeneral Administrative1.00Dataroom management9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor all9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/19/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Call with AFIC advisors	8/31/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
9/5/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling3.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/6/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangGeneral Administrative1.00Dataroom management9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00 <td>8/31/2023</td> <td>Wang</td> <td>Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls</td> <td>1.00</td> <td>M, Th Advisor Call</td>	8/31/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/6/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/7/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation1.00Dataroom management9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Felled Items0.50Corditor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recover	9/4/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/7/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/7/2023WangGeneral Administrative1.00Dataroom management9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Creditor call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/18/2023WangFenancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFenancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/22/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing August monthily fee statement <td></td> <td>-</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>		-			
9/7/2023WangGeneral Administrative1.00Dataroom management9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/19/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023W		•			
9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation3.00Docket research9/8/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Creditor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFC advisors9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFestatements / Monthy Invoice1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/22/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing Participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00M		-	, ,		
9/9/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Creditor call9/11/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/18/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023Wang <td></td> <td>•</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>		•			
9/10/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Docket research9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Creditor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing August monthly fee statement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries <t< td=""><td></td><td>-</td><td></td><td></td><td></td></t<>		-			
9/11/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Creditor call9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthy Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M Th Advisor Call9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement<					
9/12/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M, Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/26/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangGourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale He			0 0 1		
9/14/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M. Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M. Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M. Th Advisor Call9/26/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M. Th Advisor Call9/26/2023 <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>					
9/18/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00M. Th Advisor Call9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statement / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangGourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Internal strategy call re: Part					
9/18/2023WangStakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.50Call with AFIC advisors9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/26/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/26/2023WangFee Statement Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/26/2023WangFee Statement Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Flings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/		-			
9/18/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Updating recovery model and/or deck9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/26/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets<		-			
9/19/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.00Advisor call9/20/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangGourt Hearing / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal Strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0		-	•		
9/20/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing hours9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Pr		-	, ,		
9/22/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Advisor call9/22/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling2.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement side-by-side9/24/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50<			Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice		Preparing hours
9/23/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.50Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement side-by-side9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements / Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentati	9/22/2023	-	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/23/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.00Preparing participation agreement side-by-side9/24/2023WangFinancial Analysis / Modeling1.00Modeling participation agreement recoveries9/25/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50M, Th Advisor Call9/25/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.50Preparing August monthly fee statement	9/22/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/24/2023       Wang       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.00       Modeling participation agreement recoveries         9/25/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       M, Th Advisor Call         9/25/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.00       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/26/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       2.00       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/26/2023       Wang       Court Hearing / Flings / Preparation       0.50       Sale Hearing         9/27/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets         9/27/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       0.50       Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       4.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       4.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement	9/23/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/25/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       M. Th Advisor Call         9/25/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.00       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/26/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       2.00       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/26/2023       Wang       Court Hearing / Flings / Preparation       0.50       Sale Hearing         9/27/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets         9/27/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       4.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement		-			
9/25/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.50Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials					
9/26/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice2.00Preparing August monthly fee statement9/26/2023WangCourt Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.50Sale Hearing9/27/2023WangAdvisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.50Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets9/27/2023WangFee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.50Preparing August monthly fee statement9/27/2023WangGeneral Presentation Preparation4.50Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials		-			
9/26/2023       Wang       Court Hearings / Frilings / Preparation       0.50       Sale Hearing         9/27/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets         9/27/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       4.50       Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials		•			
9/27/2023       Wang       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.50       Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets         9/27/2023       Wang       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.50       Preparing August monthly fee statement         9/27/2023       Wang       General Presentation Preparation       4.50       Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials					
9/27/2023         Wang         Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice         0.50         Preparing August monthly fee statement           9/27/2023         Wang         General Presentation Preparation         4.50         Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials					•
9/27/2023 Wang General Presentation Preparation 4.50 Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials		-			
		•			
			· ·		
	012012023	wany	A statisti / management meeting / internal Calls	1.00	

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 35 of 197

	Professional	Category	Hours	
9/28/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/29/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.50	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/29/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/30/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
10/1/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
10/1/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Preparing August monthly fee statement
10/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
10/2/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.50	VDR Management
10/2/2023	•		0.50	5
	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal company call re: Participation Assets
10/4/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
10/4/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.50	VDR Management
10/4/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Review Declaration Draft
10/4/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/5/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
10/5/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.50	VDR Management
10/5/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/6/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.50	VDR Management
10/6/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/9/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
	-			•
10/9/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/12/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
	•			
10/12/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculation of claims
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculation of claims
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Analysis of prior insurance claim settlements
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/14/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/15/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/16/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
10/16/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/17/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/18/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/18/2023	-	-	0.50	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
	Wang	General Presentation Preparation		
10/18/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/19/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
10/20/2023	Wang	General Administrative	3.50	Discovery request
10/23/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
10/23/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/24/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/24/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
0/24/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/24/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Reading reply in support of participation agreement
10/24/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/24/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/24/2023	-			
	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/25/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/25/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Omnibus hearing
0/25/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/25/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/26/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 36 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	
0/26/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/26/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/27/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.50	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
0/27/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Discussing discovery
0/27/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/27/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Preparing September Fee Statement
0/30/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
0/30/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.00	Preparing September Fee Statement
1/1/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Printing reference documents for PA Hearing
1/1/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.50	Participation Agreement Hearing
1/1/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
		, 0		
1/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/2/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
1/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal meeting on precedent insurance litigation settlements
1/2/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing August invoice
1/2/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Producing discovery
1/2/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
1/3/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
1/3/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/3/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Producing discovery
1/6/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status conference
1/6/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/7/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor Call
1/7/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/8/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing October fee statement
1/9/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/9/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.25	Preparing October fee statement
1/9/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/13/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/13/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing September invoice
1/13/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/14/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.25	Preparing September invoice
1/14/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/15/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/15/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing October fee statement
1/16/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor Call
1/16/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/21/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/21/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.25	Preparing October fee statement
1/21/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.25	Advisor call
1/22/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.25	Preparing October fee statement
1/22/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/26/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.25	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/28/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call on recovery update
1/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.75	Internal call to prepare for stakeholder meeting
1/28/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.75	Stakeholder meeting
1/29/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Calculating default interest
1/30/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Preparing October fee statement
2/1/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	November Fee Statement
2/4/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
2/4/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Counterparty claims analysis
2/5/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/5/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Internal Advisor Call
2/5/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.50	Counterparty claims analysis
	•			
2/5/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/6/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	November Fee Statement
2/6/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/7/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/8/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/11/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	November Fee Statement
	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/11/2023	5			

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 37 of 197

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
12/12/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Reviewing funds flow draft
12/12/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyzing default interest claims
2/12/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/13/2023	•	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/14/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
	•	5 5		
2/14/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Reviewing funds flow draft
2/15/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	October monthly fee Invoice
2/15/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Reviewing funds flow draft
2/18/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Reconciling sale distributions changes
2/19/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/19/2023	-	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Reconciling sale distributions changes
2/19/2023	0	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Responding to stakeholders
	U	-		
2/21/2023	•	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Plan administrator hearing
2/22/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/23/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/23/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.50	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/24/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/26/2023	•	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/26/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.50	Sale distributions and ad hoc analysis
	-			
2/26/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
2/28/2023	•	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	December monthly fee statement, November invoice
2/28/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/28/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale distributions and ad hoc analysis
1/2/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/3/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Correspondence related to allocated consideration calculation
1/4/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/4/2024	-		5.00	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling		
1/5/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/6/2025	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/6/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	4.00	Prepare Interim fee application
1/8/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/9/2024	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
	-			
1/9/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare Interim fee application
1/9/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/10/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/11/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/11/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Prepare Interim fee application
1/13/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare Interim fee application
1/15/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare Interim fee application
	-			
1/16/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/17/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/17/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/18/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/23/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/24/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/24/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare December fee statement
1/25/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/29/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare December fee statement
1/30/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Review debt amortization schedule
2/1/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and swap breakage calculation
	•	, ,		
2/2/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and swap breakage calculation
2/5/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/5/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.50	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/6/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/6/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and swap breakage calculation
2/6/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/6/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.00	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
				Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/7/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	
2/7/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/7/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/8/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/9/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/12/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Conducting Change of Control analysis
	-			
2/13/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 38 of 197

liouis ,	, or neu by	Greeninin i roressionuis for the		eompensation i erioù
Date	Professional	Category	Hours	
2/23/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
2/26/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
2/26/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/27/2024 2/28/2024	Wang Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50 0.50	Advisor call Conducting Change of Control analysis
2/28/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/29/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
3/1/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare January Monthly Fee Statement
3/4/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding recoveries from additional assets
3/5/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/6/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/7/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/9/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Confirm maintenance reserve balances
3/10/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/11/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/11/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
3/12/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/12/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling		Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor strategy call
3/13/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/14/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/14/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/15/2024 3/18/2024	Wang Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50 0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/18/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received
3/19/2024	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Confirmation Hearing
3/22/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculate sw ap breakages
3/25/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/26/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
3/26/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/26/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sw ap breakages
3/26/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.00	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/27/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/27/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/28/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/29/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/29/2024	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.50	Estimate Greenhill unpaid / future fees
3/30/2024	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Respond to stakeholder request
4/2/2024	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
4/3/2024	Wang	General Administrative		VDR Management
4/3/2024	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
4/4/2024 7/27/2023	Wang Davananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00 1.00	Calculate sale order allocated considerations M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Dayananda Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.00	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Creditor call
8/1/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.50	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	1.00	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	5.00	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/25/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.00	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Marketing materials for sale process
	Dovonondo	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
8/28/2023	Dayananda			
8/28/2023 8/29/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
8/28/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00 1.00 1.00	Advisor call Preparing for hearing Call with potential bidders

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 39 of 197

		•		•
Date	Professional	Category	Hours	
8/31/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.50	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/4/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.00	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/6/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/6/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	3.00	Marketing materials for sale process
9/7/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	3.00	Dataroom management
9/8/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	3.00	Dataroom management
9/9/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/10/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.50	Call with potential bidders
9/12/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/23/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.50	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.50	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
10/5/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
10/12/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.00	Court hearing
11/7/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/7/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/10/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/11/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.00	Advisor strategy call
3/13/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.00	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.00	Stakeholder call
3/18/2024	Dayananda	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.50	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received
3/26/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.50	Advisor call
4/3/2024	Dayananda	General Administrative		VDR Management
	,			-

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 40 of 197

## EXHIBIT C

## Summary of Expenses During the Final Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through and Including April 5, 2024)

Expense Category	Jul 23	Aug 23	Sep 23	Oct 23	Nov 23	Mar 24	Total
Taxi	\$52.84	\$611.03	\$-	\$277.28	\$88.97	\$-	\$1,030.12
Taxi - OT	-	471.19	-	4.16	-	-	475.35
Mobile/Cellular Phone	-	248.25	32.55	203.44	170.16	-	654.40
Meals - Overtime	-	221.82	25.93	82.87	-	24.55	355.17
Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	-	10.00	-	-	-	-	10.00
Crediting	-	-	-	-	-	-	(726.37)
Total	\$52.84	\$1,562.29	\$58.48	\$567.75	\$259.13	\$24.55	\$1,798.67

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 41 of 197

## EXHIBIT D

**Previously Filed Monthly Fee Statements** 

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

#### SUMMARY OF THE FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2023

Name of Applicant:	Greenhill & Co., LLC				
Applicant's Role in Case:	Investment Banker to t	he Debtors			
	September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27,				
Date of Retention:	2023				
	<b>Beginning of Period</b>	End of Period			
Time period covered by this statement	July 27, 2023	November 30, 2023			
Summary of Total Fees	and Expenses Requested	1:			
Amount of Compensation sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	$700,000.00^2$				
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought					
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$2,373.17				

This is a(n) \_\_\_\_\_ monthly <u>X</u> interim \_\_\_\_\_ final application.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 each for the months of August, September, October, and November of 2023.



<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document P8g42 of 997

_		Requ	ested		Outstanding		
Date Filed [Docket Number]	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses	Amount Paid	Fees
10/2/23 [No. 299]	7/27/23 - 8/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$1,050.36	\$140,000.00	\$1,050.36	\$141,050.36	\$35,000
10/30/23 [No. 447]	9/1/23 - 9/30/23	\$175,000.00	\$25.93	\$140,000.00	\$25.93	\$140,025.93	\$35,000
12/1/23 [No. 557]	10/1/23 - 10/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$1,037.75	\$140,000.00	\$1,037.75	\$141,037.75	\$35,000
12/14/23 [No. 579]	11/1/23 - 11/30/23	\$175,000.00	\$259.13	\$140,000.00	\$259.13	\$140,259.13	\$35,000
Total		\$700,000.00	\$2,373.17	\$560,000.00	\$2,373.17	\$562,373.17	\$140,000

## **Previously Filed Fee Statements**

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBg43 of 997

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employees During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	60.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	141.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	115.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	122.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	55.0
Noah Bronstein	Associate	48.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	235.5
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	65.0
Total	•	843.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBg45 of 997

## Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	290.75
General Administrative	37.50
General Presentation Preparation	78.00
Financial Analysis / Modeling	156.75
Financial Due Diligence	13.00
Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	9.50
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	119.50
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	21.00
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	117.50
Total	843.50

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document P8g46 of 997

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category (July 27, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	34.0	-	-	-	-	1.5	12.0	-	13.0	60.5
Chandiramani	59.8	2.5	8.0	1.0	2.0	5.0	31.5	4.0	27.3	141.0
Whiffen	41.0	-	23.0	13.5	11.0	2.0	10.5	-	14.5	115.5
McCarthy	53.0	3.0	12.5	3.0	-	1.0	22.5	-	27.5	122.5
Becker	26.5	4.0	5.0	-	-	-	9.5	-	10.0	55.0
Bronstein	14.0	1.0	-	22.5	-		7.0	0.5	3.5	48.5
Wang	38.0	14.0	21.5	116.8	-	-	18.5	16.5	10.3	235.5
Dayananda	24.5	13.0	8.0	-		-	8.0		11.5	65.0
Total	290.8	37.5	78.0	156.8	13.0	9.5	119.5	21.0	117.5	843.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBg46 of 997

Expense Category	Jul 2023	Aug 2023	Sept 2023	Oct 2023	Nov 2023
Taxi	\$52.84	\$611.03	\$-	\$167.11	\$88.97
Taxi - OT	-	471.19	-	4.16	-
Mobile/Cellular Phone	-	248.25	32.55	203.44	170.16
Meals - Overtime	-	221.82	25.93	65.72	-
Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	-	10.00	-	-	-
Total	\$52.84	\$1,562.29	\$58.48	\$440.43	\$259.13

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)<sup>3</sup>

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document PBg48 of 997

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>4</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

#### FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2023

Pursuant to sections 105, 327(a), 328(a), 330(a) and 363 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "<u>Bankruptcy Code</u>"), Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 2014, and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the Southern District of New York (the "<u>Local Rules</u>"), the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Docket No. 240] (the "<u>Interim Compensation Order</u>"), and the Order Authorizing Employment and Retention of Greenhill & Co., LLC as the Debtors' Financial Advisor and Investment Banker, Effective as of July 27, 2023 [Docket No. 235] (the "<u>Retention Order</u>"), Greenhill & Co., LLC ("<u>Greenhill</u>") hereby files this application (this "<u>First Interim Fee</u> <u>Application</u>") seeking allowance of compensation for professional services performed by Greenhill during the period commencing on July 27, 2023, through and including November 30,

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document PBg49 of 997

2023 (the "<u>Compensation Period</u>") in the amount of \$700,000 and reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,373.17<sup>5</sup>. This First Interim Fee Application has been prepared in accordance with *General Order M-447*, *the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York* (June 17, 2013) pursuant to Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-1(a) (the "<u>Local Guidelines</u>"). Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a certification regarding compliance with the Local Guidelines.

In support of this First Interim Fee Application, Greenhill respectfully represents as follows:

#### JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (this "<u>Court</u>") has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other legal bases for the relief requested herein are sections 327(a), 328(a), 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-1.

#### **BACKGROUND**

3. On July 27, 2023 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the Debtors commenced with the Court voluntary cases (the "<u>Chapter 11 Cases</u>") under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors are authorized to continue operating their businesses and managing their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

<sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document PB 50 of 997

4. Greenhill was retained effective as of the Petition Date pursuant to the Retention Order. The Retention Order authorized Greenhill to be compensated pursuant to its engagement letter, a copy of which is attached to Greenhill's retention application [Docket No. 111] as <u>Exhibit</u> <u>C</u> (the "<u>Engagement Letter</u>") and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.

#### **RELIEF REQUESTED**

5. By this Interim Fee Application, Greenhill is seeking entry of an order (a) approving on an interim basis compensation of \$700,000.00 for professional services provided to the Debtors and reimbursement of \$2,373.17 in actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Interim Compensation Period, and (b) directing payment of all such allowed compensation and actual and necessary expenses, less any amount previously paid for such compensation.

6. Pursuant to the terms of the Engagement Letter, Greenhill earned \$700,000.00 in compensation, consisting entirely of Monthly Advisory Fees (\$175,000.00 per month) for August, September, October and November of 2023. In addition, Greenhill incurred actual and necessary expenses associated with providing professional services to the Debtors during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,373.17.

		Requested			Outstanding		
Date Filed [Docket Number]	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses	Amount Paid	Fees
10/2/23 [No. 299]	7/27/23 - 8/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$1,050.36	\$140,000.00	\$1,050.36	\$141,050.36	\$35,000
10/30/23 [No. 447]	9/1/23 - 9/30/23	\$175,000.00	\$25.93	\$140,000.00	\$25.93	\$140,025.93	\$35,000
12/1/23 [No. 557]	10/1/23 - 10/31/23	\$175,000.00	\$1,037.75	\$140,000.00	\$1,037.75	\$141,037.75	\$35,000
12/14/23 [No. 579]	11/1/23 - 11/30/23	\$175,000.00	\$259.13	\$140,000.00	\$259.13	\$140,259.13	\$35,000
Total		\$700,000.00	\$2,373.17	\$560,000.00	\$2,373.17	\$562,373.17	\$140,000

7. All services for which Greenhill requests compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors and were not duplicative in nature with other Debtor advisors.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Prog 510 off 1997

8. Greenhill does not bill its clients based on the number of hours expended by its professionals. Accordingly, Greenhill does not have hourly rates for its professionals, and Greenhill's professionals generally do not maintain time records for the work performed for its clients. Consistent with the terms of the Retention Order, however, Greenhill has maintained a daily time log detailing the activities and services performed by Greenhill on behalf of the Debtors, in half hour increments, during the Compensation Period, attached hereto in <u>Exhibit B</u>.

#### **SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED<sup>6</sup>**

9. In accordance with (i) the Retention Order, (ii) the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules and the Local Rules; (iii) the Interim Compensation Order; and (iv) the U.S. Trustee Guidelines (collectively, the "Guidelines") and its internal timekeeping procedures, Greenhill has established the following categorization of matters in order to provide a meaningful summary of services rendered on behalf of the Debtors and their estates in connection with these Chapter 11 Cases:

Matter number	Matter description
1	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls
2	General Administrative
3	General Presentation Preparation
4	Financial Analysis / Modeling
5	Financial Due Diligence
6	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions
7	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation
8	Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice
9	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>6</sup> This summary is not intended to be a detailed description of the work Greenhill has performed during the Compensation Period but rather is a guideline offered to the Court and other interested parties with respect to the services performed by Greenhill.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Prog 521 off 19947

10. Consistent with the Guidelines, the following summaries highlight certain key areas in which Greenhill provided essential services to the Debtors during the period.

## A. Advisor / Management Meetings / Internal Calls (Matter #1) Total hours during the period: 290.75

11. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals corresponding (and preparation thereof) with the management team, the Debtors' other advisors, and among the Greenhill team itself, on matters related to the restructuring process, the sale process, the Chapter 11 Cases, ongoing strategy, and / or other related topics.

### B. General Administrative (Matter #2)

#### Total hours during the period: 37.50

12. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals performing general administrative tasks, including, but not limited to, team coordination, issuing invoices, and responding to correspondence from the Debtors' other advisors.

### C. General Presentation Preparation (Matter #3)

#### Total hours during the period: 78.00

13. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals preparing various presentations and marketing materials for internal purposes, potential investors, the Board of Directors, the creditors, and various other stakeholders on a range of topics including, but not limited to, the sale process, stakeholder negotiations and settlements, and other related topics.

#### D. Financial Analysis / Modeling (Matter #4)

#### Total hours during the period: 156.75

14. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals performing financial analyses and preparing various schedules and files for internal (e.g. management, Board of

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Prog 532 off 1997

Directors) and external consumption (e.g. potential investors, stakeholders). Greenhill performed numerous financial analyses, including, but not limited to, review of the Debtors' capital structure, settlement returns analysis, stakeholder recovery analyses, sale process scenario and purchase price analyses, and other bespoke analyses as required.

#### E. Financial Due Diligence (Matter #5)

#### Total hours during the period: 13.00

15. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill facilitating due diligence requests for internal (e.g. management, Board of Directors, the Special Committee) and external consumption (e.g. potential investors, stakeholders, the Court). This category also involves time spent coordinating phone meetings with the Debtors' management to conduct internal diligence.

## F. Board - Calls / Meetings / Discussions (Matter #6)

#### Total hours during the period: 9.50

16. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating in calls and meetings with the Debtors' Board of Directors and time spent preparing for those calls and meetings.

## G. Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation (Matter #7)

#### **Total hours during the Compensation Period: 119.50**

17. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating and listening to Court hearings in its capacity as investment banker to the Debtors, including time spent engaged in research, performing requisite analyses and reviewing or preparing relevant documents in preparation for such Court proceedings and related matters, including, but not limited to, the *Declaration of Vinod Chandiramani in Support of Debtors' Motion for Entry of an Order Authorizing Allowance and Payment of the Purchaser Protections in Support of the Plan and Consummation of the Azorra Aircraft Sale (Filed by Lauren C. Doyle on Behalf of Voyager)* 

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Prg 548 off 1997

Aviation Holdings, LLC) [Docket No. 41] and Declaration of Michael Masterson in Support of the Debtors' Motion for Entry of Orders (I) (A) Conditionally Scheduling a Sale Hearing and (B) Approving the Form and Manner of Notice Thereof; (II) (A) Authorizing the Private Sale of the Target Assets Free and Clear of All Encumbrances Pursuant to the Purchase Agreement and (B) Granting Related Relief (Filed by Lauren C. Doyle on Behalf of Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC) [Docket No. 49].

# H. Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice (Matter #8)Total hours during the period: 21.00

18. This category includes time spent by Greenhill professionals recording hours as well as preparing and reviewing the fee applications and / or related analyses.

## I. Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items (Matter #9)

### Total hours during the period: 117.50

19. This category reflects time spent by Greenhill professionals participating in calls or other correspondence with the Debtors' stakeholders, including lenders, potential buyers, potential investors, and other stakeholders and their professionals. Topics for such discussions were typically focused on sale process updates, settlement framework conversations, and recovery/waterfall analyses.

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank.]

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 554 off 1997

WHEREFORE, Greenhill requests entry of an order approving on an interim basis in (i) an interim allowance of \$700,000.00 as compensation for professional services to the Debtor during the Compensation Period and reimbursement for its actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,373.17, together in the aggregate \$702,373.17; (ii) the Debtors be authorized and directed to pay Greenhill the outstanding balance of \$140,000; and (iii) for such other and further relief as this Court deems proper.

Dated: January 15, 2024

New York, New York

<u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 5/65 of 19947

## EXHIBIT A

**Certification Regarding Compliance with Local Guidelines** 

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Prog 516 off 1997

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>7</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

### <u>CERTIFICATION OF VINOD CHANDIRAMANI IN SUPPORT OF THE FIRST</u> <u>INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND</u> <u>FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE</u> <u>DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2023</u>

I, Vinod Chandiramani, certify as follows:

1. I am a Managing Director of North American Financing Advisory & Restructuring

at Greenhill & Co., LLC ("Greenhill").

2. This certification is made in respect of Greenhill's compliance with *General Order* 

M-447, Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of

New York Bankruptcy Cases pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a) (as updated June 17, 2013) (the

"Local Guidelines") in connection with Greenhill's first interim fee application (this "First

Interim Fee Application") seeking allowance of compensation for professional services

performed by Greenhill during the period commencing on July 27, 2023, through and including

November 30, 2023 (the "<u>Compensation Period</u>").

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>7</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 587 off 1997

- 3. In respect of Section B.1 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that:
  - a. I have read the First Interim Fee Application;
  - b. to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees sought fall within the Local Guidelines; and
  - c. the fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices customarily employed by Greenhill and generally accepted by Greenhill' clients.
- 4. I certify that Greenhill has provided the information required by the Local

Guidelines in the Application and that the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, the Debtor, and counsel for the Debtor are each being provided with a copy of this Application.

Dated: January 15, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 598 off 1997

## EXHIBIT B

Time Records of Greenhill Professionals

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 609 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/2/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/8/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/9/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
		-		
8/10/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/14/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/15/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/17/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/22/2023	Masterson	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.5	Board Precall, Meeting
8/24/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Remarketing Process - Investor Outreach Preparation
8/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
8/30/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
8/30/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.0	Court Preparation
8/31/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Stakeholder call
8/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/5/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
	Masterson			
9/5/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
9/12/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/14/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
				Stakeholder call
9/18/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	
9/19/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/22/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
9/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
10/2/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
		0 0 1		÷
10/5/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/12/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with Milbank
10/25/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/25/2023		· ·		•
	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/31/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
11/1/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/2/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/6/2023	Masterson	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status conference
11/8/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Buyer call
11/9/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Masterson	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Buyer call
11/13/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
44/00/0000	Masterson	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023				

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 620 off 1997

/27/2023	Professional Chandiramani	Category Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	Hours 0.5	Advisor call
27/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Internal Calls		
		5	3.5	Board Meetings
27/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	0.5	Advisor call
28/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
28/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
29/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation Review
30/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
31/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Advisor / noteholder call
31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor strategy call
/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
/1/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Discuss diligence request
/1/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Prospective Investor discussion
/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Working Group discussion
/3/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
/3/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss drafting questions
/3/2023	Chandiramani	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
/4/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor lawyer call
/6/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
/7/2023	Chandiramani	• •	1.0	
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor / management working group call
/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	General update discussion
/8/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Liquidation analysis discussion
/8/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
/9/2023	Chandiramani	Financial Due Diligence	2.0	Strategy work
10/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/2023	Chandiramani		1.0	Stakeholder call
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
11/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
11/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
11/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
12/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
13/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
14/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call
		-		
15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call - Strategy
16/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call - Strategy
/17/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call - Strategy
/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
19/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	
				Internal strategy call
20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation agreement discussion
20/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
21/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
22/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
22/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Board Meeting materials review
22/2023	Chandiramani	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board meeting
22/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Retention app review
22/2023				
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
24/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
24/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
24/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder strategy call
25/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Bidding procedures discussion
25/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Retention app review
28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
29/2023		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		Creditor Call
	Chandiramani	0	0.5	
29/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
30/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	4.0	Preparing for hearing
30/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
30/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.0	Omnibus Hearing
				•
31/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
/4/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
/5/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis catch up
/6/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
/7/2023		5 5uno		
/7/2023 /7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussions / Comments related to retention order

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 622 off 1997

9/11/2023 9/11/2023	Chandiramani			
	Ob an allower and	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party situation catch up
/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
)/14/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
/15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
		0 0		
/15/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
/18/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with AFIC advisors
/18/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/18/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/19/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
/20/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/21/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
	Chandiramani		0.5	
/22/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/23/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/23/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
/25/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor call
/26/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Sale Hearing
/27/2023	Chandiramani		0.5	•
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/27/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
/29/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
/29/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
/29/2023		0		· ·
	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
/29/2023	Chandiramani	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Review August monthly fee statement
0/1/2023	Chandiramani	General Administrative	0.5	Review of third party contact list
0/1/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review teaser for participation assets proposal outreach
0/1/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Diligence re: Participation Assets
				•
0/1/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
0/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
0/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
0/2/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
0/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
0/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
		-		•
0/3/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
0/3/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Fee App review / comments
0/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
0/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review Declaration Draft
0/4/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
0/4/2023	Chandiramani		0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
0/4/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of declaration / comments
0/5/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
0/6/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
0/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
0/9/2023	Chandiramani	0	1.0	
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		Review of Participation Asset term sheets / related recovery analysis
/10/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
)/10/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/10/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis
/10/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
/11/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
/12/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
/12/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
/12/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
/12/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of draft declaration materials
)/16/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
		-	0.5	· ·
/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor internal strategy call
)/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
/18/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
/18/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor internal strategy call
/19/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
/23/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
/23/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Hearing prep
/24/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
/24/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Preparation for court hearing
/25/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Omnibus hearing
	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
/25/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
)/25/2023 )/26/2023		• •		
	Chandiramani Chandiramani Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0 1.5	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 622 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
10/30/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/30/2023	Chandiramani	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Reviewing September Fee Statement
10/31/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Deposition preparation
		<b>.</b> .		
11/1/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal meeting on precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discovery discussion
11/6/2023	Chandiramani	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status conference
11/7/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor Call
1/9/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
		· ·		
1/9/2023	Chandiramani	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review of waterfall analysis
1/10/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis discussion
1/10/2023	Chandiramani	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of recovery analysis calculations
1/13/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
1/16/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call on recovery update
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.8	Internal call to prepare for stakeholder meeting
1/28/2023	Chandiramani	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.8	Stakeholder meeting
1/30/2023	Chandiramani	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Chandiramani	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Reviewing October Fee Statement
7/27/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Whiffen	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
7/27/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
		· · ·		
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
7/28/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Review financial analyses
7/29/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Prepare financial analyses
7/30/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	2.0	Prepare and review diligence materials
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
7/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Management calls
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
8/2/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses
				•
8/4/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal review
8/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/7/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/8/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses
8/10/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
B/10/2023	Whiffen		1.0	Stakeholder call
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
8/11/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/12/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/13/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/14/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
8/14/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
B/15/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
8/17/2023	Whiffen	5 5	1.0	Advisor call
8/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
8/19/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	Diligence assistance
8/20/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	2.5	Diligence assistance
3/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
3/21/2023		• •		
	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/21/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor calls
8/22/2023	Whiffen	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
8/22/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/23/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
3/24/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
3/24/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
3/25/2023	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/25/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 628 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
8/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	2.0	VDR calls with management
8/28/2028	Whiffen	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepare internal materials for filings
8/29/2023	Whiffen		1.0	Investor outreach coordination
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with potential bidder
8/31/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
		· ·		
9/1/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	VDR coordination
9/2/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor and management calls
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.0	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Potential investor call
9/6/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
		· ·		÷
9/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Potential investor calls
9/8/2023	Whiffen	Financial Due Diligence	1.0	VDR coordination
9/11/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/11/2023	Whiffen	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Potential investor calls
		•		
9/14/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
9/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
9/25/2023	Whiffen			
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/26/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Court hearing
9/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
		• • •		÷
10/5/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/18/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/23/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/25/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
10/26/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Whiffen	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
11/1/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
11/2/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/7/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/10/2023	Whiffen	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
11/13/2023	Whiffen			-
		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
11/16/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/21/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/28/2023	Whiffen	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Whiffen		0.5	Advisor call
1730/2023	www.initerr	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	
7/28/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
7/29/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation
				<b>o i</b>
7/30/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Advisor / noteholder call
7/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor strategy call
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	•	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
	McCarthy			-
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
8/1/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Prospective Investor discussion
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update call
		0 0		•
8/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Working Group discussion
8/3/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/3/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss filings / drafting
8/3/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
		-		
8/6/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
			1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/7/2023 8/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor / management working group can

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 624 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
8/8/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Liquidation analysis discussion
8/8/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
	•	6 6		
8/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/10/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
8/12/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
8/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
8/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
	•			
3/14/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call
3/16/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
3/17/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/18/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/19/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
	•	-		5
3/20/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
8/20/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation agreement discussion
3/20/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
3/21/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
3/22/2023	McCarthy	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
/22/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Board Meeting materials drafting / edits
/22/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Retention app review
/24/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
/24/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/24/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
3/25/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Bidding Procedures discussion
3/25/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Retention app review
3/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/29/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
8/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal catch up
3/30/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
3/31/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
3/31/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Section 341 meetings of creditors
8/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
9/4/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis catch up
9/6/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/7/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussions / Comments related to retention order
9/10/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	0.5	Coordination of VDR
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Revised potential retention order
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/11/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party situation catch up
9/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/15/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
	•			
9/16/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/18/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
9/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis catch up
	•			
9/19/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/20/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/21/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis catch up
9/22/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
	•	General Presentation Preparation		Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
0/23/2023	McCarthy McCarthy		1.0	
9/25/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/26/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
	•			
9/28/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
9/29/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third party calls on status of Participation Agreement
9/29/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Review of Monthly Fee App (August)
10/1/2023	McCarthy	General Administrative	0.5	Review of third party contact list
10/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/2/2022	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/2/2023 10/2/2023 10/3/2023	McCarthy McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0 1.0	Outreach to third-parties related to Participation Assets Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 625 off 1997

-			-	<b>a</b>
Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
10/3/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion re: Participation Assets
10/3/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Fee App review / comments
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court Hearing
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/4/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review of declaration / comments
10/5/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/5/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review of declaration / comments
10/6/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Review of Participation Asset term sheets / related recovery analysis
10/10/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court Hearing
10/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/10/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis
10/10/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/11/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
10/12/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/12/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of draft declaration materials
10/12/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
10/16/2023	McCarthy	-	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
10/16/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
10/16/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/18/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/19/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/19/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/19/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
10/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/23/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Hearing prep
10/25/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/26/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	
				Internal strategy call
10/26/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/27/2023	McCarthy	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/27/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/30/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/31/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Hearing / deposition prep
11/1/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Hearing
11/2/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/2/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery prep
11/3/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Waterfall analysis catch up
11/6/2023	McCarthy	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Hearing
11/7/2023			0.5	*
	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Internal strategy call
11/9/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/9/2023	McCarthy	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of waterfall analysis
11/10/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis discussion
11/10/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review of recovery analysis calculations
11/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/13/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Waterfall / aircraft novation update
11/13/2023	McCarthy	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review of recovery analysis calculations
11/14/2023	McCarthy	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis review / discussion
	mooding	, tancor , management meeting , meenial cano		
7/27/2022	Becker	Advisor / Management Mosting / Internal Calle	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/27/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		•
7/28/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/1/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/11/2023	Becker	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/25/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	Becker	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with potential bidders
8/31/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/4/2023	<b>D</b> .			Advisor coll
9/6/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
	Becker Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls General Presentation Preparation	1.0 3.0	Marketing materials for sale process

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 626 off 1997

	Professional		Hours	Description
9/10/2023	Becker	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Becker	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with potential bidders
9/12/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/23/2023	Becker	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/9/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/12/2023			0.5	•
	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor call
10/16/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/25/2023	Becker		1.5	Court hearing
		Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		•
10/26/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Becker	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
11/7/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
		0 0		
11/13/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Becker	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Deckei	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Gans	0.0	
10/4/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Aviator Rule 2004 Motion Hearing
10/4/2023	Bronstein	General Administrative	1.0	Preparing VDR for potential participation assets investors
10/4/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/6/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/8/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Bronstein		0.5	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
		Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		
10/10/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/10/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Advisor call
10/11/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/12/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/15/2023	Bronstein		1.0	
		Financial Analysis / Modeling		Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/16/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/17/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/18/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/19/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/24/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/24/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/25/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Omnibus Hearing
10/25/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/26/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
		, ,		
10/26/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/27/2023	Bronstein	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/27/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/27/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery review
0/31/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court Hearing preparation
		0 0 1		
11/1/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Court Hearing
11/2/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
11/2/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/3/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery review
11/6/2023	Bronstein	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
		·		
11/7/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/8/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Waterfall and cash flow analysis related to upcoming closing
11/9/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
				•
	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with Management
			0.5	Advisor call
	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/10/2023 11/13/2023 11/14/2023	Bronstein Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 627 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
1/13/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfa
1/16/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
				•
1/17/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfa
1/17/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/20/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modelling recoveries
1/21/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/21/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries
1/22/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/22/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modelling recoveries
11/24/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries
1/28/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/28/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modelling recoveries
1/28/2023	Bronstein		0.5	Noteholder Call
		Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
1/29/2023	Bronstein	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Reviewing October monthly fee statement
1/30/2023	Bronstein	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Bronstein	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
7/27/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	6.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
7/27/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.5	Updating recovery model and/or deck
	Wang			
7/30/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
7/31/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Stakeholder call preparation
	-	•		
8/1/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/2/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/3/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/3/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/4/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/7/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
	-			
8/7/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/9/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	•		1.0	
	Wang	General Presentation Preparation		Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
8/12/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/14/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
	-	•		
8/21/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/22/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/24/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Wang	General Administrative	5.0	Internal compliance checks for retention application
	-			
8/25/2023	Wang	General Administrative	2.5	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/28/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/29/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing hours
8/29/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023				
	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Reviewing liquidation analysis
8/31/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/4/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/5/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
	-			
9/6/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/7/2023	Wang	General Administrative	1.0	Dataroom management
9/8/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.0	Docket research
9/9/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Docket research
		· · ·		
9/10/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Docket research
9/11/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/12/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023		Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
	Wang			
9/18/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/19/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing hours
9/20/2023				

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 628 off 1997

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
9/22/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/23/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/23/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Preparing participation agreement side-by-side
9/24/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/25/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/25/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/26/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/26/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/27/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	4.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/28/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/29/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023				
	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/29/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/30/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
10/1/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
10/1/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
10/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/2/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10/2/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
	-		0.5	
10/3/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal company call re: Participation Assets
10/4/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
10/4/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10/4/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review Declaration Draft
10/4/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/5/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
10/5/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10/5/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
	-			
10/6/2023	Wang	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10/6/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/9/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
10/9/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	-	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1.0	
	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling		Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
10/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/12/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
0/12/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023		Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculation of claims
	Wang			
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculation of claims
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analysis of prior insurance claim settlements
10/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/14/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/15/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/16/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/16/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/17/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/18/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
	-	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/18/2023	Wang	•		
10/18/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/19/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
0/20/2023	Wang	General Administrative	3.5	Discovery request
10/23/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/23/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/24/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/24/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
0/24/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/24/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Reading reply in support of participation agreement
	wany	Source rearings / Fillings / Freparation	0.5	
10/24/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 729 off 19947

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
10/25/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/25/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/25/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Omnibus hearing
0/25/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/25/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/26/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
0/26/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/26/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/26/2023	Wang	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
0/27/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
0/27/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussing discovery
0/27/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
0/27/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing September Fee Statement
0/30/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
0/30/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Preparing September Fee Statement
11/1/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Printing reference documents for PA Hearing
11/1/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/1/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/2/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal meeting on precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August invoice
	-			
11/2/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Producing discovery
11/2/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
11/3/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
11/3/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/3/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Producing discovery
11/6/2023	Wang	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status conference
11/6/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/7/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor Call
11/7/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/8/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/8/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing October fee statement
11/9/2023		•	1.0	
	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor Call
11/9/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
11/9/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/10/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/10/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/11/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/13/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/13/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/13/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing September invoice
11/13/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/14/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing September invoice
11/14/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
	-	· · · · ·	0.5	
11/15/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling		Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/15/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing October fee statement
1/16/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
1/16/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/21/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/21/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
1/21/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.3	Advisor call
1/22/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
1/22/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/26/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.3	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/28/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
1/28/2023			0.5	
	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		Advisor Call
1/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call on recovery update
1/28/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.8	Internal call to prepare for stakeholder meeting
1/28/2023	Wang	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.8	Stakeholder meeting
1/29/2023	Wang	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Calculating default interest
1/30/2023	Wang	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2023	Wang	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing October fee statement
7/27/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023		-	0.5	Stakeholder call
	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items		
8/3/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/10/2023				

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 730 off 19947

Date	Professional	Category	Hours	Description
8/14/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	5.0	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/25/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with potential bidders
8/31/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/4/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/6/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/6/2023	Dayananda	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
9/7/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	3.0	Dataroom management
9/8/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	3.0	Dataroom management
9/9/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/10/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Dayananda	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with potential bidders
9/12/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/23/2023	Dayananda	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/2/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/5/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/12/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/1/2023	Dayananda	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
11/7/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Dayananda	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
	Dayananda	A and a standard and a	0.0	

### EXHIBIT C

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)<sup>1</sup>

Expense Category	Jul 2023	Aug 2023	Sept 2023	Oct 2023	Nov 2023
Taxi	\$52.84	\$611.03	\$-	\$167.11	\$88.97
Taxi - OT	-	471.19	-	4.16	-
Mobile/Cellular Phone	-	248.25	32.55	203.44	170.16
Meals - Overtime	-	221.82	25.93	65.72	-
Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	-	10.00	-	-	-
Total	\$52.84	\$1,562.29	\$58.48	\$440.43	\$259.13

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 732 off 1997

## EXHIBIT D

**Previously Filed Monthly Fee Statements** 

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 73/30 off 19947

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

#### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2023

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC		
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors		
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023		
Beginning of F		Period	End of Period	
Time period covered by this				
statement	July 27, 2023		August 31, 2023	
Summar	y of Total Fees	and Expenses Re	equested:	
Amount of Compensation soug	ght			
as actual, reasonable, and nece	ssary:	\$175,000.00 <sup>2</sup> (	80% = \$140,000.00)	
Amount of Expense Reimburse	ement sought			
as actual, reasonable, and nece	ssary:	\$1,050.36 <sup>3</sup>		

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of August 2023 only.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Frg 7334 off 1997

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through August 31, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	29.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	67.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	85.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	51.0
Eli Becker	Vice President	26.0
Linda Wang	Analyst	78.5
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	35.0
Total		372.5

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 7355 off 19947

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through August 31, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	126.5
General Administrative	12.5
General Presentation Preparation	39.5
Financial Analysis / Modeling	58.0
Financial Due Diligence	8.0
Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	9.5
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	56.0
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	1.0
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	61.5
Total	372.5

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 736 off 1997

Expense Category	Jul 2023	Aug 2023
Mobile/Cellular Phone	\$-	\$248
Meals - Overtime	-	222
Taxi - OT	-	471
Taxi	53	56
Total	\$53	<b>\$998</b>

#### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (July 27, 2023 Through August 31, 2023)

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 7337 off 19947

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	14.0	-	-	-	-	1.5	6.5		7.5	29.5
Chandiramani	26.0	-	1.0	0.5	2.0	5.0	18.5	-	14.0	67.0
McCarthy	25.0	-	1.5	1.0	-	1.0	11.0	-	11.5	51.0
Whiffen	24.5	-	23.0	13.0	6.0	2.0	6.0	-	11.0	85.5
Becker	12.0	-	2.0	-	-	-	4.5	-	7.5	26.0
Wang	13.0	7.5	7.0	43.5	-	-	5.0	1.0	1.5	78.5
Dayananda	12.0	5.0	5.0	-	-		4.5		8.5	35.0
Total	126.5	12.5	39.5	58.0	8.0	9.5	56.0	1.0	61.5	372.5

### Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Frg 738 off 1997

Professional Masterson	ı from	Petition	Date	through	the	end	of	August
------------------------	--------	----------	------	---------	-----	-----	----	--------

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/8/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/9/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
3/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
3/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
3/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
3/15/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
3/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
3/17/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
3/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
3/22/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.5	Board Precall, Meeting
3/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
3/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Remarketing Process - Investor Outreach Preparation
3/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
3/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
3/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
3/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
3/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.0	Court Preparation
3/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
3/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Stakeholder call
8/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pg 839 off 1997

#### Professional Chandiramani from Petition Date through the end of August

	andiramani from Petition Date through the	0	Persolution
Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	3.5	Board Meetings
7/27/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
7/29/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation Review
7/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Advisor / noteholder call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor strategy call
8/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Discuss diligence request
8/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
8/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Prospective Investor discussion
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Working Group discussion
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
8/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss drafting questions
8/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/4/2023 8/6/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Creditor lawyer call
8/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5 1.0	Internal strategy call Advisor / management working group call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	General update discussion
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Liquidation analysis discussion
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
8/9/2023	Financial Due Diligence	2.0	Strategy work
8/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/10/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
8/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
8/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
8/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/14/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call
8/15/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call - Strategy
8/16/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
8/16/2023 8/17/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0 1.0	Advisor call - Strategy Advisor call
8/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call - Strategy
8/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
8/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
8/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation agreement discussion
8/20/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
8/22/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Board Meeting materials review
8/22/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board meeting
8/22/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Retention app review
8/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/24/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
8/24/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
8/24/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder strategy call
8/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Bidding procedures discussion
8/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Retention app review
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
8/29/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
8/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	4.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
0/20/2022	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Declaration review
	Court Liceniana / Filinga / December	4.0	
8/30/2023 8/31/2023 8/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0 3.0	Preparing for hearing Omnibus Hearing

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 840 off 1997

#### Professional Whiffen from Petition Date through the end of August

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
7/27/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
7/27/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
7/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Review financial analyses
7/29/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Prepare financial analyses
7/30/2023	Financial Due Diligence	2.0	Prepare and review diligence materials
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Management calls
8/2/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
8/2/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call
8/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss drafting
8/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal review
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/7/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/8/2023 8/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0 1.0	Review financial analyses
8/10/2023	· ·	1.0	Advisor call Stakeholder call
8/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/13/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/14/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
8/14/2023	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Prepare internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/15/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
8/17/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
8/19/2023	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	Diligence assistance
8/20/2023	Financial Due Diligence	2.5	Diligence assistance
8/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
8/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discuss diligence request
8/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/21/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor calls
8/22/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
8/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Review financial analyses
8/22/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/23/2023	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/24/2023	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/25/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Investor outreach and sale process preparation
8/25/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach
8/27/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	2.0	VDR calls with management
8/28/2028	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepare internal materials for filings
8/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Investor outreach coor
8/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with potential bidder
	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation		Court hearing
8/31/2023 8/31/2023		1.5 1.0	· ·

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 821 off 1997

#### Professional McCarthy from Petition Date through the end of August

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor Call
7/29/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Noteholder Diligence / Summary Presentation
7/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Advisor / noteholder call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor strategy call
8/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor diligence call
8/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Prospective Investor discussion
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update call
8/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Working Group discussion
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discuss filings / drafting
8/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses
8/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Noteholder Diligence Requests
8/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	General update discussion
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Liquidation analysis discussion
8/8/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
3/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/10/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
3/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
3/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/14/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call
8/16/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder counsel call
8/17/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
8/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
3/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation agreement discussion
3/20/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Noteholder Diligence Requests
3/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy calls / pre-call for Board Meeting
3/22/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Meeting
3/22/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Board Meeting materials drafting / edits
3/22/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Retention app review
3/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
3/24/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Bidding Procedures review and related materials
3/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Bidding Procedures discussion
3/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Retention app review
3/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/29/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
3/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor / management working group call
3/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal catch up
3/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Declaration review
3/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
3/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Section 341 meetings of creditors
3/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 862 off 1997

#### Professional Becker from Petition Date through the end of August

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/11/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/25/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with potential bidders
8/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 848 off 1997

#### Professional Wang from Petition Date through the end of August

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	6.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.5	Updating recovery model and/or deck
7/30/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Stakeholder call preparation
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/2/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/4/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/8/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/9/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Participation agreement discussion
8/12/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/14/2023	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	General Administrative	5.0	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/25/2023	General Administrative	2.5	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Updating recovery model and/or deck
8/29/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing hours
8/29/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Reviewing liquidation analysis
8/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 854 off 1997

#### Professional Dayananda from Petition Date through the end of August

Date	Category	Hours	Description
7/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
7/28/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	First Day Hearing
7/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
7/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
7/31/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Creditor call
8/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
8/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	M, Th Advisor Call
8/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/10/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/11/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Prepared internal materials for bid procedures filing
8/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/24/2023	General Administrative	5.0	Internal compliance checks for retention application
8/25/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	6.0	Investor Outreach
8/28/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
8/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
8/29/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
8/30/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Preparing for hearing
8/30/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call w ith potential bidders
8/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
8/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prog 855 off 1997

#### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2023

Date	Name	Expense Category	Narrative	Amount
7/28/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Taxi - First Day Hearing	\$53
8/1/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone expense	\$95
8/10/2023	Andrew Tong	Meals - Overtime	Overtime dinner	\$150
8/10/2023	Andrew Tong	Taxi - OT	Overtime taxi	\$136
8/21/2023	Michael Masterson	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone expense	\$57
8/29/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Taxi - OT	Overtime taxi	\$156
8/29/2023	Amith Dayananda	Meals - Overtime	Overtime dinner	\$55
8/29/2023	Amith Dayananda	Taxi - OT	Overtime taxi	\$22
8/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone expense	\$96
8/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Meals - Overtime	Overtime dinner	\$17
8/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Taxi - OT	Overtime taxi	\$158
8/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Taxi	Taxi - Deposition Preparation	\$56

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Ptg 846 off 1997

Dated: October 2, 2023 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

#### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
	Beginning of P		End of Period
Time period covered by this			
statement	September 1,	2023	September 30, 2023
Summar	y of Total Fees	and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation soug	ght		
as actual, reasonable, and neces	ssary:	\$175,000.00 <sup>2</sup> (	80% = \$140,000.00)
Amount of Expense Reimburse	ement sought		
as actual, reasonable, and neces	ssary:	\$25.93 <sup>3</sup>	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of September 2023 only.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (September 1, 2023 Through September 30, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	14.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	25.5
Will Whiffen	Principal	15.0
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	28.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	16.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	42.5
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	21.0
Total	163.5	

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (September 1, 2023 Through September 30, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	64.0
General Administrative	17.5
General Presentation Preparation	25.0
Financial Analysis / Modeling	11.5
Financial Due Diligence	5.0
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	12.5
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	6.5
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	21.5
Total	163.5

#### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (September 1, 2023 Through September 30, 2023)<sup>4</sup>

<b>Expense Category</b>	Sept 2023
Meals - Overtime	\$25.93
Total	\$25.93

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Financial Due Diligence	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	9.5	-	-	-	-	0.5	-	4.5	14.5
Chandiramani	14.0	2.0	3.5	-	-	2.0	1.0	3.0	25.5
Whiffen	6.0	-	-	-	5.0	0.5	-	3.5	15.0
McCarthy	14.0	2.5	5.0	-	-	4.0	-	3.0	28.5
Becker	6.5	4.0	3.0	-	-	0.5	-	2.5	16.5
Bronstein	-	-	-	-	-	-	-	-	-
Wang	7.5	1.0	10.5	11.5	-	4.5	5.5	2.0	42.5
Dayananda	6.5	8.0	3.0	-	-	0.5	-	3.0	21.0
Total	64.0	17.5	25.0	11.5	5.0	12.5	6.5	21.5	163.5

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 932 off 1997

#### Professional Masterson for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/5/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
9/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Remarketing Process - call with Potential Buyer
9/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/14/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
9/15/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/22/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 958 off 1997

#### Professional Chandiramani for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/4/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis catch up
9/6/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussions / Comments related to retention order
9/11/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Revised potential retention order
9/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party situation catch up
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/15/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/15/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
9/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/19/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
9/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023		0.5	·
	General Presentation Preparation		Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/29/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Review August monthly fee statement

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 9554 off 1997

#### Professional Whiffen for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/1/2023	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	VDR coordination
9/2/2023	Financial Due Diligence	1.5	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor and management calls
9/5/2023	Financial Due Diligence	1.0	VDR coordination
9/5/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Potential investor call
9/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Potential investor calls
9/8/2023	Financial Due Diligence	1.0	VDR coordination
9/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Potential investor calls
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
9/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Court hearing
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 935 off 1997

#### Professional McCarthy for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/4/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis catch up
9/6/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Review of supplemental materials for bondholders
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussions / Comments related to retention order
9/10/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Coordination of VDR
9/11/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Revised potential retention order
9/11/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Update call with certain bondholders
9/13/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party situation catch up
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/15/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis catch up
9/19/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Engagement Letter Amendment
9/20/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis catch up
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/23/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Participation Agreement Waterfall Review
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call
9/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call regarding Participation Assets with Azorra Advisors
9/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third party calls on status of Participation Agreement
9/29/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.0	Review of Monthly Fee App (August)

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 956 off 1997

#### Professional Becker for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/6/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
9/8/2023	General Administrative	3.0	Dataroom management
9/10/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call w ith potential bidders
9/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/23/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

#### Professional Wang for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/4/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/7/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/7/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Dataroom management
9/8/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	3.0	Docket research
9/9/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Docket research
9/10/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Docket research
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with AFIC advisors
9/18/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Updating recovery model and/or deck
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/20/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing hours
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/23/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/23/2023	General Presentation Preparation	4.0	Preparing participation agreement side-by-side
9/24/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/25/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/26/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
9/27/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/27/2023	General Presentation Preparation	4.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/28/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
9/29/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials
9/29/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August monthly fee statement
9/30/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing ABC Claims Marketing materials

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Prg 958 off 1997

#### Professional Dayananda for the month of September

Date	Category	Hours	Description
9/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Sale Process Management / internal materials
9/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/6/2023	General Presentation Preparation	3.0	Marketing materials for sale process
9/7/2023	General Administrative	3.0	Dataroom management
9/8/2023	General Administrative	3.0	Dataroom management
9/9/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/10/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Creditor call
9/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Call with potential bidders
9/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
9/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
9/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
9/22/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/23/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Dataroom management
9/25/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
9/26/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Sale Hearing
9/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Pgg169 of 997

#### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2023<sup>5</sup>

Date	Name	<b>Expense Category</b>	Narrative	Amount
9/30/2023	Amith Dayananda	Meals - Overtime	Overtime meal	\$25.93
Total				\$25.93

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggL00 of 997

Dated: October 30, 2023 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg102 of 997

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

#### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
Beginning of P		Period	End of Period
Time period covered by this	Time period covered by this		
statement	October 1, 20	23	October 31, 2023
Summar	y of Total Fees	and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation soug	ght		
as actual, reasonable, and neces	ssary:	$175,000.00^2$ (80% = $140,000.00$ )	
Amount of Expense Reimburse	ement sought		
as actual, reasonable, and neces	ssary:	\$1,037.75 <sup>3</sup>	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of October 2023 only.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggL62 of 997

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (October 1, 2023 Through October 31, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	8.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	34.5
Will Whiffen	Principal	8.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	33.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	8.0
Noah Bronstein	Associate	23.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	65.5
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	5.5
Total	187.5	

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Piggl 03 of 997

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (October 1, 2023 Through October 31, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	56.0
General Administrative	7.5
General Presentation Preparation	12.0
Financial Analysis / Modeling	43.0
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	29.5
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	8.0
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	31.5
Total	187.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document PggL08 of 997

<b>Expense Category</b>	Aug 2023	Sep 2023	Oct 2023
Mobile/Cellular Phone	\$-	\$32.55	\$203.44
Meals - Overtime	-	-	65.72
Taxi - OT	-	-	4.16
Taxi	554.77	-	167.11
Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	10.00	-	-
Total	\$564.77	\$32.55	\$440.43

#### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (October 1, 2023 Through October 31, 2023)<sup>4</sup>

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg106 of 997

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	6.5	-	-	-	2.0	-	-	8.5
Chandiramani	11.5	0.5	3.0	-	8.0	2.0	9.5	34.5
Whiffen	6.0	-	-	-	2.5	-	-	8.5
McCarthy	9.5	0.5	5.0	-	5.5	-	13.0	33.5
Becker	4.5	-	-	-	3.5	-	-	8.0
Bronstein	6.0	1.0	-	10.0	3.5	-	3.0	23.5
Wang	8.5	5.5	4.0	33.0	2.5	6.0	6.0	65.5
Dayananda	3.5	-	-	-	2.0	-	-	5.5
Total	56.0	7.5	12.0	43.0	29.5	8.0	31.5	187.5

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document P8g166 of 997

#### Professional Masterson for the month of October

Category	Hours	Description
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with Milbank
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation       1.0         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5         Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation       1.0         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document P8g108 of 997

#### Professional Chandiramani for the month of October

Date	Category	Hours	Description
10/1/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Review of third party contact list
10/1/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review teaser for participation assets proposal outreach
10/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Diligence re: Participation Assets
10/1/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Fee App review / comments
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review Declaration Draft
10/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call - Participation Assets
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of declaration / comments
10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
10/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
10/9/2023			
10/9/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0 1.0	Review of Participation Asset term sheets / related recovery analysis Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
10/10/2023		1.0	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
10/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls		
10/10/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	
	5		Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
10/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/12/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of draft declaration materials
10/16/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor internal strategy call
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/18/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor internal strategy call
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Hearing prep
10/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
10/24/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Preparation for court hearing
10/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Omnibus hearing
10/25/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/26/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Reviewing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/27/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Discussing discovery
10/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/30/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Reviewing September Fee Statement
10/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Deposition preparation

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg109 of 997

|--|

Date	Category	Hours	Description
10/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/18/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg160 of 997

Professional McCarthy	for th	e month o	of October
-----------------------	--------	-----------	------------

Date	Category	Hours	Description
10/1/2023	General Administrative	0.5	Review of third party contact list
10/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.0	Outreach to third-parties related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion re: Participation Assets
10/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Fee App review / comments
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court Hearing
10/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review of declaration / comments
10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/5/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Review of declaration / comments
10/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal advisor strategy call
10/9/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Review of Participation Asset term sheets / related recovery analysis
10/10/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court Hearing
10/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/10/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Review / sharing of external lender creditor analysis
10/10/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/11/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
10/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/12/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review of draft declaration materials
10/12/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussions related to Participation Assets
10/16/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/16/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review / comments consolidation
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third Party Participation Asset term sheets review
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Hearing prep
10/25/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.5	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/26/2023	General Presentation Preparation	2.0	Participation assets waterfall analysis review
10/27/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Third-party discussion related to Participation Assets
10/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion related to Participation Asset strategy
10/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
10/31/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Hearing / deposition prep

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggII0 of 997

#### Professional Becker for the month of October

Date	Category	Hours	Description
10/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
10/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
10/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggII2 of 997

#### Professional Bronstein for the month of October

Date	Category	Hours	Description
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Aviator Rule 2004 Motion Hearing
10/4/2023	General Administrative	1.0	Preparing VDR for potential participation assets investors
10/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/6/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/8/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
10/10/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing
10/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Advisor call
10/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/12/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/15/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/17/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/24/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/24/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/25/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Omnibus Hearing
10/25/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation agreement recoveries
10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/27/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.5	Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement
10/27/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
10/27/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery review
10/31/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court Hearing preparation

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggII2 of 997

#### Professional Wang for the month of October

Ubit         Uncernation         Network         Network         Description           1002020         Centro Marketing marketing         1.00         Programs & Appring ACC clams Marketing marketing           1002020         Selectioners in Marketing Marketing Marketing marketing         1.00         Programs & Appring ACC clams Marketing marketing           1002020         Selectioners in Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing         1.00         Programs Action Action           1002020         Selectioners in Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing Marketing         1.00         Programs Action Action           1002020         Selectioners in Marketing Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams Marketing Marketing           1002020         Centr Abartings / Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams         1.00           1002020         Centr Abartings / Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams         1.00           1002020         Centr Abartings / Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams         1.00           1002020         Centr Abartings / Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams         1.00           1002020         Centr Abartings / Programs         6.5         This Appring ACC clams         1.00           1002020         Programs Abartings / Program		ng for the month of October		
101/1202Perspective Action (Marking / Markanger)10Perspective Action (Marking / Markanger)102/202Bask Action (Marking / Kalaka filmen) (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Bask Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Bask Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Bask Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Bask Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Action (Markanger)18With Anagereni102/202Action (Markanger)18With Action (Markanger)102/202Action (Markanger)18 <th></th> <th>Category</th> <th></th> <th>Description</th>		Category		Description
102202         Adder / Mangament Menting / Internal Calle         0.5         M. The Adea of M.           102202         General Administrative         0.5         VCM Management           102202         General Administrative         0.5         VCM Management           102202         General Administrative         0.5         Thisdawi y call-Parcipation Acades           102302         Statusfield Call / Menting / France Internal         0.5         WCM Management Management Management           102402         Call Hangay F Hings / Propendix         0.5         WCM Management Management Management           1044020         Call Hangay F Hings / Propendix         0.5         WCM Management           1044020         Statusfield Call / Menting / France Internal         0.5         WCM Management           1044020         Statusfield Call / Menting / France Internal         0.5         WCM Management           1044020         Call Hangay F Hings / Hi				
1012020Bahunku Cui, Tukentigi, Relaced hama10Tukentigu, Parking Cui, Kuana1012023Stakunku Cui, Lukentigi, Relaced hama65Tukentigu, Cui, Parking Cui, Kuana1012023Stakunku Cui, Lukentigi, Relaced hama65Tukentigu, Cui, Parking	10/1/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing August monthly fee statement
192202         General Administrative         0.5         VUD Manequeers           192202         Balacheler Galt / Meetings / Related Items         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           192202         Balacheler Galt / Meetings / Related Items         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           192202         Balacheler Galt / Meetings / Related Items         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           192202         Actac / Managemeet Meeting / Tamat Calls         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           1924020         Cont Heetings / Timps / Parsathin         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           1926020         Cont Heetings / Timps / Parsathin         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           1926020         Cont Heetings / Timps / Parsathin         0.5         Thrisesky call - Participation Assets           1926020         Cont Heetings / Timps / Parsathin         0.5         Modeling participation asset parceal assets           1926020         Francial Andreis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset parceal assets           1926020         Francial Andreis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset parceal assets           1926020         Francial Andreis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset parceal asset				
1902003Biakubab Caik / Matering / Fieland tens6.5Thiopany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Sakaholade Caik / Matering / Related tens6.5Niropany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Adako Caik / Matering / Fieland tens6.5Niropany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Caik Hening / Filma / Personiton6.5Niropany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Adako Caik Mangement Method / Neural Caik6.5Niropany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Adako Caik Matering / Filma / Personiton6.5Niropany cai - Periopation Asaka190203Adako Caik Matering / Niropany Caik Matering6.6Niropany caik matering190203Adako Caik Matering / Niropany caik matering6.6Niropany caik matering190203Adako Caik Matering / Natering6.6Niropany caik matering190203Adako Caik Matering / Natering6.6Niropany caik matering190203Adako Caik Matering / Natering6.6Niropany caik matering190203Financia Anayais / Nodeling6.6Niropany caik matering19020				
193202         Bakenbak Caik / Mangumer Mantery / Internat Caika         0.5         Thisparty cail / Participaton Asets           193207         Bakenbak Caik / Mangumer Mantery / Internat Caika         0.5         Nitepsy cail / Participaton Asets           194208         Caikar / Mangumer Mantery / Internat Caika         0.5         Nite Manual Caikar           194208         Caikar Aministatin         0.5         Nite Manual Caikar           194208         Caikar Aministatin         0.5         Nite Managument           195208         Anther / Mangument Mantary Internat Caika         0.5         Nite Mangument           195208         Fancial Antheritatine         0.5         Nite Managument         Nite Nite Nite Nite Nite Nite Nite Nite	10/2/2023	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
1910202Bakehdar Cain (Heerny, Filery / Perparties0.5Wite and compary offer Policytan Asset1914/202Cart Heerny, Filery / Perparties0.5Vita Comba Herrog1914/202Cart Heerny, Filery / Perparties0.5Wite Ansatz1914/2023Cart Heerny, Filery / Perparties0.5Wite Ansatz1914/2023Cart Heerny, Filery / Perparties0.5Wite Ansatz1915/2023Ansatz / Languanter Maring / Francation0.5Wite Ansatz1915/2023Ansatz / Languanter Maring / Francation0.6Wite Ansatz1915/2023Ansatz / Languanter Maring / Francation0.6Wite Ansatz1915/2023Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2024Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2025Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2026Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2027Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2028Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2029Francation Ansatz0.6Maring Ansatz1915/2020Francation Ansatz <td>10/2/2023</td> <td>Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items</td> <td>0.5</td> <td>Third-party call - Participation Assets</td>	10/2/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
Mole:// Management Meding / Heard Calls         0.5         Heard compary of in: Prolipsition Assets           1644202         Carter Administration         0.5         VER Management           1644203         Carter Administration         0.5         VER Management           1644203         Carter Administration         0.5         Rever Docurston Data           1644203         Carter Administration         0.5         Trindenty - Proleighton Assets           1644203         Carter Administration         0.5         Trindenty - Proleighton Assets           1642032         General Administration         0.5         VER Management         0.6           1662032         General Administration         0.5         Molein generalization acit proposition constration           1662032         Francial Analysis / Moleing         0.6         Moleing generalization acit proposition constration           1662032         Francial Analysis / Moleing         0.6         Moleing generalization acit proposition constration           1662032         Francial Analysis / Moleing         0.6         Moleing generalization acits proposition constration           16610322         Francial Analysis / Moleing         0.6         Moleing generalization acits proposition constration           16610322         Francial Analysis / Moleing         0.6         Moleinge	10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
1944/2000Court Heatings / Filings / Progenation0.50.900 Reader Machinesting1944/2010Court Heatings / Filings / Progenation0.6Reader Machinesting1944/2010Saturer Mannersen Meeting / Internal Cals0.6N. Th Acker Cal1952/2020Acker / Mannersen Meeting / Internal Cals0.6N. Th Acker Cal1953/2021Filings / Maching0.6N. Th Acker Cal1953/2021Filings / Maching0.6N. Th Acker Cal1953/2021Filings / Maching0.6N. Cal Maching Antonia Machinesting1953/2021Filings / Maching0.6Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2021Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2021Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2021Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2021Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2022Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2023Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2024Filings / Maching / Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2025Filings / Maching (Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2026Filings / Maching (Internal CalsN. Maching participation saide (proceal incomites1953/2025Fili	10/3/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
Diversity         Diversity / Firery / Fire	10/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal company call re: Participation Assets
1940/2001Schwier Meerstern (Preprinting Present Order) Present (Preprinting Present Order) Present (Preprinting Present Order) Present (Preprinting Present Order)1952/201Genet Administration0.5Windergenet Order) Present (Preprinting Present Order)1952/201Francial Analysis / Modring0.5Windergenet Order) Present (Preprinting Present Order)1952/201Francial Analysis / Modring Present Order)0.5Windergenet Order)1952/201Francial Analysis / Modring Present Order)0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1952/202Francial Analysis / Modring Present Order)0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1952/202Francial Analysis / Modring0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1952/202Francial Analysis / Modring0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.5Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.6Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.6Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.6Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.6Modring predicipation asset properal incomers1953/202Francial Analysis / Modring Preprint Order0.6 </td <td>10/4/2023</td> <td>Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation</td> <td>0.5</td> <td>10/4 Omnibus Hearing</td>	10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	10/4 Omnibus Hearing
1014/2023         Shinkhofor (all Valening / Heind Steing)         0.5         Throppung out - Principation Assets           1005/2023         General Administration         0.5         VDR Management           1005/2023         General Administration         0.5         Wooding participation asset propoal recontes           1005/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Wooding participation asset propoal recontes           1005/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling / Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1005/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1005/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1001/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1001/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1001/2023         Filterical Analysis / Modeling / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1001/2024         Filterical Analysis / Modeling Participation asset propoal recontes         0.6           1001/2025         Filterical Analysis / Modeling         1.6         Modeling participation asset propoal recontes           1001/2026         Filterical Analysi / Modeling	10/4/2023	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
1050200Adver / Mangement Medrag / Farma Calls1,0M. Th. Adver Call1050201Fanctial Analysis / Modiling2,6Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling3,6Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling3,0Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling1,0Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling1,0Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling1,0Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analysis / Modiling2,0Modiling paticipation assed propant monomes1050202Fanctial Analy	10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Review Declaration Draft
19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.6         VDR Management           19/02/20         General Animistation         0.6         VDR Management           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.6         VDR Management           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.6         VDR Management           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.6         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         1.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.5         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         0.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         1.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         1.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         1.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing         1.0         Modeing participation asset proposit mocentes           19/02/20         Financia Analysis / Modeing	10/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
1959220Pinecial Analysi / Moding2.0Moding participation asch proposal recoveries1969220Pinecial Analysi / Moding0.6Modering participation asch proposal recoveries1969220Pinecial Analysi / Moding0.0Modering participation asch proposal recoveries1969220Pinecial Analysi / Moding0.0Modering participation asch proposal recoveries1969220Pinecial Analysi / Modering0.0Modering participation asch proposal recoveries1970220Pinecial Analysi / Modering1.0Modering participation asch proposal recoveries1970220Pinecial Analysi / Modering1.0Calculation of alian197	10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	M, Th Advisor Call
1992222         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.5         VDR Management           1992222         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1992222         Actional Analysis (Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1992223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal mocowies           1997223         Financial Analysis (Modeling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal m	10/5/2023	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.6Modeling pacticuption asset proposal mocoraties10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0M. To Asharo C. All Consenses10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0M. To Asharo C. All Consenses10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Modeling acticuption asset proposal mocoraties10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Modeling pacticuption asset proposal mocoraties10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Timodayn cali / Statticuption Assets10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Galuation of calina10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Galuation of calina10/07020Function Analysis / Modeling0.0Galuation of calina10/070200Function Analysis / Modeling0.0 <td< td=""><td>10/5/2023</td><td>Financial Analysis / Modeling</td><td>2.0</td><td>Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries</td></td<>	10/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10190202Pancial Analysis / Modeing3.0Median gardicipation as at proposal recoveries10190202Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing2.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Calxistism of Alasis10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at p	10/6/2023	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
10190202Pancial Analysis / Modeing3.0Median gardicipation as at proposal recoveries10190202Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing2.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at proposal recoveries10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Calxistism of Alasis10190203Financial Analysis / Modeing1.0Modeing participation as at p	10/6/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10002000Advacr / Margament Mediag / Instanta Califa1.0M. Advacr Cali10010202Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recordies10010202Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recordies10010202Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.0Calculation C daims10012020Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.0Calculation C daims10012021Sickendoric Cali / Meding / Harana Cali0.5Thrid-sty cali / Participation asset proposal recordies10012022Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.0Calculation C daims10012023Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.0Calculation C daims10012024Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recordies10012023Picarelia Anvysia / Modeling				
1090200         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10102023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         2.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10102023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10102023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         0.6         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10102023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10102023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           101102024         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           101112023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           101112023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           101112023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10112023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recordies           10112023         Fixacial Anysis / Kooling         1.5         Anysis / fixacii				
10100203Court Hendry / Fling/ Pepaton0.5Media participation asset process recoveries10100204Francial Ankyle / Meding0.6Mediang participation asset process recoveries10100205Francial Ankyle / Meding0.6Mediang participation asset process recoveries10100206Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Mediang participation asset process recoveries10100207Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Mediang participation asset process recoveries10100208Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Mediang participation asset process recoveries10110209Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Cacutator Cali10110209Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Cacutator Cali101110209Francial Ankyle / Meding1.0Modeing participation asset proceal recoveries				
10102022Financial Analysis / Modeling2.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10102023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10102024Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10102025Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10102026Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10112027Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10112028Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10112029Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10112029Stakenokier Cali / Medeling / Hartine Calis0.5Tird-party cali - Particplaton Assets10112029Stakenokier Cali / Medeling / Hartine Calis0.5Tird-party cali - Particplaton Assets10112029Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Analysis of prori issuance claim settlements10112029Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling gardicplaton asset proposal recorries10112029Financial Analysis / Modeling1.				
101010200Financia Andysis / Modning0.6Modeling participation asser proposal recoveries101010200Financia Andysis / Modning1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101010201Financia Andysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101010202Financia Andysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101010203Financia Andysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101110203Financia Andysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101110203Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Michage participation asset proposal recoveries101110203Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Tindrayri call - Participation Assets101120204Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Tindrayri call - Participation Assets101120205Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Andysis / Modeling101120206Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101120207Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101120208Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101120209Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101120200Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101120201Financia Andysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal r				
10102023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101102023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101102023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101102023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           10112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Turd-garty cal - Participation Assets           10112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Analysis of prior insurance calins actilisments           10112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           10112023         Financia Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries           101120203         Financia Analysis / Modeling <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></t<>				
101/02029Function Analysis / Modeling2.0Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/02029Funccial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/02029Funccial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/02020Funccial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/12020Funccial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/12020Funccial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/12020Stakehold Calls / Meetings / Related Meeting0.5Thridyatry call - Participation Assets101/12020Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Thridyatry call - Participation Assets101/12020Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Analysis / dori insurance calms ettements101/12020Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal inconvies101/12020Financial Analysis / Modeling <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>				
10100223         Functial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           10100223         Absor / Management Meding / Intenai Callis         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           10110223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           101110233         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           101110233         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           101110233         Financial Analysis / Modeling         5.5         Third-party call - Participation Assets           10112223         Stakeholder Calli / Medining         6.5         Third-party call - Participation Assets           10112223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Analysis of prior insurance claim settements           10112223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           10112223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           10112223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposi recoveries           10112223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         <				
10102023         Advac / Management Meeting / Itemai Calls         1.0         Internal strategy call re-Participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Stakehold Calls / Modeling         1.0         Calculation of calms           10112023         Stakehold Calls / Meelings / Related Items         0.5         Thr-Advac Call           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Calculation of calms           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10112023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling pa		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Stakeholder Calis / Meeting / Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Third-party cali - Participation Assets           1011/2023         Stakeholder Calis / Meeting / Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Caliculation of claims           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Caliculation of claims           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Analysis of prior inscuree claim settlements           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           1011/2023         Financial Analysis /		, ,		
101112023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries101112023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10112023Abdac / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th Addac Call10112023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Palelad terms0.5Throt-patry call - Participation Assets10112023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Calculation of claims10112023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Calculation of claims10112023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10112023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset pro	10/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets
10112223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10112223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10112223       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Felated tems       0.5       Third-party call - Participation Assets         10112223       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Felated tems       0.5       Third-party call - Participation Assets         10112223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Calculation of claims         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Analysis of prior insurance claim settlements         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10113223       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Preparing participation asset proposal recoveries         1011223       Stakeholder Calls / Modeling       0.5       Preparing Sepremoter Fee Statementi / Modeling      <	10/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
1011/12/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proporal recoveries1011/12/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related tems0.5Third-party call - Participation Assets1011/12/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related tems0.6Calculation of claims1011/12/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Calculation of claims1011/12/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries1011/12/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries1011/12/20	10/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/12/2023       Adates / Management Meeting / Internal Calis       0.5       M. Th Adates Cali         10/12/2023       Stakeholder Calis / Meetings / Related Items       0.5       Third-party cali - Participation Assets         10/12/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Calculation of claims         10/12/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Calculation of claims         10/13/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Third-party cali / Participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Stakeholder Calis / Meetings / Related Items       0.5       Thread Party cali / Participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Stakeholder Calis / Meetings / Related Items       0.5       Thread Party cali / Participation Assets         10/14/2023       General Analysis / Modeling       0.5       My Th Adateor Cali	10/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
101/12/2023         Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related terms         0.5         Thrid-party call - Participation Assets           101/12/2023         Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related terms         0.5         Third-party call - Participation Assets           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Calculation of claims           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Analysis of prin traumarc claim settlements           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         General Presentation Preparation         0.5         Preparing Sequentication on participation asset proposal recoveries           101/12/2023         General Presentation (Internal Calls         0.5         Preparing Sequentication on participation asset proposal recoveries	10/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
101/22222         Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related items         0.5         Tird-party call - Participation Assets           101/22223         Financial Analysis / Modeling         10         Calculation of claims           101/22232         Financial Analysis / Modeling         15         Analysis of pric insurance claims           101/32232         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Preparing participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         Stakeholder Calls / Meeting / Internal Calls         0.5         Preparing participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         General Presentation Preparation         0.5         Preparing participation asset proposal recoveries           101/42023         General Analysis / Modeling         0.5         M. Tarkyor Call           101/42023         General Analysis / Modeling         0.5         M.	10/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/12/2023         Stakeholder Calls / Meeting / Related items         0.5         Thrid-party call - Participation Assets           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Calculation of claims           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/13/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/14/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/14/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/14/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/14/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Preparing participation Assets           10/14/2023         Stakeholder Calls / Meeting / Related Items         0.5         Preparing participation Asset           10/14/2023         General Presentation Preparation         0.5         Preparing participation Asset           10/12/2023         General Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         General Analysis / Modeling         1.5         M	10/12/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.0         Calculation of claims           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Analysis of prior insurance claim settlements           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         1.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         Financial Analysis / Modeling         0.5         Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items         0.5         Preparing resentation on participation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         General Presentation Preparation         0.5         Preparing resentation on saticipation asset proposal recoveries           10/12/2023         General Administration         0.5         Preparing Segtember Fee Statement           10/12/2023         General Administration         0.5         Modeling articipation asset proposal recoveries           10/22/2023         Fee Statements/		-		
10/13/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Calculation of claims         10/13/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Analysis of prior insurance claim settlements         10/13/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Feldted items       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       General Administrative       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       General Administrative       0.5       M. Th Advisor Call         10/14/2023       General Administrative       0.5       M. Th Advisor Call         10/14/2023       General Administrative       0.5       M. Th Advisor Call         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       General Admi				
10/13/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Analysis of pror insurance claim settlements10/13/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/15/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Third-party call - Participation Assets10/15/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/15/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/15/2023General Analysis / Modeling0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/15/2023General Analysis / Modeling0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/25/2023General Administrative0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/25/2023General Administrative0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/25/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/25/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/25/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invice0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></t<>				
10/13/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/14/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/15/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/16/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/17/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/17/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tecoveries         10/17/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tee Statement         10/17/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tee Statement         10/12/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       Min Advisor Call         10/22/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tee Statement         10/22/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tee Statement         10/22/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       Preparing Sequence Tee Statement         1				
10/14/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/15/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/16/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/16/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/17/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023Cataments / Monthy Invoice0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/18/2023General Administrative0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/23/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements / Monthy Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthy Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthy Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthy Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing September Jee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis /				
10/15/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/15/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/15/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/17/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Felated Items       0.5       Preparing presentation proposal recoveries         10/18/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing presentation proposal recoveries         10/18/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing presentation proposal recoveries         10/18/2023       General Arensitistative       3.5       Discovery request         10/22/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/22/2023       Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/22/2023       Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023 <td< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></td<>				
10/16/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/16/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/17/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.5Third-party call - Participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invice0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/19/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/22/2023General Administrative3.5Discovery request10/23/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5M. Th. Advisor Call10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analys				
10/16/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/17/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/17/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       0.5       Thrid-party call - Participation Assets         10/18/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/19/2023       General Administrative       3.5       Discovery request         10/23/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       Mr, Th Advisor Call         10/23/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Internal strategy call ne: Participation Assets         10/24/2023       Court Heatings / Filings / Preparation       0.5       Redening reply in support of participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries      <				
10/17/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items0.5Tirid-party calle - Participation Assets10/18/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/19/2023Ackisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Adkisor Call10/29/2023Ackisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Adkisor Call10/29/2023General Administrative0.5M, Th Adkisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5M, Th Adkisor Call10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Reading rephy in support of participation Assets10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participati				
10/18/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       0.5       Third-party call - Participation Assets         10/18/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/18/2023       Ackisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/22/2023       General Administrative       3.5       Discovery request         10/23/2023       Ackisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/23/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthy Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthy Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthy Invoice       0.5       Reading repy in support of participation Assets         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10				
10/18/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/18/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/19/2023General Administrative3.5Discovery request10/23/2023General Administrative0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Reading participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis	10/17/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/18/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/19/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/202023General Administrative3.5Discovery request10/23/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling pa	10/18/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Third-party call - Participation Assets
10/19/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/20/2023General Administrative3.5Discovery request10/23/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M. Th Advisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5	10/18/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/20/2023General Administrative3.5Discovery request10/23/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing Sptember Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing Sptember Fee Statement10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Preparation0.5Ormitobas hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25	10/18/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing September Fee Statement
10/23/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/23/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormitus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Ormitus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Mitm Advisor Call10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Mitm Advisor Call<	10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/23/2020       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fien Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Fien Statements/ Monthly Invoice       0.5       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/24/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/25/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Ormibus hearing         10/25/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Ormibus hearing         10/25/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/25/2023       General Presentation Preparation       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/25/2023 </td <td>10/20/2023</td> <td>General Administrative</td> <td>3.5</td> <td>Discovery request</td>	10/20/2023	General Administrative	3.5	Discovery request
10/23/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Callis0.5Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation agreement10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Ormibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financia	10/23/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/24/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice0.5Preparing September Fee Statement10/24/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Callis0.5Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation agreement10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Ornibus hearing10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset propo	10/23/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice		Preparing September Fee Statement
10/24/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5Internal strategy call re: Participation Assets10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation agreement10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0<				
10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation agreement10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries<				
10/24/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Reading reply in support of participation agreement10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023 <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>				
10/24/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></t<>				
10/24/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items1.5Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement10/27/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Dis				
10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation0.5Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling2.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Discussing discovery10/27/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.0Discussing discovery10/27/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset prop				
10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling2.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items1.5Third party investor call regarding Participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.0Discussing discovery10/27/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor				
10/25/2023Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation0.5Omnibus hearing10/25/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling0.5Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/25/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling2.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/26/2023General Presentation Preparation1.0Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items1.5Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement10/27/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls1.0Discussing discovery10/27/2023Financial Analysis / Modeling1.0Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries10/27/2023Fienancial Analysis / Modeling / Internal Calls1.0Discussing discovery10/27/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/2023Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls0.5M, Th Advisor Call10/27/2023Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice1.0Preparing September Fee Statement10/2023Advisor / Management				
10/25/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       0.5       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/25/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Model				
10/25/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Preparing preparing September Fee Statement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls <t< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>-</td></t<>				-
10/26/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call				
10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       2.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/30/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call	10/25/2023	General Presentation Preparation		Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries
10/26/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/20/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call	10/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	M, Th Advisor Call
10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/30/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call	10/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
10/26/2023       General Presentation Preparation       1.0       Preparing presentation on participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/30/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call				
10/27/2023       Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items       1.5       Third party investor call regarding Participation Agreement         10/27/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       1.0       Discussing discovery         10/27/2023       Financial Analysis / Modeling       1.0       Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries         10/27/2023       Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice       1.0       Preparing September Fee Statement         10/30/2023       Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls       0.5       M, Th Advisor Call				
10/27/2023     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     1.0     Discussing discovery       10/27/2023     Financial Analysis / Modeling     1.0     Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries       10/27/2023     Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice     1.0     Preparing September Fee Statement       10/30/2023     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls     0.5     M, Th Advisor Call				
10/27/2023     Financial Analysis / Modeling     1.0     Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries       10/27/2023     Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice     1.0     Preparing September Fee Statement       10/30/2023     Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Callis     0.5     M, Th Advisor Call				
10/27/2023         Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice         1.0         Preparing September Fee Statement           10/30/2023         Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls         0.5         M, Th Advisor Call				
10/30/2023 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls 0.5 M, Th Advisor Call				
		-		
10/30/2023 ree statements/ montally invoice 2.0 Preparing September Fee Statement				
	10/30/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Preparing September Fee Statement

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggII3 of 997

#### Professional Dayananda for the month of October

	rocessional Dayananda for the month of October					
Date	Category	Hours	Description			
10/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
10/4/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing			
10/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call			
10/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
10/10/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing			
10/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
10/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
10/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document P@g178 of 997

### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023<sup>5</sup>

Date	Name	Expense Category	Narrative	Amount
8/29/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber from meeting	\$110.48
8/29/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber to meeting - tip	\$10.00
8/29/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Cab from meeting	\$223.18
8/29/2023	Michael Masterson	Agency Booking Fees - Airfare	Booking fee for cab	\$10.00
8/30/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber to meeting	\$39.90
8/30/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber to meeting	\$44.95
8/31/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber from meeting	\$78.27
8/31/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Uber to meeting	\$47.99
9/13/2023	Michael Masterson	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone bill	\$32.55
10/2/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Taxi	Uber to / from court hearing	\$31.22
10/2/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Taxi	Uber to / from witness preparation meeting	\$38.77
10/2/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Taxi - OT	Uber tip	\$4.16
10/4/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Taxi	Uber to / from meeting	\$97.12
10/4/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Meals - Overtime	Overtime meal	\$18.35
10/4/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Meals - Overtime	Overtime meal	\$18.24
10/20/2023	Noah Bronstein	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone bill	\$71.57
10/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Cell phone bill	\$131.87
10/31/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Meals - Overtime	Overtime meal	\$29.13
Total				\$1,037.75

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBgL16 of 997

Dated: November 30, 2023 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg116 of 997

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

## FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2023

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
Beginning of P		Period	End of Period
Time period covered by this	Time period covered by this		
statement	statement November 1, 2		November 30, 2023
Summary of Total Fees		and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation sought			
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$175,000.00^2 (80\% = 140,000.00)$	
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought			
as actual, reasonable, and neces	ssary:	\$259.13 <sup>3</sup>	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of November 2023 only.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBgLIZ of 997

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (November 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	8.0
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	9.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	6.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	9.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	4.5
Noah Bronstein	Associate	25.0
Linda Wang	Analyst	49.0
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	3.5
Total		115.0

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBgLI19 of 997

## Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (November 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	41.0
General Presentation Preparation	1.5
Financial Analysis / Modeling	44.25
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	21.5
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	4.5
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.25
Total	115.0

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggL29 of 997

Expanse Catagomy	Nov
Expense Category	2023
Mobile/Cellular Phone	\$170.16
Taxi	\$88.97
Total	\$259.13

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (November 1, 2023 Through November 30, 2023)<sup>4</sup>

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg 280 of 997

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	4.0	-	-	3.0	-	1.0	8.0
Chandiramani	5.0	0.5	0.5	3.0	-	-	9.0
Whiffen	4.5	-	0.5	1.5	-	-	6.5
McCarthy	4.5	1.0	2.0	2.0	-	-	9.5
Becker	3.5	-	-	1.0	-	-	4.5
Bronstein	8.0	-	12.5	3.5	0.5	0.5	25.0
Wang	9.0	-	28.8	6.5	4.0	0.8	49.0
Dayananda	2.5	-	-	1.0	-	-	3.5
Total	41.0	1.5	44.3	21.5	4.5	2.3	115.0

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg182 of 997

#### Professional Masterson for the month of November

Date	Category	Hours	Description
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/6/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status conference
11/8/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Buyer call
11/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Buyer call
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg182 of 997

#### Professional Chandiramani for the month of November

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document P8g183 of 997

#### Professional Whiffen for the month of November

Date	Category	Hours	Description
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Court hearing
11/1/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Management call
11/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg185 of 997

#### Professional McCarthy for the month of November

Date	Category	Hours	Description
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Hearing
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/2/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery prep
11/3/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Waterfall analysis catch up
11/6/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Hearing
11/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/9/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Review of waterfall analysis
11/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Recovery analysis discussion
11/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review of recovery analysis calculations
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Waterfall / aircraft novation update
11/13/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review of recovery analysis calculations
11/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Recovery analysis review / discussion

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document P8g126 of 997

#### Professional Becker for the month of November

Date	Category	Hours	Description
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Court hearing
11/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg186 of 997

#### Professional Bronstein for the month of November

Date	Category	Hours	Description	
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Court Hearing	
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.5	Advisor call	
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Discovery review	
11/6/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference	
11/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/8/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Waterfall and cash flow analysis related to upcoming closing	
11/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/9/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with Management	
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/14/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/15/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call	
11/16/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/16/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/17/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with management regarding Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/17/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	
11/20/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modelling recoveries	
11/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/21/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries	
11/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modelling recoveries	
11/24/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries	
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modelling recoveries	
11/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Noteholder Call	
11/29/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Reviewing October monthly fee statement	
11/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
11/30/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall	

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg188 of 997

#### Professional Wang for the month of November

Date	ng for the month of November Category	Hours	Description
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.5	Printing reference documents for PA Hearing
11/1/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5	Participation Agreement Hearing
11/1/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/2/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analysing precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal meeting on precedent insurance litigation settlements
11/2/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing August invoice
11/2/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Producing discovery
11/2/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
11/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling participation asset proposal recoveries
11/3/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/3/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Producing discovery
11/6/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status conference
11/6/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/7/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor Call
11/7/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/8/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/8/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing October fee statement
11/9/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/9/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
11/9/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/10/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/10/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/13/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/13/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing September invoice
11/13/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Call with company about Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/14/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing September invoice
11/14/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/15/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/15/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing October fee statement
11/16/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor Call
11/16/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/21/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/21/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
11/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.3	Advisor call
11/22/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.3	Preparing October fee statement
11/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.3	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor Call
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call on recovery update
11/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.8	Internal call to prepare for stakeholder meeting
11/28/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.8	Stakeholder meeting
11/29/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Calculating default interest
11/30/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
11/30/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing October fee statement

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pgg189 of 997

#### Date Category Hours Description Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation 11/1/2023 1.0 Court hearing 11/7/2023 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls 0.5 Advisor call 11/9/2023 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls 0.5 Advisor call 11/13/2023 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls 0.5 Advisor call 11/16/2023 0.5 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls Advisor call 11/28/2023 Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls 0.5 Advisor call

#### Professional Dayananda for the month of November

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Pgg189 of 997

### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2023<sup>5</sup>

Date	Name	Expense Category	Narrative	Amount
11/2/2023	Thomas McCarthy	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Monthly phone bill	\$95.16
11/2/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Taxi from meeting	\$40.87
11/2/2023	Michael Masterson	Taxi	Taxi to meeting	\$48.10
11/29/2023	Noah Bronstein	Mobile/Cellular Phone	Monthly phone bill	\$75.00
Total				\$259.13

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBg190 of 997

Dated: December 14, 2023 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg 92 of 997

## EXHIBIT E

Form of Order

23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:89 Main Document Pgg192 of 997

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.

Chapter 11

Case No. Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

## ORDER APPROVING THE FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2023

Upon consideration of the First Interim Application of Greenhill & Co., LLC for

Allowance of Interim Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of

Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors from July 27, 2023 Through and Including November

30, 2023 (the "Application"),<sup>2</sup> pursuant to sections 327, 328, 330, and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code

and Bankruptcy Rule 2016, seeking allowance of interim compensation for professional services

rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection therewith

during the period commencing July 27, 2023 through and including November 30, 2023 (the

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Application.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document P@g198 of 997

"<u>Compensation Period</u>"); and the Court having reviewed the Application, and having heard the statements regarding the relief requested in the Application at a hearing before the Court (the "<u>Hearing</u>"); and the Court having found that (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of Reference M-431, dated January 31, 2012 (Preska, C.J.); (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157(a)-(b) and 1334(b); (c) venue is proper before the Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and (d) due and proper notice of the Application and the Hearing was sufficient under the circumstances; and the Court having determined that the amount requested for fees and expenses payable to Greenhill & Co., LLC is reasonable and appropriate under the facts and circumstances of these chapter 11 cases; and upon all of the proceedings had before the Court and after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefor;

### **IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT**

1. The Application is approved as set forth herein.

2. Upon entry of this Order, the Debtors are authorized and directed to remit payment to in the amount of \$700,000.00 for actual, reasonable, and necessary professional services rendered to the Debtors during the First Interim Application period, and \$2,373.17 for reimbursement of actual, reasonable, and necessary costs and expenses incurred by Greenhill during the First Interim Application Period.

3. Upon entry of this Order, and to the extent that such amounts have not been paid prior to the Hearing on the Application, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay Greenhill the outstanding amount of \$140,000.00.

4. This Court retains exclusive jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising from or related to the implementation, interpretation, or enforcement of this Order.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 603 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:30:59 Main Document PBg195 of 997

New York, New York

Dated: \_\_\_\_\_, 2024

## HONORABLE JOHN P. MASTANDO III UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM DECEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
	Beginning of Period		End of Period
Time period covered by this			
statement	statement December 1, 2		December 31, 2023
Summary of Total Fees		and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation sought			
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$175,000.00^2$ (80% = $140,000.00$ )	
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought			
as actual, reasonable, and nece	ssary:	\$0 <sup>3</sup>	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly



<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of December 2023 only.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@327 off 1297

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (December 1, 2023 Through December 31, 2023)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	4.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	7.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	5.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	10.0
Eli Becker	Vice President	6.5
Noah Bronstein	Associate	13.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	31.5
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	1.0
Total	•	79.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@338 off 1297

## Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (December 1, 2023 Through December 31, 2023)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	32.5
General Presentation Preparation	3.0
Financial Analysis / Modeling	31.5
Board – Calls / Meeting / Discussions	2.0
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	4.5
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	3.5
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	2.5
Total	79.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@3900ff1597

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (December 1, 2023 Through December 31, 2023)<sup>4</sup>

This page left blank on purpose

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@40off1597

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Presentation Preparation	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	3.0	-	-	-	0.5	-	1.0	4.5
Chandiramani	4.5	-	-	1.0	0.5	-	1.0	7.0
Whiffen	4.0	-	1.0	-	0.5	-	-	5.5
McCarthy	4.5	-	4.0	1.0	0.5	-	-	10.0
Becker	5.5	-	-	-	1.0	-	-	6.5
Bronstein	5.5	0.5	6.0	-	1.0	0.5	-	13.5
Wang	4.5	2.5	20.5	-	0.5	3.0	0.5	31.5
Dayananda	1.0	-	-	-	-	-	-	1.0
Total	32.5	3.0	31.5	2.0	4.5	3.5	2.5	79.5

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@41.00f11397

#### Professional Masterson for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
12/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
12/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Plan administrator hearing

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@ 4/2 off 11:97

#### Professional Chandiramani for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
12/4/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
12/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
12/5/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Plan administrator hearing
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/27/2024	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board meeting
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@ 433 off 11:397

#### Professional Whiffen for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
12/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/18/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review financial analyses
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/21/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Court hearing
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@440ff1597

Professional Mc	rofessional McCarthy for the month of December					
Date	Category	Hours	Description			
12/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Discussion re: certain aircraft / contracts			
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Follow up discussion re: certain aircraft / contracts			
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/7/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Novation schedule / recovery presentation / bridge			
12/8/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Novation schedule / recovery presentation / bridge			
12/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Recovery analysis			
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/14/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Recovery analysis review / adjustments			
12/15/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / sale proceeds calculations			
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/21/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/21/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference			
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			
12/27/2023	Board - Calls / Meeting / Discussions	1.0	Board Update			
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call			

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pgg140 of 197

#### Professional Becker for the month of December

diessional betwee for the month of bettember				
Date	Category	Hours	Description	
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call	
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call	
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call	
12/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call	
12/22/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Plan Administration Agreement Hearing	
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pgg146 of 197

#### Professional Bronstein for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
12/4/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modelling recoveries
12/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Modelling recoveries
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/8/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Preparation of Board materials
12/12/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Reviewing November monthly fee statement
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
12/18/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries
12/19/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modelling recoveries
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
12/22/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
12/22/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Plan Administration Agreement Hearing
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modelling recoveries
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pgg142 of 197

#### Professional Wang for the month of December

Date	ing for the month of December	Hours	Description
	Category		Description
12/1/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	November Fee Statement
12/4/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor call
12/4/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Counterparty claims analysis
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/5/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal Advisor Call
12/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Counterparty claims analysis
12/5/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/6/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	November Fee Statement
12/6/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/7/2023	General Presentation Preparation	1.0	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/8/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/11/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	November Fee Statement
12/11/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/12/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/12/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Reviewing funds flow draft
12/12/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyzing default interest claims
12/12/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/13/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/14/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Reviewing funds flow draft
12/15/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	October monthly fee Invoice
12/15/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Reviewing funds flow draft
12/18/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Reconciling sale distributions changes
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Reconciling sale distributions changes
12/19/2023	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Responding to stakeholders
12/21/2023	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Plan administrator hearing
12/22/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/23/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/23/2023	General Presentation Preparation	0.5	Updating presentation on Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/24/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/26/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Sale distributions and ad hoc analysis
12/26/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Modeling Sale Order sale distributions and waterfall
12/28/2023	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	December monthly fee statement, November invoice
12/28/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/28/2023	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale distributions and ad hoc analysis
	, ,		

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pgg148 of 197

#### Professional Dayananda for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
12/14/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
12/19/2023	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g149 of 197

### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM DECEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023<sup>5</sup>

This page left blank on purpose

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/35/24 Entered 05/35/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pigg150 of 197

Dated: January 31, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
Beginning of P		Period	End of Period
Time period covered by this			
statement	January 1, 202	24	January 31, 2024
Summary of Total Fees		and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation soug	ght		
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$9,175,000.00^2$ (80% = $7,340,000.00$ )	
Amount of Expense Reimburse	ement sought		
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		\$127.32 <sup>3</sup>	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.



<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of January 2024 and Change of Control M&A Fee of \$9,000,000 as defined in the Amended & Restated Engagement Letter dated September 19, 2023.

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@ 522 off 1497

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	3.5
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	5.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	3.0
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	8.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	3.0
Noah Bronstein	Associate	2.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	27.0
Total		52.5

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g533.0ff1297

### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	20.5
Financial Analysis / Modeling	18.5
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	6.0
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	7.5
Total	52.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g540ff1497

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (January 1, 2024 Through January 31, 2024)<sup>4</sup>

~

	Oct
Expense Category	2023
Meals - Overtime	\$17.15
Taxi	110.17
Total	\$127.32

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g550ff1297

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Total
Masterson	3.0	-	0.5	-	3.5
Chandiramani	4.0	-	1.0	-	5.0
Whiffen	2.5	-	0.5	-	3.0
McCarthy	3.5	2.5	2.5	-	8.5
Becker	2.5	-	0.5	-	3.0
Bronstein	2.0	-	0.5	-	2.5
Wang	3.0	16.0	0.5	7.5	27.0
Total	20.5	18.5	6.0	7.5	52.5

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document PP 356 off 11/97

#### Professional Masterson for the month of January

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@ 57 off 1497

#### Professional Chandiramani for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/12/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Interim Fee App Review
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/17/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation Assets discussion
1/17/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation Assets follow up discussion
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@9580ff1497

#### Professional Whiffen for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g5900f11497

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/2/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/4/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/9/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/11/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Interim Fee App Review
1/12/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Interim Fee App Review
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/17/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation Assets discussion
1/17/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Participation Assets follow up discussion
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call
1/25/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation / purchase price / net proceeds calculations
1/27/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Interim Fee App discussions / review
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document Pgg160 of 197

#### Professional Becker for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g161 of 197

#### Professional Bronstein for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g162 of 197

#### Professional Wang for the month of December

Date	Category	Hours	Description
1/2/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/3/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Correspondence related to allocated consideration calculation
1/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/4/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	5.0	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/6/2025	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/6/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	4.0	Prepare Interim fee application
1/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/9/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Status Conference
1/9/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/9/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare Interim fee application
1/9/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/10/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/11/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/11/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Prepare Interim fee application
1/13/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare Interim fee application
1/15/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare Interim fee application
1/16/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/17/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/17/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/23/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/23/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/24/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/24/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare December fee statement
1/25/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Sale order allocated consideration calculation
1/29/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare December fee statement
1/30/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
1/30/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review debt amortization schedule

### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:39:50 Main Document P@g163 of 197

### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2024 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2024<sup>5</sup>

Date	Name	Expense Category	Narrative	Amount
10/19/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Meals - Overtime	Overtime meal	\$17.15
10/24/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Taxi	Taxi to / from meeting	\$68.79
10/27/2023	Vinod Chandiramani	Taxi	Taxi to / from meeting	\$41.38
Total				\$127.32

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/05/24 Entered 05/05/24 20:32:50 Main Document PiggL64 of 197

Dated: March 1, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

### FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2024 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2024

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
Beginning of		Period	End of Period
Time period covered by this			
statement February 1, 20		24	February 29, 2024
Summary of Total Fees		and Expenses Re	equested:
Amount of Compensation sought			
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$\$87,500.00^2$ ( $80\% = \$70,000.00$ )	
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought			
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$0.00^{3}$	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.



<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of February 2024 and reflects 50% crediting of Monthly Advisor Fees per the Amended & Restated Engagement Letter dated September 19, 2023.

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document PP 466 off 1497

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (February 1, 2024 Through February 29, 2024)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	2.0
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	3.0
Will Whiffen	Principal	2.0
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	5.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	2.0
Noah Bronstein	Associate	4.5
Linda Wang	Analyst	23.0
Total		42.0

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document P@g637 off 11/97

### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (February 1, 2024 Through February 29, 2024)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	14.0
Financial Analysis / Modeling	18.0
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	2.5
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	7.5
Total	42.0

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pg g68 off 11/97

### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (February 1, 2024 Through February 29, 2024)<sup>4</sup>

This page left intentionally blank

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document P@g@00f1197

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Total
Masterson	2.0	-	-	-	2.0
Chandiramani	2.0	-	1.0	-	3.0
Whiffen	2.0	-	-	-	2.0
McCarthy	2.0	2.0	1.5	-	5.5
Becker	2.0	-	-	-	2.0
Bronstein	2.0	1.5	-	1.0	4.5
Wang	2.0	14.5	-	6.5	23.0
Total	14.0	18.0	2.5	7.5	42.0

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document PPg 70 off 11/97

#### Professional Masterson for the month of February

i i oressionar mast	croon for the month of rebraary		
Date	Category	Hours	Description
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document P@g71.off1207

	andiramani for the month of February		
Date	Category	Hours	Description
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/8/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Interim Fee App review / comments
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/28/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Monthly Fee App Review

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document P@g722off1207

Professional Whiffen for the month of February					
Date	Category	Hours	Description		
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call		
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call		
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call		
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call		

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document P@ 328 off 11/97

#### Professional McCarthy for the month of February

	cartiny for the month of rebruary		-
Date	Category	Hours	Description
2/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
2/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/8/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Interim Fee App review / comments
2/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
2/23/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
2/26/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Monthly Fee App Review
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
2/28/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	0.5	Monthly Fee App Review & related calculations

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document PggLT0 of 197

#### Professional Becker for the month of February

 Trocssional Decker for the month of February				
Date	Category	Hours	Description	
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call	

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document PggII5 of 197

#### Professional Bronstein for the month of February

Date	Category	Hours	Description
2/1/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and sw ap breakage calculations
2/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and sw ap breakage calculations
2/5/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/8/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Reviewing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Conducting Change of Control analysis
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document Pigg II of 197

#### Professional Wang for the month of February

Date	Category	Hours	Description
2/1/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and sw ap breakage calculations
2/2/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and sw ap breakage calculations
2/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/5/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.5	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculating sale order allocated considerations and sw ap breakage calculations
2/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/6/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	2.0	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/7/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Review ing expenses related to Interim Compensation Period application
2/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/9/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating debt payoff amounts, including accrued and default interest
2/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Conducting Change of Control analysis
2/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/20/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
2/22/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/23/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
2/26/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement
2/26/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/27/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
2/28/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Conducting Change of Control analysis
2/28/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculating sale order allocated considerations
2/29/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Preparing January Monthly Fee Statement

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:30:59 Main Document P@g173 of 197

### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2024 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2024<sup>5</sup>

This page left intentionally blank

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/29/24 Entered 05/29/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pigg IIs of 197

Dated: March 29, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

(Jointly Administered)

Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

Chapter 11

### <u>FEE STATEMENT OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR SERVICES AND FOR</u> <u>REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS</u> <u>FOR THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 5, 2024</u>

Name of Applicant:		Greenhill & Co., LLC	
Applicant's Role in Case:		Investment Banker to the Debtors	
Date of Retention:		September 19, 2023, effective as of July 27, 2023	
	Beginning of Period		End of Period
Time period covered by this			
statement	March 1, 2024		April 5, 2024
Summar	equested:		
Amount of Compensation soug	ght		
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$102,083.33^2 (80\% = 81,666.67)$	
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought			
as actual, reasonable, and necessary:		$$24.55^{3}$	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.



<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Represents Greenhill's Monthly Advisory Fee of \$175,000 for the month of March 2024 and a pro-rated Monthly Advisory Fee of \$29,166.67 from April 1 through April 5, 2024; reflects 50% crediting of Monthly Advisor Fees per the Amended & Restated Engagement Letter dated September 19, 2023.

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document PP 320 off 1597

### Summary of Hours of Service by Greenhill Employee During the Compensation Period (March 1, 2024 Through April 5, 2024)

Name of Professional	Position	Hours Billed
Michael Masterson	Managing Director	6.0
Vinod Chandiramani	Managing Director	5.5
Will Whiffen	Managing Director	8.5
Thomas McCarthy	Principal	8.5
Eli Becker	Vice President	12.5
Noah Bronstein	Vice President	7.0
Linda Wang	Analyst	39.0
Amith Dayananda	Analyst	18.5
Total	105.5	

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document ዋሮያ 32 መf 1597

#### Summary of Hours of Service by Category During the Compensation Period (March 1, 2024 Through April 5, 2024)

Project Category	Hours
Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	28.5
General Administrative	1.0
Financial Analysis / Modeling	59.0
Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	5.0
Fee Statements / Monthly Invoice	3.0
Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	9.0
Total	105.5

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Ports 20:29:29 Main Document

#### Summary of Expenses During the Compensation Period (March 1, 2024 Through April 5, 2024)<sup>4</sup>

Expense Category	Mar 2024
Meals - Overtime	\$24.55
Total	\$24.55

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Ports 20:29:29 Main Document

Professional	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	General Administrative	Financial Analysis / Modeling	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	Total
Masterson	4.0	-	-	1.0	-	1.0	6.0
Chandiramani	3.5	-	-	1.0	-	1.0	5.5
Whiffen	4.0	-	3.0	-	-	1.5	8.5
McCarthy	4.0	-	2.5	1.0	-	1.0	8.5
Becker	2.5	-	9.0	-	-	1.0	12.5
Bronstein	2.5	-	2.5	1.0	-	1.0	7.0
Wang	4.5	0.5	28.5	1.0	3.0	1.5	39.0
Dayananda	3.5	0.5	13.5	-	-	1.0	18.5
Total	28.5	1.0	59.0	5.0	3.0	9.0	105.5

## Statement of Hours by Professional by Project Category

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document PP 384 off 1597

#### Professional Masterson for the months of March and April

Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor strategy call
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
4/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document PP 485 off 1597

#### Professional Chandiramani for the months of March and April

		r	
Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Noteholder recovery analysis discussion
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
4/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Ports 886 of 11:97

Professional Whi	ofessional Whiffen for the months of March and April							
Date	Category	Hours	Description					
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses					
3/14/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses					
3/14/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call					
3/25/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Review financial analyses					
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					
3/28/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Stakeholder call					
4/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call					

# 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document P@387 off 11:97

<b>Professional Mc</b>	Carthy for the months of March and April		
Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Noteholder recovery analysis discussion
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy discussion
3/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
3/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of recovery analysis
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal strategy discussion
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of illustrative novation timing analysis
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	PIMCO discussion re: novation status
3/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations
3/19/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
4/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Internal update discussion
4/4/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Review of novation/closing calculations

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pigg188 of 197

<b>Professional Bec</b>	ofessional Becker for the months of March and April					
Date	Category	Hours	Description			
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis			
3/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/10/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/11/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call			
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor strategy call			
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/14/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments			
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call			
3/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received			

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pgg189 of 197

#### Professional Bronstein for the months of March and April

Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor strategy call
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/19/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Confirmation Hearing
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor strategy call
4/4/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pigg 90 of 197

#### Professional Wang for the months of March and April

Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/1/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare January Monthly Fee Statement
3/4/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding recoveries from additional assets
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/5/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	3.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/9/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Confirm maintenance reserve balances
3/10/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/11/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/11/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/12/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor strategy call
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/14/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/14/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/15/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received
3/19/2024	Court Hearings / Filings / Preparation	1.0	Confirmation Hearing
3/22/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculate sw ap breakages
3/25/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/26/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/26/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sw ap breakages
3/26/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	1.0	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/27/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/27/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Prepare February Monthly Fee Statement
3/29/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
3/29/2024	Fee Statements/ Monthly Invoice	0.5	Estimate Greenhill unpaid / future fees
3/30/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	0.5	Respond to stakeholder request
4/2/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
4/3/2024	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management
4/3/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Calculate sale order allocated considerations
4/4/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Calculate sale order allocated considerations

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pigg 93 of 197

#### Professional Dayananda for the months of March and April

Date	Category	Hours	Description
3/5/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/6/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call with FTI regarding ad hoc analysis
3/6/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/7/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/8/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	2.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/10/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	0.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/11/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/12/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/13/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	1.0	Advisor strategy call
3/13/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	4.0	Analyze aircraft-level cash flow s and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Analyze aircraft-level cash flows and purchase price adjustments
3/14/2024	Stakeholder Calls / Meetings / Related Items	1.0	Stakeholder call
3/18/2024	Financial Analysis / Modeling	1.5	Conduct ad hoc analysis on penalty rents received
3/26/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
3/28/2024	Advisor / Management Meeting / Internal Calls	0.5	Advisor call
4/3/2024	General Administrative	0.5	VDR Management

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pgg192 of 197

#### STATEMENT OF EXPENSES BILLING PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 5, 2024<sup>5</sup>

	Date	Name	<b>Expense Category</b>	Narrative	Amount
3.	6/6/2024	Amith Dayananda	Meals - Overtime	Overtime Dinner	\$24.55
	Total				\$24.55

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>5</sup> Reflects expenses that have been processed by accounting to date – may not include all expenses incurred during period, which will be included on subsequent fee applications accordingly.

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/36/24 Entered 05/36/24 20:29:29 Main Document Pigg 95 of 197

Dated: April 30, 2024 New York, New York

> <u>/s/ Vinod Chandiramani</u> Vinod Chandiramani

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 194 of 197

## <u>EXHIBIT E</u>

Form of Order

23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 195 of 197

#### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC et al.

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. Case No. 23-11177 (JPM)

(Jointly Administered)

#### ORDER APPROVING THE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION OF GREENHILL & CO., LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS INVESTMENT BANKER TO THE DEBTORS FROM JULY 27, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 5, 2024

Upon consideration of the Second Interim and Final Application of Greenhill & Co., LLC for Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Investment Banker to the Debtors from July 27, 2023 Through and Including April 5, 2024 (the "Application"),<sup>2</sup> pursuant to sections 327, 328, 330, and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2016, seeking allowance of second interim and final compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection therewith during the periods commencing December 1, 2023 through and including April 5, 2024 (the "Second Interim Period"), and July 27, 2023 through and

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's tax identification number, are: Voyager Aviation Holdings, LLC (8601); A330 MSN 1432 Limited (N/A); A330 MSN 1579 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 1 Limited (N/A); Aetios Aviation Leasing 2 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation LLC (9861); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1123 Limited (N/A); Cayenne Aviation MSN 1135 Limited (N/A); DPM Investment LLC (5087); Intrepid Aviation Leasing, LLC (N/A); N116NT Trust (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing IV Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing VI Limited (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Panamera Aviation Leasing XIII Designated Activity Company (N/A); Voyager Aircraft Leasing, LLC (2925); Voyager Aviation Aircraft Leasing, LLC (3865); Voyager Aviation Management Ireland Designated Activity Company (N/A); and Voyager Finance Co. (9652). The service address for each of the Debtors in these cases is 301 Tresser Boulevard, Suite 602, Stamford, CT 06901.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Application.

#### 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 196 of 197

including April 5, 2024 (the "<u>Final Compensation Period</u>"), respectively; and the Court having reviewed the Application, and having heard the statements regarding the relief requested in the Application at a hearing before the Court (the "<u>Hearing</u>"); and the Court having found that (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of Reference M-431, dated January 31, 2012 (Preska, C.J.); (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157(a)-(b) and 1334(b); (c) venue is proper before the Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and (d) due and proper notice of the Application and the Hearing was sufficient under the circumstances; and the Court having determined that the amount requested for fees and expenses payable to Greenhill & Co., LLC is reasonable and appropriate under the facts and circumstances of these chapter 11 cases; and upon all of the proceedings had before the Court and after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefor;

#### **IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT**

1. The Application is granted as set forth herein.

2. Compensation to Greenhill for professional services rendered during the Second Interim Period is allowed on an interim basis in the amount of \$9,539,583.33.

3. Compensation to Greenhill for professional services rendered during the Final Compensation Period is allowed on a final basis in the amount of \$10,239,583.33.

4. Reimbursement to Greenhill for expenses incurred during the Second Interim Period is allowed on an interim basis in the amount of \$151.87.

5. Reimbursement to Greenhill for expenses incurred during the Final Compensation Period is allowed on a final basis in the amount of \$1,798.67.

6. The Debtors are hereby authorized to pay Greenhill the outstanding amount of \$2,059,607.88.

2

## 23-11177-jpm Doc 893 Filed 05/15/24 Entered 05/15/24 20:39:59 Main Document Pg 197 of 197

7. This Court retains exclusive jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising from or

related to the implementation, interpretation, and enforcement of this Order.

New York, New York Dated: \_\_\_\_\_, 2024

> HONORABLE JOHN P. MASTANDO III UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE